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Chapter 23 Things All Men Understand

"Tony Stark claimed that he definitely didn't take the Superman drug from Emperor Company to 
beat up ten cover models the night before yesterday?"

Luther saw some interesting news.

"This guy is really good at playing."

Luther really didn't expect that there would be people who would take Superman drugs to fight, but 
it was impossible to beat up ten cover models in an hour after taking Superman drugs, so how much 
did he take?

Tony Stark swore that he didn't take drugs, and the reporters' reports were all slander and jealousy.

Then Tony Stark said that he would not rule out the use of legal means to protect his rights.

A typical case of a dead duck mouthing hard.

But Luther thought this news was good, and men knew what was going on.

Moreover, with Tony Stark's live advertisement that was trying to cover up the truth, most men 
would probably smile knowingly and quickly place an order for Superman drugs.

So, Luther thought about it, and in order to express his gratitude, he did not expose the consumption 
record of Tony Stark's bodyguard Happy buying Superman drugs, but only invited the most 
charming male movie star in Hollywood to shoot an advertisement.

"Superman drugs, let you regain the confidence of a real man!"

After taking the Superman drugs, the male star conducted a series of physical training to show his 
strength, and then the cameraman knew how to accidentally pass through the male star's lower 
body.

...

Finally, the male star lay in the middle of the ten cover models, hugging them left and right, 
showing a smile of enjoyment.

It seems that nothing has been said, but it seems that everything has been said.

The most interesting thing is that these ten cover models are the ten cover models that Tony Stark 
broke the news about.

For a while, the media exploded and fell into a carnival.

They didn't expect Luther to do this!

The only regret they had was that the boss of the Emperor Company did not come on stage in 
person.

Otherwise, this topic would be more shocking!



But they thought too much. How could Luther go on stage in person? He is not Clark. He can do 
something to Lois. They are not two different species. It is okay without super vision. Once super 
vision is turned on, it is terrible. What's more, the memory of super brain is photographic.

He can even recall the bedwetting when he was one year old, so it is even worse.

After Luther appeared at the press conference, his popularity exploded. He was called the most 
charming man in America... Although he is not an American citizen.

Young, handsome, rich, single, genius.

Almost the same personality as Tony Stark, the difference is that he is young, tall, tall, tall... and 
strong!

A proper handsome man, not a playboy. Until now, there has been no scandal about Luther.

It is normal that he will be pursued by most American women.

This made Tony Stark very unhappy, because he felt that all his limelight was stolen by Luther.

Happy's original intention of buying the Superman drug was probably just to better protect Tony at 
critical moments, but using the Superman drug as aphrodisiac was Tony's own idea.

He didn't expect Luther to be so... unconventional, and he used this to advertise something that 
everyone knew.

This made Tony Stark even more upset. At this time, Tony Stark could be said to be arrogant. Most 
of the villains were provoked by his own foul mouth and arrogance, and it was also the most 
difficult time to get along with him.

So Luther naturally wouldn't spoil him. Why should I spoil you?

Not to mention, he has been busy recently.

Not only the town symbol, but also the police departments and even the military, the National 
Guard, etc. in many states of America came to the Emperor Company to discuss cooperation, even 
the medical insurance system that Luther originally didn't intend to intervene in, that is, the well-
known medical field in America.

The other party actually sent people to discuss cooperation.

The huge profits and market of Superman Drug, plus the fact that the Emperor Company did not 
make any moves during the several times they attacked it, and the people who attacked it 
mysteriously disappeared, they asked experts such as the CIA and FBI to investigate.

But no clues were found, it was done too cleanly, beyond imagination, which made them judge that 
there was a lot of water behind the Emperor Company.

Since there is no way to kill you and take your technology, and they are reluctant to give up the 
huge profits and market of Superman Drug, then of course they will cooperate.

The consortium is nothing more than for money.

Luther didn't have the whole "I was bitten by you, so I have to kill you dogs, I have to retaliate 
against you, and kill you."



He is not such a superficial person, can't he wait for the Chitauri to invade and guide the Chitauri?

What does it have to do with him to die at the hands of aliens? He can't retaliate against him, right?

Besides, even if he can't wait that long, Luther can still plan a super-powered terrorist attack.

By then, the dead will be big figures like the consortium chaebols, and the masters will not panic, 
and then the superman drug and compound No. 1 will be sold in large quantities again.

Luther has already thought clearly about the positioning of the Imperial Company, which is security 
and strategic consultant. They will use compound No. 1 and superman drug to create a group of 
soldiers, sign a lifetime contract with these soldiers, and let them fight for the Imperial Company.

Similar to Blackwater, but unprecedented super mercenaries.

However, I heard that security companies like Blackwater have begun to realize the market impact 
that superman drugs and compound No. 1 may bring, and Michelle has received their orders.

Of course, they are definitely not as competitive as the Emperor Company. The Emperor Company 
will launch various conventional security affairs and security services, targeting bioterrorism and 
super-powered terrorism, etc.

Think about it, one is a company that packages original goods, and the other is a company that buys 
other people's products and then packages them. Even if it is professional, which one would you 
choose?

Just like Nokia, this competitiveness is simply incomparable. Nokia did nothing wrong, but it 
became too slow, and it is completely incomparable.

"Alas, there are fewer and fewer people. It's time to conduct artificial human experiments or clone 
research."

The sales of Luther's Superman Drug and Compound No. 1 have increased hundreds of times, and 
even his group of scientific researchers who work day and night until they die probably can't 
complete these orders. There is a lack of manpower, and Luther doesn't want the Superman Drug 
and Compound No. 1 to be cracked and spread out.

So it is very troublesome to train trustworthy personnel. Although he taught himself hypnosis and 
relied on the ability of Kryptonians to turn hypnosis into super hypnosis, it is also very troublesome 
to hypnotize so many people at one time.

Of course, there are other solutions, such as asking those bigwigs who were hypnotized by him to 
arrange some people for him.
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