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Chapter 97 If you can control him...

The Power of Kamigawa is not a product of Devon Star.

The original plot contains a book called "Overview of the Kamigawa Sequence", written by 
Dinghei. This shows that the genetic research on the power of Kamigawa was already in existence 
when the Kamigawa civilization existed. Later, it was just Kieran who brought it to the angel 
civilization ( Large processing) and Deno civilization (minor transformation) there for further 
processing and transformation.

The book talks about three types of super sequences: harmonious recessive, genetic recessive and 
damage recessive. However, Ge Xiaolun does have many sequences that have not yet been 
activated. This shows how high Xiaolun’s upper limit is. No wonder, this is a setting Created by the 
two oldest civilizations in the world, how can it not be awesome?

Dinghei, the greatest scientist of the Kamigawa Civilization. It can be considered that he presided 
over the construction of the big clock. His identity is equivalent to the teacher of the space 
principal, and the ancestor of Carl. When the Kamigawa Civilization was destroyed, he disappeared 
together with the civilization. Kieran once tried to resurrect the teacher, but failed.

Of course, the power of Kamigawa is definitely not as good as the power of Galaxy.

Keisha said that the power of the Galaxy is a bit higher than the power of Kamigawa they originally 
expected.

However, Holy Kesha and the others did not decrypt the last lock because it was too difficult.

He Xi frowned.

"I don't know. The information I can read is all opened to me by him. I used to be curious about 
how he completely prohibited others from reading his dark data. Now I'm afraid it's his super 
genetic technology that suppresses us. "

"Didn't he also trade super gene engine technology with you?"

Holy Kesha asked.

"Maybe they want to see how far our technology has reached, or maybe their super gene technology 
is different from ours, so they plan to study it, but the possibility that their super gene technology is 
not as good as ours is too low."

This is the result calculated by Hexi's space-based system. She herself feels that it is impossible for 
the dark universe to not have super genetic technology. After all, when they first met, Luther 
showed his ability to prohibit her from reading information from the dark plane. .

At that time, she thought it was the ability of some special primitive super gene.

"Then do you think we should kneel down and lick him?"

Holy Kesha said with a smile.

"One is a grown up god, and the other is a new god who is still playing house. I don't think you will 
choose him."



He Xi said calmly.

It is impossible for a normal person to choose Luther, because he is too powerful and has grown up 
and does not need help. So what is the significance of angels to him?

Things that have no help or meaning are just worthless things that I scraped together.

When the time comes, you can’t blame others for being abandoned casually.

Holy Kesha and He Xi were both confident and felt that the angels had plenty of time to wait for the 
power of the galaxy to grow. They had no idea that Luther had seen the future and had no intention 
of intervening in the future.

He just gave He Xi a way again. Otherwise, if he took action to destroy Holy Kesha himself, it 
would be strange if the little skirts didn't hate him. How could they come to seek refuge with him?

And Di Leina, Luther's attitude towards Lieyang Civilization is to just wait and see them commit 
suicide.

Pan Zhen felt that he was awesome, and the Lieyang Civilization was also awesome. After 
destroying the Holy Kesha, the God of Death, Karl, used the void engines and warriors developed 
by the void particles obtained from blasting the black hole to destroy the Lieyang Civilization. 
Naturally, it is to get the light of the sun so that he can continue to explode black holes.

They feel that they only need to protect the power of the galaxy and not let the Kryptonian 
civilization, which now knows the importance of the power of the galaxy to the angels, take action 
against the power of the galaxy. Then the angel civilization does not need to choose the Kryptonian 
civilization.

If a fight really breaks out, the angel civilization is actually not afraid of the Kryptonian civilization.

The information He Xi brought back was horrifying, but the scene that Holy Kesha faced when she 
overthrew Hua Ye was even more horrifying and despairing, but she still succeeded.

"What about Kryptonian civilization?"

Hexi asked.

"Can you control him?"

Holy Kesha asked with a smile.

"Fuck you, why don't you do it yourself? Your status and strength are worthy of him anyway, so you 
might as well control him."

He Xi said.

"Tens of thousands of years ago, we experienced a darker and more desperate period. That time has 
passed, let alone now?"

Holy Kesha then said.

"Do you need me to gather all the retired angels?"



He Xi has stored an unknown amount of materials and resources, enough to replace all the retired 
old angels!

Otherwise, you really think that angels have become the overlord of the known universe for so 
many years just to make ends meet. They have never fought such a rich war!

"No need, Kryptonian civilization has no army to invade."

Holy Kesha said.

Hexi recalled that he seemed to have seen a few people in the Supreme Heaven. Although those 
people were ridiculously strong, they were either gods or third-generation super warriors, or even 
third-generation super warriors who had reached the standard of "demigod". That is, angels per 
capita.

Moreover, they are much better armed than Angel Yan. If they really fight, Angel Yan will lose 
more than he wins one on one, and he will definitely die in one against two.

The Kryptonian civilization is also very wealthy, that's right. If it were not wealthy, how could it be 
possible to be worthy of the status of the overlord of the dark universe and the king of the gods 
without this family background?

Those ten third-generation gods of war are all equipped with top-level God-killing power, and their 
weapons are also top-notch. Although He Xi can come up with similar things and can directly create 
thirty third-generation gods, it is unknown whether he can win.

The power of killing gods is too variable, it is the most unreasonable, and it is also the easiest force 
to defeat the strong with the weak!

The Kryptonian civilization must have an army, but is it probably still in the dark universe?

She also didn't wonder why Luther entered the known universe without bringing his own army, just 
like the man came here by himself without bringing his own army?

"There may not be any high-level guarding angels left this time."

He Xi went on to say, facing the power of killing gods, no one can say that they can win surely!

"There may not be a fight."

Holy Kesha has her own opinions and judgments.

"But we still have to be careful of that guy taking action against the power of the Galaxy..."

Holy Kesha had a headache.

At this time, Morgana also had a headache.

"My God wants to see you."

The arrogant black-armored and black-winged God of War chopped down several of her generals as 
soon as she came in. The God-killing power made her dare not act rashly. Although the God-killing 
power could not destroy the fourth-generation divine body, the pain ah.

More importantly, she knew who was standing behind this guy.



"What does that guy think I am, that I can come and go at a moment's notice?"

Morgana snorted coldly.

"Isn't it?"

The black-armored and black-winged God of War said with a smile.
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