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Chapter 11 He Kills Me Again 

Suggestion: Please play and listen to the song above as you read through this chapter. 

……………………………………………………… 

It was dark all I could see is darkness. 

I cried out for help but nobody was there to help us or rather me. Claire was nowhere to 
be found insight. I don’t know where they took her. 

I heard footsteps coming then the door opens widely, two hunters came and drag me by 
my hair, it hurts even though I’m a werewolf. I didn’t even know where they were taking 
me again. They drag me out of the house then into an SUV van, then they blindfold me. 

The car stops I felt hands on my arms once when they let go of the blindfold I look 
around and saw the clearing. We were in the woods in the middle of nowhere. 

Then figures came out of the trees first I saw my mate or ex-mate Eric then Lucian. 

My wolf Eliz howl with excitement that our mate is here. Then we saw the alpha of the 
moon bridge pack with his beta come out from another tree. 

“Let her go” 

Eric says as Eliz keeps jumping around in my head. 

“We’ll give you your men if you only let her go” maybe he’s finally giving us a chance. I 
gulp my saliva nervously. 

ADVERTISEMENT 

The men began to untie me “not her,” I furrow my eyebrow in confusion. 

“Her” 

that’s when I realize and notice Claire who was in another two men’s grip along with the 
other four werewolves. 

My breath hitch, my eyes now burning begging for my tears to drop. 

Then something pierces within me 



He chose her 

He didn’t just choose her again, but even if I’m not the first option I was hoping and still 
wishing he would let me be the second one to be saved. I still cling on to that thin rope. 

The hunter spoke “we can only release five of your kind meaning one will be left here 
with us. Five is the only number we can let go since you have our five men with you.” 

Maybe he’ll pick me I still keep hoping for it and praying to the moon goddess that he 
would. 

Yet my world slowly, harshly came tumbling down again. I was waiting for it yet it didn’t 
happen. 

He pointed his finger to another one and the others until everyone is free except for me. 

ADVERTISEMENT 

Eliz howl in pain that our mate didn’t just leave me here to die. 

He took Claire with him without even a pity or one last look back for me. 

Tears were dropping nonstop from my eyes watching him walk away from me with 
somebody else’s mate. 

Leaving me here at the mercy of the hunter’s hands. 

“And you Alpha Reed?” he shook his head 

“I was only here for my mate, knowing she’s safe now we have to go.” 

So everyone was here to save her, no one was here for me. Eliz keeps howling in pain. 

How lucky is she to have two Alpha protecting her. I couldn’t control my tears by then 
but I couldn’t even beg for my life there was no more hope for me now. 

I saw the alpha giving me a cold look then walk away with his beta. I kept on sobbing as 
the hunters drag me with them. 

“I guess we can keep the most beautiful b**** to entertain us tonight.” 

ADVERTISEMENT 

They laugh all together dragging me back into the car. I didn’t protest as all my energy 
was slowly draining. 



These men didn’t even look at me with sympathy, not even considering if my eyes 
would reflect their daughters, wives, or sisters’ image. 

I may not be like them but then at least think that what if somebody else was doing the 
same thing to their daughter or sister. Yet I guess I’m not all human to them I’m just one 
of the creatures that they would use for their entertainment. 

The car moves but my eyes were still fixed outside the woods, the place where my 
mate, Lucian, and everybody else left me. 

The place fades and I just can’t help but sob again in silence. 

Thinking this is the end of me. No one will help me not even my pack as if they know 
where I am now. 

My Mate successfully kills me again. 
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