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Mr. McNeal nodded and said profoundly, ” That’s good. Run your business
properly. We welcome all legal companies to develop and operate in a
healthy and orderly manner, and we will try our best t o provide the best
management environments for companies like yours.”

After the small delay downstairs, everyone was a little tired because they
had all traveled a long distance. Additionally, the economic forum would
begin in a few hours, so as per Mr. McNeal’s suggestion, everyone
returned t

o their hotel rooms to rest.

Meanwhile, after whispering a few words with Wilbur, Jasper went
directly into a suite that had been prepared a long time ago with Mr.
McNeal.

Mr. McNeal, Ms. Garcia, Mr. Mason, and Tony were all present in the room,
and Jasper saw them talking when he walked in.

“Jasper, the economic forum has made a lot of noise,” Mr. McNeal said to
Jasper.

Jasper nodded and said, “Everyone knows what’s going on right now, so
they also fully support it.”

“That’s good.”

Mr. McNeal sat on the sofa and said to

Jasper, “Did you inform Mr. Coyle?”

Jasper said, “Yeah, I believe Mr. Coyle

should be here soon.”

“Alright, the reason we’re meeting before the economic forum is that you
said Wall Street capital might take action against the foodstuff in the
country. This is not a trivial matter, so we can’t be careless in handling this.
How sure are you?”

Jasper said sincerely, “When it comes to certainty, this is completely my
guess, so I am almost unsure. However, the facts are clear. I believe
Swallow Capital asked some professionals to analyze this too and the
conclusions drawn should be similar to mine, right?”



Mr. McNeal and Mr. Mason glanced at each other and said with a smile,
“You little rascal… Indeed, after you pointed this out, we did find that
Wall Street capital is likely to launch an attack on foodstuffs and use it as
an entry point.”

While they were talking, Mr. Coyle arrived.

This time, he did not bring Wilbur along and came alone.

Obviously, after Wilbur told him that Jasper invited him to a closed-door
meeting, he realized that the things discussed in this closed-door meeting
would be very confidential. Hence, the fewer people knew about this, the
better.

“Mr. Coyle, please sit down.”

After Jasper got up and gestured for Robert to sit down, he sat on the
other side by himself and saw Mr. McNeal eying him. He mulled over this
for a while and then expressed his thoughts.

After more than ten minutes of narration, Jasper added, “So, Soros was
not shooting in the dark when he suddenly went long o n corn and
soybeans after shorting cotton. futures. We think he still has something u
p his sleeves which might end up being a huge conspiracy, a conspiracy to
attempt t o monopolize our domestic foodstuff.”

What was foodstuff?

It was people’s livelihood and the most basic and fundamental commodity
for a country and society.

Since ancient times, people had relied on food. If a country could not even
guarantee its own food security, then there would be no need to talk
about financial security and national defense security because the rest
would be considered nonsense in comparison.

Meanwhile, Robert was particularly

sensitive to this.

He was Terra’s Sugar King, and sugar, like salt, was a basic living material
of human beings. It could be said that Robert had spent his entire life
dealing with these seemingly insignificant things that nobody could do
without.

His brows had been tightly furrowed since the start of Jasper’s narration.



After Jasper finished speaking, Robert said decisively, “If this is the case,
then w e must take any measures to stop them!” “With more than one
billion people in Somerland, the annual foodstuff demand i s huge. Once
there’s a problem with this system, the radiation will cause huge
turbulence that’s effect will be even worse than a direct military invasion!”
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