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Chapter 29 Two New Missions

“E… enough.”

Li Lin staggered a few steps backward. Her pretty face was all red.

She looked at Bai Chen with mixed feelings, a combination of embarrassment, anger, and some 
other strange feelings.

The girl had never dreamt that she would lose her first kiss to the person she had hated all these 
years. And that hatred she had been harboring was now gone, too. For her, it was a feeling that 
could not be put into words.

“Thank you for keeping your word.” Bai Chen licked his lips a little. He looked at 
her cute face that was all pink now with a smile.

He felt very pleased with the preceding kiss, which, of course, was his first.

Li Lin looked at Bai Chen’s face. When their eyes met, she had to turn away because her heart 
skipped a beat for no particular reason.

She did not reply but chose to say something else instead. “I… I’m gonna head back.”

As soon as she was done, Li Lin turned around and ran away without waiting for Bai Chen to say 
anything.

She looked exactly like a rabbit that was trying to flee from a lion.

Bai Chen did not chase after her; he looked at her back with a smiling face instead. He then found 
that she had forgotten the bag of clothes he was holding, so he smiled and ran after her.

“W… why are you following me?!?”

Li Lin heard quick footsteps after her and turned around to see who it was. When she saw that it 
was Bai Chen, her face went even redder. She was thinking all sorts of things about how this guy 
was trying to steal a kiss from her again.

“You forgot your stuff,” he said and gave her the bag.

Li Lin sighed with relief. She was obviously overthinking things. The girl quickly took the bag and 
turned around to run away again.

After a few steps though, she stopped and said, “First kiss… that was my first kiss.”

Then she bolted and left Bai Chen’s sight in a rush after having said what she said.

Bai Chen felt happy in his heart. He had speculated that it must be her first kiss too, but hearing her 
declaring that out loud made him happy nevertheless.

He shouted, “Mine too.”

Li Lin heard what he’d said, but did not stop her from running.



Her heartbeat quickened as she raced and her face turned even rosier, the colour spreading to her 
ears and pale smooth neck.

Ding!

---

[Mission Complete!]

Mission 7: Apologise to the resentful woman (15 points)

Reward: You have received 15 points and the opportunity to receive special skills or items at 
random!

---

Bai Chen heard a sound in his head and saw a mission-accomplishment window had popped up.

He smiled with happiness. Today was indeed a profitable day for him. He had not only completed a 
mission but had gotten his first kiss from the cute girl, Li Lin.

If this was not profit, then he did not know what was!

Bai Chen opened the system window to see some information.

---

[The Life Changing System]

User: Bai Chen

Age: 18 years old

Level: 2 (25/100)

Description: You still need 75 points to level up.

Instruction: If you wish to change your life into what you have always wanted, proceed with the 
following missions!

[Mission Dashboard]

Mission 10: Get rid of the enemy you encounter (20 points)

Mission 11: Pick up the trash in Xing Xiang Park (10 points)

Further Instruction: The order of mission completion is irrelevant. After you are done with the tasks 
assigned to you, you will be given a chance to receive special skills or items at random. The skills 
or items will give you a better life!

[You have 1 opportunity to receive special skills or items at random]

---

After checking out the Life Changing System window, Bai Chen smiled a little. He calculated that 
the points added from missions 10 and 11 would give him 55 points in total today.



Bai Chen obviously wanted to complete both missions 10 and 11 today. He wanted to level up 
faster, which was why he had to hurry up with the missions.

The boy swept his gaze over the two missions for a while, before pressing to see the details of both.

---

[Mission 10: Get rid of the enemy you encounter.]

Instruction: Your enemy has brought forth a strong army to get rid of you. You have to obliterate 
them all.

Reward for success: Win 20 points

Penalty for failure: You will be gravely injured.

---

[Mission 11: Pick up the trash in Xing Xiang Park]

Instruction: Many people visit Xing Xiang Park, but not many try to keep the area clean. The entire 
park has more litter than the cleaners can handle. You have to help out by trying to clean up some of 
the trash from Xing Xiang Park.

Reward for success: Win 10 points

Penalty for failure: The park will be more littered.

---

After reading the details of both missions, Bai Chen decided that he would go with mission 11 first.

As for mission 10, he would deal with it later, knowing full well who the enemies for this mission 
were.

Of course, the army of enemies had to be Ba Guan’s gang. Bai Chen had not upset anyone other 
than that gang.

He made up his mind and closed all the system windows. The boy walked back to the station to 
board a train to return to Xing Xuan Station.

He would head over to Xing Xiang Park to complete the mission. As for the roulette bonus, he 
would try his luck after he got home.
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