
Read God of Life and Death Chapter 5: Grab a wife 

"How is this going?" 

Fang Yue was startled, he was so frightened that he was cautious, and he 
kept jumping. 

With a squeak, Fang Yue pushed open the door, and saw a handsome white 
man with a long sword on his waist, shouting at Fang Yue under the 
moonlight. 

"Catch the thief!" Fang Yue's first reaction was that this person didn't know 
him, and it must be a thief who didn't know where he came from. 

The white-clothed man, with sword eyebrows and star eyes, raised eyebrows, 
sneered at the corners of his lips, showing a disdainful expression: "Want to 
call someone? There are no doors! When I came, I had already planted a 
nine-stroke formation around your courtyard. Seal. Even if you break your 
voice, no one will come to rescue you!" 

Unexpectedly, the other party actually came prepared and took Fang Yue. 

"Damn, isn't this just crossing? Why should I be assassinated? Am I going to 
be the shortest-lived traverser in the history of crossing?" 

In Fang Yue's mind, there were all messy things. The more nervous he is, the 
more difficult it is for him to calm his mood. 

"You and I have no grudges in the past, and today I have no grudges, neither 
of my acridines knows you, why are you looking for me? Did you admit the 
wrong person!" 

Fang Yue tried his best to delay time, and various thoughts kept pouring in his 
mind, wondering how to escape to heaven. 

Fang Yue's security system is really bad. The dignified princely family's home 
was regarded as a back garden, and it was easy to break in. What a creation 
this is! 

Well, according to the original memory in the body, the martial artist of this 
secular world is divided into three levels: apprentice, martial artist, and military 
commander. Each level is subdivided into three levels: elementary, 



intermediate, and advanced! I am, almost an intermediate apprentice! So what 
level of this buddy? Paralysis, can't see it clearly! 

Egg hurts! 

Fang Yue broke his fingers for a long time, but he couldn't see why. 

"Huh? No grievances and no grudges? You take my love and rob my wife. 
This is a great hatred! Today, even if I risk being wanted by the Fang family 
and the Chu family, I will fight Cut off your head. To relieve my hatred!" 

The man in white was full of spirits and said to Fang Yue awe-inspiringly. 

"Gah? The hatred of taking away your wife? Special, I'm still a virgin, take you 
a hairball! This is definitely not done, Lao Wang is next door, he is wronged, 
he is in debt, so quickly find him!" 

Fang Yue pointed to the wall next to him, talking nonsense. 

The white-clothed man frowned, "Who is Lao Wang? What is he doing to 
Mengying?" 

A bitter murderous aura leaked from the body of the white-clothed man. 

As if a sword mountain and a sea of fire descended on, Fang Yue couldn't 
breathe with the sudden killing intent. 

Fang Yue suddenly said: "It turns out that Chu Mengying is your wife. She is a 
little bitch, she turned out to be a second marriage, no wonder the original 
owner of this body would rather die than to wear a pair of torn shoes!" 

"Shut up, you are not allowed to insult my goddess! I have never met Miss 
Chu, but I saw her beautiful face in a picture scroll. Since then, I think about it 
day and night. I can't remember it, since then I named her Liu Zhengyi's wife, 
whoever is stronger with me, I will kill whoever!" 

The murderous intent of the man in white is even stronger. 

Fang Yue was dumbfounded, fucking, the legendary fan of the brains, all this 
can be encountered, the luck after this crossing is really leverage! 

No one has ever met, so you have decided on your future wife's identity. This 
is who gave you the courage to live until now! 



Also, the name Liu Zhengyi. Your mother is illiterate! No wonder this straight 
man's name is so handsome that he can't find a match. 

"I don't bully you. Now I will give you a chance to make a move. If you can 
beat me by one and a half strokes, I will turn around and go! Otherwise, I will 
take your head as the price for you to defile my goddess! " 

As his name suggests, Liu Zhengyi is loyal. 

"Then I will now announce the dissolution of the marriage contract, so as not 
to tarnish the goddess in your dreams. We both go home to sleep, so why 
not?" 

Fang Yue said weakly, he really didn't have the confidence to act with others. 

Although this physical body has a powerful force, Fang Yue is a 
transcendence! Memories are just like movies. For reference and 
understanding only. 

As a good socialist young man, Fang Yue has never killed a chicken, let alone 
fight with others! 

In the memory of the original owner of the body, there are indeed hands-on 
experiences with people, and many times. 

But Fang Yue still won't make any moves. This is the same as you've seen 
Resident Evil from one to six in the movie theater, and you can't beat 
zombies! 

"No!" Liu Zhengyi rightly rejected Fang Yue's suggestion. 

"You announced the dissolution of the marriage contract with my goddess, 
which is also an insult to my goddess! In my heart, my goddess is perfect, and 
you are the only stain in her life and must be removed!" 

The atmosphere was suddenly tense, dark clouds covered the moon, and the 
earth was dark! 

In the small yard, the two confronted each other, a murderous intent rippling 
endlessly! 

No data found. 



 


