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Chapter 103
After burying her head in Kristy’s arms for a long time, Miriam gradually calmed down,
rubbed her red eyes, looked at her, and started asking her about her, “How are you and
Mr. Huo?”

Kristy was stunned. She blushed at her face just now, and coughed unnaturally. She
pretended to be calm and said: “It’s back to the way it was before, but now he always
takes me on business trips. Take care of me too.”

“…”

Miriam blinked, “Nothing? He didn’t show you anything again? Didn’t you knock on the
side?”

Kristy looked at her, her eyes darkened, and she shook her head, “No, he didn’t like to
talk very much, and he was so serious every day, I couldn’t guess it.”

“Then you haven’t tried again?”

As if something had been poked, Kristy’s eyelids turned upwards, and she said without
grace: “Damn! Don’t mention it, why not, I was in the company before, including a
suitor’s rose in front of him, he He didn’t even react to the fart, and never mentioned it
afterwards.”

“…”

Miriam didn’t know what to say. The way she could think of, Kristy was smart and could
think of more. This didn’t work. Is it really in vain?

“He never touched you again?”

Kristy’s expression was a little weird, I don’t know if it was a loss or a fortune, she
watched her obediently shook her head, “Since that time, I have never dared to drink
more, and I just drink a little while socializing, so he didn’t commit a mess again. Keep
your distance from me.”

“…”

Miriam couldn’t figure it out. What was the man doing? I felt that he was more
emotionally restrained than Bryan.

Kristy didn’t know what she was thinking, she tilted her head and entangled, and said:
“Actually, I thought afterwards, if I want to get drunk again or pretend to be drunk, try his
attitude, but I saw a picture in his wallet. Later, I gave up decisively.”



Miriam was stunned and surprised: “He, he won’t be married, right?”

Kristy shook her head in loss, “I asked him if he was married before the incident, and he
said no, but that picture is indeed a little girl, in her twenties, very beautiful, she should
be a girlfriend.”

“Have you ever seen a real person?” Miriam tightened her eyebrows, her delicate facial
features were tied together.

Could it be a misunderstanding?

“I haven’t seen it, but I heard him answer the phone.” Kristy said, holding her hand and
suppressing her voice, “I have never seen him talk to anyone so tenderly.”

It’s really gentle and very jealous.

Miriam’s mood became even more uncomfortable for a while, and quickly calmed down:
“Don’t think about it, maybe it’s not what you think. When he went to find you that day, I
didn’t think the anxiety in his eyes was pretending.”

Kristy scratched her hair and sighed: “I thought about it later, so let’s forget it. If he can
keep like this with me, at the very least it means that my vision is not bad, and the others
are not bad. Maybe that night we both I drank the fragment, and he was responsible for
it. I also refused. Then this incident has never happened, so why bother to separate the
couple.”

Miriam looked at her and pulled the corners of her lips with a helpless smile, “Your three
attitudes really make the juniors feel helpless. Since you keep your distance, why does
he take you with you every time you travel?”

“…” Kristy choked, her eyes rolled, she didn’t know how to answer, and stuttered: “This,
this, I don’t know.”

“Are you now his personal assistant?”

The woman’s eyes widened immediately, “No, this lady has her own job, but I don’t want
to go, but he has a valid excuse every time. He is my boss again. What can I say?”

Miriam’s eyes fell deep in the distance, thinking.

“Oh, I don’t want to think about it…it’s so annoying.” Kristy waved her hand with an
annoyed look. Thinking of something, she pulled her and said: “Oh, yes, you are not
going to work these days, how did the company explain it? “

At present, few people outside know that she is the daughter of Judge Lok Ma, City Two,
and she will cover up and do not want to cause unnecessary trouble.

“I took time off, saying that my mother was sick.” Miriam said quietly.



No matter who is sick, they must be inseparable from the hospital these days.
Fortunately, President Henry hasn’t explored much. She hasn’t had time to worry about
the company’s affairs these days, and she doesn’t know how the department is going.

“All right, if you are too busy looking back, tell me, I can take care of you when I have
time.”

Miriam looked at her and smiled gratefully, “Lin, thank you.”

The two chatted together for a while before Kristy left.

Downstairs in the hospital, Kristy carried her bag, walked a few steps and stopped, took
out her mobile phone, and dialed a number to go out.

After connecting, she said as she walked: “I delivered the money for you. She didn’t
seem to have any doubts, and her mood eased a little. What you worry about shouldn’t
happen.”

There was silence on the phone for a few seconds, and a low male voice slowly
sounded, “Thank you, Miss Kristy.”

Kristy slowed down, looked at the blue sky and the day, and said quietly: “Mr. Shao,
although I don’t want her to do anything regrettable, I still hope you can think about it
from her point of view. How about this money? I will not explore what kind of mentality it
gives, but your identity will inevitably put her in an awkward and embarrassing situation,
as long as a woman who needs to point her face will probably not accept it.”

“I understand, otherwise I won’t find Miss Last Week.”

Kristy raised her eyebrows and sneered, and interrupted him coldly, “You don’t
understand! You also came to me after making a fuss? You just saw her troubles and
thought she needed help, thinking that as long as you give If she is not stupid, she
should accept it. Mr. Shao, oh no, Mr. Shao, you still don’t understand Miriam’s heart,
and you don’t really understand why she insisted on divorcing you in the first place.”

The phone was completely silent over there.

Just when Kristy thought he was going to hang up, the man’s voice rang again, “Miss
Kristy knows?”

“Heh…” The woman sneered with her red lips curled up, “I know, but what if I know?
You know I won’t tell you. If you still can’t understand, then you can only be destined to
be inappropriate .”

It was also the infatuation of the girl who had been blind for years.



The man’s calm voice came, “I didn’t want to ask you any more questions, but I would
like to thank Miss Kristy for her words. You have worked so hard to make a few more
trips these days.”

When the words fell, I hung up over there.

Kristy was taken aback for a moment, took off the phone and looked at it, staring and
curling her lips severely, “It’s really slow and hopeless.”

Chapter 104
The problem of the operation fee was solved, and Miriam temporarily relaxed, as long as
he waited for approval, he could transfer Lu’s father to the hospital for surgery.

Father Lu’s situation did not improve. Although he woke up, he could only squint to see
people, and couldn’t speak. Miriam and her mother took turns to take care of the night.

When both of them were asleep, Miriam found some time to deal with work.

There were a lot of documents in the mailbox waiting for her confirmation.

When I looked through it, I found a private email with the sender of Mu Ming.

When she opened it, she was a little bit dumbfounded.

In the past few days, because of her busy schedule, she returned her work number, and
there was no time to answer some calls. This kid would even think of sending her an
email.

Asked when she would go back and whether her mother was very sick. He was planning
to organize a delegation with colleagues from the department to visit the company on
behalf of the company.

Miriam was really afraid of him coming, so she changed her hand and touched her
mobile phone and made a call.

Mu Ming’s brisk voice came over cheerfully, “Sister Miriam, you finally called. I thought
you didn’t want us anymore.”

Miriam smiled, “Why, miss me?”

“Yes, it’s almost grass growing.”

The corner of Miriam’s mouth twitched, “Is it going to be moldy when I am idle?”

“Hey, no, you are not here, our department still strictly requires ourselves.” Mu Ming
laughed.



Then he asked: “Auntie’s illness is really serious? How many days will you get back?”

Miriam pursed her lips and thought about how to answer, and then said: “It’s a bit tricky,
but it’s not a big deal. It’s just that there are other things to deal with at home, and I may
have to go back later.”

“Is this serious?” Mu Ming became worried.

“Don’t worry, it’s not very serious. You just need to work hard there and let me rest
assured.” Miriam pretended to smile casually.

Mu Ming laughed and said: “I am here alone, without relatives and no cause, and
nothing is wrong. Or I will help you after work. You are still pregnant, my brother is not at
ease.”

“Don’t.” Miriam trembled with fright, hurriedly refused, and then joked, “The hospital
needs a quiet place. I can’t stand your shrewd temperament. I can’t bear it when you
come over. Alone, do you have the heart to mess with me?”

“Sister Miriam…” The boy on the other side of the phone stretched his voice, and said
pitifully, “What you said hurt me, I thought I was your right-hand man.”

Miriam hurriedly smiled, “Yes, it’s about work, it’s about life, I can do it myself, sister.”

Mu Ming changed his tone and said seriously: “Really don’t help? Is it convenient for
you?”

“It hasn’t been a few months, nothing will happen.” Miriam said sincerely, “Thank you for
your pastoral name, please tell everyone that I am nothing serious, just let them rest
assured, don’t have to come, I will go back soon Up.”

“Oh, all right.” He agreed boredly.

“Then go ahead, I won’t bother you.” Miriam smiled and hung up the phone.

At this moment, on the other side of the mobile phone, Mu Ming was standing in front of
the corridor window, hung up the phone, the expression on his face gradually faded until
it became cold.

The cool breeze from the window blew in, and he slowly opened the page of his phone,
looking at the black headlines of the news headlines, the smile on the corners of his
mouth was no longer innocent, a bit cold and oozing.

[Judge City Two Lok Ma suffered a stroke in prison…]

…
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