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Chapter 145

“Oh, I’ll go to bed right away.” Father Lu said softly, and then fell silent again. I don’t
know if something was brewing. Miriam didn’t say or ask, let alone get up.

Half a minute later, the old man opened his mouth and looked at her and begged:
“Miriam…can you help Dad do something?”

Miriam lowered her eyes, still without any extra expressions on her face, raised her
eyebrows lightly, “What else have you not explained to the court? Let me help you with
the aftermath?”

“…”

Father Lu was a little embarrassed, pursed his lips, and said nonchalantly: “It’s not what
you think…”

Miriam blinked, “Then why don’t you tell mom and wait for me to come back to help
you?”

“I don’t want your mother to worry about it, and tell her that she can’t do anything. Her
legs are inconvenient, so don’t let her toss.”

Miriam curled her lips, “Then I’m still pregnant.”

Father Lu choked immediately.

Indeed, now the family should say that the most worrying thing in the family should be
her, running around with a big belly, how can they relax.

There was a trace of guilt on the old face, and he didn’t say more.

Seeing him like this, Miriam couldn’t help feeling soft again, and said helplessly: “Okay, I
was joking with you. I didn’t say this to worry you, but just to tell you, don’t think it is, hide
everything in your heart. My mother can see it clearly, you can feel it without saying.”

“Speak, what do you want me to do?”

“Miriam…” Father Lu was moved in his heart. He raised his skinny arm with only bones
to touch her head, but he gave up halfway and said hoarsely: “I have an old friend,
tomorrow Birthday, I want you to help me see her.”

Miriam was startled, “Your friend? What kind of friend, he didn’t come when you had an
accident. You still remember his birthday.”



The wall fell down and everyone pushed, not to mention that he was a corrupt official
who fell from the horse. He used to have so many friends. After the accident, no one
came to visit. This time he was seriously ill. Although the news is confidential, the news
broadcast is also released immediately. , Still no one came over.

She saw it clearly when she borrowed the money, and now she suddenly heard him
mention a friend, so she was so surprised.

Father Lu looked into the distance with turbid eyes, dazed not knowing what to think,
and murmured, “She passed away…”

Miriam’s expression condensed, her lips moved a few times, and her mood suddenly
fell.

Birthday, not the anniversary of death, did he let her go to the grave?

No wonder he is in a bad spirit today.

Miriam was quiet for a few seconds without asking much, but her voice became softer, “I
will help you to see him tomorrow and tell me his name and address.”

Father Lu’s eyes were happy, and he couldn’t help holding her hand with a touch of
relief. After a few seconds, he slowly said: “She’s Mushan, you should call her aunt…”

“Wait!” Miriam’s expression changed, and she suddenly interrupted him, her eyes
narrowed, “Mushan…auntie? Female?”

He talked about an old friend for a long time, and she thought it was an old buddy.

“No wonder you dare not tell my mother, it turns out that you really have romantic debts
outside. You still remember it after you passed away.”

Her face gradually cooled.

The messy things between the officials and the mistress are nothing new. He can
embezzle her mother behind her back. How can it be impossible to mess around outside
without her mother behind?

Father Lu’s complexion changed, he panicked, propped up on the bed, half-length
wanted to get up, coughing anxiously, “Miriam, no, uhhhhh, not what you think, dad
swears to God that I am absolutely not sorry for your mother… …She is just an old
friend I knew a long time ago, and just passed away before I went to prison…”

As he said, his eyes gradually dimmed, and he wanted to speak again, his eyes rushing
with struggle and a trace of guilt, there seemed to be something unspeakable, and
finally he sighed, still not saying anything, pursing his lips and lying down again.



Miriam looked at him calmly, knowing he was disrespectful, but still laughed mockingly,
“Your old friend of the opposite s3x…my mother doesn’t know it yet, co-authored…is a
confidante? I remember that my birthday is today. If she is still there, if you are still a
good judge, are you planning to carry my mother to celebrate her birthday and present
her today?”

Marriage, co-authoring is just like this, right? Lie and deceive for a lifetime, pretending to
be foolish, and smiling and respecting each other when facing each other.

She didn’t want to deceive herself at first, so she took the initiative to end the wrong
marriage with Bryan. If she continued like that, would she have to be like her mother?

“Miriam…” Father Lu’s expression darkened, and his thin, old face was at a loss. He
seemed to want to explain, but he didn’t know where to start. After a dull day, he
intermittently squeezed out an excuse, imploring. Taste: “She is not a confidante, and I
and her are not the kind of relationship you think… Don’t tell your mother about this, I
don’t want her to think too much.”

Miriam’s pretty face was faint, “Even if you used to have a little bit of a little bit, I won’t tell
her if you don’t tell her, I can’t take care of you, but I can’t let my mother get hurt again,
you I’m sorry, except for the people, there is only her.”

“I know…” Father Lu was sad.

“Okay, tell me the address, I will visit tomorrow.” Miriam said and stood up.

“Lincheng, Hongxing District… Cypress Cemetery.”

Miriam wrinkled her brows, a little surprised, “Lincheng?”

Lincheng, this place seems to have appeared in her ear more than once recently, and it
seems familiar.

There was a flash in her mind, and she remembered that Mu Ming’s home seemed to be
in Lincheng.

Father Lu was puzzled, “What’s wrong?”

Miriam shook her head thoughtfully, “No, nothing…I know, I will be there tomorrow
morning.”

“Okay, well…” Father Lu loosened his eyebrows, as if he had fulfilled some wish, smiled
contentedly at her, and slowly closed his eyes tiredly.

Miriam’s eyes deepened, she looked down at him, stood by the bed for a while, turned
off the light and left.

…



The next day, because the trip to Lincheng was too sudden, she didn’t have any
preparations, so she planned to go back to the company to handle some things first, and
then ask for leave afterwards.

When he left the house, both Lu’s father and Tian Tian were still awake. Miriam
confessed to Lu’s mother who was cleaning up the table, “Mom, Dad may be tired of
staying in the house, doesn’t he have a wheelchair? You can push him in the community.
Go around, but be careful when you go downstairs.”

“Annoying?” Mother Lu snorted, wiping the table heavily and cursing, “I am not annoying
if I stay at home and guard him every day. If he is not sick, he is still in the small iron
gate. It’s locked, something I don’t know to repent of.”

“…”

Miriam couldn’t tell the truth, so she touched her nose angrily, changed her shoes,
straightened her hair, and said with a dry smile: “Mom, Tian Tian, you have to work hard
for a long time, she is very good. , Won’t run around, don’t forget to feed her food and
drink.”

If she didn’t go to Lincheng, she would definitely take the child with her.

Chapter 146

“Understood, your mother and I have raised you so much, and still use you to teach how
to raise children? You go to work, and be careful on the way.”

“…Oh, then I’m leaving, bye.”

In the elevator, Miriam walked in and habitually pressed the minus first floor, raised her
eyes, her expression condensed, she lowered her head and her white fingers and
clicked the next floor button.

The elevator stopped on the first floor. She was carrying a bag, with no expression on
her delicate face, and without going to the parking lot, she walked straight out of the
apartment building.

At the intersection outside the community, she raised her hand to check the time, and
was about to stop the car. A black car passed by and stopped in front of her.

Miriam frowned, ignored it, and was about to retreat to the side when the car door
suddenly opened, revealing a familiar face.

“Miss Lu.”

The woman was taken aback, looked up and saw the big tall man in front of her, her face
suddenly changed, “Yan Ke? You, why are you…”



She remembered what the man said on the phone last night, her expression changed
again, and she said solemnly, “He asked you to come?”

Yan Ke nodded calmly and respectfully, “Well, Mr. Shao asked me to take you to work.”

Miriam refused, “No, I can fight by myself, you can go back.”

I thought he had listened to her last night, but she was still playing the piano to the cow.

For the sake of the child, she doesn’t plan to drive to work again in the future, but she
wakes up early and is completely in time for the taxi or the shuttle bus. She is not dear
enough to be picked up.

Yan Ke’s tall and straight body blocked her way quietly, and said quietly: “Miss Lu, I was
hired by Mr. Shao. This is my job. I can’t listen to you. If you don’t want to, you can. Let
Mr. Shao tell me to go back.”

“You!” Miriam was speechless.

Clenched his fist, not wanting to waste time with him, quickly took out his mobile phone
and dialed a number.

Connected after ringing for ten seconds.

“Hello, this is Secretary Lin, and Mr. Shao is in a meeting. You can tell me if you have
anything or call me later.”

“…”

Meeting?

Miriam squeezed the phone, before she spoke, her pretty face went dark when Lin Shui
finished speaking in one breath.

“No need.” She took a deep breath and was about to hang up.

“Wait, you are Miss Lu?” Lin Shui seemed to hear her voice and her tone changed.

Miriam’s voice faded, “It’s me. If he doesn’t have time, I’ll hang up.”

But in the next second, it was replaced by a deep, familiar male voice, “You are looking
for me?”

Miriam’s face changed slightly, and her heart moved.

Isn’t he in… a meeting?



But there was no time to think about it. She was rushing to work, and her tone suddenly
became cold.”Bryan, let Yan Ke go back. I don’t need someone to send it. Didn’t you
understand what happened last night?”

The man’s tone sank, “Did you drive again today?”

Miriam bit her lower lip, “No.”

“Since you didn’t drive, you were taking the bus and squeezing the bus. Don’t even think
about squeezing the bus. You might as well take his car and pay him back.”

“…”

Miriam’s face turned black, completely unable to refute.

Taking a deep breath, she couldn’t bear it, “Bryan, can you not be so naive, I’m rushing
to work, I don’t have time to waste with you two.”

The man was still calm, without any impatience at all, “There are also a group of people
waiting for me to go back to the meeting, boy, you are just riding in a car, you can treat
him as if he doesn’t exist.”

“…”

Miriam raised her eyes and glanced at Yan Ke.

When he does not exist?

She is not blind.
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