
Love After Marriage, He Got A Free Wife  

 

Chapter 121: Not Being a Good Person 

 

After the middle-aged man left, only the husband and wife were left in the office. Fang 
Xiaonuan had already sensed her husband’s increasingly intense gaze, so she went up 
to him directly. The man who had a murderous aura just now was completely different 
from the gentle husband from before. In that moment just now, it was as if she had 
transported to the time when the two of them had just gotten married. She did not like 
how bad his temper was. 

Ji Lingchen’s heart was already filled with anger. Just now, he was interrupted by his 
wife, and the anger in his heart began burning even more intensely. He suddenly sat 
down on the boss’s chair, and the chair creaked from the impact. 

“Did you sleep enough? You don’t even remember who I am?” Ji Lingchen asked in a 
low voice. His gaze had been fixed on this little wife who seemed to have no regrets 
about her actions. After so long, she still did not explain, so he could only speak first. Ji 
Lingchen did not know that his current behavior was a form of compromise. 

Fang Xiaonuan pouted and said angrily, “I just don’t want that man to know that you’re 
my husband.” 

Without a doubt, Ji Lingchen’s expression turned even darker when he heard this. 
Clearly, he was even angrier. His eyes were pitch black as he stared into his wife’s eyes 
and waited for an explanation. 

Fang Xiaonuan said, “My husband should be the good-tempered, mild-mannered, 
reasonable, and extremely respectful Ji Lingchen. He’s not someone who yells at his 
subordinates or throws things at people.” 

Huh? His little wife was complaining that he was too harsh on his subordinate just now. 

Fang Xiaonuan was not afraid of Ji Lingchen. If he bullied her, she would fight with him. 
Her mindset was very simple. She continued, “So if I say that you’re my husband, 
everyone will know that I, Fang Xiaonuan, married a bad-tempered man. He’s simply 
inhuman. Shame on me!” 

Ji Lingchen was speechless. His wife was scolding him again for being inhuman. 



Fang Xiaonuan continued, “Since that’s the case, I’ll let you experience what it feels like 
to be disrespected.” Then, she deliberately called Ji Lingchen “uncle” and said that Ji 
Lingchen was an old man who liked to date young women and that he had a bad 
character. 

Fang Xiaonuan’s words were like gasoline to Ji Lingchen’s anger. However, she was 
also the fire extinguisher. When Ji Lingchen looked at his wife’s cute demeanor, he 
would not be able to lose his temper no matter what. If anyone else said these things to 
Ji Lingchen, even members of his own family, he would not take it sitting down. 
However, the person who was saying these things was his little wife, his little kitten. He 
could only endure it! 

Fang Xiaonuan did not know what her husband was thinking at all. She was still 
chattering non-stop. “You just threw reports at someone. That’s too much. You don’t 
look like a good person at all.” 

Ji Lingchen said nothing. It was over. His own wife saw him as a bad person. 

Fang Xiaonuan said, “That man just now was about the same age as Dad. You scolded 
him just like that and even threw things at him. You didn’t care about his pride at all. If 
his children saw this, wouldn’t they want to scold you for it? If someone treats my dad 
like that, I’ll definitely get even with that person!” 

Ji Lingchen suddenly realized that his little wife had turned things around and made him 
think of his subordinate as her father. 

Ji Lingchen said, “Your father is the chairman of the Fang Corporation. No one would 
treat him like this.” Right now, he was Ji Lingchen’s father-in-law as well. People would 
fawn over him. Who would dare to get angry at him? 

Fang Xiaonuan frowned and stomped her feet. “Hubby, why don’t you understand what 
I mean? The point is that you don’t respect people!” 

Ji Lingchen said, “But he’s just a subordinate. I’m paying him a high salary…” 

Fang Xiaonuan said, “So you can humiliate him with a high salary?” 

Ji Lingchen took a deep breath and suppressed his anger. He patiently explained, 
“Xiaonuan, listen to me. The mistake he made just now was the lowest mistake a new 
employee could make. There are two possibilities. First, he took the data directly from 
his subordinates. Second, he deliberately wanted to fool me. That’s why I’m so angry.” 

“He is a veteran employee of the company, so I asked him to do it again. If it were 
anyone else, I would have fired him immediately and he wouldn’t even have the chance 
to correct his mistake.” 



“You said that I threw the reports at him. That is indeed my fault. I admit my mistake.” 

“I was really too angry, so I couldn’t control my actions. I promise there won’t be a 
repeat of this, okay?” 

Ji Lingchen patiently explained it all to his wife. 

However, Fang Xiaonuan did not seem to be able to accept such an explanation. Her 
brows were still tightly furrowed and she did not say a word. 

 

Chapter 122: Recent Developments of the Finance 
Director 

 

Ji Lingchen simply rose from his office chair and walked over to his little wife. He took 
her hand and said, “Xiaonuan, I will definitely listen to your suggestions and heed them.” 

“But there are some things that you shouldn’t interfere in. The Ji Corporation would not 
be where it is right now if I was gentle on everyone.” 

“Sometimes, using certain methods is very normal. There are definitely things that you 
won’t be able to accept, so it’s best that you don’t see them.” 

Hearing this, Fang Xiaonuan’s attitude softened. She said, “Hubby, although this is the 
case, I still feel that your actions just now were very excessive. Since he is an old 
employee, he definitely knows your temper. He must be a supervisor if he was allowed 
to provide a report at your office. How could such a high-level employee make such a 
low-level mistake? There must be a reason for this.” 

Hearing his wife’s words, Ji Lingchen fell into deep thought. What his wife said made 
sense. Thinking back, his subordinate was acting a little strange just now. Although he 
would usually make some small mistakes, this person was generally very serious about 
his work. It was precisely because of this that he slowly promoted this employee to his 
current position. Therefore, there was definitely something wrong here. 

After thinking about it carefully, he said to his wife, “Xiaonuan, you head home first. I will 
investigate this matter properly. If he really has something to hide, I will do as I see fit. Is 
that okay?” 

Fang Xiaonuan pursed her lips. Then, her husband coaxed her into the exclusive 
elevator. 



Just as the elevator door was about to close, Fang Xiaonuan suddenly stretched out her 
small hand to stop the doors from closing. She asked, “Hubby, are you coming home for 
dinner tonight?” 

Ji Lingchen replied, “I have something to do tonight, so I’ll be home later.” 

When Fang Xiaonuan heard the answer, she let out a disappointed “Oh” and let go. The 
elevator doors slowly closed and she was sent downstairs. 

After returning to the office, Ji Lingchen called his assistant in. “Go and investigate the 
director of the finance department. Look into recent developments of his home life as 
well.” 

The assistant asked doubtfully, “Jiang Rui, Director Jiang?” 

Ji Lingchen nodded. He sat in the chair and leaned back. He looked at his assistant and 
asked, “Has there been anything unusual about him recently?” 

The assistant said, “CEO Ji, he has been the focus of discussion among the employees 
of the company recently. Everyone feels sorry for him.” 

Ji Lingchen frowned. It turned out that something had really happened. He looked at his 
assistant and waited for his next words. 

The assistant said, “His wife abandoned him and ran off with someone else. She even 
took away all his money. His mother is old. When she heard about this, she was so 
angry that she had a stroke. His daughter is studying abroad. I heard that the chaotic 
relationship at home might lead to the school expelling her.” 

Ji Lingchen rarely cared about his subordinates’ family matters. He only cared about his 
work and never cared about their home life. 

Ji Lingchen asked, “Why did his wife leave with someone else?” 

The assistant said, “This is his second wife. I heard from the company’s older 
employees that his mother didn’t like her first daughter-in-law. She had forcefully 
separated the two of them.” 

“Originally, his life was pretty good. His second wife even gave birth to a son. His son is 
going to enter junior high this year.” 

“Who knew that his wife would actually fool around with her fitness trainer? I don’t know 
if she was bewitched by someone, but she hardened her heart and took all his assets 
away. Then, she eloped with the fitness trainer. She didn’t even want her own son, let 
alone her husband.” 



“The daughter living abroad was conceived in his first marriage. The stepmother 
naturally could not discipline her wholeheartedly. The daughter was also unhappy in her 
new family, so Director Jiang sent her to study abroad. However, when she went abroad 
things became more and more outrageous…” 

The assistant told Ji Lingchen many stories about Jiang Rui. 

Ji Lingchen frowned and said, “How troublesome!” 

The assistant nodded in agreement. “Yes, we really can’t do anything about these 
things. It’s not just about the money; everything in the family is a mess. He has been in 
a daze recently.” 

Hearing that, Ji Lingchen massaged his temples. Dealing with family matters was not 
his strong suit at all. 

Ji Lingchen said, “I understand. You can leave.” 

The assistant asked curiously, “CEO, was this all you wanted to know about Director 
Jiang?” 

Ji Lingchen thought of his little wife throwing a tantrum at him and felt a little depressed. 
He was not in the mood to answer the assistant’s question. Instead, he instructed, “Go 
and call the head secretary over.” 

The assistant said, “Yes sir.” 

The assistant left the office. Not long after, the head secretary came in. 

 

Chapter 123: How to Coax A Child 

 

Everyone in the capital knew that Ji Lingchen had two capable right-hand men by his 
side. One was Assistant Liu, who was responsible for all public affairs and was good at 
diplomacy. The other was Head Secretary Song. Secretary Song was a middle-aged 
woman who was very capable. She was mainly in charge of all the internal operations of 
the company. She was both courageous and meticulous. 

Ji Lingchen was very good at managing people. He knew what kind of people to place 
in those positions. There had been people who had tried to poach these two, but they 
refused to be tempted. They wholeheartedly stayed with Ji Lingchen. After this 
happened a few times, the two felt that the outside offers were getting too annoying, 



and so they directly said to Ji Lingchen, “CEO Ji, they have recently gotten very 
annoying. We want to work in peace.” 

Ji Lingchen was furious. He had directly purchased the Aki Company, turning it into a 
subsidiary of the Ji Corporation. This action of his was a warning to others. If anyone 
wanted to poach talent from him, not only would they be unsuccessful, they might even 
lose their company. 

“CEO, you were looking for me?” Secretary Song entered the office and asked 
respectfully. 

Ji Lingchen asked, “I just wanted to ask you, if a child is throwing a tantrum, how do I 
coax her? What should I give her?” 

A child? Secretary Song’s brain worked at lightning speed. She immediately knew that 
the CEO was talking about his young wife. 

Secretary Song calmly replied, “It depends on what she’s angry about.” After all, there 
were many things to consider when giving gifts. 

Secretary Song had been responsible for the company’s employee benefits and 
customer business gifts over the years. She was able to handle things properly every 
time. 

Ji Lingchen said, “She was angry because she felt that my style of doing things is too 
excessive.” 

Secretary Song thought for a moment and replied, “You can give Mrs. Ji jewelry. Mrs. Ji 
is very particular about how she dresses but doesn’t wear any jewelry. Why don’t you 
give her a bracelet or necklace that she can wear on a daily basis?” 

While Ji Lingchen was thinking about it, Secretary Song said again, “Madam is angry, 
but she should not be picky about a gift. So, I believe that as long as you choose a gift 
carefully and there are no further arguments, she will understand your intentions and 
won’t pursue this matter any further.” 

Ji Lingchen nodded and said, “Come with me to the social gathering tonight.” 

Secretary Song said, “Then Assistant Liu, he…” 

Ji Lingchen said, “He doesn’t have good taste. He often works overtime at the 
company.” 

Secretary Song said, “Yes.” 



Ji Lingchen was referring to taste in jewelry. He was going to pick something out for his 
wife. 

After work, Secretary Song and Ji Lingchen headed to the social gathering venue 
together. On the way there, they deliberately took a detour to the shopping mall. 

“CEO, I thought you would call the boss of the jewelry company to order it and have it 
sent to your office directly,” Secretary Song said. 

Ji Lingchen said, “Since it’s an apology gift, you have to buy it in person to show 
sincerity. If I wait for it to be sent to the company, I will have to wait till tomorrow.” 

Ji Lingchen was already able to picture how angry his wife would look tonight. She 
would call him “uncle” again and insult him left and right. 

“Let me see this bracelet,” Ji Lingchen said, pointing to a golden bracelet on the 
brochure. 

The manager heard this and immediately ordered his staff to open the safe to get the 
bracelet. 

When Ji Lingchen personally arrived at a store, the store would send the highest 
management staff to receive him. The store would be closed immediately and would no 
longer receive any customers. 

“May I ask, CEO Ji, is this bracelet for…” the manager trailed off. 

“My wife,” Ji Lingchen replied. 

The manager was so surprised that his mouth was wide open, and he was speechless 
for a while. He did not expect the decisive CEO Ji to be such a romantic person. 

After they took out the bracelet, Ji Lingchen carefully looked at the seemingly ordinary, 
but exceptionally eye-catching bracelet in his hand. 

The manager quickly explained the design philosophy of the bracelet, the technology 
used to make it, the emotions expressed, and so on. 

Secretary Song often read fashion magazines, and she recognized the bracelet at a 
glance. She said to Ji Lingchen, “CEO, this bracelet is the work of an internationally 
famous designer, Mr. Phelps. It’s not cheap, and it’s a very sincere gift. The bracelet is 
very dazzling, and Madam’s skin is already fair. She’ll definitely look very beautiful in it. I 
believe that she will love such an exquisite and thoughtful gift.” 

Ji Lingchen nodded in satisfaction. He put the bracelet back into the box, took out a 
black card, and said, “I’ll take it.” 



Ji Lingchen smiled as he left the jewelry store with the small gift. 

In the car, Secretary Song said, “CEO Ji, you’re really good to your wife.” That was 
obvious. He just bought a bracelet worth millions. 

Ji Lingchen was in a good mood. “She’s just a child. If I don’t go along with her wishes, 
her little temper will be hard on the whole family.” 

 

Chapter 124: Children Don’t Listen 

 

The child Ji Lingchen was talking about was quietly walking to the refrigerator. When no 
one was looking, she stole an ice-cream and went back to the bedroom. Now that Fang 
Xiaonuan’s stomach was no longer hurting, she had begun craving things again. After 
eating the ice-cream, Fang Xiaonuan leaned on the bed and called Old Master Ji, who 
was far away in the hospital, to ask him how he was feeling today. 

“Dad, Lingchen has a social engagement tonight, so we won’t be able to visit you. 
Moreover, you will be discharged tomorrow,” Fang Xiaonuan said. 

Old Master Ji drank the stomach-nourishing vegetable porridge made by his eldest 
daughter-in-law and said happily, “Yes, yes, you don’t have to come. I’m fine here. With 
your brother-in-law and sister-in-law here, you don’t have to worry.” 

Fang Xiaonuan could hear the hidden meaning in her father-in-law’s words. She 
deliberately tried to scare him and said, “But if you really miss me, I can also ask the 
chauffeur to send me to the hospital.” 

“No, no, no, there’s really no need. I don’t miss you. Just stay at home and be good!” 
Old Master Ji quickly refused. 

“Hahaha, got it, Dad.” Fang Xiaonuan smiled and hung up the phone. 

After hanging up, Old Master Ji said, still in shock, “Fortunately, she didn’t insist on 
coming. Otherwise, she would make me so angry that I’d get sick again. My blood 
pressure was so high yesterday.” 

… 

It was dinnertime, and she was the only one in the Ji family home. The maids were busy 
fussing over her. 



The maid took the basin. 

Fang Xiaonuan said, “I just washed my hands. Take it away.” 

The maid left with the basin. Another maid came over to help her with her meal. 

Fang Xiaonuan said, “I have hands of my own. You all may leave!” 

Fang Xiaonuan was left alone in the dining hall, and she finally began to eat heartily. 

Meanwhile, Ji Lingchen was watching the young woman on his phone. 

Fang Xiaonuan said, “A big table of delicious food that belongs to me alone. How 
blissful!” 

Ji Lingchen smiled and sent a thumbs up emoji. He also commented, “Don’t eat spicy 
food or cold food. Be good.” 

Fang Xiaonuan immediately replied with a funny cat emoji. She even said, “I’m not 
listening. I’m not listening.” 

Ji Lingchen could not help but laugh out loud in front of everyone. 

Someone asked curiously, “CEO Ji, what’s making you so happy?” 

Ji Lingchen replied, “Nothing much. The child at home is being disobedient.” 

Secretary Song obviously knew who CEO Ji was talking about, so she took the initiative 
to change the topic and speak on behalf of him. 

Not long after, Chairman Fang arrived. Seeing that his son-in-law was also present, he 
said excitedly, “Lingchen?” 

Ji Lingchen hurriedly stood up and greeted him. “Dad.” Then, he took the initiative to 
give up his main seat for his father-in-law. He was still wondering why no one had told 
him that his father-in-law would be coming. 

When the host saw this, his heart tightened. When he had sent out the invitations, he 
had not invited Chairman Fang. Who had invited Chairman Fang? If he had known that 
Chairman Fang was coming, he would not have arranged for Ji Lingchen to sit at the 
main seat. This was really… Thinking of this, the host’s forehead was covered in cold 
sweat. Fortunately, the two of them did not say anything. They just automatically 
adjusted their seats. The people at the dining table were all shrewd. The conversation 
was interesting and it was not awkward. No one felt uncomfortable. 

Chairman Fang asked, “How is Old Master Ji’s health?” 



Ji Lingchen said, “Thank you for your concern. Father’s illness is no longer serious. He 
will be discharged tomorrow.” 

Chairman Fang said again, “Then tomorrow, ask Xiaonuan to go with you to the hospital 
to pick up Old Master Ji.” 

Ji Lingchen shook his head and said, “Xiaonuan has classes tomorrow, so I won’t 
bother her. The environment in the hospital is not good, so I don’t want her to be there 
so frequently. I can go there by myself tomorrow. It won’t take long.” 

Hearing this, Chairman Fang grew more and more fond of his son-in-law. 

The crowd toasted and laughed. 

At this moment, Ji Lingchen’s phone rang. He looked at the caller ID and quickly got up 
to leave the private room. 

Chairman Fang also caught a glimpse of his son-in-law’s phone screen from the corner 
of his eye. He was a little puzzled. Who was “Kitten”? 

In the corridor, Ji Lingchen picked up the phone and asked lovingly, “Why aren’t you 
sleeping?” 

Fang Xiaonuan said coquettishly, “Hubby, you haven’t come home yet. How could I fall 
asleep? When will you be back?” 

Ji Lingchen looked in the direction of the private room. The people inside were chatting 
happily, and it would not be over anytime soon. He said, “I might be late. You can go to 
bed first. You still have classes tomorrow.” 

Fang Xiaonuan said aggrievedly, “Alright then. I left the door open for you. Don’t be too 
late!” 

Ji Lingchen heard his wife’s quiet voice and his heart softened. He smiled and replied, 
“Alright, got it.” 

Fang Xiaonuan urged, “Don’t drink too much.” 

Ji Lingchen said, “Don’t worry. Dad Is here too.” 

 

 

Fang Xiaonuan asked in confusion, “Huh? Dad is at the same table as you?” 



Ji Lingchen said, “Yeah, I didn’t know beforehand.” 

“Then take care of Dad. Don’t let him drink too much. Send him home tonight,” Fang 
Xiaonuan instructed. 

“Got it,” Ji Lingchen replied. 

After coaxing his wife to hang up, Ji Lingchen returned to the private room with a smile. 

Looking at the smile in Ji Lingchen’s eyes, Chairman Fang asked warily, “Who called 
you?” 

Ji Lingchen replied, “It was Xiaonuan. She asked me what time I would be back.” 

“Oh, Xiaonuan.” Chairman Fang suddenly realized that the kitten was his daughter. 
However, this nickname was too easy to misunderstand. Chairman Fang smiled 
awkwardly. Young people nowadays even had such strange nicknaming conventions. 

… 

Meanwhile, Fang Xiaonuan was packing her school bag. After she was done packing, 
she threw her school bag on the sofa before climbing into bed. She really did not like 
the empty space beside her. She tossed and turned a few times before slowly closing 
her eyes. 

Because he had a class the next day, Ji Wen also went home. At around ten in the 
evening, Ji Wen was washing up when he suddenly received a call from Ji Lingchen. 

“Ji Wen, are you at home or at the hospital?” Ji Lingchen asked. 

“I’ve already gone home, uncle.” Ji Wen replied. 

Ji Lingchen said, “If you’re not doing anything, come and pick me up. I’ve had too much 
to drink, so I can’t drive.” 

Ji Wen was extremely surprised. Ji Lingchen had once said that he would not let him 
come into contact with any of the Ji Corporation’s business partners before he 
graduated. Ji Lingchen had even taken the initiative to ask him to pick him up. If he did, 
those people would know who he was. 

Ji Wen asked, “Uncle, you really want me to go over?” 

Ji Lingchen said, “Come. Go to Room 608 of Jade Water Deluxe.” After speaking, Ji 
Lingchen hung up. 



Ji Wen held onto the phone, staring blankly for a long time. He did not understand what 
his uncle meant. After leaving, he drove out of the Ji family’s residence and made his 
way to Jade Water Deluxe. 

In the past, Ji Lingchen would bring a chauffeur with him for social engagements. But 
today, Assistant Liu was not here, and Secretary Song was a woman. Thus, he had 
simply asked his nephew to come pick him up, and at the same time, let Ji Wen make 
an appearance in front of all his business partners. It was time for him to make contact 
with these people. 

Knock, knock, knock. There was a series of knocks on the door. 

Ji Lingchen said, “Come in!” 

Ji Wen pushed the door open and entered the room. He looked at the dozen or so 
people in the room, and for a moment, everyone’s eyes were focused on him. 

“Uncle, I’m here,” Ji Wen said in neither a servile nor overbearing manner. 

Ji Lingchen nodded and beckoned Ji Wen to come to his side. 

Ji Wen hurriedly walked to his uncle’s side. When he saw Chairman Fang beside him, 
he politely greeted him, “Hello, Mr. Fang.” 

There was no way to change the way he addressed him. Ji Wen was used to calling him 
Mr. Fang. 

Chairman Fang did not hesitate to address him. He smiled and replied, “Xiaowen, 
you’re here.” 

Ji Lingchen stood up and introduced him to everyone, “Everyone, this is my nephew, Ji 
Wen.” 

“So, this is young master Ji Wen. He looks a little like CEO Ji.” 

“How old is he?” 

“CEO Ji, he really does look like your nephew. He really has an extraordinary 
temperament.” 

Hearing the compliments, Ji Wen politely thanked everyone. 

“It’s getting late. Let’s go home. The Madam at home might lock the door,” Ji Lingchen 
said. 

When he said this, everyone knew that it was time to leave. 



Ji Lingchen patted Ji Wen on the shoulder and led him and Chairman Fang away. 

After they left, Ji Lingchen said to Chairman Fang, “Dad, I’ll have Xiaowen drive you. 
You’ve been drinking, and the driver isn’t here.” 

Chairman Fang did not hesitate and directly got into his son-in-law’s car. 

Ji Wen drove away from Jade Water Deluxe. After the three of them left, everyone was 
puzzled. They did not understand why Ji Lingchen would suddenly let his nephew 
appear at such an occasion. Some of them began to wonder where his nephew was 
studying, how old he was, and whether he was married. 

In the car, Ji Wen asked, “Uncle, didn’t you say that you wouldn’t let me get in touch 
with our family’s business partners too early? Why did you let me come today?” If he 
needed someone to drive him, he could have just called the chauffeur. Ji Lingchen 
clearly wanted him to come. 

Ji Lingchen said indifferently, “You’re already in university, so it’s time for you to get in 
touch with our family’s business partners. Today is just the beginning. In the future, 
during the winter and summer holidays, you shouldn’t play around too much. Attend all 
the social engagements with me and get used to these social functions.” 

Chairman Fang also nodded in agreement and said, “That’s right, Xiaowen. There’s no 
harm in learning these things early. You should pick up your uncle’s skills. Even if you 
master a few skills, you can still become an elite in this industry.” 

 

Chapter 126: Omniscient 

 

After accepting the invitation, Ji Wen did not say anything else. The husband and father-
in-law in the back seat, on the other hand, were having a lively conversation. 

Chairman Fang said, “Lingchen, don’t you feel that what happened today is a bit 
strange?” He had invited him, but for no apparent reason. Also, the gathering started 
ten minutes later than usual. Something must be going on. 

Ji Lingchen’s eyes were clear and bright. He said calmly, “Internal strife in the 
company.” The person who had organized the gathering today was Director Tang of the 
Tang Corporation. He had intended to maintain a cooperative relationship with the Ji 
Corporation and extend the contract. But the people of his company seemed to want 
him to make a fool of himself in public, which was why they had come up with this idea. 
If Ji Lingchen was going to vent his anger on Director Tang, then the cooperation would 



naturally be ruined. During the meal, Ji Lingchen had thought of this. He had already 
asked Secretary Song to send someone to investigate the internal affairs of the Tang 
Corporation. After he had received the information, Ji Lingchen told his father-in-law. 

“The second-in-command of the Tang Corporation wants to replace Director Tang. Only 
by destroying this contract renewal with the Ji Corporation will he have a chance to do 
that.” 

“If Director Tang is able to convince me to continue the partnership, then it will prove 
that the Ji Corporation recognizes Director Tang’s ability, and his position will be 
unshakable.” 

“That’s why the other party came up with this idea, to have you appear at the gathering.” 

“Although everyone was very happy at the dinner table, in truth, in their hearts, they 
already have their own judgments about the Tang Corporation.” 

Chairman Fang was filled with endless admiration for his son-in-law’s efficiency. He was 
practically omniscient. In the short time it took to eat, he was able to understand this 
matter thoroughly. Looking at his son-in-law once more, Chairman Fang’s heart felt 
somewhat conflicted. 

Chairman Fang asked, “Then will you renew your contract with Director Tang this time?” 

Ji Lingchen was silent for a moment before replying. “I’ll go home and ask Xiaonuan.” 

Chairman Fang said, “Ah? Why ask her? She doesn’t understand either.” 

Ji Lingchen said, “But this time… we have to listen to her.” 

Chairman Fang did not ask any more questions. He could not understand them. 

After a while, the car approached a 24-hour convenience store. Ji Lingchen asked Ji 
Wen to stop the car. He got out of the car and entered the convenience store. After a 
while, he returned to the car with a big bag of things. 

“What did you buy?” Chairman Fang asked. 

“I bought these for Xiaonuan,” Ji Lingchen replied. 

The bag was open. Chairman Fang saw a bag of brown sugar. After being married for 
many years, he knew what brown sugar was for, so he did not ask more questions. 

However, after returning home, he told his wife how attentive and gentle his son-in-law 
was to his daughter. Of course, he also complained about the strange nickname he had 
given her. 



Ji Lingchen arrived home at around eleven o’clock, and Fang Xiaonuan had already 
fallen asleep. 

When the two of them reached home, Ji Wen told Ji Lingchen what he really thought. 
“Uncle, I don’t want to take over the family business.” 

Ji Lingchen pretended not to hear him and said, “It’s getting late. You still have to go to 
school tomorrow. Go to sleep.” 

Ji Wen said, “Got It.” 

Ji Lingchen returned to the bedroom and found that his wife was sleeping on her 
stomach. He walked over and picked her up. He turned over and put her back on the 
bed. He covered her with the blanket again and went downstairs to wash up. 

When he came back, Fang Xiaonuan was lying on her stomach again. He turned her 
over again. 

“Um… Hubby.” Fang Xiaonuan opened her eyes in a daze and called out, but she 
quickly closed her eyes and fell asleep again. 

Ji Lingchen gently patted her back, as if he was coaxing a child to sleep. The lights in 
the room were off, but Fang Xiaonuan deliberately left a wall lamp for him, probably 
because she was afraid that he would not be able to see clearly once he was back. 

Looking at the young woman who was sleeping soundly, Ji Lingchen gently caressed 
her cheek, then tiptoed to open the jewelry box and put the bracelet on her wrist. 

Fang Xiaonuan slept very soundly, completely unaware of it. 

After doing everything, Ji Lingchen kissed the young woman on the forehead. Then, he 
crawled into bed and cuddled his wife. 

The next day, Fang Xiaonuan woke up. There was still no one around her. She 
seriously suspected that her husband had not come home last night. Thinking of this, 
the little flame in her heart kindled. Suddenly, she found that the pillow next to her 
looked used. The little flame was extinguished in an instant. She leaned on the pillow 
and smelled it. Yes, it smelled like her husband. It seemed that he had come home last 
night. 

“What do you smell?” Ji Lingchen leaned against the door frame and looked at his wife 
with a smile. 

“I smell that my husband came home last night.” Fang Xiaonuan got up. 



Suddenly, she realized that there was something on her wrist. She hurriedly brought her 
wrist closer and took a look. There was a bracelet on her wrist. It was the work of the 
old Mr. Philip, a designer she had long admired. 

 

Chapter 127: Your Husband Will Reimburse You! 

 

“Magnificent!” Fang Xiaonuan shouted in surprise. 

Ji Lingchen raised his eyebrows. It seemed that he had chosen the right gift. It was 
something his little wife liked. 

Ji Lingchen asked, “Do you like it?” 

Fang Xiaonuan kept nodding and said, “I like it. I like it very much, but it’s so expensive. 
I was never willing to pay for it.” 

“Silly, didn’t I tell you to buy whatever you want? If you don’t want to spend your own 
money, just look for me after you buy it. Your husband will reimburse you!” Ji Lingchen 
said with a smile. 

“Really? Hubby, can you buy me luxury items too?” Fang Xiaonuan asked with twinkling 
eyes. 

“Of course,” Ji Lingchen replied without hesitation. 

Fang Xiaonuan happily opened her arms and threw herself into her husband’s arms. 
She hugged his waist tightly and pressed her face against his chest. She nestled 
against his chest excitedly to express her joy. 

Ji Lingchen caressed her head lovingly. His smile reached his eyes. 

… 

The next morning, Fang Xiaonuan was washing up when Ji Lingchen suddenly said, “I 
found out why the subordinate behaved that way yesterday.” 

“Why?” Fang Xiaonuan asked curiously. 

Ji Lingchen told his wife everything about Director Jiang’s family. Then, he asked, 
“Xiaonuan… do you have any idea how we can help him?” 



Fang Xiaonuan stopped brushing her teeth and shook her head in annoyance. “I don’t 
have any ideas either…” She quickly washed up and walked out of the bathroom. Then 
she said, “Hubby, it’s very difficult for outsiders to interfere in family affairs. He can only 
handle it himself. His wife took his property and ran away, so he reported her to the 
police. When his mother was sick, he found a doctor to treat her. As for his daughter, he 
should have been more attentive. We can’t help him, but…” She suddenly looked at Ji 
Lingchen with a smile. 

Ji Lingchen said, “Go ahead.” 

Fang Xiaonuan said, “My husband might have a way to help him.” 

“Huh?” Ji Lingchen waited for his wife’s next words with interest. 

Fang Xiaonuan held her husband’s hand and said coquettishly, “Actually, my husband 
can give him a leave of absence. That way, he’ll have enough time to deal with these 
matters.” 

“Given his current state, he won’t be able to work properly. If that’s the case, it would be 
better for him to go home and focus on dealing with the family matters before coming 
back to work.” 

“That way, when he comes back, he won’t make such a low-level mistake.” 

“If he doesn’t make mistakes, my husband won’t be angry.” 

“My husband will still be my handsome, gentle, and good husband!” 

“In addition, if this is the case, the Ji Corporation will find out that my husband is a good 
leader who cares about his employees.” 

“Everyone will admire you even more, and will be proud of having a leader like you!” 

Ji Lingchen said, “Then… From now on, when you come to the company, will you call 
me husband or uncle?” 

Fang Xiaonuan said, “Then I’ll definitely call you husband. I’m your wife. What else 
would I call you?” 

Ji Lingchen cupped Fang Xiaonuan’s little face and lowered his head to kiss it. Then he 
said, “It’s a deal!” 

Fang Xiaonuan’s little face turned red and said, “Then, hubby, when you see him 
tomorrow, remember to explain what happened. Tell him that I’m actually your wife and 
not your niece. Don’t let him continue to misunderstand!” 



Ji Lingchen scratched his little wife’s nose and said, “Wasn’t this misunderstanding 
caused by your little mouth?” 

Fang Xiaonuan pouted and said coquettishly, “Hmph, wasn’t I angry yesterday?” If Fang 
Xiaonuan acted coquettishly, no matter who was right or wrong, she would win. 

Ji Lingchen said, “Alright, I got it. Oh right, there’s still one more thing that you need to 
decide.” 

Fang Xiaonuan quickly asked, “There’s still something that needs to be decided by me? 
Hubby, tell me quickly.” 

The man was holding her in his arms. 

Ji Lingchen told his wife everything that had happened yesterday. “Now, should we 
continue to work together? I’ll listen to everything you say.” 

“Ah?” Fang Xiaonuan was stunned. This collaboration was worth at least one billion, 
and her husband dared to ask her to make such a hasty decision? 

Ji Lingchen did not want to put too much pressure on his wife, so he explained, 
“Actually, even if we don’t work with them, there will still be many companies that will 
beg for a collaboration with Ji Corporation. So, you can choose whatever you want. 
There’s no pressure.” 

Fang Xiaonuan said, “But, hubby… What would you choose?” 

Ji Lingchen said, “If I stuck to my own standards, I would choose not to work with them 
anymore.” 

“If you can’t even manage your own employees well, it can only mean that your 
management skills are very poor.” 

“I would not feel sorry for him. I would only think about how to maximize the company’s 
profits.” 

 

 


