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Ralph was just back from his meeting with Walter and Shani, it has been a 
while for him and though he hasn’t experienced anything that would be of 
concern, he always likes to check in with the group every couple of weeks. 

He would still see Suzy and talk to her every now and then, but she had 
visited him less because Madison has been coming to his place more often 
and the teenage ghost didn’t like their steamy sessions. 

In some ways, Suzy has been like the little sister that he never had. And like a 
true annoying little sister she would pout and being a ghost, she stormed 
through the kitchen walls every time Madison walks into his apartment. 

And that night Suzy was not gone the second Madison walked into his 
apartment. 

“She did? what did you tell her?” he asked while he was already boiling on the 
inside. Madison was telling him about meeting her mom unexpectedly at 
Silvio’s. 

He was about to reach for his phone when Madison shook her head telling 
him no. 

“She’s still your mom, Ralph. But you can still choose your path. She just 
wants what’s best for you. I didn’t say anything to upset her, she already 
hated my relationship with you.” 

Ralph took another beer and drink it down as if the golden liquid could calm 
him down. When in reality he was still fuming, thinking that he’d call his mom 
and told her that he won’t be coming home for the holidays. 

“Ralph, baby, please…” she sat next to him and wrapped her hand to his 
body. 

“She’s not even my real mom.” 

“I know, but she raises you. And they’re your parents’ best friends. Think 
about your real parents then?” she rests her head to his c.hest and he pulled 
her in and k!ssed her hair. 



“Madison, why are you so nice?” 

“Because I love you? because you’re so cute and cuddly? because you build 
my bookshelves? because…” she straddled him and gave him her sweet little 
k!sses in between her words. 

He chuckled and they ended up n.aked and sated, tangled in bed hours later. 

“I’m liking our talk.” He pulled her n.aked body on top of his. 

She smiled, she was sleepy and falls asleep in his arms within seconds. Only 
to wake up screaming that night from the scariest and most vivid dream she 
had ever had. 

Madison was deep in the woods. She was walking, calling out trying to find 
Ralph. Her throat was sore, and she was tired and sweaty from the long walk. 

 

But then she stopped when she found a big abandoned-looking house. 
Madison could see traces of footsteps so she silently followed them, while her 
heart was pounding so fast. 

The surrounding was eerily quiet, she could feel a trickle of sweat trailing 
down the back of her spine. Her eyes scanned the area, she was putting one 
step in front of the other. 

She was scared sh!tless. But her adrenaline kicked in when she saw a man 
lying on the floor and she could see the Breitling watch that Ralph love adored 
for years. 

“Ralph…” Madison whispered, trying to wake him the moment she reached 
his side. 

“Ralph, please!” She shook his body trying to get him up, but he was heavy, 
and he’s not opening his eyes. 

She was panicking when she could feel something dark was approaching 
them. 

“…wake up, please…please…you gotta wake up,” 



Her boyfriend was not waking up, he was too heavy and she would never 
leave him behind. Ralph’s eyes were still closed and she was struggling not to 
scream in fear as Madison felt the dark figure was coming closer to her. 

“Give him to me,” 

His deep throaty voice made her looked back at the dark ent!ty, and that was 
when she saw it. 

The big black hairy figure was so tall that she could only see him from the 
wa!st down. The monster reached out his hairy hand and grabbed Ralph’s 
legs and that was when without thinking she grabbed her lover. 

What Madison didn’t expect was his bl00d seeping through her white dress. 
Then she looked at her dress thinking she never owns a white long sleeves 
dress to which she thought looked more like a nightgown. 

But her mind was quick to go back to Ralph who was unconscious. Her hand 
reached to the end of his t-shirt and she gasped when she saw his abdomen 
was sliced open and his bl00d was seeping through. 

She was crying in her panic state, and at the same time, Ralph’s body was 
being dragged away. She was h.ugging him, trying to hold him down, but the 
monster was more powerful and she was dragged away with him at the same 
time. 

Madison was crying and screaming for Ralph and she didn’t even felt the 
rough texture of the floor when it scr.apes her knees as she was trying to hold 
onto her Ralph. 

“Maddie! Maddie! wake up!” 

He tugged her awake she was screaming out his name in sheer shock. 

“Ralph!” 

She opened her eyes and h.ugged him so tight that he was worried about her 
life. But then he quickly thought it was a nightmare and relaxed back while 
taking her back into his arms, comforting her and soothing her sobs. 

“It’s okay baby, I’m here. I’m not going anywhere.” 



“It was the most… you’re…I can’t…the monster…” Madison was not letting 
him go, her hold on him was tight and she couldn’t even form her sentences. 

“Baby, I’m here…calm down.” He was feeling her damp t-shirt. 

“You’re sweating, let me get you a fresh t-shirt then we can get back to sleep.” 

She was not letting him go, so he took her hand and both walked to his 
drawers so Madison could change to his fresh t-shirt. 

But he was not ready when he saw the scr.apes on her knees and her shins 
and saw the sole of her feet were all dirty as if she has been walking on a very 
dirty floor. 

He was silent while she was looking at him with her tears rolling down her 
cheeks. 

“What is happening to me? I thought I was dreaming?” 

“We need to go to Walter, no… wait, we’re going directly to Shani, I’m calling 
Walter to meet us there.” 

Ralph was going to get his phone but Madison was still not letting him go. 

“I’m afraid!” 

“I’m so sorry, baby.” He h.ugged her and decided to change her clothes and 
clean her scr.apes in the bathroom while trying to calm her down. 

The water was black from the dirt and the soil from her feet. Twenty minutes 
later she was dress in his t-shirt, her scr.apes were all treated but she was still 
not letting him go. 

Ralph gave up and called Shani telling her that he had an emergency and was 
going to her place at that very moment. Then he called Walter, knowing he 
knew and the fact that they might need his assistance should Shani wanted to 
do a seance. 

Ralph put on his clothes then both went back to her place and wait for her to 
put on her loose pants and sneakers then they’re out of the apartment building 
just hours before dawn. 



Ralph was feeling her fears and she was scared for his life after knowing that 
it was not a dream. 

Or is it? 
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They spent the whole ride to Shani’s in total silence, Madison would still look 
at him and Ralph would caress her cheek trying to assure her that everything 
would be okay. 

But she hadn’t told him what she saw. Was it a premonition? if it was, would 
he be dead and taken by the monster? 

Her brain was still busy trying to process the thoughts when they finally 
arrived at Shani’s. 

“You know we could have our holiday here?” Ralph tried to joke referring to 
their last coastal escape, but she was still remembering about holding him in 
her arms. Lifeless. 

“I couldn’t wake you, you’re dead…bleeding, your stomach sliced open, I 
can’t…I didn’t…” 

She was teary, and he took her into his embrace. He didn’t know exactly what 
she meant by her words, so he was trying to calm her down while his hand 
knocks on Shani’s front door. 

“Hey, Madison…baby, I’m fine. I’m right here.” 

And just like on cue, the door opened and Shani greeted them. Her husband 
Arkael was beside her holding their little boy. 

“Madison? come inside…Arkael, would you get Audric back to bed?” Shani 
was a bit startled with her condition, and swiftly let the couple into their home. 

She k!ssed the sleepy little boy and her husband nodded and smiled at his 
pregnant wife. 

“I’m sorry to bother you, I didn’t know…” Ralph started his words, he didn’t 
realize that Shani was pregnant until that day. 



“It’s my clothes, I don’t like people giving me the look for being pregnant, 
come on…” Shani was hiding her pregnancy, knowing she has a very special 
baby inside of her. 

Shani ushered them to sit in her small yet comfortable living room, Ralph 
didn’t leave Madison’s side as her hold on his hand was still strong. 

“Ralph, would you go to the kitchen and make her some tea? both of you will 
be fine, he’s here. My house is protected.” 

“No.” Her words her small but she looked into her eyes with determination as 
Madison took his hand to her lap and keeping him close. 

Shani looked at her possessiveness and the burn behind her eyes and 
suddenly she feels the need to touch their hand. 

“May I?” Shani asked the still teary young woman and she nodded showing 
her trust in the pregnant witch. 

Shani closes her eyes and tries to reach beyond Madison’s vision but the wall 
was too thick for her. 

“Walter,” she murmured the word at the same time as the knock on her door. 
She opened it and let Walter sit on the one chair sofa beside them. 

“Okay, now that you’re among friends please tell us about your dream.” Shani 
put Walter’s hand on hers and she puts hers on Madison’s, then told Ralph 
quietly to put his hand on Walter’s. 

Shani was flowing her positive energy into the circle, Madison felt the 
calmness almost instantly then she started her words. 

 

“I don’t know if it was a dream, but I was in a dark forest looking for Ralph. My 
feet were tired but I kept on walking and calling out his name, then more 
walking until I found a large abandoned house. That’s…I found him on the 
floor… hurt, I… try to wake him…then…the shadow…monster, big…black, 
hairy…so tall…” her words were choppy but Shani squeezes her hand, giving 
her more positive energy and Madison continue with her words. 



Ralph was silent throughout Madison’s explanation, deep down cursing, 
thinking how could the same setting and same ent!ty haunted her. 

Such a thing should not even be possible. 

Walter looked at him and shook his head, silently telling him to wait. Then 
Shani, let go of her hold the moment Madison finished her story. 

“You need to call Suzy, she went with you when you’re getting Ralph back 
from the other realm. This is the same ent!ty, I need to know why he’s not 
letting you go. But for now, I’m making her a protection spell that should be 
enough until we figure out what’s happening.” 

“Madison, why don’t you helped me prepared your Amulet. And let the guys 
find out more from Suzy,” 

“But I need to know about…” 

“Madison, you can’t see and hear her anymore and I need your energy in 
making this Amulet, it’ll be faster this way. I don’t want the ent!ty attaching 
itself to you.” 

With her last word, Madison left Ralph to continue with Walter and she 
followed Shani to another room where there were old books, herbs, various 
candles, and more witchcraft stuff that she wouldn’t know what they’re called. 

Madison was to her side, while Shani was opening her big old spellbook. 

“I didn’t want to ask you this in front of Ralph, because I didn’t want him to 
start blaming himself…” 

Her initial words made Madison wary already but she was silent, patiently 
waiting for more of her words. 

“…are you pregnant?” 

The question shocked her and she put her hand on her stomach 
spontaneously. 

“No…I don’t know, I don’t think so. No…” Madison was teary, her back was to 
Ralph’s who was still busy talking to Walter. Madison kept on looking at Shani 
while shaking her head. 



She h.ugged her warmly and told her that everything would be okay. Shani 
wiped her tears then carry on with her task of making the amulet, opening her 
old-looking book while she explained everything to the younger woman. 

“…because it’s Ralph’s baby, it relates inside you that’s why you’re 
experiencing the real like dream. But in my personal opinion, I think you were 
taken there that’s why you have the wounds.” 

“But I was sleeping, he was right there with me…” 

Madison wiped her tears when Shani whispered that Ralph was coming their 
way. 

“Hey, what’s with the tears? is everything okay?” 

“She will be fine, we’re going to do another cleanse after I’m done with the 
amulet. She should be okay, but she has my number just in case.” Shani took 
her hand and chanted a spell while the amulet is placed on her hand. 

The warmth of the bluestone on the antique-looking pendant was felt on 
Madison’s hands and she relaxes the moment it was placed on her neck. 

Walter called out for Ralph, and the man k!ssed her hair and walked back to 
the other room. 

Ralph was in his seat talking to Walter when Shani said not to take off the 
amulet until the baby is born. 

Madison wiped her tears and took a deep breath to calm herself down. 

“Please don’t tell anyone about the baby, I will let him know in time. I just need 
to let reality sink in.” 

“I won’t, but you can call me, you know that right? you don’t have to handle 
this alone.” 

Shani pulled her in for another h.ug and they both went back to sit with Ralph 
and Walter. The men had talked to Suzy and noted the details. 

“So Suzy describe the same ent!ty as yours, the surrounding, the abandoned 
mansion, even the footsteps leading to the open window.” Ralph took her 
hand in his, the moment she sits beside him. 



“…and Walter also confirmed the similarities though he was a bit distracted.” 
The younger man continue. 

“Yeah, looking for you then carrying your weight can be such a distraction,” 

“Guys, come on… what’s the conclusion?” Shani asked the question. 

“We think it’s the same, don’t know how. Maybe because you two are getting 
close? and her vision was affected?” 

“Well, for now, the amulet will protect you. I’m confident that the ent!ty won’t 
bother you again.” 

The four of them talk about the ent!ty, and Shani kept her word about letting 
Madison break the news to Ralph. 

And it wasn’t long until Walter’s phone buzzed with his beautiful wife’s face on 
the screen. 

“Alright then, that’s my cue…my wife just realized that I left the house. But, I 
trust my life with Shani and you should too. Whatever you guys are going 
through, we’re here, call us.” 

Walter said his goodbye and Ralph decided that they should go too, Shani 
reminded Madison to call her again for anything, even if it’s just to talk. 

“Thank you, Shani, I really appreciate this.” Madison h.ugged her for a little 
while longer. 

***** 

“There’s something you’re not telling me,” Ralph said the moment he put the 
car in drive. 

“Let’s just get back first.” 
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It was morning when they arrived at his place, they didn’t talk much. He had 
tried to get her to talk but she was shutting herself from him. 



Ralph thought maybe she was exhausted because of the nightmare, the drive, 
and also the stress from the ent!ty itself. 

“I’m so tired Ralph, hold me… I’m not feeling very well.” Her words were soft 
and barely audible. 

Madison woke up in the middle of the afternoon and felt a little bit feverish, her 
body was a bit warm as she snuggled in closer to her boyfriend. 

“Let me order some soft food and get you some hot milk.” He k!ssed her 
forehead softly, he didn’t like the fact that there was grey mist surrounding 
her. 

His mind wonders when he was preparing the hot milk after ordering her 
favorite lasagna from Silvio’s. 

There shouldn’t be any bad energy surrounding them, she had been cleansed 
by Shani already. 

He was not focused when night came and her fever was not getting better. 

“Suzy! Suze…where are you?!” 

The teenage ghost popped up from the floor, head first surprising him. 

“The fvck Suze! don’t do that! use the walls like you usually do, okay?” 

“Okay, I was trying something new. But someone’s in a really a bad mood 
apparently.” The teenage ghost hovers to his side trying to sniff the hot coffee 
in his hand. 

But then she backed away when she feels the sudden chill, then looked at her 
surroundings. 

“What… woahhh what is happening here?” 

“Shit! you’re seeing this too? I’m not imagining this? what is happening Suzy?” 

“It’s him, oh no…Walter! got to get Walter here. He’s draining her.” 

“What? how can’t I see it?” 



“Just get him here, and your witch friend tells her to bring her stuff. And you, 
you need to get away from her.” 

“What?! I’m not leaving her!” 

“Whatevs, just get your sidekicks here, fast!” 

Ralph was about to call them when Suzy was inches from his face, the dirty 
noose on her neck was clearly visible to him. 

“Wait! Ralph, her amulet, why did she takes it off?” being a ghost for so long 
she learned to recognize a protection charm from afar. Suzy could see the 
spell that it radiates, and it was not working when it’s not attached to Madison, 
the ent!ty was too strong. 

“She didn’t, I did.” 

“You stupid fool! she needs to wear it all the time. Put it back on!” 

He was quick to get her amulet from her side table and put it back on her 
neck, the dark mist was thinning and finally disappear. 

“You really think I need to get away from her?” Ralph asked her when 
Madison was back to sleeping soundly. 

“Well, he’s your ghost.” 

Suzy kept on hovering, she knows that he’s deeply in love with his woman but 
she was telling the truth and she was liking his Madison. She has been a good 
influence on him and Suzy has never seen him as happy before. 

 

She was actually thinking to move on but changed her mind when he joined 
his friends in the last seance. Suzy still didn’t know about the ent!ty and why 
he wouldn’t stay away from Ralph. 

So she stayed with Ralph when he was back to doubting himself. 

“She has the amulet, stop blaming yourself.” 

“Right.” 



But Ralph was doing exactly that, he was blaming himself and Suzy finally left 
him as she knows her presence was useless. 

***** 

Knowing she was safe with her amulet, he decided to go back to Shani and try 
to figure out more about the ent!ty. He texted her from the small diner telling 
her that he’s taking an early holiday. 

Madison didn’t realize he left until the morning after when she wakes up alone 
and feeling the cold side of the bed beside hers. 

Then she saw his text. 

His favorite duffel bag was gone, his clothes, shoes, even his denim jacket 
was gone. 

“What do you mean you’re taking an early holiday?” 

“Hey baby, I’m sorry it’s so sudden but something happened last night when I 
took off your amulet. And Suzy said some things, now I’m on my way back to 
Shani to fix all of this. Just don’t take off the amulet.” 

“So, when are you coming back?” 

“I think this might take a while, and the holidays are coming. So, I don’t 
know…” 

“Okay,” 

“Look baby I love you, please know that.” 

“I love you too Ralph, thank you for looking out for me.” 

There was a sad feeling inside her, maybe she was being hormonal but she 
was teary while her other hand was holding her stomach. She ended the call 
as she feels the urge to throw up. 

Morning sickness. 

Moments later she throws up to nothing, just the gagging and nausea feel that 
made her sick to the point that she couldn’t move from the bathroom floor. 



That morning she decided to avoid eating and drink some hot milk instead. 
Madison finally gets out of the apartment just before lunch and decided to buy 
a test pack although she knows she must be pregnant already. 

She has never felt so unsure about her life, she didn’t even know how to 
proceed with her life not when she has a baby inside her. Ralph’s. 

Madison took a seat at the small cafe and order hot chocolate milk and some 
honey-dipped french toast. She was sticking to light meals, not wanting to 
throw up again. 

Inside her purse were two packs of pregnancy kit that she bought from the 
pharmacy next door. She knows Ralph would be responsible, but will they be 
happy in the long run? 

She wiped her tear and look outside of the small cafe window and try her best 
to finish her brunch. She sighed when she thinks about her parents, then 
Ralph’s mom. And most of all thinking about how she could be too carried 
away with Ralph. 

Two hours later she was back sitting on her bathroom floor, breaking, tears 
falling as she quietly sobbed when she saw the two pregnancy kits stating that 
she’s pregnant. 

Ralph had checked in on her when she reached her apartment, and she was 
lying telling him that she was fine. 

That late afternoon she packed her bags and decided to also take an early 
vacation to her mom’s just because she lives closer and Madison was too 
tired for the long drive to her dad’s. 

She needed to get away and clear her mind before she faces him and told him 
about being pregnant with his child. 

Meanwhile, at that same time, Ralph was being scolded by Shani. She was 
telling him that he shouldn’t leave her alone. Not in her condition. Though the 
double-meaning words were not getting through to Ralph as Shani kept 
Madison’s words and let her pregnancy stay a secret. 

“She’s like this because of me.” 



“Can’t argue there,” Shani pursed her l!ps in annoyance. She was telling 
Ralph to go back, but he was stubborn as hell and wanted his issue to be 
resolved soonest. 

“Ralph, if she said we wait then I really think you should wait.” 

Walter was there already, though Shani said the moon wasn’t in the right 
position. The summoning could be a mess, and after the last one with Ralph, 
she was taking things more carefully. 

“I’ll stay close, just call me…” 

Shani cuts his words and looked at him when she told him to come back 
tomorrow night. 

“Rain is coming here, he has gained more power and knowledge since his 
time with his king of hell. He should be able to help us.” 

“Thank you, I’ll come back tomorrow.” Ralph excused himself, he was tired 
from the worry and the drive when he decided to rest at a nearby hotel. 

“Hey, I missed you, I love you. How are you?” Ralph called Madison as he 
was getting ready to end the day. 

“Hey, miss you and love you too, I’m at my mom’s. I don’t feel like staying 
alone.” 

Ralph cursed on the inside once again blaming himself for being stupid and 
not just take her with him instead. But he was torn when Suzy told him that he 
should get away from her. 

“I’m sorry, I should’ve…” 

“Have you talk to Shani?” Madison interrupted his words and asks about 
Shani. 

“Yes, she’s taking us, helping me with our issue and we’re waiting for her 
witch friend, Rain, to come and help us tomorrow…” 

The young couple talk for a little bit longer before they sleep alone thinking of 
each other. 

Both worry for each other. 



Lusting For Ralph Chapter 34 - Tips 
0 7 minutes read 

“Morning mom…” 

“Morning sweetheart, breakfast is on the table. I’m sorry I have to go work 
today, I’ll see if I can get back earlier and we can spend some time together.” 

“It’s okay mom, I’ll be spending the holiday here. We have a lot of time later.” 
Madison k!ssed her mom goodbye and made herself a cup of hot chocolate. 

She had never been close with her mom and at that moment she decided to 
spend the whole day reading and forget about her issues. At that time she 
was just glad that her mom would be busy all day at the office. 

Meanwhile, another young pregnant college student had just woken up in the 
lush comfort bed of a certain rich campus jock. She puts her arm over his 
body and rests her cheek on his bare c.hest, the young woman was liking his 
warmth. 

“Morning,” his deep manly voice greeted her, making her smile in her sleep. 

“Mmhh…sshh…” she mumbled with her eyes still closed. 

He chuckled when she put her legs over his th!gh and pulling herself closer to 
him. The aroused man wrapped her se.xy body and k!ssed her hair. 

“I read those pregnancy hormones can make you feel hornier.” He whispered 
huskily in her ear while his e.rection was getting harder. 

“Maybe, but I need to pee first.” She giggled and sneakily get away from him. 

“I’ll go make some decaf.” He let out another chuckle then shook his head and 
lazily get himself out of the bed. 

She found him moments later quietly sipping his coffee, proudly supporting 
nothing but his shorts which hangs low enough that his trail was visible for her 
view. 

It has been more than a week since the day Brian was declared to be the 
father of the baby. She was relieved and nervous at the same time. But her 



weariness was not an issue because Brian cherished her. And from that day, 
they have been living the happy couple lifestyle. 

They would go to campus together and she would wait until he finishes with 
his practice. People talked behind them, but they were living their life without a 
care in the world. Mostly because Brian told her not to worry and that he will 
be responsible and raised their kid together. 

But the coming holidays were not in her favor, she dreaded the day but it 
came anyway. 

“It’ll be okay,” he k!ssed her bare shoulder and she rests her back to his 
n.aked c.hest, while she sipped her decaf coffee milk. 

Brian saw right through her, being one of the it girls on campus she might 
seem like one of those pretty party goer types. But once he gets to know her 
better he was surprised that she enjoys spending time at his place. 

And Brian knows those type of woman who needs their daily dose of shopping 
and clubbing, and shockingly Kendra was careful moneywise. At times her 
behavior irritates him to the point that he just give the waiter his black card 
when Kendra insisted on checking out the bill. 

“I’m not sure about us spending the holidays with your parents, maybe I 
should just stay here. Maybe we’re a mistake, I seriously think you should 
think this through.” 

“Hey, Kendra…listen to me. I got this, we’re doing this together. You should 
let me marry you…so your parents will be okay with all of this.” 

 

“No! Brian, just leave my parents alone. I’m worried about yours.” 

Brian put her coffee down and cupped her face. He has been asking her to 
marry him, he had grown to care for her and he wanted to do what’s right with 
her. 

“Look, don’t worry okay?” 

“Okay.” Kendra gave up and leave it to him, thinking she needs to think about 
the baby and be responsible too. 



“Good, now I have an early practice scheduled this morning. Why don’t you 
just relax and go sleep some more?” 

“You’re talking my language.” She smiled at him and pulled him down for a 
k!ss. 

“You’re going to make me late,” 

“So?” she teased, slithering her hands to his c.hest making him gr0aned and 
lift her to the kitchen stool. 

That morning he was late for practice, but he had a big smile on his face while 
she was back to sleeping in his bed still in his oversize t-shirt and her tight 
shorts. 

It was almost lunchtime when Brian called her saying he’ll be late for another 
hour. And she picked up the house phone thinking it was him again, but she 
was surprised when it was another woman on the other end of the line. 

“Yes, I’ll fix you a late lunch just…” 

“Hello? who’s this?” 

“Hi, this is Kendra.” She was nervous thinking she was caught answering his 
landline. She instantly knew it was his mom from the deep calm voice. 

“Kendra, where is my son, Brian?” 

“He has an early practice,” 

“Right, and you’re there alone?” 

“Yes.” Her voice was a bit shaky while she cursed on the inside. 

“I am fifteen minutes away from his place, tell me, Kendra, I know my son 
never leaves a woman alone in his place. Are you his girlfriend?” 

She was silent for quite a while and his mother was still waiting for her 
answer. 

“Yes.” 



“Good, go get ready and meet me at the lobby in ten minutes.” She ended the 
call and Kendra panicked. 

Should she call him, or should she…but then she looked at the time and she 
only has less than ten minutes to get ready and that’s when she picked her 
best jeans then cursed when it doesn’t fit her anymore. 

She finally wears her semi-formal dress and matches it with her denim jacket, 
then she slipped on her flats and put on her l!pgloss. She had only minutes to 
spare when she decided to call Brian, but she was connected to his voicemail 
instead. 

Kendra was on her way down when his text came in informing her that he’d 
call back stating that he’s in the middle of practice. 

Your mom called your apartment. I picked up. Now on she’s picking me up for 
lunch. Help. (Kendra) 

She waited for his text but a sleek black Bentley pulled over at the lobby 
driveway and the driver opened the door for her. 

“Miss Kendra, please…you’re expected.” 

Kendra awkwardly entered the car and sits down as she greeted the older 
woman. 

“Good afternoon, Mrs. Harrison.” 

“Please don’t be nervous, please…” his mom patted the seat next to her. 

Kendra tried to relax but she couldn’t, she could feel sweat trickle down her 
spine while the AC in the car was cold and comforting. 

“I’m sorry for being nosy, but he never brings his dates back home. And then 
yesterday he called and told me that he was going to bring a woman home…” 
his mother let out a laughter. 

“…his woman, that kid could be such a caveman…” 

Kendra started to relax, while his mother was busy babbling, talking about her 
son until they arrived at the lobby of Markov chain hotel. 



She was glad that she didn’t wear her jeans. Kendra was talking to his mom 
when Brian’s text came. 

Where? (Brian- the baby daddy) 

She smiled brightly when she saw his text, and her emotion was seen by his 
mom. 

Markov hotel downtown. (Kendra-the freeloader) 

On my way (Brian- The boyfriend) 

That was his hint, knowing that he would introduce her as his girlfriend. 

“You looked happy?” his mom was surprisingly not scary at all when she was 
taking her seat and ordering their food. 

“Brian is coming to join us.” 

“Good, I missed him.” 

They talk about her study and small stuff, Kendra was actually surprised that 
she didn’t ask anything about why she was staying at her son’s place and 
almost half an hour later he came dressed in his designer jeans and crisps 
white shirt. Kendra looked at him, feeling all the b.utterflies in her stomach. 

“Afternoon mom.” He greeted his mom, once she arrived at their table, then 
he greeted Kendra with a chaste k!ss on her l!ps which made her blushed 
instantly. 

His mom smiled at the young couple and he was liking that his mom gets 
along with Kendra. Though his worry was not with his mom, but with his dad, 
he would scold the campus jock for being careless and impregnated a 
woman. 

But then he looked at the Shushi plate in front of Kendra, knowing for sure 
that it was his mom who ordered the meals. 

Brian knows that Kendra would probably too shy to order her lunch. 

“…yes, could you get us some cheese sauce?” 



“Sir?” the waiter was a bit puzzled with his request looking at the fresh sushi 
platter in front of him. 

But it didn’t take long for the smell to hit her senses and she looked pale and 
within seconds she excused herself to the ladies. 

“Damn!” Brian cursed and hold her arm as she quickens her steps to the 
restroom. Then he took an empty ice bucket from the recently vacant table. 
She was quick to throw up in it making few heads turned their way. 

Kendra was teary instantly. She felt so embarrassed for herself for throwing 
up in the posh hotel restaurant, where his mom was clearly noticing. 

Brian was holding her hair when she throws up and he held her close when 
she was done. 

“I can’t do this.” 

“I got you babe… we’re going to be just fine.” 

“Are you carrying my grandchild?” his mom warmly asked when she finds the 
young woman in her son’s embrace. 

“Mom…” Brian started. 

“I…we…” 

“We had the paternity test, I was going to break the news over the holidays.” 

Brian kept her in his arm, while she was wiping her tears away and didn’t 
expect that his mother would pull her in for a h.ug. 

“Come here…” his mom took her into her embrace and Kendra was 
embarrassed for crying harder. 
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“Come, why don’t we order another food.” His mom ushered her to the mirror 
and get Kendra some tissues. 



“Brian…tell the waiter to move us to another table, a more private one and 
why don’t you order for her this time?” 

Brian nodded to his mom and k!ssed Kendra on her temple just before he 
leaves her with her mom. 

“I can see that my son loves you very much.” 

“I…we’re not an actual couple…” Kendra looked at his mom, she couldn’t start 
her baby’s life with secrets. She needs his mom to know about their 
relationship, she didn’t want to be judged once his family knows about the 
truth. 

“Kendra, love grows. And I see the moment you look at your phone reading 
his text message.” His mom tucked in her loose strands back behind her ear. 

Kendra didn’t believe her luck when his mom h.ugged her and welcomed her 
into their family. 

Though her new best friend Madison was thinking the opposite when her mom 
came home. 

“Madison, come sit with me…” 

Being a single mom after her divorce didn’t affect her the least, she remains 
distant from her only child. 

“So I met Ralph’s mom today just after I had  a business  lunch with a client…” 

Madison cursed on the inside, she knows where the conversation is going 
already. 

“And she and I had a long talk, but basically she wants you to let go of Ralph, 
r0mantically. Look, Maddie…I can’t give you any insights on your love life 
looking at my own failed marriage.” 

The marriage that happened because of her. Madison thought sarcastically. 

“I know we haven’t been close, but I do care about you. And I’m not sure you 
can handle the Richardson. We are not on the same playing field as they are. 
I know you’re close with their boys, but you should stop dreaming of getting a 
tap into their wealth. We can seek our own.” 



Madison couldn’t believe her words. Her own mother saying that she wanted 
him for his money, thinking that she wanted to climb the social ladder like a 
true gold-digging b!tch. 

“I’m pregnant, with Ralph’s baby. I haven’t told him, that’s why I came early for 
the holiday. I need to think.” 

Her mom looked at her in disbelief. 

“What? are you seriously shocked that I turned out just to be like you?” 
Madison was in rage listening to her mom talking about her like she’s a stupid 
wh0re. 

And that was when she slapped her, then it was her turn to look at her mom in 
surprise. 

“I’m guessing my holiday is over,” Madison stomped her feet in anger and 
headed back to her room to pack up her stuff without even knowing her 
destination. 
“Come, why don’t we order another food.” His mom ushered her to the mirror 
and get Kendra some tissues. 

 

It was getting late, but she knew she couldn’t stay a minute longer under the 
same roof as her mom’s. 

And her mom didn’t stop her only daughter from leaving her house late at 
night, as she was still feeling disappointed at Madison. 

That night the pregnant young woman decided to make the five-hour drive to 
her dad’s. She felt confident knowing that her mom hasn’t been in contact with 
her dad, not since their divorce. 

“Hi baby,” Ralph’s voice was calming her down. 

She was pulling over to the side of the road to take his call, not wanting him to 
hear her surrounding. She was lying, telling him that she was at her mom’s in 
bed and was sleepy already. 

Ralph sounded different, but Madison has her issues to deal with so she just 
let it go, and the same feelings were passing through Ralph. He noticed that 



there was something different in her voice. But she was saying that she was 
fine when he asked, so he decided to let it go. 

They talk for a couple of more minutes before Madison ended the call telling 
him that she was sleepy already. While in reality, she was feeling the eerie 
vibe from her surrounding area. 

Shani had warned her about the in-depth feel, though the amulet protects her 
she could still sense them because the baby was giving her the once closed 
sixth sense ability. 

Madison put the car in gear and exhale when she managed to leave the 
wooded area behind, and her surrounding felt lighter once again. 

She felt sleepy when she decided to make a stop at the first diner she 
encountered. The coffee was bad and the food was worse, so it didn’t take her 
long before she was back on the road. 

Looking at her GPS it was another two hours of dark roads before she would 
reach her dad’s suburb town. 

But she wasn’t far from the diner when she almost ran over a deer, her car 
swerved and she almost hit a tree. She was fine, the car was fine, but the 
almost incident had shocked her eyes awake. 

“Fvck!” she cursed and swiftly turned switch the engine back on and put the 
car in gear. 

It took her less hand two hours to reach her dad’s, but she didn’t believe her 
eyes when she saw him getting out of a car then move to the passenger seat 
and a woman was quick to k!ss her dad. The couple continues k!ssing until 
Madie lost sight of them behind her dad’s front door. 

“Damn!” she cursed knowing that she couldn’t stay at her dad’s, the 
awkwardness would be too great and she surely doesn’t want to deal with the 
fakeness of new acquaintances. 

I should’ve called first…stupid! she thought when she turns the car around 
and headed to the nearest gas station. 



Madison was thinking of staying in a motel that she passed earlier, just to 
sleep and then to think about what she was going to do with her holiday and 
how to avoid Ralph since she was not ready for him. 

Not yet. 

Morning came too soon, and she was sleeping it off until the sun hits her in 
the eyes and she noticed the sleazy motel she was resting in. She washed 
her face then called her new best friend Kendra. 

“…so, yeah…I need a place for the holidays. I was thinking can I  hide out at 
yours?” Madison asked while sitting on the edge of the bed, wanting to get out 
of there soonest. 

“Aww Madie, you should really talk it out with him, I know for sure that he 
loves you very much. But of course, you can stay at mine. Brian insisted that I 
move in with him.” Kendra let out a nervous laugh. 

Madison congratulated her, she was glad that Kendra was finding her 
happiness with Brian. And though she still hated him, but she was glad that he 
was taking responsibility. 

It somehow showed her that people can change. Some of them. 

“…though the lease would be over next week and I wasn’t going to extend the 
rent…because of my parent, you know…they cut me off, including their 
financial support.” 

Madison sighed at the news. It was perfect, she knows Kendra’s place. 
Modest, quiet, little apartment near campus. It was perfect for her holiday 
hideout. 

“I’ll take care of your lease, don’t worry about it…” 

Madison was not loaded as Ralph but having divorce parents means that she 
gets double of her allowance and her parents were successful enough that 
she has her savings. But it was mainly because she spends her money on 
books, not like other divorce b.rats who shops and travel a lot. 

It was almost in the evening when she reached Kendra’s apartment, and she 
looked at her watch knowing that Ralph would check in on her in a couple of 
more hours. 



And like a scheduled appointment she was back to her friendly conversation 
with her boyfriend. And the couple both were lying telling everything was fine 
while in reality both were falling apart. Both busy with different issues on their 
mind. 

 


