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Two years later 

“You look beautiful Madison,” 

“Thank you, mom.” She h.ugged Nancy when they were finished with the 
wedding ceremony. Madison was glowing with her baby bump, she was in her 
second trimester. 

They decided to fast forward the wedding day when they found out about the 
unplanned pregnancy. She was blaming Ralph for his carelessness but smiled 
knowing she couldn’t be any happier when they found out that she was 
pregnant. 

After the last miscarriage, she would worry if she could conceive in the future. 
And Ralph had agreed to keep everything quiet until her pregnancy was 
confirmed by her doctor. 

And after that, all hell breaks loose when she told Nancy. She congratulated 
them after she called the wedding organizer and told them to secure a place 
for her son’s wedding. 

Nancy was upset with the sudden change of plan but was thrilled with the 
news. Tough that means Maddie was juggling her last year of college and 
wedding preparation at the same time. Luckily she had Amanda, Kendra, 
Jessica, and the whole crew of Nancy’s choice of wedding organizer helping 
her out with the wedding. 

Ralph’s mom was the head of the wedding committee, and she had 
successfully succeeded in making the women and men follow her leads and 
held a very grand wedding event for their acquaintances. 

Alan, Ralph’s dad was very proud of his son. He had turned out to be a very 
fine young man, Ralph even started to work in one of their offices and Nancy 
couldn’t be any more joyful for the newlyweds. 

Within those two years, Jessica and Madison have continued their friendship 
and grew closer, while Kendra was also very happy with her little family. 



It took time for Kendra to be accepted by Brian’s dad, but he finally did after 
Kendra showed him his first grandson. The little guy managed to melt his 
heart and Kendra was happy with her life. Although her parents still didn’t 
acknowledge her, she was still thankful for what she has. 

As to Madison’s parents, they were there at her wedding day, still at their 
usual capacity as her parents, too distant and too estranged. 

“He was looking at you, you know that right? why don’t you forgive him?” 

“He cheated on me, why would I want to forgive him.” 

Jessica was helping Madison with her dress after she went to the bathroom. 
And Madison took that time to scold Jessica about Tyler. 

“I’m sure there’s a good explanation, why don’t you give him the chance to 
explain? I know he loves you. Ralph said so too.” 

“Pfft… maybe, I don’t know. I need to think about this. I read somewhere, 
once a cheater always a cheater.” 

Madison sighed, knowing the issue was too delicate and Jessica can be so 
stubborn. She decided to back down and give them time to mend their 
problem. 

“Madison, babe…wifey, baby momma, our first dance is up. Let me show you 
how I can still twirl you with all those baby weights.” Ralph walked into her 
bridal suite in search of his new bride. 

Madison laughed while Jessica shook her head, mumbling, telling the couple 
that she still believes that they’re too young to be parents. 

“Thank you for your vote of confidence Jessica, I know you love us too much 
that you will guide us and make Madison a fit mom for our future baby.” 

“Ralph, it’s you. Madison is great. She’ll be the greatest mom for your kid, it’s 
you that I’m worried about.” 

“I know and I’m humbled to know you and will have you as the godmother. 
There, it’s settled. Jessica will be our daughter’s godmother.” 

“Oh my god! It’s going to be a girl?!” 



“Ralph! This was supposed to be a surprise.” Madison sighed knowing her 
new husband was too excited when they find out about the baby’s gender. 

He couldn’t wait to reveal it to everyone and at that moment almost everyone 
knows already. While his mom was the only one who was still kept in the dark, 
just because she was too excited to host the baby shower complete with the 
baby gender revealing event in it. 

“Come on, let’s do the dance and stick with the schedule. We do not want the 
mother of the groom to be stressed out.” 

Ralph chuckled took Maddie’s hand and tugged it with enough force that she 
was pulled and bumped onto his c.hest with excellent precision. Madison 
laughed and Jessica decided to leave the newlyweds in their own little bubble. 

She was out the door and decided to go back to the ballroom and that was 
when Tyler showed up in front of her. 

“Jess, you got to listen to me.” 

“Not now Tyler, your mom needs me.” 

“And you don’t think I need you?” 

“If you do, you won’t be k!ssing your PA! fvck you, Tyler! you’ve embarrassed 
me in front of the whole office!” 

“She’s gone, and I didn’t k!ss her!” 

“Well, I’m not the only one seeing it. And it doesn’t matter that she’s gone, it 
won’t matter if she stays. We’re done!” 

They were still arguing when Ralph and Madison decided to exit her bridal 
suite. 

“Oh, crap! wrong turn! wrong turn!” Ralph whispered in panic mode like a kid 
almost caught stealing from the cookie jar. 

Madison rolled her eyes but followed Ralph and took the longer route to the 
ballroom and left the bickering couple behind. 

“You know your brother should tell her what happened. He’s her first, she’s 
not like any other women he dated…” 



“Hey, don’t you think I’ve tried? she’s the godmother of our baby. Don’t you 
think I want her to be happy? even if it’s with Tyler, you know that guy is 
helpless right?” 

Madison nodded and let Ralph pulled her onto the dance floor once they 
reached the ballroom and decided to leave Tyler’s and Jessica’s issue for 
later. 

“I love you, my beautiful pregnant wife.” 

“I love you too, my handsome se.xy husband.” 

“I can’t wait to be inside you.” Ralph put his hand on her wa!st, whispering 
se.xily in the middle of the ballroom with everyone’s eyes looking at the new 
husband and wife. 

Madison looked at him, bite her l!p, and decided to play his game. 

“I can’t wait to have you on top of me, ravishing my body, devouring me, 
taking me to my org*asm, over and over again until my legs tremble.” She 
smiled sweetly at him making him gr0aned as he felt himself getting hard in 
front of everyone. 

“You’re one vicious wife.” 

“I am, but you love me to pieces.” 

“I do.” He pulled her in, k!ssing her deeply, and made people clap and cheer 
for the newlywed couple. 

Madison rests her head to his c.hest as they both sway to music being played 
by the small orc.hestra which Nancy picked out for the wedding day. 

That day Ralph felt complete, with Madison in his arms and their baby growing 
inside her belly. While Maddie was feeling safe in his embrace knowing she 
has the rest of her life to spend with him and she couldn’t wait to start her 
journey. Being a wife and a mom to their future children. Yes…being an only 
child she longed to fill their house with children’s laughter. 

********* 

The End 



 


