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There was time when he was little when he acted out, he was filled with so much anger 
because of his contention with his father. Even when he was still very young, Hunter 
used to but thead with his father, though he respected him, his father always used 
intimidation to make him behave. 

The training little Hunter had to go through was rather extreme, something that only a 
full grown warrior would be able to do and his father expected him to have the same 
ability as those battle hardened warriors. 

At eleven years old, after the attempt of murder, every time Hunter filled with rage, he 
would come to the cave behind the waterfall and met that sweet little girl, who had 
saved his life. His naïve smile and her innocent eyes were the only salvation for him, 
something that could make him feel better in a matter of second. 

Maybe he realized, only this little girl, who really cared about him, she was the only one, 
who tried to save his life while the other tried to hurt him. Needless to say, the training 
he had to go through was brutal. It was beyond one could imagine a young kid like him 
had to go through. 

But, with this little girl, he could be a child again, as little Hunter knew, this little girl 
wouldn’t hurt him, neither she would bring him pain. 

Therefore, now when Lilac looked so scared of him, Hunter felt a pang in his heart. He 
tried to gather his wits, but he felt restless. The horror in her eyes bothered him so 
much. 

“Love, I will not hurt you,” he said in a very gentle voice, keeping his distance from her 
because he knew how much she put her guard up against him. He didn’t want to 
provoke her further. 

Lilac was still reeling with the horrifying feeling after witnessing Hunter’s brutality. 

Maybe this was what people always said that you would never understand completely 
until you witnessed it with your own eyes. 



Lilac had known about the brutality of the lycan, but only now she understood the 
extreme of it and what was more terrifying was; what Hunter had done to Kellan was 
only a glimpse of what he was capable of doing. 

“Love, I am sorry.” Hunter didn’t move from his place. He looked like he was under a 
great torture and the sadness look in his eyes made Lilac snapped from her fear. 
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Hunter had never hurt her. He had done everything in his power to protect her. he 
promised, he swore to her that he would never cause her any pain and he proved it all 
this time when he always stood by her. 

“Lilac…” 

99 

The way he called her name was filled with longing and misery, which let Lilac knew 
how much he cared for her. He was worried with her reaction and this made Lilac 
loosened up a little bit. 

“I will never hurt you, you know that, love…” 

Yes, Lilac knew about that too, but it was so hard to undo what she had seen, but at the 
same time, Lilac felt bad because she caused Hunter to be in distress, somehow she 
was being very sensitive. Probably because she just learned the truth about her father 
and also her mother almost at the same time, which made her very emotional and 
couldn’t think clearly. 

Complicated with her own feeling, Lilac started to cry. She was afraid of Hunter, but at 
the same time she needed him. After she learned what happened to her mother, she 
needed his comfort… 

“Don’t cry.” Hunter approached Lilac carefully and once he was close to her, he hugged 
her tightly. He felt relief because Lilac didn’t reject him again like before. 

It took Lilac a while to gather her thought and calm herself down, as she welcomed 
Hunter’s touch. 

Weirdly, she felt safe in his arms, even though she was afraid of him a moment 

ago. 



it was so weird how thing worked when it came to your loved one. 

Along that time, Hunter didn’t say anything, he only hugged her, caressed her and 
kissed her head, offering comfort that he could. 

Only after an hour had passed, Lilac wiped her tears and lifted her head. Her eyes were 
swollen. “I am sorry, I didn’t mean to push you away…” she ended up apologizing 
because the look on Hunter’s eyes when she rejected him etched in her mind and as 
time went by, she regretted her reaction. 

She shouldn’t have done that. 

Hunter was very patient with Lilac. He didn’t want her to be very emotional again 
because it wouldn’t be good for her current condition. 

“I am sorry, I scared you.” Hunter caressed her cheeks. “I will never do it again in 
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Hunter didn’t promise Lilac that he wouldn’t hurt someone again, but he promised not to 
do it in her presence and Lilac noticed that, yet she didn’t say anything. 
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“Do you want to eat something? You have been sleeping throughout the night. You 
must be hungry.” 

Now Hunter mentioned about it, Lilac felt her stomach was growling. Crying after a long 
sleep and traumatic event were not a good combination. 

But, what was more embarrassing was when Hunter chuckled when he heard that. 

“Let’s go find something you can eat,” he said happily. 

Lilac was a little bit put her guard up with Hunter and he noticed that too, but it went 
better than the alpha expected. He grabbed her hand and took her out of the bedroom. 
Fresh air in the morning was good for her. 



However, when they were on their way to the kitchen, they met Raya. 

“Lilac, are you okay?” Raya asked after she greeted the alpha. “I heard you fainted 
yesterday.” 

“I am fine,” Lilac said timidly. 

“Are you going to the kitchen? I just cooked breakfast, do offered. 

you 

want it?” Raya 
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“There is no need for that, Raya.” Hunter stopped her before Lilac could answer her 
offer. He took her hand and walked away. 

Lilac 

gave Raya an apologetic look, while she simply waved her hand and smile, as if saying; 
she understood. 

Here, Lilac felt it again. The way Hunter was with her and other people was very 
different, as if he was two different people, or maybe three; the loving one, the aloof one 
and the cruel one. 



“Why are you staring at me, love?” Hunter glanced at Lilac with a soft smile on the 
corner of his lips. 

“Why do you treat your pack member coldly?” Lilac asked curiously, she started to feel 
more comfortable with him again. What happened earlier might be because she was too 
shock after hearing what happened to her mother, thus seeing Hunter’s brutal side 
didn’t.go well with her already messed up mind. 

“Me?” Húnter raised his brows. “I didn’t.” 

Lilac pursed her lips. “You did.” 

e cause 

Even now, Lilac didn’t want to talk about what Kellan had told her, she was not ready to 
bring up the topic and Hunter didn’t pressure her to know what the of her sudden broke 
down and what Kellan had said to her. 

“I act like usual,” Hunter didn’t even know if he acted differently. 

“No. I feel like you are more intimidating whenever you are with your pack member. It 
feels like whenever you were around, they didn’t even dare to raise their head and look 
at you.” Lilac tried to 

describe it, but she did a poor job and Hunter chuckled. “Why are you laughing.” 

“I am their alpha, Lilac. Of course, the way I with them will be very different with the way 
I am with you.” Hunter opened the door to the kitchen and two women greeted him 
politely. “All of you can leave.” 

The two of them immediately left the kitchen without saying anything and nodded 
politely at Lilac. 

“See? The way you speak with them, you are rather cold and very intimidating.” 
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Lilac pointed that out, which Hunter thought about it for a while and agreed. 



“I don’t have any obligation to be nice with them.” Hunter pulled a chair and let her sat 
down. He kissed her forehead and then started to cook. “I only need to be nice with 
you.” 

“You are still an alpha even when you are with me.” 

“No. I am Hunter. Not an alpha when I am with you.” 

In another word, what he showed people and the way he treated them was how an 
alpha should act. An alpha was a leader of the pack, it was understandable if they had 
to be more strict and firm with their act. 

However, Hunter was not a strict alpha or a ruler of the pack when he was with Lilac. He 
became himself and the person he became was someone, who loved this woman 
dearly. 

“Do you want to eat something? Are you… craving for a certain dish?” There were a lot 
of thing Hunter wanted to talk with Lilac, but then it was not the right time. For 

he wanted to feed her first. 

now, 

Lilac gave some thought. “Meat.” 

It didn’t take long for Hunter to cook the meat Lilac wanted and serve it for her. She 
looked surprise by how well he could cook. 

“Literally, I can do anything,” Hunter said smugly and Lilac scrunched her nose when 
she heard that before laughing with him. Her fear toward him felt like a silly thing now. 
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After that, both of them enjoyed their meal and once they were done, Hunter took her to 
meet with the healer. S~ᴇaʀᴄh the  website  to access chapters of novels early and in 
the highest quality. 

Abigail looked surprised and then immediately checked Lilac’s condition. She could sigh 
in relief when both her and the baby were alright. It seemed, Lilac’s healing ability 
started to take care of her body. 

Werewolf was not as strong as lycan, thus their healing ability was rather slow. 

“She and the baby are fine,” Abigail informed the alpha and Lilac caught her word. 

“Baby?” Lilac furrowed her brows. “What do you mean?” 
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“That’s…” Abigail was flustered. She looked at the alpha and realized that he had not 
yet told her about it. “Oh, that’s because…” she couldn’t finish her words, because she 
didn’t know what to say. 

“You can leave, Abigail,” Hunter said, saving her from the situation. 

“Yes, alpha. I am sorry…” 

The healer immediately left the room, leaving only the two of them inside. 

“Hunter… what she meant with…” Lilac furrowed her brows and then touched her flat 
stomach. “Is that true? I am pregnant?” She was in disbelieve. 

“I didn’t mean to let you know about this pregnancy in this way, but yes, we are 
pregnant, Lilac.” Hunter said softly, he waited for Lilac’s reaction. “Are you fine with 
this?” 

Lilac was shocked. She felt like there were a lot of surprise that had happened in 
nowadays, which left her speechless. 

But of course, among all the surprises she had received recently, this one was the 
happiest. 

“Of course,” Lilac said in small voice. “Of course, I am happy.” She literally threw herself 
at him and hugged him so tightly. “I am very happy!” 

Lilac loved to have family of her own, she loved to think that one day she would meet 
with her mate and they started to have family, because she had none at that 

time. 

She always looked at the other children, whom walked with their parent with envy, 
because she wanted a family like that too. 

Therefore, when she found out about Aiden’s betrayal and how the person that she 
thought she would spend the rest of her life with would start family with another woman, 
it broke her completely. 

But right now, it was different. She had Hunter and they were going to have their own 
family. Her little happy family. 



“I will arrange for the ceremony to happen in three days,” Hunter said, kissing her neck. 
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The news about the ceremony to cement Lilac’s position in this pack was already a 
huge shock for them, but then another news hit them hard when they heard the alpha 
and the luna were pregnant and they were going to have the ceremony within three 
days. 

All of them were overjoyed, but there was not a small number of people, who was being 
sceptical that the alpha would finally settle down with someone. After all, the alpha had 
never been serious with every woman she was with. 

But then, they should have noticed that Lilac was different. The alpha treated her very 
differently from the previous women he was with. Not to mention she was having his 
child. 

Within three days, everyone was busy, there were a lot of things for them to do and talk 
about. Everyone gave them congratulation to their future luna, but some of them were 
still trying to keep distance from Lilac. 

Lilac herself didn’t mind that, because she knew that she couldn’t force them to like her. 
Everything took times and she believed in the process. 

And right now, she was surrounded by people that cared about her genuinely. 

“You look so pretty!” Raya cooed, as she entered the room and found Lilac with Lena 
and Rose. The four of them became very close and they were the people, who 
supported Lilac and helped her during this time to prepare her ceremony. Of course, the 
entire pack also helped. Sᴇaʀ*ᴄh the Findɴovel.ɴet website  to access chapters of 
novels early and in the highest quality. 
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be held by alpha Hunter 

After all, this was the first biggest ceremony that after so many years. 

“See? I told you, right? This tiara is so beautiful! It fits her greatly!” Lena added. She 
looked satisfied with her choice, because Lilac kept saying she wanted to keep it 
lowkey, but the two of them didn’t agree with her. This was her ceremony, she had to go 
all out and made everyone couldn’t take their eyes off her. 

“Where have you been?” Rose asked, as she brushed Lilac’s long hair lightly. “I have 
been looking for you, but I couldn’t find you anywhere.” 

“I was with Abigail,” Raya replied. “I got some prescription from her.” 

“Are you sick?” Lilac asked, she turned to face Raya. It was not common for a shifter to 
get sick, moreover Raya looked fine. 
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“No, it’s not for me.” Raya said, she waved her hands. “There is no need to think much 
about this. Let’s go out, if we let the alpha waited for long. I am afraid, he would charge 
inside this bedroom.” 

Lena and Rose giggled to hear that comment, while Lilac blushed. 

Currently, they were staying inside a tent near the river, the ceremony itself would be 
held at night under the moonlight and Lilac would put her mark on the alpha 

to seal their union. 

It was only Lilac who would do it, because Hunter had done that long before this 
moment. Marking your partner was a crucial thing for shifter, whether you were 
werewolf or lycan. 

And it was only the lycan, who would allow their woman to mark them back, which 
showed they were equal and both of them felt the pain of it and also pleasure for 
knowing your other half was yours forever, while werewolf only had to mark their woman 
without receiving the same thing back. 

Therefore, Lilac was extremely nervous to do this, because this was not even a tradition 
in her pack. She didn’t have any idea what to do. 



Even though three of her friends kept saying everything would be alright and she only 
needed to sink her teeth on Hunter’s neck, but then they had never had done it too 
themselves. 

However, all of Lilac’s anxiety slightly faded away when she saw Hunter was waiting for 
her. He smiled reassured her that everything would be alright. 

once her feet 

In this ceremony, Lilac required to take off her shoes and bare touched the cold ground, 
she felt so much better, this was a refreshing feeling, especially when the cold night 
wind brushed her cheeks and played with her hair, she only needed to put her focus on 
her mate and nothing else matter. 

Lilac was wearing black color, this color was the lycan pack’s color with her dress 
embroidered with their insignia on her back. The dress was beautiful and it was stitched 
with golden thread, giving off a regal aura for her. 

Thankfully, she was not showing yet, because the dress was rather tight around the 
upper part. The tiara on her head shimmered under the moonlight and this gave off an 
ethereal look on her. 

Everyone was in awed on how great Lilac could manage to pull this complicated dress. 
The black color didn’t give her a gloomy look, instead it emphasized her beauty, 
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Some of the pack member might not agree for her to be the luna of the pack, since she 
was a werewolf and they had never had a woman outside of their pack to be the luna 
before, but everyone had to agree on this; Lilac looked beautifully stunning right now. It 
took their breath away to see her waltzed toward the alpha. She carried herself very 
well. 

And for the last part, it was thanked to luna Jasmine for all of her lesson. Lilac couldn’t 
deny it that the luna had molded her into someone she was right now. 

“You look so beautiful,” Hunter said, he didn’t only say it, but his eyes told her that she 
was beautiful. Lilac had never felt this way before and she was almost crying because 
of how happy she was right now. 

“Thank you.” 

The sacred ceremony went well, everyone looked very happy and the night was 
magically, but miles away from the lycan pack, there was a certain alpha, who just 



received this news and currently, he was throwing everything that he could reach. His 
roar filled the room and everyone was trying to avoid him, lest they were being punished 
for even being exist. 

That was how bad Aiden was right now. 

“How could she move on so fast?! Did she cheat on me while I was away?!” Aiden had 
turned crazy right now, he co 

even think logical the moment he heard 

about the ceremony and how Lilac would put her mark on the lycan. 

“My son, there is no way she would have done that, they didn’t meet with each other 
until the party that we threw to mark our peace treaty.” Luna Jasmine tried to comfort 
her son. She was having a great headache with the fact Aiden would face trial, but then 
this news came and her son spiraled out of control. 

“How could she go through with that barbaric tradition?! Was she being forced!?” Aiden 
glowered. 

It seemed, no matter what luna Jasmine said, Aidan was having none of it, he 

looked insane. 

“We need to help her to get out of that pack!” Aiden rushed toward the door, but luna 
Jasmine immediately went to stop him. 

“You can’t do that, you can’t even leave the pack house or else you are going to lose 
your case in the trial! The other alphas will not happy with this!” 

“I. DON’T. CARE!” 
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Outside of the door, Ruby was holding Azel in her arms. She heard everything that 
Aiden said about wanting to go to the lycan pack and get Lilac back. He didn’t even shy 
to admit that he wanted that woman back in his life even though she was already 
someone else’s woman. 

He always said Lilac was his mate and the rejection didn’t mean anything. This was 
what happened if you couldn’t accept the rejection, slowly, you would go into a 
madness, where you couldn’t even think logically. 

Two of the ser vants stared at Ruby, they didn’t dare to say anything, but they 
understood this was a conversation she shouldn’t have listened. 

“Luna Ruby…” one of the ser vants talked, but Ruby already turned on her heels and 
then left. Azel was sleeping in her arms. 

These two ser vants were the people that luna Jasmine appointed to help her with Azel, 
but Ruby was no longer that naïve girl, who would believe that right away. 

Ruby and her two serv ants went back to Azel’s nursery room, which was right next to 
the luna’s bedroom. 

“Do you like this? You can take this.” Ruby asked, she showed the two ser vants two 
rings that she got from the present of Azel’s celebration in the other day. She fished out 
the rings from her pocket and watched the greediness in their eyes, though their lips 
said different things. 

“No, luna, those rings are very beautiful, but we can’t accept it.” 

The two ser vants were girls from the orphanage, the same orphanage that Lilac came 
from and the two of them were siblings. 

“You don’t need to be bothered, this is only gifts. I have a lot.” Ruby approached them 
and gave the rings to each of them, who refused at first, but then they pocketed the 
rings after a little bit more persuasion. 

This was only small movement, but she knew she had to start to do something and 
gather her own people, or else, she would only have miserable days ahead of hers. 



“You can leave, this is already very late at night.” Ruby didn’t ask anything from them 
after she gave the/rings, or at least, not yet. She dismissed them and then went to her 
own bedroom. 

Ruby hated Lilac. She hated her for having someone like Hunter by her side, 

III 

O 

Clure i58 

someone, who would go extra length to make her happy and when she compared that 
lycan alpha to Aiden, she felt very sorry to herself. 

But, at the same time in the lycan pack, it didn’t even cross Lilac’s mind about Ruby’s 
existence, because right now she had a great task at her hand. 

This was the last part of the ceremony, where she had to mark Hunter in front of the 
other pack member, under the moonlight, in the river. 

Right now, Hunter was already in the middle of the river, he took off his clothes and only 
wore his pants, the soft light of the moon fell on his chest and he looked ethereal. 

For Lilac, she would go to him. She had changed her dress into a simple white dress 
and then deep herself into the river that reached her waist, while the pack members 
were standing around the river, each of them was holding a candle. 

The water was surprisingly not as cold as she thought and each step she took, she felt 
her heart was beating harder. 

Would her heart burst the moment she reached him. What would happen then? Baby… 
please, help your mother to get through tonight. Lilac prayed. She touched her stomach 
subconsciously, but her subtle gesture didn’t go unnoticed by Hunter and this made his 
eyes turned warm. 

He was going to have the woman that he wanted and she would be his forever. This 
woman, who had saved his life years ago was going to be the mother of his child, she 
was going to be the only woman for him right now, the only person he was growing old 
with and raising their child. 

They would start this little family. It was his dream, so did she. 

Hunter stretched out his hand when Lilac was close enough and pulled her closer, he 
could feel how cold her hand was and the anxiety in her beautiful eyes. The moon and 
the stars reflected in her eyes when she stared at him. 



“Are you ready?” Hunter asked in small voice, which only the two of them, who could 
hear that. 

“I am not sure,” Lilac replied in the same tone. She grimaced when she glanced at his 
neck. “I might hurt you.” 

“Don’t worry, you will never hurt me.” If the pain came from her, Hunter was more than 
willing to accept it. 
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“It will be very painful.” Lilac frowned. She remembered how painful it was. 

Of course, Hunter was aware of that, therefore, he marked her while giving her the 
pleasure. Some of the man did that to alleviate the pain from their mate, because if they 
had done it during a ceremony like this, there was no way the pleasure part would exist. 

“Or should you give me the pain and pleasure too like I did to you?” Hunter teased her 
and this made Lilac blushed. 

“There are so many people here!” Lilac hissed fiercely. 

“I am not serious, Lilac. You are very tensed.” Hunter pecked on her lips and chuckled. 

The sight of their alpha was being playful came as surprise for the pack member, 
because it had never happened before. How could be the alpha being very relax and 
comfortable with the woman he just met less than a year? 

They couldn’t comprehend this. 

“Do it, I will be able to hold it.” Hunter pushed Lilac’s head, until her lips touched his 
neck and he gasped. He wanted her lips all over him, not only on his neck, but he had 
to press down those thoughts and focus on this moment. 

No matter how he lusted over his mate, there was no way he would degrade her by 
doing something in front of hundred pair of eyes. 

Hunter wrapped his arms around her waist and caressed her back to soothe her 

nervousness. 

Lilac was flustered, it should be her, who did the soothing, but Hunter did it for her 
instead. “I am sorry in advance if I hurt you.” 



“Even if you hurt me, you don’t need to be sorry. My life belongs to you. I am yours and 
that will never change.” Hunter squeezed her body, he wanted to hug her like this 
forever. 

With that, Lilac calmed herself down and started to sink her teeth to make her mark on 
his neck, he could feel Hunter’s body tensed up when she went too deep and could 
taste his blood. 

And when she thought she needed to stop and it was enough, Hunter pressed her head 
gently and let her sunk her teeth even deeper, sealed the fate between them, marked 
him as hers, just like how he marked her as his. 
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Under many eyes that witnessed their union, there was a pair of eyes that stared at 
them intently. 
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Outside of the door, Ruby was holding Azel in her arms. She heard everything that 
Aiden said about wanting to go to the lycan pack and get Lilac back. He didn’t even shy 
to admit that he wanted that woman back in his life even though she was already 
someone else’s woman. 

He always said Lilac was his mate and the rejection didn’t mean anything. This was 
what happened if you couldn’t accept the rejection, slowly, you would go into a 
madness, where you couldn’t even think logically.. 

Two of the se rvants stared at Ruby, they didn’t dare to say anything, but they 
understood this was a conversation she shouldn’t have listened. 

“Luna Ruby…” one of the serv ants talked, but Ruby already turned on her heels and 
then left. Azel was sleeping in her arms. 

These two serv ants were the people that luna Jasmine appointed to help her with Azel, 
but Ruby was no longer that naïve girl, who would believe that right away. 

Ruby and her two serv ants went back to Azel’s nursery room, which was right next to 
the luna’s bedroom. 

“Do you like this? You can take this.” Ruby asked, she showed the two serv ants two 
rings that she got from the present of Azel’s celebration in the other day. She fished out 
the rings from her pocket and watched the greediness in their eyes, though their lips 
said different things. 

“No, luna, those rings are very beautiful, but we can’t accept it.” 

The two serv ants were girls from the orphanage, the same orphanage that Lilac came 
from and the two of them were siblings. 

“You don’t need to be bothered, this is only gifts. I have a lot.” Ruby approached them 
and gave the rings to each of them, who refused at first, but then they pocketed the 
rings after a little bit more persuasion. 

This was only small movement, but she knew she had to start to do something and 
gather her own people, or else, she would only have miserable days ahead of hers. 

“You can leave, this is already very late at night.” Ruby didn’t ask anything from them 
after she gave the rings, or at least, not yet. She dismissed them and then 
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went to her own bedroom. 

Ruby hated Lilac. She hated her for having someone like Hunter by her side, someone, 
who would go 

to make her happy and when she 

to Aid 100% 

that lycan alpha she felt very sorry to herself. 
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compared- 

But, at the same time in the lycan pack, it didn’t even cross Lilac’s mind about 

she had a great task at her hand. 

Ruby’s existence, because right now, 

This was the last part of the ceremony, where she had to mark Hunter in front of the 
other pack member, under the moonlight, in the river. 

Right now, Hunter was already in the middle of the river, he took off his clothes and only 
wore his pants, the soft light of the moon fell on his chest and he looked ethereal. 

For Lilac, she would go to him. She had changed her dress into a simple white dress 
and then deep herself into the river that reached her waist, while the pack members 
were standing around the river, each of them was holding a candle. 

The water was surprisingly not as cold as she thought and each step she took, she felt 
her heart was beating harder. Sᴇaʀ*ᴄh the  website  to access chapters of novels early 
and in the highest quality. 

Would her heart burst the moment she reached him. What would happen then? Baby… 
please, help your mother to get through tonight. Lilac prayed. She touched her stomach 
subconsciously, but her subtle gesture didn’t go unnoticed by Hunter and this made his 
eyes turned warm. 



He was going to have the woman that he wanted and she would be his forever. This 
woman, who had saved his life years ago was going to be the mother of his child, she 
was going to be the only woman for him right now, the only person he was growing old 
with and raising their child. 

They would start this little family, It was his dream, so did she. 

Hunter stretched out his hand when Lilac was close enough and pulled her closer, he 
could feel how cold her hand was and the anxiety in her beautiful eyes. The moon and 
the stars reflected in her eyes when she stared at him. 

“Are you ready?” Hunter asked in small voice, which only the two of them, who could 
hear that. 

“I am not sure,” Lilac replied in the same tone. She grimaced when she glanced at 
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his neck. “I might hurt you.” 
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“Don’t worry, you will never hurt me.” If the pain came from her, Hunter was more than 
willing to accept it. 

“It will be very painful.” Lilac frowned. She remembered how painful it was. 

Of course, Hunter was aware of that, therefore, he marked her while giving her the 
pleasure. Some of the man did that to alleviate the pain from their mate, because if they 
had done it during a ceremony like this, there was no way the pleasure part would exist. 

“Or should you give me the pain and pleasure too like I did to you?” Hunter teased her 
and this made Lilac blushed. 



“There are so many people here!” Lilac hissed fiercely. 

“I am not serious, Lilac. You are very tensed.” Hunter pecked on her lips and chuckled. 

The sight of their alpha was being playful came as surprise for the pack member, 
because it had never happened before. How could be the alpha being very relax and 
comfortable with the woman he just met less than a year? 

They couldn’t comprehend this. 

“Do it, I will be able to hold it.” Hunter pushed Lilac’s head, until her lips touched his 
neck and he gasped. He wanted her lips all over him, not only on his neck, but he had 
to press down those thoughts and focus on this moment. 

No matter how he lusted over his mate, there was no way he would degrade her by 
doing something in front of hundred pair of eyes. 

Hunter wrapped his arms around her waist and caressed her back to soothe her 

nervousness. 

Lilac was flustered, it should be her, who did the soothing, but Hunter did it for her 
instead. “I am sorry in advance if I hurt you.” 

“Even if you hurt me, you don’t need to be sorry. My life belongs to you. I am yours and 
that will never change.” Hunter squeezed her body, he wanted to hug 

her like this forever. 
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With that, Lilac calmed herself down and started to sink her teeth to make her mark on 
his neck, he could feel Hunter’s body tensed up when she went too deep and could 
taste his blood. 

And when she thought she needed to stop and it was enough, Hunter pressed her head 
gently and let her sunk her teeth even deeper, sealed the fate between them, marked 
him as hers, just like how he marked her as his. 



Under many eyes that witnessed their union, there was a pair of eyes that stared at 
them intently. 
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Lilac could feel how Hunter’s body tensed up when she sunk her teeth. She tased his 
blood and knew that she hurt her, but at the same time, she felt how intimate they were 
right now and how strong her feeling toward him. 

As if Hunter said the color of the sky was white, she would believe it without a second 
thought. This strong feeling made her heart burst with love and euphoric. She felt like 
she could do anything if it was with him. 

Was this how you felt when you marked someone? This feeling was very intense! Was 
this how Hunter felt when he marked her? 

That was why the bond between mate was very strong, especially the alpha and the 
luna. 

Lilac couldn’t be more grateful that Aiden didn’t mark her before he left for war, because 
with the intensity of this feeling, she was sure, she wouldn’t be able to give up on him no 
matter how much he hurt her. This feeling was very strong, but at the same time, it was 
very scary. 

Lilac was not sure how long she bit Hunter, but she knew it was done and pushed him 
away slightly to see his face. She wanted to see how much she had hurt him. 



And she was shock when she saw how pale Hunter was, blood trickled down from his 
neck, but there was this satisfying smile on his lips. 

She was about to apologize to him, but then he kissed her roughly. He didn’t want to 
hear her apology, because right now, he swore that he was the happiest creature 

in this realm. Sᴇaʀ*ᴄh the Find  website  to access chapters of novels early and in the 
highest quality. 

Hunter put his hand on the back of her head and plunged his tongue into his mouth, 
swallowed whatever words she was going to say to him, because he didn’t want to hear 
any of it. 

He kissed her roughly to the point, Lilac was no longer care about the people around 
her, as she gave up all of her sense to focus on his touch, how close they were and how 
happy she was. The sound of people cheering for them faded away on the back of her 
mind when she reciprocated his kiss. 

It felt like fire had been lit up and now she wanted both of them to be burned in this 
flame of affection. 
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How much she loved this man couldn’t be described into word. 

Her breathing became heavy and she felt dizzy, as she breathed heavily when Hunter 
pulled away and grinned at her. 

“Breath, love…” he said softly. 

Aiden remembered the feeling of being complete, as if he had finished a heavy task and 
then all of the burden on his shoulders had been lifted up. 

He had never felt this kind of happiness and fulfilment in his entire life until he laid his 
eyes on Lilac for the first time. 

She was one of the orphan girl, skinny and was very timid, but her beautiful eyes 
captivated him, as if there was something inside those beautiful eyes that drew him 
closer to her. Something magical when he touched her and felt this spark, tempting him 
to touch her further. 



Aiden still remembered how his heart burst into incredible happiness when he said the 
word. Mate. 

Yes. He found his mate two years ago only a few weeks before he had to lead his 
warriors to war in order to fight the lycan. 

He remembered how she stared at him in disbelieve and how her lips quirked into a 
smile, she looked relief. 

He remembered how she tried not to cry when she sent him off for war. He remembered 
how she hugged him very tightly and he comforted her by saying he would be back for 
her and then they could together again. 

He remembered how he waited his time to come home to her. 

However, Aiden didn’t remember when he started to forget that feeling and fall for Ruby. 
Being away from his mate for so long and was in a warzone with countless people died 
everyday had numbed his feeling and made him forgot about the happiness he felt 
when he was with her. 

And then came Ruby. 

Aiden knew how foolish he was to think he could make things right by bringing 

2/3 

Need Top Metal Stamping? Get a 10% Discount (Start Now) 

3/3 

IVIUTI, 20 vid 

Chapter 154 

Ruby back to the pack, thinking he would be a father and he couldn’t let his firstborn to 
be born out of the pack. 

He forgot how much he craved for Lilac’s presence, as he was thinking he did the right 
thing to take responsibility for what he had done. 

He shouldn’t have done that. He shouldn’t have brought Ruby to the pack. 

If she stayed away from him and he left her in her village. Lilac would still by his side 
and he wouldn’t be this miserable. 



Only after he saw her again and the pain in her eyes that he realized what he had lost. 
Especially when she rejected him. He couldn’t accept that. He didn’t want her to leave. 
He wanted her. 

“Ugh!” Aiden opened his eyes with a great headache and heavy heart. He felt like his 
body had weighed a ton and he could barely move. 

“You are awake now?” 

Aiden was familiar with his voice and tried to open his eyes to see his father, the former 
alpha of the pack. Alpha James. 

Because Aiden was under trial, alpha James took his position again, since a position of 
an alpha shouldn’t be left empty. 

“What are you doing here, father?” Aiden groaned, he raised his hand to cover his eyes 
from the light of the sun. It was already morning and he didn’t know when exactly he 
passed out and dream about her. 

Aiden didn’t want to wake up and continue his dream again. 

At the very least, in his dream, he had her. They were happy together. 

“Get up!” alpha James said sternly. “Get your act together! This is not how I raised my 
son!” 

SEND GIFT 

୦ 

Sᴇarch the  website  to access chapters of novels early and in the highest quality. 

 
Chapter 155 

Chapter 155 

Alpha James had enough with his son, he wanted him to get his act together. Their 
pack was in a great danger because of him, not only that, he endangered himself too by 
allowing his impulsivity got the better of him. 

Right now, Aiden was not the proud son he had. The son, who managed to bring peace 
to the one year war with the lycan by killing their alpha. That was not the brave son he 
knew. 



He could understand if he was having some regret for letting go Lilac and made a bad 
decision, but after everything had been done and said, also there was a child, his 
firstborn that added to the equivalent, of course, it was time to move on! 

What kind of alpha, who would spend all of his time wallowing over someone else’s 
woman? 

“Are you going to die like this?!” Alpha James couldn’t accept this. The trial would put 
Aiden in bad situation, especially when he couldn’t get the help from the other alphas. 
He was going to die if they let thing escalated wildly. 

However, Aiden didn’t seem have any indication he wanted to preserve his life. He 
didn’t have any desire to fight and was very hangover from drinking so much last night. 

“Get up!” Alpha James hollered. He was livid. This time, he didn’t use his word again 
and immediately grabbed Aiden by his collar and then dragged him to the bathroom, 
threw him on the floor and poured cold water on his head. 

Right at that time, luna Jasmine entered the bathroom and saw what her mate was 
doing to her precious son and immediately intervened, she pushed James away and 
hugged her son. 

“What are you doing?! Are you going to hurt him more?! He is already in so much pain! 
Why are you trying to hurt him again!?” Luna Jasmine glared at him. 

This was always something that became the source of their contention recently. 
Jasmine coddled Aiden so much, no matter what mistake he did. 

“If you are going to let him like that, he is going to lose everything! Can’t you see how he 
destroyed himself?!” James had enough with the way Jasmine pampered their son. 
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She had been doing this over and over again. Thankfully, Aiden didn’t grow up to be a 
spoiled child, but then it didn’t help him to be mature too. 

“Can’t you be more gentle with him? He has gone through a lot! Why would you want to 
put him down even more!?” Luna Jasmine kept defending her son and she told James 
to go out of the room. 

James was very disappointed in his son, but he couldn’t argue with Jasmine, 



because he knew her so well, thus he also knew there was no point of arguing with her. 

11 

“Are you awake?” Lilac asked Hunter softly when she saw he started to move. 

“Hm…” Hunter turned his body around and hugged her tightly, which let their skin glued 
to each other again and this made the spark between them erupted deliciously. 

They were still naked under the blanket and after the ceremony last night, which could 
be said went smoothly, even though with short preparation, the two of them were thrown 
into a passionate night. 

“Are you, okay?” Hunter opened his eyes, he tried to examine her skin, thankfully there 
was no sign of what he did to her last night. 

Hunter tried to be gentle with her, but he couldn’t help himself, but lost his control a little 
bit in the middle of it. 

“I am fine,” Lilac said lazily, she nuzzled his neck and saw her mark, somehow, she was 
fascinated. It didn’t look bad. She liked the concept of it, which she wouldn’t have it in 
her former pack. 

“Now, officially you are the luna of the pack.” Hunter caught her lips and kissed them, 
nibbled on them and bit them. He He 

“Hm…” Lilac moaned satisfied. There wad the taste of them. 

better, but being in her mate’s arms. 

nothing else that could make her felt 

“After this, I am going to announce your pregnancy,” Hunter said firmly. It should have 
been done before the trial. 

“Okay…” Lilac agreed with him. 
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The trial would be held within two days from now and tomorrow they would go to Golden 
Claw pack again. Lilac was not thrilled to go back there again. 



“Do you want a daughter or a son?” Lilac asked. 

“It doesn’t matter if the baby is a son or a daughter, as long as you were the one to give 
birth to them, I will love them the same.” 

Lilac blushed when she heard that, it was not everyday Hunter would say something like 
that and she loved it to the bit. 

However, Lilac and Hunter’s happiness while waiting for the birth of their child was the 
exact opposite of what Ruby was feeling right now. 

In the distance, she could see alpha James walked out of Aiden’s bedroom. He looked 
very livid. Right now, he was the alpha of the pack again because Aiden was in trial. 

Ruby bit her lip, she balled her fists and then walked toward James with baby Azel in 
her arms. The baby was sleeping and he looked so adorable. 

“Did you manage to talk with him, alpha James?” Ruby strike a conversation with 

Aiden’s father. 

Alpha James initially didn’t interact with her so much, especially with the drama upon 
her arrival, therefore, he was rather surprised when Ruby initiated a conversation first. 

“Not really,” Alpha James grumbled. His eyes fixed on Azel. “You need to try to talk with 
him. He needs to get his act together, or else, the alpha lycan will crush him. I am sure, 
he would demand the heaviest punishment.” 

2014 

Ruby moved closer, showing the baby in her arms. “He will not listen to me,” she said 
with a deep sigh. “Do you want to hold baby Azel, alpha James?” 
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