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The designers surrounding her also followed. Jocelyn glanced at her and said lightly, 
“Okay, what advice are you going to give me, Miss Rothschild?” 

Bella covered her lips and chuckled. Her voice sounded so pretentious that Jocelyn got 
goosebumps. “Miss White, don’t say that. I can’t give you any advice. You got an 
allergic reaction during the competition yesterday, but you still insisted on finishing the 
design draft. I admire you so much! By the way, how is your body?” She heard that 
Jocelyn had won the Century Jewelry Competition before, so she wanted to praise 
Jocelyn while disparaging others. She thought that even though Jocelyn braced herself 
and finished the competition in a commendable manner even if she had an allergic 
reaction yesterday, she still would not win the competition. 

 

She was the most likely to win among this group of people. In front of Jocelyn, who was 
slightly famous before, Bella suddenly had a huge sense of superiority. 

Jocelyn glanced at her but did not expose what she was thinking. Her tone was neither 
humble nor arrogant when she said, “Thank you for your concern, I am much better 
now.” 

When Bella saw the reporter taking a photo, she immediately took Jocelyn’s hand 
affectionately, and said with a smile, “Miss White, I know you are very talented. You 
have won the Century Jewelry Competition before, but you have encountered a special 
circumstance this time. So, don’t worry too much, it’s just a competition. If you can’t win 
this time, you can try again next time.” 

Bella was behaving like she had the trophy in her bag. Jocelyn was not used to being so 
close to strangers. Therefore, she pulled her hand away stiffly from Bella’s. 

After hearing what Bella said, everyone was in an uproar. “No way, Jocelyn won the 
Century Jewelry Competition award!” “Gosh, you’ve utterly embarrassed yourself this 
time. Bella had a crushing defeat against 



you!” 

“You can’t say that, after all, she had an allergic reaction.” 

“Maybe that’s just an antic. Who can finish drawing their design draft after they get an 
allergic reaction, I don’t believe her.” 

Everyone was discussing among themselves. When Bella saw that she had reached 
her goal, she was smiling brightly. 

She even came forward and said something to help Jocelyn, “Don’t say nonsense. Miss 
White is sick this time, so she didn’t do her best. Don’t just speak without thinking.” 

“Bella, you’re too kind. You’re even helping her.” 

“Bella is so nice and she’s so talented.” 

“Maybe Jocelyn deliberately gave herself the allergic reaction as a way out since she 
knew she couldn’t win, and she didn’t want to lose face.” 

“Bella was even helping her when she’s doing that. What an angel!” 

Jocelyn was not blind or deaf so she could see and hear clearly. However, she stood at 
one side coldly and did not speak. Lexie looked at everyone, a look of disgust flashed in 
her eyes. Her expression was also filled with displeasure. 

She could not take it anymore and was about to fly into a fit of rage but was stopped by 
Jocelyn. 

Jocelyn glanced at her and shook her head slightly. 

Lexie’s eyes flashed and she glanced coldly at the nosey group of designers. Her eyes 
were frigid. 

Before the party started, both Bella’s character and influence received praise. 

She looked like she was on cloud nine and she would start floating on air soon. 

At ten o’clock, the party started on time. The host came to the stage. “Hello everyone, 
all the designers have come from afar to participate in the Greene City Ocean Heart 
Jewelry Competition. In order to welcome everyone, the organizer specially held today’s 
party and is planning to announce the winners at the party today.” The crowd looked 
expectant. The host chuckled. “I know you can’t wait to know the result. Alright, I won’t 
keep you on the hook. Before the party starts, I will satisfy everyone’s curiosity, okay?” 
“Okay!” The voices of the people at the party were scraggly, but their answers were 



surprisingly consistent. The host smiled. “First of all, let’s announce the third place, 
Peggy Schuman from Cloud City and also…” 

Three people got third place. The winners were overjoyed and the ones whose names 
had not been called were praying internally, hoping that they would be on the list for the 
second place. 

The host continued to read the list of winners, and two people got second place. Now, 
the designers who did not win anything looked dejected and disappointed. 

There was only one first place spot and it was also the champion of the competition. 

The host kept everyone on the hook. “Why don’t you all guess who will win the first 
place this 

time?” 

As soon as the host finished speaking, several designers surrounding Bella shouted 
one after another, “Bella!” 

The host looked down at the name on the card and his expression was distorted for a 
moment. 

He raised his head again and his expression returned to its natural state. He smiled and 
said, “Next, please congratulate the champion of Greene City Ocean Heart Jewelry 
Competition, Miss Jocelyn White from Mauve City. Everyone, please give her a round of 
applause!” 
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After the host finished announcing the list of winners, the expressions on the faces of 
the designers in this circle were very interesting. 

They glanced at Bella, then at Jocelyn. In the next second, everyone tried to distance 
themselves from Bella. There were different expressions on their faces. Contemptuous, 
ridicule, speechless… 



 

Bella stared at the host on stage in disbelief, her mouth crooked with anger, and her 
delicate little face became distorted. She never thought that this would be the result. 

A circle of pragmatic designers came to congratulate Jocelyn. Yet, Jocelyn’s expression 
was always indifferent The group of reporters also reacted and hurriedly took pictures of 
Jocelyn. Some of the smart reporters remembered just now that this group of people 
said Jocelyn had an allergic reaction during the competition. She could still win after 
getting an allergic reaction, what an antic! 

Hence, they quickly and carefully asked someone to inquire about the situation at that 
time and recorded it. 

The host was on stage and announced the last encouragement prize, and the winner 
was Bella, who thought she was the champion and was complacent. 

However, no one was paying attention to her now. 

Bella had never been so embarrassed since she was a child. 

Her uncle was just a judge who could only rate each contestant, but not decide the final 
result. 

However, when her uncle said that she was very good, she was full of confidence and 
thought she would win the first prize, but she never expected that she would receive a 
consolation prize as encouragement. 

Bella walked away sullenly when no one was paying attention. 

At the end of the party, Jocelyn received the trophy, and her name was already trending 
on the Internet #geniusdesignerjocelynwhite #receivedanawardevenwhenshewassick 

[How amazing! It’s rumored that she was sick and yet she still got the champion. 
Marvelous indeed!) 

[It’s not a rumor. She did get an allergic reaction. The organizer even posted a video of 
her during the competition. Her face looked so pale, and her body, neck, and face were 
covered in red spots. What a poor girl, but I am impressed!] 

(She’s superhuman. Who can finish a competition when they’re sick and even get the 
first 

prize?] 



[Which jewelry designer could be so amazing except for Jocelyn? Who else? Who else? 
From now on, Jocelyn is my idol. Anyone unconvinced, please step forward. I’ll kill all of 
you!] 

(She is Jocelyn White, a genius jewelry designer with patience, resilience, and talent!] 

Among the hashtags, a new hashtag appeared out of the blue and started trending. At 
the same time, it was even getting more and more popular. 

#jocelynwhitethenewjosiesonnetjr “Josie Sonnet Jr.? Are they talking about Jocelyn?” 
“Yeah! Go search her design draft online and all of them are so astonishing. She’s so 
truly talented.” 

“How long has Jocelyn gained fame? How can she compete with Josie? Josie is an 
international jewelry designer.” 

“Why not? Jocelyn is even more amazing than Josie back in the day. Josie got three 
consecutive champions in three months, and she was praised to the heavens online. On 
the contrary, Jocelyn got three consecutive champions in just half a month, so she’s 
much better! She is definitely worthy to be called Josie Jr.” “Hey, did you notice that 
Jocelyn looks kind of like Josie up-close? Are they relatives?” “Hey, you’re so nosey. Do 
you want to look up their ancestry?” 

This topic was extremely popular on the Internet and at this moment, the hospital 
posted the proof that Jocelyn almost went into anaphylactic shock after getting an 
allergic reaction. 

At this moment, Jocelyn’s resilience and talent were praised to the high heavens. 

Which designer was like this? 

It was also at this moment that Jocelyn felt she finally had the first show of her talent 
and made a name for herself in the jewelry world. 

On the plane going back to Mauve City, Jocelyn sat with Lexie. Davis went back in 
advance since he needed to take care of something. 

As for Yuni, she failed to drive a wedge between Jocelyn and Lexie, so she was hiding 
from the two. 

Plus, since Skyler threw a tantrum last night, he seemed to have disappeared. He had 
always been unpredictable, so Jocelyn did not think much about him. Inside the 
departure lounge, Lexie looked at the trending topics online and she was in a bad 
mood. 



“Why are they calling you Josie Jr.? You have a name!” She sounded enraged and her 
small face was getting colder and colder. 

Jocelyn sighed helplessly. “Don’t overthink, this is how everyone’s acknowledging my 
ability. I am pretty optimistic about this. Plus, Josie has been popular for so many years, 
and to be honest, my ability can’t compare to hers” 

Lexie said gloomily, “You’re much better than her!” Jocelyn burst into laughter. “That’s 
just in your heart, I know.” 

Lexie pressed her lips together and looked at Jocelyn. She did not say anything 
anymore. Jocelyn went back to work the next day after being back in Mauve City. When 
Jocelyn fell asleep last night, Skyler had not come back. Jocelyn thought he did not 
come back to No. 1, North Court. After she ate breakfast, she planned to go to work. 

In the end, the moment she picked up her car keys, Skyler came downstairs. “I’ll drive 
you to work today.” 

Jocelyn shook her head quickly. “No need, I can drive.” 

Skyler frowned and looked at her with no expression on his face. “You can drive me 
then.” 
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Jocelyn choked. Could she refuse? Skyler stared at Jocelyn and did not say anything. 
He lost his temper that night and never showed up in front of Jocelyn again. Now, he 
knew very well that he was bothered by that. Jocelyn is willing to listen to his words and 
talk to him just because she remembered his life-saving grace. However, in her heart, 
they were still in the relationship dictated by the agreement. Skyler felt agitated. It was 
what he wanted in the first place, and now he did not want it anymore. 

He was upset when he saw Jocelyn because her cold attitude toward him made him 
uncomfortable, and he wanted to find a place to vent his emotions. However, he started 
missing Jocelyn when he could not see her. When he recalled the various warnings he 



made to Jocelyn at the beginning, Skyler finally felt what it was like to shoot himself in 
the foot. 

 

They had not seen each other for two days. When Skyler looked at Jocelyn at this 
moment, his mood seemed to calm down. Jocelyn did not notice his abnormality. She 
thought about it seriously and said sincerely, “I’m going to the alumni party at night. If I 
send you to work, I won’t be able to send you back at night.” “You’re saying so many 
things, but you just don’t want to send me, right?” Jocelyn shook her head quickly. “No, 
I’m telling the truth.” Skyler snorted coldly, his voice frigid, “You just need to take me to 
work. You don’t have to worry about how I’m getting off work.” 

Jocelyn’s expression was still hesitant. 

Skyler’s expression became a little unpleasant. Many people begged to send him to and 
from work, but he only wanted her to do so. 

He had never felt such urgency to get close to a person before. 

His feelings and self-confidence were constantly competing with one another. He looked 
at Jocelyn deeply, and he had no choice but to take out his trump card, “I have a back 
injury and I’ll affect my wound if I drive.” Jocelyn’s face changed slightly, and she 
immediately looked at him with a worried expression. “I’ll drive you to work. I can take 
you back first at night and then go to the alumni party.” Skyler felt bitterness in his heart. 
Jocelyn was finally willing to send him to work and her attitude was also spectacular. 

It was a pity as she was just feeling guilty since he got hurt because of her. Skyler got 
into Jocelyn’s car, feeling horrible and sweet at the same time. If one had never liked 
someone before, they would not understand the contradictory feeling. 

Skyler knew that he could force Jocelyn to get a marriage certificate with him and even 
not get a divorce, but he could not force Jocelyn to fall in love with him sincerely and 
from the bottom of her heart. 

Jocelyn started the car and Skyler sat in the passenger seat. He had a dark look on his 
face and it was unknown what he was thinking. 

Jocelyn took the initiative to ask him, “Is your wound getting better?” 

Skyler glanced at her sideways, peeled off a piece of candy, and said in a low voice, 
“Yea, it’s getting better. Your design for the competition this time is pretty good. 
Congratulations.” 

The faint mint smell spread in the car. 



Jocelyn pursed her lips and said, “Thank you.” 

The theme of the Ocean Heart Jewelry Competition was to design a piece of jewelry 
based on the heart of the ocean. 

Her inspiration came from the artwork in Ocean Park, which was a bronze statue of the 
heart of the sea. She made changes and deformations on the two intersecting hearts 
and surrounded them with lace that looks like waves so that the meaning and beauty of 
the design coexisted. 

Skyler did not speak anymore. He looked out the car window, it was unknown what he 
was thinking as his expression was always cold and indifferent. 

They were almost at the company and Jocelyn finally remembered what happened with 
Giada. 

“By the way, Mr. Moore, what happened to Giada? Did she have something to do with 
my allergic reaction?” Jocelyn asked casually 

Skyler’s eyes sank and his expression was gloomy. “She’s not the one who gave you 
the allergic reaction. However, she was suspected of kidnapping and assault, so this 
time, I won’t let her come out and continue wreaking havoc.” 

Jocelyn understood and it seemed that this time Giada would not be let out without 
serving some time in prison 

However, this was fine Giada was a bad person and letting her out would be a danger 
to society 

Skyler raised an eyebrow and glanced at Jocelyn when he noticed that she was not 
speaking ” Are you feeling sorry for her again?” Jocelyn shook her head. “No, she 
deserves it, but does she really have nothing to do with my allergic reaction?” 

Skyler glanced at her and said vaguely, “You’ll find out later.” 

Jocelyn had no idea what Skyler meant by that. 

It was not until she arrived at the company that she saw the company-wide notice that 
Fiona 

was fired, so she guessed that this matter should have something to do with Fiona. 
Come to think of it, the reason Davis returned to Mauve City ahead of time was to deal 
with this matter. 

The fact that Skyler was making Fiona being fired so public meant he was trying to get 
her out of the jewelry industry. No one would dare to hire Fiona now unless they wanted 



to offend Skyler. One had to know that unless they did not want a place in the Century 
Jewelry Competition, they should not hire Fiona again after she was fired from 
Prosperity Jewelry. For some reason, Jocelyn remembered when they were eating in 
Moon Pavilion, Fiona looked thoughtful when she heard that Jocelyn was allergic. Also, 
the reason she did not want to join the Ocean Heart Jewelry Competition might be to 
create an alibi for herself. 

However, she did not think that Skyler would find out after she planned for so long. 

During lunch, David told Jocelyn the truth. “She has a relative working in the kitchen of 
the hotel we booked. He tampered with the porridge and added seafood. Back when I 
was having breakfast with Yuni, Fiona was there with us, so she knew Yuni had a habit 
of taking porridge for the people she was eating with. Hence, Fiona decided to tamper 
with the porridge.” Jocelyn suddenly realized what was going on. To be honest, the time 
between those actions was so long that she could not even connect the two. 

At the same time, Skyler was eating in the president’s office when he received an 
international phone call. 

“Skyler, how can you be so out of line?” Josie’s enraged and stifling voice came from 
the phone. 
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Skyler slowly took the phone a little further away, a trace of impatience flashed across 
his eyebrows. “What do you want?” 

Josie’s voice sounded angry and aggrieved. “Fiona meant something to me, how can 
you treat her like that? What heinous thing did she do? Do you need to cut off her hands 
like this? She won’t be able to hold a paintbrush in her life anymore!” 

 

Skyler completely ignored her anger and said indifferently, “It’s her fault so she can’t 
blame anyone else.” 



She hurt Jocelyn, so it was more than heinous. He almost lost Jocelyn from the 
anaphylactic shock. So, this was lenient by his standards. Skyler’s attitude was a huge 
blow to Josie. 

Her voice dropped and she said with deep sadness, “Skyler, you’ve changed. Since you 
got the marriage certificate with Jocelyn, you’ve turned into such a stranger to me.” 

After he heard Josie mentioning Jocelyn, Skyler’s expression turned completely cold, 
“This has nothing to do with her. Fiona is jealous of her and wants to take action against 
her, so I just let Fiona get what she deserves. Josie, you know my bottom line, don’t 
make me despise you.” 

Josie took a breath. “Skyler, don’t say that, I didn’t mean to provoke you. Fiona and I 
were friends after all. Aren’t you slapping me across the face by doing that?” Skyler 
looked indifferent. “You have been abroad for more than a month, what face am I 
slapping?” 

Josie was silent. 

She did not speak, and Skyler’s voice sounded impatient. “I’ll hang up first.” 

“Wait!” Josie raised her voice suddenly. “Skyler, I read on the Internet that Jocelyn looks 
a bit like me, right?” 

Skyler frowned. “It’s all nonsense!” 

Josie sounded a little stubborn. “But she does look like me, at least from her pictures, 
Skyler, are you treating her like a replacement for me? If not, I can come back now and 
you can break up with her, okay?” Skyler’s voice turned cold immediately, and it was 
laced with intense anger and warning,” Josie!” 

His expression looked very off-colored. “Don’t let me hear something like this ever 
again, if not, I won’t go easy on you. Also, Jocelyn is Jocelyn and she’s nobody’s 
replacement.” 

Josie could not believe that Skyler would be impressed by another woman in such a 
short period. 

Her voice was a little hysterical. “But it’s an indisputable fact that she looks like me!” 

Skyler just hung up the phone, refusing to listen to her nonsense anymore. He looked 
sullen and he massaged his eyebrows tiredly. Back then, if Josie did not get into an 
accident for the newly established company, he would not be with her because he 
wanted to take responsibility. Six years ago, he had a good relationship with Abel. 



The Crain family was in the jewelry business, and Skyler had just established a foothold 
in the jewelry industry. Although Abel was a bit of a scoundrel, he was also like-minded 
with Skyler. Hence, the two hit it off and became friends. 

Back then, Dean, Abel’s eldest brother, was interested in Josie when he first started 
interacting with her. Abel would treat Josie like she was his sister-in-law. 

One time, Skyler needed to take care of something at the last minute, so he asked Josie 
to negotiate something on his behalf. 

As a result, Dean’s buddy acted on their initiative and drugged Josie to put her in 
Dean’s bed. 

If that was just the case, there might be room for recovery. However, that guy was too 
impulsive so not only did he drink the drugged wine, but he also gave it to Dean. That 
night, the three of them got together in a state of confusion. After that, Dean was 
enraged, and he wanted to send his friend to the police. In the end, the two got into an 
accident on the way to the police station and died. At the same time, Josie lost all hope 
and she only wanted to die. Hence, she decided to commit suicide. 

Before she died, she confessed her feelings for Skyler and said that she did not dare to 
like Skyler anymore after what happened. Initially, Skyler should be the one going to the 
negotiation, but Josie went for him at the last minute and got into trouble. Hence, Skyler 
could not forgive himself. Plus, in order to calm Josie down after what happened to her, 
Skyler agreed to stay with her, and he said he would not mind what happened. He also 
comforted her that she did not intend for this to happen. 

When Josie and Skyler showed up in front of others, they were already a couple. 
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For some unknown reason, Abel stubbornly believed that Skyler must have something 
to do with the death of his elder brother Dean. He always believed that Skyler killed 
Dean and that friend in order to avenge his girlfriend. He also refused to believe Skyler’s 
explanation. Since then, Abel’s emotions towards Josie had become extremely 
complicated, and he would always cause trouble for Skyler. 



He knew that his elder brother was at fault, but it was not enough for him to die. So, his 
friendship with Skyler had ended since then. Dean died and Abel was the only child left 
in the Crain family. The living would continue to live. Since then, the relationship 
between Skyler, Abel, and Josie had become what it was later. Skyler was in a tepid 
relationship with Josie for a few years and he hyped her to the admiration of everyone in 
the jewelry industry. 

 

He even… He even planned to marry her in the end as compensation. 

It was a pity that she was never content. She wanted fame, fortune, status, and his love. 
She wanted too much, and naturally; he could not give it to her. Skyler also knew that 
Abel told him to stay away from Jocelyn because Jocelyn would be the next Josie. 

However, how was that possible? Jocelyn and Josie were completely different. 

Before this, Skyler did not know what emotions were until he met Jocelyn. From when 
he asked Jocelyn to keep a distance from him, to being attracted to her gradually. He 
was constantly denying it and staying away from Jocelyn, but in the end, he could not 
control his heart. 

Only then did he know that liking someone was something he could not help and could 
not control. 

Plus, the reason why he was still tolerant towards Josie was just because of what 
happened in the past. He hoped Josie would not exhaust his patience again. 

At seven o’clock in the evening, Jocelyn and Lexie appeared at the entrance of the May 
First Hotel 

The two got out of the car one after another, and the doorman took the car keys before 
going to park the car. 

Jocelyn was wearing a white professional suit and Lexie was wearing a retro black 
dress. Then, the two walked toward the hotel lobby. 

Lexie looked at Jocelyn with some worry. “What if Snow comes too?” 

Jocelyn’s eyes flashed with coldness. “It’s fine. I found Howard as my boyfriend to clear 
the relationship back then, and now, I already have a marriage certificate. Do you think 
I’ll be scared if she says I am pestering Walter? “Besides, who are they? One is the 
daughter of a jewelry empire, and the other is the heir of the Keele family. I have self-
awareness and I won’t have any wishful thinking. Plus, it’s all over, don’t worry, it’s not a 
problem,” Jocelyn mocked herself and curled her lips. 



Lexie glanced at her helplessly. “Jocelyn, can I tell you that the more nervous you are, 
the more you talk?” 

CT 

Jocelyn’s face froze. Her expression was slightly embarrassed, and her voice sounded 
a little unnatural. “We’re best friends so please show me some respect and don’t tear 
me down so readily.” Lexiè nodded. Then, she reached out and shook Jocelyn’s hand. 
“It’s okay, no matter what the situation is, I will always be with you.” After they took a 
few steps, they saw a graceful figure walking over. The other party was wearing a light 
green toga dress, making her look innocent and charming. Lexie raised her chin slightly. 
“Jocelyn, that’s Renee from the same major as you.” 

Jocelyn turned a blind eye. “Don’t pay attention to her.” Jocelyn was at odds with Renee 
back when they went to school. If she went over to talk to her now, she would be 
courting trouble. 

However, even if she did not want to court trouble, the other party liked to create 
trouble. Renee swayed her hips and walked quickly in front of Jocelyn to block her. 
“Hey, isn’t this Jocelyn? You’ve never attended any of our parties after graduating for 
two years, so why did you come to the alumni party today? Is it because Mr. Keele is 
back so you want to curry favor? Too bad, he’s engaged.” 

The hotel’s reception was at one side, but Renee ignored it completely and continued to 
insult Jocelyn like there was no one around them. 

Jocelyn had a close relationship with Walter back then but then she was warned by his 
fiancé. 

Not a lot of people knew about this, but Renee was one of them who knew. 

Jocelyn had an unpleasant expression on her face. “Renee, move out of the way. I don’t 
want to spew nonsense with you.” 

Renee scoffed, “What? You didn’t get to be his girlfriend in the past two years, and you 
still want to try now? Do you seriously think Mr. Keele has dumbed down after two years 
abroad and will fancy you again?” 

Jocelyn’s face turned pale. She was always fearless. However, this was her weakness 
and also her privacy that no one knew. 

Since this had indeed happened in the past, she did not know how to retort when others 
scolded her. 

She did like Walter, and it was an undeniable truth. Even if she had no idea Walter had 
a fiancé back then, she could not deny the fact that she did fall for a man with a fiancé. 



People always said that the ones who erred unknowingly needed not be held 
responsible, but Jocelyn felt that she needed to be held responsible. – 

She should not fall for Walter back then. After Renee said that she saw Jocelyn 
lowering her eyes and did not say anything. She immediately covered her lips and 
started cackling sarcastically. “Say, Jocelyn, you’re so hilarious. Do you seriously think 
that way? I’m going to die from laughter.” Lexie directly took a step forward. She was 
filled with evil tendencies, and she wanted to rip Renee’s mouth off her face. 

At this moment, a clear but cold voice sounded, “What are you guys doing?” 
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Jocelyn froze when she heard this voice. 

She had already met Walter at the airport, even though Walter did not see her at the 
time. 

 

Jocelyn bit her lip. She really did not expect that she would meet him again in two years 
in such an embarrassing situation. Walter appeared when she was being insulted so 
much that she could not raise her head. 

Walter could not bear to look away from Jocelyn when he saw her lowering her head, 
not looking at him. He only heard Renee’s last sentence just now, but even so, he could 
guess that Renee must have said something mean. Moreover, it must be something 
that satirized Jocelyn so that was why she was powerless to refute. 

Walter was angry and distressed when saw this little girl whom he protected for so long 
getting bullied again. Lexie was glaring at him with a straight face. Her eyes were 
burning as if she was feeling injustice for Jocelyn. 

Walter was a little helpless. He looked at the reception indifferently and said in an 
unassailable tone, “What happened just now?” 



The receptionist was smart. This was the future heir of the hotel, so he must not be 
negligent. 

Fortunately, she had a good memory and she told Walter about the conversation 
between Jocelyn and Renee just now. 

Renee clenched her skirt guiltily. 

There was a deep anger in Walter’s eyes. 

He looked at Renee. “Renee, right? I remember you… When you were in university, you 
loved causing trouble for Jo, right?” 

Renee smiled dryly and looked up at Walter, her voice extremely unnatural, “W-Walter, I 
was joking with her back then!” 

Walter was expressionless. “Don’t call me that, I don’t like people who try to weasel 
their way 

into a relationship with me.” 

Renee could see that although Walter was not flying into a fit of rage, he was definitely 
angry. 

She blinked and opened her mouth to please Walter, trying to ease her current 
embarrassment, “Mr. Keele, I was only bickering with Jocelyn just now, please don’t 
take it to heart. 

“It’s just that we have heard about you and Miss Sonnet returning to the country 
together. Miss Sonnet and you are a talented and perfect match made in heaven, and 
it’s so enviable. As your juniors, we’re so happy for you.” 

She did not believe that Walter would disrespect her since she had praised them so 
much. After all, one should not slap the face of a smiling person. 

In the end, Walter really did not show her any respect. He was so indifferent that he 
looked like a stranger. “What’s so envious about that? What does my business have to 
do with you? Why are you trying to weasel your way into a relationship with me?” 

Renee could not smile anymore. She looked at Walter stiffly and said, “Mr. Keele, 
please give me some respect and don’t be so harsh.” Walter looked at her sarcastically 
and sneered, “Respect? Do you still want respect? Should you have that? Are you 
worthy of others giving your respect? It’s one thing to leave the house without your brain 
and now you’re saying I am being harsh. When you attacked and ridiculed others, did 
you never once think to control your damn mouth?” 



Walter’s tone was sharp and unkind, “Miss Lawson, I should advise you, if you want 
others to respect you, you must first learn to respect others!” 

Renee’s face was as red as a tomato. 

She bit her lip tightly. “Mr. Keele, it was my fault, I should go now.” 

After Renee finished speaking, she turned to leave. 

However, Walter’s voice called out to her coldly, “Stop!” Renee turned around in 
embarrassment. “Mr. Keele, how else can I help you?” 

Walter looked at her indifferently. “Apologize to Jocelyn or get out of the May First 
Hotel!” 

Renee’s eyes turned red in an instant. 

Today, the entire May First Hotel stopped operating to cater to the alumni party of 
Mauve University and this was all provided by Walter. 

Who was Walter? He was the eldest son of the Keele family. If he said feces smelled 
good, then everyone had to say that it smelled good. 

If she went out of here today, her family’s social connection might even be affected 
because of her, let alone her relationship with her friends. 

Renee’s eyes were red, and she stared at Jocelyn, concealing her deep hatred toward 
Jocelyn in the bottom of her eyes. 

She gritted her teeth and apologized reluctantly, “Jocelyn, I’m sorry. I was wrong. I 
shouldn’t spew nonsense just now and belittle you. It’s my fault and I am apologizing to 
you, please forgive me.” 

Walter turned to look at Jocelyn. 

Jocelyn finally listed her head and looked at Renee, her voice was so cold that it was 
terrifying, “Should I accept your apology just because you apologized?” 

Renee panicked and she subconsciously looked at Walter. 

Walter’s voice was as cold as Jocelyn’s. “Miss Lawson, you should at least be sincere 
when you apologize, do you understand?” 

Renee’s tears started falling from her eyes. She looked at Jocelyn and restrained all her 
negative emotions. “Jocelyn, I was truly wrong. Please forgive me.” 



Jocelyn stood there unmoved. 

When Reese saw that Walter was not saying anything, she gritted her teeth and bent 
down to kneel on the ground of the lobby. “I’ll kneel for you, please forgive me, okay?” 

Jocelyn finally said something, “Enough, that’s not necessary.” 

After she said that, she finally looked at Water, “Walter, let’s go.” 

Waiter nodded. “Alright, let’s go upstairs.” 

Lexie’s cold and small face was not so terrifying anymore. 

The trio went upstairs. Behind them, Renee’s gaze looked substantial and intense 
hatred enveloped her. 

She wanted to eat Jocelyn right now so she could avenge the embarrassment she felt 
today. 

Jocelyn, Lexie, and Walter went into the elevator. 

Jocelyn had a complicated expression on her face. “Walter, you… didn’t have to do 
that.” 
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Walter had always been a gentleman, and he had never been so ungentlemanly or so 
unkind to a girl. However, today, his behavior was the exact opposite of what he used to 
be. Walter knew what she meant, and his tone was indifferent, “Jo, that was nothing 
when it comes to protecting someone I care about.” Jocelyn pursed her lips; her 
expression was tense 

For a while, she did not know what to say. 

 



She really could not get used to how Walter was still as nice to her as he was two years 
ago. Obviously, their relationship was long gone, so why was he still doing this? Jocelyn 
bit her lip, feeling inexplicably depressed. 

Walter saw that something was wrong with her, and he told himself that he had to take 
this 

slow. 

He changed the subject, “Jo, I heard that you are working at Prosperity Jewelry now, 
right?” Jocelyn nodded absently. “Yeah.” 

Walter smiled; his tone as gentle as a spring breeze. “If you need anything in the future, 
you can ask me for help. If someone causes trouble for you in the company, you can 
also come to me. I have… acquaintances in Prosperity.” 

Jocelyn opened her mouth but did not know what to say for a long time. Finally, she 
hummed softly and nodded mechanically. 

After getting out of the elevator, Walter said, “Jo, you guys go get together with the 
alumni first. I need to handle something and I’ll go over later.” Jocelyn knew he was 
organizing the party today so he must be busier than she was. She nodded and 
watched Walter leave. 

Lexie’s eyes flashed and she suddenly said, “What an affectionate nickname. The name 
of your cat is also derived from your name too, right?” 

Jocelyn was stunned. “I genuinely never realized that, but Skyler was the one who 
named the 

cat.” 

Lexie teased, “Walter and Skyler have such great taste in names.” 

Jocelyn pursed her lips and said nothing. After staying silent for a while, Lexie said after 
some hesitation, “Jocelyn, does Walter… still like you?” When Jocelyn heard this, she 
was like a cat whose tail had been stepped on. She quickly retorted, “Nonsense. He 
never likes me so what do you mean still likes me?” 

Lexie pressed her lips together and did not mind Jocelyn’s reaction. “He’s behaving the 
way he did two years ago, and he can’t stand you being wronged.” 

Jocelyn’s voice sounded a little numb. “Maybe… he just sees me as his little sister.” 

Lexie was stunned. Walter had a fiancé, and he was still so nice to Jocelyn. 



“Yeah… Perhaps she’s just like a little sister.’ 

Lexie curled her lips sarcastically and grabbed Jocelyn. “Let’s go find seats.” 

Jocelyn nodded. 

The May First Hotel, which was used to host the alumni party, was not big, but it was 
enough to fit all the alumni. 

The hall, dining hall, and the meeting hall on the top floor were all turned into a buffet. 
They only needed to take the elevator to go between the halls, so it was very 
convenient. Even the dorm rooms were vacated to accommodate the alumni who could 
not go home tonight. 

Jocelyn and Lexie met a lot of familiar faces when they entered the hall. Once they 
entered society, everyone’s temperament was not the same as it was when they were 
back in school. 

In the end, Jocelyn and Lexie sat down on a sofa. 

Soon, the sofa was sat with a lot of alumni, and they were chatting and laughing among 
themselves. 

When Walter came in, he walked straight to Jocelyn even when there were so many 
empty 

seats. 

He looked at Lexie with a smile and then said with a soft smile, “Lexie, can you make 
room for 

me?” 

Lexie pressed her lips together, nodded, and got up to sit on the other side. 

Walter sat next to Jocelyn and immediately, Jocelyn’s body became stiff. When Jordan 
saw this, he made a face at Walter and then chuckled. “The reason we’re here today is 
to exchange contacts among alumni. In the future, we can help each other out at work 
and connect more. It’s meaningless to just sit here and chat. Why don’t we play King’s 
Game?” 

Walter looked like an easy-mannered nobleman, but he was very unapproachable. 

It was easy to talk to him, but it was hard to open one’s heart to him 

However, Jordan was one of Walter’s close friends and they had always been close. 



Walter did not say anything, which meant he tacitly agreed to this. Everyone else sitting 
there was making noise asking how to play this game. Jordan took out a box with dice. 
“It’s like this, we will roll the dice. There are six dice, and we’ll take turns rolling them. 
The one with the biggest number will be the big king and the one with the smallest 
number will be the small king. I’ll change the rules a little. We can take turns being the 
dealer and, in every round, the dealer can ask the big and small king to do something. If 
either of them refuses, they will have to drink ten shots. What do you think?” When 
everyone heard that they were going to play a game, the atmosphere in the room 
immediately became lively. Everyone said they were not opposed to it. 

Jordan rolled the dice first. He got a two, two threes, one four, one five, and one six. 

A total of 23 points. It was not too high or too low. 

Everyone continued rolling the dice. 

When it was Jocelyn’s turn, she rolled the lowest point in this game. Five ones and a 
two, a total of seven points. She could only pray that someone would get six points, if 
not, she would be the small king. Walter grabbed the dice and rolled them absent-
mindedly. 

Jordan’s ears moved and he winked at Walter. Then, Walter stopped the dice. After he 
revealed the dice, there were six sixes, and it was 36 points. Undoubtedly, he was the 
big king Jocelyn opened her mouth, and she did not know what to say for a very long 
time. After that, all the other players got between seven and 36 points. Jordan smiled 
amorously and said with a smirk, “Well… I won’t make things hard for you. The two 
kings should kiss, what do you guys think?” Everyone loved amorous jokes, not to 
mention one of them was Walter. This chance was so rare to come by! Everyone 
started heckling, “Kiss! Kiss!” 
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Walter looked at Jocelyn with a smile on his face. It was as if everyone was making a 
joke that did not really matter. 



Jocelyn’s eyes sank. Her voice was clear and emotionless when she said with an 
extraordinarily serious expression, “I will drink ten shots as punishment.” 

 

Upon hearing this, everyone froze. Even Jordan was dumbfounded. 

He said, “Jocelyn, don’t. How disappointing will this be? Isn’t that just a kiss?” Jocelyn 
raised her eyes and glanced at him lightly. “I have a boyfriend and Walter also has a 
fiancé, so this is inappropriate.” Walter frowned as if trying to explain something “Jo…” 
Jocelyn did not pay attention to him. After she finished speaking, she took the wine 
bottle in one hand and the wine glass in the other before drinking directly. Ten shots 
were not a small amount nor was it a large amount. Yet, she still finished them without a 
word. Walter’s expression was unreadable, and no one could tell what he was thinking. 
When he recalled Jocelyn saying that she had a boyfriend, he fell silent. From the 
beginning to the end, he did not say a word. After Jocelyn finished drinking, he poured 
himself a drink in silence and drank it. The alumni all had different expressions on their 
faces. 

After taking ten shots, Walter stood up expressionlessly. “Everyone, please have fun. I’ll 
step outside for a bit.” 

As soon as Walter left, Jordan could not stop rubbing his eyebrows. 

He looked at Walter apologetically. He had a look that said, ‘Dude, I just wanted to help 
you.’ 

He really did not expect that Jocelyn would be so disrespectful to make him go 
overboard as soon as the game started. 

As soon as Walter left, Jordan smiled dryly and said to the crowd, “Everyone, please 
continue, I’ll go out for a bit too.” 

Jocelyn had a complicated look on her face when she saw someone secretly looking at 
her. 

Jocelyn pursed her lips and wanted to stand up when Renee walked over. 

She sat right beside Jocelyn and said to everyone with a laugh, “Are we going to stop 
playing after Walter left? We can’t do that, we’re all alumni so we have to be treated 
equally.” 

After she said that, she rolled the dice with a smirk. 

It had to be said that Renee was amazing at hyping things up. Soon, the scene became 
lively again. 



Renee lowered her head and whispered in Jocelyn’s ear. “Jocelyn, how does it feel to 
use other people’s fiancé as support?” 

Even though Renee was berated by Walter, she had been rivals with Jocelyn for so 
many years, so she knew where Jocelyn’s weakness was. Jocelyn had no expression 
on her face, but her heart tightened slightly. She never wanted Walter to stand up for 
her. Lexie sat beside them, and she heard everything. She looked at Renee like she 
was warning her, “Renee, enough is enough. Walter just couldn’t stand your behavior.” 

However, Renee ignored her. 

Instead, she looked at Jocelyn and deliberately raised her voice, “Jocelyn, I heard that 
you have a boyfriend from afar. Who is he? Why don’t you ask him to come here so we 
can meet him?” 

Jocelyn’s eyes darkened. “He’s busy.” 

Renee pouted and she looked contemptuous. “No way! He should have time to come to 
pick you up no matter how busy he is, right? Let everyone meet him. We want to see 
who the partner of the former campus belle of Mauve University is!” 

Renee started to look at Jocelyn provocatively. She could not curse at Jocelyn in case 
Walter had dirt on her. 

However, she had to seek revenge for what happened in the lobby just now. 

Jocelyn frowned slightly. “Renee, do you think you’re getting to me?” 

Renee looked innocent and said in front of all the alumni, “Jocelyn is asking me if I’m 
getting to her. I swear I don’t mean any harm. I just want to meet her partner yet she’s 
coming up with excuses. Why do I feel that her partner doesn’t love her?” 

She looked at Jocelyn with a look of sympathy, “Say, Jocelyn, if he doesn’t care about 
you, I think you should just break up with him. I’ll introduce you to another one and I’m 
sure you’ll be satisfied with him. He’s rich and handsome. Plus, you can bring him out 
anytime you want!” 

After Renee said that everyone started heckling. “Yeah, Jocelyn, bring him to meet us!” 
“If he refuses, it means he doesn’t care about you.” “You’re the campus belle of all the 
boys in Mauve University back then. Don’t defile yourself like that!” 

When Jocelyn heard that, she felt as if she was being barbecued. She looked coldly at 
Renee who was basking in the schadenfreude and stood up. “I’ll go outside to call my 
boyfriend to tell him to come pick me up.” Renee stopped her at once. Then, she lifted 
her chin and said, “Don’t. Call him here. Let us see how he treats you so we can help 
you decide.” 



Jocelyn looked at Renee and lowered her eyes to call Skyler. 

Renee then nosily put him on speaker. Evervone held their breath and stared at 
Jocelyn’s phone. Jocelyn looked slightly off color, but at least she maintained an elegant 
demeanor. 

The phone rang twice before someone answered. 

An attractive voice came from the phone. “Hello?” 

The other party’s voice was deep and hoarse. It was as deep as a cello, and it was so 
pleasant to the ears. 

Everyone was shocked when they heard his voice. They seemed to be wondering who 
this voice belonged to and how handsome the person on the other end must be. 

After all, Jocelyn was such a proud and self-respecting beauty, so it was pretty unlikely 
for her to find an ugly partner. 
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Jocelyn ignored everyone’s gaze, pursed her lips, and said softly, “Are you busy?” She 
did not call him President Moore or Mr. Moore, and she did not call him by his name too 
for fear of exposing herself. It was quiet on the other end of the phone. Skyler was silent 
for two seconds before he said, ” I’m not busy, what’s the matter?” Someone jokingly 
mouthed with a smile on their lips, “Ask him what he’s doing.” Jocelyn saw everyone’s 
look of anticipation and continued, “Are you…” Before Jocelyn could ask, Skyler 
answered, “I’m in a bar.” “It’s pretty quiet over there.” Jocelyn was a little surprised. 

Skyler’s voice seemed to be tinged with a chuckle, “I’m in the private room.” 

 

Jocelyn suddenly remembered that Skyler’s private room in Vintage Bar was so 
soundproof that no noise could penetrate the walls. It was pin-drop silent from the 
outside. She hesitated for a second and said, “Well, if you’re at a bar, I’ll hang up first.” 



The alumni were getting anxious. Their faces changed slightly, and someone cried, 
“Jocelyn, you can’t do this!” 

Skyler’s voice was cold. “Who’s that?” 

Jocelyn was a little helpless. “It’s one of the alumni. I’m at the alumni party? Everyone 
wants to meet you. I originally planned to ask you to come to pick me up, but you had 
something to drink too so you can’t drive.” 

After listening to Jocelyn, Skyler understood and said, “It doesn’t matter, I will let the 
driver drive me, you go have fun first.” 

Nothing was exposed and it worked out perfectly. Jocelyn finally breathed a sigh of 
relief and hung up the phone. 

As soon as she hung up the phone, everyone asked with envy. 

“Jocelyn, your boyfriend’s voice is so nice, he must be very handsome.” 

Jocelyn was silent for a second. Skyler’s outrageously handsome face appeared in her 
mind, and she nodded, “Well, he is really good-looking.” 

Some of them were so envious that their eyes turned green. “Wow, his voice is so good 
that it will make someone pregnant and he’s also good-looking. Is he trying to kill us? 

“Jocelyn, your boyfriend is also rich, right? He has a driver taking him everywhere,” The 
other party asked with a smile and admiration. 

Jocelyn felt uncomfortable, not knowing how to answer this kind of question. “He’s 
pretty well -off I guess.” 

Renee could not stand this anymore. She was just taunting Jocelyn, but unexpectedly, 
she gave her a chance to boast. 

Her face turned dark. “Maybe it’s just a designated driver. Why is he pretending to be 
rich?” 

Jocelyn gave her a speechless look and said nothing. 

The people in this circle also saw that Renee was here to cause trouble so they did not 
say a word and looked at each other in dismay. 

Renee was suddenly embarrassed. 

Jocelyn glanced at her lightly and said bluntly, “Yeab it might be a designated driver.” 



Renee’s face changed and she did not say anything. 

At the same time, Vintage Bar. Jim glanced at Skyler and asked with a smile, “Who is 
that?” Skyler gave him a sideways look. “Jocelyn.” Jim looked sloppy. “Why did she call 
you in the middle of the night? Is she doing a spot check?” Skyler glanced at Jim 
casually, shook the glass in his hand, and ignored him. Jim could not bear being left 
alone. “It’s just the two of us here so you should say something. Don’t make me perform 
a one-man show.” Skyler snorted softly, “I think you’re pretty happy to be alone.” Jim 
rolled his eyes. “I’m sad now.” Skyler was showing an expression that said, ‘Even if 
you’re sad, it doesn’t matter to me.’ “I’ll pick her up after I finish this drink.” Jim rolled his 
eyes and raised his eyebrows. “Pick up Jocelyn? Did she just call you to pick her 

up?” 

Skyler leaned back on the couch, gave Jim a side-eye, and said nothing. 

Jim pursed his lips and complained, “You’re so boring. Whoever drinks with you will 
probably be pissed to death in minutes. Only I can endure the humiliation for so many 
years and I have already gotten used to it.” Skyler took a sip of wine, and his expression 
was unreadable under the light of the private room. 

He was silent for a long time. Then, he suddenly said inadvertently, “Jim, how do you 
usually… How do you pursue women?” 

After Skyler said this, a dim light flashed in his eyes. 

Jim was stunned for a moment and then immediately, he became more energetic. He 
leaned toward Skyler. “No way, Skyler, who do you fancy?” Skyler glanced at him 
lightly. “Answer the question, stop talking nonsense.” Jim looked at him with a cheeky 
grin. “Tsk tsk tsk, you can’t judge a book by its cover indeed. The ten-thousand-year-old 
iceberg is about to melt, let me guess, do you fancy that Rhode person?” 

After all, during this time, it was rumored that Skyler had an affair with Rhode. 

Not only did Skyler not stop the rumors, but Rhode not only rose, but she was also safe 
and sound and this was worth thinking about. 

Skyler’s eyes darkened, “What nonsense are you spewing? I told you to answer my 
question, do you not understand human language?” Jim pointed. “I’m just curious. You 
can’t even quench my curiosity and yet you’re asking me about your relationship 
problems.” If Skyler’s face darkened in front of other people, they might be terrified. 

However, Jim was not the same. It was because even if Skyler darkened his face in 
front of him, he would not do anything to harm him. 

See, Jim was extremely arrogant in front of Skyler. 



Skyler looked at Jim coldly to see what he would say, Jim stared at Skyler. “Tell me. 
What’s so good about Rhode? You gave her the sponsorship and are so protective over 
her. I can’t even ask about her! 

Skyler looked at him in annoyance. “It’s not Rhode!!! 
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Jim’s eyes widened immediately. “What? It’s not Rhode? Then why are you so nice to 
her?” Skyler’s eyes flashed. “I’m not nice to her. She’s from the countryside and it 
wasn’t easy for her to get to this point. I don’t need to eradicate her over such a trivial 
matter.” In fact, the truth was that Skyler kissed Jocelyn that night while depending on 
the alcohol for courage. 

For the first time, he acted according to his heart! 

 

As a result, he was slapped by Jocelyn. Skyler left the North Court Villa and returned to 
the villa Jim hosted the party in. Rhode was still in the villa at the time, and when she 
saw Skyler come back, she poured him a drink without saying a word. Skyler was 
emotional for the first time in years that night. He asked Rhode why she came to this 
kind of party. 

Rhode then told him about her situation. 

She said that she was from the countryside, and she had six sisters. They were 
extremely poor. She came out to work hard and made her debut unexpectedly. She 
thought her dream was within reach, but after entering this field, she realized that this 
was a paradise for the rich. If she did not have money or power, it would be very hard 
for her if she wanted resources, She also told Skyler that she knew there was no free 
lunch in this world. She did not want to pretend to be innocent, she just wanted to get 
ahead and get out of that impoverished place as much as possible. Normally, Skyler 
would not care about such a thing at all. 



There were many poor people in the world, and it was impossible for him to provide 
relief to all of them. 

However, that night, it might be because Rhode had accompanied him through the most 
contradictory and the worst time of his life, so he understood Rhode a little bit. 

Therefore, he acquiesced to the following scandals and resources. However, who was 
Jim? He was the master playboy who had so many women but never got into any 
trouble. 

When Skyler said a girl from the countryside, Jim automatically started imagining a sob 
story. He could not stop from sighing ruefully, “It seems Rhode came up with this sob 
story in front of you.” Skyler gave him a side-eye and did not deny it. 

Jim’s eyes shone. “However, if you don’t like her, who do you like?” He thought about it 
and suddenly, his expression became tense, and she looked at Skyler in disbelief, 
“Damn, do you like Jocelyn?” 

Skyler’s expression was tense, and he leaned on the sofa, not saying a word, Jim said 
to himself, “No way, you seriously fell for Jocelyn. Although she’s good at fighting 
playing billiards, talented, and looks ethereal, but… I thought you two became husband 
and wife halfway and after you got through this, you’ll break and burn all the bridges.” 

Skyler froze and said nothing. 

Jim leaned in and stared at Skyler’s face. He looked left and right like he was looking at 
some rare treasure. 

He could not help shaking his head. A complicated expression on his face. “No way, 
you really like her. Did you ask me relationship questions just to pursue her? No, no, 
this is a rare encounter in a thousand years. This is such a historical memorial, a 
moment of significance! I must remember this.” 

Jim was so annoying that Skyler could not help looking at him coldly, “Can you answer 
the question?” 

Jim sneered. Then, he cleared his throat. “Okay, I won’t keep you on the hook. We’re 
even closer than brothers anyway, so I won’t hide anything from you Pursuing a woman 
is actually quite tacky.” 

Skyler looked at him blankly, still not speaking 

Jim continued to keep Skyler on tenterhooks. “Women are all emotional animals. Of 
course, different ways work for different people. However, they also have something in 
common. 



They like romance, and they prefer a lover who’s always nice to them.” 

Skyler frowned slightly, going straight to the core of the question, and said 
sarcastically,” Have you ever done that to a woman? Is there any experimental basis for 
your words?” Jim suddenly laughed dryly. “Don’t bring me down. Forget it, I’ll go straight 
to the point. Il you want to pursue Jocelyn, just drive her to and from work, send her 
flowers and gifts, and go on a dinner date with her. Persevere and remember to do 
something romantic for her every day. After some time, you will naturally get her. After 
that, it’s time to…” Jim said, winking at Skyler with a meaningful look. 

Skyler frowned, an incomprehensible expression on his face. “Then what?” 

Jim coughed twice in embarrassment. “And then it’s time to do what two people should 
do, of course! Do you need to ask me about this?” 

Skyler was silent. He looked at Jim and suddenly he wondered if it was reliable to ask 
this playboy for advice. 

Jim thought Skyler did not understand, so he winked at him. “Skyler, don’t tell me you’re 
so innocent that you don’t understand what I was saying.” 

Skyler gave him a cold look and lowered his eyes. It was unknown what he was thinking 
However, he kindly gave Jim an answer. “I understand.” jim immediately beamed. His 
tone was amorous when he said, “That’s about it.” 

Skyler then looked at him coldly and apathetically before asking another question. “How 
can you be sure that she’s in love with you?” 

Jim snapped his finger like he had experience in this. “This is easy. If she’s jealous 
because of you, then it means she’s in love with you.” When Skyler heard the word 
‘jealous’, his eyes darkened, and he did not say anything. 

Tim tried his best to come up with a plan for Skyler. “I think you shouldn’t explain your 
relationship with Rhode to her. You can use it to test Jocelyn to see if she’ll get jealous.” 

Skvler did not say anything, but instead, he was starting to wonder if this plan would 
work in his heart. 

Jim understood that Skyler was serious this time. Back then he was dating Josie, he did 
not take it seriously at all. He lamented, “Tch tch, look at you. The ten-thousand-year-
old iceberg has finally melted. However, it’s good that you have the marriage certificate 
so you can tie her down and take this slow.” 

While Jim was lamenting, Skyler asked a lethal question all of a sudden, “Can I not 
confess my 



feelings to her?” 

 


