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His heart seemed to be wrapped in vines. There were too many clues leading him forward. 
 
However, Shen Jingyan was instinctively unwilling to approach the truth! 
 
Placing the laptop in front of her, Qiao Nian said calmly, “Qiao Chen, see if it’s the thread you thought 
had been deleted.” 
 
Shen Jingyan felt Qiao Chen’s body suddenly tremble. 
 
His heart suddenly sank. 
 
Although they didn’t know much about that matter back then, they knew that if this continued, the 
situation would be very unfavorable for them. 
 
He took a step forward and blocked Qiao Chen with his broad figure. He frowned and opened his mouth 
without looking at the post on the school’s forum that Qiao Nian had recovered. “Nian Nian, there must 
be a misunderstanding!” 
 
He had been in an official position for many years and had long trained to be flexible. 
 
Seeing that his plan to force Qiao Nian to admit that she had gotten someone to create a car accident 
and injure Qiao Chen had been ruined, he reacted quickly and immediately changed his expression to 
play the emotional card. “I didn’t see the content of that thread. I just feel that no matter what Chen 
Chen posted online, you’ve already hit and scolded her. She has already received the punishment she 
deserves. Nian Nian, must you force her to a dead end?” 
 
Qiao Nian’s eyes were quite cold. 
 
He said it openly as if he was the one in the right. After asking in a domineering tone, he said sincerely, 
“Chen Chen is your sister. The two of you have lived together for more than ten years. I don’t believe 
you don’t have any feelings for her. If you ask me, let’s forget about this matter.” 
 
He said it casually, but in the next second, he even dared to raise it shamelessly. “I’ll get Chen Chen to 
apologize to you. Also, I’ll try my best to send her overseas. As for Mr. Steven…” 
 
“Qiao Chen must go to jail.” Before he could finish, Qiao Nian’s voice sounded, her tone very calm. She 
looked at him with beautiful dark eyes and interrupted his ‘arrangements’. 
 
It was like a statement, but also like a notice. 
 
Shen Jingyan felt like he had been slapped. He couldn’t maintain his expression, and his face began to 
turn red. 
 
He couldn’t reply for a moment. He only looked at her with an accusing gaze as if Qiao Nian was 
heartless. Before he could continue his so-called ‘fair arrangement’, he saw Ye Wangchuan walk over 



and pick up the laptop. He lowered his eyes and said meaningfully, “The post’s IP address is the Shen 
Residence.” 
 
Qiao Chen’s fingers trembled uncontrollably and her lips turned pale. 
 
Shen Jingyan and Wei Ling looked at her as if she was an idiot. 
 
She buried her head and did not dare to look up, not knowing how to explain. 
 
How could that be? The thread had clearly been deleted by the school. She had checked before. As long 
as the original thread was deleted from backstage, the IP address couldn’t be found. 
 
For this, she had even specially asked a few classmates who studied computers. 
 
It was because she was certain that Qiao Nian couldn’t find her IP address after the thread was deleted 
that she was fearless and was not afraid that this matter would blow up. 
 
How did Qiao Nian manage to restore the deleted thread to its original state? She even found her IP 
address through it. 
 
Qiao Chen could still rely on her last bit of confidence to go crazy, but now, it was as if someone was 
holding her neck. She didn’t dare to speak at all. 
 
Qiao Nian had said that defamation could lead to a sentence of three years. 
 
She had Cheng Feng Corporation and the Jiang family behind her. Most importantly… 
 
Qiao Chen quickly looked up in Ye Wangchuan’s direction. Her heart felt like it was going to be crushed 
and sent to the eighteenth level of hell. 
 
Three years in jail… 
 
Her life would be ruined! 
 
How could a person with a criminal record still establish herself in Beijing and enter the upper circles? 
 
Terror appeared in Qiao Chen’s eyes as her lips trembled. 


