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Chapter 3281 

“Damn…” 

When David heard this, he immediately cursed! 

Emotions require an understanding of the origin of time. Learning this 
immortal finger in vain without understanding the origin of time is all in vain! 

Suddenly David felt like he was being tricked! 

Seeing David like that, the Taizu of the Ji family smiled and said, “Why, you 
have no confidence in yourself and feel that you cannot understand the origin 
of time?” “Who said that? 

Of course I have confidence, but you If you don’t explain it to me in advance, I 
feel like you are just deceiving me…” 

David knew that the Taizu of the Ji family must have done this on purpose! 

“This Immortal Finger is my secret skill. Do you think I want to teach it to 
others casually?” 

After speaking, Taizu of the Ji family stretched out his hand and touched 
David’s forehead, and a golden breath flowed into David’s sea of 
consciousness. ! 

I saw a bang in David’s sea of consciousness, and there was an extra skill in 
an instant! 

“I didn’t expect that there is still a person imprisoned in your consciousness 
sea.” 

After imparting the Immortal Finger to David, the Taizu of the Ji family said to 
David! 



“That was a demon cultivator. His body was killed by me, and his soul was 
imprisoned in my sea of consciousness.” 

David explained! 

“Now I have taught you the Immortal Finger. As for when you can use it, it 
depends on when you can understand the origin of time.” “Where do you plan 
to go after 

leaving the Ji family?” 

asked the Taizu of the Ji family! 

“Go to the Southern Demon Mountain…” David said truthfully! 

“Tianmo Mountain is a very dangerous place. There are the most demonic 
cultivators in that place. It is also said that Tianmo Mountain was also a 
battlefield during the war between gods and demons. It was also the cruelest 
battlefield where most immortals died.” 

“There is a legend at the foot of the Demonic Mountain that day that the great 
devil of the ancient demon world was suppressed below. But during the battle 
between gods and demons, the remnant soul of the great devil was released. 
As a result, countless immortals were killed. From then on, that mountain 
peak was Changed its name to Tianmo Mountain.” 

“VeryMany demonic cultivators rested and recuperated in Tianmo Mountain, 
and it became the place with the most demonic cultivators in the world of gods 
and humans. “ 

The Taizu of the Ji family followed David and said. 

“Is there still such a thing? “David was a little surprised. It seems that the big 
demon suppressed under the magic mountain that day was much more 
powerful than the wind demon! 

A wisp of residual soul killed so many immortals. If this was the true body, it 
would be great! 

“The demon Mountains are dangerous, but they are also accompanied by 
opportunities. The greater the danger, the greater the opportunity. Take care 
of yourself! “ 



After the Taizu of the Ji family finished speaking, his body gradually faded, 
and finally he disappeared! 

David did not feel surprised. The Taizu of the Ji family could not leave the 
ancestral land, but it does not mean that his soul cannot leave either! 

If it is true, Since the Taizu of the Ji family could not leave the ancestral land 
for even half a step, it was impossible for the Taizu of the Ji family to know so 
many things in the Ji family! 

After the Taizu of the Ji family left, David called Huofeng and Ji Yun to leave 
secretly! 

Leaving the Ji family , Ji Yun looked back at the huge Ji family mansion. 
Maybe after leaving this time, he would have no chance to come back! But 

Ji Yun himself also knew that if he stayed in the Ji family, he would only be an 
An An for the rest of his life. Quiet young master! 

But unlike David, he can experience a lot. Maybe when David truly ascends, 
he can also ascend to the immortal world together! As the saying goes, 

one person can ascend to heaven! 

When he walked out of the yellow and blue city, the sky was also bright. ! 

“Mr. Chen, where should we go next?” “ 

Ji Yun asked David! 

“Your uncle said that there is a teleportation array in Zhuhuang City that can 
lead to the southern region. Let’s go to Zhuhuang City first. “ 

David said! 

“Mr. Chen, I don’t know Zhu Huangcheng…” 

Ji Yun looked embarrassed! 

He has been living in the Northern Territory, and Ji Yun doesn’t even know 
where some of the imperial cities and countries in the Central Territory are! 



David glanced at Huofeng, who quickly shook his head and said, “I don’t know 
you either, don’t look at me…” 
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This was embarrassing. None of them knew Zhu Huangcheng, so how could 
they sit in the teleportation array? 

“Mr. Chen, I think there must be someone in Huanglan City who will go to 
Zhuhuang City to take the teleportation array to the Southern Region. 
Otherwise, we can find someone to take us there.” 

Ji Yun said! 

David shook his head. He finally secretly came out of Huanglan City. If he 
goes back, he will definitely let Ji Lianjun know that he will be invited back to 
have s3x with the women of the Ji family. David will not do it! 

Just when the three of them were at a loss, a clear and loud voice sounded! 

“If you want to go to Zhuhuang City, I’ll find someone for you.” 

Ji Meiyan walked out from behind them and said! 

“Sister…” Ji Yun was a little surprised when he saw Ji Meiyan! 

David also didn’t expect Ji Meiyan to secretly follow them out of the city, and 
was surprised and said, “Miss Ji, why are you following me?” “ 

I know you are leaving, can’t I see you off?” 

“No matter what we have There is no emotion, but after all, I gave it to you for 
the first time, so you will be the man I will never forget in my life.” “Don’t 

worry, I won’t pester you, just come with me…” 

Jimei After Yan finished speaking, she turned around and walked towards the 
city! 

Seeing this, David could only follow Ji Meiyan back to the city! 



Ji Meiyan took David and the three of them to a remote courtyard, then 
walked up and knocked on the door! 

Soon, the door opened and a girl about the same age as Ji Meiyan came out! 

When she saw Ji Meiyan, the girl looked a little surprised. 

“Meiyan, why are you here?” the girl said, and then looked at David and the 
three of them behind Ji Meiyan warily! 

“Don’t be nervous, the three of them are my relatives.” 

Ji Meiyan said! 

Hearing what Ji Meiyan said, the girl relaxed her guard, stepped away and 
said, “Please come in…” 

Ji Meiyan took David and the othersEnter that remote courtyard! 

When they walked in, there was a vibration in the void, and then everything in 
front of David and the others changed. They looked outside at a very remote 
and dilapidated courtyard! 

After walking in, it turned out to be a very luxurious manor, with very beautiful 
buildings and pavilions inside! 

Ji Meiyan acted very calmly. It seemed that she had been here before, but 
David and the other three were a little shocked! 

David did not expect that there was another world hidden in this ordinary 
courtyard! 

Who on earth can actually create such a small world and live in it! 

Could it be that the owner here knows the origin of space and can open up 
space? 

Seeing David and the others like that, Ji Meiyan explained, “This is a space 
that has been opened up. You don’t need to be nervous…” “ 

Sister, are there such experts in this yellow and blue city who can open up a 
space on their own?” 



Ji Yun Very emotional! 

“I’ll explain it to you later!” After Ji Meiyan finished speaking, she caught up 
with the girl and asked, “Qiannan, has Uncle Cai gone to the Southern Region 
recently?” “Go, he should be leaving in the next two days 

. , this time I am with my dad.” 

Cai Qiannan nodded and said! 

“Three of my friends also want to go to the Southern Region, so…” 

“I’m afraid that’s not possible. It would be okay if it were a few days earlier, but 
now that the personnel have been decided, I’m afraid there will be no places.” 

Cai Qiannan didn’t wait for Ji Meiyan After finishing speaking, he said with a 
troubled expression! 

“Let me meet Uncle Cai first,” 

Ji Meiyan said! 

Cai Qiannan brought a few people into the hall and then left, probably to find 
her father! 

After Cai Qiannan left, Ji Meiyan explained to David and the others! 

“This space was not created by any expert. It was created with an ancient 
magic weapon. It takes a lot of spiritual stones to maintain this space.” 

Ji Meiyan said! 
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“It’s really amazing that a magical weapon can have this ability…” 

Ji Yun’s eyes were full of envy! 

David was not surprised. Some ancient magic weapons, spiritual weapons or 
artifacts have various functions. This is normal! 



But how this family obtained such ancient magic weapon made David very 
puzzled! 

Ji Meiyan saw David’s doubts, so she continued, “The owner of this family is 
called Cai Hongwei. He is proficient in geological surveying. So over the 
years, he has been organizing people to go to the Southern Territory to hunt 
for treasures. He is very familiar with the roads leading to the Southern 
Territory.” “. 

“Taobao people like this always keep their lives on their belts. I heard that 
every time they go out to hunt for treasure, many people will die when they 
come back.” “But 

Cai Hongwei is proficient in how to do it . He has the art of exploration, so he 
can find some treasures every time, and the people who go with him will be in 
much less danger. This means that before every departure, many people will 
come to choose to go with him.” “But Cai Hongwei 

can Not everyone can be brought along, they need to go through an 
assessment, and they must be introduced by acquaintances, otherwise they 
will not even be able to meet, let alone meet, they will not be found even when 
they leave the courtyard.” “But don’t worry 

, I have known his daughter Cai Qiannan since we were young, so even if the 
seats are full, you three will have no problem.” “ 

Did Cai Hongwei get the magic weapon that opened up this space?” David 
asked! 

“Probably, I haven’t seen it before. This space was only opened a few years 
ago. It was probably bought from outside.” 

Ji Meiyan nodded and said! 

David has become interested in Cai Hongwei. You must know that this world 
of heaven and earth is different from the secular world. There are many 
battlefields of gods and demons in the world of heaven and earth, and it is 
unknown how many ancient great powers are buried. If this Cai Hongwei 
really has geological survey The art of acupoint training is truly a talent! 



Speaking of which, Cai Hongwei is just like those tomb robbers in the secular 
world. If he wants to get the treasure, he must first find a good place.That’ll 
do! 

“Eldest niece, why do you have time to come to my place today? I heard that 
a lot of things have happened in your Ji family in recent days. Is your dad 
okay?” As a cheerful voice came, 

Cai Hongwei strode in! 

From the tone of conversation following Ji Meiyan, we can tell that Cai 
Hongwei has a good relationship with Ji Lianjun! 

“Uncle Cai, my dad is fine, and there is nothing wrong with the Ji family. I 
came here today to bring a few friends, and I want to follow Uncle Cai to the 
Southern Region.” 

Ji Meiyan said straightforwardly! 

Cai Hongwei turned his head and glanced at David and the other three, and 
then a look of embarrassment appeared on his face! 

After all, David and the others look very young, and their strength is not high, 
they are only in the Fusion state! 

“Eldest niece, you also know that there are many dangers along the way when 
I go to the Southern Territory, and the casualties are very huge. If your friends 
come with me, I’m afraid I won’t be able to protect them.” Cai Hongwei politely 
refused 

Ji Miyeon! 

If David and the others followed, it would be like creating a burden for 
themselves, and Cai Hongwei would not agree to that! 

“What dangers can there be in taking the teleportation array to the Southern 
Region?” Ji Yun said in confusion! 

They just don’t know the way. If they knew Zhu Huangcheng, they could take 
the teleportation array to the Southern Territory, and there would be no need 
for Cai Hongwei! 



Cai Hongwei glanced at Ji Yun, and then said, “I have never sat in the 
teleportation array when I went to the Southern Region.” 

“Don’t sit in the teleportation array?” Ji Yun was stunned! 

“Taking the teleportation array, you have to go from here to Zhuhuang City, 
and then wait to be teleported to the Southern Territory. It is too time-
consuming. I always go directly from here to the Southern Territory. The road 
is much shorter, but it is very dangerous.” “So people like 

you Those who are not strong are not suitable to follow me, you can just go to 
Zhuhuang City and sit in the teleportation formation.” 

Cai Hongwei said! 

 


