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Hong San looked at the Daluo Golden Classic, and when he saw the Chiyun 
Demon Lord in front of him, he was completely stunned! 

He never thought that a fourth-grade cultivator in the Tribulation Realm would 
have such a vast sea of consciousness, and he also had a strange book! 

More importantly, Hong San felt the breath of the Chiyun Demon Lord in front 
of him, and his legs were trembling! 

You know, he himself is the creator of the Purple Flame Sect, but he is almost 
at the level of the Immortal Realm! 

Even if there is only a wisp of residual soul left now, he has seen everyone 
and experienced everything! 

But looking at the Chiyun Demon Lord in front of him, Hong San was afraid 
from the bottom of his heart, and there was no way to hide that fear! 

“Boy, this old guy is going to piss himself, tell him if you have something to 
say, I’ll go hide, and scare him to death in a while!” 

Seeing Hong San’s legs trembling, the Chiyun Demon Lord said to David! 

David could also feel Hong San’s fear. After all, who wouldn’t be afraid of the 
great demon in the heaven like the Chiyun Demon Lord! 

“Senior, don’t be afraid, I won’t hurt you.” 

“I lied to you, but although I’m not a disciple of Zi Yan Men, I’m really helping 
Zi Yan Men.” 

“I was helping Elder Yu of Zi Yan Men to stop Huo Yuanting from getting the 
Divine Fire Seal, so I was chased by the people of the Ghost Face Sect. I had 
no choice but to enter the magma river, fall into the void crack, and come 
here.” 



David said to Hong San very sincerely! 

“Then how come you have demonic energy?” Hong San asked! 

Hong San hated the demon clan, so Zi Yan Men has been irreconcilable with 
the demon clan for so many years! 

“I have more than demonic energy, I also have the breath of the beast clan!” 

After David said this, the power of the three clans on his body slowly 
dispersed, allowing Hong San to directly perceive it! 

When he saw that David actually had the breath of the three clans, Hong 
San’s eyes widened and his expression was very surprised! 

One person has the breath of three races, which he has never heard of or 
seen before! “Strange man, what a strange man…” 

Hong San said in shock! 

“Senior, since you only have a remnant soul left now, stay in my sea of 
consciousness. I will take you out and maybe I can find a chance to revive 
you!” 

David said to Hong San! 

Hong San smiled bitterly and said, “I can’t be resurrected. Even this remnant 
soul is supported by the flame breath of the treasures around me.” 

“I know I will dissipate soon, so before I dissipate, I will pass on all my life’s 
learning to you, hoping that you can carry forward the Purple Flame Sect!” 

“Senior, you are…” David was stunned. How can he carry forward the Purple 
Flame Sect? He is not even a disciple of the Purple Flame Sect! 

But before David could speak, Hong San condensed a divine thought in his 
palm, and then instantly merged into David’s sea of consciousness! 

A complex and detailed information began to pass through David’s sea of 
consciousness! 



Before David could react, Hong San’s face turned pale and his whole body 
was shaking violently, but he had a smile on his face, as if he had 
accomplished a big thing! 

“Senior, are you okay?” 

David didn’t have time to digest the information in his sea of consciousness, 
and hurriedly asked Hong San! 

“I’m fine. Even if I die now, I can rest in peace, because I suddenly had an 
accident, and my true teachings didn’t leave much in Zi Yanmen, which made 
Zi Yanmen weaker and weaker now!” 

“And the secret of the Divine Fire Seal, I didn’t have time to tell my disciples. I 
guess over the years, they will only recognize the Divine Fire Seal as their 
master, and then use the Divine Fire Seal to practice.” 

Hong San said helplessly and ashamedly! 

“Senior, isn’t the Divine Fire Seal used for practice? I heard that after the 
Divine Fire Seal recognizes its master, it can allow the Supreme Fire to 
merge.” 

David asked Hong San in surprise! 

Hong San shook his head and said: “The Divine Fire Seal can indeed help 
practice, but the Divine Fire Seal is just an empty shell now. 
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After saying that, Hong San forced himself to leave David’s sea of 
consciousness, and the whole person returned to the bluestone platform! 

Feeling the flame breath of the surrounding treasures, Hong San’s face 
looked much better! 

However, as Hong San stretched out his hand and clapped, the colorful 
treasures around him slowly dissipated, and finally turned into an illusory seal! 



“Divine Fire Seal, is this the Divine Fire Seal?” 

David looked at the thing in front of him and was immediately surprised! 

He didn’t expect that the Divine Fire Seal would be here! 

However, this Divine Fire Seal looked very illusory, like a projection, not a real 
thing! 

“This is the Divine Fire Seal, and it is not the Divine Fire Seal…” 

Hong San said slowly! 

When David heard it, he was immediately confused and didn’t know what 
Hong San was talking about! 

Yes, it is, no, it is not, why is it still not, what a riddle! 

If Hong San hadn’t just passed on his lifelong skills to David, David would 
probably curse in the street! 

“This is the seal soul of the Divine Fire Seal, so it is said to be the Divine Fire 
Seal, and it is not the Divine Fire Seal.” 

Hong San saw David’s impulse to curse in the street, so he hurriedly 
explained! 

David understood instantly when he heard it. Some things that cultivators 
wear all year round will produce weapon spirits over time! 

Just like his own Dragon Slaying Sword, there is a sword spirit in it! 

This Divine Fire Seal was left behind by the Fire Spirit Star Lord. With the 
strength of the Fire Spirit Star Lord, it is normal for the seal on his body to 
have a seal soul and open up spiritual intelligence! 

In this way, the seal soul has always been here, and the Divine Fire Seal that 
Huo Yuanting and others are looking for is just an empty shell! 

However, an empty shell can also help with cultivation and allow the ultimate 
fire to merge. It must be the things left behind by the Fire Spirit Star Lord, and 
they are all treasures! Thinking that the Red Cloud Demon Lord and the Fire 
Spirit Star Lord were people of the same status and realm, David excitedly 



said to the Red Cloud Demon Lord: “Demon Lord, the Fire Spirit Star Lord left 
behind so many treasures in the Heaven Realm, and each one is more 
powerful than the other. Don’t you have left behind any treasures?” 

“Tell me now, I’ll go look for it and see if your treasures are stronger than 
those of the Fire Spirit Star Lord!” 

Hearing that David was asking him for treasures, the Red Cloud Demon Lord 
couldn’t help but roll his eyes and said: “I left my life in the Heaven Realm, 
isn’t that enough? And I left behind a crappy treasure.” “Is 

my soul not comparable to the crappy treasure of the Fire Spirit Star Lord?” 

“If that’s the case, then I’ll just leave you. Anyway, I can move freely here 
without any suppression. I’ll also wait here quietly for the right person!” 

As he said that, the Red Cloud Demon Lord actually acted like a child and 
wanted to leave David’s sea of consciousness! 

Seeing this, David hurriedly apologized: “Senior, I just asked casually, why are 
you so anxious? You can stay in my sea of consciousness, and I won’t charge 
you any fees.” 

“And I will definitely help you collect the complete corpse and let you revive 
again. I can definitely do it!” 

David will not let the Red Cloud Demon Lord leave him. With this guy in his 
sea of consciousness, it is equivalent to having an extra encyclopedia! 

Things in the heavens, and some treasures, I don’t understand, but the Red 
Cloud Demon Lord knows them all! 

What’s more, with the Red Cloud Demon Lord here, David can use the 
Heavenly Eye anytime and anywhere, how cool! 

“You kid, you are greedy, be careful not to bite off more than you can chew. 
Give you so many treasures, can you play with it?” 

After the Red Cloud Demon Lord finished speaking, he turned his head and 
ignored David! 

David was speechless for a while. This old demon has been around for 
thousands of years, and he is still like a child, making a little temper… 



David didn’t notice that when he was talking to the Red Cloud Demon Lord, 
Hong San smiled and slowly closed his eyes! 

That wisp of residual soul was slowly dissipating! 

Without the support of the flame energy, and Hong San passed on all his life 
skills to David, so his residual soul could no longer exist! 
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“Senior, senior……” 

David saw this and hurried forward, injecting strands of flame energy into 
Hong San’s body! 

No matter what, now that David has accepted Hong San’s lifelong skills, he is 
considered a disciple of Zi Yan Men! 

David Cheng refused to admit it, this is the result! 

“Don’t waste time, even if the Daluo Jinxian comes to the world, it is 
impossible to resurrect me. At the last moment, I can pass on my lifelong 
learning. I am already very satisfied!” 

Hong San smiled, not afraid at all! 

This residual soul dissipated, and Hong San disappeared from this world 
forever! 

David tried desperately to let Hong San exist for a while longer, but it was 
useless. In the end, Hong San’s residual soul still dissipated completely! 

Looking at the gradually dissipating Hong San, David felt a sense of regret in 
his heart! 

After all, he was a master of a generation, who founded Zi Yan Men, but died 
quietly in the end! 



“Hey…” After David sighed lightly, he set his sights on the seal soul! 

“This thing is harder to recognize than the Divine Fire Seal. I hope I can 
subdue it!” 

David said, and instantly waved his hand, and several flames wrapped the 
seal soul! 

The seal soul struggled desperately to resist, and it even emitted a fierce 
flame breath to resist! 

The temperature in the whole room instantly rose to thousands of degrees! 

However, David has a true fire body, plus the fire spirit, so he is not afraid! 

Then he sat upright in the room and began to subdue the seal soul! 

While David was subduing the seal soul, flames shot up into the sky from the 
Divine Fire Mountain above his head! 

The Divine Fire Seal gradually floated, making the flames of the entire Divine 
Fire Mountain more fierce! 

“Hahaha, the Divine Fire Seal appeared, and I finally found the Divine Fire 
Seal. It was really God’s help that I was found so quickly!” 

Huo Yuanting looked at the suspended Divine Fire Seal and laughed crazily! 
After searching for two days and one night, they finally found the Divine Fire 
Seal. 

Everyone looked at the Divine Fire Seal with excitement on their faces. Huo 
Dong licked his lips with greed in his eyes! 

Divine Fire Seal, with this thing, Huo Yuanting can become a real sect master! 

More importantly, after having the Divine Fire Seal, Huo Dong can use the 
Divine Fire Seal to break through the peak of the Tribulation Realm and reach 
the Mahayana Realm! 

“Congratulations, Sect Master Huo, who dares to disobey you in the entire 
Ziyan Sect…” 

Gu Tianchao stepped forward and flattered Huo Yuanting! 



Huo Yuanting was very pleased with it, with a proud look on his face, and then 
he moved his body and went directly to the Divine Fire Seal! 

But just when Huo Yuanting approached the Divine Fire Seal and was about 
to grab it, he suddenly screamed! 

Huo Yuanting’s face turned pale, and the whole person fell down instantly, 
with bursts of white smoke coming out of his palm! 

“What a fierce flame, I can’t even bear the flame of the Divine Fire Seal…” 

Huo Yuanting looked at his palm and frowned! 

“Father, this Divine Fire Seal needs to recognize its master. If it doesn’t, it will 
be hard to withstand the flames in the Divine Fire Seal.” 

Huo Dong hurriedly reminded Huo Yuanting! 

Huo Yuanting nodded hurriedly. He was so excited that he forgot to recognize 
his master! 

Soon, a drop of blood essence was forced out from Huo Yuanting’s brow, and 
then the drop of blood essence floated towards the Divine Fire Seal! 

As long as the Divine Fire Seal absorbs this drop of blood essence, it will be 
considered a successful recognition of the master! 

“Huo Yuanting, I won’t let you get the Divine Fire Seal…” 

Just when the drop of blood essence was about to be absorbed by the Divine 
Fire Seal, a cold voice suddenly came! 

Then several figures appeared, and Huo Yuanting’s drop of blood essence 
was instantly dispersed under a white light! 

It turned out that Elder Yu and the others arrived in time and stopped the 
Divine Fire Seal from recognizing its master! 
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Seeing Elder Yu and the others had arrived, Huo Yuanting was not panicked 
at all, but smiled coldly and said, “You guys want to stop me from getting the 
Divine Fire Seal? Don’t be delusional.” 

“Huo Dong, take people to stop them. Elder Gu, help me set up the magic 
circle. Don’t let them disturb me from recognizing the Divine Fire Seal!” 

Huo Yuanting ordered loudly! 

Huo Dong led many disciples of their lineage and rushed directly towards 
Elder Yu and the others! 

A melee broke out instantly, and Gu Tianchao pinched his fingers, and array 
patterns appeared around Huo Yuanting, directly covering Huo Yuanting and 
the Divine Fire Seal! 

“Elder Yu, you must not let Huo Yuanting get the Divine Fire Seal, stop him…” 

Zhu Ling waved the long sword in his hand and said loudly! 

Elder Yu nodded, and the whole person turned into a flaming meteor and 
rushed directly towards Huo Yuanting! 

It seems that Elder Yu intends to die with Huo Yuanting and not let him get the 
Divine Fire Seal! 

Boom! 

But with a loud bang, Elder Yu’s body was instantly bounced away by the 
magic circle! 

Elder Yu had no way to break the magic array set up by Gu Tianchao! 

At the moment, none of them understood the art of array formation, so they 
could only break the array by force. However, as the elder of Liangyi Sect, the 
magic array set up by Gu Tianchao was not so easy to break! 

Seeing that Elder Yu tried his best but still couldn’t break the array, Huo 
Yuanting laughed loudly, and then slowly approached the Divine Fire Seal. 



With a drop of blood dripping on the Divine Fire Seal, the Divine Fire Seal 
emitted a blood-red light! 

Seeing this, Huo Yuanting stretched out his hand and took the Divine Fire 
Seal in his hand! 

“Hahaha, this is the Divine Fire Seal, this is the Divine Fire Seal…” 

Huo Yuanting laughed crazily! 

Seeing Huo Yuanting get the Divine Fire Seal, whether it was Elder Yu, Zhu 
Ling, or Wei Qing and others, their faces changed instantly! If 

Huo Yuanting got the Divine Fire Seal and recognized the master, then the 
leader of the Ziyan Sect would be completely his! 

“With the Divine Fire Seal in hand, you disciples of Zi Yan Sect must listen to 
my orders…” 

Huo Yuanting shouted excitedly, holding the Divine Fire Seal in his hand! 
Seeing this, Huo Dong hurriedly led the disciples of their lineage to kneel 
down! 

Elder Yu and the others were all stunned, a little at a loss! 

“What? You don’t obey orders, are you going to rebel?” 

Huo Yuanting looked at Elder Yu and asked coldly! 

“Humph, who knows whether this Divine Fire Seal is true or false…” 

Elder Yu snorted coldly, and then raised his hand to shoot a storm of fire all 
over the sky! 

Now he can only delay by doubting the authenticity of the Divine Fire Seal! 

“Bold, you dare to attack the master of the sect. According to the rules of the 
sect, you should be beheaded…” 

Seeing this, an elder of Huo Yuanting’s lineage shouted and tried to stop 
Elder Yu! 



“Don’t worry about him, I’ll let him see whether this Divine Fire Seal is true or 
false…” 

Huo Yuanting said with a cold smile! 

Elder Yu shot out flames all over the sky, and countless flames formed fire 
tornadoes and went towards Huo Yuanting! 

Seeing this, Zhu Ling knew that Elder Yu was not Huo Yuanting’s opponent, 
so she also slapped out with a palm! 

This palm also caused flames to rise. A large bird burning with flames soared 
into the air and headed straight for Huo Yuanting! 

The two joined forces to attack Huo Yuanting! 

However, Huo Yuanting’s mouth slightly raised, without a trace of panic, but 
raised the Divine Fire Seal in his hand! 

The Divine Fire Seal suddenly emitted thousands of flames. The flames 
attacked by Elder Yu and Zhu Ling all dissipated instantly in front of the Divine 
Fire Seal, causing no harm to Huo Yuanting at all! 

Seeing this scene, Elder Yu and Zhu Ling were both very surprised! 

However, the two attacked again, and flames flew towards Huo Yuanting! 

Unfortunately, these attacks all disappeared in front of the Divine Fire Seal. 

Elder Yu and Zhu Ling were both out of breath, and their foreheads were 
covered with cold sweat! 
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Look at Huo Yuanting again, holding the Divine Fire Seal, his face full of 
pride1 



“I have the Divine Fire Seal in my hand, you still dare to be presumptuous, 
you are really ignorant…” 

Huo Yuanting sneered! 

Although Elder Yu and Zhu Ling were very angry, they had no way to do 
anything! 

“The Sect Master has moved the order, you still don’t kneel down, are you 
going to be expelled from the Ziyan Sect?” 

At this time, an elder under Huo Yuanting shouted at Zhu Ling and the others! 

Helpless Elder Yu and Zhu Ling looked at each other and knelt down! 

After the two knelt down, the other disciples also knelt down! 

Now that Huo Yuanting has obtained the Divine Fire Seal and recognized the 
master, it proves that Huo Yuanting is no longer the acting sect master, but 
the real sect master! 

If Elder Yu and Zhu Ling did not kneel down, Huo Yuanting could completely 
expel all of them from the Ziyan Sect according to the rules of the Ziyan Sect! 

Seeing Elder Yu and Zhu Ling bow their heads and kneel down, Huo Yuanting 
suddenly laughed excitedly! 

“Hahaha, let’s go back to Ziyanmen and prepare for the formal inauguration 
ceremony…” 

Huo Yuanting laughed, holding the Divine Fire Seal, and slowly walked past 
the kneeling people! 

Elder Yu and others followed him back to Ziyanmen! 

However, everyone in the old master’s lineage was worried. Now that Huo 
Yuanting got the Divine Fire Seal and became the real master, they would not 
have a good life in the future! However, 

after returning to Ziyanmen, Huo Yuanting did not trouble Elder Yu and others. 
I don’t know if they were busy with the inauguration ceremony and had no 
time to care! 



“Hey, we are finished now, and I don’t know how the little junior brother is.” 

Qian Xiu was worried about David. It has been several days, and there has 
been no news from David! 

“I think the little junior brother is in danger. Your Ghost Face Sect is too 
powerful. So many people are dealing with the little junior brother alone. The 
little junior brother can’t run away.” 

Wei Qing had long believed that David was dead! 

After all, even if David was powerful, he couldn’t escape facing so many 
people from the Ghost Face Sect! 

“Brother, how can you curse my junior brother? I believe he will be fine.” 

 

 


