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Chapter 4551 

“If you can’t beat me, even if you bring out your Mu family’s ancestors, what’s the use? I 
will beat you anyway!” 

David smiled coldly! 

Mu Kunrong ignored David, and soon a terrifying power burst out from his body! 

Boom! 

In an instant, the formations around the ring collapsed instantly! 

David only felt a breath coming towards him, and the whole person flew backwards 
instantly! 

The monks who were watching the excitement around him didn’t expect it to turn out 
like this, and they were all knocked out by this breath! 

David was suspended in the air, looking down at Mu Kunrong, frowning slightly! 

At this time, a very strong breath appeared around Mu Kunrong’s body! 

This breath was constantly expanding, and then enveloped his entire body! Boom 

boom… 

Suddenly, thunder sounded in the air! 

Everyone looked up and found that a large dark cloud had appeared at some point, 
covering the entire sky of Nanjin City! 

Thunder flashed in the dark clouds! 

“Is the head of the Mu family going through the tribulation at this time?” 

“It’s impossible. He just came out of retreat. Could it be that the head of the Mu family 
relied on the secret method to forcibly go through the tribulation and improve his 
realm?” “ 



It’s very likely. If he is improving, he will be in the sixth level of the Mahayana realm. I’m 
afraid that David will not be his opponent!” 

Everyone looked at the lightning and thought it was a thunder tribulation, so they started 
to discuss it! 

But David could see at a glance that this was not a thunder tribulation cloud, and Mu 
Kunrong was not going through the tribulation! 

With the roar of thunder and lightning, the aura on Mu Kunrong’s body became stronger 
and stronger, and this aura directly enveloped the sky and the earth! 

And Mu Kunrong’s body, in this aura, began to become empty! 

“What’s going on?” 

Mu Kunrong seemed to be disappearing! 

“Boy, just wait to die!” 

Mu Kunrong’s eyes were scarlet, and at the last moment of disappearance, he stared at 
David and roared! 

Boom! 

The thunder and lightning in the air resounded even more through the sky, and lightning 
flashed frequently! 

David held the Dragon Slaying Sword in his hand, and there was no fear in his eyes! 

No matter what tricks Mu Kunrong played, he would catch it! 

Mu Kunrong’s body was shining brightly, and everyone could no longer see his body! 

The aura around him had formed a tornado, raging on the ring! 

Only an outline of Mu Kunrong’s body remained, and his facial features could not be 
seen at all! 

In the end, Mu Kunrong’s body even disappeared, turning into a beam of light! 

Boom! 

The light soared into the sky, and then a majestic breath pressed down from top to 
bottom! 



This breath was extremely domineering! 

Many monks around retreated one after another. They didn’t want to watch the 
excitement and lose their lives! 

David felt the domineering aura, and his eyes were extremely cold! 

The aura instantly bombarded David’s body! 

David’s body, like a meteor, fell from midair and hit the ring heavily! 

The hard ring was instantly smashed by David’s body! 

The ring disappeared, and the terrifying aura was still thinking about dispersing around! 

Fortunately, many cultivators dodged early, otherwise they would be swept by this aura! 

David’s body disappeared from everyone’s sight and smashed deeply into the ground! 

The dark clouds in the sky slowly condensed into a human figure! 

A human figure that was a hundred feet tall looked somewhat similar to Mu Kunrong! 

“Could this be the ancestor of the Mu family?” 

“This ancestor looks a bit strange!” 

“Mu Kunrong sacrificed himself and summoned the ancestor of the Mu family, which 
was also cruel.” 

“He must know that he is not David’s opponent, and he will die if he fights, so he will be 
like this.” 

Everyone looked at the human figure condensed by the black cloud, and couldn’t help 
but discuss it! 

The human figure slowly lowered his head and looked at David who was beaten into the 
ground! 
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David flew up into the sky and rushed out directly from the ground! 



Although the attack just now was terrifying, it did not cause any harm to David! 

“It looks quite bluffing, but I don’t know if he can resist a beating…” 

David said disdainfully to the ancestor of the Mu family! After 

David finished speaking, a dazzling golden light instantly burst out from his body! 

The indestructible golden body was activated, and David was like a golden armored god 
of war! 

Holding the sword in his right hand and raising it high, David rushed directly to the 
ancestor of the Mu family! 

David’s speed was so fast that everyone could only see a golden shadow left in the 
void! 

“Ignorant child…” The 

ancestor of the Mu family spoke, staring at David! 

Boom! 

The ancestor of the Mu family suddenly stretched out a huge palm, which turned into 
countless palms condensed with black aura, grabbing David from all directions! 

David ignored these giant palms, but held the Dragon Slashing Sword and flew towards 
the Mu Family Patriarch at a high speed! 

In front of this Mu Family Patriarch, David was as small as an ant! 

But David was not afraid at all! 

The Dragon Slashing Sword in his hand slashed, and a sword light shot out! 

There were no moves, no fancy moves, only a strong slash! 

Boom! 

The terrifying sword light, containing rolling sword intent, went towards the Mu Family 
Patriarch like a wave! 

The Mu Family Patriarch stared at David, and then snorted coldly! 

This cold snort was full of disdain and contempt! 



The Mu Family Patriarch exhaled lightly, and suddenly a gray shield appeared! 

This shield blocked the sword light! 

Boom… 

The sword light stood on the shield, and a deafening sound broke out instantly! 

Under the heavy blow of the sword light, the shield instantly shattered and disappeared. 

The sword light of David also weakened, and finally disappeared in front of the ancestor 
of the Mu family! 

This sword was a test for both parties! 

David and the ancestor of the Mu family looked at each other from a distance! 

“Young man, you dare to kill my Mu family, do you know that your actions will bring you 
the disaster of extermination?” 

The ancestor of the Mu family said in a deep and deep voice! 

“Disaster of extermination?” 

David sneered: “Are you worthy?” 

“Insolent…” 

The ancestor of the Mu family was furious and suddenly slammed down with a palm! 

This palm actually contained countless thunder and lightning, and the power of thunder 
in it was enough to shake the world! 

“The power of thunder, I like…” 

David laughed when he saw this! 

David did not move on the ground, and the origin of thunder and lightning in his body 
began to operate, and the origin stars in the origin space flashed a dazzling light! 

Thunder and lightning began to flash around David’s body. 

Seeing this, the ancestor of the Mu family swung his palm directly, and countless 
thunder and lightning struck David fiercely! 

Pants pants pants… 



pants pants pants… 

Lightning strikes David, billowing white smoke! 

David does not dodge or evade, the origin star emits a terrifying suction force, directly 
absorbing the power of the arena! 

The lightning origin star in the origin space also begins to flicker and becomes brighter 
and brighter! 

The more lightning, the more lightning origin David absorbs! 

These lightning that look extremely terrifying are rare resources in David’s eyes. 

But no one knows this, and they all see David being struck by countless lightning, and 
the whole person is smoking, and they are all dumbfounded! 

Especially Ji Yun, seeing David like this, his eyes are red, his fists clenched, and he 
intends to save David desperately! 

The corners of the Mu family’s ancestor’s mouth are slightly raised, he knows that no 
one can survive under these countless lightning! 

“So comfortable…” 

Just when David was wrapped in those lightning, he suddenly shouted! 

The Mu family’s ancestor, who originally had a slight smile on his mouth, suddenly froze 
on his face! 
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He never thought that David, who was in the Tribulation Realm, was not afraid of the 
power of thunder at all, and it seemed that he had absorbed the countless thunder and 
lightning! 

Seeing this, the other cultivators all opened their mouths wide, shocked beyond words! 

“Does this David have the origin of thunder and lightning?” 

“Of course, didn’t you see that the thunder and lightning that hit him were all absorbed?” 



“Too abnormal, this David is too abnormal!” 

Many cultivators all talked about it! 

The ancestor of the Mu family hurriedly stopped and made the countless thunder and 
lightning disappear instantly! 

He originally wanted to use these thunder and lightning to kill David, but now it has 
become David’s resource, which is counterproductive! The 

thunder and lightning disappeared, and the golden light on David became more 
prosperous. 

“Since you don’t want to play anymore, let me play…” 

After David finished speaking, a visible lightning slowly formed in his palm! 

David looked up at the head of the Mu family, and his body suddenly rushed over like a 
rocket! 

Boom! 

The power of lightning condensed in David’s palm, becoming more and more violent! 

David’s speed was so fast that the surrounding void began to tremble, and even the 
space was squeezed! 

Facing David, the face of the ancestor of the Mu family became solemn! 

Boom! 

The head of the Mu family punched David! 

From a distance, this punch was like a mountain, covering David’s entire body! 

Even so, David did not dodge at all, but rushed forward with his fist! 

Bang! 

The fist collided heavily with David’s body! 

The surrounding void was like a landslide, and the fist was shattered in an instant under 
David’s rampage! 

David shattered this punch with the power of his body alone! 



This gap is completely a crushing force! 

Although the punch of the Patriarch of the Mu family looked huge, 

it was still too weak in front of David! 

is simply vulnerable! 

“The ancestor is just this little bit capable, no wonder the descendants of the Mu family 
have no ability!” 

David looked at the ancestor of the Mu family coldly and sneered! 

The ancestor of the Mu family had a ferocious face, and his huge body was trembling! 

The ancestor of the Mu family fell into madness, raised his hands high, and directly 
sank into the boundless void! 

The dark clouds that had originally dispersed gathered again rapidly at this moment! 

Throughout the void, you can see the dark clouds rolling violently like waves! 

The world fell into darkness, like the end of the world! 

The dark clouds began to descend rapidly, and many monks felt unprecedented 
pressure! 

The entire Nanjin City was shrouded in dark clouds. If this dark cloud pressed down, the 
monks in Nanjin City would be afraid of countless casualties! 

At this time, all the monks were panicked. They didn’t expect that the ancestor of the Mu 
family didn’t talk about martial ethics! 

Fight with David and deal with David directly! 

How come all the cultivators in Nanjin City are implicated? 

This Mu family ancestor is crazy. In order to kill David, he is willing to let all the 
cultivators in Nanjin City be buried with him! 

Boom! 

The dark clouds continued to descend, and the terrifying aura continued to emanate! 

Many cultivators have begun to kneel on the ground, unable to move! 



Other cultivators wanted to escape, but found that they could not move at all! 

“Do you want to die together?” 

David looked at the Mu family ancestor and asked! 

“Yes, I want you to die, and I want everyone who sees my Mu family make a fool of 
themselves to die!” 

The body of the Mu family ancestor began to merge into the dark cloud! 

David frowned slightly, and his face became solemn! 

This Mu family ancestor did not talk about martial ethics, and he actually wanted to die 
with everyone! 

David continuously bombarded the lightning in his palm into the dark cloud, but after the 
lightning entered the dark cloud, it was instantly submerged, and could not stop the 
downward pressure of the dark cloud at all! 

As the dark cloud pressed lower and lower, some cultivators could not bear it and 
began to vomit blood! 

There was a look of horror on everyone’s face. 
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David fought hard, but his body was like an ant in front of the dark clouds covering 
hundreds of miles. He couldn’t resist at all! 

David also felt the pressure, and his body kept falling in midair! 

“Roar…” 

Just when David was at a loss and many monks were in despair, there was a sudden 
roar! 

At this moment, the little swallowing beast rushed out from David’s storage ring, with 
light flashing around its body! 

And the size of the little swallowing beast was constantly increasing! 



Then he raised his head, staring at the dark clouds with a pair of big eyes, roaring, and 
the hair on his body stood up! 

Then the little swallowing beast opened his mouth and a huge suction force! 

The originally falling dark cloud layer was directly sucked into the mouth of the little 
swallowing beast! The 

dark clouds in a radius of hundreds of miles were sucked clean by the little swallowing 
beast in an instant! 

The originally dim world became bright, and the dazzling sunlight also shone on the 
earth! 

The pressure on everyone disappeared instantly, and everyone’s face was full of shock 
and joy! 

The little swallowing beast licked his lips, then yawned, and returned to David’s storage 
ring again! 

In a short moment, the ancestor of the Mu family used his life to merge into the dark 
clouds, intending to die together, but was eaten by the little swallowing beast! 

After a brief shock, many cultivators cheered! 

Fortunately, they were still alive, and at the same time, these people hated the Mu 
family! 

Manager Liu looked at the crazy people and wanted to leave quietly! 

But just after taking a few steps, many cultivators discovered him and attacked Manager 
Liu! 

Under the siege of many monks, General Manager Liu lost his life in an instant! 

David slowly fell from mid-air, and Pavilion Master Qian immediately greeted him! 

“Mr. Chen, congratulations, the divine beast just now was really amazing.” 

Pavilion Master Qian said excitedly! 

“Pavilion Master Qian, do you know where the Mu family is?” David asked! 

“Yes, it’s not far from Nanjin City! I wonder what Mr. Chen is doing for the Mu family’s 
residence?” 



“Then Mu Kunrong is dead, and the Mu family will decline and disband without having to 
care about it.” 

Pavilion Master Qian asked in confusion! 

“Please take me to the Mu family, Pavilion Master Qian.” 

David did not say the purpose of his visit to the Mu family! 

Pavilion Master Qian nodded when he saw this, and then took David to the Mu family’s 
residence! 

The Mu family was not far from Nanjin City, so it only took them two hours to get to the 
Mu family! 

“Mr. Chen, that manor is where the Mu family is.” 

Pavilion Master Qian pointed to a manor and said! 

David took a look at the Mu family, which was composed of dozens of magnificent 
buildings. It was a wealthy family at first glance! 

“Please wait a moment, Pavilion Master Qian, I’ll be back soon…” After Chen 

Ping finished speaking, his body rushed into the Mu family in an instant! 

Soon, screams rang out over the Mu family! 

Pavilion Master Qian stared blankly at the Mu family experiencing a massacre, and one 
by one, the Mu family members were wiped out under David’s dragon-slaying sword! 

A quarter of an hour later, David came back, and the Mu family had become a sea of 
fire! 

In David’s hand, there were still several storage bags, which contained all the resources 
of the Mu family! 

“Mu Kunrong is dead, all these resources of the Mu family, don’t waste it…” 

David smiled slightly and put away the storage bags! 

Pavilion Master Qian looked at David, his scalp numbed, he didn’t know when David 
became so bloodthirsty! 

David just listened to Mr. Shi’s advice! 



There was nothing wrong with David robbing the resources of his enemies! 

There was no psychological pressure, the enemy was to be killed and robbed! 

“Mr. Chen is right…” 

Pavilion Master Qian could only squeeze out a smile and said! 

The two returned to Nanjin City, and Pavilion Master Qian warmly entertained David. 
Seeing the tragic scene of David slaughtering the Mu family, he was really afraid that 
David would be unhappy and slaughter his Wantong Pavilion! 
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“Master Qian, you have been in the South Region for many years, and you must be very 
familiar with the terrain of the Demon Mountain area.” 

“I have a map here with a place in the South Region marked on it. I wonder if Master 
Qian knows where it is?” 

David took out the map he got from Rota’s storage bag! 

Master Qian looked at the map in David’s hand, and then noticed the place marked with 
a red circle on the map! 

When he saw this place, Master Qian’s brows frowned obviously! 

“Mr. Chen, where did you get this map?” 

Master Qian asked! 

David hesitated for a moment, not knowing how to explain to Master Qian. After all, 
David was not very clear about Rota’s identity! 

Seeing David’s hesitation, Pavilion Master Qian knew that he had asked something he 
shouldn’t have asked, so he said, “This circled place is a forbidden area in the Southern 
Region. No cultivator has been there for many years! There 

used to be an ancient city in that place, but after the war between gods and demons, 
the ancient city was completely destroyed and everyone died!” 



“Pavilion Master Qian, why did this area become a forbidden area?” David was very 
puzzled! 

After all, when the gods and demons fought in the Tianren Realm, many cities were 
destroyed and tens of thousands of cultivators died. Why did this place become a 
forbidden area? 

“That place is very strange. There were cultivators who went there before, but they all 
went without returning, and even the people could not be found.” 

“Over time, it became a forbidden area, and no one went there anymore. After all, that 
place is located on the border of the Southern Region and has no resources.” Pavilion 

Master Qian said! 

David listened to what Pavilion Master Qian said and looked at the markings on the 
map. He couldn’t calm down for a long time! 

The map on Luota’s body couldn’t have marked this place for no reason! 

And now this place is actually a forbidden area, so there must be some secrets! 

Originally, David wanted to use the resources on his body to practice for a while, but 
now that he heard that this place was so mysterious, David’s heart palpitated! 

Seeing David like that, Pavilion Master Qian hurriedly said, “Mr. Chen, you don’t want to 
go to that place, do you? I advise you not to go, and that place is very barren, there are 
no resources at all, it’s not worth the risk.” 

But the more Pavilion Master Qian said this, the more David wanted to go! 

“Pan Master Qian, thank you for your reminder, I just want to go over and take a look.” 

After David finished speaking, he took out a storage bag, which was full of resources 
snatched from the Mu family! 

“Please Pavilion Master Qian, help me hand over these resources to Guanghan 
Palace.” 

David got a lot of resources from those people in the Demon Sealing League, so he 
robbed the Mu family resources for Guanghan Palace! 

Seeing David say this, Pavilion Master Qian stopped dissuading him. After taking the 
storage bag, he nodded: “Don’t worry, Mr. Chen, I will hand the things over to 
Guanghan Palace.” 



David left the Wantong Pavilion Branch and asked Ji Yun to wait for him in Nanjin City, 
while he went to the circled place on the map alone! 

This place is not very far from Nanjin City, so there is no need to take an airship! 

Another point is that David does not want to be too ostentatious. After all, taking an 
airship to that place is too conspicuous! 

If this so-called forbidden area really hides some resources and relics, David can go 
there quietly and take it for himself! 

It is not a good thing for too many people to know! 

After saying goodbye to Ji Yun, David started to set off! 

Although there are many demon cultivators in Tianmo Mountain, and there are also 
many monsters, David has been to this place many times, and some places are very 
familiar, so he is not afraid! 

In addition to David’s current strength, those blind demon cultivators or monsters who 
are looking for trouble are just looking for death! 

The fifth grade of the Mahayana realm is no longer David’s opponent, so what is David 
afraid of! 

In the entire Tianren world, there are not many cultivators above the fifth grade of the 
Mahayana realm. The peak of the Mahayana realm is almost invincible! 

Like those immortal realm cultivators, they have long stopped asking about worldly 
affairs, concentrating on cultivation, waiting to ascend to immortality, where will they 
show up everywhere? 

 


