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David seemed to have noticed something, and suddenly opened his eyes. He was 
immediately startled by the old man in front of him. 

His heartbeat suddenly accelerated, and a trace of fear was revealed in his eyes. He 
subconsciously took a step back. 

“You… who are you, why are you here?” David asked in surprise. He had clearly used 
his spiritual sense to explore, but he didn’t find anyone at all. The sudden appearance of 
this old man made him feel very surprised. 

He stared at the old man closely, and his heart was full of vigilance. 

“You still ask me why I am here. This sentence should be I ask you, this is my home, 
what are you doing in my home?” 

The old man questioned David with an unhappy look. 

The old man was dressed in a white robe, with white hair, but his face looked very 
young, and his eyes revealed a trace of majesty and displeasure. 

David was stunned and said in disbelief: “Your home? You said this is your home?” 

His heart was full of doubts. He never thought that this ancient tree space was actually 
the home of the old man in front of him. 

“Of course, not only here, but the whole Beast City is my home!” The old man’s tone 
revealed a hint of pride and domineering. 

He raised his head slightly, and his eyes revealed a hint of pride, as if showing his 
territory to David. 

When David heard this, his head buzzed instantly, and he said in surprise: “You… Are 
you the Lord of Beast City?” 

He knew that the Lord of Beast City had not appeared for a long time. He didn’t expect 
that he had been hiding in this ancient tree space to practice, and he also used the 
endless spiritual power of many cultivators here to provide for his own practice. 



He couldn’t help but feel a little afraid of the strength and scheming of this Lord of the 
City. 

“Yes, I am the Lord of Beast City. Who are you? There are only a few people who can 
enter this ancient tree space. 

If you can explain clearly, I can let you go, but if you dare to lie, you will stay here 
forever!” 

The Lord of Beast City’s words were full of threats, which made David’s heart tighten. 
He knew that he had to answer the Lord’s questions carefully. 

His brain was working fast, thinking about how to explain his arrival to the Lord. 

It is obvious that the illusion arrays around the Beast City were set up by the city lord in 
order to isolate the Beast City from the Heavenly World! 

It has been thousands of years now. If an outsider enters the Beast City, what will be 
the reaction of the city lord? 

Another point is that if David tells the truth, it will be a sin to exterminate the nine clans 
for Liu Zhongnan and the other two! 

After thinking it over again and again, David decided not to tell the truth. If the city lord 
finds out himself, he can’t blame himself! 

“Senior, my name is David, and I am a casual cultivator. I don’t know why I can enter 
this ancient tree space.” 

“I only know that the spiritual power in my body is being absorbed by this ancient tree, 
so I want to see what’s going on.” 

David followed the city lord and said! 

“A casual cultivator?” 

The city lord smiled slightly: “You are the son of dragon. You deliberately entered the 
prison and approached the ancient tree. You want to take the spiritual power collected 
by this ancient tree for yourself?” 

David was stunned and looked at the city lord at a loss. He didn’t understand how the 
city lord knew so much about his affairs? 

Could it be that he was the one who spied on him yesterday? 

If the city lord had spied on him, he would definitely know some of his things! 



“In this beast city, nothing can be hidden from me, let alone this ancient tree.” 

“Since you are the son of dragon and a real dragon, I will not kill you. You should leave 
quickly!” 

The city lord said to David! 

“Lord city lord, this ancient tree absorbs the spiritual power of others, causing many 
cultivators to…” 

“Do you still want to redress for others and change the rules of the beast city? These 
are not things you can control. If you don’t want to die, get out now!” The city lord’s face 
became a little ugly! 
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David felt the murderous intent from the city lord, and he also closed his mouth, and 
then quickly retreated from the ancient tree space! 

Facing the city lord, David knew that he had no power to fight back! 

The other party had obviously reached the immortal realm! 

The reason why he didn’t show up was that he was concentrating on practicing so that 
he could quickly ascend to heaven! 

Looking at the ancient tree in front of him and the rich spiritual power in the ancient tree, 
David sighed! 

With his current strength, there is no way to take the spiritual power in this ancient tree 
for himself! 

“Since we can’t take the ancient tree for ourselves, let’s see if the vein of the fairy stone 
is real.” Chen 

Ping was helpless and could only settle for the second best and see if the vein that 
Xiong Kuo said was true! 

If he could get a vein of fairy stone, it would be great! 

With the storage bag obtained from Narota and the hundred-year offering from the 
Demon Sealing League, David has enough time to practice for a while! 



These resources should be enough to break through to the Mahayana realm! 

So after David decided to get the vein of fairy stone, he would concentrate on practicing 
for a while! 

Otherwise, his current strength would be really difficult! 

Some hidden forces in the world of heaven and man began to slowly emerge, and 
David must hurry up to practice! 

In the evening! 

The sky gradually darkened! 

David felt that the time was about up in the cell, and then walked out of the cell easily! 

Xiong Kuo looked at David, who regarded the cell as nothing, and his eyes were about 
to fall out of shock! 

When he came to the yard of the prison, there was no guard on duty! 

Because the entire prison was wrapped in formations, it was impossible for prisoners to 
escape! 

This is better, just enough for David to escape easily! 

As for the formations around the prison, David didn’t take them seriously at all! Although 

the illusion formations around the Beast City were very powerful and David had not yet 
been able to crack them, the formations around the prison were like child’s play! 

David’s body was submerged in the white mist, and then his palms gently pressed 
forward! 

A white light spread out from the palm of his hand, and a barrier appeared in front of 
David! 

This was the formation around the prison. David’s body slowly passed through the 
barrier without any hindrance, and even the formation did not fluctuate, and did not 
alarm the guards! 

At this time, Bai Cheng had already been waiting outside the prison. He was afraid that 
David would not be able to get out of the prison. After all, the prison had been there for 
thousands of years, and no one had been able to escape privately! 



If he couldn’t bring David to General Xing, he would definitely be questioned, and other 
guest officials might continue to mock him! 

Just as Bai Cheng paced back and forth, very anxious, he suddenly felt a wave of 
energy fluctuations around him! 

Then David’s body appeared, and he walked out slowly from the white mist! 

Seeing David really came out of the prison, breaking through the formation, Bai Cheng’s 
face was full of surprise and shock! 

“Mr. Chen, are you really out?” 

Bai Cheng stepped forward and looked at David! 

“If I said I can come out, then I can. Take me to see General Xing!” 

David said with a faint smile! 

“Okay, let’s go!” Bai Cheng nodded! 

Bai Cheng took David to the general’s mansion! 

At this time, General Xing was sitting in the hall with a dozen guests, waiting quietly! 

“General, Bai Cheng is probably talking nonsense. It’s already this late and he hasn’t 
brought anyone here yet.” 

“That’s right. I’ve never heard of the existence of dragons in our Beast City!” 

“I don’t believe that a ninth-grade cultivator in the Tribulation Realm can defeat a fourth-
grade cultivator in the Mahayana Realm, even if you kill me. If that guy named David 
really comes, I’d like to fight him to see if he can defeat me, a fourth-grade cultivator in 
the Mahayana Realm!” 

Many guests didn’t believe what Bai Cheng said at all! 
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Because it was too outrageous, they had never seen such an outrageous thing in their 
thousands of years of life! 



“Okay, wait a minute, if Bai Cheng still can’t bring people in an hour, then he will be 
directly punished!” 

General Xing waved his hand and said! 

Just as General Xing finished speaking, Bai Cheng arrived with David! 

“General, Mr. Chen is here…” 

Bai Cheng said! 

When General Xing and many guests saw David for the first time, they were a little 
disappointed! 

Because although David was a dragon, he looked too ordinary, and he didn’t have the 
noble words of the dragon! 

But David is indeed a ninth-grade strength in the Tribulation Realm! Chen 

Ping glanced at the people in the hall, all of them were Mahayana cultivators! 

Among them, General Xing had the highest realm, which was the eighth grade of the 
Mahayana Realm, and the others were only the fourth or fifth grade of the Mahayana 
Realm! 

However, the lowest one has the realm of the third level of the Mahayana realm, which 
shows that the guest officials under General Xing are not weak! 

“Are you a dragon?” General Xing asked! 

David nodded: “Yes!” 

“I wonder if you can emit some of your dragon breath so that we can explore it?” 

General Xing continued to ask! 

David did not speak, but emitted a divine dragon power. With the outbreak of the divine 
dragon power, the sound of dragon roars could be heard faintly in the hall! 

David only restrained the outbreak of a little bit of the divine dragon power, and did not 
fully explode, let alone attract the golden dragon behind him to appear! 

No matter when, hiding strength is the most important thing! 

David did not know who General Xing was, so how could he expose all his strength in 
front of him! 



“It is indeed a dragon!” Feeling the divine dragon power, General Xing nodded! 

Other guest officials can also feel the dragon breath in David’s body, so it is certain that 
David is a dragon! 

After all, everyone present was from the beast tribe, and the dragon tribe was the most 
noble among the beast tribes, so everyone’s attitude towards David changed all of a 
sudden! 

However, David, a ninth-grade cultivator in the Crossing Tribulation Realm, was able to 
defeat Bai Cheng’s fourth-grade Mahayana Realm, and everyone still doubted it! 

Even the dragon tribe couldn’t have such an ability to leap so many levels at once! 

“I heard that you, at the ninth-grade realm of the Crossing Tribulation Realm, can defeat 
the fourth-grade Mahayana Realm?” 

General Xing asked! 

“At that time, Fellow Daoist Bai just yielded!” 

David said modestly! 

“I said, how could he, a ninth-grade cultivator in the Crossing Tribulation Realm, defeat 
the fourth-grade Mahayana Realm? It should be that Bai Cheng saw that the other party 
was a real dragon tribe, and he was directly scared, so he was defeated.” A 

fourth-grade guest in the Mahayana Realm said! 

“Absolutely not, Mr. Chen is being modest. Even if I use all my strength, I am not Mr. 
Chen’s opponent.” 

“If you don’t believe it, you can fight with Mr. Chen. You are also in the fourth level of the 
Mahayana Realm. You will know after the fight!” 

Bai Cheng hurriedly explained, fearing that others would think he was lying! 

The guest was instantly interested when he heard it: “Okay, then fight. I want to see 
how powerful I can be with just the ninth level of the Tribulation Realm!” 

“I’m not that powerful, but I can beat you with one hand!” 

David knew that if he didn’t show some strength today, these people would definitely 
make things difficult for him! 



After all, in this society where the strong prey on the weak, only if your strength is strong 
enough will the other party fear and respect you! 

However, David knew that it would be difficult for him to easily win the fourth level of the 
Mahayana Realm by relying solely on the power of the dragon! 

After all, David couldn’t use a lot of his power now. He could only use the breath and 
power of the beast tribe! 

There were also some weapons that couldn’t be taken out casually, which made David 
lose confidence and beat the fourth level of the Mahayana Realm guest with one blow! 

If they fought for a long time and then defeated the guest, it would not be that shocking! 

And during the fight, they might have revealed other auras, which would be hard to 
explain! 
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“Senior, can you do me a favor and defeat 

this provocative guy?” David began to ask for help from the Red Cloud Demon Lord! 

“It’s just a fourth-grade cultivator in the Mahayana realm. Can’t you beat him?” The Red 
Cloud Demon Lord asked in surprise! 

David expressed his concerns. After hearing this, the Red Cloud Demon Lord nodded 
and said, “Okay, I’ll help you, but I can’t possess you, because I’m not a beastman. If I 
attach myself to your body, it will be easy to be discovered.” 

“Then how can you help me?” David was stunned! 

“Don’t worry about it. If I say I can help you, I will definitely help you. Just do it!” 

said the Red Cloud Demon Lord! 

David could only nod his head when he heard it. David had no pressure at all to deal 
with the fourth-grade cultivator in the Mahayana realm! 

At this time, the fourth-rank guest of the Mahayana realm stood up with a provocative 
look on his face. His aura burst out instantly, and the powerful spiritual power wave 
spread in the hall. 



He looked at David and said angrily: “Boy, today I will let you know that the gap in realm 
is not so easy to cross.” 

David looked indifferent, narrowed his eyes slightly, and said calmly: “Please teach me.” 

The guest said nothing, his figure flashed, and he rushed to David in an instant. He 
gathered a ball of powerful spiritual power in his hand and smashed it towards David. 

Everyone watched this scene nervously. They all thought that David would be in trouble 
under this attack. 

However, David was not in a hurry. When the guest’s attack was about to come, he 
gently turned sideways and cleverly avoided this fierce attack. 

The guest’s attack missed, and he was slightly startled, but he quickly adjusted his state 
and launched another attack. 

He danced with both hands, and a stream of spiritual power entangled David like a spirit 
snake. 

David’s mouth corners slightly raised, and he waved his hand lightly, and an invisible 
force instantly dispersed those spiritual powers. 

Seeing this, Ke Qing’s face turned a little ugly. He didn’t expect David to resolve his 
attack so easily. 

He gritted his teeth and decided to use his strongest move. 

The guest shouted loudly, and his spiritual power surged wildly. A huge phantom of a 
beast appeared behind him. 

The phantom of the beast exuded a powerful pressure, which made people tremble with 
fear. 

The guest pushed forward with both hands, and the phantom of the beast roared and 
pounced on David. 

Everyone saw this scene, and they couldn’t help but sweat for David. 

But David remained calm. He slowly raised his right hand, and a ball of golden light 
condensed in his palm. 

With a gentle push, the golden light instantly turned into a golden dragon and rushed 
towards the phantom of the beast. 



The golden dragon collided with the phantom of the beast, making a loud noise, and the 
powerful energy fluctuations made the whole hall tremble slightly. 

Everyone widened their eyes and watched this duel nervously. 

I saw the golden dragon was fierce and instantly dispersed the phantom of the beast. 

The fourth-grade guest of the Mahayana realm was shocked by the powerful recoil force 
and retreated again and again, his face pale. 

But David stood firmly in place, as if nothing had happened. 

The whole hall was silent, and everyone was shocked by David’s strength. 

General Xing also widened his eyes and looked at David in disbelief. 

He had originally doubted David’s strength, but now he saw with his own eyes that 
David easily defeated the fourth-grade guest of the Mahayana Realm, and he couldn’t 
help but look at David with new eyes. 

The other guests were so shocked that they were speechless. They never thought that 
a cultivator of the ninth grade of the Tribulation Realm could defeat a fourth-grade 
strongman of the Mahayana Realm so easily. 

David looked at the shocked expressions of the crowd, smiled slightly, and said, “Thank 
you.” 

Only then did everyone come back to their senses, and their hearts were full of awe for 
David. 

They knew that the strength of this seemingly ordinary dragon boy should not be 
underestimated. 
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General Xing stood up in a hurry, and said in surprise: “I didn’t expect that Fellow Daoist 
Chen is really extraordinary. He is only at the ninth level of the Tribulation Realm, but he 
can easily defeat the fourth-level cultivator of the Mahayana Realm!” 

“Please sit down, please sit down…” 



General Xing’s attitude towards David has changed a lot. Even the other guests are 
now respectful to David! 

The fourth-level cultivator of the Mahayana Realm who followed David was ashamed at 
this moment. He walked up to David and said, “I was reckless just now. Please don’t 
blame me, Fellow Daoist Chen!” 

“It’s okay!” David waved his hand casually! 

“Fellow Daoist Chen, I wonder if you still have relatives and friends? Where have you 
been living?” 

General Xing asked! 

He really wanted to know if David still had people from his clan. If he could recruit a 
group of Dragon Clan guests, then his strength would definitely increase greatly 
compared to the other two generals! 

“I have no fixed place to live, I am just a casual cultivator!” 

David said! 

David could not tell General Xing his true identity. If General Xing knew that he came 
from outside the Beast City, it would be troublesome! 

“Oh, it turns out that Fellow Daoist Chen is a casual cultivator, but being able to cultivate 
to the ninth level of the Tribulation Realm with the power of a casual cultivator is also 
considered a gifted talent.” 

“I wonder what Fellow Daoist Chen’s plans are in the future? Is there a place to go?” 

General Xing asked! 

“Where is there a place to go? I am still a criminal and I have to go to jail!” 

David said with a wry smile! 

“Go to jail?” General Xing was stunned: “Didn’t I ask Baicheng to get the amnesty order 
and bring Fellow Daoist Chen out? Why is he still going to jail?” 

General Xing didn’t know that David ran away secretly by himself, and thought that 
Baicheng brought him out with the amnesty order! 

“General, this is what happened…” 



Upon seeing this, Bai Cheng hurriedly followed General Xing and told him everything in 
detail! 

When they heard that David had escaped from the prison by himself, everyone was 
stunned! 

You know, there are two formations in the prison, there are formations in the cells, and 
there are formations around the entire prison. How could David pass through the two 
formations silently and come out easily? 

You know, in the past thousands of years, no prisoner has been able to run out of this 
prison privately! 

“Are you still a formation master?” 

General Xing looked at David and asked in surprise! 

“I’m not a formation master, I just know a little bit about the art of formation. The 
formation in the prison is simply a child’s play and can’t stop me.” 

David smiled slightly! 

After hearing David’s words, everyone frowned slightly! 

You know, there are very few formation masters in the entire Tianren world. When the 
area of Beast City was closed by the formation, there were not many formation masters 
in the entire Beast City area! 

The formations around the Beast City Prison were set up more than a thousand years 
ago when the City Lord’s Mansion spent a lot of money to offer a reward to find a 
formation master in the entire Beast City area! 

Now David actually said that the formations around the prison were child’s play, which 
was a bit too crazy! 

Although David is a dragon clan and can defeat a fourth-grade cultivator in the 
Mahayana Realm with the ninth-grade realm of the Crossing Tribulation Realm, it does 
not mean that David is omnipotent. 

Whether it is formation magic or alchemy, it is a very difficult method, much more 
difficult than simple practice and upgrade! 

Moreover, formation magic or alchemy is very time-consuming, so many cultivators are 
unwilling to practice, and hope to use their time to break through the realm! 



“Fellow Daoist Chen, there are also formations protecting my general’s mansion. I 
wonder if you can see where my formation is and break the formations around it?” 

General Xing asked David. 

“What’s the difficulty…” David smiled lightly, and then waved his hand gently! 

A white light flashed around the entire general’s mansion, which was particularly bright 
in the dark night! 

However, the white light only flashed for a moment and then disappeared! 

 


