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David waved his hand, signaling Bai Yi not to worry. 

He moved his shoulders and smiled, “You’re just in time. I’m not satisfied yet!” 

Baohu’s face was livid, and the veins on his forehead were throbbing. 

He smashed the table in front of him and roared, “Kill this ignorant kid!” 

The first master who rushed up waved his fist like a hammer, with a faint energy 
wrapped around his fist. It was obvious that he had cultivated his physical strength to 
the extreme. 

David did not dodge, and also punched out. His fist was pitifully small in comparison, 
but it was full of unstoppable momentum. 

“Crack!” 

The crisp sound of bone cracking sounded, which was particularly harsh in the silent 
Baohufang. 

The whole arm of the strong man was twisted into a weird angle, the white bones 
pierced the skin, and blood gushed out. 

He screamed and flew backwards, smashing the pillars at the edge of the ring, and fell 
to the ground unconscious. 

The second and third enemies attacked at the same time, one punched like a bell 
hammer, and the other kicked like a steel whip. 

David flashed and easily avoided the attack, while his hands lightly touched the two 
people like a butterfly flying through flowers. 

“Puff–“ 

“Ah!” 

One master suddenly vomited blood and fell to the ground; the other held his twisted 
and deformed legs and wailed. 



Every blow of David hit their vital points accurately. It seemed to be understated, but it 
actually contained terrifying destructive power. 

David was like a tiger in a flock of sheep, and he was at ease in the siege of ten 
masters. 

His movements were so fast that people could not even touch the corner of his clothes. 

Every time he attacked, an enemy screamed and fell down, or his arm was broken, or 
his leg bones were shattered, or he fainted directly. 

Seeing this scene, the masters of Baohufang were horrified and their offensive became 
more fierce. 

However, David fought more and more bravely, his speed became faster and his 
strength became stronger. 

Under his attack, the masters of Baohufang fell to the ground one after another, 
screaming one after another. 

Everyone was stunned. They had never seen such a strong fighting power. 

One person against ten masters, not only did he not fall into a disadvantage, but he 
beat his opponents without any chance of fighting back. This was beyond their 
cognition. 

“Is this still a human?” Someone murmured to himself. 

“How could his physical strength be so terrifying?” Another person said in disbelief. 

As time went on, the situation on the ring became clearer. 

Of the ten masters of Baohufang, only the last two were still struggling to support. They 
looked at their fallen companions around them, their hearts filled with fear, and their 
movements became flustered. 

David seized the opportunity, flashed, appeared behind one of them, and punched the 
other in the back of the neck. 

The man felt a black screen before his eyes, and then he collapsed to the ground. 

Then, David rushed to the last person and kicked him away. 

In just a few minutes, David was the only one standing on the ring. 

The masters of Baohufang lay on the ground in a mess, groaning one after another. 



The blood dyed the obsidian ground red, and it shone with a strange luster under the 
light. 

Baohu looked ashen, and although he was unwilling, he still said with trembling lips: “I… 
I give up…” 

His voice was as thin as a mosquito, and he was completely different from his previous 
arrogance. 

Bai Yi jumped up excitedly, and the wrinkles on his face were all smiling: “Hahaha, I’m 
rich! Nuo Qing, quickly empty the warehouse of Baohufang for me.” 

He rubbed his hands and began to calculate how many rare materials these immortal 
coins could buy. 

David walked slowly in front of Baohu and looked down at the once arrogant owner of 
Baohufang. 

His eyes were cold, as if he was looking at an ant: “Remember, when you see someone 
from our Linghufang in the future, walk around.” 

At this moment, a trace of viciousness flashed in Baohu’s eyes, and he suddenly took 
out a poisoned dagger from his sleeve. The dagger was shining with a cold green light, 
and it was obviously coated with a deadly poison. 

He stabbed David’s heart fiercely, as fast as lightning! 
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Baohu was obviously hesitant and did not dare to use his magic aura, fearing that he 
would be detected by the combat troops above. 

If the location of his black market was discovered, his life would be over. 

“Be careful!” Hu Mazi exclaimed, his face instantly pale. 

David had expected this, and a sneer appeared at the corner 

of his mouth. At the moment when the dagger was about to touch his collar, he grabbed 
Baohu’s wrist and gently pinched it—— 

“Ah!” 



Baohu screamed like a pig being slaughtered, and the bones of his wrist were crushed 
into powder and hung down limply. 

The dagger fell to the ground with a “clang”, and the venom corroded a small pit with 
green smoke. 

“This is just a lesson. In the future, you should accept the loss and don’t make sneak 
attacks.” 

David said coldly, and kicked Baohu away. Baohu flew out more than ten meters like a 
broken sack and fell heavily to the ground. 

The entire black market was silent, and everyone was stunned by this shocking scene. 

Who would have thought that a seemingly ordinary young man could sweep the entire 
Baohufang with just his physical strength? 

Those thugs who usually show off their power are as fragile as babies in front of him. 

Baohu’s face was pale, his eyes were full of unwillingness, but he did not dare to resist. 

He knew that he had no power to fight back in front of David. 

In desperation, he could only order Nuo Qing to bring people to move all the immortal 
coins and resources out. 

Bai Yi looked at the piles of immortal coins and resources and smiled from ear to ear. 

He walked up, patted David on the shoulder, and exclaimed: “My dear son-in-law, you 
are so amazing! With you, our Linghufang’s position in the black market will surely rise!” 

David smiled faintly and said nothing. He knew that in this heaven where the strong are 
respected, only by constantly improving his strength can he gain a foothold. 

Today’s victory was only due to the restrictions of the rules. If the use of magic aura was 
allowed, David would not be able to be the opponent of these people, so David had to 
improve his realm as soon as possible. 

The people in Baohufang watched their hard-earned wealth being taken away by David. 
Although they were unwilling, they did not dare to say anything. Pinshu.com 
https://www.vodtwla.cc 

They knew that from this moment on, Baohufang’s position in the black market would 
plummet. 

“Father-in-law, why don’t we go to the next black market…” 



David asked! 

Only by winning more immortal coins and resources can David improve his realm faster. 

“No problem, let’s go…” 

Bai Yi was full of excitement. After looking at Baohu coldly, he left Baohufang! 

When they walked out of Baohufang, Nuo Qing and other people from Linghufang all 
looked at David in admiration. 

Originally, their Linghufang was won a lot of immortal coins and resources by 
Baohufang, making it difficult for Linghufang to maintain. Unexpectedly, they won them 
all back. 

At first, when Nuo Qing saw David’s size and his cultivation level of the first level of the 
Transformation Immortal Realm, he simply looked down on 

him! If he was not Bai Yi’s son-in-law, Nuo Qing probably wouldn’t bother to pay 
attention to him. 

But now, Nuo Qing and others called David “son-in-law” 

all the time, and they were so affectionate. Bai Yi liked David even more, calling him 
“son-in-law” all the way. 

Bai Yi took David and began to sweep through various black markets. 

Because of David’s size, he was just a weakling in the eyes of others. 

So every time they arrived at a black market, they all thought that David would lose, 

and they placed bets one after another. The result is conceivable, every time David won 
a complete victory, and then put away a lot of immortal coins. 

Although these black markets won a lot of immortal coins, they were helpless because 
they didn’t dare to make a move. 

If they didn’t give immortal coins, or made a move on David and others, then their black 
market credibility would be gone. 

If a black market loses its credibility, it means destruction. Who would dare to do 
business in the black market? 

The most important point is that once the magic aura is used, it will definitely be leaked 
and discovered by the patrolling soldiers. 



Once the location of the black market is exposed, it will definitely be the end. The City 
Lord’s Mansion will definitely send troops to destroy the black market. 
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Therefore, unless it is a life-or-death moment, the owners of these black markets will not 
take action. They can only take out the immortal coins 

willing to accept defeat . In this day, Bai Yi led David to sweep the black market of the 
entire Rhino City and won countless immortal coins and resources. Back to Linghufang, 
Bai Yi almost hugged David and kissed him happily. 

“My dear son-in-law, don’t stay in any inn in the future. This Linghufang is your home. I 
will arrange a luxurious and comfortable room for you.” Bai Yi said to David. David 
nodded, then pointed at Hu Mazi and Xiu Rui and said, “My two friends…” “They are 
your friends, so they are guests of our house. Just live here together.” Bai Yi said very 
generously. 

“But their identities…” David was afraid that the identities of Hu Mazi and Xiu Rui’s 
human race would be leaked, which would bring trouble to Linghufang. “It’s okay. As 
long as you don’t run around in Linghufang, there will be no problem.” Bai Yi said. 
“Master Hu, Fellow Daoist Xiu, how do you two feel?” David asked the two. “I’ll follow 
Fellow Daoist Chen’s arrangements.” Xiu Rui didn’t care. He was rescued by David, so 
he could only follow David all the way. 

Otherwise, he couldn’t survive in Rhino City with his human identity. Hu Mazi said with 
some difficulty: “There are two women in the inn. Can we bring them together?” “Of 
course, I will arrange a room for you separately.” Without waiting for David to nod, Bai 
Yi spoke. “Okay, I’ll go and pick them up!” Hu Mazi happily went to pick up the two 
women. 

the following time, David and his companions did not leave Linghufang. After all, 
Linghufang has everything, which is equivalent to a small city. 

David worked hard in the Demon Suppression Tower. With the supply of immortal coins 
and a large amount of resources, David’s cultivation speed also advanced by leaps and 
bounds. 

In just half a month, David’s realm has reached the amazing eighth level of the Immortal 
Realm! 



You should know that half a month in the outside world is fifty months in the Demon 
Suppression Tower, which is equivalent to several years. 

When David came out of the Demon Suppression Tower, everyone watched him rise 
rapidly from the first level of the Immortal Realm to the eighth level of the Immortal 
Realm in just half a month. It was incredible. 

“My dear son-in-law, your cultivation speed is simply amazing, but the consumption 
speed is also amazing. The resources won in the fight are almost exhausted.” 

Bai Yi said helplessly. 

If there were no resources to supply David, David would not have been able to come 
out of the Demon Suppression Tower. 

“Father-in-law, this is already very good, but it’s a pity that all those resources were 
used by myself.” 

David said a little embarrassedly. 

“My dear son-in-law, you are being too polite. From now on, the entire Linghu Square 
will be yours, and the resources will certainly be given to you!” 

Bai Yi patted David on the shoulder and said. 

David was very touched. David agreed with Bai Yi as his father-in -law. 

“Father-in-law, I wonder if there is a trial field in Rhino City. My cultivation level has 
improved so much now, and I also need some trials to master.” 

Although David’s level has now been improved to the eighth level of the Immortal 
Realm, because there are too many levels to improve, David must go through actual 
combat and master the skills. 

But in Rhino City, David can’t just find a few people to fight and then beat them. 

“There is a purgatory field in Rhino City, but it is too dangerous. I’m afraid it’s not 
suitable for you at your level.” 

“And every time you enter the purgatory field, you need 500,000 immortal coins. Most 
people can’t afford this price at all.” 

Bai Yi followed David and said. 

“Purgatory field? Why is there a fee? Who are these fees for? What is in the purgatory 
field?” 



David asked puzzled. 
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“Of course this money is for the city lord. The entire purgatory is controlled by the City 
Lord’s Mansion.” 

“In the back mountain of Rhino City, there is a cave called the Devil Cave. Legend has it 
that in ancient times, a large number of demons were suppressed in it.” 

“Later, Rhino City was built here, and this Devil Cave was also controlled by the City 
Lord’s Mansion.” 

“The formation to enter the Devil Cave is also under the control of the City Lord’s 
Mansion. Gradually, this Devil Cave became a purgatory.” 

“Someone once tried in the Purgatory Field for a year. When he came out, his overall 
strength increased rapidly, and he went directly to the second heaven.” 

Bai Yi explained to David. 

“Devil Cave?” David was delighted: “Father-in-law, can you take me to see it?” 

“Are you strong enough? Those who enter the Demon Cave are all casual cultivators, 
and many people have not been able to get out.” 

“If you want to go to the trial with your strength, I’m afraid it will be dangerous.” 

Bai Yi was worried that David would be in danger. 

“Father-in-law, don’t worry, I know my limits, but I don’t know if you can still come up 
with 500,000 immortal coins?” 

David was now worried about whether Bai Yi could come up with 500,000 immortal 
coins as the entrance fee. 

“Since you have decided, I will get these 500,000 immortal coins even if I sell everything 
I have.” 

“You only need to consider your own safety. Don’t show off after entering. If you find 
that something is wrong, you can come out immediately.” 



Bai Yi was afraid that David would be in danger. How would he explain to his daughter 
at that time? 

“I understand!” David nodded vigorously! 

“Okay, since you have made up your mind, then follow me!” 

Bai Yi took David out of Linghufang. 

Before leaving, David said hello to Xiu Rui and Hu Mazi, but the two of them lived very 
well in Linghufang. 

Especially Hu Mazi, who had a party every night and made the two women suffer. 

After leaving Linghufang, Bai Yi took David to fly all the way to the north of Rhino City. 

You know, Rhino City is huge, and to the north of Rhino City is a towering mountain! 

David and his team flew for more than an hour before slowly landing. 

this moment, David and his companions were already at the foot of the mountain. The 
mountain in front of them made David feel very depressed. 

Halfway up the mountain, there was a cave a hundred feet wide, with golden light 
flashing all around. 

A winding staircase led directly to the cave. 

At the foot of the mountain, a courtyard was shrouded in a formation, and the starting 
point of the staircase was in the courtyard. 

“What are you doing?” 

At this time, two soldiers in armor came and questioned Bai Yi and David. 

“We are here for the trial and to enter the purgatory field.” 

Bai Yi said. 

The two soldiers just glanced at them, and then dodged and said, “Go in…” 

Bai Yi took David into the courtyard, and after entering, Bai Yi came to the payment 
office. 

“Five hundred thousand immortal coins per person…” 



A middle-aged woman said to Bai Yi and David without raising her head. 

Bai Yi took out the storage bag and threw it to the woman. The woman just weighed it 
with her hand and put it away casually. 

“This is for one person, who will go?” 

The woman looked up at Bai Yi and David and asked. 

“He goes…” Bai Yi said to David. 

At this time, the woman looked at David carefully, with surprise in her eyes. 

“Once you enter the Purgatory Field, life and death are determined by fate. We are not 
responsible for anything.” 

The woman warned. 

“Don’t worry, I won’t look for you even if I die!” David smiled faintly. 

The woman took out a lavender crystal, then threw it to David and said, “This is the trial 
crystal for entering the Purgatory Field. Just walk up the steps from here. There are a 
total of 180,000 steps. You must walk up.” 

“If you can’t even walk up these 180,000 steps, then you are not qualified to enter the 
Purgatory Field, and the 500,000 immortal coins will not be refunded!” 
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“fu**, so dark?” 

David couldn’t help but curse when he heard it. 

The woman snorted coldly and looked at David intently, as if she wanted to eat him. 

“Child, don’t be sensible, don’t bother with him…” 

Seeing this, Bai Yi hurriedly apologized to the woman. 

Then Bai Yi pulled David aside and whispered: “The King of Hell is easy to mess with, 
but the little ghosts are hard to deal with. Don’t get into conflicts with the staff in the 
future. If you get into trouble, you may not be able to get out of that purgatory.” 



“I understand…” 

David nodded. 

What’s the difference between this heaven and the secular world? Even this female 
staff member is the same… 

She looks arrogant and indifferent, as if someone owes her money. 

“Go in, be careful, if you feel that you can’t do it, don’t try to be strong, come out 
immediately.” 

Bai Yi warned David, he was afraid that David would try to be strong. 

“I know!” David said, and then walked towards the stairs. 

There were 180,000 stairs, and there was no end in sight. Especially when he was in 
the middle, David felt like he was walking on an endless road, with cliffs on both sides. 

Seeing David climb the stairs, Bai Yi wanted to leave, but he changed his mind and 
stopped, and then waited for David. 

If David really had something to do, he could still help on the spot. If David had an 
accident, Bai Qian would come to the heaven, and I’m afraid she wouldn’t even 
recognize him as her father. 

David walked step by step. This kind of stairs was not a challenge for someone like 
David who had a strong body and enough strength. 

Climbing this ladder requires perseverance, and David had the most perseverance. 

He had gritted his teeth and survived every time he walked along. Sorry, 

When David finally reached the entrance of the huge cave, he took a breath. 

Then he took out the trial crystal and threw it into the cave. 

Buzz! 

As a white light flashed in the cave, David felt as if he was sucked away by another 
force. 

When he opened his eyes, he found himself in a wasteland, surrounded by dark red, 
with skeletons and remains everywhere, and a light rain in the sky. 



David touched it with his hand and found that it was not rain, but blood. The sky was 
bleeding. 

Looking around, there was no cave at all, as if he had arrived in another world. 

At this moment, David’s face became solemn. This damn ghost place was a bit creepy. 

David began to operate the Condensation Heart Technique, absorbing the Yin Sha Qi 
between heaven and earth. There was a lot of Yin Sha Qi here, as if it was hell. 

The Yin Sha Qi around surged into David’s body like a tide. 

Fortunately, David’s Condensation Heart Technique can refine everything, no matter 
what kind of breath it is, it can be refined into his own breath. 

In addition, David himself has the blood of the demon clan. After a large amount of Yin 
Sha Qi entered his body, David felt that he was full of strength, and even the 
nervousness just now was swept away. 

“This is really a good place…” 

David actually slowly closed his eyes and began to desperately absorb the Yin Sha Qi 
around him. 

Because a large amount of Yin Sha Qi entered his body, David’s face became dark, and 
at the same time, the blood vessels in his body began to bulge. 

“Boy, although the Yin Sha Qi is good, you should not be careless, be careful not to get 
possessed.” 

“There are many evil spirits in this place. It seems that there has been a great battle 
here, and the souls of those who died are imprisoned here and can’t get out.” 

Just as David was happily absorbing the Yin Sha Qi, the Red Cloud Demon Lord 
hurriedly reminded him. 

 

 


