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Each attack of the bronze warrior carried the power of the ancient prohibition, which 
made his arm numb, and the blood-colored energy in the sword was constantly crushed 
by the axe blade. 

David saw the flaw, and the Dragon Slashing Sword turned into a streak of silk, and cut 
his sleeve with a “puff” sound, leaving a bloody mark on the shoulder armor that was 
deep enough to see the bone. 

Three against one, David seemed much more relaxed, otherwise it would be a bit 
difficult for David to deal with this elder, unless he let the Red Cloud Demon Lord 
possess him! But 

David didn’t want too many people to know about the existence of the Red Cloud 
Demon Lord, after all, this was his killer move! 

It was used for show at the end! 

At this moment, on the other side of the battlefield, the killing of the Shura Guards had 
entered a white-hot stage. 

These dead warriors awakened by their blood essence felt no pain, and every swing of 
their swords was fierce with the determination to die together. 

An elder from Tianyuan Pavilion tried to gather Dharma to protect himself, but was hit 
by three Shura Guards at the same time. The protective fairy light shattered like glass, 
and before he could scream, he was cut into several pieces by the black blade. 

Blood flowers bloomed in the sky above Liuli City, and the elders from Tianyuan 
Pavilion turned from their initial arrogance to fear. 

In just a moment, more than half of the twelve accompanying elders were killed or 
injured, and the few remaining ones were also fighting hard with injuries, surrounded by 
the black shadows of Shura Guards. 

“Retreat!” 



Seeing that the situation was not good, the Pavilion Master of Tianyuan Pavilion 
slapped his jade fan fiercely, and several moon-white wind blades exploded, forcing the 
Shura Guards in front of him to retreat. 

He looked at the blood-stained elder, and a trace of resentment flashed in his eyes: 
“Elder, you and I failed today, and we will make Shura Palace pay for our blood debt 
another day!” 

After that, he no longer wanted to fight, and waved his sleeves, and several winds 
wrapped up the remaining people from Tianyuan Pavilion, turning into streams of light 
and escaping. 

Seeing that the Pavilion Master of Tianyuan Pavilion had escaped, the elder was so 
angry that he wanted to curse! 

“Want to go?” 

Sang Tianyang snorted coldly, and the Shura jade pendant on his chest burst into 
golden light again. Dozens of Shura ghosts flew out of the jade pendant and instantly 
wove a large net in the void. 

The Pavilion Master of Tianyuan Pavilion crashed into the net, as if he had crashed into 
a real rock wall, and snorted with blood. 

But he was the Pavilion Master of Tianyuan Pavilion after all. He forcibly burned his 
immortal power to break the corner of the net, and fled with the remnants. Before 
leaving, he left a harsh word: “Sang Tianyang, David! Today’s account, I Tianyuan 
Pavilion has remembered it!” 

Everyone in Tianyuan Pavilion retreated, and now only David, Sang Tianyang and his 
daughter, and the great elder who was forced into a corner by two warrior statues were 
left on the battlefield. 

The great elder’s knife had been broken into two pieces, with half of the sharp blade 
stuck in his chest, and blood soaked his robes, but he still held his neck, without any 
fear in his eyes. 

“Kill me!” 

He stared at David, “Although I lost today, I don’t regret it! If there is an afterlife, I will 
make you pay a thousand times for Sang Qi’s revenge!” 

David put away the Dragon Slaying Sword and walked in front of him with a complicated 
look. 



He could understand the pain of the elder losing his son, but he could not forgive the 
other party’s crazy killing. 

“Your life should not be decided by me.” He turned to Sang Tianyang, “Palace Master, 
this person is a traitor to Shura Palace, you should deal with him…” 

Sang Tianyang looked at the elder with a haggard face and was silent for a long time. 

The brothers in the past turned against each other, and today’s bloody battle actually 
added a few strands of white hair to his temples. 

He waved away the Shura Guards, and those black shadows turned into light spots and 
merged into the ground, but the bloody smell in the air lingered for a long time. 

“Great Elder.” Sang Tianyang’s voice was filled with fatigue. “You and I are from the 
same sect. I will not kill you, but from today on, you are no longer a member of Shura 
Palace, and Shura Palace will never welcome you again.” 

Upon hearing this, the Great Elder was stunned at first, and then he laughed bitterly: 
“Expel? Haha… What a good expulsion! I lost my son and everything. The status of 
Shura Palace is nothing to me!” 

He suddenly pulled out the sharp blade from his chest, letting the blood gush out, but 
straightened his spine, and walked out of the Glass City step by step. His back looked 
particularly lonely in the setting sun. 
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“Father…” Sang Lan wanted to say something, but was interrupted by Sang Tianyang! 

He knew what Sang Lan was going to say. People like this who betrayed should be 
killed to prevent future troubles! 

If you let the tiger go back to the mountain, it will definitely be a trouble in the future! 

But Sang Tianyang did not make a move. After all, he was wrong to take someone 
else’s love before! 

When the dust settled, Liuli City was in ruins. 



Sang Lan also understood what her father meant, and gently supported Sang 
Tianyang’s shaky body: “Father, you have lost too much blood and essence, go back 
and heal your wounds.” 

Sang Tianyang nodded and looked at David: “My friend Chen, thank you for today… If it 
weren’t for you, Shura Palace might…” 

“Palace Master, you are too polite.” David bowed and said, “If you hadn’t summoned the 
Shura Guards, I would have been killed by the sword now.” 

He paused and looked at Mo Qingyun hiding behind the stone pillar, “Qingyun, we 
should go.” 

Mo Qingyun walked over quickly, still with a look of shock on his face, but bowed to 
Sang Tianyang and his daughter, “Thank you, Palace Master, and Miss Sang Lan for 
saving me.” 

Sang Tianyang looked at David deeply, and took out a token engraved with the Shura 
totem from his arms, “This is the guest token of the Shura Palace. If you encounter 
trouble in the second heaven in the future, you can come to me with this token.” 

David took the token and put it in the storage bag, “Thank you, Palace Master, for your 
kindness. See you later.” 

Under the setting sun, the figures of David and Mo Qingyun gradually disappeared 
outside the ruins of Liuli City. 

In the distant sky, thunderclouds rolled, Sang Tianyang looked at the direction where 
the great elder left, and the jade pendant tightly held in his hand sent a burst of 
coolness. He didn’t know whether he was right or wrong to do so. 

But some grudges, even if they meet with swords, are hard to break; and some 
encounters, even if they meet by chance, can be exchanged for life and death 
protection. 

“Lan’er, let’s go back too!” Sang Tianyang turned and left, but he was obviously much 
older! 

………… 

David and Mo Qingyun left, strolling in the void! 

“David, you don’t look very good, why don’t you go home and have a good rest!” 

Mo Qingyun said! 



“No, I’ll find a place to rest in the tower!” 

David found a hidden place, and then took Mo Qingyun into the tower! 

After entering the tower, David began to slowly close his eyes, and a strong breath 
around him continued to spread outward, shaking the void in the tower! 

In the previous battle, although David won, he was also injured, but he gained a lot! 

If you just practice in seclusion without actual combat, even if your realm is improved, 
your real strength will be greatly reduced! 

The battle with the elder made David realize a lot! 

Slowly, David’s breath became stronger and stronger, and the void around him 
gradually twisted! 

Not far away, Mo Qingyun looked at David worriedly, she didn’t dare to practice! 

I don’t know how long it took, David suddenly opened his eyes, and two rays of light 
flashed in his eyes! 

Boom! 

A terrifying breath instantly erupted from David’s body, and Mo Qingyun felt a 
suffocating pressure! 

“The fourth level of the scattered fairyland…” 

David took a deep breath and smiled. 

He didn’t expect that the battle with the Great Elder would give him insights and directly 
break through to the fourth level of the Scattered Immortal Realm! 

“If I dare to fight that Great Elder again, I will beat the piss out of him!” 

David’s confidence increased greatly at this moment! 

You must know that David’s strength increases exponentially with each realm 
improvement! 

Every life-and-death battle can give David a new harvest. Life-and-death battles can 
best stimulate potential! 

David really wants to find a master to fight with now! 



This time, the Great Elder burned his origin and directly reached the ninth level of the 
Scattered Immortal Realm, letting David know that his combat power was not enough to 
defeat the ninth level of the Scattered Immortal Realm, so he asked the two warriors to 
take action! 

But now, if he encounters a ninth-level cultivator in the Scattered Immortal Realm, David 
is not afraid, and he has enough power to fight! Of course, if 

he encounters a ninth-level cultivator in the Scattered Immortal Realm who can also 
fight across levels, David is still defeated! 
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But now David should be almost invincible under the Three Heavens! 

As long as he improves one realm, he will be able to sweep across the Three Heavens! 

The cultivators who broke through the scattered immortal realm all broke through the 
three heavens and went to the fourth heaven! 

After all, only the cultivators of the fourth heaven can be called true immortals! 

“Senior, I wonder if you can show up in this tower, let’s have a fight?” 

“I feel full of power now, I want to find someone to try!” 

David followed the Red Cloud Demon Lord and said! 

“What? You still want to fight with me?” The Red Cloud Demon Lord sneered! 

“I just want to try, you are just a soul now, you should be able to give it a try!” David 
said! 

“Hey, you are so arrogant just because you are at the fourth level of the scattered 
fairyland. You still want to try it with me!” 

“If I say I can defeat you with one hand, you will feel that I have no sympathy, but I can 
tell you that I can turn you into ashes with just a breath.” 

“In my eyes, even if you have reached the fourth level of the scattered fairyland, you are 
just like an ant. I can drown you by 



just peeing!” “I advise you to be low-key. This is the heaven. It’s okay under the three 
heavens, but once you break through the three heavens, you don’t know when you will 
meet a master.” 

“If you pretend like this, you may be spit to death by someone…” 

David: “………………” 

Originally, he just wanted to fight with the Red Cloud Demon Lord in this tower to test 
his strength! 

But who knew that he was scolded and hit David directly! 

But what the Red Cloud Demon Lord said was right. David’s current strength can still 
survive in the three heavens, but once he goes to the fourth heaven, facing the entire 
heaven, it will not be enough. 

“Qingyun, let’s go…” 

David ignored the Demon Lord Chiyun and looked at Mo Qingyun and said! 

Mo Qingyun nodded and followed David out of the Demon Suppression Tower. 

Although only a few hours had passed outside, it had been more than ten days in the 
tower, otherwise David would not have made such a quick breakthrough! 

“Where to go?” Mo Qingyun asked! 

“Go home first…” David decided to go back to the Mo family first. 

Let Mo Qingyun stay with Mo Wuji for a while, and then take Mo Qingyun to the Eighth 
Palace! 

But just when David followed Mo Qingyun to the Mo family, he found an old man in 
black above the Mo family! 

Mo Wuji led the Mo family to confront the old man in black! 

It’s just that the old man in black is the eighth level of the scattered fairyland, and the 
Mo family is not an opponent, and has never taken action! 

And the old man did not take action against the Mo family, just stayed quietly in the 
void! 

“Father, who is this?” 



Mo Qingyun walked to Mo Wuji and asked! 

Mo Wuji shook his head: “I don’t know him, but he wants to find David…” 

“Looking for me?” David frowned slightly and looked at the old man in black: “Who are 
you? What do you want to find me for?” 

“Are you David?” The old man asked! 

“Yes, it’s me!” David nodded! 

“Do you have treasures from the ancient ruins?” The old man in black asked! 

David heard it, took a look at the old man in black and said, “What’s your business?” 

It can be seen that the old man in black has bad intentions. 

“How dare you!” The old man in black frowned, and his body instantly became illusory. 
At the same time, countless chains appeared around David. In just a moment, David 
was trapped by the chains! 

At the same time, black lightning passed through the chains and bombarded David! 

“David…” 

Mo Qingyun and Mo Wuji were very shocked! 

I didn’t expect that the old man in black would start fighting without saying a word! 

But just when the lightning bombarded David, there was a loud bang! 

Then a golden sword light broke through the black lightning, and then went towards the 
old man in black! 

The old man in black condensed his eyes. He didn’t expect David to still have the 
strength to resist. In an instant, he waved his palm and a black light came up! 

Boom! 

With an explosion, the two people retreated at the same time! 
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David quickly stopped, with a smile on his face. Finally, someone was trying to compete 
with him! 

In this way, he could clearly know what strength he could achieve as a fourth-grade 
immortal! 

The dragon-slaying sword in David’s hand trembled slightly, and then soared into the 
air! The 

next moment, the ten-thousand-foot sword light fiercely slashed at the old man in black. 

The entire void was torn open by the sword light! 

The old man in black looked solemn. He didn’t expect that David, who looked only a 
fourth-grade immortal, could burst out with such terrifying strength! 

Originally, he thought he could easily control David, but he didn’t want to underestimate 
David’s strength. 

The old man in black, who didn’t dare to be careless, took a step forward, then made a 
fist with his right hand, and blasted out countless black lightning in an instant. 

The two people collided again! 

Boom! 

The sword light exploded with the black lightning, and shock waves instantly shattered 
the surroundings, even many courtyards of the Mo family were crushed to pieces. 

Mo Wuji was distressed and hurriedly led the Mo family to cast shields to protect the Mo 
family’s houses! 

“You old guy, you are still interesting!” 

“Continue…” 

David rushed towards the old man in black with a sword again! 

This sword was too fast and the angle was tricky. The old man in black changed his 
face, and then he waved his palms, and a black shield appeared in front of him! 

Boom! 



The moment the sword light touched the shield, the shield shattered and the sword light 
disappeared! 

But David did not stop, and the dragon-slaying sword in his hand was still waving! 

In just a moment, the sword light appeared in front of the old man in black again. Just 
when the old man in black was horrified and was about to swing the shield again, he 
suddenly found that not only in front of him, but also around his body, there were dense 
sword lights! 

He was wrapped in sword light and was about to become a hedgehog! 

The old man in black shouted loudly, and lightning burst out from his body. For a 
moment, the whole void was rolling with lightning, like the end of the world! 

Rumble… 

The lightning collided with the sword light, and then made a loud noise and shattered! 

The old man in black fought and retreated until he stopped after a few breaths, and the 
lightning around him gradually disappeared! 

The old man in black was in a very bad state, with countless blood pouring out of his 
body! 

David, holding the Dragon Slashing Sword, looked playful and looked very relaxed! 

“Are you a fourth-grade scattered fairyland?” the old man in black asked! 

“Yes!” David nodded! 

“Then why…” The old man in black wanted to ask something else, but David didn’t want 
to pay attention to him, and the Dragon Slashing Sword was about to swing again! 

“Wait, wait…” 

The old man in black quickly shrank his head, showing a look of fear! 

“Are you scared?” David asked! 

“Scared!” The old man in black nodded repeatedly: “If I knew you were so powerful, I 
would never come even if I was beaten to death!” 

“How do you know that I have treasures from ancient ruins on me?” David asked! 

He was very curious, and only Shura Hall and Tianyuan Pavilion knew about this! 



Shura Hall is not supposed to spread it out casually, so it must be Tianyuan Pavilion! 

“Someone has spread the news. Now the entire Three Heavens probably know that you 
have the ancient relics and treasures.” 

The old man in black replied! 

“Who spread it?” David asked! 

“Then I don’t know, they are all anonymous.” The old man in black said, and then 
apologized a little: “I’m really sorry, I believe in other people’s words, I’m sorry…” 

The old man in black said, and was about to turn around and leave! 

“Wait…” David shouted coldly! 

The old man in black was stunned, and then said with horror: “I have admitted my 
defeat, what else do you want? Don’t you know the rules? Can’t you kill me if I admit my 
defeat?” 

David was speechless for a while, and could only say lightly: “I also have rules. If you 
hand over the resources on your body, you can spare my life!” 

“This…” 

The old man in black seemed a little embarrassed! 

But David shook the Dragon Slaying Sword in his hand lightly, and the old man in black 
quickly took out his storage bag and threw it to David! 

Then he left without looking back, as fast as lightning! 
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The old man in black ran for a long time before he dared to stop. Seeing that David did 
not chase him, he let out a long sigh! 

“Damn, what a monster, he is only a fourth-grade scattered fairyland, but he made me, 
an eighth-grade scattered fairyland, embarrassed!” 

The old man in black cursed! 



In fact, he didn’t know that David was just practicing with him. If David had hit him with 
all his strength, his head would have fallen to the ground long ago, and there would be 
no possibility of escape! 

“The person who spread the news is really a piece of shit. It seems that he is clearly 
trying to harm others!” 

The old man in black was fooled! 

Seeing that David was only a fourth-grade scattered fairyland, he didn’t take him 
seriously at all! 

But now that he thought about it, he finally understood that if David got a treasure from 
an ancient relic, it would prove that David’s strength or background was definitely 
extraordinary. Otherwise, a fourth-grade scattered fairyland would not be able to get the 
treasure from the relic at all! 

The old man in black, knowing that he had been fooled, left in frustration! 

Although he felt unwilling in his heart, he knew that this was already a conspiracy. If he 
didn’t want to fall into the conspiracy, he had to stay away! 

………… 

David took the storage bag of the old man in black, and did not put it away, but handed 
it directly to Mo Wuji! 

“Master Mo, the resources in this storage bag should be regarded as the capital for 
rebuilding the Mo family!” 

David said! 

Many buildings of the Mo family were destroyed in this war! 

“David, why are you being polite to me? We are all family!” Mo Wuji did not reach out! 

David stuffed it directly into Mo Wuji’s hand and said, “Now, almost everyone in the 
Three Heavens knows that I have treasures from ancient ruins on me, and there will 
definitely be many people targeting me!” 

“So I can’t stay in the Mo family, otherwise it will bring disaster to the Mo family!” 

“I plan to take Qingyun away temporarily, and let Qingyun come back to see you after 
this matter is settled!” 



“Okay, you guys should be careful. It’s really not suitable to stay here in the current 
situation of the Mo family!” Mo Wuji nodded! 

“Father…” 

Mo Qingyun looked at Mo Wuji with reluctance in his eyes! 

“After a while, I will rebuild the Mo family, and you can come back to see me.” 

Mo Wuji gently patted Mo Qingyun’s shoulder! 

Mo Qingyun nodded vigorously! 

David took Mo Qingyun away, and soon the figures of the two disappeared in the sky. 

But soon, David and Mo Qingyun traveled through the void, and their piece of void 
began to tremble violently, and a ray of light directly enveloped them! 

David instinctively protected Mo Qingyun behind him, and at the same time, figures 
appeared around him, looking at David and the others! 

“Is this the David who has the ancient relics and treasures?” 

Someone asked a question! 

When David heard it, he frowned immediately. How come someone recognized him 
wherever he went? 

Obviously he was targeted! 

“Sorry, I’m not David!” David shook his head! 

“Don’t fu**ing fart, we have seen all your projections!” 

Someone waved his hand casually, and a projection appeared in the void, and it was 
David on it! 

This time, David didn’t want to admit it! 

The other party even made a projection. It seems that David will have no place to stand 
in the Three Heavens! 

“This guy is only a fourth-grade scattered fairyland. How can he get the treasure of the 
ancient ruins?” 

Someone questioned! 



Several people surrounded David directly. Everyone wanted to know what the treasure 
of the ancient ruins was! 

Seeing several people surrounding him, David said coldly: “I don’t care who you are, it’s 
best not to provoke me, because there will be no good end if you provoke me!” 

“Damn, are you so arrogant?” A man in green sneered: “A mere fourth-grade scattered 
fairyland dares to talk to us like this?” 

“I am…” 

Puff… 

Before the man in green could finish his words, David made a move, and the Dragon 
Slaying Sword instantly chopped off the man in green’s head! 

 

 


