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“This is Dragon Bell, the magical item of magical items. It is a hundred times 
stronger than your useless magical item!” Kai scoffed. 

“Impossible. That’s impossible. You’re merely at Third Level Body Fusion 
Realm. Even if you have a top-grade magical item, you won’t be able to use 
it!” Barken refused to believe that the magical item in Kai’s possession was a 
top-grade magical item. 

“Yeah, whatever,” Kai responded contemptuously. 

“You insolent brat! I’ll tear you to shreds for destroying my magical item!” 
Barken bellowed as he launched a furious punch in Kai’s direction. Unfazed, 
Kai pressed his palm on the Dragon Bell, channeling the Power of Dragons 
into it. 

Roar! Following the thunderous roar, the intricate patterns adorning the 
Dragon Bell began to glow. These patterns appeared to take on a life of their 
own as they detached from the Dragon Bell and transformed into a dragon 
hovering above Kai’s head. 

Barken was taken aback by the sight. He immediately retracted his fist and 
gazed at Kai in shock. 

“Is this a dragon? A real celestial beast?” Barken and the other guardian 
swiftly retreated, their faces drained of color. 

Cloud, Sunny, and the rest were also filled with shock as they looked at the 
scene before them. The appearance of the dragon had mixed feelings swirled 
within their hearts. 

They were glad to have buried the hatchet, for. they had never expected Kai 
to have so many tricks up his sleeves. If they hadn’t made peace with Kai, 
they might have been the ones facing the dragon’s attack. 

Roar! With a roar, the dragon ripped the void open with its paws and headed 
straight for Barken. The dragon was as swift as lightning as it reached out to 
him. 

Seeing that, Barken spun on his heels to flee, but the dragon’s claw scratched 
his back, ripping out a piece of his flesh. Barken fell to the ground with serious 



injuries, his eyes filled with fear. The other guardian immediately stood in 
front of him in a protective manner, his body. trembling slightly. 

Roar! The dragon let out another roar, opening its jaws wide, which almost 
made that Demonic Cultivator p*ss himself. 

Instead of launching another attack, the dragont slowly retreated and flew 
above Kai’s head before returning to the Dragon Bell. 

Kai calmly stored the Dragon Bell in his Storage Ring, then glanced at the 
Demonic Cultivator. “Who was the one who said I was ignorant earlier? Watch 
as I send you to hell, you fools.” 

His eyes gleamed icily. At the same time, Cloud, Sunny, and the rest heard 
Kai’s voice ringing in their ears. “What are you guys waiting for?” 

Their eyes lit up, and they attacked the Demonic Cultivator without 
hesitation. The Demonic Cultivator, petrified by the dragon’s presence, was in 
a state of panic, leaving him vulnerable to the attacks launched by Sunny and 
the others. 

When Cloud was engaged in battle with that Demonic Cultivator, Kai pulled 
out his Demon Flogger and headed straight for Barken. 

Recognizing the significance of capitalizing on. Barken’s injury, he was 
determined to seize this opportunity and ensure that neither of the Demonic 
Cultivators escaped with their lives intact. 

At that moment, Barken was severely injured and lying on the ground. He 
could do nothing but watch as Kai approached him with Demon Flogger in his 
hand. 

“Kid, if you have the audacity to end my life, Inferno Devil will not let you off!” 
Barken screamed in terror. 

“Ha! Whatever devil doesn’t bother me!” 

Kai cracked the whip that carried a pure demonic fire at Barken. “W-Why do 
you have the demonic fire, too?” Barken could barely believe his eyes. 

He couldn’t fathom how Kai was able to refine pure demonic fire as well. Can 
the demonic fire of Inferno Devil be easily refined by human cultivators? 



When he was in a state of confusion, Kai’s whip landed on him. He let out a 
miserable cry as his body was engulfed by the flames. His body and spirit 
turned into ash instantly. 
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“Barken!” The other Demonic Cultivator let out a thunderous roar when he 
saw his companion being struck to death by Kai. 

Nonetheless, Sunny and the others swiftly launched a counterattack, not 
giving the Demonic Cultivator a chance to catch his breath. 

Kai stared at the Demon Flogger in his hand, a delighted grin playing on his 
lips. This is an effective weapon against the Demonic Cultivators indeed. 

“All of you step back. I’ll handle him.” Gripping the Demon Flogger tightly, Kai 
executed a swift, forceful leap, then whipped it toward the Demonic Cultivator. 

An aura as fast as lightning emerged and raced toward the Demonic 
Cultivator. Sunny and the others promptly retreated upon witnessing that. 

The Demonic Cultivator fixed a furious glare on Kai, his eyes blazing with 
anger. In an instant, he released a powerful palm strike, summoning a roaring 
fire dragon that charged menacingly at Kai. 

The moment the Demon Flogger struck the fire dragon, a resounding 
thunderclap reverberated across the entire snowy plains. 

The fiery dragon instantly dissipated, and Kai’s Demon Flogger, charged with 
demonic fire, materialized in front of the Demonic Cultivator in the blink of an 
eye. 

Thud! A sharp crack echoed as the demonic fire on the Demon Flogger 
transformed into a sea of fire, engulfing the Demonic Cultivator. A towering 
blaze soared into the sky. 

Confronted with the purest demonic fire from the demon race, the Demonic 
Cultivator had no chance whatsoever. From the instant he engaged with 
Sunny and his companions to when he was struck by Kai’s Demon Flogger, 
the Demonic Cultivator was enveloped in dread throughout the process. 



His profound terror hindered him from unleashing his utmost 
potential. Otherwise, Kai would not have been able to dispatch him effortlessly 
with a single lash. 

Amidst the demonic fire, the Demonic Cultivator shrieked in pain before 
turning into ashes and vanishing completely. 

The rest of the group looked at Kai in silent admiration as he extinguished the 
life of an Eighth Level Body Fusion Realm cultivator with a single lash of his 
whip. 

The Dragon Bell and the Demon Flogger were both powerful divine 
weapons. Anyone who possessed even one of those treasures would 
probably be overjoyed. 

Kai alone now possessed two, and these might not even be his entire 
arsenal. The fact that a mere cultivator in the Third Level Body Fusion Realm 
possessed two divine weapons was truly unbelievable. 

What Sunny and the others did not know was that the Dragonslayer Sword in 
Kai’s hand was also another divine weapon, especially considering the sword 
spirit, Zelda, residing in it. If Zelda fully recovered, the Dragonslayer Sword’s 
power could increase many folds! 

Furthermore, there was still the Divine Bow. If Kai still had the bow with him, 
he might even be able to take Lynette on. If Kai were to reveal all of his divine 
weapons, Sunny and the group would likely be left speechless with envy. 

“Let’s move quickly. We need to find a secure. location now to hasten our 
recovery!” Kai urged the people, who were still reeling from the shock. Sunny 
and the rest nodded before catching up with Kai. 

They had to leave the area as soon as possible. Otherwise, they would be 
doomed if the other Demonic Cultivators detected their presence. Just when 
Kai and his companions were about to make an escape, several terrifying 
auras approached them from behind. 

They could not help but knit their brows. “We’re doomed. What the hell is 
wrong with these Demonic Cultivators?” 

Cloud was already severely injured. If they were to fight the Demonic 
Cultivators again, his demise would be unavoidable. 



“D*mn it. Why are there so many Demonic Cultivators in the far north? I 
thought they’d all been eradicated? They’re all still so formidable! It seems 
luck is not on our side this time!” Konce could not stop cussing. 

What was supposed to be a treasure hunt in the north had turned into a 
disaster. Not only did they not find the treasure, but they might also. lose their 
lives in this expedition. 

Kai held his breath, gathered his spiritual. sense, and heightened its intensity. 
Soon, Kai flashed a grin and said, “They’re not Demonic Cultivators. Those 
guys have come to save us.” 

With that, Kai led the others and charged in the direction of the auras. The 
group heaved a sigh of relief when they saw the figures from a distance. 
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“Kai!” Quinley called out loudly to Kai, then quickly made her way 
over. Following right behind her were a few skilled warriors from the Tall 
family, either Eighth or Ninth Level Body Fusion Realm cultivators. This clearly 
showed that the Tall family’s strength was not to be underestimated. 

“Are you guys okay? Jerison returned and told me about your situation, and 
my brother sent. me and a few subordinates over to rescue you,” Quinley 
said. 

“We’re fine,” Kai uttered while shaking his head. “We’ve just sustained some 
injuries.” 

“Let’s head back to the Tall residence. You can continue with your treasure 
hunt after you’ve recuperated,” Quinley suggested. “Recently, Demonic 
Cultivators have been causing havoc in the far north. Many cultivators who 
came in search of the treasure have met with brutal ends. It’s perilous for you 
to persist in your current condition.” 

Kai nodded in acknowledgment. Although he wished to discover the treasure 
and acquire the Ice Soul Pill, the present circumstances did not allow him to 
do so. Furthermore, Feenix and Aislin were still at the Tall residence, and Kai 
wished to meet them. 

Sunny and the others, too, agreed to head to the Tall residence because they 
knew they were not in the perfect condition to continue exploring the far north. 



The group then departed and headed for the Tall residence. Meanwhile, 
Lynette, who had been teleported away earlier, had arrived at the location 
where Kai and Barken had dueled. 

Looking at the chaos the duel had left behind, as well as the remnants of the 
tower strewn across the ground, Lynette furrowed her brow. 

“All of Barken’s magical items have been shattered into pieces. What kind of 
formidable cultivator did he encounter?” Lynette did not know Barken was 
killed by Kai and his companions. 

Even the destruction of the tower was the result of Kai’s actions. 

Just as Lynette was still pondering if there were other powerful cultivators 
nearby, the voice of Inferno Devil echoed in her ear. “The two guardians I sent 
with you are dead. What have you done? Get back here right now!” 

Lynette could not help but break out in a cold sweat after hearing Inferno 
Devil’s voice. However, she obediently complied and vanished with a leap. 

Meanwhile, at the Tall residence, Feenix and Aislin anxiously awaited Kai’s 
return, having learned that Quinley had gone to fetch him. 

“Aislin, you’ve been in the Ethereal Realm with us for quite some time, all for 
the sake of Master. When Master arrives, I’ll make sure he showers you with 
affection,” Feenix uttered. 

Upon hearing that, Aislin blushed instantly and responded, “Don’t talk 
nonsense. I hardly know Kai…” 

“Just sleep with him, and you’ll know him better,” Feenix responded with a 
chuckle. 

“Josephine is his official girlfriend, but she hasn’t slept with him. Yet, the rest 
of you have already done it with him,” Aislin said. Feenix burst into laughter. 
“Josephine is his wife-to-be, but we’re not…” 

Soon, Kai appeared, and Feenix and Aislin, who had been eagerly awaiting 
his arrival, dashed out of the house. After spending a significant amount of 
time in the Ethereal Realm and enduring many hardships in their search for 
Kai, they had finally reunited with him. 



“Master! Master!” Feenix rushed toward Kai before finally throwing herself into 
his arms. 

“Feenix.” Kai held her close. 

“Kai…” Aislin, too, called his name as she walked up to him. “Master, Aislin 
also fearlessly followed you into the Ethereal Realm when you were pulled 
into it because she wanted to rescue you,” Feenix explained. 

“Thank you, Ms. Yuchamore,” Kai responded politely. Quinley turned to 
Feenix and suggested, “Kai 

and the others must be exhausted, having been relentlessly pursued by the 
Demonic Cultivators. How about we allow them to rest for now? We can 
discuss matters once they’ve had enough time to recover.” 

Feenix nodded in agreement, and together, they entered the Tall residence. 
Prior to their arrival, Quinley had already made the necessary lodging 
arrangements for them. 

Once everyone had settled in, Quinley sought out Kai and said, “Kai, my 
brother would like to meet you. Please come with me.” 
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Kai followed Quinley over when he heard that Mason, the head of the Tall 
family, wanted to see him. He wanted to meet Mason in person too. Kai was 
not very sure about Mason as a person for now. 

If Mason was an evil man who even colluded with Demonic Cultivators, then it 
would be dangerous for them to live in the Tall residence. Soon, Quinley 
brought Kai to the living room. 

Kai saw a middle-aged man sitting in the main seat. He knew that the latter 
must be Mason, the head of the Tall family, while the person sitting beside 
Mason was Jerison. 

When Jerison saw Kai, he stood up and greeted him politely. After all, if it 
wasn’t for Kai, Jerison could have died in the Demonic Cultivators’ trap, and 
Jerison was well aware of this fact. Mason also got up and welcomed Kai 
when he saw him.. 



“Mr. Chance, thank you so much for saving not only Quinn but also Jerison! I 
don’t know how to repay your kindness to us.” 

Mason didn’t put on airs like how a head of a family usually would. Instead, he 
was nice and polite. Kai was very comfortable with such a first impression. 

He flashed a faint smile and said, “Don’t worry about that, Mr. Mason. We 
can’t avoid running into problems out there, and it’s normal for us cultivators to 
help each other!” 

“Mr. Chance, please have a seat!” 

Mason gestured for Kai to take a seat before he returned to his own 
seat. Then, he clapped his hands once and somebody entered with a very 
exquisite bronze plate. There was a crystal clear ice soul fragment shining on 
the plate. 

Mason said sincerely, “Mr. Chance, you should know that there are many ice 
soul fragments in the far north. However, it’s not easy to find them. The ice 
soul fragment is very helpful for cultivation as well as for recovering spiritual 
energy. I don’t have much to repay your kindness for saving my brother and 
sister, so I can only gift you with an ice soul fragment. I hope you like it…” 

Kai was a little shocked as he stared at the ice soul fragment. He did not 
expect Mason to give him such a precious item. 

“Mr. Mason, this is too precious! I can’t possibly accept that! Also, Ms. Tall 
saved two of my friends and even allowed them to stay here peacefully. I am 
very grateful for that too!” Kai was very grateful that Quinley had saved Feenix 
and Aislin and had even given them a place to stay. 

“Mr. Chance, I heard that the two girls are your good friends. My incompetent 
brother almost made a huge mistake! I have already taught him a lesson. Mr. 
Chance, please accept this ice soul fragment,” Mason said. 

Seeing that Mason was so persistent, Kai had no choice but to keep the ice 
soul fragment. 

Mason smiled when he saw Kai accepting it. Then, he waved his hand and 
said, “Quinn, Jerison, leave us. I need to discuss something with Mr. Chance.” 



Quinley and Jerison nodded and left. Kai’s face was full of confusion as he 
didn’t know what Mason wanted to talk to him about. After Quinley and 
Jerison left, Mason suddenly enveloped Kai with his aura. 

Kai did not expect Mason to make a move against him. He frowned, and the 
Power of Three in his body erupted instantly. Then, a strong spiritual sense 
tried to enter Kai’s body forcefully, seemingly trying to find out Kai’s every 
secret. 

Just when the spiritual sense was about to enter Kai’s body, he released his 
own spiritual sense from his huge consciousness field, trying to devour or 
destroy the foreign spiritual sense that was trying to enter his body. 
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Kai’s consciousness field was huge but Mason’s spiritual sense was oddly 
strong. There was still a huge gap between their powers. 

Soon, Kai couldn’t hold on anymore. Mason’s spiritual sense entered his body 
and successfully retrieved the secret of Kai’s body from his consciousness 
field. 

Just when Mason’s spiritual sense was about to find out more in Kai’s 
consciousness field, the Golden Tome suddenly moved. A ray of golden light 
shone from it. The speed of the light was very fast, and it had a strange aura. 

At once, Mason’s spiritual sense was crushed. The restraining aura 
surrounding Kai immediately disappeared. Mason looked pale and there was 
even a streak of blood on the corner of his lips. 

“Mr. Mason, what is this supposed to mean?” Kai stared at Mason coldly as 
he was furious that Mason had suddenly made a move against him. 

“Mr. Chance, please don’t misunderstand me. I just wanted to have a look at 
your body. I did not expect a cultivator like you to have obtained the nascence 
aura when you’re only in Third Level Body Fusion Realm! It’s unbelievable!” 

Mason’s face was filled with shock. 

“Nascence aura?” Kai frowned. “What is that?” Mason was stunned. He 
glanced at Kai and asked, “You’re a cultivator. Don’t you know what a 
nascence aura is?” 



Kai shook his head in response. “I only know that breaking through the realm 
of Tribulator is akin to remodeling one’s entire physical being. One can 
comprehend nascence and reach a new level of understanding of all things. 
After breaking through the realm of Tribulator, one can become a half-
immortal, and as long as one continues to cultivate, one can eventually 
become an immortal. 

Mason nodded and said, “That is correct. You will be able to comprehend 
nascence once you break through the realm of Tribulator, and it is also used 
to confirm the strength of each cultivator after breaking through to this realm. 
However, it’s not just breaking through the realm of Tribulator that one can 
comprehend nascence. 

Some exceptionally gifted individuals can experience nascence aura even 
when they’re in the realm of Tribulator, and this is not surprising. But I have 
never seen anyone with nascence aura in Body Fusion Realm. Yet, you have 
it! Understanding nascence may be easy, but acquiring nascence aura 
requires arduous cultivation. And one must create a nascence space within 
their body, which is akin to a cultivator’s elixir field.” 

Mason tried his best to explain to Kai, but the more he explained, the more 
Kai was confused. 

Kai had never felt that he had nascence aura. It was just that a random ray of 
golden light had shot out from the Golden Tome. However, the aura of that 
golden light was indeed different. 

Seeing that Kai looked confused, Mason knew that he had zero idea what he 
was talking about. “I’ll bring your primordial spirit to my nascence space to 
have a look. Don’t try to resist me anymore. The nascence aura in you is too 
strong. If you attack me, I won’t be able to take it.” 

Mason was indeed a little scared that Kai would release his nascence aura 
again. 

However, Mason didn’t know that it wasn’t. Kai’s nascence aura but the aura 
released by the Golden Tome. Kai couldn’t control it, and it wasn’t something 
he could use whenever he wanted to. 

“Mr. Mason, don’t worry…” 

Kai nodded. 



Mason then waved his hands. 

Buzz! 

Kai could feel a slight tremor in his consciousness field before a ray of light 
shone down on him, enveloping his primordial spirit. In the blink of an eye, Kai 
appeared in the middle of a palace that was completely made of ice. 

 


