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Lin Keting’s words made Chen Ping look at her twice more, wondering what 
her identity was. She was not interested in immortal techniques. 

However, Chen Ping was not very interested either. You know, all the 
techniques he learned were taught by people in the heavens! 

Needless to say, the Condensation Technique was the top technique in the 
heavens! 

Holy Light Fist, various divine patterns, and the Eye of Heaven, which one 
was not a very powerful technique in the heavens! 

Chen Ping didn’t need to learn any techniques according to the records on the 
boulder. If he really wanted to learn, the Red Cloud Demon Lord was much 
better than those immortals! After all, the Red Cloud Demon Lord 

was also a figure in the eighth heaven of the heavens, and he was not 
comparable to ordinary immortals! 

“It’s just some ordinary immortal-level techniques. I’m not interested. Let’s find 
out if there are any other treasures!” 

Chen Ping smiled slightly! 

Chen Ping’s words made Lin Keting slightly stunned. She couldn’t help but 
look at Chen Ping with curiosity in her eyes. This time, she was even more 
curious about Chen Ping’s identity. 

At this time, Chen Ping and Lin Keting were both very curious about each 
other’s identities, but no one had made it clear! 

The two had just met, and they had not yet reached the point of being close 
friends! 

Ji Yun, Zhu Qingxiu and the right blind elder were almost angry to death after 
hearing what Chen Ping and Lin Keting said! 



These two people are not interested in the immortal-level exercises, but it 
does not mean that others are not interested! 

But now that Chen Ping has said it, Ji Yun and Zhu Qingxiu can’t say 
anything! 

“Since you are not interested, don’t waste more time here…” 

Lin Keting said, and started to move forward! 

Chen Ping followed behind him. Although others were reluctant, they could 
only follow! 

Chen Ping stared at Lin Keting, because there was a maze here, so Lin 
Keting was unlikely to get out! 

But who knew that Lin Keting shuttled through the boulder and finally walked 
out of the stone formation! 

Chen Ping’s face was a little surprised. Could it be that Lin Keting was also a 
formation master? 

Did she see the formation in the boulder? 

Chen Ping quickly caught up with Lin Keting and opened his mouth to ask, but 
he didn’t know how to start for a while! 

If he opened his mouth, Chen Ping would reveal that he had discovered a 
maze in the boulder. If Lin Keting asked why Chen Ping didn’t tell him in 
advance, Chen Ping would be very embarrassed! But if he 

didn’t open his mouth, Chen Ping was very curious and wanted to know if Lin 
Keting was a formation master! 

Just when Chen Ping was in a dilemma and didn’t know how to start, Lin 
Keting suddenly stopped and looked at Chen Ping with a playful look on her 
face and said, “Did you find that there was a maze in the boulder?” 

“Ah…” Chen Ping was stunned, then nodded! 



“I’ve seen that you have already found the maze in the boulder. Why don’t you 
tell me? Do you want to wait until I fall into the formation, and then you can 
solve it in front of me?” 

Lin Keting asked Chen Ping so bluntly! 

This time, Chen Ping’s face turned red, and he didn’t know what to do! 

Chen Ping did have that idea. By then, Lin Keting and the others would pay 
attention to him, and he could also show off! 

But now, he failed to show off, but was slapped in the face… 

embarrassing… 

“Miss Lin, are you also a formation master?” 

Chen Ping asked very embarrassedly! 

“Of course I’m not a formation master, I know nothing about formations…” 

Lin Keting shook her head! 

“Ah?” Chen Ping was stunned: “Then you…” 

Chen Ping really wanted to know, how did Lin Keting walk out of the giant 
stone maze without knowing the formation? 

How did she open the formation at the entrance of the battlefield of gods and 
demons without knowing the formation? 

Lin Keting smiled, then spread out her right hand, just let Chen Ping look at 
the rune on her palm, and then continued to move forward with a smile! 

Chen Ping also understood instantly that it was all caused by the rune on Lin 
Keting’s palm! 

But who exactly drew the rune on Lin Keting’s palm, and this rune seemed to 
be omnipotent, it was simply amazing! 
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After walking for a while, the surrounding scenery began to change. The 
originally barren land was now green! 

Mountains began to appear on both sides, as if they suddenly appeared! 

Waves of fresh air came to my face, making me feel much more comfortable! 

In the middle of the mountains, there is a deep canyon. 

At this time, many people were standing at the entrance of the canyon. These 
people seemed to be looking at the things in the valley, but no one 
approached. 

When Chen Ping and his team approached, everyone made way for them. 

Now in this battlefield of gods and demons, everyone has become an ordinary 
person, so they have become restrained. If there is a conflict, a stone may kill 
them. 

These monks have been practicing for many years. If they don’t have spiritual 
power, their real physical strength is probably not as good as that of ordinary 
people. 

After everyone made way, Chen Ping and his team saw that there were three 
stone statues in the middle of the valley. The stone statues were not big, only 
the size of ordinary people. But around the stone statues, there were several 
people lying. These people were motionless, and it was unknown whether 
they were alive or dead. 

These three stone statues look very ordinary, but their faces are hideous and 
their expressions are different, which makes people shudder. 

“What’s going on?” 

Lin Keting asked the people beside him. 



An old man said, “There is something strange about these three stone 
statues. When you get close to them, you will feel uneasy, hallucinations will 
appear, and you will faint. I just fought to the death to retreat.” 

After hearing the old man’s words, Chen Ping and the others realized that the 
people around the stone statues had fainted! 

“Do you see anything wrong?” 

Lin Keting looked at Chen Ping and asked! 

Since Chen Ping knows the art of formation, perhaps these three stone 
statues, like the boulder just now, also have a maze array or something like 
that. 

But Chen Ping shook his head: “I can’t see it, but I can be sure that there is no 
formation around these three stone statues. I don’t know if there are other 
things.” “But 

now everyone is an ordinary person. Even if these three stone statues can 
make people faint, it is estimated that the power is not great…” 

This is Chen Ping’s analysis. Chen Ping himself doesn’t know what it looks 
like. He needs to investigate it. 

Now there is no way to use the divine sense to investigate, and the Heavenly 
Eye cannot be used. The only way is to go closer to see what is going on. 

Hearing Chen Ping say this, Lin Keting walked towards the three stone 
statues. 

“Miss Lin, be careful, or I will go…” 

Chen Ping saw Lin Keting approaching the three stone statues, so he 
reminded her. 

“Don’t worry, you forgot that I have a secret method of self-defense.” 

Lin Keting waved at Chen Ping and then walked over. 



Everyone looked at Lin Keting, and the right blind elder took a step forward 
and blocked in front of Lin Keting: “Miss, you can’t take risks. If anything goes 
wrong, we can’t explain it at all.” 

“I’ll try to see what’s so special about the three statues…” 

“Right blind elder, although you have the sword intent now, you are still an 
ordinary person. You can’t resist that kind of divine sense attack at all.” 

“I have a secret method of self-defense in my hand, nothing will happen…” 

Lin Keting called the right blind elder and walked away without stopping! 

Soon, Lin Keting arrived in front of the three statues, but just as she walked in 
front of them, Lin Keting suddenly felt dizzy, and the space in front of her 
began to distort! 

Then in Lin Keting’s mind, countless illusions flashed, impacting Lin Keting’s 
sea of consciousness! 

Suddenly, Lin Keting felt a black shadow blocking in front of her, and then 
hugged her in his arms! 

“Ms. Lin, are you okay?” 

Chen Ping’s voice rang out! 
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Lin Keting saw Chen Ping, her mind was in a trance, feeling the warmth of 
Chen Ping’s chest and his affectionate eyes, Lin Keting felt that she was 
about to fall. 

She didn’t understand, she just met Chen Ping, why would Chen Ping care 
about her so much. 

“I’m fine…” Lin Keting looked at Chen Ping and smiled slightly. 

Chen Ping looked at Lin Keting and slowly approached. 



Lin Keting’s heartbeat began to accelerate, she knew what Chen Ping was 
going to do, he was going to kiss her. 

Lin Keting wanted to dodge, but found that she couldn’t move at all, her body 
had no strength at all. 

In the end, Lin Keting could only close her eyes and wait for Chen Ping’s kiss. 
At this time, Lin Keting was actually looking forward to it deep in her heart. 

Buzz… 

Suddenly, a golden light emerged from Lin Keting’s palm, accompanied by a 
buzzing sound in the sea of consciousness, and Lin Keting regained 
consciousness. 

She found that Chen Ping didn’t hug her at all, let alone kiss her. 

It was just an illusion just now, and Chen Ping was still watching her from a 
distance. 

Lin Keting didn’t understand why she had such an illusion. Fortunately, no one 
knew about it, otherwise she would be so embarrassed. 

“Damn it, you almost made me look bad…” 

Lin Keting stared at the three statues angrily, and then slapped one of them 
with her palm. 

Bang! 

Lin Keting slapped it, and the statue didn’t move at all. 

Lin Keting then remembered that she had no spiritual power at all, and she 
didn’t have any sword intent. She was able to get rid of the illusion only by 
relying on the runes on her palm. 

However, everyone was very surprised to see that Lin Keting didn’t faint and 
was knocked down by the illusion, but no one dared to approach. 

“Miss, I’ll do it…” 



Seeing this, the right blind elder waved his long sword, and a sword intent 
rose up. 

Boom! 

The sword intent slashed fiercely on the stone statue, and the stone statue 
instantly collapsed. 

After the stone statue collapsed, a dagger was hidden in the stone statue. The 
dagger looked blood red all over, and there was even a bloody smell 
emanating from the dagger. 

“What is this?” 

Lin Keting stretched out her hand to take the dagger, but was stopped by 
Chen Ping with a quick step. 

“Ms. Lin, don’t touch this thing. This dagger has too much evil spirit. Your 
current body can’t bear it at all.” 

Chen Ping sensed the evil spirit on the dagger the moment it appeared. 

If everyone’s strength was not suppressed, the evil spirit on the dagger might 
not cause any harm. 

But now they are all ordinary people, even if a little evil spirit enters the body, 
they can’t bear it. 

Lin Keting looked at Chen Ping, then took her hand back. Now she has trust in 
Chen Ping. 

“Magic dagger, this is a divine weapon of heaven…” 

A middle-aged man in a black robe suddenly shouted excitedly at this 
moment, and then rushed over desperately, trying to take the dagger in his 
hand. 

Seeing this, the Right Blind Elder extended his long sword and directly 
stopped the middle-aged man in black robe, saying coldly: “Damn, this is 
something our eldest lady found, and you dare to touch it?” 



The middle-aged man in black robe was stunned, and then took two steps 
back. They all saw with their own eyes that the Right Blind Elder just broke the 
stone statue with a sword! 

In this place where spiritual power is banned, the Right Blind Elder still has 
such strength, of course he is afraid. 

“Although you broke this stone statue, we found it first. If you say that this 
thing is yours, we will not accept it.” 

The old man who just spoke said. 

He retreated back at the risk of his life, and now there is a magic weapon in 
the stone statue, but they can’t get it. Who will accept it! 

“That’s right, we found the stone statue first…” 

“You opened the entrance magic circle, and we paid the spirit stones to come 
in. It can’t be that everything in here is yours, right?” 

“At most, we can spend spirit stones to buy it, right?” 

Everyone was a little dissatisfied and shouted! 
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If all the treasures encountered along the way were possessed by Lin Keting, 
wouldn’t they have come here in vain? 

Now everyone’s strength is restricted, but the sword intent of the Right Blind 
Elder is not restricted. In this way, no one can be the opponent of the Right 
Blind Elder, and they can only serve as a foil in vain. 

“Shut up, everyone. If you have the ability to get the treasure, ask the sword in 
my hand first.” 

The Right Blind Elder waved his long sword, and everyone shut their mouths 
instantly. 



Although everyone dared not speak under the pressure, they all showed 
dissatisfaction in their eyes! 

“Right Blind Elder, how come you have become so reckless!” 

Lin Keting glared at the Right Blind Elder, and the Right Blind Elder had to 
retreat! 

“Everyone, you are right. This thing does not belong to me, and I can’t bully 
the weak.” 

“I think this is how it is. If anyone wants this dagger, then use the spirit stone 
to exchange it.” 

“Of course, we will share the spirit stone equally, so that everyone can get the 
benefits and not enter here in vain.” 

Lin Keting said! 

Lin Keting’s words instantly made everyone agree with both hands. After all, 
this is the best solution! 

Everyone who sees it will have a share, so no one will have any objections! 

But the middle-aged man in black robe frowned and said, “This girl, if we 
compare spirit stones, I’m afraid none of us can beat you. By then, it will still 
fall into your hands. We can only get some spirit stones.” 

It can be seen that the middle-aged man in black robe likes the magic dagger 
very much, but if he wants to exchange it with spirit stones, I’m afraid that only 
Lin Keting has the most spirit stones here! 

After all, at the entrance, Lin Keting has already collected a lot of spirit stones. 

“Don’t worry about this, I won’t participate. I don’t want this magic dagger…” 

Lin Keting shook his head! 

When he heard that Lin Keting didn’t participate, the middle-aged man in 
black robe’s eyes lit up! 

“Chen Ping, do you want it?” Lin Keting looked at Chen Ping and asked! 



“I don’t want it. I don’t want this kind of magic weapon. The weapon in my 
hand is much better than this magic dagger.” 

Chen Ping also shook his head. 

Whether it is the Dragon Slaying Sword, the Dragon Pattern Bell, or even the 
God King Bow, the power they truly unleash is greater than that of this magic 
dagger! 

Seeing that someone else gave up, the eyes of the middle-aged man in black 
robe became brighter! 

“Everyone, this magic dagger is very important to me, and it has a strong Yin 
Sha Qi. Now everyone is an ordinary person, and I am afraid that they can’t 
withstand this Yin Sha Qi.” 

“But I’m not afraid, so I hope everyone will give this magic dagger to me. I am 
willing to pay 100,000 spirit stones…” 

The middle-aged man in black robe said to everyone very politely! 

He was very afraid that someone would snatch this magic dagger from him. If 
he didn’t have enough spirit stones on him at that time, it would be 
troublesome. 

“One hundred thousand spirit stones? Are you fooling a child here? I’ll pay 
150,000 spirit stones!” 

Someone immediately refuted. After all, the higher the price, the more spirit 
stones everyone would get, so it was impossible for the middle-aged man in 
black robe to take the dagger away so easily! 

“You…” The middle-aged man in black robe frowned. Although he was angry, 
he had no choice but to say, “I will offer 200,000 spirit stones. I hope you…” 

“300,000 spirit stones…” The old man who spoke first spoke. 

“350,000…” 

“400,000…” 

“500,000…” 



Before the middle-aged man in black robe could speak, others began to shout 
for a price increase! The 

middle-aged man in black robe was so angry that he was about to die. His 
expression froze. Many people here were obviously just joking. They didn’t 
really want the magic dagger, but just wanted to raise the price! 

“One million…” 

The middle-aged man in black robe knew that if he continued like this, the 
price would continue to rise endlessly, so he gritted his teeth and shouted out 
a sky-high price of one million spirit stones! 

Sure enough, the shouting out of one million shocked everyone. They looked 
at the middle-aged man in black robe one by one. No one raised the price! 
Seeing that 

no one was raising the price, the middle-aged man in black screen finally 
breathed a sigh of relief! 

Lin Keting glanced at him and said, “If no one raises the price, then the magic 
dagger belongs to this Taoist friend! 
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“Give it to him. He has already offered one million. No one is competing with 
him.” 

“It seems that this guy really likes it. But we can also pick up a lot of spirit 
stones for free, so we are satisfied.” 

“This method is really good. Even if I don’t get any treasure, I am happy. 
Anyway, I can get spirit stones.” 

Everyone was very happy, and no one raised the price! 

“Daoyou, this magic dagger is yours…” 

Lin Keting looked at the middle-aged man in black robe and said! 



The middle-aged man in black robe rushed over with excitement, and then 
grabbed the magic dagger. Feeling the trace of evil spirit in the magic dagger, 
the middle-aged man in black robe was trembling with excitement! 

“Daoyou, now that you have the things, is it time to get the spirit stones? 
Everyone is waiting!” 

Lin Keting asked. 

“I…” 

The middle-aged man in black robe was embarrassed and his expression 
became unnatural! 

Seeing the appearance of the middle-aged man in black robe, Lin Keting 
immediately thought that this guy should not have so many spirit stones, and 
he was just bidding randomly. 

Others also saw this situation, and someone immediately stood up and said, 
“Brother, if you can’t take out the spirit stones, put the things back, otherwise 
don’t blame us for being rude.” 

“That’s right, you don’t have spirit stones, why are you shouting so happily? 
Are you making fun of us? Even if our strength is sealed, one kick per person 
is enough to kill you.” 

“Take out the spirit stones, if you don’t, we will kill you immediately…” 

Everyone was filled with righteous indignation and prepared to attack the 
middle-aged man in black robe. 

After all, this is related to the interests of everyone. If the middle-aged man in 
black robe doesn’t take out the spirit stones, Lin Keting agrees, and others will 
not agree. 

This is the bondage of interests, which shows that Lin Keting also has some 
means. 

“No, don’t worry, I didn’t say I won’t take the spirit stones.” 

The middle-aged man in black robe was also scared when he saw the angry 
look of the crowd. If he was beaten up by these people, he might lose his life. 



“Everyone, I only have 500,000 spirit stones on me, but I can lend them.” 

After the black-robed middle-aged man finished speaking, he looked at Lin 
Keting and said, “Miss, I will borrow 500,000 spirit stones from you. I will 
return them to you as soon as I leave here.” 

“You and I are not related, and I don’t know you. Why should I lend you spirit 
stones? If you run away, who can I find?” 

Lin Keting looked at the black-robed middle-aged man and said, feeling very 
ridiculous. 

“No, I will never run away. I can hand over a wisp of my soul to you. If I run 
away without returning the spirit stones, you can completely destroy my soul.” 

The black-robed middle-aged man actually proposed to borrow spirit stones 
with his soul. 

This decision shocked many people. You must know that in the eyes of all 
cultivators, the soul is life. If you hand over your soul to someone else, it is 
equivalent to letting someone else control your life. 

Now this black-robed middle-aged man is actually going to use his soul to 
borrow spirit stones. It seems that he really intends to return the spirit stones. 

Lin Keting looked at the black-robed middle-aged man, so she nodded and 
said, “Okay, I’ll lend you 500,000 spirit stones.” 

After that, Lin Keting threw out a storage bag with 500,000 spirit stones in it. 

The black-robed middle-aged man put his own spirit stones and the spirit 
stones given by Lin Keting together, and then put them directly on the ground. 

Lin Keting distributed the one million spirit stones according to the number of 
people on the scene. 

These people took the spirit stones they picked up for free, and laughed and 
laughed. 

The black-robed middle-aged man stretched out his palm and slowly 
approached his sea of consciousness, intending to extract a wisp of life soul 
for Lin Keting. 



“No need to mortgage the life soul, I believe you, you will return these 500,000 
spirit stones.” 

Lin Keting stopped the black-robed middle-aged man. 

The black-robed middle-aged man was slightly stunned, then looked at Lin 
Keting gratefully and said, “Thank you, young lady, I will definitely return it 
double every day.” After the black-robed middle 

-aged man finished speaking, he stood up and walked back, leaving the 
battlefield of gods and demons. 

Now that you have obtained the magic weapon you want, there is no point in 
staying in the battlefield of gods and demons. If you end up losing the magic 
weapon, it would be a waste of time. 
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“Miss, do you trust him so much? You should know that he is a demon 
cultivator, and you just met by chance. You don’t even know his identity.” 

“If he doesn’t return your spirit stones, where will you find him?” 

Among the crowd, the old man asked Lin Keting in confusion. 

But who would have thought that Lin Ke Ting smiled and said: “If he dares not 
to return the spirit stone, there will be no place for him to stay in the entire 
heaven and human world. Even if he goes to heaven and earth or the sea, I 
will find a way to catch him.” 

Lin Keting is extremely confident. This confidence is not something she 
pretends to have, but is innate. 

From this, we can also infer the identity and power behind Lin Keting, which is 
absolutely terrifying! 

“Everyone, since this first stone statue contains a magical weapon, it is 
estimated that there must be good things in the other stone statues. Now let’s 



open them and take a look. No one is allowed to fight over them. The rules 
are still the same.” 

Lin Keting said to everyone! 

Everyone nodded. Who would dare to fight for it? The blind elder on the right 
was holding a sword, watching intently from the side. He was ready to kill 
anyone who made any unusual movement with his sword! 

Seeing that everyone agreed, Lin Keting looked at the blind elder You and 
said, “Blind Elder You, you…” 

“Let me do it this time…” 

Chen Ping didn’t wait for Lin Keting to finish speaking and just stood up! 

He also wanted to try out his sword power to see if he could cut the stone 
statue in front of him. 

Lin Keting nodded, then waved her hand to let the right blind elder retreat! 

Chen Ping held the Dragon-Slaying Sword, but he didn’t know how to unleash 
the sword’s power. When he killed those sand scorpions, he also acted based 
on his feelings! 

If Chen Ping tried to use sword power now, he might not be able to do so. 

Chen Ping stared at the stone statue intently and suddenly slashed with his 
sword! 

“cut……” 

Accompanied by Chen Ping’s roar, the Dragon-Slaying Sword slashed fiercely 
on the stone statue! 

The head of the statue was smashed directly, but the body of the statue was 
not damaged at all. 

Just now, Chen Ping just used brute force and hit the stone statue directly. 

He did not display the sword intent. 



However, it is quite amazing that he was able to smash the statue’s head with 
brute force alone. 

“Boy, you can’t use the sword intent?” 

Seeing this, the blind elder on the right asked with a hint of sarcasm. 

Chen Ping did not say anything, but chopped at the stone statue with the 
Dragon-Slaying Sword again. 

Ding ding ding…… 

Chen Ping swung his sword several times in a row, and although the stone 
statue was finally chopped into pieces, it was not done by the sword intent or 
a single sword strike. Instead, it was done by Chen Ping using brute force to 
smash it open! 

If the Dragon-Slaying Sword was not a magical weapon, the sword in his hand 
would probably have been damaged if the stone statue had been smashed in 
this way. 

The stone statue was broken into pieces, revealing a battle axe inside, 
gleaming with a cold light. 

Lin Keting sold the battle axe in the same way, and of course the spirit stones 
were divided equally among everyone! 

Chen Ping was holding the Dragon-Slaying Sword, but his mood was not very 
high. He didn’t understand why he suddenly couldn’t use his sword power? 

“Senior, what exactly is that sword intent?” 

Chen Ping could only ask Demon Lord Chiyun to see if he understood. 

“Don’t ask me, how would I know that stuff? I can’t use it either. Who can seal 
my strength?” 

Demon Lord Chiyun quickly shook his head! 

But what he said was true. If the strength was still there and not sealed, there 
would be no need for sword intent. 



Things like sword intent are probably used most in the secular world. After all, 
they are just ordinary people and have no spiritual power to assist them. They 
can only rely on practicing sword intent to improve their strength. 

It should be a state similar to the unity of man and sword. 

While Chen Ping was pondering the sword intent, the third stone statue was 
also opened by the right blind elder, and the things inside were also sold. 

Chen Ping did nothing, and by the time he realized what was happening, he 
had already earned hundreds of thousands of spirit stones for nothing. 

However, Chen Ping didn’t seem happy either. After all, what he had done just 
now was a bit embarrassing. 
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“Still thinking about the sword?” 

Lin Keting saw what Chen Ping was thinking and asked. 

Chen Ping nodded: “What exactly is that sword intent?” 

“I don’t know. I haven’t cultivated the sword intent yet.” Lin Keting waved her 
hands quickly. 

The blind elder on the right smiled and said, “Boy, the sword’s meaning can 
only be understood but not explained. I’ll give you another sword strike to see 
if you can comprehend the mystery. That’s your own business.” 

As the blind elder on the right said this, he raised the sword in his hand and 
was about to chop it out! 

But before he could make a move, the sword in the Right Blind Elder’s hand 
began to shake violently, which made the Right Blind Elder’s face change 
suddenly. 

“Right Blind Elder, what’s wrong?” 



Lin Keting asked hurriedly. 

“Miss, Blind Zuo must be in danger outside.” 

The blind elder on the right said. 

“Danger?” Lin Keting frowned slightly: “Has he gotten into trouble again? Go 
out and check immediately, and try to stop him from getting into trouble 
again.” 

“Miss, what are you going to do?” asked the blind elder on the right. 

“Don’t worry, he’s still here, and I have something to save my life, so I’ll be 
fine.” 

Lin Keting pointed at Chen Ping and said. 

The right blind elder glanced at Chen Ping, and then said: “Boy, you must 
protect our young lady. If our young lady gets into trouble, there will be no 
place for you in the entire heavenly world.” 

After saying that, the Blind Elder You quickly ran towards the entrance of the 
battlefield of gods and demons! 

Chen Ping was speechless. What had he done to offend anyone? Why did he 
suddenly have to take responsibility? 

Seeing Chen Ping’s expression, Lin Keting smiled and said, “Don’t worry, he 
is just trying to scare you. Nothing will happen to me. Even if something 
happens to me, it has nothing to do with you.” 

“As long as I’m here, nothing will happen to any of you.” 

Chen Ping patted his chest and started bragging. 

When everyone heard what Chen Ping said, they all expressed their desire to 
follow him. They had all seen how Chen Ping had just used his sword to 
smash the stone statue into pieces! 

Even without spiritual power, Chen Ping still has such strong physical 
strength. If there is any danger, Chen Ping will still be able to block it. 



So everyone chose to follow. The main reason was that even if they couldn’t 
get the treasure, they could at least get spirit stones, so it was not a loss at all. 
These people were very good at calculating. 

Lin Keting accepted everyone who came and then set off with everyone. 

………… 

Outside the battlefield of gods and demons! 

Elder Zuo Xia was fighting with Tiansha and Tianluo, and the battle was hard 
to resolve. 

Among the several monks wielding swords, four of them had already fallen to 
the ground seriously injured, their lives unknown. But even so, none of the 
monks wielding swords retreated! 

Elder Zuo Xia was also furious, and the sword in his hand kept attacking like 
thunder! 

But with the cooperation of Tiansha and Tianluo, Elder Zuo Xia still fell into a 
disadvantage! 

Blood had already begun to flow from his left arm; Elder Zuo Xia was injured! 

“Damn it, I don’t know if Blind Right received my message. If he doesn’t come 
to help, I will probably run away, or I will really die in the hands of these two 
little bastards.” 

The Left Blind Elder prayed in his heart, hoping that the Right Blind Elder 
received his message! 

Although he thought so in his heart, there was no fear on the face of the blind 
elder Zuo, and he continued to shout and curse stubbornly! 

You can be timid in your heart, but you must not be timid in your momentum! 

“You’re such a hard-mouthed old man! We’ll tear your mouth to pieces and 
see how you can still yell and curse.” 

Tianluo was already pissed to death! 



Just fight if you want to. After fighting for a long time, all eight generations of 
my ancestors have been scolded by the blind elder Zuo. It’s so infuriating. 

“You little bastard, you still want to tear my mouth apart, but don’t you realize 
what kind of person you are?” 

“I cursed your eight generations of ancestors. Your ancestors have 
accumulated merits. Do you think I curse everyone?” 

Elder Zuo Xia floated in the air with a sword in his hand and sneered at Tian 
Luo. 

“Fuck you…” 

Tianluo was going crazy, and he rushed towards Elder Zuo with a sword in 
hand, his speed was extremely fast, it seemed that he was furious. 
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Seeing this, Tiansha also rushed forward with his sword, and the two of them 
went straight towards Elder Zuo Xia. 

Elder Zuo Xia frowned slightly. If the fight continued, he would definitely be 
defeated. 

But if I turn around and run away now, I would lose face. 

Just when Elder Zuo Xia didn’t know whether to fight or flee, a figure suddenly 
appeared. 

“Who are you? How dare you attack Blind Zuo?” 

The right blind elder waved his palm, forcing Tianluo and Tiansha to retreat 
and asked. 

When Tianluo Tiansha saw that the Left Blind Elder had come to help, he 
hurriedly stepped back and looked at the Right Blind Elder. 



When the Left Blind Elder saw the Right Blind Elder coming, all his thoughts of 
running away were swept away. He immediately pointed at Tian Luo and said 
arrogantly: “Grandson, don’t you want to tear my mouth apart?” 

“Grandpa is standing here motionless. If you have the guts, come over here. 
Come, come, come…” 

Elder Zuo Xia hooked his finger at Tian Luo, with a strong sense of 
provocation. 

“Blind Zuo, stop messing around with cats and dogs and causing trouble. The 
eldest lady has told me not to cause trouble.” 

When the right blind elder saw the look on the left blind elder’s face, he was 
also furious. This guy was too troublesome. 

“Blind Right, I didn’t cause any trouble. These two grandsons are from the 
Demon Sealing Alliance and they injured the young lady’s guards. Can you 
spare them?” 

Said the blind elder Zuo. 

“What? Someone from the Demon Sealing League?” 

“Fuck him…” 

The right blind elder jumped up, grabbed something out of thin air, and with a 
magic sword in his hand, he attacked Tiansha and Tianluo. 

Elder Zuo Xia chuckled and rushed forward as well. 

Tiansha and Tianluo were confused. They didn’t understand why these two 
guys hated the Demon Sealing Alliance so much? 

They originally wanted to use the Demon Sealing Alliance to scare the other 
party, but now, they have directly angered the other party! 

Upon seeing this, Tiansha quickly took out the jade slip for transmitting sound 
and began to call for help. 

He knew that the two of them were definitely no match for each other. 



Tianluo and Tiansha retreated while fighting and didn’t want to fight anymore. 

But the Left Blind Elder and the Right Blind Elder were like dog-skin plasters, 
tightly clinging to the two men. 

The melee continues. 

………… 

In the battlefield of gods and demons! 

In the battlefield of gods and demons! 

Chen Ping followed Lin Keting and everyone else and continued to move 
forward in the battlefield of gods and demons! 

After passing through the valley, everyone saw a vast expanse of white before 
their eyes, an endless snowfield appeared. 

Seeing this scene, everyone frowned! 

It hasn’t been long since I came here, but I’ve already experienced several 
regional landscapes. 

“Could these be illusions? Our powers are sealed now. Even if it’s just a small 
illusion, I’m afraid we won’t be able to break free and will be trapped inside.” 

“How is it possible that such a small ruins could contain several different 
regional landscapes?” 

The old man in the crowd said with some confusion. 

“This is not an illusion!” Chen Ping shook his head. 

“How do you know it’s not an illusion?” 

The old man looked at Chen Ping in surprise. 

“Because I am a formation master. Even if I have no spiritual power, ordinary 
formations cannot escape my eyes.” 

Chen Ping said truthfully. 



“Formation Master?” 

Everyone was very surprised to hear that Chen Ping was a formation master. 

After all, in the world of heaven and man, formation masters are very rare. 

“Look, there are footprints on the snow. Could it be that someone has been 
here before?” 

At this time, someone shouted. 

Everyone hurried over and found a row of footprints on the snow. However, 
the footprints were very shallow, probably because they had been there for a 
long time and were partially buried by the accumulated snow. 

“The footprints are no longer clear. It looks like someone has been here a long 
time ago. I’m afraid it will be difficult for us to find the treasure now.” 

The old man sighed, his face full of disappointment! 

If someone enters in advance, the treasures will be taken away by the other 
party. 

When the others heard this, they were also extremely disappointed. 

“That’s not necessarily true. Didn’t we just get three magic weapons from the 
stone statue? Even if someone came in, it’s impossible for them to take away 
all the treasures.” 

Lin Keting hurriedly comforted her. 
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“Miss Lin is right. Even if someone enters, it is impossible to find all the 
treasures. Let’s not lose heart.” 

Chen Ping also encouraged everyone! 



“Yes, we should not be discouraged. Now that we are here, we should 
continue searching!” 

Someone agreed with Chen Ping and Lin Keting! 

Soon everyone’s fighting spirit was restored, and a group of people stepped 
on the snow and stepped into the vast snowfield! 

Because they had no spiritual power, everyone walked very slowly and with 
great difficulty in the snow! 

However, it had no effect on Chen Ping. 

The biting cold wind made many people shiver all over. A cultivator in the 
Tribulation Realm was unable to withstand the severe cold. No one would 
believe it if they told others about it, but this was the case here. 

They all became ordinary people, relying solely on body heat and clothes to 
resist the cold wind, which was indeed very difficult. 

Even Zhu Qingxiu, a Mahayana cultivator, had his arms folded across his 
chest, his body trembling slightly. 

“Put it on…” 

Chen Ping took off his coat and handed it to Zhu Qingxiu. 

Even if he took off all his clothes, Chen Ping’s body could withstand the 
severe cold. 

Zhu Qingxiu glanced at Chen Ping and did not refuse. Instead, he took the 
clothes and put them on. 

“I didn’t realize you were so kind to women. I’m a girl too, why don’t you let me 
wear it?” 

Lin Keting walked up to Chen Ping and asked jokingly. 

Chen Ping glanced at Lin Keting, smiled slightly and said, “You are not cold. If 
you are cold, I can give you my pants to wear.” 

As Chen Ping said this, he actually wanted to take off his pants. 



“Stop it, who is wearing your pants? Taking off your pants in front of girls, how 
shameless!” 

Lin Keting rolled her eyes at Chen Ping, turned around and quickened her 
pace! 

Chen Ping smiled faintly. Of course he couldn’t really take off his pants. He 
was just teasing Lin Keting. 

Lin Keting is very powerful, and the power behind her is terrifying, but she is 
like a blank sheet of paper and obviously has very little experience in society. 

After walking for a distance, several harsh sounds were heard from above. 

Chen Ping looked up and found two large birds circling in the sky. Both birds 
had white feathers and their heads were blood red. 

The cry sounded a little scary, a little harsh and very unpleasant. 

Seeing these two birds, many people became nervous. 

It would be dangerous if these two birds attacked them. Now they are all 
ordinary people, who can deal with these two big birds? 

“Everyone, don’t be too nervous. These are white-feathered crows. They 
won’t attack us if we don’t provoke them.” 

“Besides, these white-feathered crows are very friendly to people. Just give 
them some food.” 

Lin Keting said. 

Chen Ping looked at Lin Ke Ting with a face full of confusion. He didn’t 
understand how Lin Ke Ting knew so much about the battlefield of gods and 
demons? 

Considering the footprints just now, someone had entered before. Could it be 
that Lin Keting had been here? 

But if you’ve been there once, why would you want to do it again? 



Chen Ping was a little puzzled, but at this time Lin Keting took out a spirit 
stone and threw it hard. The two white-feathered crows screamed and started 
fighting for it. Then one of the white-feathered crows swallowed the spirit 
stone in one gulp. 

“This kind of bird actually eats spirit stones?” 

Chen Ping was very surprised! 

Lin Keting ignored Chen Ping and continued throwing spirit stones into the air. 

Two white-feathered crows were circling above Lin Keting’s head, shouting 
excitedly. 

Soon, Lin Keting no longer threw the spirit stone into the air, but threw it 
directly on the snow. 

Two white-feathered crows also fluttered their wings and landed, pecking at 
the ground. 

Lin Keting walked forward slowly and gently stroked the feathers of the white-
feathered crow. The white-feathered crow did not dodge and was indeed very 
close to humans. 

Seeing this, Chen Ping also wanted to touch the white-feathered crow. 

“Don’t touch them. You need to feed them spirit stones before touching them, 
otherwise they will think you are an attacker.” 

Lin Keting reminded Chen Ping. 
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Chen Ping paused slightly, but did not feed the White-Feathered Crow the 
spirit stone. Instead, he continued to approach the White-Feathered Crow. 

Seeing that Chen Ping didn’t listen to her, Lin Keting said angrily: “You guy, I 
reminded you but you didn’t listen. The White Feathered Crow will attack you 
soon, don’t cry…” 



Chen Ping just smiled and continued to move closer to the white-feathered 
crow. 

When they were only a few meters away from the white-feathered crows, the 
two white-feathered crows became alert and stared at Chen Ping intently. If 
Chen Ping got closer, they would attack. 

Lin Keting was watching from the side. She wanted to see how Chen Ping 
would be attacked by Bai Yuwu. It was because of this guy’s disobedience! 

But just as Chen Ping was getting closer and closer to the White-Feathered 
Crow, the aura of the dragon blood on his body began to slowly emanate. 

Although all the powers in Chen Ping’s body were suppressed, his own blood 
aura could not be suppressed! 

As the aura of dragon blood spread, the two white-feathered crows instantly 
went from being alert to being terrified, and their bodies were shaking slightly! 

Chen Ping approached the White Feather Crow, then reached out and began 
to stroke it. The White Feather King was as docile as a little lamb and didn’t 
dare to move! 

No matter which of the two white-feathered crows Chen Ping touched, they 
didn’t dare to move! 

At this moment, Lin Keting was completely confused. She didn’t understand 
how Chen Ping did it! 

When the others saw that Chen Ping did not feed the spirit stones, and the 
White-Feathered Crow allowed himself to be stroked, they also wanted to try 
it! 

But just as he got close, the White-Feathered Crow chirped and attacked, 
scaring the monk so much that he ran away! 

“return……” 

Chen Ping shouted, and the White-Feathered Crow that had launched the 
attack was actually very obedient. It stopped attacking, turned around and 
walked back. 



At this point, everyone else was also confused. They didn’t understand why 
these two white-feathered crows would listen to Chen Ping? 

Amidst everyone’s confusion, Chen Ping simply rode on a white-feathered 
crow, and then gave a gentle call, and the white-feathered crow instantly flew 
into the air! 

Sitting on the White Feathered Crow, Chen Ping could see higher and farther. 

Lin Keting looked at the white-feathered crow carrying Chen Ping in shock, 
and her desire to win was aroused in her heart, so she went towards the other 
white-feathered crow. 

She also wanted to ride on the White Feather Crow and let it carry her into the 
sky. 

But Lin Keting tried several times, but was thrown off by Bai Yuwu every time. 

“You big bird, I fed you so many spirit stones, why do you only let me touch 
you and not ride you?” 

Lin Keting stared at the white-feathered crow and yelled angrily. 

“Let her ride…” 

Chen Ping shouted to the white-feathered crow on the ground in mid-air. 

After hearing Chen Ping’s call, the white-feathered crow slowly lay down and 
let Lin Keting ride on him! 

Two white-feathered crows carried Chen Ping and Lin Keting and soared in 
the air! 

Everyone was watching from below with envy. 

If their strength was not suppressed, they would all be able to fly in the air, 
and there is nothing to envy. 

But in this battlefield of gods and demons, everyone’s strength was 
suppressed. Not to mention flying, even walking for a long time would make 
one tired. 



Lin Keting sat on the White Feather Crow, looked at Chen Ping and asked, 
“What’s wrong with you? Why does this White Feather Crow listen to you?” 

“How would I know? Maybe he sees me as someone who is closer to him.” 

Chen Ping then replied! 

There was no way he could tell Lin Keting about his dragon bloodline. 

“Nonsense.” Lin Keting rolled her eyes at Chen Ping. 

“Then tell me, why do you seem to know everything about the God and 
Demon Battlefield? You even know the personalities of these White-
Feathered Crows.” 

“Have you entered this battlefield of gods and demons before? Who are you?” 

Chen Ping looked at Lin Keting and questioned. 

He was really curious about Lin Keting’s identity. 

“I won’t tell you…” 

Lin Keting smiled, then rushed forward on the Baiyuwu! 

 


