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Chapter 776 A Severed Hand

Hayden’s eyes widened as he watched Kai’s transformation. He had
never seen such an unusual occurrence!

Suddenly, a loud buzzing sound rang out as the Divine Cauldron in Kai’s

arms flew into the air and gradually grew into a bronze cauldron that was
as tall as a person.

There seemed to be something burning inside the bronze cauldron as it
kept emitting wisps of white smoke that Kai’s body quickly absorbed.
However, it was no ordinary smoke but spiritual energy. Spiritual energy
was rising from inside the cauldron!
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When Kai first got his hands on the cauldron, he did not detect any traces
of spiritual energy on it. However, the cauldron was brimming over with
it now, and the spiritual energy was quickly absorbed by Kai.

In truth, the Divine Cauldron was an ancient divine tool used to brew
countless extraordinary pills and miraculous elixirs. Hence, it was
unsurprising that it contained spiritual energy.
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As Hayden watched the scene unfold, he could not help furrowing his
brows. I didn’t expect him to have so many magical items.

He turned to Curtis and said, “If you help me kill this guy, I’ll let you
have your pick of one of the magical items later.”



Hayden had used up most of his martial energy during the fight earlier.
He thought he could surely finish Kai off, not anticipating the sudden
turn of events.

I can’t figure out what other magical item Kai possesses. I’ve practically
depleted my martial energy, yet he’s still alive and well before me. I need
to team up with Curtis and get rid of him once and for all…
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“Sure!” Curtis responded.

Then, he swung his sword through the air, unleashing a wave of lethal
intent that transformed into chains and bound themselves tightly around
Kai.
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At the same time, Hayden seized the opportunity to cast a dark web over
them again with a wave of his hands to prevent Kai from escaping.

Despite being thus restrained, Kai neither struggled nor attempted to
break free. Instead, he merely continued absorbing the spiritual energy
greedily from the Divine Cauldron.

The Dragonslayer Sword in his hand buzzed loudly as it, too, was
absorbing the spiritual energy ravenously.

Seeing that Kai did not even struggle despite being bound by chains,
Curtis raised his sword and charged toward him. “It’s time for you to
meet your end!”



Even so, Kai appeared not to notice Hayden’s impending attack. As he
directed all of his concentration into executing the Focus Technique, he
started regaining his elixir field’s spiritual energy at top speed.

His body also slowly began recovering, and his bare skin radiated a faint
golden glow.

Clang!

Advertisement

Curtis had attempted to pierce Kai’s chest with his sword, but all he heard
was a loud, crisp ringing in the air as if it had struck a piece of iron.

Stunned, he gathered his energy and attacked again with even more
force.

Swoosh!

The Sword of Evil pierced through Kai’s skin, and droplets of blood
began running down the blade.

Curtis burst into maniacal laughter when he saw that Kai was injured. He
declared gleefully, “No matter how strong you are, you’re still no match
for my sword!”

Since Kai appeared well and truly restrained, Curtis did not think that the
former had any chance of defending himself. Hence, he lowered his
guard and planned to attack again with even more force.

Whoosh!



Just as he was preparing to attack, the cold glint of a blade flashed before
his eyes.

Shocked, he slowly lowered his gaze to discover that his hand that had
been wielding the Sword of Evil was now cleanly severed at the wrist.

A crimson river of warm blood flowed from the wound.

“Argh!”

The excruciating pain finally hit Curtis a few seconds later, and he let out
an anguished cry.

Despite being restrained, Kai had already achieved oneness with his
Dragonslayer Sword. Controlling it with his mind, he used it to sever
Curtis’ hand.

Chapter 777 Fight To The Death

Hayden’s face fell when he saw that Kai had cut off Curtis’ hand. If this
goes on, we might really fail to kill him.

As that possibility crossed his mind, Hayden suddenly seemed to vanish
from where he stood and appeared in front of Kai, catching the latter off
guard. Kai wanted to try and break free from his restraints, but Hayden
had already delivered a blow right in the middle of his chest.

The blow sent Kai flying backward. He finally succeeded in freeing
himself from the chains in mid-air before falling heavily to the ground.
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That time, he could not stop himself from coughing up a mouthful of

blood.



Glancing down at his chest, he saw that it had caved in from the blow.
An imprint of a palm was also clearly visible.

“You’re a stubborn one…” Hayden muttered when he saw that Kai still
was not dead yet. He raised his arm high and leaped toward Kai, aiming
directly for the latter’s head.

Just then, the big web that covered them suddenly disappeared. At the
same time, Hayden felt himself getting thrown back as if something had
slammed into his body.

“Who’s there?” he demanded, startled.

Whoever it was, that person had to be highly skilled to force Hayden to
retreat while remaining hidden.

“Mr. Xuereb, would you be so kind as to show this old man some respect

and leave with your men?”

At that moment, an elderly man walked forward slowly while a young
man followed behind him.
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The older man with the dignified air was the elder of the Medicine God
Sect, Axton Knox, and the young man beside him was Donald Yorkson.

Hayden’s gaze hardened. “Who are you?Why should I show you respect

and do as you say?”

He did not recognize the duo standing before him.

“I’m Axton Knox, an elder from the Medicine God Sect. Therefore, I
hope you’ll consider taking my advice,” Axton replied slowly.



The expression on Hayden’s face shifted instantly at the mention of the
Medicine God Sect.

“Mr. Knox, this b*stard murdered my son. I’m merely avenging my

son’s death, so why are you siding with him?”

Despite his question, Hayden’s tone was much less harsh than before.

“This man is an honored guest of the Medicine God Sect. So, of course,
I’d help him. You’re the leader of the Empyrean Sect, yet your son
dabbles in black magic and has been the ruin of many young ladies. As
his father, don’t tell me you were oblivious to what he was doing! I’d say
Mr. Chance did everyone a favor by taking your son’s life,” Axton said
as he gestured toward Kai. It seemed as if he knew all about Carlos’

cultivation of black magic.

“You…” Hayden’s face flushed scarlet before turning pale, and he turned
to glare at Kai furiously. “I’m definitely going to kill him today and

avenge my son’s death. After that, I’ll give the Medicine God Sect a
lavish gift to apologize for my actions.”

With that, Hayden released a burst of martial energy that made a loud
whistling noise as it sped toward Kai.

Since Kai was on the verge of dying, there was no way Hayden would let
such an opportunity slip through his fingers.

Axton’s expression turned icy when he saw that Hayden still had the guts
to take action in his presence.

“You dare to go against the Medicine God Sect?”



As Axton spoke, he flicked his hand and enveloped Hayden in an
invisible aura. When Hayden’s martial energy came into contact with the

invisible aura, it dissipated without a trace.

Hayden gritted his teeth and bellowed, “Fall in!”

At his command, the men he brought shifted into a triangular formation
while brandishing their blades.

“Mr. Knox, I must kill Kai today. If you insist on standing in the way,
then I have no choice but to fight to the death!”

It seemed that Hayden was hell-bent on killing Kai.

Axton snorted coldly. “Don’t you know that you’ve almost exhausted all

of your martial energy? Even if you hadn’t, killing you would be as easy
as crushing an ant…”

A quick flick of his hand sent a violent gust of wind sweeping toward
Hayden and his men like a whirlwind.

Although Hayden braced himself and stood his ground, the strong gale
knocked his men off their feet.

By the time it subsided, Hayden’s face was deathly pale. He opened his
mouth, and a mouthful of blood spewed out at once.

Chapter 778 A Grave Mistake

Axton gazed at Hayden and uttered calmly, “Leave. If you continue to
persist, I won’t show mercy…”

Infuriated, Hayden glowered at Kai and hissed through clenched teeth,
“Consider yourself lucky today. Sooner or later, I’ll kill you…”



With that, Hayden turned to leave.
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When the injured Curtis saw that, he quickly hurried after Hayden.

However, Kai stepped forward and blocked his path, saying, “Don’t even
think about leaving…”

“W-What are you going to do?” Curtis was so terrified that he shook like
a leaf. Now that one of his hands was severed, he was even more
incapable of taking on Kai.

Kai’s eyes glinted coldly. “I’m going to kill you…”

If he hadn’t brought Hayden here, Lyanna wouldn’t have died. It was all
because of him!

Terrified by Kai’s murderous gaze, Curtis quickly turned to Hayden and
pleaded, “Mr. Xuereb, I’m begging you. Please take me with you…”

At that moment, all he could do was pray that Hayden would take him
away from that place.

Alas, Hayden left without so much as a backward glance.
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Curtis sank into despair when he saw Hayden walk off. Left with no
other choice, he cast a pleading look at Kai and begged desperately,
“Please spare me! I’ll give you anything you want! Turcoln has many
magical items—”

Kai fixed him with a menacing glare wordlessly, then swung the
Dragonslayer Sword.



Curtis’ head flew up in the air, then fell to the ground and rolled away
into a far corner.

Kai sheathed his sword, then went over to Axton and said, “Thank you
for coming to my rescue, Mr. Knox.”

“You’re welcome. It was nothing, really,” Axton responded with a faint
smile. As his gaze fell upon the Divine Cauldron, he asked, “Is this
bronze cauldron yours?”

“Oh, yes. A friend gave it to me.” Kai shot a blast of spiritual energy at

the Divine Cauldron as he spoke, and it shrank back to the size of a palm
before flying into his hands.

He did not want Axton to know that it was a Divine Cauldron. After all,
it’s an ancient divine tool used to craft pills. What if he learns what it

really is and wants it for himself? He may have saved my life, but one is
susceptible to a change of heart under great temptation. It’ll be better for
me to be cautious.

After putting away the Divine Cauldron, Kai’s gaze shifted to Lyanna.
He became misty-eyed as he looked down at her body on the ground.

It did not matter whether he had liked her or whether there had been any
feelings between them. The fact that Lyanna had died because of him
pained him deeply.

Kai walked to her side, crouched down, and gently carried her in his arms.
He was planning to give her a proper burial.

“Kai, wait…” Axton called out as he approached Kai.

After checking on Lyanna’s condition, he took out a pill and slipped it
into her mouth.



Then, he said to Kai, “Kai, your friend’s not dead. However, she’s very
close to dying. I’ve given her a longevity pill, so all we can do is hope
that we can get to the Medicine God Sect in time. We’ll be able to save

her once she’s there…”

“What? She’s not dead?” Stunned, Kai quickly transferred a little
spiritual energy into her body.

Soon, he realized that she was indeed alive. Her heart was still beating,
albeit weakly.

Kai broke out in a cold sweat. If it had not been for Axton, Kai would
have buried Lyanna!

Before checking on Lyanna earlier, he had already expended most of his
spiritual energy. Thus, he did not manage to do a thorough check. And I
very nearly made a grave mistake!

“Please lead the way, Mr. Knox…”

Having said that, Kai instructed Tommy, “Start the car.We’re heading to

the Medicine God Sect immediately.”

“The Medicine God Sect don’t allow outsiders to come and go as they
please. It’d be better for you to join me in my car,” Axton explained.

Kai nodded. Not wanting Josephine to worry, he instructed Tommy to
return to Horington with the others and let her know where he had gone.

After that, he carried Lyanna into Axton’s car.With Donald at the wheel,
they made their way swiftly to the Medicine God Sect.

Chapter 779 Join Forces



Meanwhile, Hayden headed straight for Turcoln after leaving Nuthana.
Since Kai had the support of the Medicine God Sect, it would be difficult
for him to kill Kai by solely relying on the Empyrean Sect’s capabilities.
That meant he would not be able to avenge Carlos’ death. Hence, he
planned to join forces with Turcoln to achieve his goal.

Declan seethed with rage when he learned that his favorite disciple had
died at the hands of Kai. I doted on Curtis the most! I have no sons or
daughters of my own, so I taught him everything I knew. I even gave him
the Sword of Evil in hopes that he would take over leadership of Turcoln
someday. But now, he’s dead! All my efforts have been for naught!

Turcoln was well-known in the southwest, and everyone knew its name.
Hence, the news that someone had killed Declan’s favorite disciple
shocked the community to the core. All eyes were on Declan as they
wondered how he would react.
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“Just you wait, Kai Chance. Even if you escape to the ends of the earth,
I’ll rip you to pieces, limb by limb!” Declan roared.

Fury radiated from his entire body as he slammed a fist down onto the
table before him, smashing it to pieces.

The other Turcoln disciples were indignant as well. They had always
gotten away with acting arrogantly in the southwest, and they had never
suffered such humiliation before.

Hayden secretly smirked as he looked at the enraged Declan. He piped up,
“It won’t be that hard to get rid of Kai, Master Naberhaus. He may have
a trick or two up his sleeve and even managed to kill Xander, but it’ll be
easy for me to deal with him. What’s more, you’ll be involved too.
However, he was taken away by some people from the Medicine God



Sect. He’s probably hiding there now, so it’ll be difficult for us to get our
hands on him…”

“So what? Just as a debtor has to clear one’s debts with money, a
murderer like him has to pay for his actions with his life. Even if it’s true
that he has gone into hiding at the Medicine God Sect, I’ll definitely kill
him…”

Declan’s eyes blazed with anger as he spoke. He was so consumed with
rage that he could not care less if Kai was indeed hiding out at the
Medicine God Sect.

“Master Naberhaus, he killed my son, and now he has killed your

favorite disciple. The Empyrean Sect is willing to join forces with
Turcoln to storm the Medicine God Sect and slaughter Kai!” Hayden
declared excitedly.

With both of our forces combined, we’ll be able to rival the Medicine
God Sect’s strength and capabilities. I doubt they’ll risk a confrontation
with us for Kai’s sake.
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Declan nodded. “Excellent. There’s no time to lose, so you should start
making your preparations at once. I’ll round up a few others from the

other clans to come with us and demand for the Medicine God Sect to
hand over Kai.”

He knew full well that the Medicine God Sect was no pushover. Thus, he
thought it’d be wise to get a few more people to join the fray and exert
more pressure on the Medicine God Sect.

Hayden nodded, then hurried off to gather his men.

Meanwhile, Kai and the others had reached the foot of a mountain. The
only way to the Medicine God Sect was through a winding and



treacherous mountain path surrounded by dense woods. There were also
beasts and parasites in the area. Occasionally, a miasma of poisonous
vapors would hang in the air. Hence, few people dared to venture there.

After the others got out of the car, Donald parked the car to one side and
took out a black hood.

In a respectful tone, he said, “Mr. Chance, the Medicine God Sect has a
rule that all outsiders must have their eyes covered before entering…”

With Lyanna still in his arms, Kai nodded. Since the Medicine God Sect
has set such a rule, it won’t do for me to go against it.

In truth, the hood served no purpose because Kai only had to use some

spiritual sense to scope out his surroundings over a radius of tens of
meters. Hence, he did not need his eyes to see.

Chapter 780 Haughty And Prideful

When Donald moved to cover Kai’s head, Axton stopped him. “There’s
no need for him to wear it. Kai is no stranger. Once he familiarizes
himself with the routes, he can always drop by whenever he wishes.”

Upon hearing this, Kai felt touched.

Following Axton’s instructions, Donald tucked the hood away.
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Together, the trio head up the mountain. Throughout their entire journey,
they kept on a small winding path surrounded by the thick foliage of trees.
Despite the wilderness, the trail was clear, indicating that many others
had traversed it before.



To any ordinary person, this journey would have been a treacherous one.
Nevertheless, it was nothing but a walk in the park for Kai and the rest.

It took them one day and one night to arrive at their destination. Midway,
Axton fed Lyanna a longevity pill while Kai constantly supplemented her
with spiritual energy to keep her alive.

“Kai, we’ve reached the Medicine God Sect.” Axton pointed toward the
far distance.

When Kai looked over, a thick layer of fog obscured his vision. But upon
probing the area with his spiritual sense, he immediately sensed a valley
entrance with four guards stationed in front of it.

Even without the guards, no ordinary person could have located this
place unless they had the guidance of someone from the Medicine God
Sect. It was like an oasis hidden from the outside world.

“Indeed, this is an excellent location. Though the mist is quite thick…”

With a flick of his finger, Kai directed a beam of spiritual energy into a

nearby boulder.

Promptly, the rock lit up as the surrounding mist began to fade. In mere
seconds, it had vanished into thin air.
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Without the mist, the entrance to the Medicine God Sect was now in

plain sight. When the stationed guards caught sight of Axton, they
hurried over and knelt respectfully. “Mr. Knox, welcome back,” they
greeted in unison.

Even so, Axton didn’t even spare them a glance. Instead, he was staring
at Kai in astonishment.



“Kai, how did you know where the core of the Medicine God Sect is?”
Aston asked.

“The mist was conjured by a basic concealment array. Usually, all it
takes to remove the arcane array is to locate its core.” Kai shrugged

nonchalantly. “Once its core is exposed, all you have to do is destroy it.”

To Kai, disabling such a basic arcane array was nothing more but child’s
play.

Despite Kai’s calm tone, Axton was still at a loss. Kai truly is a jack of
all trades. Not only is he capable of fighting, but he’s also a master of
alchemy and arcane arrays. He is a genius!

“I established this simple arcane array when I first founded the Medicine
God Sect. Nevertheless, the most we can do with it is activate and
deactivate it at will. I didn’t know that there were such secrets about the

arcane array. I’ll have to learn more from you in the future,” Axton said
in an earnest tone.

“Mr. Knox, you are too kind.” Axton’s praise came as a pleasant surprise
for Kai. After all, Axton Knox was a man who was highly revered and

respected by many. Most individuals in his position would be haughty
and prideful. His humble attitude took Kai wholly by surprise.

Similarly, the four guards glanced at Kai in utter shock. I can’t believe
that Mr. Knox, an elder, just sang such high praises about this young
man.

Despite their surprise, they remained silent. It wasn’t every day that they
got to speak with Axton, or even Donald, as they were merely footguards
in charge of guarding the entrance. Hence, the four guards did not dare to
act out of line.



“Mr. Knox, Mr. Chance, it’s been a long journey. Why don’t we

continue our conversation inside?” Donald suggested,

“That’s right.” Axton bobbed his head in agreement. “Let me summon
the rest for a meeting. We need to figure out a way to heal this young

maiden’s injuries.”

With Lyanna in his embrace, Kai followed Axton and Donald into the
Medicine God Sect.
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