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Married at First Sight Chapter 2384-It didn’t need to be like this, Matriarch 
Farrell had no choice but Kathryn. 

Not long after Kathryn left, Shiloh barged in. 

Matriarch Farrell, who was thinking about the past, frowned when she saw her 
adopted daughter come in, and quickly put on a helpless face, saying to 
Shiloh: “How many times have I said, you have to knock on the door before 
you come in, you always enter with the left ear, out of the right ear.” 

She had cultivated her daughter so hard, but she couldn’t even do the most 
basic manners well. 

It was she who spoiled Shiloh. 

Fortunately, Shiloh was not her own daughter; otherwise, she would die of 
anger when she saw the successor she had spent more than 20 years 
cultivating so unbearably. 

“Mom, I’m sorry, I forgot.” Shiloh immediately turned around and went out, 
closed the door of the office, then knocked on the door again, and got the 
consent of her adoptive mother before she opened the door again and came 
in. 

Soon, she sat down opposite her mother. 

“Mom, Mom, let me ask you something. Has our family received an invitation 
from the York family?” 

Unable to attend Young Master York’s wedding as Hayden’s female 
companion, Shiloh thought of going with her adoptive mother. 

The premise was that the York family wanted to invite the Farrell family. 

Matriarch Farrell: “Got it, how is it?” 

“Mom, let me go with you.” Shiloh said very considerately: “I don’t have to take 
care of the company’s affairs now, let alone the family’s affairs. I have nothing 
to do every day, and I feel flustered. I just happen to accompany you there.” 



Matriarch Farrell looked at her, and said angrily, “Did you touch ashes with 
Young Master Queen?” 

Shiloh: “No, Young Master Queen is a hard bone. I can’t chew it off no matter 
how hard I try. Mom, just take me there. I haven’t attended such a grand 
occasion for a long time.” 

Just by asking, Shiloh knew how grand the wedding was. 

It was no exaggeration to say that it was the most prosperous wedding in 
Wiltspoon. 

The guests were celebrities from all walks of life, not just those from 
Wiltspoon. 

It was a good opportunity to climb up. 

Matriarch Farrell said calmly: “Just now I told Kathryn to take care of the 
company’s affairs. I must leave for a period of time. The shortest is ten or one-
half months, while the longest is one month. Even though Kathryn is my own 
daughter, I won’t take her with me.” 

Shiloh didn’t say any more, she understood what Matriarch Farrell meant. 

“Your father is at home too.” Matriarch Farrell added another sentence. 

Shiloh’s face immediately collapsed, “Mom, why can’t you take me? I’m also 
your daughter, as you said, treat me and Kathryn equally.” 

Matriarch Farrell: “I have decided not to take any of you there. I’m taking this 
opportunity to relax and want to be alone for a while.” 

Shiloh pouted and stopped talking. 

It’s normal for her mother not to take Kathryn, her biological daughter, with 
her, but even if her mother didn’t take her with her, Shiloh knew that she 
would have no chance if she continued to grind. 

Seeing that the adoptive daughter looked unhappy, Matriarch Farrell opened 
the drawer, took out a brocade box from inside, and handed the brocade box 
to Shiloh. 



Matriarch Farrell: “Here is a necklace, which is very suitable for young girls 
like you and Kathryn. Kathryn doesn’t seem to be interested in jewelry, so I 
will give it to you.” 

Shiloh took the brocade box, opened it, and saw that the necklace was very 
beautiful, and it was a famous brand, worth hundreds of thousands, so she 
immediately laughed and thanked her adoptive mother repeatedly. 

She couldn’t wait to pick up the necklace and put it on. After putting it on, she 
asked her adoptive mother, “Mom, does it look good?” 

 


