
Married at First Sight Chapter 2530-She asked the other party to get off 
work because the things she worked overtime to deal with were more matters 
in her own company, and her secretary in the Farrell Group could not help 
her. 

It was quiet outside. 

Some departments in the company were also working overtime, but not on the 
floor where Kathryn’s office was located. 

She left the office, passed through the large cubicle office outside, and walked 
towards the elevator. 

When she arrived at the elevator entrance, she saw a man leaning against the 
elevator entrance, holding a bouquet of flowers. 

He smiled when he saw Kathryn’s arrival. 

Kathryn had a fate with this man once. 

It was her second-generation ancestor, Leo Giguere, that Holden wanted to 
lead her. 

When Holden wanted to lead Kathryn, Kathryn asked Mr. Fraser to investigate 
Leo and find out Leo’s background clearly. 

Leo was a second-generation ancestor who only knew how to live happily, 
and Holden actually wanted to introduce Leo to her. 

Obviously, Matriarch Farrell was on her side and refused for her, preventing 
Holden from arranging a blind date between her and Leo. 

But Holden, who didn’t treat Kathryn as his biological daughter at all, still tried 
every means to arrange for her to meet Leo. 

“Kathryn.” 

Leo stood up straight, walked over with a bouquet in his arms, and handed it 
to Kathryn with a smile. “Get off work? I know you are still working overtime in 
the company, so I specially bought a bouquet of flowers and waited for you to 
get off work. Let me treat you to a late-night snack.” 



Kathryn pushed away the bouquet he handed her with one hand, and with a 
cold expression on her pretty face, she refused coldly: “Thank you, Mr. 
Giguere, for your kindness. I have already made an appointment.” 

After that, Kathryn started, and Leo walked by. 

“Kathryn.” 

Leo stretched out his hand to pull Kathryn, but Kathryn avoided it. He quickly 
ran in front of Kathryn and opened his arms to block Kathryn’s path. 

His eyes moved downward from Kathryn’s face unscrupulously. 

Holden said that he was very satisfied with him and asked him to find a way to 
capture Kathryn. Then he would be the Farrell family’s son-in-law. 

Although the women of the Farrell family did not marry, they only recruited 
son-in-laws, and it was shameful for many men to become the son-in-law of 
the Farrell family, but it was suitable for their second-generation ancestors, 
who had no ability and disliked ordinary girls. 

As long as he becomes Kathryn’s husband and has a daughter, will the Farrell 
family still not belong to his daughter? As long as he loves his daughter, is 
good to her, and has a deep relationship between father and daughter, when 
his daughter comes to power and she is filial to him, he will be able to 
dominate the Farrell family. 

The Farrell family was among the most wealthy families in Jensburg. Although 
it was at the end of the spectrum, it was still a truly wealthy family. It was 
incomparable to those upstarts. The Farrell family was also very rich. After all, 
it was an old, wealthy family with more than a hundred years of wealth. 

Leo was very clear about the current situation of the Giguere family. 

He had no ability, but he wanted to continue to live a good material life. The 
best way out was to become Kathryn’s husband. 

Holden said that Kathryn grew up in the countryside. Her adoptive parents 
were not good to her and made her timid and weak. As long as Leo could 
make Kathryn fall in love with him, then he could become Kathryn. The 
invisible head of the family had endless glory and wealth. 



Holden also said that when dealing with a woman, if Leo sleeps with Kathryn 
first, she won’t be able to escape. No matter how arrogant she was, he could 
easily take her down. 

Holden was Kathryn’s biological father. If he taught Leo to take down Kathryn, 
Leo would not be too polite to Kathryn. 

It had been two years since Kathryn returned to the Farrell family. People 
outside also knew what life was like in the Farrell family. 

Leo also believed that Kathryn was a weak and easy-to-manipulate woman. 

 

 

 

 

 

 


