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Chapter 50: Postponing plans 

When Arabella felt very happy and breathed a sigh of relief as soon as she managed to 
leave Leonard and also Ayumi. Very different from what Leonard was currently feeling. 
He really felt very annoyed and angry that Arabella still went even though he forbade 
her. 

'Unlucky! I couldn't scold her nor forbid Arabella to go. Where is Arabella actually 
going?' muttered Leonard who was currently busy thinking about where the woman who 
was currently walking from the shop had left him and made him not know what Arabella 
was on as she disappeared from sight. 

Not wanting to lose track, Leonard chose to speak to Ayumi because he wanted to go 
threaten Arabella for a while as usual. 

"Honey, I'm going out for a while to say something to my cousin because I'm really 
worried about him. I'll order a taxi for Arabella so she's more comfortable when she 
goes to meet her friends," said Leonard, who is currently looking for the right reason to 
talk to women wearing colorful knee-length dresses. the blue. 

Meanwhile, the current Ayumi had just received the leg chain she wanted to try, 
reflexively turning to stare at Leonard. 

"Why do you think that Arabella is a lost toddler and doesn't know anything about taking 
taxis. Especially in today's digital era, everything is easier and school children know how 
to do it." 

"I feel you are too much in worrying about your cousin, Leo. However, if you still want to 
help Arabella, just go now. I will wait for you here," said Ayumi, who was still shaking 
her head at the excessive attitude of the man who became her little friend. 

In truth, Leonard felt slapped by Ayumi's words, but his curiosity was far greater than 
the ridicule from the woman who looked completely astonished at his attitude. 

"I already consider her like my own sister, dear. Moreover, I do not have a younger 
sister because I am an only child and feel lonely living at home alone with only my 
parents. That's why I feel happy when Arabella is entrusted to our family." 

While looking for an excuse to Ayumi, Leonard's mind was currently worried about 
Arabella who might have disappeared and made him only curse in his heart to vent the 
bubbling annoyance. 



'Unlucky! maybe that cheap woman had disappeared. Hopefully he's still on the street 
and hasn't taken a taxi yet.' 

As soon as Ayumi waved her hand to shoo her away, Leonard, who was now out of 
sight of the woman of Japanese descent, hurriedly stepped out of the jewelry store to 
chase the man who had disappeared from sight. 

Leonard looked around to find the whereabouts of the woman he hated so much, but 
wondered where his siren wife had gone. Feeling very angry that he didn't find the 
woman he was looking for, he punched the air around him and cursed. 

"Shit! Where is she? She's gone so fast," muttered Leonard still not giving up on finding 
the woman he thought went with a man. 

It wasn't until a few moments later that he caught the silhouette of Arabella who had just 
stepped around a car and entered through the front door. 

"Fuck! I was right. That cheap woman went with a man in a black car," Leonard cursed, 
who is currently memorizing the car's license plate number to find out who owns it. 

Wasting no time, Leonard contacted someone to find out who was the owner of the 
luxury car that had just taken his siren wife away. 

"You cheap woman! She said she was going with a friend. Even though she was alone 
with a man behind me. How dare she lie by saying she had important business. Just 
watch out when she gets home." 

Leonard had just closed his mouth, the sound of his cellphone ringing and making him 
immediately pick up the call from his mother by sliding the green button up. 

"Hello, Mother." 

"Leonard, why is there someone from Stevan who packed all of Arabella's clothes? 
What happened? I called your brother earlier but he didn't pick up. I only said this 
because I was very happy, finally Arabella left the house and you can quietly marry 
Ayumi without a hitch ," said Nayla Sari from across the phone. 

Meanwhile, Leonard was very surprised because he did not understand the wishes of 
his half-brother. For some reason he felt very upset because his stepbrother always did 
what he wanted. 

"What the hell is he doing? He hasn't said anything to me at all, including Arabella. Was 
it Stevan calling that cheap woman? I guess I'll have to go to my brother's office to ask 
Arabella what he's up to. boutique because this is much more important." 



Leonard immediately hung up the phone without waiting for his mother to speak to 
respond to his words. 

He hurriedly goes to meet Ayumi and intends to take the woman he will marry back to 
the apartment first. Then just go to the company of the stepbrother. 

To be continued... 

 


