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Chapter 051 You Wanna Marry Charlie 

Leticia seemed to be interested in the two kids very much. What if she would take them 
away in case they were Charlie's 

sons? 

Oh, poor Theresa' That could break her heart! 

Leticia asked, "Aren't you curious about this?" 

Cristina said, "Not at all. They're my boys, and they live with me. I'm not interested in 
who their father is. Paternity test 

or not, they're still my sons." 

Speaking of which, Cristina was on guard against Leticia, "Correct me if I'm wrong, you 
kept saying the paternity test just in order to take them away from me." 

Leticia said, "Well... You know, Miss Lagarde, you're not well-off. If they're really my 
grandsons, it's better for them to live with us, and they won't have to make money for 
you on the internet any more." 

Leticia met the boys online. Every time she remembered that they didn't have enough 
clothes to wear but they were still 

so sweet and mature at such a young age.... 

She couldn't help feeling sad. 

No one was able to imagine what they had been through! 

Had their parents had a slight conscience, the boys wouldn't have had to be posted 
online. 

Cristina frowned. "In case you forgot, Ms. Calsis, it's my call to raise my kids my way, 
and it's my right to have them 

livestream. I am their mother, not you." 



She got pissed! 

What the hell was Leticia doing? 

Did she have any idea what Theresa had been through in the Watson Family when 
giving birth to these two babies? How dared she speak ill of the person who had 
brought the boys up? Having heard Cristina out, Leticia said, "You won't be treated 
shabbily as long as you have the boys run the test. You 

gave birth to two kids for the Calsis Family, and you deserve something better. Well, if 
their father happens to be someone else, I'll still give you a large amount of money, just 
because they look so similar to my son. And that money will be their tuition fees. What 
do you think, Miss Lagarde?" 

"I deserve something better?" Cristina asked. "What would it be? To marry your son?" 

It was impossible for Cristina to demand more money. Theresa wouldn't let her! 

For Theresa, nothing was more important than her babies, let alone money. 

But... 

What if Theresa married Master Calsis? She wouldn't be bullied any more if the Calsis 
Family, the most powerful family here, got her back. 

Leticia wasn't expecting that. 

Looking at Cristina, she asked, "You really wanna marry my Charlie?" 

'My boys need a father, but they can't lose their mother either. All I want is to get a 
family for them." That Charlie 

looked handsome, and the Calsis Family was damn rich... 

Cristina kinda looked forward to it if she could make a match for him and Theresa. 

Leticia hesitated, "But..." 

"But what?" Cristina sneered. "If you think you can buy me over, save it. We're done 
here." 

Cristina was leaving, and Leticia stopped her at once. "Well, the thing is, Charlie is 
married." 

"Really?" Cristina said. "How come? I've never heard of it!" 



Aunt Brenda had told her that Charlie was single! 

If he had been married, Aunt Brenda would definitely have known it because everyone 
in the Calsis Family shall get busy with his wedding. 

But the truth was that Aunt Brenda had never mentioned it! 

Leticia explained. "It happened a few days ago. They got marriage certificates. Charlie 
made decisions on his own. I'm his mother, but I won't break them up. Besides, Theresa 
looks nice." 

And Old Mr Calsis also liked her! 

Leticia couldn't break them up just for the two kids. 

"Theresa? That's Charlie's wife?" For a second Cristina almost believed that she had 
misheard. 

Leticia looked at her "You know Theresa?" 

"Well. We've met several times." 

Cristina grabbed the glass in front of her and took a drink of water, swallowing her 
shock. 

Jesus Christ' 

Such a good friend she was! 

This chick had married Charlie! 

And she had kept it from Cristina! 

Leticia requested, "About the paternity test, please reconsider it. Charlie is a married 
man now, but if they're really his. 

sons, we won't walk away, and you'll still be generously repaid. How does it sound?" 

Leticia looked pretty sincere. Cristina said, "I'll think about it. But... I'd like to meet 
Charlie first. A lunch or dinner will 

do." 

She was very much like to know what kind of man Charlie was, who had taken her dear 
Theresa away. Leticia agreed. "OK. I'll fix it. How about tonight? Are you available?" 



Charlie was to be discharged from hospital by the night! 

And they could have dinner together at home. 

Leticia suspected that Cristina may not wanna marry Charlie any more when she saw 
this crippled man. 

Cristina nodded. "Sure." 

At noon Charlie was having lunch in the ward, still elegant in his hospital gown. 

He looked up at Theresa. "You've already packed up and moved to my house?" 

"No," sitting on the chair, Theresa said. "I'm here to ask you, may I still live in my own 
apartment?" 

"No." Charlie answered. 

"Come on! I know I made a mistake, all right?" 

Was that necessary? 

He was still mad at what had happened yesterday. 

Theresa had never seen someone holding grudges for so long. 

Charlie raised his eyes. "Are you picking me up?" 

Theresa smiled, "In case you got bored, here I come. Anyway, I'm your wife. How sweet 
I am, huh?" 

She didn't want to be here at all, but she still came just to please him. 

Charlie raised his eyebrows. "It's been just half a day. You miss me so much?" 

He had seen so many flattering women. 

Theresa could live with anything but Charlie's narcissism. It was a huge challenge for 
her. 

Men think highly of themselves ever since they're born. Whatever you do, they believe 
that you're doing it for them. However, Theresa didn't correct him but exaggerated, "Of 
course! I love you so much! Last night you asked me to go 

back, and I couldn't sleep all night just because I was so excited! Actually, there are 
some reasons why I don't wanna 



move to your place..." 

"Which are?" Charlie curiously looked at her. 
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Chapter 052 Let's Have Dinner Tonight 

Theresa said, "I love you so much, but I couldn't tell you before because of our contract. 
What if I couldn't live without you after I move to your house and someday you drive me 
away? How pathetic I am. You know I've divorced once, and I 

don't wanna be abandoned again." 

She knew that he was too narcissistic. 

On the day they had married, he was worried that he might be stuck with her. 

And now if she appeared to love him very much, Charlie would wanna run away from 
her. After all, he hated trouble. Theresa had managed to come up with this last night. 
Retreat in order to advance! And then she just had to see what would happen next. 

When Theresa was done, she looked at Charlie with eager and affectionate eyes. 

And she was sure that Charlie would show disgust. 

However, he was indifferent at all. 

Sitting on the sickbed, he went on with his lunch. 

It perplexed Theresa! 

What was wrong with him? 

Was his porridge that delicious? 

For God's sake, say something! 

Charlie ate up his porridge, and glanced at Theresa. "You love me, and I already knew 
it. You have given me some hope, 

and are kinda useful to me. So I'm giving you a chance to live in my house, which not 
everyone can easily get!" 



He sounded like a God distributing alms. 

Deep down Theresa couldn't help despising him! 

Unbelievable! 

She didn't get him at all! 

Charlie raised his head, and saw Theresa's unpleasant eyes. "You're touched? Are you 
crying?" 

Hell... 

Touched my ass! 

She got pissed! 

Charlie went, "If you don't have time to pack up, just leave it. I'll have everything you 
need prepared." 

So there was no way she could live in her own place. 

She did all that work for nothing. 

Theresa went silent, sitting angrily beside him. 

At this moment Charlie's phone rang. "Pass me the cell." 

Theresa glimpsed at him, and took it for him. He grabbed the phone and glanced at her, 
confused. Why wasn't she 

grateful? What was she pissed at? 

It's true that women can't be spoiled! 

The more you dote op her, the more she's gonna ask for! 

Charlie ignored her, and answered the phone. 

Right at this fime Theresa's cell rang too. It was Cristina. She went out of the ward with 
the phone. 

Cristina was meeting Leticia today. They should be done by now. 

Before Cristina left, Theresa had reminded her several times on WhatsApp to stick to 
the plan. 



"Yeah." Standing in the corridor, Theresa picked it up. 

Cristina exploded, "Damn you, Theresa! You're married?!" 

Theresa twitched her lips, took the phone away a little, and replied when Cristina was 
finished, "Yep." 

"How dared you keep it from me? I'm the last one in the world to know that! You 
wretched woman!" Cristina was getting 

more furious. She was Theresa's best friend! 

No one could play them off against each other 

And in the end, Cristina was ignorant of Theresa's marriage. 

Theresa said, "I just didn't think it was necessary to tell you." 

"Why? It's Charlie, OK? Do you have any idea how wealthy his family is? Jimmy, that 
bastard, was proud every day of 

himself for having married Rose. And you just married Charlie!" 

Last night when Cristina had mentione the Calsis Family, Theresa said that it was hard 
for her to be Calsis. Unforgivable! 

Jesus! That was what Cristina's best friend had done! 

Theresa coughed, "There are some reasons..." 

"Oh yeah? What reasons?" Cristina must get to the bottom of it. 

Theresa begged, "May I explain to you face to face tonight after I get home?" 

She looked back at the ward. Theresa had promised Charlie that this secret shall only 
be kept among him, Cristina, and 

her. 

If someone here in the hospital overheard her, there would be big trouble! 

"No. I wanna hear it now!" 

"Well, we got married, but our relationship is not what you think. He doesn't love me, 
and I don't love him. When the thing is done, we'll divorce." 



"What?" Cristina was shocked. "Why?" 

"Do you really think I can be Mrs. Calsis on my own? I told you last night what had 
happened. Please don't talk about Leonard and Ben with anyone else." 

Theresa knew that she wouldn't have a future with the Calsis Family. So by no means 
would she involve her kids with 

them. 

Cristina couldn't fully understand. "Fine. Explain to me tonight. You owe me, bitch." 

Theresa laughed, "Last night I was your sweetheart, and now I'm a bitch?" 

"Yes. Shut up." Cristina laughed too. 

Theresa hung up and went back to the ward. Charlie had finished his phone call and his 
lunch. 

He asked, "Put the dishes away." 

Theresa did as he asked. Charlie glanced at her. "And uh... We're having dinner at 
home. Don't be late." 

"Tonight?" 

"Hmm. With my mom's guest." Charlie had a long face, dissatisfied. 

Theresa saw that. "You don't like that guest, do you?" 

"You'll know it by then. When are you picking the boys up?" Charlie was used to it that 
Theresa was a mother too. "Three pm," Theresa said. "Today the school closes earlier 
because of the holiday." 

"Come back after you get them home. We're done here." Lying on the bed, Charlie 
grabbed his 

pen 

and 

paper, 

and 

continued working on his designs. 



In the afternoon, having taken the babies home, Theresa went to the hospital. 

Jonathan had finished Charlie's discharge procedures by then. 

They went back to the Calsis Family together. 

It was almost six o'clock when they came home, right about the dinnertime. 

Charlie was sitting in the wheelchair, followed by Theresa and Jonathan. The dinner 
was ready. 

Leticia was chatting with her guest in the dining room right now. 

Cristina... 

Theresa was astounded to see her. 

What was she doing here? 

Sitting on the chair, Cristina saw Charlie and Theresa, but she deliberately ignored her 
best friend. After all, she had told 

Leticia that she wasn't familiar with Charlie's wife. 
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Chapter 053 I Love My Wife Only 

Cristina was intrigued by Charlie. He looked handsome even if he was in a wheelchair. 

Above all, for Cristina, he was glowing 

Leticia introduced them to each other, "This is Cristina." 

She had told Charlie about Cristina and the boys over the phone, but now she didn't say 
much about them for the sake of 

Theresa. 

Charlie glimpsed at Cristina, the woman who had used the kids to get close to his 
mother and marry him. Ridiculous! 

He'd very much like to see what this woman was gonna do. 



Cristina smiled to Charlie, "Nice to meet you, Mr. Calsis." 

With a long face, Charlie said nothing. 

Theresa sat down, confused about what Cristina was doing. However, Cristina was 
eyeballing him pretty hard. 

Charlie put some meats and vegetables in Theresa's bowl. "Come on. Eat." 

Theresa didn't know what Charlie was up to. Since when was he so sweet? 

Panicked, she ate slowly and meanwhile sent a message to Cristina with her phone. 
"What the hell are you doing?" 

'Admiring your husband of course." Cristina replied. 

Theresa could even feel her abnormally high pulse rate. 

In case Leticia found something, Theresa put down her phone, and looked at Charlie. 

Leticia asked, "You know Miss Lagarde, Charlie?" 

Charlie raised his head, glanced at Cristina and said, "No. I don't have to know such a 
grifter." Seriously? 

A grifter? 

Damn! 

"Are you sure you don't know her?" Leticia reconfirmed. 

Charlie said, "I don't know this liar who popped up from nowhere." 

Cristina said, "But I know you! Charlie, you're so handsome!" 

She appeared to be a love-sick girl. 

Charlie heard her. "I'm married." 

And then he looked at Theresa, reached out and put his arm around her shoulder. 
"You'd better back off." 

Theresa could feel the weight of his hand, as if she was cuddled up against him. 

She knew that they were playing games, but she was still shocked. For a long time she 
had been lonely. 



Cristina eyed Charlie and Theresa with amusement. This man was almost perfect 
except for his crippled legs. 

She even thought that it was good for Theresa to marry him! 

She lowered her head, and sent a message to Theresa. "He's nice!" 

Theresa kneaded the center of her forehead, not knowing what to say. Charlie was 
unaware that Cristina was acting and 

vice versa. 

Theresa was so afraid to give them away if she said something wrong. 

So she sent a message to Cristina immediately. "Stop it. What the hell do you want?" 

Cristina ignored the message, raised her eyes, and asked Charlie, "Well, I heard that 
your wife had a divorce, and she has 

two kids. You two don't make a match at all, and your social status is way higher than 
hers. Is it OK with you, Mr. 

Calsis?" 

Although Cristina had never spoken ill of Theresa, now she was curious about how he 
would react to this. Charlie smiled, "It's not your place to comment on my wife's privacy. 
She divorced because her ex- husband was a 

scumbag. She has two kids, so what? I love her. That makes her kids my kids!" 

Theresa sat closer to Charlie than anyone in the dining room. 

His voice was soft, but every word he said was astonishing. 

Theresa glanced at him, and almost lost her marbles because of his charm. 

Charlie eyed Cristina in disgust. "No more playing us off against each other. I love my 
wife only. You don't stand a 

chance." 

She was nothing but a grifter! 

His mother was so old that she had believed that Cristina had his kids! 

Nonsense! 



Charlie's words were quite offensive, but Cristina wasn't angry at all. 

This man was really her thing! 

He could definitely protect Theresa from Jimmy! 

But for this acting, Cristina couldn't wait to pronounce them real husband and wife! 

She controlled herself, stood up and asked Leticia, "May I use the bathroom?" 

She almost jumped. 

Leticia nodded. "Of course." 

Having been controlling her feelings, Brenda offered to show Cristina the way. 

She couldn't figure out what her niece was up to, and she couldn't ask in front of 
everyone either. 

At the door to the bathroom, Brenda went, "What the hell is this, Cristina? You got two 
more kids? What were you talking 

about?" 

Cristina said, "Leave it alone, aunt. I'm doing this for Theresa." 

At this time Theresa came, and dragged Cristina into the bathroom. "Are you out of your 
mind?" 

In the presence of the Calsis Family, Theresa was at an utter loss what to do. 

She couldn't bear it at all. 

Looking affectionately at Theresa, Cristina imitated Charlie, "No more playing us off 
against each other. I love my wife only. You don't stand a chance." 

Theresa went silent. 

There was nothing wrong with the way Charlie had said those words, but Theresa felt 
humiliated after Cristina had repeated them. 

She warned her friend, "Enough!" 

"I get it now. You married the right man, Theresa. I like him too! He's much better than 
Jimmy. Above all, he's rich," Cristina looked around this bathroom. "Oh, I'm jealous. 



This bathroom is much bigger than my apartment!" Theresa sternly said, "No more 
jokes, Cristina. I don't love him. We're not a couple. We just signed a contract. So don't 

take it serious!" 

"A contract?" 

"Yeah," Theresa had to tell her the truth. "I agreed to marry him and help him find 
Sarah. As soon as she gets back, we'll divorce. That's it!" 

"Sarah? You mean your stepmother's daughter? What does she have to do with 
Charlie?" 

"She's his fiancée." 

"His what?" Cristina was shocked. "Wow. So it was Sarah who dumped Charlie 
because of his disability!" 
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Chapter 054 You're Wanted in Master Calsis' Room 

Cristina had known nothing about Sarah before but that she was Theresa's younger 
stepsister. 

Theresa was just a middle class girl, whose social status was much lower than the 
Calsis Family's. 

So was Sarah. How come was she qualified to marry Charlie? 

Theresa said, "Yes! Sarah's gone. Charlie intends to bankrupt the Cameron Family, and 
I have to do something! So, please do me a favor and drop it!" 

"But he was really nice to you back there," Cristina said. "I almost believed that you're a 
real couple." 

"What exactly did you tell Leticia?" Theresa looked perplexed at Cristina. 

Cristina said, "Nothing important. She wanted a paternity test for Charlie and the kids. I 
said OK, but Charlie's gonna 

marry me if he's the father. I mean, to marry you actually!" 

"Cristina," Theresa said. "You promised not to stir up trouble!" 



"What trouble did I stir up?" Cristina asked. "All I want is to find someone to take care of 
you. Who knows you've married 

Charlie? I'm here just to see what kind of a man he is. I think he hates me because I 
said I'd marry him." 

"What he said just now was only for show," Theresa said. "Even if he finds out that 
Leonard and Ben are his sons, won't marry their mother either. That's why he 
mentioned me and treated you as a liar." 

he 

"But he's nice to you," Cristina said. "You told me the other day that his legs could be 
cured. Let's say, if he really doesn't mind about your past, and if he likes your kids... 
Aren't you willing to give it a shot?" 

Theresa went blank for a moment. "That's nonsense! You don't know him. I've divorced 
once. There's no chance he'd 

love me." 

And their contract mattered as well! 

"You've divorced, so what? That doesn't make you a loser! Just like he said, you had 
bad luck and met a bastard. Anyway, 

I don't think Charlie cares about this. If you love him, go get him! What if he loves you 
too? You guys click, and your babies will have a father!" 

Theresa solemnly corrected Cristina, "I don't love him. No more gossip." 

She was really not in the mood for this now. 

"You mean it?" Cristina didn't believe Theresa. As an outsider, Cristina admired Charlie 
after what had happened just now. "Well, since you guys will divorce someday, why 
don't I court him? You know, Sarah has dumped him, and I don't think they'll see each 
other again. If I make it to marry him, I'll be Mrs. Calsis! Bravo!" 

"Sounds great." Theresa rolled her eyes. 

"You don't mind?" Cristina asked. 

"Why bother?" Theresa said. "It's not easy for me to start a relationship with someone 
now. All I want is to take care of 

Leonard and Ben." 



She glanced at the phone clock. "I have to go back, before anyone gets suspicious." 

To the Calsis Family, Theresa and Cristina weren't familiar with each other. There must 
be something off if they had 

chatted in the bathroom for so long. 

Theresa went back to the dining room first. 

Charlie almost finished his dinner. 

Theresa had a glimpse at him, and sat down. Right now he was elegantly drinking a cup 
of water. 

She remembered what he had said to Cristina.... 

And what Cristina had told her in the bathroom. 

To be honest, Charlie was a good man. He was competent, distinguished, and 
protective, which made him more 

attractive. 

But... 

Theresa knew that he and she belonged to different worlds. 

After his legs were cured, he would still be Master Calsis. 

While she would be reduced to that homely woman with a miserable history.... 

Having drunk up the water, Charlie found that Theresa was a bit down and deep in 
thought. 

He asked, "What? Got trouble?" 

Theresa wasn't expecting that. "No." 

Who dared to cause trouble for her? 

Charlie knew that she was lying. He frowned but didn't push her to explain. 

Right at this moment Cristina came back and sat down. When she saw him, a shadow 
of a smile touched her mouth, as if she was provoking him. 

Charlie "got it" at once. Miss Lagarde had probably bullied his wife. 



He put down the cup, and told Theresa, "Help yourself. I'm done. Get me to my room, 
Jonathan." 

Jonathan did as he asked. 

Theresa went on with her dinner, and Leticia was talking about Leonard and Ben with 
Cristina. She really liked the two 

kids. 

Though Charlie's words may have pissed Cristina, Leticia was still trying to persuade 
her. 

"Miss Lagarde, would you reconsider my proposition?" 

Instead of turning her down, Cristina said, "I need a few days." 

What for? Theresa glanced at her friend. Why hadn't she just said no? 

Never mind. In no way would Theresa run the paternity test. 

Whether it was a coincidence that the kids looked like Charlie, or they were really the 
descendants of the Calsis Family, 

Theresa didn't wanna put a bet. 

She couldn't afford to take any risks! 

Leticia said, "OK. Call me when you make up your mind." 

Cristina nodded. 

Meanwhile, Jonathan went downstairs. He came to Cristina and said, "Miss Lagarde, 
you're wanted in Mr. Calsis' room." Cristina said, "Yeah." 

She got up and told Leticia, "Excuse me." 

And then she went upstairs. 

Theresa was wondering what this was about. Her kids? 

What if Cristina said something she shouldn't? 

Charlie was waiting for Cristina in the study. She went in and saw him in his wheelchair 
with moonlight on his back, as if 



he was shining. 

Cristina approached him, and frivolously said, "Well, it seems that I do have my charm, 
Mr. Calsis. Can't wait to see me 

now?" 

Charlie raised his eyes and stared at her, which almost froze the whole room. 

Cristina was startled. Somehow, she felt uneasy. 

She was always a careless person, but now the way Charlie looked at her scared her. 

Why was he so hostile? 

Charlie demanded, "What did you tell Theresa?" 
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Chapter 055 A Gift for You 

Cristina was shocked. "Nothing " 

She had chatted with Theresa for a few more minutes. Did it bust her? 

Cristina was a little worried. 

Charlie sternly said, "Theresa is my wife. She does have a bad and painful past. I don't 
care what you're coming for, but 

I'm warning you, Miss Largarde: don't embarrass my wife ever again, or things will be 
pretty bad for you. 

As he remembered Theresa's look just now, Charlie couldn't help frowning. He believed 
it was all Cristina's fault. After all, there were so many women who not only were 
dreaming to be a rich man's mistresses but also would mess 

around his wife once they had a chance. 

Theresa loved him, and she'd definitely be hurt. 

She may have been convinced that he would dump her one day due to her babies. 

How could she be that stupid? 



Charlie's warning surprised Cristina. 

So... he was concerned about Theresa? 

He thought she was bullying Theresa? 

Cristina laughed, "You really care about your wife, Mr. Calsis. I didn't see that in you. 
Well, why don't you just tell me in what aspects she exceeds me?" 

"All aspects." Charlie eyed Cristina in disgust. "I think I've said enough to you. Today 
you're my mother's guest, and you'll be fine. Next time, I'll make sure that you won't." 

Cristina looked back at him, bit her lip, and got satisfied. She was happy for Theresa! 

Earlier today Cristina hadn't wanted the paternity test, but now... 

She changed her mind. 

She asked Charlie, "Don't you wanna see the kids, Mr. Calsis? They look just like you." 

"A lot of people in the world look similar, but I don't have any twin brothers, so no one 
looks just like me." Charlie didn't. buy a word of it. 

He told Cristina, "So much for the kids. I don't know you, and I never touched you. How 
come you had my kids? My 

mother wants a grandchild too much, but I'm not her." 

Old people were easy to fool, but he was clearheaded. 

Cristina raised her eyebrows. She was not in the mood to talk about IVF. By the time 
the test result came out, he would 

have known. 

Even if he wasn't Leonard and Ben's biological father, Cristina would still take all efforts 
to pair Charlie and Theresa off. She went out of Charlie's room, and saw Theresa at the 
end of the stairway. 

Theresa nervously asked, "What did you say?" 

Cristina answered, "Secrets." 

"Hey!" Theresa said. "I'm serious." 



Cristina went, "I'm coming home. Oh, why don't you stay here tonight? I'll look after 
Leonard and Ben." 

"What do I stay here for?" Theresa was nearly speechless. 

Her babies were still waiting for her! 

"Your husband is here. What else can you guys do? When there's an opportunity, take 
it. I think Charlie's really nice to 

you, much better than Jimmy! You've been lonely for so long, sweetie. You deserve a 
man." 

As soon as Cristina remembered what Charlie had told her, she was in such a hurry to 
throw Theresa to his bed. Theresa said, "Nonsense!" 

"Wow, you blushed. See you around." Cristina was leaving 

Theresa was about to follow her friend when Jonathan went downstairs. She had to 
control herself for now. 

"Jonathan." She greeted him. 

Looking at her, Jonathan spoke, "You're wanted in Master Calsis' room, Mrs." 

It suddenly occurred to Theresa that Charlie had asked her to stay here tonight. 

And by no means could he forget it. 

She had a lot to explain if she wanted to go home! 

As Theresa went upstairs, Charlie had been waiting in the bedroom. She opened the 
door and saw him in the wheelchair. She said, "You rang?" Charlie glanced at her. "I 
did. Sit." 

Theresa came closer, sat on the sofa and looked at Charlie. 

What was he gonna say? 

And Theresa was also thinking about how she should start with her request to go 

Charlie could be stubborn and unreasonable. 

He tapped somewhere closest to him. "Sit here." 

It confused Theresa, but she still did as he asked. 



back. 

Charlie picked up the velvet box that he had just put down, and opened it. There was a 
ruby ring. 

He asked, "Give me your hand." 

Theresa didn't know what he was doing, but still reached out, and saw him wear the ring 
for her. 

He was satisfied to see that it fit her slim finger. 

To Theresa, the ring looked expensive. It could be sold at a profit! 

She asked, "What's this about?" 

Charlie said, "It's a gift. My mom said this was for my wife. Now I'm giving it to you." 

All women loved jewelry. She'd be happy with this, right? 

Yes! She looked much better now! 

Theresa kept reminding herself that Charlie was not her husband. Therefore, she still 
had to return this ring as soon as 

they divorced. She looked at it, took it off, and put it back to the box. 

Charlie asked, "What are you doing?" 

Why did she take it off right after he had put it on for her? 

Theresa said, "It's too valuable, and it's inconvenient for me to do things with it on. 
Besides, I may lose it." 

Charlie didn't like the answer. "Rings are made to wear. What's the point if you put it 
away?" 

Theresa said, "Well, it's better than I losing it! What if you wanted it back when we 
divorce? I won't be able to afford a 

new one!" 

Charlie only wanted her to be happy, hence the ring. He had never thought of getting it 
back or having her bought a new one for him. After all, he had no intention of getting 
married again. 



He put the ring back on her finger. "Never take it off." 

"Fine, but let's cut a deal first. Never ask me to buy a new one in case I lost it. It's not 
my responsibility!" She was 

coerced! 

Dissatisfied, Charlie said, "You heard me. It's yours. When did I mention buying a new 
one? Am I that stingy?" 

It was just a ring! 

Come on! 

Theresa's eyes shone with excitement. "Really? So it's OK if I just sell it?" 
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Chapter 056 Charlie's exasperation 

'Such an expensive ring. She wants to give it out?!' Charlie's ears moved, and he looked 
at Theresa. "You want to sell my 

present?" 

He was more pissed at the way she sold it so casually as if it was worthy of nothing to 
her. 

Theresa looked at him. And then Charlie said, "You can try it if you dare to sell it! Wear 
it well and if you lose it, 

pay 

for it 

ten times over!" He seriously suspected Theresa was here to piss him off. 

Theresa said, "Then I'd better not wear it!" She couldn't afford to pay for it twice as 
much, let alone ten times! She didn't want to spend the rest of her life in debt. 

Seeing that she wanted to take it off, Charlie didn't stop her, "Go ahead! You can take it 
off as you wish. I think the 

Cameron family also wants to go bankrupt!" 



Theresa was speechless. 'Shit, I have never seen such an outrage! Who will force 
people to wear a ring!' 

She said, "Charlie, you're a man hard to please. You just want my money! You are 
going too far?" 

Charlie looked at the woman who didn't know how to be grateful at all, and said, "Put up 
with it! Who let you have to ask for my help!" 

He was trying to coax her well, but she didn't deserve it! Not only wasn't she satisfied, 
but he was also getting pissed off! Theresa looked at him, depressed, but persuaded 
herself into doing as he said. Wearing a ring was such a small thing, after all. "In that 
case, I'll go back!" 

She stood up, ready to leave, thinking she could just get over like that. But she was only 
two steps out when she heard Charlie say, "I should have said that you would stay here 
tonight, right?" 

She looked back at Charlie and said, "I'm a particularly bad sleeper, and I snore. I'm 
afraid I'll disturb you, so I'd better go home and sleep!" 

"It doesn't matter, I'm not afraid of noise. Come over and serve me a bath." He hadn't 
showered in the hospital for the 

past two days, and he was dirty as hell at the moment, A good shower was what he had 
been waiting for. Theresa frowned, "Me? Serve you a bath? That's... not good!" 

Although Theresa knew that with his disabled leg, he might need help with showering or 
anything... she's a woman after 

all! Hence, she proposed, "I'll go get Jonathan for you, he should be in." 

"No, I want you." Charlie said, "Jonathan has other things to deal with." 

Theresa had a terrible headache and always felt like Charlie was just giving her a hard 
time when she wanted to go back! However, Charlie sat there, already stretching out his 
hands, with a relaxed look, and said to her, "Come here and help 

me undress." 

To prevent him from saying again that he wanted to bankrupt the Cameron family, 
Theresa resigned herself to the fact 

that it's just a shower. 'Men are all the same! What's the big deal?" 



She walked up to Charlie, surprised to see him waiting like an emperor to be served. 
"You need help undressing for the shower? Does Jonathan help you take it off too?" 
She had a mental picture of two men together, Jonathan helping Charlie 

undress... Spicy! 

Charlie said, "Not really, he's not like you." 

"Not like me?" Theresa said, "How?" 

"You're my wife." Charlie had hated having people touch him before or having people 
help him, which always felt like an 

insult to him. But since meeting Theresa and being intimidated by her last time, he didn't 
seem to have so many worries when it came to this woman. Because he knew that she 
wouldn't discriminate against him or anything because of his inconvenient legs. 

When Theresa helped him unbutton his shirt, she notice Charlie's enjoyment on his 
face. She realized he seemed to have changed a lot, not as awkward as before, when 
she'd pull his pants and he'd have a fit. She looked at the man and smiled, 

just as Jonathan pushed his way in at that moment. 

When he walked in, he saw Thera standing in front of Charlie, taking off Charlie's 
clothes. "Sorry to interrupt." He coughed, before hurriedly stepping back, and closing 
the door. 

'Oh my gosh, I didn't expect the two to have developed to this point! I can't believe it! 
Theresa can do it! Even Master Calsis, who has never been close to a woman, has 
been softened by her!" 

Theresa looked at Jonathan, who had already gone out, as if seeing a savior, and said 
to Charlie, "Jonathan is here, let 

him help you. He must know how to take care of you." 

"You want to flee?" Said Charlie. 

Theresa looked at the man, helpless, "Are you going to torture me like this just because 
I said you were incompetent yesterday? It's been a night, isn't that enough?" 

'What a petty man!' Theresa regretted why she had asked him that at the time. 

"Not enough!" 

"Then what do you want?" 



"Go prepare the water," he commanded. 

She glanced at him before going into the bathroom, accepting her fate. While she was 
working, she wondered if he would 

ask her to rub his back, which she hadn't done before, except for the two little ones. 
She'd never served an adult man anyway! Disabled man, though. 

Lost in her thoughts, she turned around and saw Charlie had come in at some point, 
sitting in his wheelchair, his shirt unbuttoned by her. Even though he was trapped on a 
wheelchair, he still had fine abs. Theresa came over and helped him take off his 
unfinished shirt, then looked at the half naked Charlie and hesitated, 

resignedly ready to help him take off his pants, only to hear Charlie say, "Okay, get out." 

Although he said that he wanted her company, it was out of impulse, and when it really 
came down to it, Charlie wimped out. Although the woman was a good person, he didn't 
truly regard her as a wife, and there was no way he could get her to even do something 
like that for himself. He just wanted to see how far she could go. 

Having mentally prepared herself, Theresa was instantly relieved at his words and then 
a little surprised. 'Just like that?" "You really don't need help?" 

"Get my pajamas and wait for me at the door," he commanded. 

Theresa looked at the calm man in front of her, thinking that it seemed when he took a 
bath, he did not like the presence 

of others. So it had been a bluff. 

'Interesting!" She smirked and deliberately said, "It doesn't matter, I can help you!" 

He had made fun of her just now and made her think that he was going to let her bathe 
him. Now that she knew his weakness, it would be strange if she didn't let him pay back! 

Charlie looked up at her, only to see Theresa smiling and approaching him, teasing him 
with his words, "I'll help you! Didn't you say that I'm your wife, and doing these things for 
you is what I should do? Why are you shy? I can't imagine that Mr. Calsis has a shy 
moment?" 

Charlie looked at the woman who was getting ahead of herself and found out that she 
was bold! He grabbed her hand that reached for his pants, "Woman, don't you play with 
fire!" 

He wondered did she really think he was afraid to touch her. 
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Chapter 057 Kissing Charlie 

Yet, he just didn't feel the need to go that far for now. 

Theresa snorted and deliberately said, "It seems that you still can't do it!" 

She had almost been fooled by him. However, when she took a serious look, she found 
that Charlie was very innocent. If she got a little closer to him, he would be awkward 
and shy. 

Charlie was going to let it go, but when he heard Theresa's words, he suddenly reached 
out, pulled her back, hugged her, and put one hand on her chin, "You say it again?" He 
couldn't believe that she had just apologized so sincerely, and now she was teasing him 
again! 

Theresa looked at his fake fierce look and knew that this man was actually just looking 
fierce, but a paper tiger inwardly, and he wouldn't touch her at all. Otherwise, he 
wouldn't haven't touched a woman until now. Therefore, she smiled and teased, "What's 
your fetish, Mr. Calsis? You like to hear people say you can't do it?" 

Charlie gritted his teeth, "Woman, do you know that there is a price to pay for being 
mouthy?" 

"Price, what price?" Theresa looked at Charlie with his ears all red. Instead of being 
scandalized, she took the initiative, "Charlie, I suppose you haven't ever touched a 
woman before! I'm still curious, when you were with Sarah before, you never held hands 
or anything else?" 

Sarah was far from a good woman, but she was at least a good-looking woman, which 
Theresa had to admit. She had been with Charlie for a while, and Charlie should have 
never touched her. Theresa now wondered if the man was a neat 

freak when it came to women. 

No sooner had she finished her words than Charlie bowed his head and let her know 
what the price was. His lips fell on her small mouth which only made him angry. It was 
not a very skillful kiss, but indeed a hard one. To warn her, his eyes 

carried a little irritation. 



The scent that belonged uniquely to a man instantly encroached on her, and Theresa 
was dumbfounded for a moment- She had thought he was just saying, and the kiss was 
totally beyond her imagination! 

Like he hated to leave any air in her lungs, Charlie kissed her until she couldn't breathe. 
Looking at her pitiful look, his eyes were filled with pleasure after revenge. "Cat got your 
tongue?" 

Theresa coughed and hurriedly pushed him away, leaving his arms and standing up. 
Charlie looked at her somewhat flustered look and said, "I can't do it? I like men? Try 
saying something like that in front of me next time, and you will have the answer. I admit 
you do have a unique way of attracting me, and no one but you has ever dared to say 
that in front of me!" 

Charlie had just been really close to being pissed off by the bold woman. However, after 
the kiss, his mood was suddenly lifted, especially watching her go from arrogance to 
panic. The girl was now glaring at him, as if she really hadn't expected it. Yet, she was 
the one who had initiated the provocation, so she could only take the loss. At her 
sudden quietness, Charlie instructed, "Get out." 

Theresa did as he said. When she went into his dressing room to get his pajamas, her 
brain was still fogged from that kiss. She felt her lips still hurt a little because he had just 
pushed too hard. She looked in the mirror and couldn't help but knock on her head. 'Er, I 
will never do that again! How can I know the man, who usually dislikes me so much, is 
able to lay his mouth on mine?" 

Theresa took his pajamas to the bathroom door and put them down, then glanced at 
Charlie, who was still in the shower before walking out of the room, only to find 
Jonathan still waiting on the couch outside. It seemed that he had something to say to 
Charlie. 

Seeing Theresa come out, he stood up and said, “Ma'am." 

'Oh, it ended a little faster, it seemed.' He added in his head. 

Theresa said uncomfortably, "I'll go back first " Although Charlie didn't agree, she didn't 
want to stay anymore. It's so 

embarrassing" 

Jonathan said, "But Master Calsis asks you to stay tonight" 

Theresa didn't say a word, went straight down the stairs, and left. Jonathan entered the 
room after that Charlie finished 



his shower, changed into his pajamas, and came out, seeing that Jonathan was alone in 
the room, and asked, "Where's 

her?" 

"Mistress said she went back." Jonathan speculated his master's reaction, "How about I 
call her back?" 

"Forget it." Remembering the way she looked when she slipped away, Charlie decided 
to let her go. He wanted her to move in just to teach her a lesson, and now that the 
lesson had been learnt, Charlie was in a surprisingly good mood. "Thank you," Theresa 
said to the taxi driver after paying the fee and got out of the car when her mobile phone 
rang. The call was from Leah, her stepmother, and on the phone, Leah's voice sounded 
very caring, "Tess, how have you been with Charlie lately?" 

Hearing Charlie's name, Theresa's mind flashed unconsciously through the images in 
the bathroom. She coughed, trying to suppress the mixed emotions that were pouring 
through her, "It's... good!" 

Leah wasn't too stupid to neglect the uncertainty in Theresa's words. "Really? Why 
doesn't it sound like that? Does Charlie resent you?" 

Theresa was stunned for a moment before Leah advised, "We women are not easy. 
Charlie has never been married, and 

the Calsis family's conditions are good. You are divorced with two children. Even if he 
looks down on you, you should 

understand. Just put up with it when he says something mean! Men, they all have a 
temper." Originally, Leah had thought that if Theresa got along with Charlie well, she 
could get Sarah back, who had been living a 

hard life abroad. After all, she had no one familiar there to take care of her, and it was 
better to come back home. Now 

that Leah thought Theresa's relationship with Charlie was not very stable, she wouldn't 
let Sarah come back for now. Theresa heard her stepmother's words and thought it was 
ridiculous. She knew what her stepmother was fearing they didn't get along and trying to 
solve her problem, yet Leah's words were still harsh on the ear-What happened to a 
divorced woman? What's wrong with her kids? Why did she have to understand? Sarah 
disliked Charlie, so she should be 

disliked by him? 

Leah's words had already exposed the fact of how much her stepmother despised her. 
However, Theresa didn't get angry 



with her either. What Leah thought of her was not within her interest. 

Hence, she said, "Got it! I'm fine with Charlie, you don't have to worry." 

Only by reassuring Leah would Sarah come back. 

Leah said, "Okay if it's convenient, you call Charlie back and have a meal with your 
dad." 
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Chapter 058 She fled home 

Without seeing them in person, Leah always felt uneasy. When she saw that Theresa 
and Charlie were on good terms one day, she would call Sarah back. 

Theresa said, "Okay, I'll talk to him." She hung up the phone, pressed the button to 
summon the elevator, and went 

inside, which had very few people in it at this time. 

She went home, opened the door, and saw two kids painting, and Cristina, who was a 
gamer on weekends, was playing a back?" 

mobile game. When she saw Theresa come in, her eyes widened and she said, "Why 
are you 

Theresa answered, "Came back when I want to." 

Leonard and Ben saw her and ran over, and Ben hugged her, "Mom, kisses." 

Theresa squatted down and let Ben's sweet kiss fall on her cheek. Leonard stood by 
with a serious look on his face, "I want a kiss too." 

Cristina held her phone and looked at the two, "I'm jealous!" As a single woman, every 
time she looked at Theresa and her two kids, she wanted to find a man and have a 
baby. 

Theresa glanced at her, "Play your game." 

Cristina twisted her mouth. "I have enough. All my teammates are idiots." She put her 
phone down and sat next to Theresa, "Didn't I ask you to stay there? You're not staying 
with your husband?" 



"I'm coming back to see Leonard and Ben." 

"I'll take care of the two little ones. You're not sure about me?" 

Theresa looked at her and said, "There's no need for that." 

"I think there is." said Cristina, Don't you want something to happen between you and 
Charlie?" 

"Didn't I tell you I was just working with him?" Theresa reached out, poking her head, 
"What are you thinking." 

"I know, that's why I told you to take your chances! You don't even know how good 
Charlie is to you! He watched us 

talking and thought I was bullying you, called me up, and warned me not to bully his 
wife." 

"Erm..." Cristina's words took Theresa a bit by surprise, not convinced that Charlie had 
mistakenCristina for a bad woman for her sake. "Really?" 

"Really! How could I lie to you? I asked him what was so great about you, and he said 
that I'm not even a finger of yours. 

He appreciates you, and that's enough! Tess, I think he looks like a very good man!" 

Theresa's gaze, unconsciously, fell on the ring Charlie had given her, and she 
remembered his words, "A gift, for you." He thought she had been bullied, so he had 
given her a gift to make her happy. Otherwise, why had he suddenly given her 

a ring? 'No, this's not possible! Charlie is so self-righteous, how can he be so nice to 
her?' The idea had just popped up 

and was snuffed out by Theresa immediately. But Cristina's words made her a little 
suspicious. 

Cristina also saw the ring on Theresa's hand, and she came over with a look of surprise 
on her face, "Gosh! A ring? 

Where did it come from? It's from Charlie, isn't it? I haven't seen it at dinner." 

"He sent me after you left." Theresa glanced at it. 

"Oh my god, this man is so generous! Even someone like me, who doesn't know 
anything about gems, can see that it's definitely not cheap!" Besides, there's no way 
Charlie would give her a fake. Cristina touched the jewel on the ring and 



said, "Shit, you're still staying here. If I were you, I'd sleep with him, okay? Give him a 
baby right now." Theresa rolled her eyes at her friend, "Then you go, I'm going to take a 
shower." Then, she went into the room and took 

a shower. 

She washed her face and removed her makeup, and the sound of the water rushing 
reminded her of the kiss with Charlie, and she blushed like a tomato. 'Oh my god! I was 
so silly!' She didn't know what she had been thinking at the time. On second thought, 
she just ran back, Charlie wouldn't find trouble with her family, right? 

'Forget it.' Theresa shook the thought out of her head. She had been tired enough after 
running around all day, and she just wanted to rest at the moment. 

The next morning, Theresa woke up and glanced at her phone, afraid that Leah would 
call her and say something like Charlie was angry again, and she was going to be broke 
again. However, there was only peace. 

Cristina and Leonard were still asleep, and Ben was up, streaming again. Theresa was 
making breakfast in the kitchen. 

After a while, Ben came over and brought her phone with him, "Mom, your phone is 
ringing." 

Theresa heard the phone ring and her heart skipped a beat, but she answered the 
phone anyway. The call was from Jonathan, and it didn't sound like he was trying to 
blame her, "Ma'am, Master Calsis is asking when you're coming over today." 

She was going to help Charlie with acupuncture today. Theresa said, "He's not angry, is 
he?" He still summoned her today, so he should not pursue the matter of her running 
away. 

"Angry? What did you do to make Master Calsis angry?" said Jonathan, having no clue 
at all. 

Theresa breathed a sigh of relief. "Oh, I'll come over after breakfast." 

After finishing breakfast with the two kids and Cristina, Theresa said to her friend, "You 
stay home with Leonard and Ben, I'll go to Calsis' house and I'll come back soon." 

"You don't have to come back." Cristina couldn't wait for her to stay at the Calsis' house 
right now. 

Theresa glared at her, "I told you I'm going to take Leonard and Ben out to buy clothes 
today. There's an event in the kindergarten, and it's necessary to prepare clothes for the 
show." 



"Show? Leonard and Ben are performing again?" Cristina said expectantly. 

Ben nodded, "Yeah, there will be a bonus. If we get it, we'll buy facial masks for mom." 
As soon as he had money, all he could think about was buying something for his mom. 

"What about me?! Just buy it for your mom? What if I want it too?" teased Cristina. 

"Then buy you a little bit too." 

"Eccentric!" Cristina pretended to be aggrieved. 

Theresa looked at the little guy, the corner of her mouth raising, and touched Ben's 
head, "Thank you, baby, Ben is the 

best!" 

Leonard pouted and snorted on the side before putting the chopsticks down. Theresa 
and Cristina looked at him at the same time, "What's wrong with Leonard?" 

"Mom said I wasn't good." Leonard took his mother's words to heart with a long face. 

Theresa pouted, "When did I say that?" 

"You said Ben was the best." He finished speaking coldly, and turned his back, playing 
a little tantrum. 

Theresa rubbed her eyebrows, "I was wrong, Leonard and Ben are the best! Leonard is 
also well-behaved!" She didn't know if it was her delusion that Leonard's character was 
a bit like someone... 
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Chapter 059 Too happy to sleep 

'It's not possible that Leonard is really his son, is it?" 

Theresa muttered in her mind when she stood in Charlie's study, looking at the man 
who looked just like Leonard and 

Ben, and was incredibly focused on the phone when talking to someone. 

Charlie casually looked up at her, and saw that she was staring at him with wide, 
'affectionate' eyes. "Have you seen 



enough?" He put down his phone, looked up and asked. 

Theresa was caught off guard before quickly looking away. Amused by the woman, 
Charlie asked, "How did you sleep last night 

Theresa coughed, "It's okay." 

"Not too happy to fall asleep, are you?" 

Theresa rolled her eyes, wondering what was there to be happy about. She looked at 
the strange-thinking man and said, 

"No, I had nightmares." 

"Why?" Charlie looked at her. 

Theresa explained, "We have a fake marriage. You acting like this bothers me a lot. We 
make a deal, you are not allowed to kiss me as you wish!" 

Charlie looked at her and tickled his lips, as if to taunt her, "Obviously you were happy, 
and now you put on a reluctant look." 

Theresa had still been in a mixed mood before he said so, and now she was so angry. 
"Charlie, I solemnly declare, I don't like you, I don't like you at all!" 

Charlie raised an eyebrow, acknowledging her words. 'She said it like it was true. But I 
have seen her duplicitous look.' Theresa didn't care if he was listening or not, and just 
pretended he had listened. She said seriously, "Start the 

acupuncture. I have something to do later." She took the tools out, and began to 
prepare, taking a deep breath to make 

herself ignore the presence of the man. 

After the acupuncture, Theresa came out of Calsis' house and rushed to the mall where 
she had made an appointment with Cristina. Cristina had booked a table in the 
barbecue restaurant since it was noon time and the mall was crowded Theresa had 
been busy lately, so Leonard and Ben had eaten at kindergarten at noon and take-outs 
at night, 

which made her feel very guilty. 

After the barbecue, two adults and two children stopped by the downstairs mall. Cristina 
said, "I haven't been out to the 

mall for a long time, I've been shopping online." 



Theresa said, "So today I just want to take them out and buy clothes." 

They quickly went into a children's clothing store. Ben walked over and saw a nice set of 
clothes, like the suit of a little 

prince, and he asked, "Miss, how much is this?" 

The shopping guide looked at the tag, "1100 dollars." 

"So expensive?" Ben's eyes widened in surprise, not expecting the high price. "That's 
not necessary, it's too expensive." The shopping guide looked at Ben's surprised look 
and smiled. Ben looked very cute, and he even knew that things were expensive. Many 
children just asked for what they wanted and didn't think about where the money came 
from at all. Ben walked over, took Theresa's hand, and said, “Mom, we don't buy it! It's 
too expensive, let's change a shop." Theresa originally thought that Ben and Leonard 
had never bought particularly expensive clothes, but the cheap ones 

online, because she thought they were enough for daily wear. But this time, since they 
were going to have a performance, she wondered if she should buy something a little 
more expensive so that they wouldn't be teased by others when they were stuck in the 
middle of a bunch of kids. Before she could speak, she heard a mocking voice next to 

her, "Oh, isn't this Theresa?" 

The voice was a little snarky, and Theresa realized that it was Jimmy's sister Luna. 
Luna was followed by a little kid, her 

son, Jake, who was a year older than Leonard and Ben. With his fleshy body, he looked 
two or three years older than 

Leonard and Ben. The last time she had gone to eat sushi, she had seen Luna with him, 
but they hadn't said hello. When she had still been married to Jimmy, Luna didn't like 
Theresa very much, who had grown up in a wealthy family, 

and had a fair and pure complexion. From the first time they met, Luna had been full of 
envy for such a good looking 

and well educated woman. 

The conditions of the Watson family were not good, and as the oldest child of the family, 
Luna naturally had more responsibilities. She had dropped out for work before she 
could finish high school, and some of her brother's college tuition had been paid by her. 
She had worked hard and lived a difficult life, so when she looked at Theresa, who 
seemed to have everything by birth and could marry her carefully cultivated brother so 
easily, she didn't like her very much. 



Of course, the most important reason was self-abasement. The existence of Theresa 
always made her feel inferior and as 

if she had lived her life for nothing. However, all the dislikes were only in her heart, and 
she hadn't dared to show them 

at home. She had pretended to be very intimate with Theresa, but now it was different-
The highly educated, good-looking, well-off Theresa was just a person who had children 
with others because of cheating, and even her father hated her. Luna's inferiority to 
Theresa was suddenly transformed into a sense of superiority. What Theresa had done 
was something she couldn't do in her life. Coupled with the fact that her husband's 
business had been good these years, and the family conditions had improved, she 
didn't have to cover her hatred anymore. 

She looked at Theresa and said confidently, "It's been a long time!" 

Theresa greeted, "Long time no see." 

Luna checked upon Theresa, along with Leonard and Ben, the two bastards she had 
with some man, and said, "Bring the kids to buy clothes?" 

"Oh, yes." Because her tone was polite, Theresa kept it the same way. 

But the children were different! Luna's son, Jake, stood aside and pointed at Leonard 
and Ben, "Mom, their clothes stink. They look like beggars." 

Luna heard Jake's words and scolded him, "Jake, how can you say that about other 
children? It's not their fault that they 

can't wear good clothes! Their mothers don't have money. How embarrassing it is for 
others if you say that!" "Oh." Jake was reprimanded by Luna and temporarily shut up. 

Luna looked over at Theresa but said something even meaner than her son's, "Theresa, 
you're too miserable! Look at 

you, how can you dress your children like that?" 

Theresa glanced at Leonard and Ben's clothes, wondering where was wrong with them. 
Besides, her kids looked good whatever they wore with their cute faces. 

Before she could retort, Luna added, "Our Jake has never worn these goods since he 
was a child. Kids should dress decently. Otherwise, people will laugh at their mothers 
when they go out!" 

"I think comfort is the most important thing for kid's clothes. They don't necessarily need 
to wear expensive ones. They will grow fast anyway." 



Luna smirked, reflecting that Theresa was only saying so because she couldn't afford 
expensive clothes. 
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Chapter 060 

Luna said, "If you can't afford it, I still have a lot of old clothes at home that Jake doesn't 
want, Do you need me to give 

them to you?" 

"No, thanks." Theresa didn't think Luna was being kind, she was just trying to mock her. 

Luna said, "Alright, forget it. Theresa, look at you, when you were with Jimmy, how good 
your life was! But now your life really sucks. So it's better to keep your nose clean. What 
is the use of a good education? If you do something like cheating, 

you'll lose your face, right?" 

Theresa said, "Thank you, I think my life is much better now than before." 

'I did have a good life before, but it had nothing to do with the Watson family!' Her father 
had been good to her at that time and usually had given her pocket money. Even when 
she had been pregnant at home, she still had lived a good life. These years she was 
indeed not as rich as in the old days in material well-being, but she had a better spiritual 
life, she no 

longer had to rely on her father, and she could take care of herself, also the two babies. 

Luna said, "You call this better? I can't see that you are quite good at seeking joy amidst 
the sorrow." 

While the adults were talking, the children next to them also chatted. 

Jake looked at Leonard and went to him, compared his height with himself, and asked, 
"How old are you?" 

Leonard looked at Jake and did not say anything with a cold look on his face. 

'I didn't like this Jake! Because he just actually said I was a beggar, I am not a beggar!' 

When Jake saw that he didn't say anything, he was unhappy, "Huh, you're a mute! I 
can't believe you can't speak." 



"Leonard is not mute." Ben came over and said indignantly, "He just doesn't want to talk 
to you." 

"Why don't you want to talk to me?" Jake said smugly, "Is it because he's not as tall as 
me? Am I particularly tall? None 

of the children in our kindergarten are taller than me, and they are all afraid of me, I am 
their boss." 

Jake was dominant inside the kindergarten because he was tall and physically strong. 

Leonard gave a sideways glance at him, 'the boss? I am also the boss, the boss of our 
brother. Because I am the elder 

one' 

Jake saw Leonard did not speak, so he said, "Are you afraid of me? Then I'll be your 
boss from now on, come on, call me boss." 

"What does boss mean?" Ben asked. 

"It means a person that is very impressive!" 

"Then I'm also very impressive!" Ben said, "I'm good at drawing and playing chess, and 
I can also dance." 

He started counting the things he was good at. 

Because Leonard and Ben were very smart, Theresa taught them a lot of things. The 
point is that both of them are very good at learning and have mastered a lot of things. 

Jake gave him a mean look when he heard this, "It's useless, I'm very good at fighting." 

"Really?" Ben looked at him, "You know taekwondo?" 

"What's that?" Jake said, "Anyway, I'm very good at fighting, you guys call me big 
brother from now on and I'll beat you up if you don't listen." 

"Oh, okay." Ben said, "Big brother." 

Anyway, He did look big. 

Jake heard Ben call himself big brother and looked at the little brother with satisfaction, 
his eyes fell on Leonard again, "It's your turn!" 



Leonard grunted, he is different from Ben, Ben has a good temper, but Leonard is an 
arrogant nature. He could be persuaded by reason but not be cowed by force, and he 
didn't like to talk nonsense. He turned around and was about to walk away, he did not 
want to talk to this fat guy. 

Jake was unhappy to see him leaving, 'Which child dares to be disrespectful to me? 
How dare this brat?" 

He stopped Leonard, who was about to leave, and dragged him, "I said it's your turn." 

As soon as he reached out his hand, it was pulled by Leonard. Then Leonard threw him 
to the ground with a force Ben did not say anything. 'Leonard is still so powerful! Even 
Jake, who is so much taller than him, could fall.' 

Take also froze for a moment 

Lana saw this, her eyes widened in surprise, and ran over, “Jake, baby, are you okay!" 

Jake was coaxed by Lama, only to realize what happened, then he cried out! 

I actually, thrown by him to the ground?" 

Luna looked at Leonard and said, "You, how can you bully our little Jake like that? 
What, You even hit him? Did you learn. 

that from your mother? I heard about your mother beating people the other day, I didn't 
expect you to do the same!" 

Leonard looked at the woman and snorted. 

In fact, he hadn't expected that he could throw Jake to the ground. Because Jake said 
he was very strong, so he pushed harder How did he know that Jake would be so easily 
dropped by him? 

Theresa saw this and said, "Leonard, apologize to jack, how can you hit someone? I let 
you learn taekwondo is not for you to bully others." 

Ben came over and said, "Mom, it's not true, Leonard didn't bully him, he hit Leonard 
first but was beaten up by 

Leonard." 

"That is impossible!" Luna naturally defended her son, "Our little Jack is especially 
obedient, how could he have hit him. first? But you, what kind of children can a person 
like your mother make?" 



"What do you mean?" The one who spoke was not Theresa, but Cristina Lagarde. 

Since Cristina didn't know Luna, she didn't intervene. Now, she could forget the 
children's conflict, but this woman was still personal abuse against Theresa, which is 
very excessive! 

Cristina said, "Ben has said, it is your son hit others first, obviously your son is too 
stupid, looking tall, want to cause trouble, but can not beat others. Leonard usually is a 
good boy and never fights with people, unless they mess with him. first." 

"My son is too stupid?" Luna looked at Cristina in disbelief, "How dare you say that?" 

"How dare 1? How dare you!" Cristina said, "You came up here and pointed at us, 
showing off and mocking us, and you think I can't say something about you? You said 
our children are dressed like beggars, then I also think your son looks. like a pig! Ben, 
you tell me, who started this?" 

"It was Jack." Ben said. 

Ben's ability to express himself was exceptionally strong and was completely at the 
same level as an adult. He knew a lot 

of words, so he was especially able to express his thoughts. Cristina also admired him 
for this. 

Cristina asked again, "And why would he do that?" 

"Because Jack said he was the boss, he said he was especially good at fighting, and 
wanted Leonard to call him big brother Leonard did not want to, so he was going to hit 
Leonard! Then Leonard fought back..." Ben recounted word for 

word. 

Cristina looked at Luna, "Is he making himself clear? It is your son's problem, you 
yourself do not teach your son right. 

What, a kid wants to be the boss, huh? He doesn't deserve to be a boss. Does being 
taller mean he can bully the weak? Is 

he also bully other children like this in kindergarten? Pity! He messes up with the wrong 
person. Leonard can beat ten of 

this kind of fool." 

Cristina was not to be messed with! 



 
Chapter 61 

Chapter 061 

Cristina used to do live streaming for a short period of time, she could spend all day 
having a fight with people on the Internet and she always won. Later she quit the live 
streaming circle because Leonard and Ben were much more popular 

than her. So as for quarrels, Luna was just a kid. 

Luna was furious, "Theresa, this is how you teach your children? It's no wonder your 
children are such uneducated with 

a mother like you." 

"What's wrong with my son?" Theresa retorted. 

Luna said, "Your son can lie at such a young age! You want to slander Jake? I'm not 
gonna let that happen. I tell you what, everyone saw my son being beaten anyway, so 
think about the consequences! If you don't explain it, you won't be able to get away with 
it." 

She was so angry, "This family is disgusting! And this Cristina, I don't know where she 
came from, but obviously, she's not a good person! Hopefully, she will get her mouth 
shut.' 

The shopping assistant stood aside and said, "How about checking the surveillance 
video?" They could see who fired the first shot from the video, so they would know 
whether Ben is lying. 

Theresa said, "Then let's do it!" 

She trusted Ben and believes that Ben would not lie. She had confidence in her son. 

Cristina said, "Yeah, let's check the video." 

Luna looked at the confident two, and then looked at her own son, remembering that 
Ben said Jack wanted to be the boss, she probably knew how things were. Jack usually 
told her that he was the boss at school, and the kids in the neighborhood had to call him 
boss or big brother. If they really had checked the video, maybe they would have found 
out 

that Jack hit Leonard first. 



'That is not good." 

Luna thought she could fool everyone in the children's affair. After all, no one saw Jack 
hit Leonard first. But she hadn't. expected that the shopping guide would say that. 

She glared at the assistant and yelled, "Check the video? It's none of your business. 
Who the hell are you? Just now they hit my son, everyone saw it, there is no need to 
watch the video." 

The assistant was young. And she was scared when she saw Luna's arrogance. 

She said weakly, "I'm just giving you some advice. I'm afraid others will be affected by 
you guys." 

"Others? Well, do you know how much I spend in your store every year? I'm a VIP 
customer. Also, do you know who my 

brother is? He could close the store with one word. You don't seem to understand the 
situation." 

'I'm still here, how dare she speak for a poor guy like Theresa. Is she blind? Theresa 
cannot afford anything in this 

store.' 

The assistant did not dare to say anything after being scolded by Luna. 

At this time, someone walked in, and they could hear welcome around the door. 

The store manager was the first to walk over, "Welcome, madam." 

"Long time no see, your business looks good today!" The voice sounded warm, and 
Theresa looked over and saw that it was Charlie's mother Leticia Calsis. She didn't 
come alone, there were a few people carrying things for her, seemingly accompanying 
her out for shopping. 

The store manager asked, "Are you here for inspection?" 

This mall was previously owned by the Calsis family, and when Leticia was still working, 
she would sometimes come over 

to check on the work, and the store manager had some seniority, so she knew Leticia. 
At this moment, she was respectful 

to Leticia when she saw her. 



Leticia said, "I want to buy some baby stuff." 

"You will have a grandchild?" The store manager said happily. She completely forgot 
about the dispute in the store! 

Theresa and Cristina did not continue talking because of Leticia's appearance. And 
arrogant Luna also did not say anything. She was only arrogant in front of people 
weaker than her, and for those who were richer than her, with a more 

prestigious status, the inferiority in her bones would come out again. She didn't dare to 
speak loudly, so she whispered and asked the waiter, "Who is this?" 

She knew that most of the customers who came to this store were relatively rich. The 
store manager is also a 

knowledgeable person, and those who can make her so respectful are usually of high 
status. 

The waiter said, "Of course the Mrs. Calsis of the Calsis's Group, She come here before 
she retired." 

Luna heard that and thought, 'Calsis's Group, that is Charlie's mother and Rose's 
grandmother. Jimmy said that they are particularly rich. He married with Rose, so he will 
be able to contact the Calsis family in the future, which will lead to a satisfying 
professional career." 

Thinking of this, she smiled and walked to Leticia. She said, "Hello, Mrs. Calsis." 

Leticia lifted her head, glanced at Luna, and smiled politely, "Hello." 

Leticia didn't know who she was, but she usually said that out of politeness when 
someone greeted her 

Luna said, "My name is Luna Watson, I am Jimmy Watson's sister. I've been hearing 
about you from him before, and it's my honor to meet you today." 

Leticia glanced at her after hearing the name Jimmy Watson. Leticia was not satisfied 
with the situation of the Watson family, and naturally, she was not that cordial to his 
family. 

Luna said, "Are you here to buy clothes as a gift? Let me help you to choose." 

She ingratiated herself with Leticia on the side. 

Leticia was not interested in chatting with her and said indifferently, "I'll just look 
around." 



Leticia thought of Leonard and Ben, she really liked them. But she didn't know when 
Cristina would let the children do paternity tests. But she was sure that those two 
children are her grandchildren. So she wanted to buy some clothes to give them. 

After finishing talking to Luna, she looked up and saw the two babies and Cristina were 
there. 

Seeing this, Leticia's eyes lit up and she walked over, "Leonard, Ben." 

When she got up in the morning, she watched the live streaming of Ben, but she hadn't 
seen them coming. 

She came over and hugged Leonard and Ben, "Fancy meeting you here!" 

Leonard was still angry, he was in a bad mood, all caused by Jack. But Ben was a little 
warm boy, he said warmly to Leticia, "Grandma." 

"Little boys, you're so cute! I just came to buy clothes for you two, and you are here, too. 
Tell grandma, what kind of clothes you like!" 

Ben shook his head, "No, the clothes here are too expensive." 

"No, they are not. grandma will buy you, pick whatever you like." Leticia felt sad after 
hearing this. The clothes here were cheap for the Calsis family, but the children were 
not raised by them. She was sad that the word expensive would come out of the mouth 
of Ben. She took a look at Cristina next to her, but when she thought about it, it was 
good enough that she could bring the children up herself, so Leticia didn't ask for more. 
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Luna watched from the side. She had wanted to please Leticia, but Leticia ignored her, 
instead, she saw the two children like they were her own grandchildren, which made 
Luna a little uncomfortable. 

*This Theresa was really insidious, once she and her children see the powerful and 
influential people, they would stick to 

them!" 

She glanced at Jack and said, "Go over and say hello" 



Perhaps children were more likable and it's easier for them to please people than 
adults. She also did not want her son to 

fall behind. 

But Jack said, "No!" 

"Why?" 

"I don't know her." Although Jack always said he was the boss among the children, but 
in front of his elder relatives, Jack was introverted, he was a little shy and not too good 
at speaking in front of adults. This is also because Luna's inferior personality was 
subliminally passed to the child. 

"It doesn't matter. Look at the other children, go! If you go mommy will buy you candy." 
She would not let others plck the opportunity to please Leticia. 

up 

"I don't want to" Jack was urged by Luna, so he was simply lying on the ground. 

Luna didn't know what to do. 

Leticia only paid attention to Leonard and Ben, and did not care about these irrelevant 
people. After greeting Leonard and Ben, her gaze fell on Theresa, "Why are you here 
too?" 

Theresa did not realize that she had met Leticia by chance together with Cristina until 
she was asked by Leticia. She coughed and said in a rush, "I came out to buy clothes 
for the kids and happened to see Leonard and Ben, so I came over to say hello. I 
watched their live streaming, too." 

'Leticia did not know these two babies before, but she liked them the first time she saw 
them. So it is normal for me to 

like them, right?' 

The good thing was that Leticia seemed to believe her words and did not keep asking. 
Theresa was relieved. Just then, Luna came over, "Mrs. Calsis." 

When Theresa saw Luna, her heart thumped, afraid that Luna would say something that 
would reveal her. 

Leticia didn't even raise her eyes, just focused on picking out clothes for the child, and 
indifferently responded, "Yeah?" Luna also knew she could not continue the 
conversation, so she said, "Then, take your time, I gotta go. I will visit you 



next time if I had the chance." 

"Okay." Leticia responded again. 

Then Luna hurriedly left with Jack. As for the dispute just now, Leonard and Ben had 
Leticia to cover them, so she dared 

not mention it even more. It was better to leave before they mention it. Only after seeing 
Luna leave did Theresa breathe a sigh of relief. 

Leticia picked out a lot of clothes for the two babies, filling several large shopping bags, 
Cristina said, "This is too much." 

Leticia said, "Give me an address, I will have someone send it to you. It's all for the kids, 
not for you." 

Theresa stood aside, so Cristina could only say, "Alright." 

'Leonard and Ben would be happy for having so many clothes bought by their 
grandmother." 

After shopping, Cristina took the two children away, Theresa originally wanted to go 
together, but that would be too easy to expose, so she had to follow Leticia. 

Sitting in the car, Leticia was still thinking about Leonard and Ben, "Those two kids are 
so cute." 

Theresa nodded, "Sure." 

Leticia said, "If they were Charlie's children, we would bring them back, you don't mind, 
right?" 

Theresa was Charlie's wife now, so Leticia should tell her clearly in advance. If the two 
children would come back, maybe they should have to call her mother! 

When Theresa heard Leticia's words, she was a little surprised, "Bring them back?" 

As soon as she heard this, Theresa felt her head was about to explode, 'Leticia wants to 
bring them back? No, I can't accept this.' 

Seeing the look on Theresa's face, Leticia thought she didn't like the two children and 
tried to convince her, "These two children have had a miserable life, look at them, they 
can't even wear a good piece of clothing. Since you are married to Charlie, you should 
think more about him, and by the way, persuade him to bring the two children back. This 
is also his responsibility as a father, what do you think?" 



After contacting Theresa, Leticia found that she was a relatively considerate person, 
and those two children did not seem to hate Theresa today. It would be a good idea to 
have Theresa persuade Charlie to take the children back. 

However, just as she finished her words, she heard Theresa say with a strong tone, 
"No, I don't agree!" Leticia looked at Theresa and was confused, "Why?" 

Theresa could feel that the way Leticia looked at herself was full of surprise. Still, she 
had to excuse herself, "Charlie and I are already married, and as his wife, I can't accept 
that he has children outside." 

'Anyway, Leticia thinks that I don't want the two children back because I don't like them, 
so I should make her think so!" However, she had two children before she married 
Charlie, but now she was saying that she couldn't accept that Charlie 

had two children outside. Theresa herself felt shame. 

Leticia said, "Our family is well off, we are capable to raise the two children, it doesn't 
matter." 

Leticia hadn't expected that Theresa would refuse. 

Theresa continued, "Yes, I know that the Calsis family is well-off, even if we raise two 
more children, it won't matter. 

But...I just can't accept this. When we got married, Charlie told me that he would not like 
other women and would only love me, only I am his baby. Now you're asking him to get 
those two kids back, so is Cristina coming back too? I'm not willing to do that." 

Speaking of this, Theresa deliberately stern her face. But in fact, she wanted to slap 
herself inwardly, 'God, how could I say such mealy-mouthed words? The point is, 
Charlie would kill her if he knew that she was talking to his mother like 

this saying things he hadn't said. If it weren't for the two children, she really couldn't say 
it. But now... Forget it!' After saying that, she did not dare to look at Leticia's face, so 
she pretended to look out the window. Leticia was angry 

because she hadn't expected that Theresa would say something like this. 

'How headstrong she is!" 

When they arrived at Calsis's Residence, Leticia didn't say anything to Theresa and got 
out of the car first. 

Brenda saw her and greeted her, "Mrs. Calsis." 



Leticia also ignored her and went directly into the door. Looked like she was in a bad 
mood. 

Theresa got down from the car and looked at Leticia's angry back, feeling nervous. She 
knew that she had caused a big trouble. But actually, she didn't have to care about this. 
She thought, 'It doesn't matter if I really offended her. Anyway, I 

could retire when Sarah comes back, then I just need to go as far as I can with the two 
children. ' 

Brenda saw Leticia's back and glanced at Theresa with some confusion, "Did you make 
Mrs. Calsis angry?" Theresa said, "Uh, sort of." 

She remembered the words she just said and felt that was really arrogant. 
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Brenda said, "By the way, just now Old Mr. Calsis has been looking for you, I thought 
you were not coming back until 

afternoon, since you are here, maybe you should go over and take a look." 

Theresa nodded, there was nothing to do anyway, so she went to see her Grandpa Old 
Mr. Calsis. 

When Old Mr Calsis saw her, he smiled and said, "Sarah." 

He had the chess in front of him and was playing it himself, Theresa sat down and said, 
"Grandpa, I have told you I am 

Theresa" 

"Right, Theresa." Grandpa said, "Where have you been? I didn't see you at lunch 
today." 

"Got some work to do." Theresa picked up a chess piece, put it on the board, and 
accompanied Grandpa to play chess. Grandpa remembered her name at first, but after 
a while, he only remembered Sarah. Halfway through the game, Charlie and Jonathan 
came. Charlie parked his wheelchair beside her, looking at the way she was playing. 
Charlie's appearance 



reminded Theresa of the conversation she had with his mother Leticia in the car when 
she returned. "Does he know what I said in the car? No, maybe he doesn't.' 

my mom?" 

She still pushed her luck. But the next second, she heard Charlie's voice, "I heard that 
you came back with Theresa deliberately tensed her face and said steadily, "Well, I was 
shopping in the mall and happened to meet her, so we 

came back together." 

"Did you make her angry?" Charlie looked at the woman's small face, and it seemed a 
little innocent. 

"But mother has always had a good temper, how did she do that?" 

Theresa looked at Charlie with a face that played the fool, as if she didn't know 
anything, "What, she's angry? Why?" 

"You come out with me." Charlie said and pushed the wheelchair out. 

Theresa looked at his back and continued to play chess with her grandfather, having a 
feeling of being dead. 

'Charlie shouldn't be angry with me just for this matter, right?" 

She continued to sit where she was, accompanying Grandpa to play chess. After a 
while, Jonathan came back. He saw her was still sitting there and playing chess with 
Old Mr. Calsis, he reminded, "Madam." 

Jonathan also thought this woman blew him away, 

Just now Leticia went to Charlie and scolded him. She also mentioned those words of 
Theresa and said that Theresa was 

spoiled too much by him. Jonathan was stunned when he heard those words of 
Theresa. Although Jonathan knew Theresa loved Charlie, she even dared to say that 
she didn't like Charlie's children... Besides, she also said such shameless 

words. It truly blew him up. 

Theresa coughed and said, "I will go after finishing this round with grandpa." 

Jonathan didn't say anything. However, this round ended, and he stood aside, looking at 
Theresa, the look on his face 



seemingly said, 'We can go now, right?" 

Theresa had to stand up and looked at Grandpa as if she would not come back, 
"Grandpa, Charlie is calling me." 

"Go on." 

Theresa left and went to Charlie's study. Charlie sat behind the desk and looked at her 
who walked in, "Sit down." Theresa sat down and saw there was a glass of water in 
front of her. She picked it up and drank it quietly, and then said, 

"What's wrong? I'm playing chess with grandpa there!" 

She tried to put on a busy look. 

There was a book in front of Charlie, he reached out, opened it, and looked at it for a 
while before saying, "Did you tell my 

mother that when we got married, I said that I would only love you for my entire life?" 

Theresa couldn't say anything. Although it was her own words, now retold by Charlie, it 
still made Theresa embarrassed. 
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Charlie added, "And you said that you were my only little cutie?" 

Theresa coughed, "Did I say that? I don't remember..." 

Charlie's lifted his eyes from the book and landed on Theresa's face, looking at her, who 
was playing dumb, and said, "I 

never knew you're good at playing dumb. You pretend to behave in front of me while in 
front of my mother, you do whatever you want?" 

Theresa heard him chew her out and said to Charlie, "I didn't want to be like this, but 
there was nothing I could do at 

that time." 

"What do you mean there was nothing you could do?" Charlie looked at her and asked 
curiously. 



Theresa said, "Your mother asked me to persuade you to take the two children back. I 
like you so much. I got so agitated that I didn't consider the consequences. I already 
know I'm wrong. Can you... not trouble my father because of this?" Hearing her say she 
liked him, Charlie pulled the corner of his mouth, looked at Theresa, and said, "Then 
who told me 

this morning that she didn't like me at all?" 

He knew this woman had lied! He had really thought she didn't like him! Charlie didn't 
know why, when he had heard her say she didn't like him, he had been a little 
uncomfortable in his heart. While now, there was inexplicably smugness. Theresa said, 
"Wasn't I shy? You kissed me last night, I felt embarrassed... And I was afraid of 
offending you! Charlie, you are so good that I am afraid that I do not deserve you, so... I 
don't even have the courage to admit that I like you." To 

prove that her words were true, she exaggerated. 

Sure enough, for this man, flattery seemed to be really quite useful. Charlie looked at 
her, and even his gaze softened a 

lot. He looked at her and said, "So you dare admit it now?" 

"Well..." Theresa said, "it's because... you already know, don't you?" She lowered her 
head and put on a pitiful look. Charlie saw her lower her head and said, "Come here." 

Theresa heard his words, did not know what he wanted to do, but still walked to him. 
Only to see Charlie hold her hand and make her sit down in his arms, "..." Theresa said 
those words only in the hope to move this man with true love, at 

least letting him go easy on the Cameron family. Unexpectedly, now he... 

Charlie looked at her, his eyes very gentle as if he was comforting her, "I thought about 
it, there is really no way to control the like for someone. So, since you are my wife, then 
I'll give you the right to like me.' "Uh..." What the hell was this? Did he mean she 
couldn't like him without him giving her the right? Wait a minute, Who 

cared about this kind of right anyway? 

Not waiting for Theresa to speak, Charlie added, "Don't worry about Cristina and her 
two children, they will not have anything to do with me in the future. My mother is going 
senile, you don't have to take it to heart, I won't be the same as 

her." 

Won't be the same as his mother... 



Theresa heard this and looked at Charlie, "So, no matter what your mother says, you 
won't take those two children 

back?" 

"Of course." They were not his children, why would he take them back? 

Theresa heard Charlie's words and breathed a sigh of relief. In the Calsis family, 
Charlie's words mattered. As long as he 

didn't ask, his mother shouldn't be able to do anything about taking the children back. 

 #Chapter 65  
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Theresa was relieved to think that her two babies would not have to come to the Calsis 
family Looking at the woman in 

his arms, Charlie saw her relieved look and smiled, "I never knew you liked me that 
much?" 

Theresa coughed and said, "Well." For the sake of the two babies, she would pretend to 
like him so much and be a little unruly enchantress. 

Charlie said, "I'm sleepy, go to bed with me." 

"Uh....." Theresa raised her eyebrows. 

Charlie said, "Why are you not moving? Go to the bedroom." 

Theresa hurriedly stood up and followed Charlie to his bedroom. 

Since it was Saturday, he didn't have to go to work, so he napped at home. 

Theresa, beside him, helped and served him to lie down on the bed. Seeing that he 
wanted to sleep, she said, "Then you 

sleep, I'll go out and go on playing chess with Grandpa." 

After her words, she was about to go out when she heard Charlie say, "Come back." 



Theresa looked back and saw him reach out, patting the spot beside him. Five minutes 
later, she was lying next to Charlie on the same bed. The man's breath was just off to 
the side, and she didn't dare to move but to lie straight up like a 

corpse. 

Didn't he feel disgusted with her and dislike her? Now all of a sudden, he asked her to 
nap with him, what did he mean? In Theresa's mind, a mess of ideas welled up, almost 
making her mind break down, and she didn't know what to say with her wrinkled face 
like a bitter gourd. 

Looking at the woman, Charlie thought that he was merciful and saw her like him so 
much that he reluctantly let her sleep with him. That kiss last night had gotten stuck in 
his head. Even when reading a book in the morning, he would unconsciously think of 
the image at that time... He thought, maybe because he really hadn't had much contact 
with women, he found the taste of her surprisingly good, even a little arousing. He felt 
her smell pleasantly fragrant. And with her around, it was surprisingly easy for his heart 
to calm down. 

But... Theresa in front of him pulled a long face. Charlie asked, "Are you unhappy about 
lying with me?" 

'Happy? It'll be strange if I'm happy!' Theresa thought so in her heart but did not dare to 
show it on her face, she said, 

"I'm not unhappy, I am just, too happy." 

'Is that so?' Charlie was a little skeptical. 

Theresa saw him staring at her like that and said, "Really, I'm so happy that I don't know 
how to react." She desperately 

explained, but her body unconsciously kept moving to the side, pulling away from him. 

Since she had said so, Charlie would take it that she was too nervous. He said, "Move 
over a little." 

 
Chapter 66 

Chapter 066 

"No, no need, I'm afraid I'll squeeze you," Theresa said awkwardly. Whoops, she now 
deeply understood what it was like 



to tell one lie and have to make up for it with more lies. For the sake of the two babies, 
she was really willing to do 

anything! 

Charlie saw her moving farther and farther away, then simply reached out to pull her 
back and held her in his arms, 

making her not able to move anymore. 

Theresa coughed, looked at the man who had closed his eyes, and said, "Charlie, what 
are you..." 

"If you roll farther, you'll fall off the bed," Charlie said, "Just go to sleep." 

It must be that she was so excellent that this man would be so humble. In that case, she 
had to let him take the initiative. Theresa looked at this man beside her, and for a 
moment, she didn't know what to say. She could only be held in his 

arms, watching him sleep. When she had been with Charlie before, she had always 
kept a distance. Although the two 

were married, this was the first time to be so close. 

The room was very quiet, the afternoon sunshine went through the window and fell on 
the floor. Theresa felt a little bit harsh, but charlie seemed to sleep soundly. She looked 
at the man and found it a sense of wonder to look at him closer. This man's skin was so 
good that she couldn't see any blemishes. There was fine fluffy hair on his face. And his 

eyebrows, nose, mouth.... 

Theresa looked as she felt her mouth a little dry and averted her eyes. Good lord, just 
because she said that in front of his mother, he punished her with this? It was a very 
newfangled punishment, wasn't it? She also had to admire Charlie 

because of his boldness. Wasn't he afraid that she would do something to him? 

"Charlie, Charlie?" Not knowing how long she had slept, Theresa couldn't stand it 
anymore, feeling her body numb, and asked the man beside her but received no 
response. She reached out to push him away gently, then got out of the bed, and quietly 
left his room. 

She went downstairs just in time to hear Rose's voice, "Uncle Charlie really has two 
children out there? I have never 

heard of it before!" 



Leticia said, "I have just found out. You will know when you see those two children. 
They look exactly the same as Charlie, I don't believe they are not his children." 

"Then should we take them back?" Rose said with concern. She knew that the Calsis 
family wanted Charlie to get married and bear children early. 

Leticia said, "I want to bring them back, but Charlie never believes me, saying that they 
are not his children and he 

refuses to take them back. I talked to Theresa today and asked her to persuade Charlie, 
but she didn't agree." "Why didn't she agree?" "She said she can not accept that Charlie 
has children out there." 

Jimmy, sitting aside, was a little surprised at Leticia's words, "Is Theresa crazy?" She 
had two children of her own and 

she had said she could not accept that Charlie had children out there? If they were 
really Charlie's children, would her words matter? 

Leticia rubbed her forehead, sighed, and said, "That's what she said." 

"Then what did Uncle Charlie say?" Rose asked, "He can't still spoil Theresa at this 
point, can he?" Let alone her, she couldn't even stand Uncle Charlie's own sons. Rose 
didn't expect that Theresa would be so rampant! 

Leticia said, "I have already told Charlie he has really spoiled this woman too much! She 
is not well off, and it was only because I saw Charlie like her that I kept her, not knowing 
her unruliness." 

Rose said, "Grandma, don't be angry. I don't know who encouraged her to be so 
ignorant to dislike Uncle Charlie's children despite two children of her own. Uncle 
Charlie is not an indiscriminate person, and sooner or later he will see through her." 

Leticia glanced at Rose and said, "I'm just afraid Charlie was so dazzled by this woman 
that he will listen to her on everything." 

Rose pressed her lips together, remembering that Theresa had hit her with her hand 
and Uncle Charlie had stood on her side. The more she thought about it, the more she 
felt wronged. 
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Theresa stood outside, listening to them discussing her She pressed her lips together 
and did not know what to say. In short, she would zip her mouth. 

She directly left Calsis's Residence and went back home, planning to come back later. 
As she entered her home, she saw Jimmy sitting at the coffee table in the courtyard, 
sipping his tea. Jimmy's gaze fall on her face as he raised the corners. of his mouth, 
"You are back, Aunt Theresa?" He called her by that on purpose. 

Theresa raised an eyebrow and said calmly, "My nephew-in-law is so polite today? This 
is not like you." 

Before she had asked him to call her Aunt Theresa to make fun of him. Since today he 
asked for it, she would satisfy his 

peculiar taste. 

Jimmy's face darkened. He looked at her and said, "You are satisfied now." 

"That's for sure," Theresa said, "It feels not bad to be called Auntie by the person I hate 
the most every day! How can I 

not be satisfied?" 

Jimmy looked at her smug look and said, "I heard that Charlie has two children out there 
who look exactly the same as 

him. 

"Thanks for the reminder, I already know." Not only did she know that Charlie had two 
children out there, but she also knew that those two children were her Leonard and Ben. 
Just Jimmy probably hadn't thought that the two children he hadn't wanted at that time 
would look exactly the same as Charlie. 

Jimmy said, "When those two children and their mother are taken back to the family, 
your good days will be over. I said before, with your condition, Charlie will not be 
interested in you. He married you only because Old Mr. Calsis likes you. You don't 
really think you are the Mrs. Calsis, do you?" 

"You know very well about what he thinks." Theresa rolled her eyes at him, "But Charlie 
likes me a lot! I'm his little cutie, 

his baby. See, he gave this ring to me! He won't be interested in women out there." As 
Theresa said, she deliberately 



showed off the ring on her hand. She knew that Jimmy didn't want to see her well, so 
she said these words to anger him. As expected, as soon as Jimmy saw the ring on her 
hand, his face darkened immediately. The ring was so priceless that he 

could not afford it indeed, or to be more accurate, only Charlie could give away such an 
expensive ring at will! Jimmy looked at Theresa and was filled with contempt for her 
when he thought that this woman had actually given 

herself to Charlie for money. He said, "Theresa, why are you so cheap? Is it true that 
any man can sleep with you as long 

as he pays you? But can Charlie, that cripple, satisfy you?" 

So what if Charlie was rich? He was just a cripple in a wheelchair! While a lot of women 
were waiting in lines to sleep with him, Jimmy! 

Theresa looked at him, "I am cheap, but even if you pay me, I won't sleep with you. 
Stop dreaming about it! There is something wrong with Charlie's legs, but he's still much 
better than you!" 

She looked at Jimmy with much contempt. No one had ever known his secret except 
her. After all, they had been married for three years, but had never really had sex. 

Hearing her words, Jimmy got so angry that he stood up and left straight away! If he 
wasn't in Calsis's Residence, he would teach her a lesson. But now he was, he couldn't 
do this! 

Watching him go away with anger, Theresa pulled the corner of her mouth. Seeing 
Jimmy like this, she only felt that he 

deserved it! 

She watched Jimmy leave and suddenly sensed someone staring at her. Theresa 
looked up and saw the balcony of Charlie's room, where Charlie was sitting and staring 
at her. 
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Focused on by a pair of dark eyes, she was inexplicably a little afraid and smiled at him, 
not knowing what he was thinking with his cold face. 



Theresa went upstairs. Charlie had already returned from the balcony, and he was 
sitting by the floor to ceiling 

windows with his back to her. 

In front of the rest of the Calsis family, she was very arrogant, but in front of him, 
Theresa dared not. After all, she knew 

that only if he protected her would she have the confidence to be arrogant. So in front of 
Charlie, she naturally behaved a little better She asked in a soft voice, "What's wrong?" 

"What did you say to Jimmy just now?" Charlie looked at her reflection in the glass 
window with his darkened face 

Theresa said, "Nothing." 

"Nothing?" Charlie turned around and gave her a look, "I kept you in the Calsis family so 
that you can help me get Sarah back, don't forget your real business. Jimmy is Rose's 
husband, they are already married. If you dare to hook up with him, I won't spare you!" 
Charlie said these words sternly. 

Theresa looked at him and let out a laugh. 

Charlie frowned, "What are you laughing at?" 

"Don't worry!" Theresa said, "I won't hook up with him! Why don't I hook up with you with 
the time? Charlie, you're richer and better than him... There is nothing wrong with my 
brain, why will I hook up with him?" 

Charlie's face softened a little as he looked at her smiling face. 

He hadn't known why, but he hadn't seen her when he had woken up and had 
wondered where she had gone, which turned out that she had been there talking to 
Jimmy. The thought of her having been with Jimmy before and they having slept 
together made him upset, very upset! 

Seeing that he did not say anything, Theresa asked, "Do you want some water?" 

Charlie said, "I'm not thirsty." 

Theresa looked at him, sat down on the sofa next to him, and poured herself a glass of 
water, "You just want to know what I talked to him about, don't you? He just heard of the 
children and said I won't stay long in the Calsis family and he 

is waiting to laugh at me. Then I quarreled with him. And even you misunderstood me, I 
am so distressed." Speaking of this, she looked a little aggrieved. 



Charlie looked at her face and said, "Where did you go?" 

"I went home," Theresa said, "to check on the two babies." It had turned out that 
Cristina had taken them to her place, and Theresa had come back without seeing them. 

The two sat in the room for a while before the housemaid came, knocked on the door, 
and told Charlie to go downstairs to have dinner. 

Charlie turned to Theresa and said, "Go downstairs with me to have dinner." 

"Okay" Theresa stood up and accompanied Charlie downstairs. 

There were a lot of people in the dining room. The whole family were there, and even 
Pat came over. They were all chatting before they saw Charlie and Theresa coming 
downstairs and the dining room immediately quieted down. 

Theresa instantly felt that everyone's eyes fell on her and Charlie. 

Leticia's face did not look nice. People around also had the same unpleasant look. 
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Rose and Jimmy sat together Jimmy saw Theresa following Charlie and pulled the 
corner of his mouth, waiting to see 

Theresa's show. He had never seen someone so unruly and arrogant as Theresa. 
Charlie had married her just because Old Mr Calsis was senile and mistook her for 
Sarah, but she even had offended Rose and thought of herself as Charlie's baby! What 
a laugh! She was just a divorced woman with no attraction. What kind of women hadn't 
Charlie met? Would he keep indulging her? 

Theresa didn't pay attention to Jimmy, followed Charlie, and sat down next to him. 

Old Mr. Calsis was also there. Everyone looked at Theresa with a complicated look 
except him who still treated Theresa the same as before. Seeing Theresa having sat 
down, he quickly handed over the bowl next to his own, "Sarah, this is for 

you." 

"Thank you, Grandpa." Theresa took the soup Old Mr. Calsis handed her, picked up the 
spoon, and took a sip. 



Rose sat aside with a complicated look. She didn't like seeing her great-grandpa being 
fooled by this woman. She didn't pay attention to Theresa, but looked at Charlie and 
said, "Uncle Charlie." 

Charlie answered then his eyes fell on Theresa. 

Pat sat aside and asked Charlie, "Charlie, how are feeling? Any better?" He came over 
today because he knew Charlie had been discharged from hospital and came to see 
him specially. 

Charlie said, "Thank you for your concern, Pat. I am feeling much better today." 

Pat said, "Good to know." After these words, his eyes fell on Leticia. He glanced at her, 
who hadn't moved her chopsticks 

at all, and said, "Mother, why aren't you eating?" 

Charlie also raised his head and glanced at his mother, "Not feeling well?" 

Hearing Charlie's words, Leticia said meaningfully, "I am not feeling well indeed." She 
had talked to Charlie about 

Theresa this afternoon, and she hadn't expected that Theresa was still sitting here now 
as if nothing had happened. Rose glanced at Leticia and asked Theresa, "Aunt 
Theresa, I heard that you made Grandma angry today?" Theresa heard Rose's words 
and she knew that Rose fully intended to see her being kicked out of the Calsis family 
now. 

Her eyes fell on Leticia, "Mother, you're not feeling well?" 

Hearing Theresa's words, Leticia pulled a long face as if she did not want to talk to her. 

Theresa had made a fool of herself and could only glance at Charlie next to her. She 
didn't know what to do since Leticia had ignored her. 

Jimmy saw Theresa's embarrassed look and raised the corners of his mouth, 'You 
deserve it!' She still wanted to stay in the Calsis family after offending Leticia? 

'Sarah, how's the soup?" Old Mr. Calsis cared very much about Theresa. With him 
around, it seemed like things would never get embarrassing. 

Hearing Old Mr. Calsis's words, Theresa lowered her head and sipped the soup he had 
handed over. Everything the family gave Old Mr. Calsis was the best. Theresa took two 
sips and found it really quite tasty, raising the corners of her mouth, 

"So good." 



Charlie sitting aside looked at her smiling face, "That good?" 

"Yes," Theresa took the initiative, "do you want a sip?" 

"Feed me," he said seriously. 

Theresa, "..." Uh... Feed him the soup? How? 
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Her brain was baffled for a moment, while the man beside her, who didn't seem to feel 
anything wrong, was just waiting patiently Theresa picked up the bowl, used a spoon to 
scoop a small mouthful of soup, and carefully fed it to his lips. Charlie lowered his head 
to drink the soup she fed him. As he drank the soup, he was staring at her at a very 
short 

distance with a hot gaze, making Theresa's face burn. 

The Calsis family had always been very strict and serious, especially, in the presence of 
the elders, the two showed affection like this, looking really a little embarrassing. 
However, Charlie didn't seem aware of it, patiently enjoying 

Theresa's care. 

Leticia sitting aside put her chopsticks on the table, opened her mouth, and said to 
Charlie, "Charlie, those two children, what's your plan?" He wouldn't really listen to 
Theresa and indulge her, would he! Charlie knew that his mother was now trying to 
force him to take those two children back. He said, "My baby doesn't like those two 
children, so I won't take them back." 

Theresa, who was sitting right next to him, feeding him soup with the spoon, choked 
when she heard his words. "What 

the hell, why do I think he just played a trick on me?' She looked at Charlie next to her 
and noticed that he had said this 

kind of stuff without his face flushing and his heartbeat speeding up! This man... 
Obviously, it was him who did not want to take the children back, but he had said those. 
The family would hate her more, wouldn't they? 

The whole Calsis family, except Old Mr. Calsis, looked at Theresa even more 
complicatedly. 



Rose had thought that Charlie would be more restrained because of Leticia's anger. 
After hearing Charlie's words, she said in disbelief, "Uncle Charlie, how can you be like 
this? Do you know that Grandma is very angry about this matter! Even if you love Aunt 
Theresa, you have to take care of your own children, don't you?" 

"My own children?" Charlie said, "Where did I get the children, why don't I know that?" 
After these words, he then looked at Leticia and said, "Mother, I know you want me to 
have children early. Don't worry, Theresa and I will try our best to let you have a 
grandchild in two years. But... those fakers out there, just don't take them back into the 
house anymore." 

Jimmy, who was sitting aside, waiting to see Theresa's show, heard Charlie's words and 
instantly lost his appetite! Charlie really planned... to have a child with Theresa? This 
woman? How could he be interested in the woman he had 

deserted? 

Hearing Charlie's words, Leticia looked at Charlie and said, "All right, don't you want 
evidence? I'll show you!" She knew 

Charlie just won't believe that those two children were his right now. But Leticia was 
unwilling to give up! Theresa frowned when she heard Leticia's words, 'Evidence? She's 
not really going to get a paternity test, is she?" 

After dinner, Theresa went back to the room with Charlie to give him acupuncture. 

Seeing her standing behind him thoughtfully, Charlie looked up at her and asked, 
"What's on your 

Theresa looked at him, "Nothing" 

mind?" 

Charlie heard her words and raised his eyebrow, "You've been moping since dinner, 
haven't I been nice enough to you?" 

He had done his best to defend her in front of the family! 

Theresa laughed at his words, "Very nice. Charlie, you've been very nice to me!" 

Charlie said, "Then why are you unhappy?" 

Theresa lowered her eyelids at his words and said, "I just don't think your mother likes 
me anymore! I'm a little worried that you'll be caught in the middle." In fact, she was 
worried about the two children and was afraid that Leticia would 



take this matter seriously. So she could only make this excuse. 

Charlie said, "Don't worry, when she goes to investigate and finds out that those two 
children are not mine, she will be 

relieved." 

It was okay if he didn't say it, but when he did, Theresa's heart was even colder. "What 
if they are?" Theresa asked tentatively. 

 
Chapter 71 

Chapter 071 Charlie heard her words and gave her a look, pulling the corner of his 
mouth, "Why are you getting silly too! I'm having a headache! Come here and rub it for 
me." He sat on the chair and leaned back Hearing his words, Theresa reluctantly 
walked to his back and helped him press his head. She was an acupuncturist and knew 
the 

acupuncture points well, so she knew how to press his head when he was having a 
headache. After her pressing for a while, Charlie felt much better. Theresa released her 
hand and was about to leave when Charlie's hand suddenly lifted up and grabbed her 
hand. Theresa was stunned for a moment and looked at this man, "Charlie..." It was 
okay to pretend in front of his family! But now there were just the two of them and no 
one else, did they still need to pretend? Charlie pulled her over and let her sit downı 
beside him, saying, "Don't take matters about the family to heart, just do what you 
should do and leave the rest to me! No one can bully you." With her hand in his, 
Theresa looked at the man, hearing his words, and found that he was actually 
comforting her. She said, "I know! With you around, I don't have to worry about 
anything. By the way, Sarah's mother called earlier and asked you to go home with me 
for a 

meal." 

"A meal?" Charlie laughed, "That kind of person doesn't deserve to have a meal with 
me!" Theresa and Sarah were not blood sisters. But Leal was different, she was Sarah's 
blood mother! Charlie didn't even want to see her! Theresa said, "Don't you want Sarah 
back? She won't let Sarah come back until she is relieved to see us married and 
together. So do you want to go together and see?" "OK," Charlie immediately agreed 
alter listening to her analysis. Theresa asked, "So when are you Iree? Do you have time 
tomorrow weekend?" "Yes." "Then we'll go over in the evening. I'll tell her in advance." 
Theresa said. Charlie nodded, "Okay." 

Out of Charlie's room, the driver he arranged was driving Theresa home. In the car, 
Theresa sent a message to Leah, (How's my dad?) (Much better,) Leah said, [When are 



you coming over to see him?] Charlie has agreed with me to go home tomorrow.) [Very 
well.] Leah said, It's just in time that your dad is about to be discharged from hospital.) 

Then I'll go over tomorrow to pick him up.) Theresa thought of her father... She had 
never had a good relationship with her father in the past few years, and she had been 
busy recently, so she had had very little time to go to the hospital. Now that her father 
was about to be 

discharged, it was a good time for her to go over and see him. Leah said, Okay, okay! 
It's a good time to take Charlie lo meet your dad. She was now quite active in 
matchmaking Theresa and Charlie, just hoping that their relationship would be linalized 
quickly. Theresa nodded, Yeah Leah said. Then I'll ask Sofia to cook dinner for you 
(onorrow. Call me then] 

Okay I Theresa looked at the messages from Leal and remembered that she had never 
been so polite to this stepmother all these years, which seemned a little ironie now. 
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opened the car door and got out of the car. The driver soon drove the car away. 
Theresa was about to enter the door when she suddenly saw the car next to her put its 
lights on and sound the horn twice. She took a look and found it was actually Jimmy's 
car. Jimmy stepped out of the car. He had always been waiting to see her meet 
Waterloo, especially today, he must have thought that she would have to leave the 
Calsis family! As a result, things had let him down! Theresa was not surprised that he 
would find his way here now, she just clidn't have time for him, and wasn't interested in 
him either. So she went straight inside. Jimmy was not fussed, he followed her as she 
went forward until she went into the neighborhood... the lobby and the elevator where 
she pressed button She looked at him as if he was a shadowy ghost and asked, "What 
the hell do you want?" "Is he a crazy stalker? Idiot!" Jimmy's gaze fell on Theresa's 
face, and he asked, "Have you slept with Charlie?" "..." Theresa was stunned for a 
moment because he asked too directly. She looked at him and laughed, "Didn't you say 
before that Charlie can't be interested in me? Are you proving yourself wrong by asking 
this now?" Jimmy looked at Theresa and said, "So, you really have slept with him? You 
have just known him and you have climbed into his bed so soon?" "Jimmy." Theresa 
said, "Watch your mouth! Does it have anything to do with you who I have slept with?" 
As if he had any right to take 

care of her business! Jimmy looked at Theresa's arrogant look, "How does it have 
nothing to do with me? How does your business have nothing to do with me? Do you 
know I feel disgusted wlien I see you flirt with Charlie!" He even hadn't had any appetite, 
with her and Charlie having disgusted him all night! Theresa said, "You are really 
strange, does it have anything to do with you what Charlie and I do? Didn't you think 



yourself disgusting when you said I was cheating on you in front of the Calsis family?" 
Jimmy looked at her and said, "You hurry to Calsis's Residence and get divorced right 
now! Don't ever show up at Calsis's Residence again, do you hear me?" "You think I'll 
listen to you?" Theresa looked at him and raised her eyebrow, "What the hell do you 
think you are now? Are you unaware of it? We have gotten divorced! What I do has 
nothing to do with you anymore! You have avoided me every day while I was looking 
after the children and asking you to give me the house these years. What, seeing that 
I'm living a good life together with Charlie, you got bothered? How ridiculous men were! 
They could throw you out like dirt, but if you were living a good life, they would get 
bothered! Seeing that she saw himself as nothing, Jimmy grabbed her thin arm in 
annoyance, "Theresa, I'm not joking," His hands were large and 

he grabbed her easily, with his dark eyes fixing on her. He knew Theresa had used to 
like him very much. Back then, she had been excellent, and there had been many men 
chasing her. But because he had been around, she had never looked at any other man. 
Even if a man had taken the initiative to go after her, she would have rejected him, 
saying she had had a boyfriend. Jimmy at that time, although his grades had been 
excellent in all aspects, but his family conditions hadn't been very good. Theresa's 
presence had given him lots of comfort, she even had rejected some rich men that had 
tried to pursurher, which had given him great comfort in his heart. All these made Jimmy 
think that she would like him no matter what he had donel And that she would belong to 
him forever. But now, she was... around another man, who was even a cripple. Theresa 
saw him yrabbing her arin, "Mr. Watson, if you keep pestering me like this, I'm going to 
call the police! Let go!" Jimny looked at Theresa's indifferent look, there was a mixture 
of emotions welling up. Maybe it was because of his indifference to her these years that 
she had changed her heart! 
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ut she still liked him in her heart. rieht? She had used to like him so much... He didn't 
know why he was no match for Charlie that 

cripple. With an indomitable thought, Jimmy said, "Theresa, How about we go back to 
the past?" He had always been very arrogant in front of her, especially after their 
divorce, since which his career had been on the rise, having given him a lot of 
superiority complexes. However, at this moment, he lowered his posture in front of her 
and used the tone of a plea. Theresa was thinking of how to refute his words that almost 
angered her to death when she suddenly heard this. Being stunned for a moment, she 
looked at Jimmy in his serious face, which seemed that he was not joking. She said, "It 
seems... something is really wrong with your brain?" Jimmy looked at her, took a deep 
breath and said, "Didn't you marry into the Calsis family and curry favor with Charlie just 
to anger me? I admit you have achieved your goal, and now I'm too angry to see you 



with him! So, can you stop now?" "Anger you?" Theresa said, "You think I married into 
the Calsis family just to anger you? What will I get from angering you? If I anger you, will 
you give me the house? Can I not feed those two children?" Jimmy listened to her 
words, sank his face, and said, "Isn't it just a house? I'll give it to you! I said I can give it 
to you! Those two children, I can raise thein too! As long as you leave Charlie, 
everything will be negotiable." "... You can raise those two children?" Theresa was a 
little surprised. He had hated those two children at that time, had kept preventing he 
from bearing them, and even had divorced her for them. And now, he actually wanted to 
raise those two children! 

Jimmy knew that children were her weakness, and he said, "So what if you have 
married Charlie now? He has two children of his own, the 

Calsis family will not accept your two children. No one knows what will happen to them 
in the future! But if you leave the Calsis family now, I can raise these two children." He 
knew better than anyone that these two children had no father, so there was only 
himself who could help her raise these two children Theresa listened to Jimmy's words 
and pulled the corner of her mouth, "In order to get me out of the Calsis family, you've 
really put ind lot of efforts." He even was willing to accept the children he hated the 
most! Jimmy looked at her and asked, "So, what do you say?" He really couldn't stand 
seeing her around Charlie, let alone seeing her stay with Charlie Theresa said, 'What do 
I say? You said you can raise the two children, but how? Jimmy, are you mad? You 
have already married Rose, who doesn't know now you are the son-in-law of the 
Nandlall family? You said you can help me raise the children, is that a joke? You really 
think I'm that stupid?" Jimmy said, "I have money now, how much can it cost to raise 
two children? Can't I afford to keep you? You don't have to worry about this kind of 
problems at all." "And then what?" Theresa looked at him, "I come back and stay with 
you? Listen to you and stop messing around with other men... Who 

do you think you are?" She was literally dying laughing at the smugness of this man, a 
married man who still wanted to keep her? Jimny said, "Who am I? We've known each 
other lor so many years, do we have no feelings at all? I can give you everything you 
want 

now! I'm willing to come back and stay with you now, so be content! Don't wait for me to 
change my mind." Theresa listened to his self-righteous tone as if his coming back to be 
with her was a gift for lier and she should accept it with great gratitude She looked at 
Jimny and said, "You stay with me? You think you deserve it? Does Rose know what 
you just said? She loved you so wholeheartedly that she took shots at me for you, while 
you said that to me here?" Hearing Theresa mention Rose, Jimmy said, "She's just a 
little girl knowing nothing, I love you more than her! If you hadn't insisted on 

bearing those two children at that time, we wouldn't have gotten divorced. Theresa, you 
know I still love you!" 
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"Like? Ha ha... He had put her in such a position and he said he liked her? Theresa 
laughed. 

Jimmy listened to her sneering laughter, "You don't believe? If you hadn't given birth to 
those two children back then, we would have been fine now. Wouldn't we?" "Fine." 
Theresa said, "Why don't I think so? I've never regretted bearing those two children, and 
I'm grateful to myself for having divorced you. I would regret only if I have been staying 
with someone like you. Don't talk nonsense to me and get lost, I'm bothered about 
looking at you." The elevator arrived and she was about to go in when Jimmy saw her, 
reached out, and grabbed her arm, not letting her in, "Theresa! Don't you be 
unappreciative."..." Theresa saw him grabbing her hand, "Jimmy, what the hell do you 
want? Are you drunk and fooling around here? If so, go back to yout Miss Nandlall! i 
have no time for you." Jimmy looked at her and changed his tone to a gentle one, "You 
still like me, don't deny it! Otherwise you wouldn't have put your heart into me all these 
years. As long as you divorce Charlie, we'll be fine together no matter what happens, 
okay?" Theresa didn't even look at this man, "I won't divorce Charlie." Even if she 
would, she wouldn't let him know now! 

Timmy said, "Why?" 

"Why?" Theresa said, "I like him! He's nice to me, gentle and rich, he's thousands of 
times better than you! As for you? It was just me being a tool to like you a long time ago. 
Where do you get the confidence to think I still like you now?" 

Jimmy said, "You really don't like me?" He didn't believe it! Why didn't she like him? 
Theresa said, "Why would I like a man who is divorced? Is there no man lett in the 
world? Jimmy, you think too highly of yourself! Not every woman loves you 
wholeheartedly and treats you as a treasure" Maybe it was because she had been too 
nice to him before! So that he had started getting dizzy with smugness and thinking too 
highly of himselt! Listening to her words with his fingers unconsciously clenching hard, 
Jimny tried to find a hint of lying in her eyes. But... after looking for a long time, he 
failed. It was just in time that his cell phone rang. Jimmy took a look at it, and it was 
Rose. He glanced at the phone, then looked at Theresa, turned and walked out. 

Theresa looked at his back and raised her eyebrow. She didn't know how he could have 
said such words! He was now with Rose and the whole family wanted to curry favor with 
Rose. While he actually asked her to go back to the past with him? Did he really think 
she was a 

lool? 
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Thereca ignored Jimmy and went back upstairs to find that Leonard and Ben were still 
not back. They went to Cristina's in the aftern 

to see the clothes that Leticia bought for them. Theresa looked at the time and realized 
it was late and called Cristina Soon, Cristina answered, "Hello, Theresa." "You guys 
aren't back yet?" Theresa frowned. Cristina said, "Wait, almost, I'll call a cab now." 
Theresa said, "Then I'll wait for you." She cleaned up the house and it was probably 
almost an hour before she saw Cristina return with the two babies. 

Leonard and Ben looked incredibly handsome in the new clothes Leticia had bought. As 
soon as they saw Theresa, they hugged her. Theresa held the two children, looked at 
Cristina and asked, "Why are you so late?" They should have been back long ago. 
Cristina said, "Don't you ask! Rose went to my place in the evening" "..." Hearing Rose's 
name, Theresa froze for a moment, "What was she doing there?" "Seeing the babies!" 
Cristina said, "She thinks I'm the mother of the children, so she somehow found my 
address and came over to see these two children. Then we talked for a while, so that's 
why we delayed until now." "You didn't blurl it out, did you?" Theresa was a little 
worried. Cristina said, "Don't worry! I didn't, how could I blurt it out!" She slumped down 
on the couch and said, "Rose likes these two children so much!" 

"It'll be strange if she doesn't like them." Theresa thought of Rose, who saw these two 
children as the hope of driving her away. 

Cristina said, "She seems to be quite nice, it's a pity for her to have married that bastard 
Jimny." Theresa heard Cristina's words and pulled the corner of her mouth, "I think so." 
Jimmy was a bastard indeed! Especially today, he had come to find her and had said 
something like that. I1 Kose knew, she would probably die with anger. However. 
Theresa dared not let Charlie know these words. Il Charlie knew, he would have to 
strangle her to death! It had been okay before, but since he had warned her today, 
Theresa had become a little wary of Charlie. It was obvious that he still loved Rose, she 
could not step on his boundary line. 

The next day, Sunday, Cristina did not have to work and helped Theresa with the 
twochildren at home. Theresa went to Calsis's Residence first to give Charlie 
acupuncture. In the morning, there were not many people in the house. She walked in 
the door and saw Rose and Leticia sitting on the couch, watching together the 
livestream of Leonard and Ben. Rose said, "They're really cute!" Leticia said, "You saw 
them yesterday?" 



"I did," Rose said, "they really look exactly the same as Uncle Charlie" Before, she had 
been worried that what Leticia had said might be false, and that maybe those two 
children were not Uncle Charlie's children. But after seeing Leonard and Ben, Rose was 
more certain that the two children were definitely Uncle Charlie's. Otherwise, they 
couldn't look exactly the same. Theresa heard the two of them discussing Leonard and 
Ben, and took the initiative to speak, "Mother." She have now married to Charlie, so she 
naturally followed Charlie to call his family. 

When Leticia heard her words, she raised her head and looked at her, and the corners 
of her mouth, which had been smiling, immediately sank down. She said, "I can't afford 
you calling me Mother." Previously, Lelicia had thought that Theresa was a nice person, 
she could let her raise the children after they were taken back. However, because 
Theresa had been unable to accept the two children, she had changed her inind. She 
now wanted to have the paternity test of the two children done and then... let Cristina 
marry in! In that way, There would have to leave the Calsis family. So she was not so 
polite to Theresa anymore. Theresa heard Leticia's words, the corner of her mouth 
witched. Rose", sitting aside, said to Theresa, "Aunt Theresa, I went to see those two 
children yesterday." 
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Theresa caid. "Oh"Of course Theresa already knewbause she had heard from Cristina, 
she was not surprised at what Rose had said at 

all. Rose said, "Those two children, they must be Uncle Charlie's. So... I hope you can 
cherish the last few days in the Calsis family." When the identities of the children were 
determined, she would see how Theresa would keep acting so arrogantly. Theresa 
listened to Rose's words, didn't know what to say, and plalked at the live steam. 
Because Leonard had been injured and had had to rest for a few days. Today she was 
away, he started the live stream again. She sighed helplessly and went to find Charlie 
Rose looked at Theresa's back and then looked at Leticia, saying, "Grandma, don't 
worry. Miss Lagarde has agreed with me to have dinner together with the two children 
this afternoon, I'll talk to her specitically about the paternity test then." Leticia nodded, 
"Okay." With Rose helping with this matter, she was in a relief. 

On the other hand, Theresa went upstairs and went into Charlie's room. She had 
already called before coming, so Charlie was waiting for her. He didn't go out today and 
was wearing pajamas at this moment, making him look a little lazy. With a book in his 
hand, he was sitting on the sota, looking at it. Theresa entered the door and said, "Good 
morning." Charlie looked at her, "So early today?" She came a little earlier today. 
Theresa said, "I'm going to the hospital to pick up my dad. I've already talked to Sarah's 
mother and told her we'll have dinner at my home tonight, you go by yourself then?" 



Charlie looked at her and said, 'Why are you unhappy about going home?" Theresa 
said, "Maybe I'm a little nervous about the thought of meeting my dad." "... Charlie said, 
"What's so nervous about meeting your lather?" Theresa heard his words and laughed 
slightly. "You don't know, my dad has been ignoring me for a few years. If I haven't 
married you, I guess he will keep ignoring me even if i talk to him now." "Why?" Hearing 
him ask why, Theresa was stunned for a moment. What could it be except Jimmy and 
his family? And now, he had still appeared shamelessly in front of her, asking her to go 
back to the past with him? Did he have any idea what she had been through these 
years? Theresa said, "Let's get started." She did not want to talk to Charlie about this. 
Charlie saw that she did not want to mention it, and didn't continue asking. Leah was 
not at the hospital today. When Theresa arrived at the hospital, only her father's 
assistant, Robert, was there, who had been with her father for many years. Seeing 
Theresa enter the door, he took the initiative and said, "Miss Theresa." "Hello, Uncle 
Robert." After greeting him, Theresa's eyes fell on her father's face that looked much 
better than the last time she came. 

Theresa took the initiative and said, "Dad." Jotuison raised his head and looked at 
Theresa with a slightly complicated expression. Theresa said, "Leah is not here today, I 
came to pick you up from the hospital." Johnson said to Theresa, "I heard from Leah 
that you have really married Charlie? Theresa nodded, "Yes. How is the family lately?" 

Charlie was not ayainst the Cameron tamily and helped the Cameron family deal with 
some of their troubles at hand. Of course Johnson burn about it! Heartually had been 
sure for a long time that Theresa had married Charlie, otherwise... Charlie was not an 
angel, he was not so nice that he had suddenly decided to let Theresa po for no reason. 
He turned to 'Theresd and said, "Fine" However, he still could not fully accept it in his 
heart that his own daughter had had to marry 

Charlie, a cripple! 
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Out of the hospital, in the car, Theresa sat next to her father, remembering that the last 
time she had sat with him had been a lone long time ago. Long enough... as if it had 
happened a hundred years ago. She, sitting aside, peeked at her father, feeling a little 
happy in her heart. Johnson asked, "You are married to Charlie, he did not five you a 
hard time, did he?" Theresa said, "No, he is quite nice and treats me very well." 
Although Theresa had said so, Johnson was sull not relieved at all. When the Calsis 
lamily had come to the door to marry Theresa, Theresa had already married Jimmy at 
that time. And Leah had wanted to inarry her daughter over, so he had let Sarah replace 
her. Theresa was now divorced with two children, the Calsis family really did not care 
about her alfair? He didn't believe there would be such a good thing under the sun. 



Theresa saw her lather say nothing and asked, "By the way, Dad, when you were sick, 
Sarah did not even call to ask you?" Sarah was not her father's blood child, but she was 
very good at pleasing him. In the past, when her father had felt not very well, she must 
have called 

actively Johnson said, "No, she hasn't called back since she left away." speaking of 
which, Johnson burst out sighing, "Charlie's legs are disabled, so she doesn't want to 
marry over. You're such a fool! If you are hali as smart as Sarah, you haven't had to be 
in the situation today." "It's actually good to marry Charlie! He just has disabled legs, so 
what?" As if it couldn't be cured! But for the time being she did not want to say it to her 
father. Anyway, she and Charlie were not really married! Johnson said, "How toolish, 
marriage is a litetime thing. In the future when he is old, you will have to serve him and 
suffer from it." Theresa looked at her father and raised the corners of her mouth, "Dad, 
you still love me." Theresa's words made Johnson's face darken. He pulled a long face, 
looked away from the window, and stopped saying anything. No matter whether he 
could accept it or not, she had already married Charlie, he couldn't stop it. 

Back home, when the father and the daughter just entered the living room, Leah came 
out, looked at Johnson and said, "You are back, how are you feeling? Is everything all 
right?" Theresa looked at her as she showed care to her father, and silently went 
upstairs. She hadn't come back for a long time. After she had gotten married to Jimmy, 
she had occasionally come back to live. But after their divorce, she had never come 
back here again. Theresa went upstairs and was about to go to her room to take a look, 
when Sofia, the maid in charge of cleaning, came out of her room, saw her and said, 
"Miss Theresa." Why had she come back? Hadn't she already been kicked out by Mr. 
Cameron? Sofia had been hired by Leah and never liked Theresa. Theresa didn't say 
anything and was about to go into her room to take a look, when Sofia stopped her. 
Theresa looked at this maid and asked, "What do you mean?" Sofia said with a long 
face, "You can't go in this room." Theresa twitched the corner of her mouth, "It's my 
house, why can't I goin?" She reached out, dragged Sofia aside, and opened the door 
to the room directly. It was neat inside, but... things were completely different than 
before! 
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Everything had been changed, and there were private photos of Sarah hanging on the 
wall. Although Sarah had left, her mother was at home and helped her clean the room 
very neal. The room Theresa had used to live in when she had been at home had been 
while Sarah's room next door had been smaller... 

Sotia ad followed her in. Theresa looked at Sofia, who said, "This is now Miss Sarah's 
room, and your room is next door." After Theresa had been kicked out, it hadn't taken 



long for Sarah to have the rooms exchanged. Theresa looked in here and said 
meaningfully, "Sarah really likes my things." Since she had been a child, there had been 
nothing of hers that Sarah hadn't liked. Sometimes her clothes had been left in the 
room, and she had run over and tried them on secretly. And when she had been not at 
home, she had even despoiled her room! Seeing Theresa standing aside and watching. 
Sofia asked, "If you've seen enough, let's go out! Miss Sarah doesn't like people coming 
into her room." As if Sarah was the owner of the room! Theresa looked at Sofia and 
said, "Before I left here, this room was mine." When Sofia heard Theresa's words, she 
glanced at Theresa with some contempt, "You know, that was before. Who is in charge 
in the house now? Of course it's Mrs. Cameron! You has left the house for many years." 
Who didn't know those disgraceful things that Theresa had done? Sofia's eyes flashed a 
trace of mockery. Even if Theresa came back now, she was just a substitute for Sarah 
to marry into the Calsis family. Would the Calsis family put her, a divorced woman who 
had had an affair, in their eyes? Thinking of this, She naturally spoke to Theresa in a 
much more contemptuous manner. When Theresa heard Sofia's words, the corner of 
her mouth involuntarily twitched. She held back her temper and asked, "Where are my 

things?" "It's in the room next door,"Sofia said, leading Theresa to the room next door. 
Compared with Sarah's neatly tidied room, Theresa's room was a mess. Her things that 
Sarah liked had been taken into use by her, while the rest had been thrown in here as if 
they were garbage. Theresa said, "When you are free, tidy up these things for me." 
Sofia rolled her eyes at her, "How can I be free? There will be guests at home today, I 
have a lot of things to do! You're not coming back to live anyway." She really thought 
she was a Miss! She called her so just to be polite to her! Who in the neighborhood 
didn't know what she had done? It was embarrassing to even mention it! Theresa said, 
"Leah pays you to work like this?" She had never seen such an arrogant servant! Or, 
was she only so arrogant in front of her? Sofia heard Theresa's words and said, "How 
can you call Mr. Cameron by her name like that? You are a junior anyway! It's not polite 
at all." Hearing Theresa call Leah by her first name immediately made her unhappy. 
Theresa raised the corners of her mouth, "You're loyal to your master." There was no 
wonder. She had heard that this maid, who was just Leah's relative in the countryside, 
had been called to work in the house later. Now she naturally defended Leah against 
everything! Sofia said, "You are both daughters of the Cameron family, look at Miss 
Sarah, and then look at you... Miss Sarah is usually very polite to elders, unlike you, 
directly calling their first names." "Daughter of the Cameron family?" Theresa pulled the 
corner of her mouth, "It seems you all have forgotten Sarah's last name before!" She 
had just changed her last name after her mother married here with her, and she had 
really become a daughter of the Cameron family? Theresa couldn't help feeling funny 
when she heard this. Sofia planxed at Theresa and said, "I can't explain to you clearly. 
Your last name is Cameron indeed, unfortunately, you have disgraced the Cameron 
family so much. Mrs. Cameron is asking me for something, so I'll go downstairs." 
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She finished her words, left Theresa and walked away! 

Theresa went into her room and picked up those things of hers and tidied therri up, 
which were all things full of her childhood memories 

There was nothing special but her mother's plioto. She searched for a long time before 
she found it from inside a pile of trash. She dusted the photo, saw her mother's smiling 
face, and finally put it in her bag When she came down from upstairs, Leah was 
ordering Sofia to cook. Sofia was chatting with her, "That Miss Theresa, she's not 
coming back to live, is she?" Leah said, "She has married into the Calsis family why will 
she come back?" Sotia said, "She went to the Miss Sarah's room today and found it 
occupied by Miss Sarah." "She is not coming back to live anyway, while Sarah will have 
to come back to live in that room later." Theresa stood aside and listened to the master 
and the servant's duet, feeling funny as hell. She had known, just a maid could be so 
arrogant? It must be Leah's idea! The maid had just figured out her master's thought 
before she had dared to give her a look. She then coughed and walked down. Leah 
heard her voice and looked up with an extraordinarily warm smile. "Theresa, you're 
downstairs! By the way, did Charlie tell you when he is coming over?" This woman 
flipped her face even faster than a book Theresa walked down, "No." "Then call and ask 
him, we have to arrange the cooking time perfectly, in case that he won't come all the 
time until the food gets cold." Theresa heard Leah's words, her eyes fell on Sofia next to 
her, who saw 'Theresa looking at her and was not arrogant anymore in front of Leah, 
she still had some scruples. Theresa said, "I just asked her to help me tidy up my room, 
but she rejected. Leah, if you can't control a servant in the house, just change one." 
Leah laughed when she heard Theresa's words, she glanced at Sofia and said, "You go 
ahead with your work." Sofia nodded and walked away Leah said to Theresa, 'Sofia is 
my relative from iny native place. Her family are having a hard time, her eldest son is 
sick and can't work. The whole family depends on her to make it through! At least, she 
is also an elder, just go easy on her. I'll have someone tidy up your room later." Theresa 
and Charlie would go back after dinner and wouldn't stay here anyway, she wouldn't 
waste the time! Even thougli she had asked Theresa to come back, she had just wanted 
to see how her relationship with Charlie was going! It wouldn't be that easy for Theresa 
to move back in. Theresa looked at Leah's perfunctory look and said, "I understand. It 
seems that it is also your intention to let Sofia disobey me!" "How is that possible?" 
Leah put on a wronged look, "Hasn't it always been me who has taken care of you since 
you were a child? I have never treated you badly." After Theresa's mother had passed 
away, Leah had married over and had taken good care of Theresa. At first Theresa had 
also thought she had liked her, but later she had realized that she had just been 
pretending to perform well in front of her father. After Sarah had come over and her 
father had been away, she had had more tricks behind her back Theresa looked at her, 
laughed lightly, said nothing, and went straight to the living room. Looking at Theresa's 
back, Leah raised the corners of her mouth. Although Theresa had married into the 
Calsis family, she was worried about nothing at all. Sarah just had not wanted to marry 
over, so Theresa had been made to marry over instead. With her reputation, she 



wouldn't have a good time in the Calsis family. Johnson usually had to be responsible 
for work outside, and simply had no time for family matters, let alone Theresa. In this 
house, she was the only one in charge. 

At six in the afternoon, Theresa was playing on a swing alone in the courtyard. She 
hadn't come back for a long time. Everything here was filled with her childhood memory, 
but somehow with a little difference. She had used to do whatever she had wanted at 
home, while now, there was an annoying mistress in the house in addition, 
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Leah came out of the house and saw Theresa sitting alone on the swing and asked, 
"Theresa, why hasn't Charlie come over vet. is he not 

coming over? She had known how Theresa could possibly call Charlie over with her 
standing in the Calsis Carnily, and it would be stranap that Charlie would be willing to 
accompany her home! Maybe Theresa had wanted to come back herself and had used 
Charlie as 

an excuse. Theresa looked at the time, it was already six o'clock She said, "Maybe 
there is a traffic jam! It's commuting time." "It's Saturday," Leah rolled her eyes at her. 
Did Theresa think she was a tool? She was clearly making an excuse! Theresa said, 
"Then just keep waiting" She didn't bother to explain, but Charlie was not someone who 
would break his word! If he said he would come, he would come! Leah was rendered 
speechless by Theresa and entered the door. Theresa, sitting on the swing, called 
Jonathan, who said, "Already on our way." She stood up, walked out the door, and went 
outside for a walk for a while Leah glanced at her through the window and saw her walk 
out the door, getting a little worried. If Theresa had kept her busy all day for nothing, she 
wouldn't spare her! Twenty minutes later, Charlie's car pulled up at the door. Theresa 
stood by the wall at the door and behind her was flowery vines, making her look like a 
flower fairy drowning in them, who looked in a little mess. 

Jonathan got out of thecar and took the initiative to say, "Mrs. Calsis, what are you 
doing here?" Although it was in the evening, it was still a little hot outside Theresa said, 
"You guys are so late." Jonathan said, "There was a delay!" He got Charlie out of the 
car. Charlie glanced at Theresa and asked, "Miss me so much?" "..." Theresa heard him 
and twitched the corner of her mouth, "Yes, I miss you like crazy!" Charlie said, "Let's go 
inside." Theresa followed behind him. She didn't know how many blank stares she had 
received before he had come, but luckily he had come! The several people had just 
entered the courtyard when Leah came out. Seeing Charlie, she smiled warmly, 
"Charlie, welcome! You're finally here!" 



Charlie glanced at this woman coldly. 'So this is Sarah's mother? Charlie said, "It looks 
like you have gotten tired of waiting?" His tone was harsh. Leah pulled the corner of her 
mouth, and dared not talk back to Charlie. With no arrogance which she dared not show 
in front of Charlie. she said, "Of course not, I just can't wait to meet you. Let's go inside!" 
"You?" Jonathan looked at Leah, "Who gave you the permission to talk to our Master 
Charlie like that?" For a moment, Leah stiffened and didn't know what to say. She had 
only had some contact with Jonathan before, but now it seemed that this Charlie was 
not someone to mess up with either. No wonder when she had been his future mother-
in-law, she had never saw him please her, let alone... now! She said, "Let's go for 
dinner." She took the lead ahead. Theresa followed behind Charlie and Jonathan, and 
raised the corners of her mouth as she watched Leah even not dare to breathe heavily 
in front of the two. This woman only dared to play tricks in front of her! 
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had just been discharged from the hospital, and his health was still not very good. In 
addition, he had no good impression of Charlie because Charlie had almost caused the 
family's bankruptcy before. Il Theresa hadn't married over, he didn't know what situation 
the family would be in. The thought that Theresa had married him made him feel 
uncomfortable in luis heart. Leah entered the door, saw Johnson, and said, "Dear, 
Charlie and Jonathan are here." Johnson lifted his head, looked at Charlie, and said, 
"Okay," without a simple extra word. It seemed he didn't welcome Charlie as much as 
Leah Leah was afraid her husband had offended Charlie and explained, "Johnson has 
just been discharged from the hospital to lay and is still not feeling well, so I hope you 
two can forgive him." Charlie took a look at Johnson and said nothing. They took their 
seats, Theresa was sitting next to Charlie, and Leah asked Sofia to serve the dishes. 
Leah was very hospitable to Charlie and Jonathan, serving the two to eat and saying, "I 
made these all by myself, you two can have a taste 

of them." Charlie didn't move his chopsticks. While Theresa, sitting aside, was eating 
intently. She hadn't eaten muchat lunch today and was starving Leah took a glance at 
Theresa who was only eating by herself and said, "Theresa, serve your husband to eat, 
don't just eat by yourself. Look at you..." After saying that, she turned to Charlie and 
said, "Our Theresa is just so ignorant, she didn't give you any trouble, did she?" Hearing 
Leah's words, Charlie looked at Theresa, picked up the chopsticks, indulgently clipped 
and put food, that was on his side and she couldn't reach, into her bowl for her. He 
spoke in a soft voice, "Didn't you have lunch?" "I just ate casually." Charlie said, 'What, 
has your family been so poor that there is no food for you? Theresa heard his words 
and gave him a look. Leah, sitting aside, looked at Charlie's gentle look as he was 
talking to Theresa, and almost thought there was something wrong with her eyes! This 
was the same man who had been not polite to her at all just now! Not bad! Theresa 
really had something! She had really underestimated her! Even if she was divorced and 
had had an affair, she could still hook up Charlie. But it was actually a good thing! If 



these two were not in a good relationship, she wouldn't dare to let her Sarah back! After 
all, if Charlie would turn against Theresa and pester Sarah as soon as he saw Sarah, 
Sarah wouldn't be able to marry a good man even though she wanted to! 

Charlie kept clipping food for Theresa, who was sitting next to him and being a foodie 
without saying anything Johnson, sitting aside, watched Charlie take care of Theresa. 
He hadn't thought this rumored Mr. Charlie of the Calsis family was actually 

quite nice to Theresa, which was out of his expectation! 

Alter finishing the meal, Charlie looked at Theresa and asked, "Where is your room?" 
Theresa heard his words and said, "Upstairs." Thinking of her room that had been 
occupied long time ago, she didn't know if it was still hers now. 

When Leah and Sotla aside heard this, they took a look at each other. 

Charlie said, "I want to rotake a look." Hearing this, Softa hurriedly went upstairs in 
advance 
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Leah aside kept stalling them, "Dinner's not finished yet! Charlie, it seems you didn't eat 
much, why not eat some more? Charlie looked at Leah, "I'm full." Seeing that this 
woman was dilly-dallying, he got annoyed and said, "What, I can't take a look at my 
wile's room?" When Leah heard this, subconsciously clanced at Theresa. Good for her! 
She could also report! She had thought Theresa and Charlie would left after dinner, so 
she hadn't let anyone tidy up Theresa's room, and Charlie's visit to Theresa's room was 
out of her expectation. 

Leah helplessly followed behind Theresa and Charlie and took the elevator upstairs. 
Leah walked ahead, entered the door first and saw that Sofia was still tidying up. Sofia 
had come upstairs in advance, but... the time was too limited to have it all tidied up. 
There even were only a few things that Theresa had left in the past, which were not 
enough at all. Charlie appeared at the door, took a look inside, and then looked at 
Theresa, "This is your room?" ".." Theresa heard his words and said, "No." "Then where 
is it?" 

"I don't have a room here," Theresa looked at Charlie and said, "I usually don't live 
here." "You're the only daughter of the Cameron family, and this is how you're treated?" 
". ." Theresa felt a little sad about his words. She said, "Haven't you heard of the 
saying? Once you have a stepmother, your will have a stepfather." 



Leah, standing aside, heard Theresa's words and her face stiffened, "Theresa, how can 
you say that it will make Mr. Calsis think that we are in a bad relationship!" 

Theresa heard Leah's words and pulled the corner of her mouth, "Leah, you don't think 
that I'm going to cover up for you in front of iny husband, do you? Didn't you say this 
morning that you were going to have someone tidy up my room, and this is how it is 
tidied up?" Sofia, standing aside, heard Theresa's words and said, "I'll go get a quilt. 
There wasn't even a decent quilt in the room. Theresa raised the corners of her mouth, 
looked at her who was ready to leave, and said, "No need." Sofia looked at Theresa, 
"Miss Theresa." "I can't afford it!" Theresa said, "Didn't you say that Sarah is the only 
daughter of the Cameron family? That I am just a disgrace to the family instead of a 
Miss! And that this Mrs. Cameron is the only one in charge of this house, right?" 
Theresa looked at Leali, showing her no mercy at all. Leah's face was a little still. She 
wanted Theresa and Charlie to have a good relationship, but she hadn't expected they 
would have gone this far. Theresa even talked to Charlie about matters in her family! 
Hearing Theresa's words, Charlie, in his wheelchair, glanced at Leali and said, "It 
seems iny wife has suffered a lot before I came." He had wondered why she had looked 
in a mess at the door, and she had returned home whereas she had not been happy at 
all. Leah said, "How is that possible? How dare we let her suffer at home? Her father is 
still here!" Theresa heard Leah's words and said, "Since Leah said so, then, I'd like to 
have Sofia fired! In my house, I really can't stand a maid who doesn't put me, the 
master, in her eyes, and I've never seen such an arrogant maid." She was a vindictive 
person! She remembered clearly how solla had treated lier before. As soon as Solla, 
standing aside, Neard that Theresa wanted to fire her, slie hurriedly looked to Leah for 
help. Leah pressed her lips topether and realized that Theresa was now here to get 
even with her. She said, "Sofia's family are having a hard time, twow can berlamily 
make it through it she is tired! Theresa, isn't it just a room? I'll go tidy it up for you in no 
time. Can you just 

fort but T ravaid saastically. "You are the one inchar e of this house, you said fork it then 
fortelt!" Theresa looked at Charlie, "Honey, let's pobki 
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Leah knew she was saying this because she was still angry. She retained, "Don't, I'll fire 
Sofia right away! Sofia, you go!" Of course she would not offend charlie. Now, since 
they were calling the account, she could only sacrifice Sofia! Hearing this, Sofia's face 
turned wry and she glared at Theresa. She had known that when this woman came 
back, nothing good would happen! Theresa looked at her and raised her eyebrow. 

After Sofia lett, Leah personally went to help Charlie and Theresa tidy up the room, 
while Theresa and Charlie were waiting on the balcony outside When Leah finished 



tidying, she came over and said, "Theresa, your room is tidied up, you can take Charlie 
to have a rest." Theresa heard her words and said, "No need, it's not my own room, I'm 
not used to living in it. When Sarah does not want to use my room anymore and want to 
return it to me, I'll consider it then!" Leah, standing aside, heard Theresa's words and 
frowned. What, she still wanted to despoil Sarah's room? She usually didn't come back 
to live anyway! Jonathan aside heard Theresa's words and sighed, "Mrs. Calsis, you're 
so poor! You just haven't been back to your own house for a period of time, and you 
don't even have your own room anymore." Theresa said, "It's not up to me, my mother 
passed away so early. She deliberately went along with Jonathan's words. Jonathan 
looked at Leah and said, "Then Mrs. Cameron, please vacate our Mrs. Calsis's room! 
Her room, naturally, should be returned to her." He didn't speak to Leah in a polite 
manner! It was completely a ton of command. Leah bit her lip, remembering that she 
had just tidied up so arduously for a long time but for nothing. Theresa was just 
intending to anger her and had waited until she had finished before having told her that 
she would not live in that room. This girl was really wicked! Leah couldn't get angrier 
with Theresa. Robert walked up and said to Theresa, "Miss Theresa, Mrs. Cameron 
want Mr. Calsis to go over." Theresa heard Robert's words and glanced at Charlie, "My 
dad?" She didn't know what her dad wanted to say to Charlie! In fact, she didn't even 
know if Charlie was willing to go see her father now. She was hesitating when she 
heard Charlie say, "I'll go." 

Thanks." It was great that he was willing to save her father's face! Charlie glanced at 
her and, together witli Jonathan, followed Robert to see Johnson. Leah saw Charlie 
leave, came over, looked at Theresa, and said, "Theresa, you are going too far! With 
Charlie backing you up, you are intending to anger me, aren't you? If you don't want to 
live in that room, you shouldn't ask me to tidy it up in the first place." "You were not 
going too far when you messed with my things, and threw my things in the room as if 
they were trash while I was not home?" And even the photo of her mother had been 
thrown over like trash, too. She was getting angry just thinking about it! Leah said, 
"That's your dad's idea," "Are you sure it was my dad's idea to let Sarah despoil my 
room?" Leah said in an annoyiny, voice, "What does it have to do with us that you made 
your dad angry and was kicked out of the house? If you 

didn't have an affair at that time, will you be in this situation today? i know that you are 
very proud of yourself now being a daughter-in-law of the Calsis family, but don't you be 
too proud. After all, you are divorced with two children, and had an affair. What kind of 
person is Charlie? Even if he is now in a wheelchair, he may not really put you in his 
heart. When he gets tired of playing with you, I'll scevtat you are proud of then! He was 
just a man that her Sarah didn't want alter all! 

 
Chapter 84 

Chapter 084 Theresa sneered, "These words, you can go and say them in front of 
Charlie!" She knew Leah can't do anything about her now, so the latter could only say 



so in a fit of pique. Without wasting time with Leah, she turned around and went back to 
the courtyard. In the evening. it was much cooler in the courtyard. Sofia came out after 
doing the housework Seeing Theresa sitting there enjoying the night breeze, she glared 
at the young girl, then walked away with her bag Theresa kicked the floor around her 
feet and couldn't resist playing on the swing. Her mood was inexplicably good. She had 
to admit that riding on Charlie's coattails, it didn't seem so bad! She raised her head and 
found the light was on in her father's study. She wondered what Charlie and her father 
were talking about there. 

In the study. Jolinson looked at Charlie and said, "I'm sorry, Mr. Calsis, for calling you 
here." Charlie found Johnson's tone very polite. He did not treat him as a junior at all. 
He said, "You are Theresa's father, I am supposed to respect you." 

"Actually, I called you over to persuade you to divorce Theresa," Johnson said. Hearing 
this, Charlie's face darkened, "What did you say? Mr. Cameron, I'm only being polite to 
you for your daughter's sake, you should 

appreciate it." The thing about Sarah before had already made him hate Johnson so 
much! Johnson sighed, "I only have one daughter. Although you are very good to her, I 
can't trust her to marry you." "Trust?" Charlie said, "Is the Calsis family not good 
enough? If you hado't married her to me, would your family still be here today?" 
Johnson said, "I haven't had any contact with her for years. What happened in the 
family had nothing to do with her in the first place. Marrying her to you, she will have to 
take care of you for the rest of her life. How can she live her life?" With a long face, 
Charlie looked at Johnson, not expecting this man to mock him to his face, "Is that why 
you hid Sarah away?" "What between you and Sarah had nothing to do with her." 
Jolinson said, "It was Sarah who was to marry you in the first place." "I didn't look down 
on Sarah, but your family is looking down on me!" Charlie roared. Being a proud man, 
he couldn't bear this kind of aggravation "I don't know where Sarah is, but if she comes 
back, 1'11 let her marry you! But Theresa, she didn't want to." Charlie looked at 
Johnson and said, "That's because Sarah isn't your own daughter, is it? But if you say 
so, I'll definitely marry Theresa! Ask her not to marry me if you can! You didn't pay 
attention to your daughter when you left her out all these years, so what kind of good 

father are you pretending to be now?" Charlie's words embarrassed Johnson. He 
looked at Charlie, who was wearing a roguish look on his face, and simply did not know 
what to say. While Charlie ignored him and went straight out in his wheelchair. 

Theresa was sitting on the swing, looking at her mother's picture blankly, when 
suddenly someone stopped beside her, "What are you looking at?" She froze for a 
moment and looked back to see Charlie sitting right next to her, with a dark face. 
Theresa replied, "Are you done talking to my father?" 

 
Chapter 85 



Chapter 085 

You do have a good father!" Charlie's tone was unfriendly. 

He hadn't even thought about this when he was with Theresa recently, but to his 
surprise, he was now, again, disliked by her father! When Theresa saw his darkface, 
she knew it wasn't a compliment. She looked at him and asked, "What did my dad say 
to piss you off Charlie sneered, "He told me to divorce you, saying I wasn't good enough 
for you!" Theresa laughed when she heard Charlie's words. She had thought that there 
was a misunderstanding between her father and her and that he didn't like her, but she 
hadn't expected that he could say such things to Charlie. It seemed that he still valued 
her in his heart. After all, to a man who was a father, only his daughter was the best in 
the world. Before Theresa's laugh fell, Charlie had already reached out, pinching her 
chin, "You're still laughing. Do you think I'm a crippleso 1 don't deserve you?" 

Theresa looked at Charlie, tot annoyed. The man looked proud but had fragile self-
esteem. She raised the corner of her mouth and said, "Did I say something like that? 
Charlie, you are very good. But when you have a daughter, you'll think the same way! 
Children are always the best in the eyes of their parents. My dad, he loves me too!" She 
sighed as she added, "I haven't actually talked to him much in the last few years. He 
thought I was cheating and was distant to me, like I was a disgrace to the family. I 
thought he'd hate me so much, I'm glad to hear you told me that." Her father had always 
been a thorn in her side. Especially after having raised two children, she was 
particularly prone to remember the things she had used to do as a child with her father, 
who had taught her how to swim, how to cycle... She was sometimes afraid that she 
would never talk with her father ever again because of what had happened with Jimmy! 
Charlie watched the way she was immersed in her own emotions and found that she 
always touched him in the heart when she smiled. He looked at her lips, and her neatly 
set teeth, and suddenly remembered thic last time when he had kissed her. The next 
thing he knew, his lips had landed on hers. There was a wind blowing under the night 
sky and Theresa's hands were holding the ropes of the swing Charlie's kiss was 
withaclean scent. Theresa sat on the swing and wondered why this man was kissing her 
again. 'Sure enough, if there is a first, there will be a second. Was I too nice to him last 
time? She pondered the question, and when she realized him still kissing her with no 
intention of stopping, she finally reached out and pushed him, "What are you doing?" 
Charlie stared into her eyes and said, "Punishment." 

Theresa rolled her eyes. "What did I do that you want to punish me for? You're just 
taking it out on me, aren't you?" Because her father had said things that upset him, he 
made her the target of his anger. Charlie complimented, "Clever!" He admitted he had 
been a bit mischievous. Tlie old Cameron wouldn't let him be with his daughter, but he 
was determined to play against the old man. 'Why can't I?' At the thought that he had 
kissed her again, he instantly felt better. Theresa glanced at him and smirked, 
"Childish!" Charlie said, "You're not childish? Then why are you swinging here? This is 
something your son plays with! "So I can't use it?" Theresa muttered, "It's not affecting 
you." 



She then stood up. "Come on, let's go back!" She still needed to accompany her son 
after finishing his acupuncture. Today is Sunday, and Cristina had to prepare for work 
tomorrow. With the two kids at home by themselves, she was worried as a mother. 
When Theresa and Charlie left, Leah and Robert came out to see them off. Leah bid 
Charlie goodbye warmly, "Charlie, come again with 

Theresa when you liave time" With a long tace, Charlie didn't say anything Leah looked 
at him and asked Theresa, "What's wrong with him?" 
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Chapter 086 

Theresa glanced at her stepmother, who had been embarrassed by Charlie all night, but 
she wasn't taking it out on Charlie at all. All her anger had been towards Theresa. 

Theresa turned to Robert and said, "Uncle Robert, I'll be off now." Robert said, "Take 
care, Missie." "Say goodbye to dad for me." 

"I will." 

Theresa finished and then got into the car and sat next to Charlie. Leah waved at the 
two from outside the car, as she always did in front of Robert and Charlie. 

Theresa paid no attention to her anymore. She sat in the car, withdrew her gaze and 
subconsciously glanced at Charlie beside her as the streetlights shone through the car 
window illuminating the right side of his well-defined face. 

He looked less than pleased, and Theresa curled her lips at his quick temper-She was 
the one who had been kissed and she hadn't complained about anything! She had said 
before that she wouldn't touch him after the wedding, but he had kissed her twice! She 
pursed her lips and didn't want to discuss this, just silently thinking about herself. 

"Mr. Calsis, we have arrived." When they arrived at the Calsis's residence, Jonathan in 
the front row got out of the car first. Theresa glanced at him, opened the car door 
herself and got down. Jonathan helped Charlie to get down and they walked into the 
living room. "Charlie, you're back?" Leticia sat on the sofa, her face beaming with joy 
when she saw her son return. 

Charlie glanced at his mother and acknowledged. 

"I heard that you and Theresa went back to her house for dinner?" Leticia asked. She 
had heard from the maids at home. Charlie nodded, "Yes. Is there something wrong, 
Mother?" Apart from Leticia being there, so was Rose. The two of them also seemed to 



have just returned from outside. Leticia said, "Yes, I have something important to tell 
you." 

Her expression looked relaxed and she was in a good mood, but for some reason, 
Theresa had a bad feeling, because Rose was sitting on the side with a smug look on 
her face and looking at Theresa with a bit of mockery in her eyes. 

Charlie said, "What is it?" "Take a look at this." Leticia picked up the folder at the side 
and handed it to Charlie. Jonathan reached out, took the folder 

and handed it to Charlie. 

Charlie took the folder, opened it and read the file carefully. His expression became 
complicated all of a sudden. 

Leticia said, "I told you the two children are yours. You didn't believe me. This is the 
paternity test, I had it expedited. Look. I 

didn't lie, right? Theresa stood by and just felt her limbs freeze. 'A paternity test? How 
did they get it?' She could barely contain herself and her face was full of shock. Rose 
sat on the side and didn't miss Theresa's reaction. 'Ha-ha, Theresa thought the kids 
were not his, didn't she? Now that she's seen the paternity test, she lost control so 
quickly!' 

 
Chapter 87 

Chapter 087 Rose raised the corner of her mouth and added fuel to the fire, "Aunt 
Theresa, you don't seem to be happy that uncle Charlie has children, do you?" 

Leticia also looked at Theresa. Il Theresa had not had hostility towards the two children 
at the beginning, she could still tolerate her, but now... She would have liked to have 
Cristina married to Charlie. No matter how she looked at it, Cristina would be more 
reliable than Theresa! She asked Charlie, who was still reading the paternity report, 
"Charlie, you didn't believe before that the children were yours. Now the evidence is 
here, you should believe it now!" 

Hearing Leticia's words, Charlie looked at his mother and asked, "Are you sure, there is 
nothing wrong with this paternity 

test? 

"Of course not." Leticia said, "Am I that careless? It's about whether they are your 
children or not. It's so important, so I waited all day with Rose, not until we got the 
results before coming over to talk to you. Look, you must have had something with 



Cristina before, but you forgot! Cristina agreed if you want to get your children back, but 
you have to marry her. I was 

thinking that you were married to Theresa, and this matter needed to be considered. But 
now, it seems that there is no need anymore! Theresa doesn't like these two kids, so let 
her leave! You take care of your business with Cristina, she's a mother of two children 
anyway, don't treat her badly." 

Her meaning couldn't be more obvious, it was to get Charlie to divorce Theresa and 
marry Cristina. 

Standing aside, Theresa felt her limbs go numb. She subconsciously glanced at Charlie, 
who turned out to be the father of Leonard and Ben. Rose wanted to say that he 
shouldn't abandon his own children, while Leticia stopped her. Hence, she closed her 
mouth. 

"I'm tired, take me upstairs," said Leticia. 

"Okay." Rose nodded, and she helped Leticia up the stairs. "Grandma, why don't you let 
me talk about it!" 

*There is no need." Leticia said, "Since Charlie knows it's his children, he'll definitely 
take care of them. He just didn't believe it before, and was led by Theresa." 

Rose took one look at how certain Leticia was and nodded, "Okay." 

In the living room, it was very quiet, Charlie stared at the paternity test, and his face was 
very complicated. 'Cristina really has my children? How is this possible? He glanced 
back at Theresa and said, "You go back first today!" He knew that she must be sad, but 
he had to find out about 

the kids, and he couldn't be bothered to coax her now. He then turned to Jonathan and 
said, "Jonathan, you come up with me." - 

With Charlie's words, Jonathan followed him upstairs. 
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Theresa looked at Charlie's back and frowned. He had sworn that he would not take the 
children back before because he had thought then the children were not his. It looked 
like he had changed his idea now, 



"What now? What should I do now?' 

Theresa was somewhat lost as she came out of Calsis's residence. As she walked out 
the gate, just in time to run into 

Jimmy who had returned from outside. Seeing her in this state, Jimmy called her. 
Theresa ignored him and walked past straightly, about to get away when he stopped 
her again. 

He looked at her depressed face, as if she had lost her mind, and raised the corners of 
his mouth, "I heard the paternity test 

for the children has come out and Charlie really has two children out there. Didn't you 
say that he loved you very much? Didn't you want me to call you Aunt? What's now? 
Can't accept the reality, huh?" "Get out of the way. Theresa reached out and pushed 
him. She couldn't care less about his sarcasm now, all she could think about was her 
two children. 

'What will it take to keep them from bringing the children back to the Calsis family? How 
am I going to keep my two babies?' 

It was as if she had already seen the tragic scene of the two children being brought 
back to the Calsis family, then Sarah came back and she had to leave the two children 
to them! Once they are acknowledged by the Calsis family, Leonard and Ben, for sure, 
wouldn't be able to stay with her. 

Jimmy had not expected that a single blow from Charlie would be so hard for her. This 
woman, who clearly had used to like him the most was now acting like she was dying 
for a cripple like Charlie. He looked at her and said, "Can't you find someone else if 
Charlie doesn't want you? Is it necessary to make such a 

sympathetic show? I've told you before, don't get your hopes up about the Calsis family. 
Who do you think you are? Just a divorced woman! Even if Charlie treats you well on a 
whim, that's just like taking pity on a beggar on the street, will he really like you? Now 
that his sons are back, it's only normal that he doesn't want you, who was so arrogant 
before and dare to offend even his mother?" 

Theresa didn't make a sound. 

He looked at her, and in a rare moment, he felt a bit sorry for her, and said with great 
compassion, "Actually, what I told you before is not impossible, as long as you draw a 
clear line with Charlie and are willing to come back to me, I will still take care of you. 
What do you think?" He lifted his hand, wanting to touch her cheek, wondering if he was 
sick to think she was not bad lately. Maybe men were 



like that, especially after finding out she was having an affair with Charlie, he... quite 
wanted her to come back to his side! After all, it is natural to keep his own woman by his 
side. Before his hand could touch Theresa's face, Theresa raised her hand to stop him, 
she glared at him, 'Nuts!" She pushed 

Jimmy away and ran straight away. 

She took a taxi and went straight home. In the car, she called Cristina-She didn't know 
what was going on, but Cristina certainly knew. As it turned out the phone couldn't be 
connected. She hurried back to the house and found that Cristina had not yet left and 
was having a midnight snack with her two babies. Without changing her shoes, Theresa 
walked straight up to Cristina and said, "Why didn't you answer the phone?" "You 
called? Cristina gave her a calm look, 'The battery went out, I'm charging it now! Do you 
want some? Barbecue bought downstairs Boby, what's wrong with you? Who bullied 
you?" Theresa just felt a throbbing in her temple, "Leticia got the paternity test today, it's 
Charlie's with Leonard and Ben. What's going on?" 

Cristina coughed when she heard this, and looked away sheepishly 

"Talk!" There was unkindness in Theresa's tone. 

Both kids sot on the side and dropped the yoghurt in their hands in shock. Ben 
murmured, "Mum..." Cristina saw that Theresa already knew about it, she couldn't hide 
it even if she wanted to, so she tugged her sleeve and said, 

The children are still here, don't be so aggressive, you scored them. Take your time, sit 
down and I'll tell you: 

Theresa cat back down and let out o breath, she had already thought of every bad 
possibility on her way back. 
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Cristina said, "I'm just trying to figure out whether Charlie is Leonard and Ben's father. 
The result came out so soon? They are really Charlie's children! Isn't that great? Now 
that you and Charlie are married, Leonard and Ben can live with you together at Calsis's 
Residence. How nice! They have a father, too!" 

"Cristina!" Theresa cried out. "Are you crazy? How many times have I told you? And you 
have always promised me that everything will be fine. Is that what you promised me? 
Did you take two children to do a paternity test?* Cristina looked at Theresa and said, 
"Isn't it good for you?" "Good for me? Do I need you to do this for me? What should I do 



now?" "Forget it. I'm going back." Cristina looked at Theresa and was a little upset by 
what Theresa said. She stood up and had to 

Cristina even didn't eat anything. 

After going out, Cristina closed the door. Theresa heard the sound of closing the door, 
and then she looked at Leonard and Ben. But she found two babies looking at her with 
worried expressions, She looked a them with a terrible headache. After a while. Ben 
said, "Mom, are you all right?" "You keep eating." Theresa eased the atmosphere, 
knowing that she shouldn't have reacted so strongly in front of her sons. But just now... 
She was a little flustered! Ben looked at Theresa and said, "Mom, Sister Cristina said 
that I have a father. Is it true?" Theresa was stunned by Ben's words. She looked at Ben 
and then looked at Leonard. When they mentioned Dad, they seemed to be looking 
forward to it. 

Other kids all had their fathers, but they hadn't had one since they were young. Since 
they heard that they had a father, they couldn't hide the expectation in their eyes. 
Theresa was grieved. She didn't know what to say to her babies. She said to Ben, 
"Does Ben want to live with Dad? Would you still like to live with your Dad if mom 
doesn't live with you?" When Ben heard this, he shook his head desperately. "No, mom, 
I don't want Dad anymore. Don't leave me and Leonard, all 

right? We like mom the most. We will always be with mom." He wanted to have his 
father, but the base was that he should be with his mother. If... he could have his father, 
but he needed to lose his mother, then he didn't want his father! Theresa looked at him 
and smiled sadly She really wanted to pack the things well and leave with her sons 
directly. In this way, she did not need to face things here. The next morning. Theresa 
had just woken up and was looking for clothes for the two children next to her. This idea 
suddenly came into her mind. Leonard and Ben were changing clothes. The two 
children obviously forgot what had happened yesterday. Ben stood on the bed and said 
to Theresa. "Mom." 

"Yes?" 

"Let me show you the dance that the teacher taught me, okay?" Because they needed 
to perform a show, the kindergarten 

had already started teaching the dance. Theresa said, "Okay." Ben looked at Leonard, 
and then the two kids danced on the bed. 

It should say that this dance was cool and good. Theresa only watched the star babies 
dancing very well on TV. She never expected her two little boys to dance in the same 
way When they finished dancing, Theresa clapped her hands and said, "Leonard and 
Ben are great!" 



Den soid, "When we perform and get the bonus, we will have the money to buy things 
for mom. Mom, don't be sad, okay?" 

Theresa was stunned by Ben's word. Did this little guy still remember that she was 
unhappy last night? 

She nodded 'Okay 

Leonard and Ben loved their life in kindergarten now. They were full of confidence. She 
couldn't really ignore everything and took thern away as she wanted. 

She tidied up the house and sent her two children to school as usual. Then she called 
Cristina and went to Cristina's house. 
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Cristina was supposed to go to work today, but because of what happened last night 
she hadn't gone to work. When 

Theresa came, she had just woken up. Her eyes were red from crying, and she looked 
a little embarrassed in her pajamas, When Cristina opened the door and saw Theresa, 
her tears fell at once. "Tess." Theresa looked at her and said, "I didn't cry. Why are you 
crying? Cristina lowered her head and said, "Did I bring you trouble? I didn't expect you 
to be so angry I really think it is good for you and want to find a good future for you and 
the babies." 

Theresa didn't trust Charlie, but Cristina really thought Charlie was very good and 
wanted to bring them together. 

She had no choice but to determine the identity of the children first, but she didn't 
expect that it would make Theresa so 

sad. 

As Theresa was sad, Cristina came back last night and didn't also sleep well all night! 

Theresa looked at Cristina's sad face and said, "Don't cry" She walked through the 
door. Cristina followed and sat down on the sofa Theresa took the tissue and handed it 
to Cristina "You should control your emotion and stop crying, I will cry if you continue to 
cry Cristina took the tissue, blew her nose, and then looked at Theresa with red eyes. 
"Are you not angry with me?" 



Theresa said: "What can I do if I'm angry with you? Now the key is to solve the problem. 
Since he knew Leonard and Ben were his children, his family would definitely find a way 
to find you. Now you should solve the problem for me!" Cristina looked at Theresa and 
said, "Oh." Theresa said, "I can't let the two children go back to Calsis's Residence, do 
you know that? No matter what happens, you should not promise them. You've messed 
up things. If you mess me up, I will..." She stared at Cristina and thought for a while, but 
she still didn't find a good way Cristina said, "I know. I won't promise anything at all. 
Don't be angry with me. When you get angry, I feel bad. We have always been best 
friends. I never expect you to be so angry with me." "Do you blame me?" Theresa 
looked at Cristina and knew that Cristina was really the only one who was good to her 
over these years. So she didn't believe she had any bad intentions! 

Cristina said, "No, no! I know you feel sorry for Leonard and Ben. It's my fault. I was too 
hasty! Did they go to school? 

"Yes." 

*Then let's go out for dinner!" 

"Don't you go to work today? Theresa looked at her. 

Cristina said, "I asked for leave. You see, how can I go to work like this?" 

Her eyes were red. 

Theresa looked at Cristina and signed. 

Cristina said, "I'm going to wash up. Just wait for me." 

As Theresa came, she was relieved! Cristina had just entered the washing room when 
the doorbell rang. She said to Theresa. "Open the door for me." Theresa stood up, 
walked to the door, and opened it. But it was none other than Jonathan and Charlie who 
stood at the door Seeing the two men, Theresa was stunned. Jonathan was also a little 
surprised. "Mrs. Calsis." 

Why was she here? 

This was Cristina's house Charlie and Jonathan found it according to Cristina's address! 

When Jonathan asked, Charlie sot in a wheelchair and looked at Theresa. His face was 
full of quests. 

"Who is it?" Just then, Cristina came out. 

Because Cristina cried all night, her eyes were still red, which made her look very pitiful, 
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Sin. this, Jonathan looked at Theresa in a complicated way. Well, she was so quick. 
She just know about the children, and she had come here to make trouble with Cristina 
Cristina was surprise when she saw Charlie Then she looked at Theresa again. 
Theresa was here, and Charlie saw this... Did the matter expose? Charlieplancol at 
Theresi and said, 'You come out with me." He turned his wheelchair aside as he said. 
Theresa looked at his back, pressed her lips, and followed. He wouldn't know about her 
acquaintance with Cristina, would he? Would he know the matter related to her 
children? "Theresa was a little worried, 

Although she knew Charlie would come, she didn't expect him to come so soon! Seeing 
that Charlie called Theresa away, Cristina looked at Theresa's back several times. 
Jonathan looked at Cristina and said, "Ms. Lagarde, are you all right?" Cristina was 
shocked after hearing Jonathan's words. Then she rot her sense, "L... I'm fine." Whiy 
did he ask this? He was so strange Jonathan said, "Shall we go to your house?" He 
came here today to talk to Cristina about the children Cristina answered. "Come in" She 
invited Jonathan into the door. Charlie stopped in the corridor, and Theresa also 
stopped. Then shes.uid to Charlie, "Mr. Causis, Te you coming here to see Ms. 
Lagarde? You said that you would not take the child back. Now it seems that you have 
changed your mind, right? He knew it was his children. So he quickly came here to see 
Cristini, ipht? If Charlie also wanted to take the children back, Theresa thought she 
should pay tnoreittention to this "I thought you were a wise mani. How could you do 
sucha stupid thin: "Charlie sdina bud mood Theresa was shocked when she heard this. 
She looked at Charlie Stupid thing What did she do? Seeing that Theresa was in a 
daze, and it seemed that she did not know she had done something wrong, Charlie 
explained. "Why did you come to Cristine? It she cried and said this to Calsis's 
Residence, what would Moun think of you "Do I make her cry? Theresa looked at 
Charlie in disbeliet. She was shocked at first, and then she got her sense Did he think 
she came here to find trouble with Cristina? Charlie said, "You stay at home these two 
days. I will deal with this matter." Theresa looked at Charlie and said, "Do you want to 
take the children back to Calsis's Residence? At this time, his ideas were very 
important. Last night, this matter happened all of a sudden, and she didn't have a 
chance to ask. But now, Theresa still wanted to ask him. Charlie looked at her and said, 
"Ms. Camerson, you should not ask this. When we got married, we had signed an 
agreement." Charlie said in a businesslike manner, Theresa looked at hin. Recently, 
she had a good relationship with him, so she forgot many things. At this moment, she 
remembered something when she leard his words. Yes! Yes! They signed an 
agreement! So how dareshe expect that she could get her children when they returned 
to Calsis's Residence? She looked at Charlie and smiled bitterly. "Sorry, I shouldn't 
have asked this." How could she expect that he would let lies children go? 



Theresa looked at the time "I'm not feeling well these two days. You should find 
someone else to do the acupuncture L.. I want to rest for two days." Theres.left when 
she finished her words. 

Charlie looked at her back and frownied. They just got married by agreement. In his 
eyes, Theresa could not accept his children because she love him. 
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This woman Wiwillful and neasonable, and he shouldn't indulge her so much at all But 
when he found she was in such state, i ncomfortable in his heart Now, he had his chilen 
and wanted to take the children back. So she lost her temper and stopped working for 
him, riphit? 

Instead of going back to Cristina, Theresa went straight into the elevator, went 
downstairs, and left. Then Charlie entered Cristina's house. Cristina was sitting on the 
sota, and Jonathan was also there. Cristini's eyes were red. When she saw Charlie 
come in, she looked at him. Well, where was Theresa? Did not they come in together? 
Charlie parked his wheelchair and looked at Cristina. He did not believe that this woman 
had his children. Unexpectedly, she really had. his children! Seeing that Charlie did not 
say anything, Cristina said, "Mr. Calsis, are you going here to talk about children?" 
Charlie said, "I heard from my mother that you want to marry me, night?" She even 
threatened his family with the childrerz Did she really want to marry him? That was 
interesting! Cristina looked at Charlie and said, "Mi Calsis, I have a question for you." 
Charlie said in a bad tone. "Just say it." Cristina said, "Do you love your wile?" The 
reason why she asked this was tosce the personality of Charlie. When he took the 
children back to Calsis's Residence, would the things that Theresa was worried about 
happening? Theresa did not want to take the children back to Calsis's Residence, 
because she had worries in her heart. So she should ask this question for Theresa, 
Charlie looked at Cristina. Ile thought Cristina wanted to marry him, so she asked this 
question! But this was simply impossible! Not to mention that he married Theresa, 
Charlie was not a person who liked to be threatened by others He said, "Ms Lagarde, 
instead of marrying me, you should explain why you have my children. If you did not 
explain it clearly, you could not marry me, and I wil sue you for stealing my child" 
Cristina felt terrible when she heard this. Then she said, "Who are you? Do I want to 
give birth to your child? You think too much. How dare you say that you will sue me?" 
Fuck! This man was so shameless! Didn't pretend to be a child because it suited you! 
Charlie said, "If you don't explain clearly, I'll let the lawyer talk to you." He thought about 
it last night. If the child was his, he should take them back to Calsis's Residence, and 
Theresa would support them. He would never marry this woman But how did this 
woman have his child? He should know this well. Otherwise, if other women also did a 
thing like this woman, what should he do Crist said, "I've never seen such a shameless 



person as you!" It seemed that he would sue Theresa when he knew Theresa was the 
mother of the child in the future. He was so stmeless! No wonder Thera resisted letting 
him know the existence of the children. Theresa kanew him well. Jonathan said, "Ms. 
Laparde, you should be polite." "Didle stow us polifeness to me? Do you think it's easy 
to give birth to two children? Do you know how much I suffered when I gave birth 
tothese twochildren/" Stor almost dropped a clanper. Fortunately, she was witty and 
changedler words quickly. Churle looked. Cristin, who was scolding all the time and said 
to Jonathan, "It seems that Ms. Lagarde can't communicate politely. 

the lawyer communicate wihher Jonathanded Then they went out topeter. Cristina stood 
at home, looking at another two men who had walked in fust now. They were so 
arrogant. Fuck! Why did she suddenly regret letting Theres marry this man? 
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Charlie and Jonathan came out of Cristina's house Jonathan said to Charlie "By the 
way. Mr. Calsis, where is Mrs. Calsis Charlie answered imaludtone "I said something to 
her, and she was alijity. Thus she ran away angrily. I just said she should not involve in 
this matter." He would deal with the matter related to Cristina. 

Theresa came here to Cristina alone, and it was not good for her. Hearing this, 
Jonathan said, "It seemed that Mrs. Calsis did not want you to take two children to 
Calsis's Residence! Although she loved you, how could she stop you doing this? That 
was your children!" Hearing Jonathan's words, Charlie said, "When do you have the 
right to talk about my wife?" Jonathan, "..." Excuse me! Fuck! As an outsider, he felt that 
Theresa's reaction was a bit excessive. Unexpectedly. Charlie didn't mean to blame 
Theresa, 

Would Mr. Calsis indulge Theresa too much? He wanted to remind him that Theresa 
was just a divorced woman! They just got married by agreement! Jonathan looked at 
Charlie and dared not to say anything. He was afraid that Charlie would feel that he was 
a busybody. When they got into the car, Jonathan looked at Charlie and asked, "Shall 
we go straight home?" "Go to Tlieresa's liouse." He did not have acupuncture last night 
and today! 

This woman left in anger, and she was irresponsible! When Theresa left Cristina's 
house, she did not go home directly. After hearing Charlie's words, she decided to leave 
here with her two 

children Now, she could not count on Charlie. She still had two days, and she should 
find a way and move away from this place. She went to see the house directly before 
going home. Charlie knew that she lived here. If she still lived here, it would be terrible 



Charlie would send someone to find her! After seeing the house, she bought some food. 
She prepared to cook at home. After lunch, she would pack the things and leave here 
with her children when they returned home. She wanted to leave here as soon as 
possible! When she entered the lobby on the first floor of the community with food, she 
saw Charlie and Jonathan waiting by the sofa in the lobby. 

Theresa was shocked when she saw Charlie. Why was Charlie here? Did he know it 
was her children from Cristina so soon? Now, she believed that Cristina had let 
something slip. If this was true, what should she do? Theresa was nervous, sweating 
She hesitated whether she should go in or not. How about walking away directly? When 
she just got this idea, Charlie's voice sounded. "Come here." It was a totally comitia 
ndugtone The walked to Charlie and looked at him. Then she asked, "Why are you 
here?" Seeing that a wasina bad mood, Charlie said, "Are you still angry?" Ther. Was 
she knd She Wasanry Why? Theresa sid, "Didn't ask for leave? Charlie said, "Can you 
decide it? Theres. don't force that we simned nurteennent. As lonas Sarah doesn't 
come back for one day, you can't leave You also promised to do acupuncture Would it 
be too irresponsible for you to love me now?" 
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There was in a bad mood. Secine that Charlie tauglit hier in such a bad tone, she said 
directly. "I am such an irresponsible person and what's the matter?" Charlietrowed when 
he heard this. "In this case, we can just let Cameron's Residence fo bankrupt! And I am 
unhappy with the word from your Dad yesterday" 

"You... Theresa brancanxious when she heard that he was going to let Cameron's 
Residence go bankrupt." She looked at him and said. "Charlie, what do you want to do? 
"I just want you to give me acupuncture, and is that OK?" 

Charlie looked at her and softened his tone. "Be obedient, don't make trouble. Your 
temper is getting bigger and bigger!" Jonathan stood beside then and looked at Mr. 
Calsis. It was your fault, and you spoiled her so much! Otherwise, how could she say 
this in front of you? Theresa glance at the two men. She knew that she could not ignore 
them directly. She was about to leave. To ensure that she could leave safely she could 
not raise his attention She said to charlie. "I'll get my things upstairs. Wait for mea 
minute." 

"No, we can do it at your house." Charlie said. "..." Theresa looked at him and said, "No. 
I don't want to let the man stay in my house." "I am your husband," she turned him 
down. Charlie smiled. He was willing to go to her house because he looked up to her! 
This woman.. even relused him! 



Theresa did not want him to stay in her house, because no one would go to her house 
except Cristina. There were so many things of children at home, and she could not let 
Charlie see this. She said, "My house is a mess, and I don't want you to see it." "I don't 
care." Charlie insisted on going upstairs with Theresa. Theresa glanced at him and had 
no choice but to take Charlie upstairs. When she got upstairs, she took out the key and 
opened the door, Charlie knew that she didn't want to let him in, but he didn't mean to 
leave at all. Theresa was depressed and had to open the door. When she got inside, 
she checked it. There was nothing in the house except some children's clothes, toys, 
and books. Fortunately, she didn't like to put photos in the living room at ordinary times. 
She breathed a sighof relief for a while and let Charlie and Jonathan in. The house was 
not big She went to get the things related to 

acupuncture and began to prepare They did acupuncture in his house all the time, and it 
was the first time to do it in her house. It took half an hour todo acupuncture. When it 
was over, Theresa said, "All right." She began to pack her things. Seeing that Charlie 
and Jonathan still stood there, she said again, "It's over. You can go back." Charlie 
looked at her. "Let's have lunch together!" Seeing that Theresa was still in a bad mood, 
Charlie wanted to comfort her. 

Theresa didn't have a good impression of him now. When she thought that he would rob 
her son in the future, she treated him as an 

Theresa said, "No. You can go by yourself. I'll cook at home." "Can you still cook?" 
Charlie looked at her with doubt. "Is your cooking edible?" *_*Theresa twitched the 
corner of her mouth and said, "So, Charlie. what do you want to do? I'm in a bad mood. 
Get out of here 

quickly!" 

Charlie naturally knew the reason why she was in a bad mood. Thus he coaxed, "You 
can rest assured that you can support my children when I take the back. I would not 
marry Cristina. Whether you have children or not, it will not threaten your status.' 

Hearing what Charlie sald, Teresa telt much more terrible. Theresa looked at Charlie 
angrily she didn't care il she still neceu to get something from him. She said to Charlie, 
"Get out!" Now, this itin was in her house, and he said he would get her children. 
Theresa could not accept it. Juluhan looked at Theresd and warned, "Mrs. Calsis, you 
have gone too lar! You only signed an agreement with Mr. Calsis, and you are tot his 
real wile You have to right to interfere with children's allars. Mr. Coilsis treated you so 
well, and you don't know how to appreciate other's lavors." 

 
Chapter 95 



Chapter 095 "..." Theresa was much angrier when she heard Jonathan's words Chemic 
aid. "Of course, I know my identity Jonathan, you don't have to remind me. However, 
here is my house, and I naturally have the right to let irrelevant people leave" Hearing 
Theresa's words, Charlie sad to loathan "jonathan, you go out first." Hearing this, 
Jonathan was worried Mut Charlie asked him to go out, so he took the initiative to walk 
out of the door. When he went out, he closed the door, leaving Theres and charlie alone 
in the room. It was quiet in the room. Theresa turned her back on him."You should go, 
too. You are not welcome in my house." Because Theresa was in a bad mood, Theresa 
was not in a good attitude. Dut Charlie said lelund her back. "You can cook now, and l'in 
hungry." Theresat looked bucket Charlie "I asked you to go out. Can't you understand 
me?" "You said that you would let the irrelevant people leave. Jonathan had left, and I 
could stay here now." Charlie said. Theresa. "..." I was so reasonable that she couldn't 
refute it! Theresa said to Charlie, "Acupuncture is over. What else do you want to do?" "I 
want to have lunch with you."Charlie was not stupid. Now, Theresa was angry, and she 
asked him to leave. But if he really left, she would be angrier. He needed to stay here to 
coax her! Theresa said, "But I don't want to have lunch with you." "Don't worry." Charlie 
said, "Even if I take the children back, you are still my baby. How old are you? Don't be 
angry, and you look 

stupid." 

"..." Theresa thought Charlie would say that they just got married by agreement, and 
she should not take care of the matters related to him. But he... 

He even said that she was his baby confidently. What's more, Charlie said this calmly, 
and he did not think it was corny words. Theresa said to Curlie. "Do you think I'm angry 
with you because I'm jealous of that woman? Charlie looked at her. "Or what?" "L" 
Theresa choked. The reason why she was angry was that he wanted to rob her baby 
But she dared not to say this in front of him. She could just keep silent! Charlie said, 
"Hurry up and cook for me. Where have you been today? I've been waiting for you for a 
long time." Theresa remembered that she had spent some time seeing the house by 
herselt. It was not lunchtime now. Theresa raised her eyebrows and said, "Who asked 
you to wait for me?" It was hard to imagine that Mr. Calsis, who had never waited for 
others, would wait for her for a long time in the lobby downstairs. Charlie said, 
"Someone signed an agreement with me, but she was lazy. How could there be such a 
good thing? Hurry up, and cook for me! I am your sugar daddy. Didn't you want 200,000 
dollars this month?" Theresa had no way but went to the kitchen and cook lunch. 
Although she was angry with Charlie, she was really hungry after working for a long 
time. Charlie sat beside and looked at Theresa who was cooking. He had eaten all 
kinds of delicious food before. But he was hungry when he watched the bone-style 
cooking Theresa cooked. "Where is my lou? Thered said, "You should eat outside 
alone." "In that case, 1'11 ask Jonathan to your dad's company later." 

"You threatenie again Charlie looked at bir proudly. Theresa brought him a pair of 
tableware and refilled him a bowl of rice. "Eat it." "Ferd me! Charlie said with confidence 
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Theresa. "..." You had difficulty in walking, not using your hands! Why should your 
Charlient side and used "Hurry up" Theresadoskelat Challe, whose are looke 
likelconard and iten. In hier daily life, she needed to take care of her two children Since 
she pave birth to her sons, she taught them to do everything, including: teaching them 
to hold chopsticks. Nowshe lookelat Charliendruckelpthe bowl. Theresa teille some 
toulin Charlie 

When she stayed in Calsis's Residence, she also led him. But at that time, his family 
was there, and she did this to cheat others. She felt happy when she saw Jimmy was 
angry. But now, only Charlie and she were here... Why washe still doing this? Theresa 
looked at the delicate face in front of her and said, "Charlie, I want to cancel the 
agreement." "..."Charlie looked at her, "Cancel the agreement? Theresa said, "Your 
family member doesn't like me anyway, and I am not good enough for you. Let's cancel 
the agreement!" Charlie thought that she was angry because of the two kids. He was 
also in a bad mood when he heard her words. He asked Theresa. "Reason." **There's 
no reason. I just don't want to go on. Sarah will come back sooner or later, I don't want 
to associate with you anymore!" If she left suddenly, Charlie would look for her. Even if 
he did not look for hier, he would find trouble with her family. 

But... It she made it clear to him... She found a seemingly legitimate reason. "I like you 
very much. As a divorced woman, we signed an agreement when we got married. But 
now, I can't obey the agreement. I am afraid it I stay with you, I will be more greedy. So 
can we cancel the agreement?" Seeing that Theresa said this seriously, Charlie said, 
"No way." ".." Theresa said, "Why? Aren't you afraid I will not let you go in the future? I 
am a woman who loves money. If I continue to stay with you, you will suffer great 
losses, am I right?" Charlie listened to her and said, "You have already signed the 
agreement. What am I afraid of? I have the best team of lawyers. You can rest assured 
that if you don't want to leave in the future, I will force you to leave." Theresa twitched 
the corner of her mouth when she heard this. She thought Charlie was killing her with 
his words! Yes! If she tackled this problem head-on with Charlie, she was kicking 
against the pricks! Theresa sneered coldly. "Then I will thank you." Theresa lowered her 
head and drank two mouthfuils of soup. She tried her best to suppress her anger. 
Seeing that Theresa was angry. Charlie smiled, raised his hand, und put liis palu gently 
on her head. He thought he was crazy now! Although he said this, he even wanted to 
spend his life with this woman in his heart. He was usually busy with his work, and it 
was too much trouble to find another person! 

Theresa grabbed lasand on top of her head and looked at him delensively. Then she 
said, "What are you doing?" Charlie withdrew his hand coldly and said, "There's 
something on your head." "Really? There looked at Charlie's und nich there was nothing 



Charlie ignoredbur, picked uplus chopsticks, and began tocat Thuis maasked her tofeed 
huen just now. Now, le bepanto eat himsell, and it seemed that nothing was wrong 
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Charlie went backitteresting: Charlie looked at theresatore he left. Then he said, "T'll 
come rack to you tonich." T ika not want to go to Calsis's Residence, so he took the 
initiative to find her. Anyway, the treatment couldn't be left behind 

Theres, said, "Don't come! I want to rest at that." She had already planned to move 
away from here as soon.is the children came back! Charlie ignorel what Theresa said 
and left 

Seeing that Charlie had left, Theresa closed the door quickly. She stayed at home and 
packed her and her baby's baps. When she packed the things well, it was time to pick 
up her sons. She rushed to the kindergarten in a hurry. She got off the car and walked 

to the door, and then she sw Mrs. Calsis and Rose They were talking to the teacher in 
charge of taking care of the children, and Leonard and Ben stood beside them. Mrs 
Calsis only cared about two children Theresa didn't expect that they should come to the 
kindergarten directly! However, at the moment, she dared not go there. The 
kindergarten teacher anew her identity. If the teacher saw her, she was exposed 
Theresa hid aside and called Cristina, Cristina said, "Tess!" Cristina went to work in the 
afternoon. She was still depressed at the thought of being inexplicably warned by 
Charlie in the niorning Theresa said, "Did you tell Rose about the school of Leonard and 
Ben?" "No, I don't tell her." Cristina said. Theresa frownied, wondering how Mrs. Calsis 
knew about this place. She glanced at Mrs. Calsis and Rose. It seemed that they would 
not leave in a short time. Theresa stared at them for a few moments, and then she had 
to call Cristina over. It was inconvenient for her to appear in front of them, so she asked 
Cristina to deal with this. Cristina walked to the door, and then she saw Mrs. Calsis and 
Rose. Then she said, "Mrs. Calsis, Ms. Nandlall." Cristina had a good impression of 
Rose. She went out to dinner with Rose yesterday, and Rose was warin to Leonard and 
Ben. Rose looked at Cristina and said, "Did you just get off work? We've been waiting 
for you for a long time. Did you usually come to pick up the children solate? The other 
children had already left with their parents!" Theresa observed for a while before calling 
Cristina. So Cristina came here late. Cristina explained. "It can't be helped. I am alone. I 
have to take care of my children and go to work." Cristina glanced at Leonard and Ben. 
Leonard and Ben knew her and ran up to her. Sometimes Theresa was very busy, and 
she would ask Cristina to help her pick up the children. Therefore, the teacher thought it 
was normal, and the two babies also could understand it. They Kiew their mother must 



have something to do, so she called Cristina to pick them up. Mrs. Calsis said, "Let's 
have dinner together. I have something to say to you. I just want to see the two 
children." Cristina hesitated. "But... I want to take the home." It was not that she wanted 
to go home, but... Theresa was still waiting for them. There called here and just asked 
her to pick up the children. If she went to dinner with Mrs. Calsis, how long would she 
have to wait? Mos Calsis look dat Cristina and said, "Don't you go home for dinner?" "I 
still have something to do in my company now, so I need to take their home quickly." 
Cristina said. Rose said, "Will you leave the children at home alone later? No wonder 
they usually had broadcast live at home." 
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"..." Cristina was sashless when she held Rose's words It seemed that she was abusing 
the children according to what Rose said. Mrs Calsis said rently. "Let us help you look 
after the children. You can come and pick them up when you are free" Seeing that they 
insisted on taking the children to dinner, Cristina couldn't leave the children alone with 
them. 

Cristina sat in the car and sent Theresa a message "Theresit, I'm sorry, Mrs. Calsis 
insisted on inviting us to dinner." Theres. was still waiting in kindergarten and had seen 
then get into the car. She had thought about moving house after taking the two babies 
back. As a result, Mrs. Calsis and Rose directly disrupted her plan! Cristina was afraid 
that Theresa would worry, so she comforted her and said, "I will deal with it. Why don't 
you go back first? I will bring Lourd and Benbeck" 

"Are you sure? Theresa was always worried. Now that Leonard and Ben were 
confirmed to be the children of the Calsis's Residence, Would Mrs. Calsis think about 
taking the child away directly? Seeing Theresa's messages, Cristina glanced at Mrs. 
Calsis, who had been staring at the children, and she was not so sure now. Rose sat in 
the front passenger seat. Mrs. Calsis, Leonard, Ben, and Cristina sat in the back Mrs. 
Calsis asked the two babies. "Leonard, Ben, what would you like to eat for the evening? 
Would you like grandma to invite you to have dinner?" Leonard sat witliout saying 
anything. He wanted to eat the food cooked by his Mon. But... Cristina told him 
yesterday that he should not mention his mother in front of others and should take 
Cristina as their mother. So he didn't want to say anything, But Ben was all right. In his 
opinion, his mother had something to do, and he couldn't cause trouble for his mother. 
This grandma was willing to invite them to dinner, which was also very good. He said, 
"Yes, but it slould not too expensive." When Mrs. Calsis heard Ben's words, she smiled 
and felt a little sad. She decided that she must bring the two babies back to the Calsis 
Residence When they got to the restaurant, they asked for a private room. Cristina sat 
down with the children and sent the address to Theresa. Rose was in charge of ordering 



Mrs. Calsis sat aside and looked at the two children many times. Finally, her eyes fell on 
Cristina, "Do you usually leave your children in 

the kindergarten when you get off worklate?" Cristina said, "Well, I'm alone and have no 
choice." Mrs. Calsis said, "We waited so long in the kindergarten today, and all the other 
children had gone back. If this happens every time, it's not good for the babies! As a 
mother, you should spend more time with thein." Cristina looked at Mrs. Calsis and 
asked directly, "How did you know that Leonard and Ben are in this kindergarten?" "Last 
time I saw them in the hospital, they had the name of the kindergarten written on their 
hats." Mrs. Calsis said. Then shechecked and found out. Hearing this, Cristina wiped 
her sweats in her heart. She had to say that Mrs. Calsis really observed carefully. Mrs 
Calsis looked at her and said, "Has Charlie come to see you?" Hearing Charlie, Cristina 
frown. "Don't mention it. He said he would let the lawyer sue me!" She had been angry 
all day about this. It wasn't worth it for Theresa. 

Cristina wasn't the children's mother, so she wasn't worried. But if Charlie did the same 
to Theresa in the future, Theresa would be so pitalul Shelorst met Jimmy and now mnt 
Charlie, the bad guy! 

t hat Crist was excited, Mrs. Calsis said, "Is there such thing?" Cristina didn't have any 
worries in front of Mrs Cilsis and direily complained. The children are mine. If you don't 
want them, you can just forputhen How can you sue me? Do you think it is easy to bully 
ordinary people like me?" 
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Mrs Calsis contortes Cristina "Don't worry, I'll brickanlask him. It won't happenaran." 
After that, she went on with the topic just now "llut. Cristina. I have 

ar al understandine of your situation You have to work now. so you can't five your 
children a Iter life, noe You Nendtime taking care of them. The Wo children are still 
young, and they need to Ive taken carror and awompaniel Lelem polcck to the Calsis's 
Residence! After they cobrack, we can look after the children. We will have more time to 
take care of them and accompany them. They can have a better life" Cristina shook her 
head, "No I think they're line with me." Cristina was also very moved by what Mrs. 
Calsis said, but... She knew Theresa's attitude lust nu:ht. And this morning. Theresa 
came to warn her! How could shedare to promise them now? Mrs Calsis looked at 
Cristina and said, "As a mother, you should always think about yourself. As I said 
before, let them go back to the Calsis Residence, and we will not treat you badly. You 
should also plan for your children's future. Won't you hope that they will work in a 
company like you? Won't you hope that they don't have money to buy a big house?" 
Although Mrs. Calsis had never been to Cristina's house, shellad seen Leonard and 



Ben's live broadcast environment, and the conditions at home were not good. Cristina 
telt heartbroken when she heard what Mrs. Calsis said. Yes, she was poor! Theresa 
and her life were not so good! But the children were Theresa's life! Cristina frowned. "In 
conclusion, you just want to take away the children without giving anything!" Mrs. Calsis 
looked at Rose when she heard Cristina's words. Rose thought it was because Cristina 
wanted to marry Charlie. Now, Cristina found that she couldn't marry Charlie, so she 
deliberately made trouble. So Rose said to Cristina, "Ms. Lagarde, my grandma doesn't 
mean that she just cares about the children. As for the matter of your marriage with my 
Uncle Charlie, we need time to deal with it." 111"..."Cristina looked at Rose when she 
heard what Rose said and asked, "What do you mean? Will Charlie marry me?" At first, 
she didn't know that Charlie was married to Theresa, so she made this request. After 
that, she never said it again! But unexpectedly, they would still mention this now! Didn't 
Charlie have a wife? Pose said, "My uncle Charlie and Theresa will divorce sooner or 
later. Don't worry. When they get divorced, we will find a way to let you marry him." 
When Cristina heard Rose's words, she couldn't believe them. "Do you niean they will 
divorce?" Shehad thought that Theresa married Charlie and had two children, so their 
marriage would be stable! Rose said with confidence. "Of course. Theresa was a 
divorced woman and was unfaithful before. Though ignore that, she doesn't even care 
about my grandma at home. How could a woman with no morality like her live with 
Uncle Charlie so long? So don't worry and take it easy. Theresa can't compare with you 
at all." 

Wisat are you kidding? Cristina yelled angrily when she heard Rose's words. She 
looked at Kose when they had dinner with Rose yesterday, she felt that Rose was very 
gentle, highly cultured, and steeped in propriety, so she had a pood impression of her. 
But subver thouphttlut Rose would hate Theresa so much! kot til sald bad things about 
Theresa in front of her! 

No wonder Theresa was so resistant to letting the children po back to the Calsis's 
Residence! How couldn't stresistant to it? That was how the Calsis's Residence thought 
of Theresa! Theresa didn't know how lone she could stay in the Calsis's Residence. 
Once the children went back, if they were not satisfied withi Theresa, they would drive 
Theresd away. Wouldn't the child have to be separated from Theresa? 
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Chapter 100 Rose didn't expe Cristina rrot angry suddenly. She looked at Cristina with 
some doubts. They chatted happily What's wrong with her? Roseashel, "Dxdi Suy 
something wrong?" She looket blankly at Cristin Cristina wanted to scold Rose 

But now, she should pretend that she was unfamiliar with Theresa. Cristina held her 
fists richtly and suppressed the anger in her heart. Then she said to Rose, "I just think 
Theresa had married the Calsis's Residence, but you still treate! her like this. Are 
marriage and divorce such a casual thing for your family? Isn't your family responsible 



for her? In that case, if I let you take my children back to Calsis's Residence, how do I 
know what you will do to my children? Rose looked at Cristina, and she appreciated 
Cristina. "Ms. Lagarde, although what you said was not very friendly, it was reasonable. 
When other people heard that I was speaking ill or Theresa, they would be very happy. 
Unexpectedly, you will be angry about this." "What? Don't you like to hear this?" Cristina 
was not afraid of Rose. Fose said, "Of course not. On the contrary, I like you better. For 
this reason, you are a thousand times better than Theresa." She also appreciated 
Cristina more. 11 Cristina was her Aunt Theresa, she would get along well with her. "" 
Cristina scolded Rose, but Rose did not get angry, and she even said she liked her 
more. Cristina thought Rose was seriously ill! She looked at Rose, who was still 
scolding Theresa, and said, "Are you still saying this?" She had a good relationship with 
Theresa, and she could not bear it when others said something bad about Theresa. 
Rose apologized quickly. "I'm talking nonsense. I won't say that." Mrs. Calsis looked at 
Cristina and said, "Cristina, I like you and hope you can marry Charlie. I will talk about 
this with Charlie. But I need time to solve this problem. You are very busy now, and we 
can take care of your sons first." "No" Cristina said, "They are used to staying with me, 
and they won't want to leave. If I let you take them away, they will be unhappy, right? 
Ben? Do you want to leave your mother?" She looked at Ben She was afraid that Ben 
wouldn't understand, so she even added the key points. Sure enough, Ben heard it and 
shook his head violently. "No, I won't leave my Mom!" Mrs. Calsis looked at Ben and 
said, "Ben, Grandma didn't let you leave your mother. Your mother is so busy at work, 
so Grandma can take charge of picking you up at ordinary times. What's more, do you 
want to see your father? If he sees you two, he must be very happy." Although Charlie 
showed no care for these two children now. Mrs. Calsis was sure that Charlie would be 
touched when he saw these two little guys who looked like him! "No," Beni remembered 
how unhappy his mother was in the morning, He did not want to change his thoughts.. 
Seeing this, Mrs. Calsis could only give up mentioning this topic for the time being. 
When the waiter served the food, Mrs. Calsis refilled food for two babies and said, "My 
babies, have a try! You loved to eat this shrimp yesterday." Beiset aside and looked at 
Mrs. Calsis. He did not cat anything. Mrs. Calsis asked, "What's the matter? Isn't it 
delicious?" "I Want to go home." Een said. He missed luis mother! 

Usually, his mother should come back at this time! 

 

 

 


