
Chapter 72:My Genes Evolve
Infinitely
WHAT IS A MAN?
Lu Yuan was stunned when he heard the cat girl's words.

The cat girl reminded again:

"If you don't turn it over, it will be burnt."

Lu Yuan regained his senses, glanced at the direction of the barbecue, and
found that a trace of smoke had already emerged from the crocodile meat at
this moment.

hasn't been turned over for a long time, it is easy to burn.

but…

Who are you? !

Who knows you? !

Why do you remind me to turn and bake? !

Lu Yuan forced the thought of vomiting in his heart, his mouth twitched, and
he asked vigilantly: "This cat man...Miss, what do you want?"

The cat girl stretched out her finger on her knee and pointed at the barbecue:
"Eat grilled fish."

Lu Yuan: "..."

This cat girl came here just to eat fish?

real or fake?

Lu Yuan didn't believe it.
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But then again, the crocodile seems to be an amphibian, isn't it a fish?

He looked at the cat girl, hesitated a little, didn't dare to pass.

What if the cat girl is shot to death after passing by?

The cat girl spoke again:

"It's going to be burnt."

The swing of her tail became a little bit larger, and her mood seemed a little

uneasy.

"Oh oh. I continue to bake."

Lu Yuan glanced at the wagging tail of the cat-man girl, walked back silently,
and continued to barbecue.

He finally persuaded him.

The strength of this cat girl is far stronger than him.

From the moment the cat girl appeared next to him, he could see it without

feeling at all.

It must be impossible to run away.

Looking at the attitude of the cat girl now, it seems that there is no great

malice.

If this cat girl really wanted to kill him, she should have done it just now, but
he couldn't react at all.

Lu Yuan thought for a while, still hold her steady, don't annoy her.

Maybe there is still life?

Lu Yuan turned over the barbecue in silence, taking a sneak peek at the cat girl
from time to time.



The cat girl didn't seem to feel Lu Yuan's gaze at all, she always stared at the

golden crocodile meat.

Even, Lu Yuan could see the cat girl's throat move, as if she was swallowing.

"..."

Does this cat man really just want to eat grilled fish?

Even so, Lu Yuan still didn't relax his vigilance in his heart, and was still

thinking about ways to get out.

Even if he drinks a potent speed potion, his speed will definitely be much

weaker than this cat girl.

It's definitely impossible to escape directly.

How about trying a sneak attack?

But considering that the cat man appeared beside him unconsciously, Lu Yuan
hesitated.

If the sneak attack is unsuccessful, then he will be completely cold.

Is there any way?

Lu Yuan thought about plans one by one, and finally eliminated them one by

one.

He was a little helpless to find that he seemed to have no resistance in front of
this weird cat girl.

Just as Lu Yuan was thinking, the cat-man girl's indifferent voice sounded
again:

"Ok?"

Lu Yuan regained his senses and glanced at the barbecue.

"It should be done!"



As soon as Lu Yuan's voice fell, the cat girl looked at him.

Lu Yuan twitched the corners of his mouth under the cat-man girl’s
expressionless gaze, revealing a stiff smile, took out a plate, and put the

barbecue on the plate:

"...you eat."

The cat girl silently took the plate, took out a knife, slowly cut through the

barbecue, and put the barbecue into her mouth.

Then her eyes lit up, and her eating movement sped up a bit.

Lu Yuan felt a little nervous when seeing the cat girl appearance:

"This...Miss, are you satisfied?"

The cat girl nodded silently.

Lu Yuan suddenly breathed a sigh of relief.

Then he showed a dry smile:

"Miss, when I think of it, I still have something to do, or should I go first?"

The cat girl glanced at Lu Yuan:

"I want more."

Lu Yuan: "..."

The underlying meaning of this is to let him continue to bake?

He finally understands why men don’t like to hear women say I want more.

He silently took out a piece of giant crocodile meat and continued to roast it.

Lu Yuan silently grilled the fish, and the cat-man girl silently ate the fish, and
the two fell silent.



After being silent for a while, Lu Yuan thought about one thing. After
entangled for a long time, he couldn't help but said, "This is the meat of the

ancient sea crocodile. The crocodile is not a fish, but an amphibious animal."

As a good young man with compulsory education, he feels that he has to stand
on the side of knowledge.

The cat girl heard Lu Yuan's words, turned her head to look at Lu Yuan, and
said seriously: "It's a fish, it's very fragrant!"

Lu Yuan: "???"

is so fragrant that it is fish? What kind of logic is this?

Lu Yuan opened his mouth, not knowing how to refute it.

Then he found out that this cat girl seemed to be very talkative?

How about getting close to her, maybe you can let her let her go?

Lu Yuan thought of this, and tentatively asked: "What's your name?"

"Every night."

Lu Yuan: "..."

Fortunately, it is the fourth sound. If it is the second sound, I suspect you are

taking advantage of me.

"Yeye, how did you come to me just now? I didn't even notice it."

Lu Yuan looked at Ye Ye and asked tentatively.

"Come here."

Lu Yuan: "..."

nonsense! Didn't come here, did you still crawl here?

Does this guy speak human words?



No, I can’t give up yet!

Lu Yuan wanted to continue to test. At this moment, the cat's ears on Ye Ye's
head moved and turned to look in the direction of the jungle.

Lu Yuan was stunned when he saw this, and then looked over. Not long after,
four figures walked out of the jungle.

Lu Yuan saw four tall kobolds.

The four kobolds glanced at Lu Yuan and Ye Ye, then at the golden roasted

meat, showing a sneer.

One of the kobolds with white fur grinned and said:

"It smells good? You two will enjoy it, but I don't know if you have thought of

attracting us? Hand over everything in the war pattern space!"

Another black fur kobold also laughed: "Otherwise, let you die here, this time

you won’t get anything, you have to regain your spirits before you can

continue to enter the land of origin. Our four brothers are all the elite genes
that have been recorded. I hope you don’t know how to praise!"

Lu Yuan's pupils shrank slightly when he heard the words.

All the elite genes burned?

Wonderful!

Four elite fighters, should they be able to block every night?

In this case, maybe he can run away?

Pull hatred!

Lu Yuan smiled coldly, and was about to start taunting the opposite, just at
this moment, Ye Ye, who was squatting on the ground, stood up.



After stood up, Lu Yuan realized that Ye Ye had a pretty good figure, tall and
slender, and he could see that hot figure in leather armor.

A pitch-black long sword appeared in Ye Ye Ye’s hand, and looked at the four

kobolds blankly: "Don’t bother Ye Ye to eat delicious food."

The four kobolds were stunned when they heard the words, and then laughed

loudly.

"Excuse me to eat delicious food?! Kitty, it seems that you don't know where

you are now!"

"Don't worry, we will send you back to your mother's arms to drink milk

soon!"

Seeing this, Lu Yuan raised the corners of his mouth, showing a slight smile.

A few comrades who can!

Make persistent efforts, continue to pull the hatred!

When the night is up, I can run away secretly!

Just when Lu Yuan was expecting Ye Ye to fight the four kobolds, Ye Ye's body
disappeared in place. UU reading www.uukanshu. com

The next moment, Lu Yuan noticed that black shadows flashed by the four

kobolds, accompanied by dark sword lights.

The bodies of the four kobolds froze in place.

Ye Ye's body appeared behind the four kobolds, with his back facing the four

kobolds, the dark long sword in his hand had been retracted.

A series of blood stains emerged from the four kobolds, blood spurted out, and
their bodies fell to the ground at the same time.

"???"



The smile at the corner of Lu Yuan's mouth froze.

What the hell? !

Four elite kobold warriors, just died like this? !

I haven’t had time to escape!

There was a biting chill in Lu Yuan's heart.

Ye Ye's strength was much stronger than he thought.

Ye Ye turned his head, and walked back, without looking at the four kobolds,
the expression on his face did not change, as if he had killed four little

chickens just now.

She came to the position just now, squatted silently, put her little white hand
on her knee, looked at the barbecue, swallowed, "Are you going to be all

right?"

Lu Yuan realized that she had already eaten the barbecue on her plate.

"...It will be ready soon~ Master Ye Ye, wait a moment."

Lu Yuan smiled all over his face.

He has given up struggling.

can't afford to provoke...

Who can stand this?

He feels like he takes a step, and he gets cold.

Am I too miserable?

How did you encounter such a monster?

Lu Yuan lamented in his heart, hoping that he could lick Comrade Ye Ye
comfortably and save the dog's life.



What is a man?

can be soft or hard, long and short!

Lu Yuan was already mentally prepared to take the courage.
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