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“That child of mine is amazing! We cultivate the Supreme golden body of the night race. We can go up 
to the sky to capture divine ROCs, and we can also enter the abyss to capture demon flood Dragons. Our 
physical bodies are invincible!” 
 
 
The night race’s elder was proudly bragging about his own genius to the others. 
 
 
He was so excited that he was dancing and spittle flying. 
 
 
“That child of mine is destined to be extraordinary. In the future, he will be an existence that can stand 
shoulder to shoulder with the ancient war god!” 
 
 
“He must be on a killing spree right now. If your kids run into him, they’ll be out of luck!” 
 
 
Everyone rolled their eyes in disdain. 
 
 
This evildoer of the night race was indeed powerful, but was their child not? 
 
 
This old man ye was really shameless! 
 
 
They cursed in their hearts. 
 
 
They raised their heads and looked up into the sky. They wanted to see how this evildoer of the night 
race was going to perform. 
 
 
An image appeared in the air. It showed a Valley, but it was empty. 
 
 
Then, the scene changed. A person appeared on the ground, unconscious. He was completely naked, 
and his face was swollen like a pig’s head. His appearance could not be seen clearly. 
 
 
Looking closely, the elders of the various races were dumbfounded. 
 
 
Elder Wang Yun and the others were also dumbfounded. 



 
 
“Who is this?” 
 
 
“So miserable! It’s definitely not that brat from the night race. There must be a mistake!” 
 
 
They started discussing in low voices, thinking that they had made a mistake. 
 
 
That kid from the night race was truly capable. He was a top monster. It was possible for him to be 
defeated. However, it was absolutely impossible for him to be beaten up like this and even be stripped 
naked. 
 
 
Hearing the discussion, the night race elder stopped his bragging and looked up. 
 
 
He was also dumbfounded and said in shock,”who … Who is this?” AI! Elder Wang, how could you be 
mistaken! Where’s my kid? Where is he?” 
 
 
“That’s strange. There can’t be a mistake!” 
 
 
Elder Wang Yun lowered his head and fiddled with the mirror. However, no matter how he fiddled with 
it, the image did not change. 
 
 
Everyone was puzzled. 
 
 
This was especially true for the elders of the equal heaven Department, who were even more puzzled. 
The examination was held every year, but this mirror had never made any mistakes before. This was the 
first time. 
 
 
“AI! Look, that pig head … Doesn’t he look a little like that kid from the night race?” 
 
 
Suddenly, an elder exclaimed. 
 
 
When everyone heard this, they began to observe carefully. 
 
 



“AI! If you didn’t mention it, I wouldn’t have felt it, but upon closer inspection, it really does look like 
him. It can’t really be that kid, right?” 
 
 
“That’s impossible!” 
 
 
Everyone could not believe their eyes. 
 
 
The person in the image did indeed look like that brat from the night race. But, how was this possible? 
 
 
With the night clan brat’s strength, even if it was the Thunder clan or the rain clan’s evildoers, it would 
be impossible for them to put him down and beat him into a pig’s head! 
 
 
“How could it be my kid? don’t talk nonsense!” 
 
 
The night race elder rebuked angrily and pointed at the person in the image.”Look, which part of this pig 
head looks like my family’s genius! That face, those eyebrows, and this … This …” 
 
 
As he spoke, he became mute, and his face revealed a dull expression. 
 
 
“No… This is impossible!” 
 
 
He mumbled, his face turning ashen. 
 
 
Seeing his reaction, everyone was stunned for a moment before coming to a realization. 
 
 
The one who was most familiar with that kid was, of course, the elder leading the night race. Looking at 
his reaction, this pig head was most likely that kid. 
 
 
“It really is!” 
 
 
“Which family’s genius did this? That’s too cruel!” 
 
 
They whispered to each other in shock. 
 



 
But then, they began to gloat. 
 
 
Someone covered his mouth and burst out laughing. 
 
 
“Hahaha! This is the genius of the night race, a Supreme genius who can capture a divine ROC and a 
demonic flood Dragon!” 
 
 
Then, the entire Hall burst into laughter. 
 
 
“How did this happen?” 
 
 
The night race elder’s face turned from green to red. He was shocked and angry. 
 
 
The mocking sounds around him made him feel even more ashamed. 
 
 
When he raised his head again and saw the miserable state of his genius, he finally couldn’t hold it in 
anymore. He clutched his chest and spat out a mouthful of blood. 
 
 
“The reputation of my glorious night race has been destroyed today!” 
 
 
He looked up to the sky and sighed. 
 
 
“Hahaha! He’s vomiting blood!” 
 
 
When the other patriarchs of the ancient race saw this, they laughed even louder. They couldn’t wait to 
see the night race make a fool of themselves. 
 
 
The group of elders from Qitian Academy looked at each other with a strange expression. 
 
 
This was the first time they had seen such a thing. 
 
 
“Woof! What monster of the night race? he’s just a piece of trash! I’m afraid it doesn’t live up to its 
name! How can you compare to my cloud tribe!” 



 
 
At this moment, another elder of the ancient clan stood out and said proudly. 
 
 
“Elder Wang, show them our family’s genius. I want them to know what a true genius is! If you want to 
become a true genius, talent alone is not enough, you must also have extraordinary wisdom!” 
 
 
“That child of my cloud tribe is full of wisdom and schemes. He was once praised for his demonic 
intelligence. Coupled with his extraordinary talent, he is a true genius. If your children were to meet 
him, they would only be abused.” 
 
 
Speaking of his own geniuses, the elder of the cloud tribe was excited. 
 
 
At this time, elder Wang Yun shook the mirror and adjusted the image. 
 
 
However, the scene did not seem to have changed much. It was still in the valley. 
 
 
“Eh? Why didn’t it change?” 
 
 
“Look, another pig head!” 
 
 
Everyone looked up and was dumbstruck. 
 
 
The elder of the cloud tribe was petrified on the spot. 
 
 
His eyes were so wide that they were about to pop out of his eye sockets, as if he had seen a ghost! 
 
 
“T-t-t-t-t-t-t-t-t-that’s impossible! There must be a mistake! You’re definitely wrong!” 
 
 
Then, as if he had gone crazy, he sprang up from the ground and roared madly. 
 
 
After a while, he quieted down. It was as if he had lost his soul. He stared at the scene in a daze, still 
muttering,””Impossible! This is impossible!” 
 
 



In the end, he also clutched his chest and spat out a mouthful of blood. His figure fell backward. 
 
 
He couldn’t take this blow and fainted from anger. 
 
 
“Hahaha! This guy … Look at how he bragged just now, so he was also a good-for-nothing! Elder Wang, 
come and take a look at my family’s genius!” 
 
 
Another Gu family elder stood out and sneered before shouting at elder Wang. 
 
 
Elder Wang was in a daze. Hearing the shout, he was jolted awake and shook the mirror in his hand. 
 
 
In an instant, the scene changed to another place. It was in a dense forest, but the thing in the picture 
didn’t change. It was still a pig’s head. 
 
 
When everyone saw this, they were instantly stunned. 
 
 
“How … How did this happen?” 
 
 
They couldn’t figure it out. They could accept one or two, but why were three of them like this? 
 
 
These were not ordinary people. They were three of the top geniuses. Who could defeat the three of 
them? 
 
 
The Gu family elder was stunned for a long time. Suddenly, his body swayed and his face twitched a few 
times. With a pfft, he spat out a mouthful of blood and fell heavily to the ground. 
 
 
“Heavens! What’s going on?” 
 
 
No one laughed anymore. They were all panicking and on tenterhooks, afraid that their geniuses would 
also suffer such humiliation. 
 
 
“Elder … Elder Wang, quick, take a look at my family ‘s!” 
 
 
“Elder Wang, take a look at that kid from my family!” 



 
 
They all shouted. 
 
 
As the mirror continued to shake, the images kept changing. 
 
 
“This is impossible …” 
 
 
“Oh heavens! Who did this?” 
 
 
The crowd kept letting out sorrowful cries. 
 
 
Pfft! Pfft! 
 
 
The patriarchs of the ancient race spat out mouthfuls of blood as they trembled and fell to the ground. 


