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“That brat can’t hold on much longer. It’s time to make a move!” 
 
“I must get the last hit and kill that brat with my own hands to obtain the treasure for the clan!” 
 
All the forces were making preparations. 
 
Many of them had held back. The ones they had sent out before were just cannon fodder to wear down 
that kid’s strength. The ones they had sent now were the main force. 
 
In order to take the boy’s life, all the clans had gone all out, sending out all the four tribulations and 
young geniuses of their clans. Almost all the four tribulations and young geniuses of the entire Pangu 
continent were gathered here. 
 
“AI! I didn’t expect that he, who was invincible in the lower realm, would fall to this point!” 
 
Among the crowd, there was no lack of lower realm geniuses who had been ferried up by the various 
races. When they saw this scene, they were all extremely emotional. 
 
In the past, this immortal venerable Tang had swept across the lower realm’s starry sky and was 
invincible. He was so awe-inspiring that he was regarded as a legend. He was like a mythical figure, and 
his fame had spread throughout the entire starry sky. 
 
But now, he had been forced to such an extent! 
 
Even if he was a monster, he was destined to die in this situation! 
 
“He’s too reckless to challenge the strength of the entire Pangu continent by himself!” 
 
“This is an impossible challenge!” 
 
They all shook their heads and sighed. 
 
In his heart, however, he still had some respect. 
 
In the entire world, there was no one who could have such a spirit on Pangu continent, but he had 
produced such a peerless figure in the lower starry sky. 
 
Even if he were to die Here, his name would be passed down for all eternity and he would become a 
legend. 
 
“Hmph! You’re overestimating yourself!” 
 
A figure stood on the Yuchi clan’s battle Ark. Her pretty face was cold and filled with killing intent. 
 
“Surnamed Tang, I will kill you with my own hands and avenge my Yuchi clansmen!” 
 



She gritted her teeth and mumbled in hatred. 
 
“Hahaha! It was really satisfying! This damn bastard is finally going to die! Who told you to always bully 
me? this is retribution!” 
 
In a corner of the crowd, a figure was squatting there, dancing with excitement. 
 
“God, you’ve finally opened your eyes!” 
 
Liu heihu looked up at the sky and almost burst into tears. 
 
This man surnamed Tang was his nemesis and nightmare. He had been haunting him for decades. No 
matter where he went, he could not get rid of him. 
 
Now, he finally saw the hope of relief. 
 
“Hmph Hmph! Tang kid, to think that you would have such a day. Just watch how I’ll deal with you later. 
I’ll take revenge for all the humiliation you’ve given me in the past!” 
 
He huffed as he pulled out a large metal rod from his back and stroked it back and forth. 
 
“Good treasure, it’s all up to you later. I’m going to let him have a taste of my thick, long, and hard 
treasure!” He mumbled and laughed, a somewhat wretched laugh. 
 
Not far away from him, a group of people from the Liu Clan saw this scene. The corners of their mouths 
twitched involuntarily and they were somewhat speechless. 
 
Although Liu heihu was extremely talented and was the son of the blood source, he had become one of 
the most outstanding geniuses of the Liu Clan after a period of cultivation. However, his character was 
extremely strange and even a little unbearable. 
 
Sinister, despicable, shameless, these were perhaps not enough to describe him. 
 
This man valued money as much as his life. He was very good at swindling. Since he came to the Liu 
Clan, the surrounding sects and clans had all suffered. Countless treasures had been stolen. How could 
they not know that it was this guy who did it? 
 
Furthermore, this person was extremely perverted and was disdained by many clan members. 
 
The elders in the clan loved this fellow, but they also had a headache over him. 
 
“Cough cough!” 
 
Liu heihu laughed for a while and suddenly came to his senses. He put on a serious face and acted like a 
gentleman. 
 
His gaze was fixed on the beautiful figure standing in front of the crowd. 
 



She was dressed in a white robe. It was simple and plain, but the loose robe fluttered in the wind, 
outlining her graceful curves. 
 
She was looking straight ahead, leaving only the side of her face for him to see. However, it was this side 
of her face that was so beautiful that it was breathtakingly beautiful, perfect and flawless. 
 
She stood there, her body covered in a layer of celestial light. It was hazy and illusory, just like a fairy. 
 
He stared at it, and a look of infatuation appeared on his face. 
 
It wasn’t just him. Many of the young geniuses in the crowd behind him were the same. 
 
“Little sister bingyao!” 
 
Liu heihu coughed again and grinned. He pointed at the big stick in his hand and said,””Don’t judge this 
thing by its wild appearance. It’s a first-class treasure. Watch closely. Just wait and see how your big 
brother Black Tiger will deal with that surnamed Tang. ” 
 
“That Tang guy is just a paper tiger! I’ve known him for a long time, and I’ve beaten him up countless 
times. I can deal with him with one hand!” 
 
Liu heihu patted his chest and started to brag. 
 
“So you guys know each other?” 
 
“Black Tiger, perform well later and take that kid’s life! The clan will heavily reward you!” 
 
When the group of elders heard this, they all nodded their heads and revealed looks of admiration. 
 
“Yes! Elder, don’t worry!” Liu heihu patted his chest and said straightforwardly. 
 
However, he was a little smug, and he was extremely proud in his heart. 
 
“I have to perform well later, and show little sister Bing Yao my heroic and heroic bearing. Who knows, I 
might be able to move her and capture her heart … Aiya! I’m getting a little excited just thinking about 
it!” 
 
Liu heihu was so excited that he was shaking. 
 
However, the beautiful figure at the bow of the ship did not pay any attention to him. Her beautiful eyes 
carried a trace of worry as she fixed her gaze on the figure who was walking forward not far below. 
 
“Hao!” 
 
She murmured in a low voice, her brows furrowed, and her heart seemed to be in a knot. 
 
“Is he … Really going to die Here?” 
 



In the sky, there was also a pair of eyes looking down. 
 
She mumbled with a doubtful tone. 
 
“Perhaps I’m overthinking it. In the face of such a situation, what can he do? Even I can’t do it!” 
 
After a moment, she shook her head and sighed. 
 
Then, she didn’t say anything and just watched silently. 
 
However, after a while, she suddenly looked forward and was stunned. She blurted out,””What is that 
place?” 
 
She was stunned for a moment before she remembered.”It’s the chaotic World Mountain!” 
 
At the end of their line of sight was chaotic World Mountain, a famous dangerous place on Pangu 
continent. 
 
“Could it be … He did it on purpose?” 
 
Looking at the mountains, she suddenly had a trace of doubt in her heart. 
 
But then, she shook her head. Even if it was chaotic World Mountain, so what? even if he entered 
chaotic World Mountain, he would still die. There was no chance of escape. 
 
“What is this kid thinking?” 
 
She mumbled, but she could not figure it out. 


