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Hope 

After Jenna had come out of her shelter everything seemed to fall in place. 
Well not everything but for Gavin things were looking up.  As soon as the 
news spread that he had sacrificed himself for my sake he became just as 
popular in our pack as he was in school. 

Jason, Derek and Eric along with their mates and Emily all came down to the 
hospital to check on Gavin. He was still on heavy medication because of the 
damage done to his head which kept him asleep but I could tell he was happy 
to have so many people come visit him. We were still in need of a willing 
unmated she-wolf to mark him. I had given up on Amy knowing deep down 
that they would have made one hell of a couple. So you can imagine my 
astonishment when she found out that I had called for all the unmated she 
wolves between the ages of eighteen and twenty three to meet me as soon as 
possible and Amy acted like a jealous mate. I guess once she heard how 
different Gavin’s behavior was she changed her mind and wanted to be the 
one to mark him. Thirty minutes later Amy’s parents, Luna, mom and all our 
friends watched as Amy marked her unconscious mate. 

“You go girl show him who’s boss ” Eric joked. Amy laughed then gently 
leaned into Gavin’s neck and bit down. 

“Amy don’t retract your fangs until he opens his eyes” Luna told her “I will tell 
you when” 

Watching Amy mark Gavin made me think of when I marked Zayn it was a 
totally different scene for sure. Where is he? I thought to myself. 

That’s what I’d like to know Jenna whined her tail down she missed her mate. 

My job was done. All we had to do now was wait for Gavin to wake up then 
the change would be a gradual process. 

I walked out of the hospital and straight for the woods Jenna was itching to get 
out and run. I wanted to go find Zayn but Emily told me that he was busy with 
Axel so I went deep into the woods but made sure to stay on our territory or 
my over protective Alpha would freak out. 



I sat down on the grass in a clearing and leaned back enjoying the 
peacefulness of my surroundings. After a little while I took my clothes off and 
shifted. My paws dug into the soil as I ran as fast as I could the wind blowing 
through my fur. I ran up and down hills I felt like I was on top of the world, like 
I owned the world. I ran freely and to be honest it was liberating to be out here 
on my own. I stopped suddenly when I came to an incredibly beautiful and 
wild creek. I was sure I was still on our territory but how come I’d never seen 
this body of water before? I sat down enjoying the view of my new found 
paradise. I watched the trickling water as it traveled along its bed bubbling 
over rocks and b.ranches. This was my kind of place to come and read I 
would definitely be coming here very often after today. 

I was lost in my own world when Jenna spoke I’m so proud of you 

I smiled but didn’t ask why because I knew why 

You handled being taken away from mate better than I did. You were strong 
enough for the both of us. 

I’m just happy you’re back Jenna I was lost without you. As I sat alone 
enjoying the view in front of me I felt a pleasant chill run down my spine. 
Someone else was here, I could feel another presence near me but I wasn’t 
scared I knew who it was that would always find me no matter where I was. I 
looked back to see Zayn in wolf form. His eyes locked on mine. 

 

“Were you looking for me?” 

“I’m always looking for you. I wanted to get in on the excitement” 

We are linked so he could feel all the enjoyment I was feeling and by the way 
Hunter was staring at Jenna I could tell he dragged him out of the office and 
over here to me. Hunter approached slowly and confidently like always I felt 
like I was trapped in his web but this time when he was standing right in front 
of me he lowered his head. 

I’m sorry you deserve better 

My breath hitched this was Zayn apologizing I remained quiet 



If I had known I was dest ined to such a smart, strong and beautiful mate I 
would have waited for you an eternity. The truth is from the first day I saw you 
I have been under your spell. What I feel for you is more than any mate bond. 
Remember my father said the same thing on our way here from Maine and I 
believe it too. I’ve seen others with their mates no matter how powerfully 
strong they are connected and committed…. we, you and I together, are 
unique. Please forgive me if I have wronged you in any way. It was never my 
intention. I will live the rest of my life loving you the way I do now just don’t 
reject me. 

I was shocked! Zayn was totally out of his comfort zone. What he said made 
my heart swell with even more love for him. I can see why he would think I 
was going to reject him but that’s never going to happen. He’s My Mate. 

I came closer to him and and l!cked his jaw Mine I whispered lovingly. Hunter 
lifted his head up and howled out with all his might. I could feel the joy rolling 
off him in waves of electricity. Jenna started her little show she jumped around 
him wagging her tail and prancing like a show girl. I heard Zayn laugh at me. 

Come on lets go for a run follow me  I said 

I’ll follow you to the ends of the earth Baby  He said and we were off. At that 
moment I felt so loved yet free. We ran for hours the soil felt wonderful and 
the air crisp. We raced through the wild and jumped over fallen trees until we 
found ourselves back at the creek. I sat down looking at the sparkling water in 
awe 

“This is incredible” I said through our mind link “I love this place” 

Zayn shifted and stood before me in all his n.aked glory. 

Jenna panted Oh my Goddess I can’t wait to l!ck him all over 

“Shift” He ordered 

I did what he asked and stood n.aked in front of him. He looked down at me 
then carried me into the water…. 

When Zayn and I finally left our little haven it was almost dark He went back to 
the pack house and I went to the hospital to check on Amy and Gavin. I found 
her family was still there and Gavin was sitting up in bed looking so much 
better than before. He was healing slowly. 



“Gavin” I ran over to his side and h.ugged him 

“Hope thank you so much I’ll never forget what you did for me Amy told me 
everything” Gavin said 

“It’s nothing compared to what you did for me. I’m so happy you’re going to be 
okay” 

“And I’m going to be one of you not to mention my mate is stunning” Finally 
the Gavin war had come to an end and he was at peace. Very soon the 
change would be complete. 

“Gavin what are you going to tell your parents?” Gavin is human with human 
parents they won’t exactly grasp the idea of their son changing into a 
werewolf. 

“I’m going to tell them that while I was away I met someone wonderful that I 
want to spend the rest of my life with” Amy wore a beautiful smile hearing him 
say that 

“Look at you talking like a mated werewolf already.” I laughed 

I walked out of the hospital feeling so relieved and happy. I was hungry and I 
missed Zayn already so I walked up to the pack house and straight to his 
office to see if he wanted to have dinner with me in our private part of the 
house or with the family. I knocked twice then opened the door. He was sitting 
behind his desk and Axel was in his office 

“Hey Baby” he leaned back in his seat and tapped his lap I walked over and 
sat down where he wanted me to.  He moves my hair over to one side and 
sinks his head into my neck. 

“My heaven” He says making me melt 

“So when are we getting revenge?” I asked 

“Very soon but I don’t want you there” 

“What? No I’m going with you this is my fight as much as it is yours”  I said 
Zayn stayed quiet which is rare so I continued taking advantage of his relaxed 
state  “I’m the one that wants revenge I’m the one who wore the bracelet,  I’m 



the one whose memory was erased and wolf traumatized” Surprisingly he 
stayed quiet rubbing his hand up and down my arm 

Just then my parents walked in with Luna who looked overly excited about 
something the Alpha was right behind her. 

“Hope tomorrow is your Luna ceremony I’m not putting it off any longer” Luna 
said in determination leaving no room for discussion. 

” And tomorrow I will be stepping down as Alpha of this pack”  Zayn’s father 
said 

“which  means you need to choose a Beta because I want to retire also I’ll 
stay as long as you need to choose someone but then I’ll be stepping 
down”  My dad spoke while his arms were wrapped around my mother. 

Zayn 

The next day the whole pack was thriving and my mom was on full fvcking*g 
swing organizing the Luna ceremony. She lives for events like this!  the whole 
pack house had turned into a massive flower shop with Hope’s favorite 
flowers Tul!ps and red roses. The ball room and courtyard were decorated to 
perfection. I had left Hope asleep in her parents room where we spent last 
night and came over to our place got changed then went out to buy her a 
wedding ring. She deserves the best and I’m going to make sure that’s what 
she gets. I am going to surprise everyone at her Luna ceremony by breaking 
traditions and asking Hope to marry me again in front of everyone. I wanted to 
make her mine in every way. 

On the way back I stopped by the hospital to check on Gavin who I  was told 
is doing much better he still looked fvckingd up but he was recovering 
because of his mates mark. I’m sure he will be able to attend tonight’s 
ceremony Hope would love to see him there. fvcking*g Hell. Okay so I’m 
trying to compromise and sh!t to make her happy but her being friends with 
any other man still makes my skin crawl. I left the hospital feeling good and I 
missed Hope. 

Everything felt calm….. too calm. 
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Hope 



I woke up to find my bedroom had been invaded by what seemed like a 
rainbow of tul!ps with radiant colors. The scent of tul!ps is food for my soul I 
jumped out of bed and picked up the nearest bouquet. 

Mmm that smells subtly sweet  Jenna purrs Where is that se.xy mate of mine? 
his scent is all over the sheets. 

Morning Jenna I giggled at the sound of her purring whenever she mentions 
Hunter 

I don’t know where he is but I can find out  I assured my wolf 

Good morning  I mind linked Zayn 

Good morning Baby did you just wake up? 

He sounded preoccupied Yeah I did and my room is full of the most beautiful 
tul!ps. 

Well a beautiful woman deserves her favorite beautiful flowers 

I smiled at how sweet and perfect he is. I still can’t believe this is Zayn Black 
the ruthless player that was hardly ever around the pack and when he was he 
was always scowling. 

Where are you? I asked him with longing 

I had some work to finish before tonight 

What are you going to do? He asked 

After I shower I’m going to make you lunch then head out to get a few things 

Head out where? I’ll take you when I get back 

No, I’m going with my mom and your mom I’ll see you tonight before the 
ceremony. I said as I stepped in the shower 

What? I have to wait till tonight to see you? 

I think you’ll manage I have to go I’m already in the shower 

fvck. I regret not waking you up before I left  I giggled at his voice 



There’s always tomorrow. Bye I love you was last I said before tuning him out 
so I could shower and start my day. 

Today is my official Luna ceremony; I already had my dress picked out a white 
Patchwork one shoulder mini dress that my mother got as a gift for me when I 
first found my mate. I’m going to pair it with beige leather pumps. I’m hoping 
Zayn won’t give me too much trouble about the length of the dress. 

Other than an invite that was sent out to each of our Alpha and Luna allies it 
would only be our pack. Still mom told me both the courtyard and Ball room 
would be decorated. I’m guessing the Ball room is where the Alpha will step 
down and announce Zayn as the new Alpha 

Mom and dad were both down stairs “Honey are you getting ready here or at 
your place? Mom asked me while placing a k!ss on my head 

“I’m getting ready up at my place” I had breakfast with my parents every few 
minutes an omega would deliver a bouquet of flowers sent from friends or 
pack members congratulating me. Finally I told them to send the flowers to my 
private wing. 

Zayn 

Hope and I were both getting ready in our room. She’s in her dressing room 
getting ready and I’m in the bedroom sitting on the couch waiting for her. I 
have the ring put away safely in my pocket. 

“Baby I don’t want to rush you but we should be heading down soon” 

She emerges in a one sleeve short white dress making my jaw drop.  She’s 
wearing the necklace with matching earrings and bracelet I got her. Holy fvck. 
The dress accented her t**s and sun k!ssed skin making Hunter howl like a 
horny dog. 

 

“What do you think?” She asked. Her hair flowing straight down her back just 
how I like it.  I stood up and walked over to her slowly my eyes taking her all 
in. She blushed under my stare. She’s a shy se.xy as hell little temptress. I 
wrapped my hand around her wa!st and leaned down towards her 



“I think you look absolutely stunning” I k!ssed her softly.  She hummed in my 
mouth making my c0ck throb for her. “Fvck.” I adjusted my e.rection “Let’s go 
my d!ck wants to jump out at you” I growled lowly and led her out towards our 
elevator while she giggled. 

We headed straight for the Ball room hand in hand and when we walked in 
everyone clapped and cheered. Hope was glowing as she smiled and greeted 
her pack and guests. I’m so proud to have her. My mother came over 

“Hope come I want to introduce you to a few friends” I watched her walk away 
with mom while I greeted our allies and pack members. Soon after my father 
announced his stepping down as Alpha of the Golden Moon Pack. 

My father made a speech then My mother and finally Brian made a speech. 
Then everyone headed outside where the Luna ceremonial would take place. 
I was the last one to walk out when I sp0tted an omega carrying another 
bouquet of flowers walking over to Hope. The flowers were a very deep dark 
shade of black giving them a foul appearance. I walked quickly and called her 
over 

“Alpha these were just delivered for the Luna” 

“Who delivered them?” I asked her 

“One of the security men said that a woman drove up to the gates and 
dropped them off” The flowers came with a card I pulled it out and stuffed it in 
my pocket when I saw Hope walk over 

“That’s a weird color I’ve never seen black roses who are they from?” She 
asked 

“I don’t know there’s no card” I lied my bl00d stirring 

“Are you okay?” She asked 

“Yes baby”  I k!ssed her head  “let’s go” 

“Put them by the elevator I’ll take them with me later” Hope said before we 
walked outside to the courtyard. 



Gavin and his mate walked over and they both bowed then h.ugged Hope 
“Congratulations” Gavin said. I have a lot of respect for him for what he did for 
Hope but the fvcker better not h.ug her again. 

“How are you feeling” Hope asked I slipped my hand around her wa!st. 

“Better thanks to you” He answered 

I k!ssed the top of my baby’s head “Ready baby?” 

“Yeah I am” I led her away to the middle of the courtyard. Everyone was quiet 

“Welcome everyone to a night of celebration. Tonight we celebrate a selfless 
woman who was born and raised in this wonderful pack. A woman who has 
changed me for life. She helped me see the good in others, she helped me 
become a better man and the more time I spend with her the more I fall in love 
with her.” Hope was smiling at me  “My pack tonight we celebrate our Luna 
Hope”  The pack cheered and howled in pride and respect for their new Luna. 
I turned and looked her in the eyes then took the ring out of my pocket and got 
down on one knee. Her beautiful eyes went wide 

“Baby thank you for accepting me and loving me. I still cannot believe that you 
are mine and I thank the Moon Goddess for giving me such a confident, 
capable, driven, beautiful mate like you. I want to make you mine in every 
way….Will you do me the honor of becoming my wife?” 

She smiled at me with watery eyes and nodded yes. I raised an eyebrow at 
her “Yes I will marry you” I slipped the ring on her finger then stood up and 
cupped her face before k!ssing her softly. I wanted to taste her right here but I 
kept it short and gentle for the sake of our families. The whole pack erupted 
into cheers and howls. Our parents were first to congratulate us before mom 
pulled her away from me. 

“You are one lucky man” Kyle said watching her I smacked him on the head 

“Thank you” I wanted to read the card in my pocket but I had to make sure I 
was alone first. Hope walked over again and h.ugged me tight “I love you” she 
said 

“I love you too” I told her as I handed her a drink “Drink then let’s dance” I 
whispered in her ear then bit down on her bottom l!p lightly and quickly. She 
quivered and I heard an ever so soft m0an making my c0ck hard as fvck. 



Hope 

As soon as I became the Luna of this wonderful pack I felt a deep connection 
to each and every pack member. Like I suddenly knew all their names and 
their concerns became mine. I could feel the connection so strong it almost 
brought me to tears. They had so much love and respect or me. I expected 
they felt this way for the alpha family of course but when I experienced first 
hand how much they cared for me, I fell in love with this pack even more. 
They were my responsibility now I would make sure to connect with them all 
and help them out one by one just to see them smile. 

I asked Zayn why is it I felt this way all of a sudden and he explained that this 
is a special connection unique and exclusively for Alphas and Lunas. 

“Something is wrong what is it?” I asked him out of the blue. 

“No baby nothing is wrong everything is right” He k!ssed me and now that our 
parents weren’t right next to us he k!ssed me hard. 

“Get a room” Matt joked I laughed hiding my face in Zayn’s neck. 

Our friends and family members were glowing with happiness for us and I had 
never felt this content and relaxed but what worried me was the fact that I was 
getting a weird vibe from Zayn he was bothered and anxious,  he just asked 
me to marry him but there was something on his mind. Jenna sensed this too 
which confirmed my accusations that he was hiding something. 

I will find out what it is but for now I wanted to enjoy our night. 
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Zayn 

I watched Hope from across the courtyard she was sitting with both her 
grandparents and a few pack members. I noticed how every few minutes she 
would look over her shoulder at me. I am the luckiest bastard alive. I pulled 
out the card that I had been keeping in my pocket and read it.. 

You k!lled Alex, I will k!ll you then take your mate and claim my rightful place. 
Hundreds are waiting to attack your pack,  many innocent lives will end 
because of you. The only way to stop this war to stop all the bl00d shed 
,whether you win or not, is to sacrifice yourself and put an end to all this. You 



have until midnight tomorrow if you care at all for your pack you will meet me 
at the clearing in the Enchanted Forest or your pack and many innocent lives 
will suffer the consequences. 

I put the note back in my pocket calmly and looked up at Hope she was 
staring right at me. I kept my gaze on her and mind linked Axel, Matt and Kyle 
to meet me in my office in five minutes. 

“The only way to stop our attack would be to sacrifice yourself” I repeated the 
words to myself then started walking towards her. She stood up and met me 
half way. I wrapped my arms around her wa!st and pulled her into me tight. 

“Baby I have to meet with Axel before he leaves just to finalize a few matters. I 
won’t be long” 

“They’re leaving tonight? Emily said they’re staying till tomorrow” She looked 
at me questioningly. 

“They’re leaving tomorrow baby but I have to meet with him tonight” I k!ssed 
her forehead  “I won’t be long”  I walked her back to where he friends were all 
gathered and k!ssed her softly before walking away to my office. Matt, Kyle 
and Axel were already there. I hated leaving her side but I didn’t want her 
finding out about the note or any of this. She has already been through 
enough and I’ll be a damned mother fvcker if I let her get hurt again in any 
way. 

“We received a threat tonight” I said as soon as I sat at my desk. 

“From who?” Matt asked already tense. I wasn’t surprised he was first to 
react. Matt and Kyle both have been our Zetas for a while now. They have 
been the highest ranking warriors since they each turned twenty. They’re both 
truly remarkable fighters, ruthless on the battle field and precise at planning 
and leading attacks. Even though they rank fourth in our pack, they don’t 
answer to anyone but me, the alpha. They are in charge of the warriors and 
war plans. I have been thinking about making one of them Beta but I need to 
find a strong enough Zata replacement. One of them if not both will be my 
Beta for sure. 

I showed them the note  “Can’t this girl get a break hasn’t she had enough?” 
Kyle said mostly to himself He was getting angry fast.  He loves Hope and I 
have to calm myself down, he’s my brother and he has a mate. 



“That’s why I don’t want her to find out about this” I looked at him seriously 

“That’s a threat to your Luna and your pack” Axel says  “War is inevitable 
now” 

“War with this b***h and her pathetic father has been inevitable for a long 
time” I sit down and run my hand through my hair then get up and pour myself 
a stiff drink.  “The coward picked up and left out of the blue one day without 
any trace with help from Alex for sure.” 

“Matt, I’m going to call the rest of our allies in here we have to be ready for 
war at any given minute the card said midnight tomorrow but that could also 
be a diversion to attack us when we least expect it. Get everyone ready now 
prepare for war as of this minute. By ten tomorrow if they haven’t attacked we 
go to the forest.” 

 

The Enchanted Forest is where we annihilated the rogues. The b***h thinks 
she has the upper hand there because of the witch who dwell amongst the 
heavy trees.  “We attack tomorrow.” I said looking at Kyle  “The b***h isn’t 
planning to face Hope alone. Rogues and the mother fvckers from her pack 
will be there but so will we. Tomorrow we end this sh!t on the battlefield.”  I 
said slowly  “I want hunters, trackers and healers with us” 

An hour later after my office had been occupied by seven alpha’s the plan was 
set. Our allies were all willing ready to aid if necessary. Matt and Kyle had 
already alerted the warriors. And everyone knew what the orders were. 

“Kyle” I called for his attention he was the last one to leave the office, he 
turned back and looked at me “Make sure to inform the warriors that I want 
Edward and Stephanie alive” My voice dark and chilling 

“Done” he said before he turned around and left. I leaned back in my seat 
finishing off my drink when I picked up Hope’s scent very close. I walked over 
to the door just as she was about to knock. 

Hope 

“Are you going to tell me what’s going on or are you going to be sleeping in 
your old room alone from now on?” I furrowed my eyes at Zayn and folded my 
arms against my c.hest, he better tell me what’s going on. 



“You think you can keep me out of our bedroom?” He growled with a grin on 
his face as he looked at me slyly. 

“Tell me” I demanded his grin making my heart beat fast but this j.erk better 
do some talking 

“Maybe I have something else in mind” He said in a low se.xy voice. He pulled 
me gently into his office and locked the door. I felt my cheeks heat up as I 
watched him slowly slide his hands down my shoulders and l!ck his l!ps. 

“Zayn I’m not going to let you try to distract me and I’m not letting you have 
your way with me in your office” I warned him but oh my Goddess the way 
he’s looking at me right now makes my insides quiver with anticipation. But f 
course I had to be strong to find out what he’s up to 

“How am I distracting you baby?” He asked as he started k!ssing my neck “I 
didn’t know I was a distraction” 

“Zayn this can’t happen in here” I say but contradict my words by running my 
fingers through his hair. 

“Why baby? the door is locked and this can happen in here or anywhere I 
want” He said so seductively 

“But if you don’t want this you can tell me to stop” urghhh I wish I could punch 
him but he’s too irresistible. His needs become my own. 

“I’ve been wanting to get my fiance alone all night” He pushed me against his 
desk and his hands find the side zipper of my dress and our l!ps crash 
together. He pulls my dress all the way down exposing the goosebumps that 
are flushed all over my skin. He moves back for a split second and eyes my 
body “fvck” 

He forces my strapless b.ra roughly down and and surprises me by coming 
down and s.ucking on my mark driving absolutely crazy. I tug at his shirt and 
start unb.uttoning it as he lifts me up and sits me down on his desk. 

“You still want me to sleep in my room baby?” His voice raspy  “wouldn’t you 
miss me?” 

“Tell me what you’re hiding” My voice came out like m0aning he chuckles. 



“Nothing baby just let me fvck you” Oh Goddess his dirty mouth did sinful 
things to my private parts. I pulled him closer and locked my mouth with his 
otherwise we would both make too much noise. Me with my m0ans and him 
with his talking dirty. 

His tongue roamed in my mouth and slid across my tongue I reached down for 
his belt as he sn.aked his hand behind me and unclasped my b.ra taking it off 
completely. He broke our k!ss making me whine then he leaned down and 
took one of my b.reasts into his mouth s.ucking my n!pple then he grabbed my 
other b.reast rubbing and kneading my n!pple softly. I arched my back and 
closed my eyes as his tongue moved from one of my b.reasts to the other 
sending tingles and waves of pleasure throughout my body and making me 
squirm against him.  Wanting more I reached for his thick and hard manh00d 
he hissed and dropped his pants to the floor then moved my panties to the 
side. He kept his dark eyes on mine as he pulled me closer to him and pushed 
into me with one hard thrust. I fell back on his desk unable to think straight 

“Did you come here to threatening me baby? was my little wolf threatening 
me?” He continued to thrust into me hard and fast. “Answer me were. you. 
threatening. me?” He stressed each word. He is so intense. And I love it! 

“No” I cried out then I regained some composure “Actually yes” 

he paused for a second then pounded harder his face tense “You can’t 
threaten me and if you do I know how to change your mind” 

What an a.ssh0le but right now I don’t care I miss him too much. I pulled him 
closer and k!ssed him to muffle my sounds. He k!ssed me slowly and 
passionately my nails dug into his back as he took every inch of me. 

He broke our k!ss and I growled at him he chuckled then covered my mouth 
with his hand at the same time he bit down on to my mark making me scream 
into the palm of his hand. I saw stars as he went in me deep, hard and fast as 
I shook and came harder than I can ever remember. I melted onto him 
completely my heart racing with the electric tingles shooting through my body. 
I heard Jenna and Hunter howl as Zayn kept on pounding until finally filling me 
in more ways than one. 

After we both could breath again he picked me up off his desk only to bend 
me over it again. 

Zayn 



fvck! I cannot control myself around her she turns me into a fvcking*g animal. 
We were still in my office but now she was straddling me on my couch. I 
fvckingd her on the desk and bent over my desk. I couldn’t help myself I’ve 
wanted to bend her over this desk since the first time I saw her. I held on to 
her tight rubbing my hands down her bare back. Her head was nestled on my 
shoulder. 

“Zayn tell me!” My little baby demanded 

“I love you so much please let me handle everything” I pulled her closer to my 
c.hest then growled when she tried getting off me but I held her down. 

“Tell me what you’ve been hiding all night or I’m leaving right now” She 
threatened 

“Watch it” I slapped her a.ss lightly. Being the stubborn little wolf she is she 
got up and started putting on her clothes. “Hope” I called in warning. She 
didn’t budge. fvck I’m losing my touch…and what very little patience I have. 

“Baby you know I’m not letting you leave this room like this” I stood up and 
pulled her against me she struggled in my arms like a cute little kitten. 

“Our guests and pack are still outside I want to go have dinner with them” She 
growled. I decided to have mercy on her and let her go. I got dressed 
watching her comb her fingers through her hair. She is so cute. 

“How do I look?” She huffed 

“Like a se.xy b.rat but I love you and I will always protect you even when you 
hate me” She stopped in her tracks her eyes wide then jumped into my arms 
melting into me. 

“I don’t hate you I love you” She said softly. Finally fvck. 
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Hope 

The next morning I woke up with my arms wrapped around Zayn. He was 
already up and deep in thought. So I inched even closer and k!ssed his 
shoulder 



“What’s bothering you? Is it our revenge battle?” I asked 

“Good morning” His raspy voice warmed my heart. “Nothing is bothering me” 
He rubbed my cheek softly. 

“You know when you hide things from me, even if it’s your way of trying to 
keep me safe it still makes me feel like you don’t have faith in me” My voice 
came out almost soft like a whisper. He stayed quiet but turned my way and 
pulled me closer. 

“I have a lot of faith in you. You know that baby” He k!ssed my cheek before 
getting out of bed.  I got the feeling he was rushing out of bed. 

I needed to get up and start my first day as Luna. I also had to catch up on a 
lot of studying. But first things first, this was Zayn’s first morning as Alpha and 
I wanted to do something special for him. I heard him start the shower so I 
went into our kitchen and started preparing breakfast. 

I made him everything he likes Bacon, eggs, sausages, hash browns, sautéed 
mushrooms, bell peppers and tomatoes. I even prepared the table. Our whole 
house was adorned with tul!ps and roses so I filled my favorite crystal vase 
that Zayn got me from France with red roses and placed it in the center of the 
table. Which reminded me of the black roses someone sent me I want to know 
who sent them. 

“What is that delicious smell” I heard Zayn ask as he wrapped his arms 
around my wa!st. I was lost in my own thoughts and didn’t notice him come in 
the kitchen. 

“I made you breakfast Alpha” I said turning around to face him with a smile on 
my face. I always smile when I see him he’s just so handsome. He’s hiding 
something and I will find out what it is. 

“Wow baby I didn’t know you could cook why didn’t you just order breakfast 
from the kitchen?” 

“I wanted to make you breakfast myself today is the first day of you being 
officially Alpha” 

“Is that so? He leaned in with a playful grin on his face and k!ssed the top of 
my head then sat down at the table. 



“I don’t want you tiring yourself order whatever you want and the cooks will 
make it” 

“You don’t let me do anything around here” I rolled my eyes at him and sat 
down at the table next to him. 

“I want to take care of you baby” He reached over took my hand placing a k!ss 
on it. 

“What do you have planned for the day?” He asked me while eating 

“I want to start my Luna duties other than that nothing much” 

We ate together and talked about who he has in mind for a Beta. He wants 
dad to remain in the position but that won’t happen it’s someone else’s turn 
now 

“Thank you baby everything was delicious. I wish I had time for dessert” He 
winks at me but have go now I’ll see you later” He pulls me up and k!sses me 
then squeezes my a.ss before leaving. 

“Always a pervert” I said to him and he chuckles as he walks out to the 
elevator. Almost as soon as he walked out I heard my phone ringing. 

“Hello?” 

“Did you get my flowers” a woman’s voice rang through my body giving me 
the chills. What flowers? I thought to myself 

 

“Yes I did.” My voice came out cold 

“Did you read the note?” What note?? 

“Yes I did” I lied 

Have you decided what you’re going to do?” I know that voice but can’t 
remember the name. 

“Alex was my brother and you k!lled him. And…I should be his Luna not you. 
I’m an alpha’s daughter. You’re just a spoiled girl. So you see why I’m doing 
this.” Oh my Goddess I remember the crazy b***h. Stephanie. 



“But if you have a noble decent bone in your body meet me and we can settle 
this. Otherwise like I wrote in my note a lot of innocent people are going to 
die.” My bl00d was boiling I’m going to k!ll her. 

“Tell me where” 

“Like the note said at the Enchanted Forest.” 

“And if I don’t come?” 

“Then there’s going to be a war and many innocent lives will end because of 
your cowardice.” 

Jenna was throwing a fit in my head. I can’t wait to get my hands on this b***h. 

“Baby”  Zayn called out for me with worry in his voice he rushes into the 
bedroom and sees me on the phone. 

“What time?” I asked no emotion in my voice. 

“Midnight come alone” She said and I hung up the phone 

“So this is what you’ve been hiding from me?” I asked him “I had to find out 
from Stephanie…” 

“Baby” He tries to take my hand 

“Don’t!”  I push his hand away. “What was the plan you go meet her then 
what?” I’m glaring at him. I cannot believe he kept this from me. He knows 
how much I want revenge for what she did to me. And now I have another 
reason b***h wants to be Luna. 

“Then I’m going to fvcking*g k!ll her” 

“Whatever you’re going to do I want to be a part of it” I said with my hands on 
my h!ps 

“Over my dead body Hope you’re staying here” 

“Why is everything a big issue with you?” I yelled  “I’m not sitting back while 
you fight my battles Zayn” 



“I said no end of discussion” He says sternly running his hand through his 
hair. I really wish I could punch his lights out right now. 

“No this is not the end of discussion I’m not a child I’m your equal.” 

“Hope stop and lower your fvcking*g voice I can’t do this…” 

I cut him off  “Why can’t you do this?” 

“Because I can’t lose you again”  he yelled out and slammed his hand on the 
wall. I stood still. He remained quiet for a few minutes with his head down then 
he spoke again. His voice laced with so much hurt. 

“Ever since you were taken away I don’t sleep at night” I stared at him and 
saw raw fear in his eyes. This is a man who fears nothing. My heart broke for 
him when I felt all his pain. Jenna whimpered in my head. I stepped forward 
towards him and wrapped my hands around his wa!st. He pulled me into him. 

“Please let me take care of this without having to worry about you. I’ll bring the 
b***h here and let you take care of her if you want but I don’t want you to 
leave here until we’re back.”  He said bringing his head to my neck. 

Zayn 

“If you go I’m going to be worried about you” She said softly 

“You don’t have to worry about me as long as you’re okay I’m 
okay…remember?” She put her head against my c.hest melting into me. 

Hope finally calmed down. I hate arguing with her she pushes my every 
fvcking*g b.utton, she drives me mad and she turns me into a fvcking*g 
animal but I can’t live without her. We came down stairs she went into the 
private living room to see her parents while I went straight to the office to meet 
with Matt and Kyle in regards to their attack plan. 

This morning our allies had sent over their elite warriors who were given 
accommodations for as long as they stayed here. Which would not be long I 
have every fvcking*g intention of ending this shirt once and for all. 

Kyle had already sent scouts and hunters to guard the enchanted forest from 
a far not to risk being seen. 



I was in my office looking over maps when they came in “Did you make sure 
the patrols inside and outside our territory are increased today?” I asked them 
both 

“Yes patrols have been tripled until further notice.” Kyle answered 

I hated the idea of making a trip to the Enchanted Forest without Hope but 
Brian will be here  is capable of taking care of her in case anything should 
happen. Something did not sit right with me. 

“Are you okay?”  Matt asked me  “I keep thinking that this might be a play to 
take Hope” 

A Luna strengthens her pack and we were already the strongest pack known 
with our Luna we were unbeatable. So this could be an attempt to take her 
away again then Edward would use his warriors and rogues to attack us and 
try to k!ll me to avenge his son. I leaned back in my seat and took a deep 
breath. I was determined to keep her safe. 

“We have to be ready for anything this is a situation where I refuse to leave 
anything up to chance. I don’t want to take any chances.” 

My brothers and I spent most of the day looking at our territory map to make 
sure all our borders were heavily guarded . I didn’t want to leave here later 
without making sure all our borders were covered. We mapped out all 
possible places and attack routes where the rogues could be hiding. He used 
rogues to attack once I’m sure he will do it again. 

“Okay guys tell me your strategy plan” I ordered 

“Okay”  Matt looked at Kyle then back at me  “They want Hope alone and 
that’s what they’ll get” 

“Matt I don’t like where you’re going with this think of a new strategy” I warned 

“Wait just listen you said you want to end this once and for all” Matt continued 

“What’s your point?” 

“We let them think that Hope took the bait and went alone ” I stood up my 
bl00d boiling 



“I know you’re not telling me to send my mate and fiance into the Enchanted 
Forest alone!” I was beyond frustrated. 

“No I’m telling you that you will be there along with all the fighter warriors but 
we will be unseen. If we show up tonight Stephanie could play it cool and 
Edward won’t attack or we let them think that Hope actually went there alone 
and expose their plan. Hope will not be harmed in any way she doesn’t even 
have to shift. When they see she’s alone they will execute their next move and 
we will be there to take them down.” 

“I don’t like this come up with another strategy” 

“Zayn she’s our best option there’s no other way. Any other way will give them 
the advantage” 

“We’re not doing it end of discussion”  I stared at both of them 

“I want to do it Zayn” I heard Hope say she was standing at the door. fvck. 

My Mate Chapter 75 - Tips 

Hope 

I walked into Zayn’s office “Hey guys” I greeted Matt and Kyle smiling at them. 

“Hey Hope I’m glad you’re here maybe you can help us convince your mate” 
Matt says 

“Matt I said form another plan because there’s no way I’m going to let her walk 
into that forest alone” Zayn growled at both his brothers. I felt bad for him he 
was just worried about me. 

I walked over to Zayn’s desk and stroked his arm to try and calm him down. I 
could feel his anger and pain together but he has to trust me and his brothers 
“I can do this you’re going to have to trust me” 

“I do trust you but this isn’t happening absolutely fvcking*g not we have 
already talked about this” He says 

“Zayn listen to me they have a point you know”  I paused  “If you go there with 
the warriors they could retreat quietly and then what?  when will this end? 



How long will this go on for? I’m going back to school next week. How long do 
I have to live in fear?” 

“Hope, first of all as Luna you’re going to have enough on your plate so you 
won’t be able to attend school, you can be home schooled and Edward fvck 
has a witch on his side, the last time we were in that forest we couldn’t mind 
link each other. Not to mention that the forest was practically on the f***s 
territory which means they probably have escape routes planned perhaps 
through tunnels. They could have decoys in place, or traps ready and 
waiting..” 

“We will all be right there hiding up in the trees. Not too close so we can 
remain undetected but close enough if they try anything.” Kyle said 

“I like that idea” I smiled at Kyle 

“You like anything he says” Zayn growls pointing to Kyle. I couldn’t help 
giggle. He’s right Matt, Kyle and I have a special bond. I love them to death 
and even though their plan may have sounded rash it was the only way to 
finally end this. 

“But if this is going to work we have to go early much earlier than they would 
expect. We hide and wait, when it’s time Hope will come driving her car two 
warriors will be in the car also hiding. She’ll park and walk down into the 
forest. 

Zayn puts his head down I can tell he’s in deep thought. Then looks up at me 
“As soon as our warriors attack you leave. You don’t fight. That’s my condition 
if you’re going to do this” 

“Okay” I said 

“Okay we’re going to get the warriors ready and situated” Kyle and Matt stood 
up ready to leave the office. 

“Wait I had lunch prepared for everyone. The tables are set up outside and 
the omega’s are ready to serve them. Make sure they all eat before they go 
that includes you two.” 

“Yes Luna” Kyle said before saluting me 

“Now isn’t the time to fvck around with him” Matt told him as they walked out. 



When we were alone Zayn’s eyes bore into mine “Are you hungry” I asked 
him 

He ignored my question moved his chair back and pulled me onto his lap 
“Hope I mean it as soon as we attack I want you out of there. I’ll have a couple 
of warriors bring you back home” He spoke sternly 

 

“Agreed” I said and playfully held out my hand so we could shake on it but he 
cupped my face and k!ssed me. He took over my l!ps and opened my mouth 
with his tongue. He tasted so good and his k!ss was so  passionate Jenna 
howled out of pleasure. 

I pulled back and ran my hands through his hair then put my head on his 
shoulder he played with my hair. This man is everything to me. I can’t wait for 
all this to be over and we can relax. 

“Zayn when Alex had me chained up, Stephanie and Edward were both there. 
They heard me yell out for you continuously but they never flinched. Gavin 
tried to get him to stop but he only got punished for it. I never felt any pain I 
was yelling out for you but I wasn’t in any pain and that made them mad. So 
don’t worry about me lets end this together. We were born and destined to 
fight together.”  He studied my face but kept quiet. 

“They are evil and heartless and with the rogues they are powerful. Yes, she 
will try to k!ll me but she won’t succeed. I am stronger than her and as a pack 
we are a lot stronger than them” 

Zayn 

I held her tight she’s so strong and confident no wonder she was destined to 
be Luna. 

“Luna” I whispered and put my forehead against hers. “Thank you for always 
believing in me” I k!ssed her again. She’s fvcking*g turning me on and I wish I 
could bend her over and fvck her right here on my desk that would definitely 
help me relax a bit but we have to get this plan going I wanted to meet with 
the warriors again and go over the details of the plan. 

We were in my office again this time Brian was with us. He was worried for his 
daughter but didn’t discourage her not once. He only motivated her. I watched 



my baby as Matt and Kyle went over the Enchanted Forest map with her 
explaining where she needed to drop me off because I would be in the car 
with her of course and where she needed to park her car. They also pin 
pointed where our warriors would be situated watching her closely. She didn’t 
show any sign of fear while we explained what she needed to do. I called 
ahead for two of our helicopters to be on standby in a clearing nearby the 
forest as soon as we attacked Hope would be taken home in one of them. 

By early evening our warriors and our ally warriors were spread out all over 
the outside of the Enchanted Forest. Some hid in the trees others in small 
camouflaged ditches. I had healers masking everyone’s scent and trackers 
situated deep in the trees waiting to send us a signal when they saw the b***h 
or anyone else in the damned forest. 

I had the utmost faith in our warriors. These men were trained to fight tooth 
and nail they are well known among other packs as ruthless fighters that fight 
with everything they’ve got and never show mercy. They can endure pain and 
t0rture with patience. Hope is the life of our pack she went out of her way to 
make sure all the warriors, trackers and healers had eaten before they left. 
She also kept calm and assured both our mothers that there was nothing to 
be concerned about. 

I knew our warriors they would fight for their Luna till death. It was nearly 
midnight I was in the car with Hope. I drove most of the way holding and 
k!ssing her hand back and front. I stopped to get out by one of our healers 
where Matt and Kyle had planned but before I got out  She leaned into me 
and k!ssed me 

“I love  you” She said. I took off my watch that Hope gotten me for my birthday 
and put it in her glove compartment. 

“I love you too remember get out of there as soon you notice any sign of 
attack.” I hesitated before climbing out of her car and shutting the door closed. 
I felt my heart race as she drove off. Hunter was already in k!lling mode. 

Hope 

I parked my car where Matt and Kyle had pointed out to me over and over 
again on the map and walked deep into the forest. I knew I was safe. I felt 
safe. I thought of Jason, Derek, Eric, Matt, Kyle, Axel and Zayn. They were all 
here making sure I wouldn’t get hurt. I had never felt  so safe. After walking for 
about fifteen minutes I saw her. Jenna growled remembering Stephanie as 



one of my t0rturers. I stood in front of her for a second in silence and she 
flinched like I intimidated her. 

“Were you followed?” She asked me looking me up and down. Whore 

“No…are you here alone or is daddy dearest nearby because I can smell 
someone else here” I said sarcastically looking behind her. She pretended to 
laugh. 

“I’m so glad you came… I’m going to k!ll you then make sure Alpha Zayn 
claims me as his Luna.” 

“Ohhh and I thought you wanted to k!ll me to avenge your sick brother who by 
the way died a painful death by my own father’s hands” I said smiling at her. 

“You b***h first you took Zayn from me, then my friends then my brother” She 
yelled. 

“I didn’t take Zayn from you because he was never yours to begin with, your 
friends found out what a lying b***h you really are and as for your brother he 
wiped my memory I’ll never forget what he put me through and he got what he 
deserved my father tore him to pieces just so you know.” I spoke calmly. 

All of a sudden a man appears from behind the trees but I can’t see him 
clearly. I’m reminded of the time Zayn and I were in the car and I saw a figure 
looking at us making out. This is the same figure. 

“Stephanie dear don’t threaten to k!ll our guest. We need her” The stranger 
said as he approached us “I already explained this to you my dear” 

“Hello again Hope” His chilling voice made Jenna growl in fury and call out for 
Hunter. Oh my Goddess Edward. 

“Hi I’m so glad you came with her that way you both die together” I said 
standing up straight. 

“By the way b***h you will never be his Luna!” I said looking straight at her in 
the eye. 

“Ahhhhhh I’m going to tear your heart out”  She screamed and attacked me I 
darted her strike and kicked her down to the ground. That’s when all hell 
broke loose. 



 


