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Chapter 1851 Divine Beast Versus Divine Beast I

The reason Adrian suddenly appeared in a flash of lightning is due to the fact that the 
Tree of Life and Death activated one of its defensive functions to call upon its 
defender. Even though the Tree of Life and Death that was summoned is not the main 
body, it is still part of the collective consciousness that the real one has. The Three-
Legged Golden Crow is also a divine beast which means that it could directly hurt the 
main body of the Tree of Life and Death.

It was not just Saena that was summoned because Adrian and Kimat were also called upon due to 
their connection. Adrian just had to confirm that he wants to be relocated and there he was on top of 
the Three-Legged Golden Crow. Kimat suddenly pounced while Adrian summoned Sirius to aid 
them as the enemy is a user of light elemental energy.

"Since when were divine beasts so easy to call?" Adrian muttered as he can feel that the Three-
Legged Golden Crow is not a being that is part of this world as of now.

The aura emanating from the Three-Legged Golden Crow is just like the mana felt from monsters 
summoned by magic. Adrian knows this because he can summon colored dragons to attack. The 
Three-Legged Golden Crow is giving off the same wavelength of energy that temporarily 
summoned beings have.

"It was the Goddess of Light Luminaria that summoned that thing from the sun itself. Look up and 
see that the sun actually has three dark spots. Two of them were killed before descending unto the 
world because of the Sun God Ra. If that did not happen then the Goddess of Light Luminaria 
might have already won." Levin Cloud stated.

"If that is the case then attacking the Goddess of Light Luminaria should be our priority. Defeating 
her would sever her connection with this thing. The Three-Legged Golden Crow does not even have 
a summon duration as she is directly tied to it as if she was supplying it some power." Adrian stated 
as the soul of the Three-Legged Golden Crow is also connected to the Goddess of Light Luminaria.

"Look at that. The dragons are trying but she is suddenly protected by a barrier that looks like a sun. 
It seems that the Three-Legged Golden Crow is also making sure that its summoner is protected." 
Levin Cloud stated as he pointed out the dragons spewing their dragon breaths at the new light 
shield that protected the Goddess of Light Luminaria.

"Then we kill the Three-Legged Golden Crow. That is the easiest way out of all of this anyways." 
Adrian stated as the Three-Legged Golden Crow suddenly burst into golden flames and shot up 
from being pinned down by Kimat.

"A fledgling divine beast actually dares to ridicule me!" The Three-Legged Golden Crow shouted in 
anger as waves of heat were generated from just its voice.

Kimat roared and the sky rumbled as a powerful lightning bolt suddenly struck down towards the 
Three-Legged Golden Crow. The Three-Legged Golden Crow immediately created a barrier that 
protected its back from being hit by the bolt of lightning. It seems to have eyes on the back of its 
head as well as having an extra leg.



"I shall burn all of you for offending me! Sun Bird's Wrath!" The Three-Legged Golden Crow stated 
as it rose to the sky and curled itself like a ball.

The Three-Legged Golden Crow looked like a small sun again but this time it released attacks. A 
flaming shower of birds were created by the Three-Legged Golden Crow as it used its special 
ability. The small flaming birds are unlike flaming meteors that did not have an intended path. The 
flaming birds actually have homing capabilities and it prioritized those that have body heat.

"What are we going to do?" Levin Cloud asked as the flaming birds were all over the place.

"I shall deal with it. Vortex!" Adrian stated as he created a small star on his palm.

Instead of the usual small star rising up to the skies where it will explode into a black hole, Adrian 
created a small portal that led towards the Three-Legged Golden Crow. This small portal 
transported the small star that Adrian created and sent it on top of the Three-Legged Golden Crow. 
The Three-Legged Golden Crow did not know what was happening around it as it used a skill 
where it uses all its focus to create a small sun.

As soon as Adrian has assured that the small star has been placed properly, he snapped his fingers as 
a powerful explosion of space created a powerful black hole. The black hole that Adrian has created 
sucked in all the flaming birds that came after the initial seconds that spread out. All the succeeding 
flaming birds were dealt with swiftly until the small sun created by the Three-Legged Golden Crow 
has fizzled out.

"The rest of us including me will deal with the Three-Legged Golden Crow. Command the other 
team members to deal with the Goddess of Light Luminaria. She is more of a problem to us if the 
battle takes long. The more time that she is given then the more time she has to accustom herself to 
the changes of her body." Adrian stated as he called Vayu and Soleil to aid him in subjugating the 
Three-Legged Golden Crow.

"Okay! I will make sure that the goddess will be defeated." Levin Cloud stated as he called upon the 
members that are not going to help with the Three-Legged Golden Crow subjugation.

The Luxera that are powerful are still scattered about and fighting the army members. The Goddess 
of Light Luminaria is also not just purely defensive as she would fire off beams of light that can 
easily disintegrate the body of a normal human. In fact, if not for the readiness of all the army 
members to fight against beings of light, then they might have been defeated earlier.

The Three-Legged Golden Crow has finally uncurled from its attack form, and it was bewildered 
that its powerful attack was not making the battlefield erupt in more flames. It then realized that a 
black hole was still sucking in all the flaming birds that it had created. It used up some of its 
powerful flames for nothing as there was barely any difference from the battlefield earlier.

As soon as the Three-Legged Golden Crow was out of its sun like shape, ten lightning bolts 
suddenly came down upon it. There was lightning attacking its body earlier when it was in a sun 
like form, but it seems that it has decreased damage when that happens. Now that the Three-Legged 
Golden Crow unfurled, countless light strikes that Kimat has condensed finally deal damage to it 
which greatly injured it.

"This will be a showdown between divine beasts. Kimat, make sure that every lightning bolt that 
you have called upon will hit. Sirius, you are also in the offensive as you need to build the Poison of 



God stacks on the enemy. Let us hunt down this Three-Legged Golden Crow. Are you with me, 
Vayu and Soleil?" Adrian stated.

"We are with you, but this transformation does not last long. We need to take it down as fast as we 
can." Vayu stated.

"No more games! I shall burn all of you to a crisp!" The Three-

Legged Golden Crow declared.

The Three-Legged Golden Crow suddenly expanded more on its size while also having its feathers 
explode into even more golden flames. If the Three-Legged Golden Crow looked like a golden 
colored crow earlier, then it is now vastly different in this instance. The Three-Legged Golden Crow 
suddenly became a flaming bird of golden flames.

"Incarnate of the Golden Sun!" The Three-Legged Golden Crow stated as numerous notifications 
suddenly appeared to all.

[The Three-Legged Golden Crow has used the Incarnate of the Golden Sun.]

[The Three-Legged Golden Crow will be immune to any fire-

based damage for the duration.]

[The Three-Legged Golden Crow will have its stats doubled for the duration of 20 minutes.]

[The Three-Legged Golden Crow will have the passive effect of Immolate. All beings near the 
Three-Legged Golden Crow will have will receive a 0.01% health damage per second with those 
near the summoned creature will get double the damage from the immolation.]

The Three-Legged Golden Crow will have suddenly flapped its large flaming wings and created 
two golden flaming tornadoes that mowed down any soldiers in its way. Soleil had to use her 
control over fire to trye and delay one of the flaming golden tornadoes. Vayu dealt with the other 
one by using the winds to do his bidding and stop the flaming golden tornado in its area.

"I see. It is a battle of the gigantic divine beasts then. Let us try your new skill, Kimat." Adrian 
stated.

[Your soulbound Kimat has used the Gha Agsheblah Domain. The Gha Agsheblah Domain makes 
all spells be inside have a 50% chance of failing. (Increased chance for healing type spells which is 
75%.]

Chapter 1852 Divine Beast Versus Divine Beast II

[Your soulbound Kimat has used the Gha Agsheblah Domain. The Gha Agsheblah 
Domain makes all spells be inside have a 50% chance of failing. (Increased chance for 
healing type spells which is 75%.]

[Your soulbound, Kimat, has activated Gha Agsheblah domain.]

[Your soulbound, Kimat, has doubled his stats for the duration of the domain.]

[The Three-Legged Golden Crow's Incarnate of the Golden Sun has been afflicted by the domain 
and has been cancelled.]



[Your soulbound, Kimat, has automatically activated the Disturber of All Things skill and has 
transformed.]

[Your soulbound, Kimat, has gained 50% more base stats for the duration of the transformation.]

[All harmful effects on your soulbound, Kimat, has been cleansed.]

[Your soulbound, Kimat, will be immune to any status ailments and status debuffs for the duration 
of the transformation.]

The surroundings are suddenly filled with clouds that is reminiscent of what happened to Adrian 
before. The clouds were not so thick that the people inside the domain are blinded by it, but it made 
those that are away incredibly difficult to perceive. The clouds also lit up as if they were transparent 
thunderclouds that came down from the sky.

The Three-Legged Golden Crow felt that its enemy has suddenly vanished from its perception. To 
make matters worse for the Three-Legged Golden Crow, the skill that can be said to be its signature 
one was suddenly cut off by a mysterious power that is more powerful than its divinity. The Three-
Legged Golden Crow is suddenly scared because it has the most potential when it comes to divinity 
among the divine beasts since it came from the freaking sun.

"Impossible!" The Three-Legged Golden Crow stated as it tried to fly away as it suddenly came to a 
realization.

A large black paw suddenly appeared like a thunderclap and slapped the Three-Legged Golden 
Crow back down to the ground. The Three-Legged Golden Crow could not even evade as the speed 
at which the paw hit it was too fast even for it. The paw itself did not greatly damage the Three-
Legged Golden Crow but it was able to send it back to the ground as if it was incredibly easy.

The Three-Legged Golden Crow looked up and saw a terrifying image of a gigantic black tiger with 
silver stripes that is ten times bigger than its current size. The titanic black tiger with silver stripes is 
none other than Kimat's form when he enters the Disturber of All Things state. This skill is actually 
not an innate skill of Kimat's evolution but is due to his mutation.

Kimat is not an ordinary Tempest Lodestone Kaiser Tigris because his soul has been tempered and 
combined with Adrian's. If one were to ask the gods of death to rate Adrian's soul, then they would 
have told anyone that it is the most bizarre soul that they have ever seen. Adrian's soul is akin to a 
strange tree than a humanoid form like that of a demon which is why some gods of death evade 
Adrian.

Due to being Adrian's soulbound, Kimat's soul is also afflicted by this change which turned into a 
mutation that heavily imparted the hidden trait inside Adrian's soul. Some beings that have been 
born with powerful souls like Kanlaon and Saena have more resistance to the mutation as their souls 
are powerful as they are respectively a dragon and a descendant of a high divine bird.

This is also the reason why Kanlaon and Saena have not gotten a domain from Adrian's soul despite 
then being compatible with the choice that the latter made. If Adrian's soul would overpower the 
two then it would be more likely for them to get a domain skill as well. This is not for certain, but 
this is information that Adrian concurred when he evolved Kimat and he gained a domain.

Kimat's new form is also a result of mutation as the real Kimat is actually the entire domain itself. 
The titanic tiger that has black fur and silver stripes is actually just a manifestation of Kimat's form 



since he needs a way to attack. It is also a way for Kimat to focus his strength into a single point 
unlike being an entire gaseous being with no body.

Having a body also makes Kimat only be damaged when his coalesced body is there unlike if he 
were to just be clouds the entire time. Although Kimat can create a body within his real body (the 
domain), he has full vision to everything inside of his domain which makes him deadly. Kimat can 
just create copies of himself by the hundreds but that would also split his mind too much despite 
having the Supreme Intelligence skill.

The reason why Kimat is choosing one manifestation is to make sure that his strength is not 
divided. Just as the people seeing Kimat relentlessly slapping the Three-Legged Golden Crow with 
paws filled with the power of lightning. Each slap would create a powerful thunderclap that can be 
heard in the battlefield. The Three-Legged Golden Crow started to get bullied by Kimat which also 
made the people that aided Adrian use this opportunity to hit all their attacks and spells.

Vayu used wind blades to cut through the defense of the Three-Legged Golden Crow. With each of 
his slices, hundreds of flaming feathers from the Three-Legged Golden Crow would be sliced. The 
area where Vayu has focused his attacks could be seen balding already. If the Three-Legged Golden 
Crow noticed its feathers getting bald then it would have burnt Vayu to a crisp.

Soleil did the opposite of Vayu as she focused more on siphoning the flames of the Three-Legged 
Golden Crow. She then converted these flames for the Tree of Life and Death which serves as the 
fuel for the latter due to its current form. Just like Levin Cloud, Soleil was able to connect with the 
Tree of Life and Death as a temporary contractor.

Soleil formed a temporary contract with the Tree of Life and Death in order to extend the duration 
of its activity. The current Tree of Life and Death needs fire as its fuel since it can be substituted 
from mana. This made Levin Cloud expend no mana at all to increase the duration of its stay which 
benefited all the beings blessed by the Tree of Life and Death. Every being that is allied with the 
Tree of Life and Death are experiencing a 10% increase in damage as a buff provided by the 
burning form of the tree.

The Goddess of Light Luminaria could see the course of the battle suddenly turning because of the 
arrival of one individual. She would have used powerful light rays to hit Adrian if it was not due to 
the Light Dragon King suddenly changing targets to her. With Adrian's arrival, the troublesome 
Three-Legged Golden Crow was distracted which mean that the Light Dragon King could focus on 
destroying the shield that covered the Goddess of Light Luminaria.

"I must do something or else my shield will be breached. Should I stop siphoning magic from the 
Three-Legged Golden Crow? No… I must use its magic in order to have enough power to defend 
myself even if it is weakening it to the level of a dragon king." The Goddess of Light Luminaria 
thought as numerous beings also started to join the Light Dragon King in trying to destroy her 
shield.

Even Adrian thought that the Three-Legged Golden Crow that they are facing is too weak even 
though it has degraded from a divine tier beast and is only an essence. The real reason on why it 
was this weak was actually the siphoning of its mana by the Goddess of Light Luminaria. She was 
using about 30% of the mana output of the Three-Legged Golden Crow to protect herself. This 
means that the shield surrounding her was not due to the fact that the Three-Legged Golden Crow 
wanted to protect her.



"It has already been five minutes. Kimat, finish the divine beast so that we could focus more on the 
bigger fish. Sirius, clean up all the Luxera in the battlefield with the help of the Shadow unit." 
Adrian commanded as he resumed command of the entire Pantheon guild.

"As master wills." Sirius and Kimat stated.

"Yes, guild leader." The Shadow Unit members stated as Sirius surrounded them in shadows as all 
of them entered the shadow realm.

Kimat roared out loud and his domain rumbled as the white clouds inside it suddenly became dark. 
The Three-Legged Golden Crow suddenly felt goosebumps in its skin as this power is almost 30% 
of the power that its real body possesses. The Three-Legged Golden Crow looked at the Goddess of 
Light Luminaria and cursed her existence.

"You idiotic goddess! Pulling my essence here when there is a being that can inflict damage upon 
my real body here! I shall curse you by getting back all the things you are siphoning from me! I 
must protect my real self instead of you!" The Three-

Legged Golden Crow shouted as the flaming golden barrier that protected the Goddess of Light 
Luminaria suddenly vanished.

Chapter 1853 Incarnate of the Sun

The Three-Legged Golden Crow shouted and reversed the connection that it had with 
the Goddess of Light Luminaria. It knew that it must protect its entire body with all its 
power because the very reaches of its soul could feel the attack coming to it will 
shatter the divine spark that was used to create its minor body. The Three-Legged 
Golden Crow suddenly looked a bit more different than before.

"Incarnate of the Sun!" The Three-Legged Golden Crow shouted as it used another skill to 
transform itself once more in hopes of defeating Kimat.

Each of its talons now hold a small flaming sun while its body became bathe in golden flames. The 
Three-Legged Golden Crow also emitted a powerful screech that deafened anyone that was near it 
as it released a frightening amount of power. The energy that came out of the Three-Legged Golden 
Crow is suddenly matched by the frightening output that Kimat has gathered as well but the former 
was unable to keep up.

"Chaotic Disrupter!" Kimat's voice stated as the entire domain transformed into him.

The Three-Legged Golden Crow was already too late as it was a step too late in getting the energy 
the Goddess of Light Luminaria was siphoning on it. The Three-Legged Golden Crow was not able 
to entirely match the power that Kimat gave out. In the end, the Three-Legged Golden Crow could 
only curse its luck and the owner of the divine beast as well.

"I shall remember this! You will not be able to go near the sun as long as I live!" The Three-Legged 
Golden Crow stated as it was suddenly pulverized by the large Kimat.

Kimat's attack did not just hit the Three-Legged Golden Crow but also all the enemies that were 
around him. All the Luxera that was at least fifty meters away were also swept by the powerful 
energy wave which disrupted their bodies. The Luxera nearest Kimat became sparks of light while 
those that are farther away started glitching.



[Your soulbound, Kimat, has defeated the Three-Legged Golden Crow (Summoned Being).]

[The real Three-Legged Golden Crow cursed your existence as someone that is the enemy of all its 
avian descendants.]

[The Primordial Divine Beast Three-Legged Golden Crow will hunt you down once it awakens.]

Adrian smiled as he was able to test how powerful Kimat truly is as a summoned divine bird was 
the perfect candidate. He did not care that the Three-Legged Golden Crow cursed him to be 
enemies forever because he does not care. He would just need to add that to the long list of all of 
Adrian's enemies.

Kimat came out of the smoke without a single scratch on its body and no sign of exhaustion. Adrian 
could even feel that Kimat seems to be feeling refreshed as if he managed to scratch an itch that was 
difficult to reach. Kimat brought an item that looked like a small sun which the Three-Legged 
Golden Crow was holding in its talons. He remembered that there were three of them, but it seems 
that only one was able to drop.

Adrian only got mediocre experience points from defeating the Three-Legged Golden Crow as it 
was basically a summoned unit. Also, there was supposed to be three of them but two were already 
killed before one managed to descend. It seems that the developers were not that crazy to add three 
divine beasts on the side of the Goddess of Light Luminaria when she is already a High God.

Adrian was about to take the small flaming orb when Saena suddenly swooped in and devoured it 
like a small fruit. He was shocked at first as he was not able to see the description of the item first, 
but Saena did work tirelessly in healing all the people. Still, he would make sure to train his 
soulbounds in proper decorum once this battle is over.

"Ahh!" The Goddess of Light Luminaria shouted as she was finally injured by one of the attacks 
from the Light Dragon King and some of Pantheon guild members.

One could see that there is a small patch of hair burned off from the Goddess of Light Luminaria 
while she has a slight cut on her palm. The small cut from her palm was bleeding gold while her 
burnt patch of hair was not healing as if it is cursed. The small cut came from the attack of the Light 
Dragon King while the burnt patch of hair came from Levin Cloud.

The reason why the small patch of burnt hair is not healing is due to Levin Cloud's death curse 
spells. Since he was already used to using healing spells and the like, he made sure to practice 
curses and hexes used by the Church of Death. Some of his friends even told him that he finally 
transitioned to his emo phase as he was not a ray of sunshine when he learned them.

"Solarian Burst!" The Goddess of Light Luminaria shouted as she no longer protected herself and 
switched to offensive mode since her barriers are being broken by the Light Dragon King.

Millions of light fractals suddenly spawned around the Goddess of Light Luminaria. She then 
grunted once more, and all these million fractals burst out. From afar, it looked like light needles 
were being sent out in a large area, but these light fractals actually reached the length of one meter. 
Just getting hit by one can cause death if hit on the heart or the head while losing an arm or a leg 
would be minimal.

Just as the light fractals were sent flying, there was a brief moment when the Goddess of Light 
Luminaria thought that she could breathe. A shadow from below suddenly spawned and released ten 



individuals and a large black wolf. The ten individuals released numerous kunai that is enchanted 
with the darkness element.

As soon as they threw the kunai, they would dive back into the shadows created by Sirius. Sirius 
would then create shadow spears and hurled it towards the Goddess of Light Luminaria. Seeing the 
spears made of pure darkness, the Goddess of Light Luminaria did not underestimate it and released 
light rays to destroy each of them. She even fired another blast of light towards Sirius in order to 
make sure that he does not create more.

This instance made the attention of the Goddess of Light Luminaria shift towards Sirius. She did 
not expect that a small female being that melded well in the shadows sneak up from behind her. She 
suddenly burst into incredible speed that even the eyes of the Goddess of Light Luminaria could not 
keep up for a moment.

"Extreme Flash Goddess Arts: Devil Butterfly." Awraka muttered as black butterfly wings sprouted 
behind her back that is made from shadows and condensed into her sharp nail weapon.

With a light tap, Awraka managed to pierce the lower left leg of the Goddess of Light Luminaria. At 
first, the Goddess of Light Luminaria thought nothing of it as it was just a pinch, but she did not 
expect to be injected with pure darkness element that is also tainted with devil energy. The Goddess 
of Light Luminaria could not hold her pain and disgust that she actually used divine energy to swat 
Awraka like a fly.

Awraka was sent crashing to the ground and immediately died from her brave attempt. The Goddess 
of Light Luminaria screamed out loud as the small hole that Awraka created suddenly became 
bigger and darker with the size of a basketball. Light suddenly started to escape from the body 
created by the Goddess of Light Luminaria as if the dark hole was a breach.

[Awraka has created a weak point for the Goddess of Light Luminaria.]

[The weak point will be active for one hour.]

[All damage done to the weak point will deal 100% of its intended damage as there are no defenses 
on that weak point.]

Notifications started flooding in for all the players as they did not expect that a goddess could 
suddenly have an obvious weakness. Given then only those that can fly and reach the Goddess of 
Light Luminaria can hit the weak point, it was still an incredible opportunity because one can even 
kill the goddess as long as they hit it.

The Goddess of Light Luminaria also forgot about the numerous kunai that were thrown at her 
because they managed to hit her body but not damage her. The kunai that attached itself to the 
Goddess of Light Luminaria's body suddenly buried deep as if the darkness element enchanted on 
them grabbed onto light.

"Great Shadow Union Arts: Chains of Darkness!" All ten members of the shadow unit stated as 
chains of darkness suddenly burst out from the kunai which reached down to the ground.

Sirius suddenly emerged from the shadows and caught all of the chains using shadow tendrils and 
started to pull on the Goddess of Light Luminaria. The shadow unit and Sirius were attempting to 
bring the Goddess of Light Luminaria to the ground.

Chapter 1854 Bringing Down a Goddess



The shadows that Sirius created suddenly pulled down the chains of darkness that 
was attached to the Goddess of Light Luminaria. The Goddess of Light Luminaria 
suddenly felt a powerful force trying to pull her down to the ground and finally 
noticed the chains attached to her body. She ignored those petty weapons, but she 
did not expect them to be akin to sealing chains.

"Did you think these chains can hold me down?! I am the Goddess of Light Luminaria! The 
Supreme Goddess of All Light!" The Goddess of Light Luminaria stated with a powerful voice, but 
the chains of darkness did not disappear even though she blasted it with powerful light.

"Those chains are made from pure darkness that is from the Shadow Realm. The God Shalim 
himself made them in order to help us." Awraka stated as she was revived by Adrian.

As soon as Awraka was sent crashing to the ground, Adrian immediately vanished from his previous 
area and went to where she landed. He immediately used Rewind to reverse the time flow in that 
area to revive Awraka. Fortunately, he made it just in time before her entire body vanished into 
particles of light.

"Will those chains hold?" Adrian asked.

"It will hold, guild leader. Although, the time limit is only ten minutes. Once the time is up then 
those chains will melt back into the shadows." Awraka stated.

"Then that should be enough time to bring down a weakened goddess. She has yet to formally take 
root in the mortal realm. This is evident because her domain has yet to distort the laws of nature." 
Adrian stated as he now has a way to bring down the Goddess of Light Luminaria from her high 
horse.

"Limit Break: Summoner!"

"Greater Summon: Kanlaon!"

"Greater Summon: Charon!"

"Greater Summon: Dodu!"

"Greater Summon: Wisteria!"

All of Adrian's other soulbounds capable of combat are sent out. He cannot summon Kenos at the 
moment as it was still in a cocoon state sleeping deep inside Adrian's soul chamber. His other 
soulbounds would do just fine because they are powerful in their own right.

"Everyone! Pull as hard as you can! We shall let the Goddess of Light Luminaria taste what its like 
to have one's feet on the ground. Having her taste it with her mouth would be a better option." 
Adrian commanded as his soulbounds released their real sizes.

Sirius saw that his other siblings have been summoned which as well is why he sent some of the 
chains towards them. Kanlaon bit on a chain made of darkness and even coiled his body on it for 
firmer grip. Saena gripped it using her talons and started flying in the opposite direction.

Charon integrated the chain to his chains and started descending to the ground as if the chain was 
getting pulled from below the earth. Dodu handled it carefully as its touch could melt anything, but 



it seems that the chains were solid enough for it not to worry. Kimat bit the chain as well and started 
running in the other direction as well.

Wisteria created vines from her tree and pulled the chains using those. All of Adrian's soulbounds 
were pulling the chains of darkness as hard as they can. The Goddess of Light Luminaria could be 
seen struggling to keep herself afloat as seven powerful beasts are trying to drag her down.

Adrian's soulbounds would not be able to bring the Goddess of Light Luminaria by herself which is 
why the other chains were gripped by the nearby players as they started to pull her down. The 
Goddess of Light Luminaria tried to deploy powerful spells to blast the players, but the Light 
Dragon King intercepted them. The feeling of getting pulled down to the ground is not something 
that the Goddess of Light Luminaria appreciates.

"I may not be able to directly hurt you, but I can make sure that the children below will be able to 
bring you down. It seems that seeing the world from above has inflated your ego far too much little 
goddess. Remember that you were once human as well." The Light Dragon King stated as she and 
the other light dragons protected the players.

"These chains! To think that there were still gods of darkness that are alive! I will hunt them down 
and kill them myself!" The Goddess of Light Luminaria roared as she tried to keep herself afloat.

"She is too powerful! We cannot pull her down!" The players shouted as they are using all of their 
strength, but they cannot pull the Goddess of Light Luminaria.

"Pull all you want! You can never bring down a High God!" The Goddess of Light Luminaria stated 
as she might not be able to kill them, but the players cannot overpower her that easily.

"Perhaps our raw strength might not be able to, but the scales must always be balanced." The High 
Priestess Galatea of the church of judgement stated as she brought out the most ordinary looking 
scales, but the keenest eye will see that it is filled to the brim with divine energy.

The scales suddenly floated above the High Priestess Galatea's head as mana was taken from all the 
players and even NPCs that are going against the Goddess of Light Luminaria. Mana is also taken 
from the Goddess of Light Luminaria, but it was so small that she felt nothing. The collective mana 
of the players and the NPCs were now against the Goddess of Light Luminaria.

"Let the Eyes of Judgement reveal what is the truth! Judgement!" The High Priestess Galatea stated 
as the scales started to move as if it was weighing the collective mana of the army and that of the 
Goddess of Light Luminaria.

The collective mana of the army was blue in color while the Goddess of Light Luminaria's mana 
was gold. The scales tipped aggressively until the Goddess of Light Luminaria's was heavier.

"You have done more sin than all of the people here combined! Maximum Penitence!" The High 
Priestess Galatea stated as a powerful force weighed down on the Goddess of Light Luminaria.

Chapter 1855 The Light Gets Sent Down

The Goddess of Light Luminaria suddenly felt a powerful force come from above her and push her 
down to the ground. She tried her best to counter it, but it was an invisible force of nature that can 
bring down light itself. The Goddess of Light Luminaria looked at the High Priestess Galatea and 
tried attacking her but was blocked by the Light Dragon King.



"You cannot defy the power of judgement!" The High Priestess Galatea stated but even she was 
experiencing heaviness as she was basically fighting against the Goddess of Light Luminaria's will.

The High Priestess Galatea might be using the collective powers of the Gods of Judgement, but it is 
still her that makes the spell work. If she fails, then the judgment that was made by the Scales of 
Balance would ultimately fail as well. She was holding on for her goddess that was sealed. She 
must not fail the world as balance must always be attained for the perfect harmony.

"Little girl! Did you really think that you can go against me even with a divine relic? You are too 
weak, and this will be your death!" The Goddess of Light Luminaria stated as she knew that the 
High Priestess Galatea could end up killing herself if she presses on with the battle of wills.

"Did you forget about me?!" A voice suddenly came from behind the Goddess of Light Luminaria.

Gomory appeared once more with her sword coated in dark flames of light. With a powerful slash, 
she managed to slice the cheek of the Goddess of Light Luminaria. Light started pouring out of the 
slashed cheek as the Goddess of Light Luminaria wailed in pain. The pain made the Goddess of 
Light Luminaria lose focus and ultimately be brought down by the force of the Scales of Balance.

With a powerful crash, the Goddess of Light Luminaria literally descended on the ground. Her 
gigantic body was planted to the ground as the players cheered out loud. The players that had the 
right mind to not cheer started to attack her since she can now be hit closely.

"Fools! Do you think that I can not just fly again!" The Goddess of Light Luminaria stated as she 
tried to fly once more but she could not.

The Goddess of Light Luminaria suddenly looked behind her as there was a being that actually 
bound her shadow. Ironic as it is but even the Goddess of Light Luminaria has a shadow since every 
being must have a physical body in the mortal realm. If the Goddess of Light Luminaria was in her 
full domain or divine realm then she might not have a shadow right now.

"Enhanced Shadow Arts: Shadow Bind!" Awraka stated as she slammed a kunai filled top the brim 
with darkness energy.

[The Goddess of Light Luminaria has been bound to the ground for ten minutes.]

"This is the last gift that the God Shalim has given me to counter the Goddess of Light Luminaria. 
He might not be able to go to this realm but know that the shadows are with us, guild leader." 
Awraka added as she started to concentrate to keep the Goddess of Light Luminaria bound for ten 
minutes.

"Thanks. This is the ten minutes that all of us need." Adrian stated as he summoned his bow and 
started attacking the Goddess of Light Luminaria.

All of the players did not miss this chance as the Goddess of Light Luminaria is now brought down 
to the ground. Even the demigods that were reluctant to go in a head in collision started to bring out 
their weapons and strike the gigantic goddess. The Goddess of Light Luminaria did not take the 
attacks kindly as she can still kill anyone within range.

"Goddess!" The Angel of Diligence Uriel and the Angel of Charity Camael stated as they tried to 
defend the goddess from all of the attacks.



The two neo angels cannot defend their goddess from all the attacks. Magic spells and arrows that 
come from wizards and archers. Sword auras from warriors, curses from shamans and witches, and 
even breath attacks from dragons are now centered at them. The Goddess of Light Luminaria 
avoided this earlier by floating in the sky which limited the number of attacks that reach her, but it 
is now a different situation once she in on the ground.

"This cannot go one, my goddess. We are not enough to defend you." The Angel of Diligence Uriel 
stated.

The Goddess of Light Luminaria knew of that but the other three neo angels have yet to awaken. 
She would also need at least one day of full concentration to bring her transform the land into her 
domain. She cannot do so when she is being hounded by different beings.

"You two are correct. It seems that both of you have done all you can to protect me." The Goddess 
of Light Luminaria stated.

"We shall die for your protection, my goddess. Please focus on waking up our brothers." The Angel 
of Charity Camael stated.

"Yes. You should both die for my protection. It seems that spreading myself too thin for perfect 
control is no longer an option. I need to retrieve my own fragments from your bodies." The Goddess 
of Light Luminaria stated as she suddenly pierced the two Neo Angels with spears made of light 
which even shocked the collective army.

"My…goddess…why…" The Angel of Diligence Uriel stated as she suddenly went limp and turn 
into ashes.

"Sister…no..." The Angel of Charity Camael stated as a tear came out from her eye, but she also 
turned into ashes.

The sudden disintegration of the two Neo Angels revealed a shining fragment akin to a golden 
crystal. The Goddess of Light Luminaria took those two fragments and ingested them into her body. 
Adrian suddenly felt a powerful surge of energy that was unlike before as if the Goddess of Light 
Luminaria felt more complete. There was also a significant change on the body of the Goddess of 
Light Luminaria as she sprouted wings.

Chapter 1856 The Light Goddess’ Anger

[The Goddess of Light Luminaria has integrated one of her Goddess Fragment.]

[The Goddess of Light Luminaria will now be able to harness the power of the light element freely.]

[The Goddess of Light Luminaria has integrated another of her Goddess Fragment.]

[The Goddess of Light Luminaria will now be able to see everything that the light in the area 
touches.]

The Goddess of Light Luminaria not only sprouted two pairs of wings but also became even more 
powerful as well. The two pairs of wings on her back are the wings that were from the Angel of 
Diligence Uriel and the Angel of Charity Camael. She felt more complete as if she reunited with a 
missing part of her.



"HAHAHA! Finally! To think that such a thing would be possible! I am really the best goddess 
there is!" The Goddess of Light Luminaria shouted as she released waves of powerful mana that 
sent anyone near her flying.

The Goddess of Light Luminaria planted her Goddess Fragments in each of the most powerful 
angels that she created in order to achieve one thing. The thing that the Goddess of Light Luminaria 
wants to achieve is none other than smooth integration to the mortal realm when she descends. Just 
as she predicted, she could feel that her body was not able to cope up with the mortal realm as fast 
as she can.

She believed that she needed at least a week in order to make her body accustomed to the energy 
fluctuations of the mortal realm. This entailed that she spends that one week just meditating to get 
accustomed to the energy fluctuations. She created something like a backup by planting the 
Goddess Fragments into angels that can live in the mortal realm.

She was not able to do it back then as the angels were sealed before she could enact her plan back 
then, but this is the time. She might have forgotten about her real intention of planting the Goddess 
Fragments into her angels, but she remembered when some of the angelic leaders tried to rebel 
against her. She did not only plant them to control them but to also accustom a part of her in the 
mortal realm.

The powers of each of the angels that they have are actually due to the Goddess Fragments 
embedded into them. The angelic leaders thought that this is due to the goddess favoring them, but 
it was actually an absolute control mechanism planted to make sure that they do not go against her 
order. The Goddess Fragments are actually akin to soul fragments of the Goddess of Light 
Luminaria which represents 5% of her power.

The Goddess of Light Luminaria was not crazy to attempt doing this when she was battling the gods 
of light as she only planted the fragments after she was the ruler of the gods of light. This ensured 
that she would have the gods of light weakened under her but also have the most powerful angels be 
her puppets. It was now time to harvest the two goddess fragments since the two neo angels she 
created could not utilize her powers well.

"Such a waste of great power. They could not even utilize everything that I have given them." The 
Goddess of Light Luminaria stated as she suddenly created five barriers to cover her, and a hundred 
magic circles appeared behind her.

"This is how you utilize unlimited mana casting light magic!" The Goddess of Light Luminaria 
stated as she suddenly created numerous waves of light magic while also creating hundreds of light 
rays that hit anyone indiscriminately.

The numerous light rays looked like someone was firing beams of deadly light from the skies 
above. The Goddess of Light Luminaria made the light elemental magic in the surrounding tremble 
as she was forcefully using everything. Add to the fact that the Goddess of Light Luminaria can 
now see everything in the battlefield due to also absorbing the Angel of Charity Camael's ability.

"I shall make sure to destroy all of you now that I have some of my powers return!" The Goddess of 
Light Luminaria stated as she casted three Supernovas at the same time but all of them needed to 
gather enough light elemental energy.



"Andromeda!" Adrian stated as he released an arrow condensed with pure starlight and nether 
energy.

"Shadow Arts: Shadow Mask!" Awraka stated as her control over the Goddess of Light Luminaria's 
shadow was broken the moment, she fused with two Goddess fragments. She needed to do 
something else and that would be making sure that her guild leader's skill hit the intended target.

Adrian released the arrow, and a black shadow suddenly swallowed it and melted into the shadows. 
The powerful arrow that would have alerted the Goddess of Light Luminaria is no longer detected. 
Even if the Goddess of Light Luminaria has the power to see everything in the light, she would 
have to process everything, and she could not detect an arrow that is coated in shadows.

"I shall kill all of you! I will make all of your bodies be burned in my great light! You would be the 
first blind priestess! AHHHH!" The Goddess of Light Luminaria stated as she pointed towards the 
High Priestess Galatea, but she ended up screaming her lungs out.

The Goddess of Light Luminaria might have transformed into a more powerful hitter but that does 
not mean that all of her body has changed. The weak point that Awraka has created still had some 
time before it vanishes. It seems that the Goddess of Light Luminaria was too drunk on her new 
power that she forgot to protect it. Even the other players also forgot that the Goddess of Light 
Luminaria had a weak point.

An arrow coated by shadows appeared just next to the weak point. The shadow that wrapped around 
the shadows were expelled as soon as the target area was near. A powerful explosion of starlight and 
nether energy then happened directly at the Goddess of Light Luminaria's weak point which made 
her scream her lungs out.

The powerful explosion made the Goddess of Light Luminaria clutch her damaged leg. She had not 
felt pain like this even from the attack of the Fallen earlier. She would not have been too damaged 
from the starlight, but the foreign element mixed in is something that she only knows from visuals.

"Nether Energy! The demon!" The Goddess of Light Luminaria muttered as she had seen the 
expressions of even the dark gods distort when they are hit by this energy.

The Goddess of Light Luminaria actually asked the gods of death what nether energy is but they ept 
their mouths shut. In fact, Adrian was judged by the gods as a dangerous individual as even some of 
the gods of death fear him. If it is an individual feared by even the gods that are feared by the other 
gods, then that should mean something. There was even a secret council of gods that colluded to 
have Adrian erased from existence as nether energy was too frightening even for the gods of 
Pandemonium.

The killing order was not made because the being they wanted to erase was the Champion of the 
Twin Gods. Should they do something to the Champion of the Twin Gods without probable cause 
then they would invite the wrath of the most powerful gods in Pandemonium. Even if the Goddess 
of Light Luminaria does not want to admit it but she would need the faith of every being in the 
mortal realm to reach the power that the Twin Gods have.

"Fortunately for us, the Twin Gods cannot kill any gods that are considered part of Pandemonium. 
This is the reason why they created their champion so that someone can do their dirty task for 
them." The Goddess of Light Luminaria thought but the dirty task she is thinking of are just rightful 
punishments from the Twin Gods.



"Where is he!?" The Goddess of Light Luminaria shouted as she frantically searched for Adrian's 
body.

"Revealing Light!" The Goddess of Light Luminaria added as numerous eyes made of light 
suddenly manifested in the entire area.

The eyes were like eerie eyeballs that the sky manifested as if they were always there and just 
opened upon the command of the Goddess of Light Luminaria. The eyes scanned the entire area, 
but they could not find the Champion of the Twin Gods. The Goddess of Light Luminaria knew that 
Adrian is in the area because his soulbounds were still trying to pin her down.

"Where is he!? If you do not want to come out, then I shall burn every being here!" The Goddess of 
Light Luminaria stated.

The Goddess of Light Luminaria once again created three Supernovas as the first ones fizzled out 
when she lost concentration. She believed that she will be able to kill the Champion of the Twin 
Gods if she destroys everything. What she did not know is that the person she was looking for was 
right under her nose.

Chapter 1857 Pressure the Weak Point

"Universal Threat!" Adrian stated as he appeared just behind the Goddess of Light Luminaria and 
struck her weak point.

Adrian immediately switched his weapons upon releasing the Andromeda skill as he knew that 
attack would garner the attention of the Goddess of Light Luminaria. She would also focus on her 
weak point for a moment in time and the starlight released would blind her of the ability to see 
everything in the light. Adrian summoned his scythe and vanished from the world.

Adrian became invisible as and moved in a slightly different world than the real one. Even Adrian 
does not fully understand how he can be undetected even from gods in this form, but he still liked it. 
The Goddess of Light Luminaria is covered with numerous barriers but even those barriers cannot 
stop the Universal Threat.

In Adrian's current state, he can pass through any defenses as long as he is in this peculiar state. He 
passed through each of the barriers that the Goddess of Light Luminaria created. He tried to see if 
the Goddess of Light Luminaria will notice him if he passes through her barrier, but she could not. 
It seems that his current state makes him immune to any obstacles whether physical or magical.

When the Goddess of Light Luminaria did not show any reaction of Adrian's movement inside her 
barrier, he finally felt at ease to attack. The Goddess of Light Luminaria created three Supernovas as 
she cannot find Adrian at all. She felt some panic from her lack of awareness from an enemy that 
can deal great pain to her.

Before the Goddess of Light Luminaria could release the three Supernovas, Adrian attacked the 
weak point once more before it vanishes. Adrian's scythe directly hit the weak point of the Goddess 
of Light Luminaria and even enhanced the attack with nether energy. A clear cut could be seen on 
the body of the Goddess of Light Luminaria.

"ARGHHH" The Goddess of Light Luminaria shouted as she suddenly released a powerful blast of 
light that sent anyone near her blasting away.



Even Adrian was unable to react from the reaction of the Goddess of Light Luminaria. He was 
heavily damaged and got sent flying, but Sirius was able to catch him using the shadows. The 
chains of darkness that held the Goddess of Light Luminaria are all destroyed which greatly 
impacted the shadow unit as they were using some of their life force to make sure that the chains do 
not get destroyed.

"Master! Are you alright?" Sirius asked as he caught Adrian.

"I am fine." Adrian stated as he drunk a potion to heal some of the health that he lost.

"You insects dare! It seems that I have been far too lenient. I will punish all of you even if that 
means showing my true form!" The Goddess of Light Luminaria stated as her body glowed golden 
as if her skin itself was made of gold.

The Goddess of Light Luminaria did not look like a human at all as her entire skin became gold. 
The body that the Goddess of Light Luminaria is showing right now is just a partial form of her true 
form. The gods would often hide their true form as incredibly weak beings would disintegrate from 
seeing them and that they are more vulnerable to attacks in their true form.

Still, the gods can harness more power in their true form. An example of a true form is none other 
than the dark gods that descended back then. They were incredibly powerful, but they are also 
easily damaged by any attacker as long as they can fight a god.

"Pulsar!" The Goddess of Light Luminaria shouted as a powerful wave of light suddenly swept 
across the entire area.

A powerful pulse of light burst out from the Goddess of Light Luminaria and damaged every being 
that is in the area. Some of the players that are close to dying became particles of light as all beings 
had their health cut in half regardless of level. The powerful magic released by the Goddess of Light 
Luminaria ignored defenses and even the level of magic resistance that one had.

Adrian also lost lots of health in just one spell and he knew that this is the power of divine magic. 
The Goddess of Light Luminaria actually released divine magic even though the world barrier is 
restricting it. This is the real power of the true form of gods as they can ignore the power of 
causality as long as it is within their means.

"You are defenseless goddess!" Gomory stated as she was not that afflicted by the divine spell of 
the Goddess of Light Luminaria.

Gomory used one stack of her blade to nullify the divine spell that should have affected her. She 
then sneaked near the goddess and made her blade burn dark once more. This is the last stack of the 
power that the Fallen has given her. She must make this count and the opportunity arose when the 
Goddess of Light Luminaria showed her partial true form.

"Dark Light!" Gomory shouted as she slashed the back of the Goddess of Light Luminaria.

"ARHHGH!" The Goddess of Light Luminaria shouted as she was in great pain.

The Goddess of Light Luminaria felt the cut even more as it was her true body getting the damage. 
The dark light flames burned behind her and it was eating at her own mana. The last strike that 
Gomory made was the most powerful and most decisive strike as all the Luxera that the Goddess of 
Light Luminaria got deleted.



The Goddess of Light Luminaria clutched her wound as she tried to stop the light from escaping her 
body. She even made use of a pair of wings to cover the damaged area. She wanted to release a 
spell, but the dark light was making it difficult for her to collect light which she found odd. The 
Goddess of Light Luminaria now prioritized Gomory as another target to be eliminated.

"I did it!" Gomory stated but a sword suddenly pierced her abdomen.

"Are you alright, Goddess Luminaria?" A monotoned voice came from behind Gomory.

Gomory looked behind and the blade came from the Angel of Humility Mikhail. The sword actually 
destroyed Gomory's defenses as her health suddenly plummeted to a dangerous degree. The Angel 
of Humility Mikhail then kicked Gomory so that she crashes to the ground.

"Attack while the goddess is injured!" One of the players shouted as the Goddess of Light 
Luminaria is still injured. The one that shouted managed to wake up those that were shocked from 
the sudden appearance of the Angel of Humility Mikhail.

Numerous spells were launched at the Goddess of Light Luminaria as the players that were still 
alive wanted to end her. They were given a command to heavily injure the Goddess of Light 
Luminaria as she would be sealed much easier once she gets weakened. She might even need to 
escape to her divine realm in which the demons can seal her back for at least ten years.

"Fortress of Light!" Another voice stated as numerous walls of light suddenly blocked the attacks 
and spells that were aimed at the Goddess of Light Luminaria.

"Gabriel, my child, you have also awakened." The Goddess of Light Luminaria stated as she smiled.

"I am also awakened, my goddess." Another voice stated as a powerful healing light came covered 
the Goddess of Light Luminaria.

The injuries of the Goddess of Light Luminaria suddenly started to heal. She also reverted into her 
more humanoid form so that she expends lesser energy to heal herself. The healing light managed to 
heal her injuries but the ones that came from the dark light is not healing. A form of magic was 
deflecting the healing spell that the Angel of Kindness Raphael casted.

The three angels have also become Neo Angels as their entire bodies are covered in angelic armor. 
They are also wearing helms that covered their eyes and head as if those are the things controlling 
them. The Goddess of Light Luminaria is not shocked that this happened as her true form was 
weaker than she thought.

The Goddess of Light Luminaria had some of the energy in her true form flow into the light 
cocoons. This made the light cocoons explode with light elemental energy which filled them to the 
brim. The three immediately emerged as soon as they were able to get this powerful energy.

"Now that we have awakened, my goddess… we shall exterminate all of your enemies. I am the 
sword that you have created to destroy your enemies. The Angel of Humility Mikhail shall be the 
one that destroys all those in your way." The Angel of Humility Mikhail stated.

"The Shield of the Goddess has also come. I will protect you from any harm." The Angel of 
Patience Gabriel stated.

"I, the Angel of Kindness, has also answered the call of the goddess. I shall make sure that our side 
will never know pain." The Angel of Kindness Raphael stated.



Chapter 1858 Greater God Level Neo Angels

The silence of the stunned players could be seen as alarming because this was a battlefield. Three 
powerful Neo Angels have been awakened that have the power of Greater Gods. The Goddess of 
Light Luminaria is no longer supplying them with magic power which meant that she can now go 
crazy.

The Angel of Kindness Raphael had a more priestlike battle armor as it looked like it was made of 
silk unlike the other two that is heavily armored. He also has this powerful yet calming aura that 
heals anyone around him even if he was not even using a spell. The sheer power of his healing aura 
could even be felt by the priests which led to them saying that they must take down the Angel of 
Kindness Raphael first.

The healers and also the shamans could feel it as well since they can feel how powerful the healing 
aura of beings are. If there is someone that could have half the potential that the Angel of Kindness 
Raphael has on their side, then that would be the Envoy of the Twin Gods. Levin Cloud has half the 
healing potential that the Angel of Kindness Raphael has which means that they can rival the latter 
when the former has the support of other priest players.

The Angel of Patience Gabriel is much different than the other two as well because he was the 
heavily armored one among the two powerful Neo Angels. He was wearing such thick armor that 
there was not light armor covering his body, yet he was moving so fast as if the armor was not 
heavy. He also has two towering platinum silver shields that emit a powerful light when struck.

The two towering platinum silver shields immediately counters any attack with a light beam that 
deals 50% of the total attack of the attacker. If the attack is a wide area attack, then he could easily 
deflect the attack that hits him with 30% of the original damage. He can also create manifestations 
of light that can block wide range attacks that can easily defend their group.

The Angel of Humility Mikhail has the standard warrior armor, but it did not look weak. The 
platinum silver armor looked like it was made with the same metal that the Angel of Patience 
Gabriel had. If the armor of the Angel of Humility Mikhail does indeed have the defensive capacity 
of the shields that the Angel of Patience Gabriel, then he has the defensive ability of a tank. He 
might also have the capacity to release counter attacks the moment his armor gets stuck.

He also has a sword made of pure divine energy which Adrian feared the most. A weapon of pure 
divine energy should not exist in the world as it is in the realm of gods. If the Angel of Humility 
Mikhail has the ability to manifest such a powerful item, then it would be even more powerful once 
divine items are no longer restricted by the world. The Angel of Humility Mikhail is also the most 
dangerous opponent according to some angel players that defected.

"My angels! Your goddess has finally awakened all of you. Now it is time for chance. Protect me 
with all your might so that this world will belong to us. I shall aid you as well, but it will be up to 
you to protect me." The Goddess of Light Luminaria stated as notifications suddenly appeared for 
the players.

[The Second Phase of the Fight has now started.]

[The Goddess of Light Luminaria is now entering her Integration Stage with the mortal realm.]

[Stop her integration so that she may not summon her divine realm into the world.]



The Goddess of Light Luminaria suddenly looked at the mortals below with disdain before 
suddenly curling herself up as a golden sphere. The Goddess of Light Luminaria entered the second 
phase as soon as her health dropped to half which was good as that meant that she will not heal past 
that point. The players were relieved that even the Angel of Kindness Raphael was not able to heal 
her wounds or else they would end up losing.

"No… we should say that we are still lucky because if the two neo angels were not sacrificed earlier 
then the real second phase would have been defeating five neo angels protecting the Goddess of 
Light Luminaria." Adrian muttered as clearly envisioned it happening should that even did not 
happen.

The Goddess of Light Luminaria curling into a small sun and her neo angels protecting her is not 
the most vexing part, but it was the generation of Luxera. The Goddess of Light Luminaria was 
creating armies of light monsters even in her integration state. To make matters worse, the Luxera 
she created can also be healed by the Angel of Kindness Raphael.

[You have three hours before the complete integration of the Goddess of Light Luminaria to this 
world.]

[Should you be unable to stop it, the Goddess of Light Luminaria will be able to unleash her true 
form and power without any restrictions.]

"Puny mortals! If you wish to defeat the goddess, then all of you would need to kill us first!" The 
Angel of Humility stated as he casted a spell that linked the life force of all three.

The connected life force of the three neo angels would then create a barrier that protected the small 
sun that the Goddess of Light Luminaria has become. Adrian could feel that such a thing should be 
impossible to defeat in three hours. They would actually need to defeat three Greater God Level 
individuals while also fighting off a horde of light monsters being healed by one of the individuals 
mentioned.

"Wait! I suddenly forgot something!" Adrian thought as he suddenly realized something.

"We will surely be able to defeat you three Greater Gods and even feast upon your divine essence 
that came from a High God herself! You shall be the stepping stone for us to kill off the Goddess of 
Light Luminaria!" Adrian proudly declared as his words were broadcasted to all beings inside the 
sealed area but also to the entire world.

Adrian was able to create such a powerful buzz because he used the gift that the God King of the 
Winds Aeolus has given him. Adrian received this gift and did not think much of it as it was just a 
gift of sending messages via the wind to any part of the world. He thought that this would not be 
needed as he has the messaging system for players, but he realized that this gift can also be used to 
target all entities in the world.

As soon as Adrian stated as such, powerful energies that were hiding from earlier started to fill the 
area. Some were hiding within the collective army while some rose from people outside the area. 
Some even descended from the skies while others came from the sea a bit far from the area. The 
entire area is suddenly filled with the aura of demigods which made Adrian smile.

"I guess it is true that there are no useless gifts given in Pandemonium." Adrian stated as he looked 
at the hundred or so demigods that have appeared.



Adrian knew that his words carried power as it traversed the world due to the gift of a high god. His 
words made an impact to all demigods that did not join the cause because they were afraid of the 
Goddess of Light Luminaria. Only a few demigods joined initially as they wanted combat 
experience or were looking for an opportunity to get some divine essence and flee.

Adrian basically broadcasted to the whole world that there are now three Greater God Level 
Individuals that have the essence of the goddess. That said goddess is also in a state of being where 
she could not directly interfere. Demigods might fear High Gods but their fear against Greater Gods 
have lessened because some greater gods of light were killed by some of them teaming up.

Adrian told them that there is now a serving of such individuals where divine essence is for the 
taking. Adrian believed that defeating three Greater God level angels would have been hopeless in 
three hours but now he does not. Adrian expected to have at least twenty or so demigods to show up 
but a hundred was more than he expected.

"It seems that more will come. I am getting reports from the Daemos Observatory about powerful 
auras heading to our location." Adrian muttered.

If the Neo Angels can exhibit such profound emotion, then they would have cursed and terrorize 
Adrian by now. They would have also scorned the demigods for viewing them as prey instead of 
powerful beings. All they could do now is defend the Goddess of Light Luminaria for three hours 
because she is now incredibly vulnerable. The goddess thinking of integrating with the world now is 
the safest because of her three awakened neo angels but she invited disaster instead.

Chapter 1859 Battle Against Powerful Neo Angels I

The reason why the Goddess of Light Luminaria entered integration phase is simple. 
She could not longer wait any longer as the mortals were craftier than she has 
anticipated. There were more things that could injure her than she expected, and 
that the world was still restricting her even if she used an ancient forbidden spell.

Since she managed to awaken three greater god level neo angels, she believed that they are enough 
to guard her while she intercepts the world. The Goddess of Light Luminaria is not just integrating 
with the world as if she is taking it in, but she is rewriting it. She is basically overwriting the current 
state of the world that she has always been the High God present in the mortal realm.

This is akin to what happened to the Western Continent Gods where they rewrote the reality of that 
continent. For the Western Continent Gods, reality was immediately overwritten because of careful 
planning and consideration of just the specified continent. What the Goddess of Light Luminaria is 
attempting is a worldwide scale which is why it takes more time.

Attempting to rewrite the current causality of the world also means that the Goddess of Light 
Luminaria will be vulnerable to things in the mortal realm as well. It is also the reason why she is 
incredibly easy to defeat while she is trying to do that. Also, the Goddess of Light Luminaria did 
not say it but even an ancient forbidden spell has a time limit.

The Goddess of Light Luminaria could only maintain the spell she used on Ark for one month at the 
very maximum. She would have to redo it all over again if she wanted to keep it activated. She 
needed to overwrite the laws of the world within a month which is why she is also doing everything 
that she can.



What the Goddess of Light Luminaria is that there would be numerous demigods eyeing her divine 
essence like hyenas. She believed that her neo angels would be able to protect her since she has 
decimated the army and killed a lot of other mortals and demigods. She would have been correct in 
doing so if there was not a person called Equinox who is the greatest variable.

Adrian managed to call on all of the demigods that are near by giving provocative words that they 
would love. Demigods that are nearing their lifespan are basically hungry for divine essence in 
order to keep living. This is also the reason why demigods with nothing to lose were now in droves 
heading to the current fight.

The first part of the second phase of the fight against the Goddess of Light Luminaria is actually a 
brutal battle royale of neo angels against demigods. The sight of a hundred or so demigods trying to 
protect themselves and their goddess unfolded before their very eyes. The situation has suddenly 
became more chaotic because the powers of demigods are not something to scoff at as they are just 
below gods.

==

"Blessing of Gaea: Area Revival!" Levin Cloud chanted as he used up one powerful spell before the 
time for the summoning of the Tree of Life and Death expires.

Levin Cloud utilized the remaining energy that was given to him by the Tree of Life and Death to 
perform a wide area revival spell at no cost. He could have asked Adrian to extend the duration of 
the Tree of Life and Death via his domain skill but even he does not know when the battle will end. 
One cannot just suddenly demand someone to use something for their own benefit.

A powerful green light covered with flames swept the entire area and revived every player and even 
NPC. The revival of NPCs shocked Levin Cloud because he knew that their revival is extremely 
forbidden. He was about to check if he will get any punishment for reviving thousands of NPCs, but 
nothing came.

"I revived them, but I did not get punished?! Am I dreaming right now?" Levin Cloud stated.

"Not really. The world is actually in great chaos right now because of her." Adrian stated as he 
pointed at the Goddess of Light Luminaria.

"Her? Why is that?" Peridot asked as she appeared near them and managed to hear their 
conversation.

"The Goddess of Light Luminaria is basically considered a banned entity still. It is only through the 
use of an ancient forbidden spell which is why she is able to be in the mortal realm. Still, one cannot 
fool the will of the world even with a magic spell which is why the world is also trying to expel her 
out. Although, the world is having a difficult time because the spell used was very old and powerful 
that she sacrificed an entire city for it." Adrian stated.

Adrian could vaguely see a foreign power that is trying to expel the Goddess of Light Luminaria 
from the world. The force was not powerful enough to counteract a golden like silk veil covering 
the Goddess of Light Luminaria which is whey she is not getting sent back. Adrian believed that 
destroying that golden silk veil is key to expelling the Goddess of Light Luminaria.

In fact, Adrian managed to clearly see this golden silk veil when he struck the weak spot earlier. The 
golden silk veil was actually shattered momentarily when he did so. If the Goddess of Light 



Luminaria did not force some of her true form to appear then Adrian would have continued fighting 
the goddess without knowing of a way to rescue their guild member.

"I wonder how Ark is doing. I hope that he is fine in that divine realm and is not crushed to death by 
divine energy." Adrian stated.

==

Meanwhile…

Ark tried to concentrate clearly and felt great disturbances to his connection with the Goddess of 
Light Luminaria. A sharp scream came from the Goddess of Light Luminaria which he was able to 
pick up and the connection between them waned at that particular moment. Ark tried to use that 
opportunity, but the connection suddenly solidified as if it was healed.

"I failed again as it was too quick, but the connection is not perfectly healed. I will have another 
chance and wait for it." Ark stated as he concentrated once more.

A few minutes later, Ark suddenly heard the screeching and felt the intense pain coming from the 
other side. The Goddess of Light Luminaria was extremely hurt which made the connection which 
has the image of golden chains to fade in and out of reality. Ark knew this was his chance which is 
why he pushed through.

Ark managed to send his will into the light chains which the small Samael could clearly see. He 
thought that he would be able to escape and destroy the connection, but his mental image was 
suddenly transported to a weird space. He was suddenly in a place full of clouds and bright light 
while a golden statue like being could be seen curled up.

As if the golden statue being noticed him, Ark was suddenly filled with immense light energy that 
was so potent that even he cannot process it immediately. Ark is suddenly jolted awake as he once 
again got knocked back inside his cage while the small Samael saw what happened.

"Ouch! Wait! Why can I suddenly not see!?" Ark shouted as his eyes were suddenly filled with a 
golden covering.

"What happened?! Why were suddenly you blasted with divine energy? You almost died if I did not 
protect you." The young Samael stated.

"If I almost died then why did you not let me? I thought having me die is one way to reverse the 
ancient forbidden spell." Ark stated.

"The death I am talking about is not the one you know where you respawn. I am talking about 
permanent death that can erase every fiber of your being. Remember that divine energy can 
basically erase life if a mortal is exposed too much. Even if you are the Chosen Nephilim, you are 
still considered part of the mortal world." The young Samael stated.

"I saw a golden statue of a woman that is curled up. All of a sudden, that golden statue uncurled 
itself and released a powerful blast of golden light." Ark stated as he was now able to see once 
more.

"You saw what! That was the true divine form of the Goddess of Light Luminaria. You are lucky 
that you managed to survive getting blasted with divine energy." The young Samael stated.



"Why would I suddenly go and see the Goddess of Light Luminaria's true form? You told me that I 
just need to intensify the pain that she felt so that our connection severs." Ark stated.

"That is the only thing that you should do but something more must be happening in the mortal 
realm. Something or someone powerful enough for the Goddess of Light Luminaria to induce her 
true form even if she becomes more vulnerable in exchange for power." The Young Samael stated.

Chapter 1860 Battle Against Powerful Neo Angels II

"I cannot penetrate the will of the Goddess of Light Luminaria anymore. It is as if I am fully 
blocked by an enormous will that is different from hers." Ark stated.

"I fear that the Goddess of Light Luminaria is now trying to synchronize with the world, but we do 
not know that entirely. Do your best and wait for the chance once again. You might have a better 
chance is the Goddess of Light Luminaria does use her true form in the mortal realm as her state 
would be much easier to deceive." The young Samael stated as Ark once again went into 
meditation.

The young Samael did not show Ark that one of its hands is turning to gold. The sudden attack on 
Ark's soul earlier would have destroyed him if the young Samael did not sacrifice itself. The divine 
power of the Goddess of Light Luminaria is slowly corroding the last remnant of the originally 
most powerful angel.

"If he gets vaporized then the Goddess of Light Luminaria will fail but that would also mean the 
death of all the angels. You must live because the Dragon of Revelation can only be truly killed by 
you. You are the last hope of the Angels and the Devils." The young Samael stated as he started to 
collect all of his remaining will to make sure that Ark does not rot in this divine realm.

==

The Neo Angels were powerful but that does not mean they cannot easily defeat an army of hungry 
demigods. Divine essence is what demigods need in order to become gods themselves. Just enough 
would make them transform into lesser gods which is why hunting lesser gods has been the thing 
for demigods. It is also the reason why there are almost no cases of rampaging lesser gods in the 
central continent.

The lesser gods would not dare leave their sanctuaries as demigods become vultures when they are 
caught in foreign soil. The demigods that appeared were high in number because there are three 
beings that have the divine essence of a Greater God. There is also a High God in a sleeping state 
which is a good way to harvest divine essence.

The demigods did not even wait for the commands of the army generals as all of them charged 
towards the three neo angels. All of the demigods are hungry for divine essence as some have their 
lives nearing the end. If they do not become gods, then they would inevitably die of old age despite 
the power that they have. Even the players could see that most of the demigods that appeared are 
desperate.

"Should we join the fight?" Levin Cloud asked as Adrian was just observing as of now after his 
speech that garnered the attention of every demigod.

"Not yet. We will join the fight after an hour. Let us make sure that our forces are solid for now 
because we do not know what might happen. It is not just demigods that are eyeing the Goddess of 



Light Luminaria right now. I am sure that there are other beings around that are also interested in 
her divine essence." Adrian stated as he had this foreboding feeling that something might happen.

Adrian secretly gave some orders to Sirius to relay to the Shadow Unit. His limit break skill has 
also finished which is why he is now down to using three soulbounds at a time. He did not want to 
do unnecessary battles as the fights that the hundreds of demigods are doing is not something that 
they can interject. The demigods were basically hurling spells laced with divine energy against the 
Neo Angels.

"Those demigods are not fools. Even though I managed to get all of their attention, the demigods 
are not fighting with everything that they have. They are all waiting for something to happen before 
they get serious. Even if those Neo Angels are having a difficult time, the Goddess of Light 
Luminaria's cocoon barrier had no trace of damage.

Adrian observed carefully as he knew that the first hour is something that he had gained as a 
breathing room. The demigods were basically acting as the beings that carried the weight of the 
current allied army. Also, Levin Cloud managed to revive a lot of dead players and NPCs but that 
does not mean they are back to peak condition.

The players that were revived were only half in health while the NPCs were extremely disoriented. 
They are basically brought back to the land of the living because the Goddess of Light Luminaria's 
presence is disrupting the natural flow of the world. She should not have been able to descend to the 
central continent at this point in time which is why she is doing more harm to the world than she 
thought.

"This would be much easier if the Daemos were not maintaining the world barrier and fixing the 
numerous rifts that the Goddess of Light Luminaria is creating." Adrian thought as he started to give 
commands to all of his guild members.

The allied army generals were shocked to see dead soldiers revive on the spot as if they were never 
killed. They have heard of the rumors of these blessed beings (players) being able to revive from the 
dead but weaker and now they have seen even their own native soldiers do the same. The revival 
spell was done by none other than the Envoy of the Twin Gods that transformed into a large flaming 
wood giant.

All the allied generals immediately commanded a retreat to those that were just revived. They 
noticed that the newly revived were unfit for battle as they were weakened. Still, their problem is 
not yet done because numerous light monsters are still being generated by the Goddess of Light 
Luminaria even though she suddenly went to sleep.

The allied army had to fight while rescuing those that were just newly revived. The players, on the 
other hand, continued their fight against the Luxera as they have gotten used to being revived on the 
spot. The players tried to join the battle against the Neo Angels, but the demigods were at another 
level.

One of the players tried to join the bombardment of the demigods but he was the one that got 
bombarded in the end. The player got caught in the crossfire between the Neo Angels and the 
demigods. Each Neo Angel had a specialty which made them incredibly difficult to defeat even if 
they are outnumbered.



The Angel of Patience Gabriel is like a tall mountain that can casually flick a demigod's spell with 
ease. He would even take damage just to have the spell be bounced back by his shields. Once the 
attack or spell was blocked, the Angel of Humility Mikhail would counterattack immediately which 
left demigods to dodge.

The attack power of the Angel of Humility Mikhail was on another level as he could easily kill a 
demigod in under five attacks. He was the epitome of perfection in the perspective of the Goddess 
of Light Luminaria. He was the best attacker, defender, and even spell caster in all of the angels as 
he occupied their highest seat called Seraphim.

The Angel of Humility Mikhail did not even care about any damage done to him as he had the 
backup of the best healer. The Angel of Kindness Raphael would basically heal 30% of the missing 
health of his comrades with just a simple wave of holy light. He might not be able to attack or deal 
damage but his heals might even be able to bring the dead back to life.

The Angel of Patience Gabriel and the Angel of Humility Mikhail did not even care if they get hit 
anymore as long as the Angel of Kindness Raphael is alive. Some demigods tried to assassinate the 
Angel of Kindness Raphael, but they were the ones that were slaughtered in the most gruesome 
way. As if the two angels were giving a warning to all their attackers that the Angel of Kindness 
Raphael is not to be targeted.

To make matters worse for the current allied army, even the Luxera could be healed by the Angel of 
Kindness Raphael. Compared to the other two neo angels, the Luxera would recover 50% of their 
health immediately after two minutes of taking damage. A powerful healing wave would be released 
by the Angel of Kindness Raphael every two minutes which healed their allies in the entire area.

The most annoying being in the battlefield right now would be the Angel of Kindness Raphael but 
he is too heavily protected to be killed. Also, he has the power level of a greater god which meant 
that ordinary assassination would basically be impossible. In the end, Adrian had to squeeze his 
brain to make a plan that would ensure their survival and victory.

"I guess the only option would be hit and run." Adrian muttered as his guild members all look to 
him with anticipation of their battle plan.
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