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Chapter 1361 Taking Advantage of One’s Seniority

“I’m giving you advice out of kindness. You guys are good. Why don’t you appreciate 
it?” The bodyguard was also speechless. “Your son is a prodigal and wants to spend 
100,000 yuan on a gift. What does it have to do with our wife? Our Madam had 
already rejected it from the very first time. Your son still doesn’t know what’s good 
for him and still insists on giving it away. Who can you blame? You can only blame 
yourself for not being able to control your son.”

“How can you youngsters talk to your elders like that? You have no manners at all!” 
Father Lin was so angry that his face turned red. “As expected of someone who was 
trained by Jiang Yu. She’s just like her. She has no manners at all.”

“Hey, what are you talking about?” The bodyguard rolled up his sleeves. “Don’t think 
that just because you’re old, we won’t dare to make a move. Let me tell you, if you 
provoke us, I don’t care who you are. I’ll still attack you! Elder? I don’t care if you’re 
an elder or a junior. If you make me angry, your ending will be very miserable!”

“Are you threatening me?” Papa Lin’s eyes lit up. He immediately lay on the ground 
and shouted, “Aiya! There’s no justice! There’s no law! I’m so old, but I’m actually 
being threatened by a group of young people!”
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At this moment, Lin Tao felt that his father was a disgrace. “Dad! Stop fooling around 
and get up quickly! Although this place was rather remote, it was not completely 
empty. If others see you like this, what will they say about our Lin Group?”

“I don’t care what they say. I only have one goal today, and that is to return the 
money.” Father Lin was really throwing away his pride. “If Jiang Yu doesn’t pay me 
back, I will never leave.”

“Dad, don’t embarrass yourself here!” Lin Tao was also a person who cared about his 
face. He could not be as shameless as Father Lin. “Just treat this money as a loan from 
you. I’ll return it to you! Can you stop embarrassing yourself here?”



“Brat, you think you can pay me back?” Papa Lin snorted coldly. “You don’t have a 
proper job and can’t earn a single cent. I’m the one who gave you the money you’re 
spending now. You’re telling me you want to pay back the money now? Or a hundred 
thousand yuan? Even if you sell all the valuable things on you, you won’t be able to 
sell them for 100,000 yuan!”

The father and son were still quarreling here, but Mo Long had already returned from 
Chi Rui’s place.

He walked to the entrance of the villa and saw the scene in front of him.

“Who are you?” Mo Long frowned. He had some impression of Lin Tao, but not 
much.

“And who are you?” Papa Lin raised his head and glanced at Mo Long. “You’re not 
here to look for that rich young lady and give her a gift, are you? Then I advise you to 
leave quickly. She won’t accept your gift at all.”

Mo Long was baffled. “What rich young lady? What gift?”

The bodyguard quickly explained what had just happened. “President, Madam asked 
us to chase these two out. We can’t let them in.”

“Then do as Madam says. What are you waiting for?” Mo Long frowned. “The 
troublemakers are already lying down at the door. Why are you guys still standing 
here?”

“Yes, CEO.”

Mo Long turned around and was about to enter the house when Papa Lin quickly 
grabbed the corner of his pants and shouted, “Don’t go! You’re that CEO? Your 
fiancée owes us 100,000 yuan. Why don’t you pay it off for her? You’re already the 
CEO. This money is just a small amount to you, right?”



Mo Long looked at Papa Lin as if he was looking at trash. “Your son has been 
harassing my fiancée time and time again. I haven’t even taken my anger out on you 
because of this, but you’re taking advantage of me. My fiancée didn’t accept the gift 
your son bought, but you want my fiancée to return the money to you?”

“Am I wrong?” Father Lin said shamelessly, “Did my son spend money on her? Then 
what’s wrong with me asking her to return the money? Your bodyguards even said that 
they would use violence to resolve this matter. I want to see what kind of violence 
they want to use!”

“Do you think you can do whatever you want just because you’re old?” Mo Long 
looked at Father Lin coldly. “It’s not a good thing to take advantage of your seniority. 
Since you’re getting old, I advise you to go back and recuperate. This matter will end 
here. If you continue to pester me, I will get my men to use violent means to resolve 
this matter.”

“It’s not that we don’t like each other. The way we talk is exactly the same.” Papa Lin 
smiled.

Chapter 1362 Exposed

“Don’t talk nonsense here.” The bodyguard quickly stopped him. “If you really make 
our CEO angry, you’ll end up very miserable. I’m not joking.”

“I want to see how miserable my end will be!” Papa Lin got up. “Either you give me a 
quick death here today, or just you wait. I’m going to expose you to the media!”

“As you wish.” After Mo Long said this, he turned around and returned to the house.

“Did you hear that? Our CEO said it’s up to you.” The bodyguard said, “Hurry up and 
leave this place. Do you really want to be beaten up?”
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“Good, good, good!” Papa Lin was so angry that he blurted out three ” okay ” words. 
“You asked for it. If the media really exposed it, don’t cry and beg me!”



With that, Papa Lin left with Lin Tao.

No one took these words to heart. Even Lin Tao thought that Father Lin was just 
saying it out of anger to save face.

Unexpectedly, the next afternoon, the media came to visit.

The group of reporters carried their cameras and squeezed at the entrance of the villa. 
They wanted to go in and interview Jiang Yu no matter what.

When the bodyguards saw this, they were a little stunned.

“Oh my god, that old man really exposed this matter to the media ”

“Quick, quick, quick. You guys hold on. I’ll go in now and tell Madam about this.”

Jiang Yu had originally planned to go to the weapons research and development base 
to take a look, but she did not go because she was feeling a little unwell.

Feng Ran had always been taking care of Teng Yi, so the person who took care of 
Jiang Yu was Mei Shuang, who had always been very free.

“Madam, Madam, there are many reporters outside. They want to interview you!” The 
bodyguard who entered panicked. “And from the looks of it, it seems like there are 
more reporters who haven’t arrived yet. What should I do, Madam? The CEO isn’t 
here either.”

“Why are there so many reporters?” Mei Shuang was shocked. “Mr. Mo Long and 
Sister Jiang Yu have been keeping a low profile here. Why are there so many reporters 
interviewing them all of a sudden?”

Jiang Yu’s eyes darkened and she instantly understood what was going on.

It must be the old man from yesterday.



The bodyguard was clumsy and could not explain for a long time.

“It’s okay. I’ll settle this matter.” When Jiang Yu stepped out of the door, she saw the 
reporters crowded at the door.

As soon as they saw someone walk out of the house, they quickly turned on their 
cameras and took pictures crazily. “Miss Jiang Yu! Are you Miss Jiang Yu? The CEO 
of the Lin Group said that you owe his son 100,000 yuan. Is that true?”

” He also said that you’re unwilling to pay your debts. Is that true? ”

“And he also revealed your identity, saying that you’re the heiress of the Kang family 
in the capital! Since that’s the case, why did you not pay your debt? A mere 100,000 
yuan should be a drop in the ocean for someone of your status!”

“Miss Jiang Yu, please give us an explanation!”

The complicated sounds mixed together and filled Jiang Yu’s eardrums.

She took a few deep breaths and walked to the door. She tried her best to force a 
smile. “What questions do you all want to ask? One at a time. I’ll answer all of you.”

The reporters lined up and began to ask questions one by one.

“I heard that you’re the heiress of the Kang family in capital, Jiang Yu. Is it true?”

“Yes, that’s right.” Jiang Yu nodded.

“I heard from the CEO of the Lin Group that you owe his son 100,000 yuan. Is that 
true?”

Jiang Yu frowned. “This is purely a rumor. I don’t owe him any money at all. It was 
his son who insisted on spending 100,000 yuan to buy me a gift, but I didn’t accept 
it.”



“But he insisted that you owe him 100,000 yuan. Your explanation for this is that his 
son bought you a gift, but you didn’t accept it?”

Jiang Yu already knew that Father Lin would publicize this matter.

So she said, “Yes. Actually, his son gave me two gifts, but I rejected them both. The 
first time I rejected him, I told him that I have a fiancé and would not accept gifts 
from other men. I originally thought that he wouldn’t come again. I didn’t expect that 
he would actually buy something even more expensive and ask me to accept it.”

The reporters looked at each other and did not ask any more questions.

Papa Lin had been hiding behind the reporters and watching all of this happen smugly. 
But now that the reporters were silent, he panicked.

“Say something! Ask questions! Don’t be like a mute!” Papa Lin shouted, “As the 
heiress of the Kang family in the capital, isn’t it shocking news that she doesn’t pay 
back her debts?”

Chapter 1363 Throw Out

The reporters still did not speak.

“Are you reporters even useful?” Papa Lin was angry. “Shouldn’t you be like a hungry 
tiger pouncing on its prey for such a big matter?”

“What’s the big deal?” A reporter asked. “According to what Miss Jiang Yu said, it 
was clearly your son who forced her! You’re taking advantage of your seniority to 
force Miss Jiang Yu to pay back the money! How shameless!”

“You’re slandering me!” Papa Lin was so angry that he retorted to the reporters, 
“She’s clearly the one who owes me money. Don’t be deceived by her!”

!!



“You’re clearly lying!” The bodyguard shouted, “Your son bought a gift and forcefully 
gave it to my wife. If my wife doesn’t want it, you can say that she owes your family 
money! You even called the reporters over because of this. Aren’t you embarrassed?”

At this point, the other reporters already knew the ins and outs of the matter. Things 
weren’t like what the CEO of the Lin Group had said at all.

They had been deceived.

“I thought this was some shocking news. I didn’t expect it to be this.” Some reporters 
were already planning to go back. “I’m going to blacklist the Lin Group in the future. 
No matter what they say, I won’t believe them anymore.”

“That’s right! It’s such a small matter, and you still lied to us and said it was some big 
news! You caused us to mobilize so many people, but in the end, this is the truth!”

“It seems that the Lin Group’s credibility is not very good. I won’t trust them 
anymore.”

The reporters left one after another, leaving Papa Lin alone.

Lin Tao felt a little embarrassed and didn’t come along.

“Mr. Lin, the reporters you found have already left. When are you leaving?” Jiang Yu 
looked at him with a smile. “How does it feel to tell tales?”

“Stop talking nonsense. It’s precisely because these reporters know your true identity 
and don’t dare to offend you that they pushed the blame to me!” Papa Lin roared like a 
madman. “If you weren’t the heiress of the Kang family in capital, would those 
reporters speak up for me? Just because you have a noble status, you can do whatever 
you want, right?”

“Your imagination is quite rich.” Jiang Yi smiled. “Can’t it be that the reporters realize 
that this matter is not my fault but yours? You’re twisting right and wrong, confusing 
black and white. Do you want everyone to stand on the same line as you?”



“You’re talking nonsense. What did I do wrong?” Papa Lin roared, “You owe me 
money and you don’t want to pay it back. Is that reasonable? If you didn’t owe me 
money, would I have called the reporters? If you had obediently returned the money, 
this wouldn’t have happened today.”

“I said I won’t pay you back. No matter how many reporters you find, I won’t pay you 
back.” Jiang Yu sneered. “If you have the ability, keep looking. Let’s see if I’ll pay 
you back.”

“Good, good!” Papa Lin was so angry that he repeated the word ” okay ” a few times. 
“This is your own request. You’re the one who told me to continue looking for 
reporters! If I find a reporter, don’t cry and beg me!”

“You said the same thing yesterday” The bodyguard mercilessly tried to sabotage her. 
“The reporters did come today, but they didn’t seem to ask any questions and left 
again. If that’s the case, then it’s better if the reporter doesn’t come.”

“You guys are really like birds of a feather.” Papa Lin was so angry that his face 
turned red, and the muscles on his face began to tremble. “Master has no manners, and 
neither do you bodyguards!”

Jiang Yu looked at him coldly and said to the bodyguard beside her, “Get rid of him. If 
he doesn’t want to leave, then use force to throw him out of here.”

After saying that, Jiang Yu returned to her room.

The bodyguards rubbed their fists and were eager to try. They all wanted to throw this 
unreasonable old man out of here.

“How dare you! I’m an old man!” Papa Lin shouted in horror, “If you dare to lay a 
hand on me, you have to pay for my medical expenses! You guys should be mentally 
prepared. If my body is injured, the medical fees will not be cheap!”

“You still have the cheek to ask for medical fees?” The bodyguard smiled coldly. ” 
Either you behave now and leave on your own, or we’ll send you away. If you want us 



to send you away, you have to be mentally prepared. I’m afraid you’ll lose an arm or a 
leg.”

They were smiling, but the expressions on their faces were terrifying. This made Papa 
Lin shiver uncontrollably.

“I’m warning you, don’t touch me!” Papa Lin retreated as he spoke. “If you dare to 
touch me, you’re all done for!”

Chapter 1364 Business

The bodyguards wouldn’t listen to Papa Lin. They lifted him up and threw him into a 
pile of grass far away.

“You guys are really uncultured! I’m an old man, and I’m already old. If anything 
happens to me, you won’t be able to pay for my medical expenses even if you lose 
everything!”

However, no one paid any attention to him. Papa Lin felt a little awkward, so he stood 
up, patted the dust off his body, and left.

Just wait and see. He had plenty of time and means. He wanted to see who was better 
between him and Jiang Yu.

After Papa Lin left, he did not appear in front of the villa for a few days. This made 
the bodyguards at the door a little unused.

“If this old man doesn’t come, I feel that our usual days are lacking in fun.”

“You’re looking for trouble. What’s so good about that old man? The moment he 
came here, he started making trouble. I can’t wait for him to never come again.”

“If you really want that old man to come over, you might as well go and find him 
yourself.”



“No, I’m not retarded.”

The bodyguards at the door were laughing and laughing. From afar, they saw Mo 
Long walking over.

Mo Long walked past them and entered the villa.

He was holding a red invitation card in his hand. He handed it to Jiang Yu and said, “I 
need you to attend the cocktail party tomorrow night.”

Jiang Yu opened the invitation and looked at it carefully. She realized that it was a 
cocktail party organized by Chi Rui.

“Hasn’t the Chi family disappeared without a trace? Why do you suddenly want to 
hold a cocktail party with such great fanfare?” Jiang Yu was puzzled.

In the upper class, all the big families liked to hold some cocktail parties. It was 
common for people like them to attend a cocktail party. However, the Chi family had 
always disappeared without a trace. For them to suddenly hold a banquet with such 
great fanfare and such an abnormal action, there must be some ulterior motive.

“I’m afraid he wants to use my identity to be active in front of the public.” Mo Long 
said, “After all, in most people’s hearts, they might not remember the Chi Family, but 
they will always know about the Mo Family.”

“The Chi family is very good at using their power.” Jiang Yu couldn’t help but laugh.

Chi Rui had even specially sent over a gown. It was said that his wife had personally 
chosen it. The gown was very beautiful and suited Jiang Yu’s temperament very well. 
She could perfectly outline her figure when she wore it.

“Chi Rui’s wife has good taste.” Jiang Yu wore the gown and admired herself in front 
of the mirror. “If she knew that her husband had done those things behind her back, I 
wonder how sad she would be.”



“Their daughter is also very cute, very innocent, and ignorant of the world.” Mo Long 
sighed. “If Chi Rui didn’t insist on his own way, if he was willing to pull back from 
the brink of death and turn back in time, their family would definitely be happier than 
they are now.”

The next night, the cocktail party was held as scheduled.

There were a lot of people at the banquet this time. From afar, it was as crowded as a 
city. Jiang Yu held onto Mo Long’s arm and weaved through the crowd.

Actually, the reason why there were so many people at the party this time was because 
Chi Rui had written Mo Long’s name on the invitation. Most of the people had come 
to attend this cocktail party in order to meet Mo Long.

Moreover, Chi Rui seemed to attach great importance to this banquet and even invited 
reporters from all over the world. Whether it was from Qingcheng or Hucheng, as 
long as it was a famous media outlet from various places, they basically all appeared 
at this cocktail party.

Jiang Yu saw an old acquaintance among the reporters-Ji Tang.

Ji Tang also saw Jiang Yu because she was dressed too dazzlingly. As far as the eye 
could see, it was like the brightest star in the crowd.

“Jiang Yu! I didn’t expect you to be here!” Ji Tang walked over and greeted him with a 
smile. “Initially, I only saw Mo Long’s name on the invitation card. I thought that you 
wouldn’t come along. I didn’t expect you to come along as well.”

“What a coincidence!” Jiang Yu smiled. “Actually, Mr. Chi Rui’s wife personally 
chose this gown for me.”

“Really? Then his wife really has good taste. This gown really suits your 
temperament.” Ji Tang praised sincerely. “This gown not only brings out your 
temperament very well, but it also perfectly outlines the curves of your figure.”

“Thank you for the compliment. Actually, the professional outfit you’re wearing is not 
bad either.” Jiang Yu said with a smile.



“Actually, most reporters wear this. I’m not any different.” Ji Tang smiled.

Chapter 1365 Meeting Chu Jie Again

Jiang Yu and Ji Tang chatted for a while more before they saw Chu Jie pushing Old 
Master Chu’s wheelchair over.

Coincidentally, Ji Tang had other things to do. She said to Jiang Yu, “I still have 
something to do. I won’t talk to you for now.”

“Alright, go ahead.” Jiang Yu nodded with a smile.

In fact, Chu Jie had already seen the dazzling Jiang Yu the moment she entered. After 
all, the gown she was wearing was the most beautiful one in the entire banquet. It was 
difficult not to notice her.
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Chu Jie stood in place and waited for a long time, but Jiang Yu and Mo Long did not 
take the initiative to greet them. This made her a little anxious.

Therefore, she stood there for a while before taking the initiative to go over.

“Long time no see.” Chu Jie walked over and smiled as if nothing had happened. “I 
saw Jiang Yu dressed so beautifully the moment I came in. Even if this is a cocktail 
party organized by the upper class, there’s no need to dress so formally, right? Those 
who don’t know better might think that Jiang Yu is a peacock. Is she here to seek a 
mate by dressing up like this?”

“The gown I’m wearing was personally chosen by the wife of the host of this 
banquet.” Jiang Yu narrowed her eyes and looked at Chu Jie. “What do you mean by 
saying this? Do you think you are mocking me? In fact, you were mocking the host’s 
wife.”



“You!” Chu Jie was speechless.

Jiang Yu looked at her and could not help but sneer. “Think before you speak. There 
are some things you can say and some things you can’t. Your gown is not very good. I 
wonder who chose it for you. Your taste is really bad.”

After saying that, Jiang Yu left.

Chu Jie stomped her feet in anger. She looked down at her gown and did not think that 
it was ugly.

She had searched through the wardrobe for a long time before she found this gown. It 
was the most popular style last year. Even now, it could beat many popular models.

In the end, Jiang Yu’s evaluation of this was-ugly?

This made Chu Jie angry.

Like a thief, she secretly followed behind Jiang Yu and Mo Long, wanting to see what 
they would do next.

Mo Long brought Jiang Yu to meet Chi Rui and his wife. He introduced them to each 
other. “This is my fiancée, Jiang Yu.”

Chi Rui looked Jiang Yu up and down and smiled like an old father. “Not bad, not bad. 
The little girl is beautiful and elegant. She suits you very well.”

“Mr. Chi, you flatter me. Mrs. Chi is also very elegant and is very compatible with 
you.” Jiang Yu said.

“Not only does the little girl have a good temperament, but she also has a sweet mouth 
and knows how to talk!” Chi Rui laughed out loud. He was very satisfied with the 
fiancée that Mo Long had found.



Chi Rui’s wife took Jiang Yu’s hand and looked at her carefully. She couldn’t help but 
exclaim, “This is a beautiful person. Mo Long, it’s your blessing to have such a 
beautiful girl as your wife.”

“Yes.” Mo Long accepted the praise sincerely. “Indeed, it’s my honor to have Yu’er as 
my wife.”

The four of them smiled happily. Such a bright smile was exceptionally eye-catching 
in Chu Jie’s eyes.

She gritted her teeth and clenched her fists so hard that her nails dug into her flesh. 
Chu Jie didn’t feel any pain.

Although Chu Jie knew that the couple in front of her had nothing to do with Jiang Yu 
and Mo Long, she still felt that the scene in front of her was very similar. Mo Long’s 
parents were carefully sizing up their daughter-in-law and were very satisfied with 
her.

Damn it, that seat should have been mine! Why should Jiang Yu take it for nothing?

The more Chu Jie thought about it, the angrier she became. She decided to stay out of 
sight and turn around to leave.

However, just as she turned around, she bumped into someone. Chu Jie rubbed her 
head and shouted angrily, “Don’t you have eyes when you walk? Can’t you see that 
there’s another person here?”

“.. Chu Jie?” The person in front of him shouted the name hesitantly.

The voice sounded very familiar. Chu Jie looked up in confusion and saw Lin Tao’s 
familiar face.

“How unlucky. How could I meet you here?” Chu Jie frowned. “Why are you here? 
This is a cocktail party that only prestigious families can attend. Your Lin Group can 
only be considered a small middle-to-upper-class group. How are you qualified to 
attend such a cocktail party?”



“What do you mean? Is the Chu family the only one allowed to attend this banquet?”

Chapter 1366 Taking Pictures

“At least our Chu family is a prestigious family. What is your Lin Group?” Chu Jie 
looked at Lin Tao with disdain. “I heard that you spent 100,000 yuan on a gift for 
Jiang Yu a few days ago, but she didn’t accept it. After your father found out about 
this, he went to Jiang Yu’s rented villa and caused a scene, didn’t he?”

“How, how did you know?” As soon as this matter was mentioned, Lin Tao felt his 
face burn. It was very embarrassing.

“Your father even specially hired reporters for this kind of thing. If you’re asking me 
how I know, you might as well ask. Who doesn’t know about this now?” Chu Jie 
laughed. “To be honest, I feel embarrassed to meet you here and talk to you. In the 
future, when you go out, don’t ever say that you know me. I can’t afford to lose face.”

“It’s all because of you. You told me to give Jiang Yu a gift!” Lin Tao was angry. “In 
the end, after I was rejected the first time, you told me that the gift I bought wasn’t 
expensive enough. Then I’ll spend 100,000 yuan to buy her a gift. Isn’t that 
expensive? But she’s still unwilling to accept it!”

“Lin Tao, do you even have a brain?” Chu Jie felt even more embarrassed now. “Jiang 
Yu is the heiress of the Kang family in Shangjing. It’s just a hundred thousand yuan, 
but in her eyes, it’s like it was bought for a hundred yuan. Do you think that spending 
100,000 yuan on something is expensive enough? Let me tell you, in her eyes, those 
things of yours are worthless!”

“But my credit card only has a limit of 100,000 yuan per month.” Lin Tao’s expression 
became more and more difficult. “The gifts I bought this time have already used up 
my quota for next month. And this gift can’t be returned. I don’t have any money to 
spend next month.”

“Lin Tao, why are you so poor?” Chu Jie took a few steps away from Lin Tao in 
disgust. “You’re full of poverty. You’d better stay away from me. If you get close to 
me, be careful not to get that poverty on me.”



“What right do you have to look down on me? Is your Chu family any better than the 
Mo family?” Lin Tao was exasperated, but Chu Jie was a woman. No matter how 
angry he was, he couldn’t hit a woman.

“You still dare to compare our Chu family with the Mo family?” Chu Jie smiled. “It’s 
normal that the Chu family can’t compare to the Mo family. Anyway, I’m going to 
marry Mr. Mo Long in the future, not him. But you’re different. It’s a fact that the Lin 
Group can’t compare to the Kang family. Do you want to be the Kang family’s son-in-
law in the future?

Then wouldn’t you have no say in House Kang? Lin Tao, oh Lin Tao, it’s really 
embarrassing for a man to end up like you.”

Her words were merciless and did not give Lin Tao any face at all.

“I advise you not to make me angry. If you do, I’ll go find Mo Long immediately and 
tell him that everything was part of your plan.” Lin Tao threatened.

“Don’t be angry. Aren’t I just telling the truth?” Chu Jie was worried that Lin Tao 
would really do that, so she quickly changed her tone. “If it really doesn’t work, I 
have one last solution. This method is a little risky, but once it succeeds, you won’t 
have to worry about anything in the future.”

“What is it?” No matter how many times Chu Jie lied to him, Lin Tao would still 
choose to believe her. He was just like a brainless young master.

“There are so many reporters at the scene, and every reporter has a camera in their 
hands. The media like them just like to dig up big news.” Chu Jie said, “If you pull 
Jiang Yu to the side, talk to her for a while, and then do some intimate actions with 
her. I’ll find a reporter and get him to take a photo of all of you. Then, you’ll come 
forward and explain. Wouldn’t this matter be solved naturally?”

“But…” Lin Tao was a little hesitant. “But this isn’t true at all. It’s a rumor.”

“I said you’re a fool, but you’re really a fool. Can’t you be more flexible?” Chu Jie 
was disappointed. “Will you say that this is fake if you explain yourself? Why don’t 
you explain and say that this matter is true? Even if Jiang Yu stood up and explained 



that this matter was fake, who do you think everyone would believe? Everyone will 
definitely believe you and will think that Jiang Yu’s explanation is just a cover up.”

“If I say that this matter is true, what about Mo Long?” Lin Tao had another worry.

“Mr. Mo Long’s side is not under your control. I naturally have a way.” Chu Jie said, 
“How is it? Think about it. This is a win-win situation.”

Chapter 1367 Execution Plan

Lin Tao thought about it and finally agreed to this condition. “Alright, I promise you. 
But this is the last time I’ll believe you. If this plan fails, then no matter what method 
you give me in the future, I won’t believe you anymore.”

“Alright, but I guarantee that although this method is a little risky, the success rate is 
very high.” Chu Jie vowed, “Alright, just go ahead. Leave the matter of finding the 
reporters to me.”

Lin Tao obediently went to look for Jiang Yu.

Actually, the person Jiang Yu did not want to see the most was him. However, she was 
too embarrassed to reject him in public. She could only ask gently, “Mr. Lin Tao, why 
are you looking for me?”

!!

Lin Tao looked at Mo Long with trepidation. Then, he whispered to Jiang Yu, “Miss 
Jiang Yu, I have something to tell you. Please come with me. I only want to tell you 
about this. Please come alone and don’t bring anyone else.”

Jiang Yu hesitated for a moment before she finally agreed and followed Lin Tao to the 
flower bed.

“Mr. Lin Tao, if you have anything to say, just say it.” Jiang Yu said, “You brought me 
here alone. I’m sure you’ll feel a little embarrassed about this, right?”



“It’s indeed a little embarrassing.” Lin Tao cowered. “Actually, it’s about the gift I 
bought for you. I thought about it for a long time and felt that I was wrong, so I 
wanted to apologize to you. In addition to what my father did before, I feel even more 
embarrassed. That’s why I brought you here alone to apologize to you.”

“It’s okay. This matter is already in the past. I’m not angry.” Jiang Yu smiled. “Since 
you’ve already apologized to me, it means that you’ve realized your mistake. There’s 
no need for me to be angry.”

“Really? Are you really willing to forgive me?” Lin Tao reached out excitedly and 
grabbed Jiang Yu’s hand. “Miss Jiang Yu, it’s great that you’re willing to forgive me!”

Jiang Yu retracted her hand without a trace and said with a smile, “Alright, let’s not 
talk about this anymore. I have already forgiven you.”

“Thank you! Thank you, Miss Jiang Yu!”

Jiang Yu just smiled and did not say anything else. She turned around and left.

Not long after she left, Chu Jie came over with a woman.

“Who is this woman?” Lin Tao asked.

Chu Jie explained, “This is the reporter that I found for you. She has already recorded 
all the intimate actions between the two of you since you brought Jiang Yu here.”

“Aren’t we going too far by doing this?” Now that things had come to this, Lin Tao 
suddenly wanted to back out. “If they find out that we’re framing them, won’t we end 
up miserable?”

“Lin Tao, don’t make me call you a useless piece of trash at a time like this!” Chu Jie 
glared at him. “Besides, how is this considered framing? We didn’t say that they did 
anything bad, and we didn’t ruin their reputation. How is this framing?”



“I’m still a little scared.” Lin Tao mumbled.

“I said you’re trash, but you’re really trash.” Chu Jie was so angry that she simply 
ignored him. Instead, she said to the woman, “You took all the photos just now, 
right?”

The woman flipped through the photos in her camera. As she looked at them, she said, 
“I took all of them. I didn’t miss a single one. I should be thanking you. If you hadn’t 
come looking for me, I wouldn’t have been able to take such a beautiful photo.”

“Don’t stand on ceremony with me. I was just looking for her casually. Who knew that 
you would volunteer and even say that you were friends with Jiang Yu?” Chu Jie 
smiled. “But I’m still quite curious. Since you and Jiang Yu are friends, why did you 
take such a photo?”

“What kind of friends are we?” The woman sneered. “She has become a phoenix, but 
what about me? I was still struggling in the mud, unable to see the day of my rise. 
Why should I suffer? Why is Jiang Yu so lucky?”

The more the woman spoke, the more ruthless her expression became. Even Chu Jie 
couldn’t help but shiver when she saw her ruthless look.

“Women are so scary.” Lin Tao couldn’t help but say, “If he’s really ruthless, he won’t 
even let go of his own friends.”

“Don’t confuse me with Jiang Yu. She’s not my friend. She’s not worthy at all!” The 
woman roared, “One day, I, Ji Tang, will snatch everything that belongs to Jiang Yu! 
Whether it’s her identity or her life, it will all be mine!”

Chapter 1368 Exposed On Media

The expression on Ji Tang’s face was extremely terrifying. Those who did not know 
better would think that Jiang Yu owed her a huge sum of money and did not return it.

Chu Jie didn’t expect to find such a terrifying woman. Even someone as ruthless as 
her and as much as she hated Jiang Yu, the expression on her face would not be so 
terrifying.



Ji Tang knew that she had lost her composure. After adjusting her emotions, she 
smiled in embarrassment. “I’m sorry. Did I scare you just now?”

Chu Jie swallowed her saliva and said, “It’s okay. As long as you hate Jiang Yu too, 
we’re friends.”

“However, I see that the gentleman beside you doesn’t seem to hate Jiang Yu.” Ji Tang 
smiled and said.

Chu Bai glanced at Lin Tao and said to Ji Tang, “Don’t worry about him. His thoughts 
are not important. All you need to do is publish the photos you just took and add some 
embellishment to the content. I guarantee that Jiang Yu’s reputation will plummet and 
your newspaper company will earn a lot of money from this.”

“Okay, Miss Chu. We are now allies on the same front. I believe what you said.” Ji 
Tang said, “I also believe that you won’t harm me.”

“Of course, why would I harm my friend?” Chu Jie smiled sinisterly and slyly. 
“Alright, go and do your own thing. Don’t let Jiang Yu find out about it.”

“Got it.” After Ji Tang tidied up the things in her camera, she left.

After Ji Tang left, Lin Tao said to Chu Jie, “Where did you find these people? Just 
look at the expression on her face when she spoke just now. She felt like she wanted to 
kill Jiang Yu! You have to be careful. Don’t kill anyone in the end!”

“So what if someone dies? I didn’t kill them.” Chu Jie said indifferently, “The person 
who will bear the responsibility will be Ji Tang, not me. Even if she wants to push the 
blame to me in the end, she doesn’t have any evidence. Then what am I afraid of?

What’s there to be afraid of?”

Lin Tao was still worried, but Chu Jie was getting impatient.



“Lin Tao, I advise you not to hesitate here like a good-for-nothing!” Chu Jie glared at 
Lin Tao. “Things have already come to this point. Are you going to back out now? To 
think that I’ve come up with a plan for your matter, and you’re not even willing to say 
thank you! I’m not afraid at all, but you’re acting like a coward and starting to 
cower!”

“I didn’t…”

“Shut up if you don’t! I don’t want to hear you speak now!” Chu Jie walked to another 
part of the venue in her high heels.

Lin Tao was left alone in the same spot, not knowing where to go.

Soon, they reached the middle of the banquet. Chi Rui led Mo Long and Jiang Yu to 
stand in the center and introduced them to everyone present.

Chi Rui’s purpose for holding this cocktail party was to introduce himself to the 
public using Mo Long’s identity. The people who came to attend the banquet also 
wanted to see Mo Long’s face.

After the cocktail party ended, Mo Long and Jiang Yu did not leave immediately. 
Instead, they stayed at the Chi residence for dinner at Chi Rui’s request.

Perhaps because Chi Rui’s wife was present, he did not talk about anything related to 
the black market today. He only talked about his family’s daily life like an ordinary 
person and also talked about Mo Long and Jiang Yu’s marriage.

After dinner, Mo Long and Jiang Yu returned to their rented villa.

Initially, she thought that nothing would happen tonight, but she did not expect to 
receive a call from Sister Xia the next morning.

“Jiang Yu, where did you go yesterday?” Sister Xia sounded very anxious. “How did 
someone take a photo?”



Jiang Yu was still unaware of the rumors on the Internet, so she answered Sister Xia’s 
question truthfully. “Mo Long and I were invited to a cocktail party yesterday. What’s 
wrong? Did something happen?”

“You’re still asking me? Have you not been online recently? Don’t you know what the 
rumors on the Internet are?” Sister Xia said, “The media has already exposed it now. 
They’re saying that you’re having an affair with another man behind Mo Long’s back! 
”

“Huh?” Jiang Yu was also stunned.

“Although only one media outlet has exposed it, other media outlets will soon follow 
suit.” Sister Xia said, “More and more people will find out about this. We can’t rush to 
explain it now because no one knows who the man in the photo is.”

Chapter 1369 Explain

Sister Xia sounded very anxious, so Jiang Yu quickly went online to look at the photos 
exposed by the media. However, after looking at the photo, Jiang Yu could not help 
but be stunned. “Isn’t this person Lin Tao?”

“Do you know this man in the photo?” Sister Xia was puzzled.

Jiang Yu explained to Sister Xia, “Of course I know him. A few days ago, he bought 
me a gift, but I didn’t accept it. His father even got the media to make a scene in front 
of the villa I rented. However, in the end, the situation was left unsettled. When I 
attended the cocktail party yesterday, he also came. He even specially called me to an 
empty corner just to apologize to me.”

“Is it really as simple as an apology?” Sister Xia was a little suspicious. “If it’s really 
an apology, he’ll come forward to explain this matter, right?”

“If he doesn’t want to cause unnecessary misunderstandings, he will explain himself.” 
Jiang Yu said, “Unless he wants to make the media’s public opinion more and more 
prominent and also wants to spread rumors about us. However, even if he wanted to 
do so, he did not have the chance. Yesterday, when he apologized to me, I used the 
recording function of my phone to record everything he said when he wasn’t paying 
attention. When the time comes to explain, just play this recording.”



“I didn’t expect you to have a backup plan.” Sister Xia couldn’t help but laugh. 
“Alright then, we just need to wait for the media to expose the identity of the man in 
the photo. As soon as his identity is exposed, we will immediately release this 
recording.”

“After all, you can’t have the heart to harm others, but you can’t be without the heart 
to guard against others.” Jiang Yu smiled. However, after laughing, Jiang Yu suddenly 
thought of a question. “Sister Xia, this cocktail party is held in Qingcheng. You’re far 
away in Shanghai. How did you know about this?”

Even if the media really exposed this news, it should be the first news to spread in 
Qingcheng, not in Shanghai.

.. Could it be that the reporter who secretly took those photos was from the media in 
Shanghai? After all, the reporters who came yesterday came from all over the city.

As expected, Sister Xia said, “This news was first exposed by a media company called 
‘Green Bird’ in Shanghai. And for the time being, they were the only ones who had 
exposed this news. The other media outlets did not make any moves. However, this is 
only temporary. Other media outlets will soon expose this news.”

“Green bird…” Jiang Yu repeated the name over and over again. “Sister Xia, please 
help me find out which reporters came to Qingcheng yesterday regarding the media 
company, Green Bird.”

“Alright.”

Sister Xia went to investigate and quickly handed the results to Jiang Yu.

There were two names on the list. One was Ji Tang, and the other was Zhao Ting.

Now that both of them were suspicious, it was difficult for Jiang Yu to say who the 
person who took the photo was.



“I have some impression of this Ji Tang.” Sister Xia looked at the two people on the 
list and recalled carefully. “Isn’t she the reporter from the talent show? I remember 
that she grew up in an orphanage with you. You even helped her. She wouldn’t do 
such a thing, right?”

Jiang Yu was silent. She could not guarantee that Ji Tang was not the one who did this.

“I will slowly investigate this matter. Sister Xia, don’t worry.” Jiang Yu said, “The 
most important thing now is to explain the matter that was exposed by the media. If 
Lin Tao knew his place, he would have come forward and explained that this was a 
misunderstanding.”

Lin Tao was indeed self-aware. He had indeed stepped forward to explain, but what he 
said was, “Yes, there is no misunderstanding. Jiang Yu and I do have an extraordinary 
relationship. We’ve been hiding this relationship from Mr. Mo Long. If that reporter 
hadn’t taken a photo of it, we would probably have kept it a secret.”

After this explanation, everyone felt that Jiang Yu was two-timing. Not only did he 
feel that she wasn’t worthy of Mo Long, but he also felt that she wasn’t worthy of Lin 
Tao.

No man would like such a fickle woman.

Sister Xia was fuming with anger when she heard Lin Tao’s explanation. “What’s 
wrong with this Lin Tao? Isn’t this obvious nonsense?”

Jiang Yu did not expect Lin Tao to explain it this way.

“Jiang Yu, we have to explain ourselves. If we don’t show up soon, this matter will 
develop in an unpredictable direction.” Sister Xia was very anxious. “And this matter 
will be exposed by more and more media.”

Chapter 1370 Recording

“I know. I will resolve this matter. Sister Xia, you don’t have to worry at all.” Jiang Yu 
said, “It’s not suitable for me to hold a press conference right now. I’ll record a video 



and upload it online. I’ll also post this recording on the Internet. As long as you’re a 
reasonable person, you’ll know who’s telling the truth and who’s lying.”

“Alright, I’ll be at ease if you do it.” Sister Xia said, “And that Lin Tao. He lied. We 
must pursue this matter.”

“Alright, I know.”

Jiang Yu recorded a video and uploaded it online. She also posted the recording.

The content of the video was an explanation for the photo that the media had exposed. 
As for the recording, it was Lin Tao’s apology to Jiang Yu that day.

The originally one-sided crowd could no longer hold their ground.

There were two people involved in the photo. The man came out to explain that this 
matter was true. However, when the woman came forward to explain, she said that 
this matter was fake.

They even released a recording of it.

The public began to wonder ,”Is this recording real or fake?”

“I feel like it’s already a recording. It can’t be fake, right?”

“But how can there be such a coincidence in this world? As soon as this matter was 
exposed by the media, Jiang Yu immediately took out the recording. The more I look 
at it, the more it seems to be a temporary synthesis.”

“I also feel that this recording is fake. Tell me, who would drag someone into a corner 
just to apologize? There must be some unspeakable relationship between the two of 
them, so the two of them chose to whisper at that place.”



“I think so too. To think that I used to like Jiang Yu. I didn’t expect her to be such a 
person! Putting aside the fact that he’s two-timing, the main point is that the man in 
the photo isn’t as outstanding as Mo Long at all!”

“That’s right. Jiang Yu is a movie queen after all. How can she give up on such an 
outstanding man like Mo Long and run into the arms of an ordinary man? I really 
don’t understand. Is she experiencing the pleasure of keeping a gigolo?”

The comments about Jiang Yu on the Internet became more and more unpleasant, and 
some people suspected that the recording was synthesized. Jiang Yu did not explain 
this for the time being. On the other hand, Lin Tao could not sit still anymore and 
came forward to explain again.

“I hope that everyone will not make such malicious speculations. Although my 
relationship with Miss Jiang Yu is not glorious, we are truly in love! Could it be that 
this world really had the heart to break up a pair of people who truly loved each other? 
Miss Jiang Yu has long stopped liking Mr. Mo Long. The person she likes is me! Why 
can’t you give us your blessings?”

After explaining, he threw out a recording.

However, the content of the recording was very different from Jiang Yu’s recording.

In the recording that Lin Tao threw out, he said to Jiang Yu, “Miss Jiang Yu, when will 
you be willing to tell Mr. Mo Long about our relationship? Although I can wait for 
you forever, I can’t wait without a clue. You have to give me an exact time so that I 
know how long I can wait for you.”

“Mr. Lin Tao, don’t worry. I’ll definitely tell Mo Long about this as soon as possible. 
Don’t worry, I won’t make you wait too long.”

“That’s good. Miss Jiang Yu, as long as I can be with you in the end, I can wait no 
matter how long it takes.”

The recording stopped abruptly.

This time, the public, who could not hold their ground, once again supported Lin Tao.



“In my opinion, the recording that Lin Tao released is the real one.”

“That’s right. Moreover, once this matter was exposed, he was the first to stand up and 
explain that this matter was true.”

“Jiang Yu only came forward to explain later. Moreover, she said that this matter was 
fake and even released a recording. There’s no such thing as a coincidence in this 
world. As soon as the media exposed it, she already had a recording. No matter how 
you look at it, it looks like it was prepared in advance.”

“I think Jiang Yu is trying to cover it up. I’m afraid that she and Lin Tao are already in 
an ambiguous relationship. How disgusting. Wasn’t she cheating? Why hasn’t Mr. Mo 
Long come forward yet? Hurry up and explain yourself before breaking up with this 
Jiang Yu!”

“This is so disgusting, this adulterous couple! Jiang Yu was not worthy of Mo Long at 
all! She can only cooperate with some despicable men. Mr. Mo Long is like a flower 
on the mountain. If he continues to stay with Jiang Yu, won’t he be tainted?”
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