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Chapter 1411 Want To Take In A Son-in-Law

Hao Jing glanced at Chu Ran and suddenly felt that this young man in front of her was 
really handsome. Moreover, he was dressed rather luxuriously. She felt that he should 
be a very rich person.

So Hao Jing put on an amiable smile and said, “Aiya, you’re really good, young man. 
Who are you?”

Although Chu Ran had called Feng Zheng, he didn’t know the woman in front of him 
at all. Although Chu Ran felt uncomfortable when a stranger struck up a conversation 
with him, he still put on airs in front of Hao Jing and tried to make himself look like a 
noble young master who was very cultured.

“My name is Chu Ran. I’m a guest of the mistress of this villa,” he said.

“Oh, so you’re a guest.” The smile on Hao Jing’s face widened. She had thought that 
the young man in front of her was the male owner of this villa. It turned out that he 
was just an ordinary guest.

“Is there something you need?” Chu Ran asked.

“It’s nothing. Auntie just thought that you’re quite handsome and wanted to ask if 
you’re single.” Hao Jing smiled like an old fox.

No matter how stupid Chu Ran was, she could tell what Hao Jing’s motive was.

“This is a personal question,” he said. “I don’t know you well, so I’m not obligated to 
answer you.”

This answer made Hao Jing feel a little awkward, but Chu Ran’s manner of speaking 
and his attire left a good impression on her.



This Chu Ran was obviously a rich kid. If she could be with Feng Ran, who knew 
how much betrothal gifts she would receive!

Anyway, Feng Ran had already broken off the engagement with that illegitimate child, 
so she was still single now. Perhaps they would be together after being matchmade?

Therefore, Hao Jing wanted to say something nice about Feng Ran in front of Chu 
Ran, but Chu Ran had already brushed past her and sat down on the sofa bed.

Seeing this, Hao Jing also knew that Chu Ran was the owner of this sofa bed.

The most important thing now was to discuss with Chu Ran and give this sofa bed to 
him and Feng Di. Hao Jing walked over and asked, “Chu Ran, this is Auntie’s first 
time here. Auntie is old and her health is not good. She can’t sleep on the sofa. Look 
at you … Can you understand me?”

The implication of her words was that she wanted Chu Ran to give up the sofa bed 
and sleep on her own. Chu Ran understood what he meant, and her expression 
immediately darkened.

“I bought this sofa bed. Why should I let you sleep on it? Who do you think you are?” 
Chu Ran’s little upbringing disappeared at this moment. “Can’t you sleep on the sofa 
with your son?”

“Young man, how can you say that? I’m your elder!” Hao Jing had thought that Chu 
Ran was a well-educated rich kid. She didn’t expect him to be an unreasonable 
playboy.

She had wanted to take Chu Ran in as her son-in-law, but now it seemed like she 
should forget about it!

“Whose elder are you? Don’t talk to yourself here.” Chu Ran simply lay on the sofa 
bed. “I bought this bed with money. Of course, only I can sleep on it. If you don’t 
want to sleep on the sofa, then you can bring your son to sleep on the floor. Who 
cares?”



“You!” Hao Jing was furious, but no matter how angry she was, Chu Ran ignored her. 
She even turned around and stopped looking at her.

Although Feng Di was young, he could see that Hao Jing was angry. He also knew 
that the man on the sofa bed had made Hao Jing angry. Therefore, he got off the sofa 
and walked to the side of the sofa. He slapped Chu Ran’s head hard and scolded 
loudly, “You’re a bad guy who made my mother angry! I’ll beat you to death!”

Chu Ran was slapped on the head for no reason. Although it didn’t hurt very much, it 
still made him very unhappy. He got up and saw that the person who had hit him was 
a child less than ten years old. Moreover, he was still talking nonsense, so he became 
even angrier.

“Is this your son?” Chu Ran grabbed Feng Di’s wrist and brought him to Hao Jing.

Feng Di was so scared that he started crying. Hao Jing was also scared.

“What are you doing? Let go of him, he’s just a child!” It was so good that it turned 
pale with fright. He was afraid that Chu Ran would throw Feng Di to the ground in the 
next second.

“I wanted to ask what your son was doing!” Chu Ran’s face darkened. “It’s fine if 
you’re being unreasonable, but why is our son so ill-mannered?!”

Chapter 1412 Villa

“Who are you calling uncultured? How can I be as uneducated as you?” Hao Jing 
retorted loudly, “Put my son down now! If anything happens to my son, I won’t let 
you off!”

What Chu Ran hated the most in his life was others threatening him. Now that he 
heard Hao Jing’s words, he wanted to see how she would react if something really 
happened to Feng Di.

Thinking of this, Chu Ran grabbed Feng Di’s collar and wanted to throw him to the 
ground.



At this moment, Jiang Yu and Feng Ran came out of the bedroom. When Jiang Yu saw 
this scene, she shouted, “Chu Ran! What do you want to do? Hurry up and let go!”

Chu Ran paused and looked at Jiang Yu before looking at Feng Ran behind her. She 
thought for a long time before letting go.

As soon as Feng Di’s feet landed on the ground, he immediately threw himself into 
Hao Jing’s arms and cried loudly. “Mom, I’m so scared! This brother was not a good 
person! He was a bad person! Quickly get Daddy to bring people over and beat him to 
death!”

When Chu Ran heard this, her expression darkened again. She said, “Listen to 
yourself. What did your son say? This is called being cultured? He’s always saying 
things like ‘beat him to death’. He was like this when he was young. What do you 
think he’ll become when he grows up?”

“It’s none of your business what my son will become when he grows up! I don’t think 
you’re a good person either!” Hao Jing’s sharp voice echoed throughout the villa. She 
sat back on the sofa with Feng Di in her arms.

Chu Ran couldn’t be bothered to argue with a shrew like Hao Jing, so she lay back on 
the sofa bed.

Feng Ran originally wanted to continue watching Chu Ran and Hao Jing quarrel, but 
since Jiang Yu had stopped them, she could only return to her room dejectedly.

Hao Jing was sitting on the sofa with Feng Di in her arms. Looking at her back, others 
would think that she was still feeling scared after what had just happened.

But in reality, Hao Jing had other plans in her heart.

At first, she had planned to take Chu Ran in as her son-in-law and get a betrothal gift 
from him. However, based on the current situation, this goal should not work. In that 
case, she planned to use this villa.



She would never believe that this villa had nothing to do with Feng Ran. If there was 
really no relationship at all, then Feng Ran would not be able to live here with a clear 
conscience.

“Mom, what are you thinking about?” Feng Di looked at her in Hao Jing’s arms. “In 
the past, you would always coax me at times like this.”

“Do you like this villa?” Hao Jing asked Feng Di instead of answering the question.

Feng Di was young, and he was at the age of being active. The interior of the villa was 
not only gorgeous, but there was also a lot of space inside. It was suitable for him to 
run around and jump around. Of course, Feng Di would like this villa.

So he said, “I like it! I like this villa very much. Mom, you said that this villa was 
bought by sister. Then let sister give this villa to me?”

“Alright, since you like this villa, I’ll let sister give it to you.” Hao Jing doted on her 
son unconditionally. No matter who this villa belonged to, she was determined to get 
it.

This villa was worth a lot of money. The Feng family would never buy her such a 
villa. However, Hao Jing really liked such a luxurious residence because it would 
make her identity more noble.

“That’s great. This villa is especially big. When the time comes, let Dad move in too! 
Then, chase sister out. In that case, only our family will stay here!” Feng Di was so 
young, but he could always say such shocking words. It was obvious that Hao Jing 
had taught him a lot.

Before dinner, Hao Jing knocked on Feng Ran’s door.

At first, Feng Ran wanted to pretend not to hear her and not open the door for her. 
However, Hao Jing’s knocking became louder and louder. Feng Ran’s eardrums were 
about to be pierced, so he had to get out of bed and open the door for her.

After opening the door, Feng Ran’s tone was not very good. Are you urging me to 
die?”



“You’re already so old, but you’re still a girl. You don’t even know how to speak.” 
Jiang Yu rolled her eyes at Feng Ran. However, she did not get angry at her. Instead, 
she said, “When we rest later tonight, come out and give this room to Feng Di and 
me.”

“Are you dreaming? This is my room. Why should I give it to you?” Feng Ran was so 
angry that he laughed. “Besides, I’m not the only one living in this room. Mei Shuang 
is also here!”

“Mei Shuang is just a servant. Why would she sleep in the guest room?” Hao Jing 
crossed her arms. “She should be sleeping in the living room!”

Chapter 1413 Bottom of Wealthy Class

Mei Shuang was still in the room. When she heard what Hao Jing said, her body could 
not help but tremble. She quickly stood up and walked to the door. She lowered her 
head and said, “I’m sorry, Madam! I’ll sleep in the living room tonight!”

Feng Ran pulled Mei Shuang’s hand and said, “Why are you sleeping in the living 
room? You wake up early and stay up late every day to prepare breakfast and dinner 
for all of us. You should sleep in the guest room! Sister Jiang Yu didn’t say that you’re 
a servant, and she also treats you as a friend! Hao Jing and Feng Di came later. They 
can only sleep on the sofa in the living room!”

“But…” Mei Shuang was still hesitating.

“Don’t hesitate. I told you to sleep here, so you sleep here! I will never let this room 
out!” Feng Ran was at odds with Hao Jing. “I’ll only give you the sofa in the living 
room. You can sleep on it or not! Those who don’t know really think of themselves as 
a scoundrel. Even in the Feng family, I don’t like you! Do you think you’re a good 
person?”

The thing that Hao Jing hated to hear the most in her life was the four words ‘third 
party ascending’. She had married Feng Zheng after Feng Ran’s mother had passed 
away.



What mistress!

“Feng Ran, I’m telling you, you better take back your words! Then apologize to me 
obediently! I’ll pretend that none of this happened. I won’t tell your father!” Hao Jing 
put her hands on her hips. “Otherwise, I’ll tell your father that you slandered me and 
framed him!”

“You two know very well how you and my dad got married! The Hao family is just a 
low-class noble family. What qualifications do they have to be on equal footing with 
our Feng family? Do you think I don’t know what methods you used to marry into this 
family?”

“Shut up! You little slut!” Hao Jing was exasperated. She reached out to pull Feng 
Ran’s hair.

Feng Ran was caught off guard, and Hao Jing grabbed her hair and dragged her to the 
ground.

“Miss!” Mei Shuang screamed and wanted to help Feng Ran. However, Feng Di 
rushed over and pushed Mei Shuang to the ground.

As he hit her body, he shouted, “Don’t go over! Don’t bully my mother! You lowly 
servant!”

To be able to hear such words from a child who was less than ten years old, it was 
obvious how backward Hao Jing’s education was.

Chu Ran was originally lying on the sofa bed to rest, but the fighting upstairs was too 
intense. There was also Feng Di’s scolding, so he couldn’t rest well.

Hence, he walked upstairs in a fit of rage. Just as he was about to shout angrily, he 
saw the chaotic scene in front of him. He had the intention to watch a good show.

So he crossed his arms and leaned against the wall beside him, looking at the scene in 
front of him with interest.



Teng Yi and Jiang Yu also heard the noise, but Teng Yi’s legs had not fully recovered 
yet, so he was still limping.

Jiang Yu quickly stopped Feng Ran and Hao Jing, who were pulling at each other’s 
hair. She then shouted at Chu Ran, “What are you standing there for? Hurry up and 
pull that child away!”

Only then did Chu Ran reluctantly grab Feng Di’s collar and lift him up to save Mei 
Shuang. Feng Di was lifted up by someone and his hands and feet flailed in the air, 
hitting Jiang Yu’s head unknowingly.

Feng Di suddenly stopped and retracted his hands and feet.

However, he did not apologize.

Jiang Yu was silent for a while. She then let go of her hand and stood up. “I don’t 
welcome you here. Hurry up and leave!”

“I came all the way here from the Feng family. I haven’t even stayed for a day, and 
you’re chasing me away.” Although she was speaking to Jiang Yu, Hao Jing’s eyes 
were fixed on Feng Ran. “Didn’t you say that this person is your friend?”

“It’s precisely because you’re my friend that she hates you too! Can’t you tell? 
Annoying thing! Get out of here! I don’t want to see you again!” Feng Ran cursed. 
“When I go back, tell my father that I won’t return to the Feng family in the future. 
Just let him pretend that I’m not his daughter!”

“You! You’re really treasonous!” Hao Jing pointed at Feng Ran’s nose. “Your father 
has raised you for so many years, but in the end, you want to sever your father-
daughter relationship with him! He really raised an ingrate!”

“Stop lecturing me. If I tell you to get lost, then get lost!” Feng Ran no longer cared 
about her identity as the daughter of the Feng family. “If you want me to return to the 
Feng family, then the Feng family will have you without me, and you without me!”



Hao Jing’s fingers trembled in anger for a long time. He didn’t know what to say. 
Feng Di, on the other hand, was so scared that he started crying when he heard Hao 
Jing scold him.

Chapter 1414 Real Estate Certificate

Feng Di’s crying filled the entire villa, annoying everyone.

Hao Jing quickly grabbed Feng Di from Chu Ran’s hands and hugged him. She 
coaxed him as if she was coaxing her darling. “Don’t cry. Mommy is here. No one 
will dare to bully you.”

However, Feng Di kept crying. As he cried, he said, “I hate my sister. I also hate her 
friends. They are all bad people!”

Feng Ran was so angry that she wanted to kick Feng Di out.

Hao Jing kept coaxing Feng Di until he stopped crying. “We can leave, but we can’t 
leave empty-handed. Hao Jing said. “Feng Ran must have a share of this villa. Feng 
Ran is a member of the Feng family, so I have to take back this share on behalf of the 
Feng family. Either you give me the property ownership certificate of this villa, or you 
give me the money.”

“How many times do you want me to say it before you understand? This villa has 
nothing to do with me! I don’t know who you heard it from, but this villa belongs to 
Sister Jiang Yu!” Feng Ran felt that Hao Jing had really fallen into the eyes of money. 
Even if this villa had nothing to do with her, she actually had an ulterior motive.

“Just because you say it has nothing to do with you, it has nothing to do with you? Do 
you think I’ll believe you? You just don’t want to give this villa to your father and me, 
so you said that, right?” Hao Jing said confidently. “If this villa had nothing to do with 
you, would you be able to live here with such a clear conscience?

Stop lying! Since your surname is Feng, then you will always be a member of the 
Feng family. Then this villa will also belong to the Feng family!”



“This villa is mine, not Feng Ran’s. Are you deaf? Can’t you hear what others are 
saying?” Jiang Yu had lost all her patience.

“You’re Feng Ran’s friend. Of course you’ll help her lie to me! But I’m not a young 
girl anymore. Your poor acting skills can’t fool me! This villa belongs to Feng Ran. I 
advise you to give it to me quickly. Otherwise, the Hao family and the Feng family 
won’t let you off!”

Even if the Hao family was a low-class wealthy family, they were still considered to 
be a middle-class wealthy family by climbing up the high branch of the Feng family. 
That was why Hao Jing dared to speak so confidently.

Before Jiang Yu could say anything, Hao Jing continued, “The Feng family is a big 
family. Now that they have the support of the Hao family, I dare say that no family 
can compare to the Feng family! Little girl, I advise you not to go against the Feng 
family. Otherwise, you will be the one suffering! But I’m magnanimous. As long as 
you give me this villa as a gift, I’ll treat everything that happened today as if it never 
happened. Otherwise, don’t blame me for being rude!”

“You keep talking about this villa. I think you really like it.” Jiang Yu looked at Hao 
Jing coldly and the corners of her mouth suddenly curled up into a sneer. “Alright, 
since you want this villa so much, I can give it to you.”

Hao Jing’s eyes lit up. ” Really?”

“Of course it’s true. I’m not lying to you.” Jiang Yu reached out her hand to Hao Jing. 
“If you give me 100 million, this villa will be yours.”

Hao Jing paused for a moment before realizing that Jiang Yu was toying with her. She 
couldn’t help but be so angry that her face twisted.

“You little b * tch, how dare you trick me! I think you’re really tired of living! Just 
you wait, I’m going to find someone to teach you a lesson now!”

Hao Jing took out her phone and made a call.



“Yes, it’s me. Immediately investigate a person named Jiang Yu and tell me all the 
results!”

After hanging up the phone, Hao Jing looked at Jiang Yu smugly and said, “I’ve 
already given you a few chances. You’re the one who didn’t take advantage of them. 
Even if you regret it now and give me ten villas as a gift, I will never forgive you.”

Hao Jing thought that Jiang Yu would be afraid after hearing her words, but she did 
not expect Jiang Yu to be so calm and even look provocative.

“Alright, then let them investigate. Let’s see what they can find out in the end,” she 
said.

Hao Jing thought that Jiang Yu was being stubborn. After waiting for a few hours, the 
results of the investigation on Jiang Yu were sent to Hao Jing.

Hao Jing answered a phone call. The expression on her face changed from smug at 
first to astonishment and finally to fear.

“Did you guys investigate wrongly?” Hao Jing couldn’t believe that the Jiang Yu in 
front of her was someone of such status.

“There is no investigation error.” The person on the other end of the phone said.

Chapter 1415 You Can’t See Mount Tai

Hao Jing’s face was filled with horror, and the way she looked at Jiang Yu had 
unknowingly changed.

Even after hanging up the phone, Hao Jing still seemed to have not recovered from 
Jiang Yu’s identity. Jiang Yu took the initiative to speak to her. “How is it? Have you 
investigated my identity?”

The phone in Hao Jing’s hand fell to the ground. Feng Di quickly picked it up and 
handed it back. However, Hao Jing didn’t take the phone. Instead, she looked at Jiang 
Yu in a daze.



After a long time, Hao Jing finally said, “Miss Jiang Yu, I’m sorry! I didn’t recognize 
you! I didn’t know your identity! Please forgive me for my offense just now!”

!!

“How do you know that you’re wrong at this time? I saw that you were quite smug 
just now.” Jiang Yu looked down at Hao Jing. “I thought you were going to be rude to 
me. Why are you suddenly apologizing to me? Your attitude changed a little too 
quickly.”

“Isn’t it because I don’t know your true identity? But now I know that I was wrong, so 
I’m apologizing to you, right?” Hao Jing quickly smiled apologetically. “Please don’t 
take what I did wrong to heart. Just treat it as if I was drunk and crazy just now! Don’t 
be angry. I’ll take Feng Di away now and never appear in front of you again!”

After saying that, Hao Jing was about to leave with Feng Di. However, Jiang Yu 
stopped her and said, ” You’ve been unreasonable for so long. Do you want to leave 
after apologizing? ”

“But I’ve already apologized. What else do you want me to do?” Hao Jing looked at 
Jiang Yu. “Do you want me to kneel down and kowtow to you?”

“Not really. It’s just that you fought with Feng Ran and insulted Mei Shuang. You 
should apologize to them.” Jiang Yu said.

“Apologize to them? You must be joking! In the blink of an eye, Hao Jing returned to 
her original sharp and mean appearance. It’s fine if you want me to apologize to Feng 
Ran, but Mei Shuang is just a servant. Why should I apologize to her? What right did 
she have? If I really apologize to her, wouldn’t she think that she’s become a 
phoenix?”

“You’re clearly in the wrong. Why don’t you admit it?” Feng Ran retorted unhappily. 
“Mei Shuang is not a servant, she is my best friend! I don’t need you to apologize to 
me. As long as you apologize to Mei Shuang, you can leave this place.”



“You still dare to ask for my help?” Hao Jing raised her eyebrows and stood up with 
Feng Di in her arms. “Don’t think that you can come up to me just because I’m 
whispering in front of Jiang Yu! I’m your stepmother, so you should respect me! Also, 
Jiang Yu, I’ve already apologized to you just now. Why are you insulting me like this? 
Do you think I’ll be afraid of you just because you have a high status?

I apologized to you just now because I was being worldly!”

Hao Jing was still stubborn.

“If I don’t give you some punishment, you really won’t lower your head.” Jiang Yu 
crossed her arms and took out her phone to make a call.

Jiang Yu said a lot of things over the phone, but Hao Jing did not understand what she 
said and thought that she was just pretending.

But five minutes later, Hao Jing received a call from the Hao family.

“Hao Jing, what kind of trouble did you cause outside?!” Hao Jing’s father shouted at 
her, “Now, all the other companies have canceled their cooperation with the Hao 
family. They said that it’s because you caused trouble outside! What trouble did you 
cause outside? If these collaborations are canceled, the Hao family will go bankrupt, 
do you know that?”

“What?” Hao Jing was shocked and looked at Jiang Yu in disbelief.

“I don’t care what trouble you’ve caused outside. You’d better get rid of them all! 
Don’t drag the Hao family into this! Otherwise, we’ll sever our father-daughter 
relationship and you won’t be able to come back to the Hao family in the future!”

Hao Jing’s father hung up the phone.

Hao Jing was still in a daze for a long time. It was not until Jiang Yu called out to her 
that she finally reacted. She asked, “Was it you who caused the Hao family to go 
bankrupt?”



“Of course, but I just want to give you a punishment. You’re not young anymore. 
Can’t you be more mature?” When Jiang Yu said this, there was a hint of mockery in 
her tone.

Chapter 1416 Detained Everywhere

Hao Jing was really flustered at this moment. She fell to the ground with a thud. Feng 
Di followed her movements and fell to the ground, crying in pain again.

However, Hao Jing no longer had the energy to care about Feng Di. She only wanted 
to beg Jiang Yu to take back what she had just said.

She grabbed Jiang Yu’s clothes and begged, “Jiang Yu, I know I was wrong! Can you 
take back your words and not let those companies cancel their cooperation with the 
Hao family?”

Jiang Yu pulled her clothes back mercilessly. “If you really feel panicked, then you 
should contact them yourself and beg them not to cancel the cooperation with the Hao 
Family.”

Hao Jing gradually became disheartened, and she couldn’t help but feel dizzy.

In the end, it was Feng Di’s crying that pulled her back to reality. She looked up and 
realized that everyone was busy with their own matters. No one cared about her at all.

Hao Jing forced herself to stay conscious and took out her phone to make a call.

Hao Jing knew the contact information of the CEOs of the companies that worked 
with the Hao family. She knew that her father would definitely try to persuade those 
CEOs to stay. However, she was the one who had provoked Jiang Yu, so Hao Jing felt 
that it was better for her to apologize and persuade them to stay.

The first person she contacted was the boss of Xing Hai Media. Xing Hai Media was a 
consortium that faced overseas. Hao Jing felt that this boss might not have much to do 
with Jiang Yu. As long as she was sincere enough, she could keep him.



The phone rang a few times before it was picked up. A very deep male voice came 
through. “Is this Hao Jing?”

“Yes, yes, yes, it’s me! Please remember me.” When Hao Jing saw that the boss of 
Xing Hai Media still remembered her, joy surged in her heart. He felt that it would not 
be difficult to make him stay.

“Why are you calling me?”

“It’s about your cooperation with the Hao family. I don’t know where you heard it 
from, so you want to cancel the cooperation with the Hao family?” Hao Jing asked.

It would have been better if she hadn’t mentioned this matter. Once she did, the boss 
of Xing Hai Media became angry and questioned loudly, “You still have the cheek to 
ask me? You should reflect on yourself. How did you make Jiang Yu angry? Do you 
know who Jiang Yu is?”

Hao Jing was stunned by Xing Hai Media’s boss. The boss continued, “The Hao 
family is just a low-class wealthy family. So what if you marry Feng Zheng? If you 
overestimate yourself and dare to make Jiang Yu angry, then don’t blame me for 
canceling the cooperation with the Hao Family! If you dare to provoke Jiang Yu, I 
can’t!”

The cooperation with Xing Hai Media was negotiated by Hao Jing’s father for almost 
half a month. Hao Jing’s father had already contacted the workers and the supplier 
who provided the materials. The money for the early stage had all been spent.

If the cooperation with Xing Hai Media was canceled, then the Hao family’s capital 
chain would break and they would really be close to bankruptcy!

Although the Hao family was bankrupt now.

“Please think about it carefully! This cooperation was negotiated between my father 
and you for half a month. At that time, the price and construction period were all 
agreed upon! We’ve already found the workers and raw materials. If you want to 
terminate the contract, you have to pay us the penalty!” Hao Jing tried to threaten 
Xing Hai Media’s boss with the penalty.



“Up to you. Also, regarding the breach of contract, I hope you can take a good look at 
the contract. In the contract at that time, your father conceded many requests in order 
to cooperate with Xing Hai Media. One of them is that we can terminate the 
cooperation at any time without paying any penalty.”

“What?!” Hao Jing exclaimed in disbelief.

“Xing Hai Media is a consortium that faces overseas. Other than the Hao family, there 
are many other upper-class groups that want to cooperate with us! Since you’ve made 
Jiang Yu angry, you’re on your own!”

“Don’t be like this. I’ll apologize to Jiang Yu now, okay? I’ll apologize to her, and 
then don’t cancel the cooperation with the Hao family!” Hao Jing hurriedly asked the 
boss of Xing Hai Media to stay.

This cooperation was extremely important and could not be canceled!

“Of course you have to apologize, but whether Jiang Yu will forgive you or not is 
none of my business. If she forgives you, I’ll consider working with the Hao family 
again. Otherwise, don’t blame me for being merciless.”

With that, the boss of Xing Hai Media hung up.

Chapter 1417 Throwing Him Out

After the call was hung up, Hao Jing immediately went to look for Jiang Yu. She 
knocked on Jiang Yu’s door. “Jiang Yu, open the door! I know I was wrong. I’m here 
to apologize to you!”

Feng Di stood at Jiang Yu’s door for as long as she knocked on the door. In the end, 
Jiang Yu was still annoyed by Feng Di’s crying and walked over to open the door. “If 
you have something to say, just say it. Don’t let your son cry.”



Hao Jing covered Feng Di’s mouth and smiled apologetically at Jiang Yu. “I know it 
was my fault just now. I was disrespectful. I was bullying others! Please don’t be 
angry and forgive me this time!”

“I’ve said it before. You should apologize to Feng Ran and Mei Shuang, not me. ” 
Jiang Yu pointed to a room. “They’re right there. You go and apologize. I’ll stay here 
and watch. If Feng Ran and the others forgive you, then I will consider forgiving you. 
As for those companies that canceled their cooperation with the Hao family, I can also 
consider letting them cooperate with the Hao family again.”

“Okay, okay, okay. I’ll go apologize now!” Hao Jing nodded like a chick pecking at 
rice and walked to Feng Ran’s door.

She knocked on the door. Mei Shuang came to open the door. Mei Shuang saw Hao 
Jing and automatically put on a humble posture. “Madam,” she asked, “is there 
anything you need from Miss?”

Feng Ran’s voice came from the room. Mei Shuang, close the door quickly. Don’t let 
her in!”

Mei Shuang was in a difficult position. Hao Jing quickly squeezed into the room while 
Mei Shuang was stunned. She said to Feng Ran, who was lying on the bed, “I was 
wrong just now. You are also a member of the Feng family. Please forgive me this 
time. After all, I am also your stepmother.”

“I told you, you’re not my stepmother! I never admitted it.” Feng Ran said in disgust, 
“Don’t apologize. We won’t forgive you!”

Hao Jing was used to being the mistress of the Feng family, so her temper was not 
very good. Although Feng Ran had always been at odds with her and always spoke to 
her in this tone, Mei Shuang would never stand above Hao Jing.

“Feng Ran, I’ve already apologized to you. Don’t be ungrateful!” Hao Jing raised her 
voice again. “It’s your greatest honor that I can apologize to you!”

“You really think you’re a golden phoenix. If you’re not willing to come over and 
apologize, I don’t want to see your face!” Feng Ran was so angry that she grabbed the 
cup on the bedside table and threw it at him.



Fortunately, Hao Jing dodged quickly. Otherwise, the cup would have hit her head and 
disfigured her.

“Feng Ran, you’re getting bolder and bolder. How dare you throw a cup at me!” Hao 
Jing’s sharp voice was like a cat scratching glass. Anyone who heard it would feel 
uncomfortable.

Jiang Yu, who was outside, walked over and coughed dryly at the door.

When Hao Jing heard Jiang Yu’s voice, she immediately changed back to her previous 
apologetic smile. “Feng Ran, I was wrong. Please forgive me.”

“You’re not my mother. Don’t disgust me! Hurry up and get out of here!” Feng Ran 
ordered him to leave.

Hao Jing wanted to say something more, but Jiang Yu said, “Feng Ran has already 
made it clear that she will not forgive you. Then, don’t waste your time. Hurry up and 
leave this place. If you leave now, you can probably return to the Hao family 
tomorrow morning. If you don’t have the face to go back, then go back to the Feng 
family.”

Hao Jing wanted to struggle a little more, but after Jiang Yu saw through her 
intentions, she immediately asked the bodyguards to throw her and Feng Di out.

Chu Ran had been watching the show from the side until Hao Jing and Feng Di were 
thrown out. He then laughed out loud and said, “You deserve it. I knew that the Feng 
family was no good!”

Although it was Chu Ran who called Feng Zheng and said that Feng Ran had bought a 
big villa here, she refused to tell her family. That was why Hao Jing was angry and 
brought Feng Di over.

However, she didn’t expect that such a big change would happen in less than a day.



Hao Jing and Feng Di were thrown at the door like garbage. To Hao Jing, this was a 
huge insult.

But now, no matter what kind of humiliation it was, it didn’t matter to Hao Jing. If she 
didn’t go back to discuss countermeasures with her father now, the Hao family would 
probably really be unable to recover.

Therefore, Hao Jing didn’t go back to the Feng Family. Instead, she brought Feng Di 
back to the Hao Family.

Chapter 1418 Help

When Hao Jing and Feng Di returned to the Hao family home, Hao Jing’s father was 
sitting on the sofa, his face green with anger.

When he saw Hao Jing come back, he stood up from the sofa in anger and roared, 
“You still have the nerve to come back?! It’s all because of you that the Hao family’s 
capital chain has been cut off! Do you know that the Hao family is bankrupt now?”

“I came back to discuss countermeasures with you because I knew about this!” Hao 
Jing shielded Feng Di behind her. “Why are you throwing a tantrum at me? It was 
Jiang Yu who made those companies cancel their cooperation with the Hao family. 
What’s the use of getting angry at me? Don’t speak so loudly. Feng Di is still young. 
Don’t scare him!”

Although Hao Jing’s father was angry, he still doted on his grandson, Feng Di. 
Therefore, she lowered her voice and said to Hao Jing, “If you hadn’t made Jiang Yu 
angry, those companies wouldn’t have canceled their cooperation. In the end, it’s all 
because of you.”

“I’m also thinking of a solution. I’ve already contacted the CEOs of those companies, 
but they don’t agree at all! I also apologized to Jiang Yu, but she refused to forgive 
me. What can I do?” Hao Jing looked annoyed.

“She’s not willing to forgive you because you’re not sincere enough! If you were 
sincere enough, how could she not forgive you?” Hao Jing’s father was exasperated. 
“Feng Zheng is the only one who can save the Hao family now. You should hurry up 



and bring Feng Di back and ask Feng Zheng for help. As long as Feng Zheng is 
willing to help, the Hao family can quickly recover from this blow.”

“Got it. I’ll go back now. I’ll leave Feng Di with you for now. Help me take care of 
him.” Hao Jing said as she rushed back to the Feng family.

Feng Zheng wasn’t at the Feng family’s house. He was in the company dealing with 
business. Hao Jing took a car to the company.

The staff at the front desk knew Hao Jing and knew that she was the CEO’s wife, so 
they let her in.

Hao Jing went straight to Feng Zheng’s office. Feng Zheng’s secretary said to her, ” 
Madam, CEO Feng is in a meeting. If you have anything to say, you can wait until 
CEO Feng is done with the meeting.

“Why is he having a meeting at this critical moment?” Hao Jing stomped her feet 
anxiously, but she couldn’t disturb Feng Zheng’s meeting, so she could only wait in 
his office.

He waited for three hours.

When Feng Zheng came back from the meeting, he saw Hao Jing sitting on her hair. 
She had already finished five cups of tea.

When Hao Jing saw Feng Zheng come back, she immediately stood up and questioned 
him, “What meeting are you having? It was on for three hours.”

“This meeting is mainly to discuss cooperation with other companies. It’s inevitable 
that it will take a little longer. Why are you here?” Feng Zheng explained and asked 
Hao Jing. “You don’t usually come to the company.”

Hao Jing then told Feng Zheng everything and added fuel to the fire. “Feng Zheng, 
look at your good daughter. She dares to ride on my head with Mei Shuang, that 
servant! When she and Mei Shuang come back, you must teach them a good lesson!”



Hao Jing thought that Feng Zheng would stand on her side, but she didn’t expect Feng 
Zheng to skip her words and focus on the matter of Hao Jing making Jiang Yu angry.

“Did you make Jiang Yu angry?” Feng Zheng found it hard to believe. “Didn’t you go 
to Qingcheng to look for Feng Ran? How did she get involved with Jiang Yu?”

“You still have the nerve to say that? Let me ask you, who exactly did you receive a 
call from? Who told you that Feng Ran bought a villa in Qingcheng?” Hao Jing raised 
his eyebrows. “I only found out after I went there that Feng Ran didn’t buy that villa 
at all. Jiang Yu did! Feng Ran is just a friend of Jiang Yu. She’s living in the villa as a 
friend!”

Feng Zheng paused for a moment before saying, “Since Jiang Yu bought the villa, you 
should just bring Feng Di back obediently. Why would you make Jiang Yu angry?”

Hao Jing suddenly became submissive and didn’t dare to say anything.

Feng Zheng immediately guessed that something was wrong when he saw her like 
this. He scolded her sternly, “Hurry up and tell me what happened.”

Hao Jing had no choice but to tell Feng Zheng that she wanted to get the villa from 
Jiang Yu, so she was a little disrespectful to her.

When Feng Zheng heard that, his head instantly swelled.

“Who gave you the guts to speak to Jiang Yu like that?”

Chapter 1419 Kicked Out of The House

Seeing that Feng Zheng was also speaking up for Jiang Yu, Hao Jing’s voice 
immediately became sharp. “Feng Zheng, I’m your wife! Now that something has 
happened to your wife, you shouldn’t be questioning me. Instead, you should think of 
a way to help me solve this problem!”

“The person you provoked is Jiang Yu. How can I help you?” Feng Zheng was not to 
be outdone either. He shouted back, “Don’t you ever consider the consequences before 



you do anything? When are you going to stop being so mean? I really don’t 
understand why I fell for you back then!”

When Hao Jing heard Feng Zheng bring up old scores, she immediately acted 
shamelessly. “Alright, Feng Zheng. Now that things have come to this, you’re 
bringing up old scores with me, right? Why do you think I married you? When you 
married me, the Feng family wasn’t like this. At that time, the Feng family and the 
Hao family were the same. They were both low-class wealthy families! Why did I 
marry you? It’s all because I like you!

I gave birth to a son for you, what right do you have to despise me?”

“I don’t mean to despise you, but you weren’t like this when we got married. When 
did you become so mean?” Feng Zheng did not want to recall the past.

“Don’t worry about when I changed. Don’t you just despise me? You think I’m mean 
and mean, and you despise me for embarrassing you? Alright, since you despise me so 
much, let’s get a divorce! Divorce!” Hao Jing shouted and left.

Feng Zheng was the CEO of a company. Being yelled at like that by someone else was 
also a loss of face for him, even if that person was his wife.

“Leave!” Feng Zheng sat on the chair angrily and roared in the direction that Hao Jing 
had left. “Leave then! If you really want a divorce, I’ll get my secretary to draft a 
divorce agreement now!”

Hao Jing cried and went back to the Hao family home. Her father was still sitting on 
the sofa coaxing Feng Di, but Feng Di didn’t seem to appreciate it. No matter how 
Hao Jing’s father tried to make him happy, Feng Di just wouldn’t smile.

Feng Di’s eyes lit up when he saw Hao Jing. He jumped down from the sofa and 
threw himself into Hao Jing’s arms. “Mom!”

“How was it?” Hao Jing’s father asked immediately when he saw her return. “What 
did Feng Zheng say?”



When she mentioned Feng Zheng, the tears that Hao Jing had just stopped flowed 
down again. “Don’t count on your useless son-in-law. I told him about this, but he 
didn’t help me think of a solution. Instead of solving it, you blame me. You even said 
that you want to divorce me!”

“What did you say? Divorce? Did Feng Zheng really say that?” Hao Jing’s father was 
shocked. “How can Feng Zheng be so ungrateful? He should help you at a time like 
this. Why would he want to divorce you?”

“That’s right, that’s why I said he’s useless!” Hao Jing’s sobs grew louder and louder.

“Alright, stop crying. In the end, this matter is still your fault!” Hao Jing’s father was 
annoyed by Hao Jing’s crying. He angrily rebuked, “I don’t think we can count on 
Feng Zheng now. Hurry up and think of a way to solve this matter! If you can’t solve 
this matter, don’t blame me for kicking you out of the Hao family!”

Hao Jing had been wronged by Feng Zheng. She thought that she would be comforted 
when she returned home. However, she did not expect that her father only cared about 
the bankrupt company and did not have a daughter like her.

“I’ve suffered such a huge grievance, but you don’t even know how to comfort me? 
You only have that bankrupt company in your heart!” Hao Jing raised her voice. “I’m 
your daughter. Am I not as important as that company in your heart?!”

“How can you compare your company to mine? That’s the company I’ve been 
working hard to run for decades! My decades of hard work have been ruined by you. 
Aren’t you going to let me lose my temper at you?”

The father and daughter were both more temperamental than the other. If Hao Jing 
was angry, her father would be even angrier than her.

“What does this have to do with me? The person who caused the Hao family to go 
bankrupt was Jiang Yu. If you really have the ability, then throw your temper at Jiang 
Yu! What’s the use of throwing a tantrum at me here?” Hao Jing retorted, unwilling to 
be outdone.

“You, get out of the Hao family now and never come back! In the future, if I don’t 
have you as my daughter, don’t call me dad anymore!” Hao Jing’s father was so angry 



that his old face was as red as a monkey’s butt. “Get out of here right now. Get out of 
here with your son!”

Chapter 1420 Divorced

Hao Jing also lost her temper and immediately left the Hao family with Feng Di.

However, Hao Jing had left with Feng Di, so the two of them had nowhere to go. Hao 
Jing thought about it and decided to return to the Feng family.

Hao Jing felt that it was time for Feng Zheng to calm down.

When she returned home, Feng Zheng was still in the office. She asked the nanny to 
take care of Feng Di while she went into the kitchen, planning to cook herself.

However, Hao Jing didn’t know how to cook at all. She only saw it when she watched 
the nanny busy in the kitchen.

Therefore, she stayed in the kitchen for a long time. Not only did she not cook a single 
dish, but she also almost blew up the kitchen.

The nanny couldn’t stand it anymore. She walked over and said, “Madam, let me do 
it.”

Hao Jing pushed the nanny away and said, “You go take care of Feng Di. I’ll be in the 
kitchen. I can handle it myself.”

Since she insisted, the nanny couldn’t say anything. She could only sigh, shake her 
head, and go back to coax Feng Di.

As soon as Feng Zheng got home, he saw a foul scene in the kitchen. He thought that 
something had happened to the power supply in the kitchen. However, when he got 
closer, he realized that it was Hao Jing cooking.



“I thought you didn’t know how to cook? Cough cough!” Feng Zheng choked on the 
oil smoke in the kitchen and couldn’t stop coughing. “What are you doing in the 
kitchen? Isn’t this causing trouble?”

Hao Jing was unhappy when she heard that. “I saw that you were too busy at the 
company, so I wanted to make you some delicious food to nourish your body,” she 
said. “Why don’t you appreciate it?”

“Look at the food you made. Is it edible?” Feng Zheng said with disdain. “Even if you 
put it on the roadside for stray dogs, the stray dogs probably won’t even look at it.”

Hao Jing simply threw away the rice spatula in her hand and said sternly, “Anyway, 
I’ve cooked this meal. You can eat it or not. I’m your wife, not a nanny. I don’t know 
how to serve you. I don’t owe you anything.”

“Don’t throw a tantrum here.” Feng Zheng took out a divorce agreement from his 
briefcase and threw it in front of Hao Jing. “Here is the divorce agreement. Take a 
look. If there’s no problem, just sign on it.”

“Are you really going to divorce me?” Hao Jing was so shocked that it was difficult to 
add to her shock. “What did I do wrong? You actually want to divorce me?”

She thought that Feng Zheng had said those words out of anger today. She did not 
expect him to come back with the divorce agreement at night.

To think that she had wanted to make some delicious food for him to nourish himself. 
Now, it seemed that her good intentions had been wasted. This man was not worthy of 
being treated well by others!

“What right do you have to divorce me? Is it because of Jiang Yu?” Hao Jing grabbed 
Feng Zheng’s arm so hard that she almost crushed his bones.

“It’s not just because of her. You have a big reason too!” Feng Zheng felt the pain and 
fiercely shook off Hao Jing’s hand. He said, “Hurry up and take a look at this divorce 
agreement. If there’s no problem, hurry up and sign it. I won’t let you leave with 
nothing. I’ll give you what you deserve. As for Feng Di, don’t take him away. Leave 
him to me.”



“What right do you have to divorce me and take my son away?!” Hao Jing suddenly 
looked like she had gone crazy. “You heartless man! If you really want to divorce me, 
then you can’t take Feng Di away from me!”

“You’re a divorced woman. How can you take good care of Feng Di? The Feng family 
is powerful and I will give Feng Di a better life.” Feng Zheng said.

After he finished speaking, he continued to urge her, “I see that you’re being 
unreasonable here. Why don’t you take a closer look at the divorce agreement? But I 
can guarantee you that there are no unfavorable conditions on it, so just sign it.”

In fact, when Feng Zheng first asked his secretary to print the divorce agreement, he 
hadn’t made up his mind to divorce Hao Jing. He even thought that if Hao Jing could 
apologize to him after he came back tonight, he would secretly destroy the divorce 
agreement like before.

However, he didn’t expect to see a foul atmosphere in the kitchen when he came back 
tonight. He even choked on the oily smoke inside and coughed. Tears flowed out, and 
he couldn’t help but feel even angrier. The idea of divorcing Hao Jing became 
stronger.

“Alright, since you want to divorce me, I’ll fulfill your wish! But I will never give you 
custody of Feng Di!” Hao Jing took a pen and signed the last page of the divorce 
agreement. Then she went to the nanny to bring Feng Di over.
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