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Chapter 161

The Council of Torment was searching for the best sacrifice. Since they failed to abduct Marianne, 
they decided to go with Sana. Sana is a person who is mostly known for having a unique TA and her 
young appearance despite being over 60. She is the closest in terms of connection towards the 
extinct species of Elves aside from Marianne. 

Yes, because of that, the cult decided to abduct her. Because her Term Attribute could be used to 
answer their problems even if the answers were vague, at least they have an idea. Furthermore, once 
they were finished using her, they would kill her as a sacrifice. However, was it really true that Sana 
was abducted? 

………

……

…

Marianne and Calix immediately called the police. They inspected the building, and sadly, all of the 
people were dead. The workers and the cleaner were dead, yet they couldn't find Sana's body. This 
confirmed their assumption, Sana was indeed kidnapped. 

It was frightening that the people were happily riding their rides in the amusement park while 
dozens of people were found dead. They confirmed that it was over 24 hours before they died. 
Sadly, they couldn't find anything to track the murderer(s). 

Calix and Marianne stepped out of the building when the police came. They were interviewed but 
they were immediately released because both of them had a strong connection. In the end, Marianne 
and Calix decided to leave the amusement park because they couldn't find anything to locate the 
enemies. 

Calix was actually disturbed, he didn't know that his grand-aunt would be missing just like that. But 
because they didn't have a strong relationship, Calix didn't feel sad nor angry, he was just anxious 
that this group of insane people might attack him again. 



As for Marianne, she was disheartened that she didn't visit Sana earlier. Perhaps she could prevent 
this tragedy if she came earlier.

They were both shocked. 

Calix glanced at Marianne, no matter how much Marianne tried to hide it, it was obvious that she 
was afraid. Perhaps she was still affected by what happened in the Flying Ship. 

"Say, why don't we eat. My treat."

Calix offered, smiling. He was actually surprised that he could ask Marianne. If his past self would 
see this, perhaps he(past self) would lose consciousness because of shock. Their relationship greatly 
changed. 

"Hah! I want to eat in a fancy restaurant. I will not eat if it's not a five-star michelin restaurant."

Marianne strongly said. As expected, she was a bonafide spoiled rich brat. 

"Okay, fine."

"Hmmph!"

Calix shrugged. Marianne scoffed but she was delighted deep inside. She experienced being asked 
for dates a lot of times, but this was the only moment where she was genuinely happy. 

"I know this place better than you. I will take you to a great restaurant."

She said and Calix nodded. 

"Thanks."

"I don't want your appreciation."



"Well, if you say so."

"B- but it's not that I care. You can do what you want."

She stuttered. Calix just chuckled and followed her instead. 

"By the way, why don't you change your clothes? You are wearing my long sleeves and I want it 
back-- Hey, why are you glaring at me like that?"

"I don't want to change, so let's go."

She pouted and started walking away. Marianne stopped her driver from following them. She didn't 
like being followed anymore. 

"But it's still cold if you wear that."

He was concerned. 

"I will not change my clothes."

She firmly said. 

Marianne was not honest with herself. She didn't want to change her dress because she wanted to 
keep wearing his sleeves, she could smell his manly scent. She felt like she achieved something by 
wearing his clothes. 

"Now that I think about it… Do you still have my battle suit? What did you do about it?"

"I threw it."

"As expected... (It's worth at least a million but never mind.)"



Calix didn't ask anymore. Maybe Marianne still had a grudge against him. However, he didn't know 
that Marianne actually hid the battle suit in her treasure chest. She was afraid that Calix would take 
it back so she lied instead. 

They reached the restaurant, it was mostly seafood but there was some delicacy too. The waiter was 
surprised that both Calix and Marianne were wearing simple clothes but he didn't care, his job was 
to get their orders and deliver them. 

"Did you like the food?"

Marianne asked, hiding her nervousness. She showed him one of the restaurants she liked, she was 
afraid that Calix won't like it. 

"It's actually great, I like them."

Calix ate the lobster without a problem. He had some allergies back when he was misfortunate, but 
now that he awakened his Luck, he could eat anything he wants. 

Mariah sighed in relief and they finished their lunch quickly. It was actually a surprise that they 
could eat after what they witnessed. Perhaps they were already used to blood. Well, Marianne is a 
Vindicator, she was trained to eat even in stressful situations.

As for Calix, he didn't feel any aversion. Heck, he killed hundreds of people last time, so seeing 
some dead people won't affect him anymore. 

After they finished eating, they understood that they would go separate ways but Marianne felt like 
she had to make a move. Now that she couldn't ask Sana for help, she decided to do this on her 
own. 

"H- hey… Why don't we--"

*Ring!!

"Oh sorry, someone's calling."



Calix checked his phone. 

"N- no, it's fine."

Marianne was irritated by the phone call. She bit her lip, she realized how awkward it was. 

She averted her gaze while Calix talked to the person. However, while talking, Marianne heard that 
the voice was from a girl.

She raised her sense of hearing and heard most of their conversation. She felt defeated. 

[Hey, Calix. I miss you~]

Kimberly was on the other side. She just departed from her office and she wanted to hear his voice. 

"Yeah, me too."

[Are you busy tomorrow?]

"Well, I think I'm free in the afternoon."

Calix replied and started walking away from Marianne. Of course he didn't want Marianne to hear 
this conversation. However--

"Calix, we have to talk."

Marianne grabbed the hem of his shirt, stopping him from leaving. 

Calix glanced at her but his ear was still on the phone. His eyes were quite cold and Marianne 
shuddered. He was waiting for Marianne to speak.



"D- do you want to see my mansion? I just remembered that your battle suit is still in my room. If 
you want, you can stay there and have some rest, but it's not that I'm forcing you, you can do what 
you want."

That was the best that she could say. She was waiting for his reply. 

"Ah yes, Kimberly. Yeah, I'll meet you tomorrow. I love you."

Marianne was hurt by that and her expression almost cracked but a gentle hand patted her head. 

"Let's go."

Calix smiled. He could do a lot of stuff before tomorrow afternoon comes, such as staying in 
Marianne's mansion.  

"O- okay!"

Marianne didn't know why but that simple gesture made her alive. 

Chapter 162

'I made a mistake… I shouldn't have invited him to the mansion… I should have brought him in a 
hotel instead.'

Marianne sighed. Because of the filtering of workers: to make sure that there were no spies, her 
uncle fired a lot of people, so most of the remaining workers in the mansion were maids. 
Furthermore, she had some people who were watching and protecting her in the dark. So perhaps 
they already know about Calix. But it was not the real problem. 

Marianne glared at the maids who were looking at Calix with flirty gazes, one maid emphasized her 
breasts by crossing her arms. They were walking in the hallway and the maids were blushing at 
him. It was obvious that they were captivated. The maids flinched when Marianne glared at them, 
yet they couldn't help but stare at Calix. He is so handsome, a hunk. 



Calix disregard their gazes and he just continued walking. Marianne sighed in relief when she found 
that Calix was not affected by their gazes. At least she was confident that Calix won't easily be 
swayed by the maids. He knew his priorities. 

"Do you want to go to my room? Your battle suit is there."

Marianne decided to sacrifice the battle suit to bait him. If this mission succeeded, perhaps she 
could loot another stuff, such as the grey t-shirt that he was wearing. She salivated while thinking of 
that. But of course she didn't forget her real mission, to seduce Calix and become stronger. 

"Okay, I'm cool with that."

Calix didn't hesitate and he agreed. After all, his real reason why he was here was to get friendly 
with her. So he would listen to what she would say. However, Calix was not that stupid. 

Calix understood that Marianne had hidden intention why she took him here. If his Luck was 
working along with him, perhaps he could get in her pants one way or another. He was not 
completely sure about Marianne's feelings but he knew that she was not that angry anymore. 

They both entered the room and Marianne locked the door just to be sure. She didn't want any 
person to disturb them. She turned around and found that Calix was looking around. Marianne was 
quite nervous, she didn't know if Calix would like her room or not. 

However, based on Calix's expression, it seemed that he didn't hate it. He was actually impressed. 
He nodded as he found some paintings and antique vases around. Marianne's room was 
sophisticated and had the sense of being semi-classical, unlike normal girls who had pink dolls and 
girly stuff around. Marianne still holds the nobility even in her room. 

'Well, compared to Yuna's room where there are a bunch of my pictures, this is better.'

He nodded. 

"That explains a lot."



"Do you like me?"

Marianne blurted out. Her inner thoughts were resurfacing.

"What did you say?"

Calix thought that he heard something. 

"N- nothing, I'm asking if you like my room."

She strongly shook her head and thought of an excuse. 

"Oh, I like your room. I guess I'm not wrong."

"About what?"

"You exudes a noble aura, and your room is the exact reflection of yours. A noblewoman. "

"You're not making fun of me, right?"

She raised her brow. 

"No, it's a compliment."

"Thanks…"

Marianne averted her gaze but she was delighted. 

"Ah, before I forgot…"

Marianne went to find the battle suit. It ached her that she had to return the battle suit. 



"Here it is."

She said, smiling to hide her sadness. She gave him the fist-size battle suitcase. When Calix 
grabbed it, the small battle suit further shrunk until it became a one-inch cube. Calix nonchalantly 
put the battle suit in his pocket.

"Wait a minute … Are you saying that your battle suit is one of the limited edition battle suits of the 
Cudgel Tech?"

Marianne was stunned, she heard that the Cudgel Tech created battle suits that could be shrunk into 
an inch but she didn't expect that the battle suit that she wore was from that series. 

"Oops, I forgot to say that. Yes, this is the C- Series."

Kimberly named it C-Series because of him. The C stands for his name. Kimberly is indeed a 
romantic person. Although actually, Calix's battle suit was created first before even the C-Series 
was released. This means that Kimberly prioritized him. Calix promised that he would give his best 
to make Kimberly happy. He chuckled imagining how he would make her moan tomorrow. 

"Hey, why are you smiling like that?"

Marianne felt that Calix was thinking of someone and she didn't like it. She wanted Calix to think 
about her and nobody else. 

She bit her lip and opened her mouth. 

"Do you want to watch Notflix? We can chill while we're watching."

Ah, the legendary Notflix and Chill.

Marianne did her best to show her intention, but she wasn't sure if Calix understood him. Of course 
Marianne could never say the vulgar word called sex, so she settled with Notflix and Chill. 

"Yeah, I'm fine with that."



Calix answered without a problem, Marianne looked at him and she didn't know if Calix understand 
her intention. 

"Okay, give me a minute and I'll bring some snacks."

She didn't want to ask the maids because she was afraid that the maids might do something bad. She 
left the room and she walked faster than usual. Her lips curled up, she was happy that Calix agreed. 

………

……

…

Calix was left alone in the room, he didn't know what to do so he was just standing there. He was 
afraid that Marianne would be angry if he sit on her bed. 

*Knock knock!

"Hm?"

Someone was knocking on the window. When Calix looked at it, he chuckled when he found Yuna. 
Yuna inspected the room and she teleported inside. She immediately jumped onto him and Calix 
caught her without a problem. 

"Calix!!"

Yuna kissed him and Calix had taken advantage of that. He attacked her lips and made her 
breathless. When their lips parted, they were red and running for air. 

"Did you finish your job?"

"Yes."

Yuna officially joined the military, she worked as a teleporter. She was tasked to bring supplies to 
the Border using her portal. 



"By the way, why are you in this place? I thought we are going to meet in the terminal?"

"Sorry, change of plan."

If not for the tracking device, Yuna would never find him. 

Yuna had to stalk Calix for ten hours once a week to maintain her Term Attribute.

She was confused why Calix was staying in this place. 

Calix chuckled and kissed her forehead. 

"Nothing, by the way, do you like to do a threesome?"

Calix may like Marianne but it didn't mean that he would disregard his other girls. Calix would 
tease Marianne a little bit this time to make her jealous. 

Chapter 163

Marianne was carefully pushing the cart full of food and beverages. Yes, Marianne decided to go 
with a food cart to make sure that they won't leave the room again. With this, they had food for all 
night. Marianne didn't want any maid to disturb them so she used this method. 

From the appetizer to full-course dinner, Marianne brought them. She had wine, soda, and some 
snacks for the Notflix. 

However, despite being in careful movements, Marianne was smiling genuinely. She didn't know 
that she was smiling, but the maids who looked at her blushed because of her lovely yet innocent 
smile. 

She was excited to share her favorite movie with Calix. She loved 'The Notebook' since high 
school. In her opinion, 'The Notebook' was the best romantic movie of all time. She cried a lot 
watching that movie, so she wanted to share her experience with Calix. 



However, she didn't know that Calix already watched that movie together with Scarlett. Although in 
the second half of the movie, Calix and Scarlett started fucking so Calix didn't watch it completely. 
He just know the plot but he didn't enjoy it. The movie was stupid regardless. 

In a way, Marianne lost to Scarlett again. Even in her movie choice, she was defeated. 

Marianne's appearance was so fresh and blooming, let's not forget that she was still wearing Calix's 
long sleeves and the legendary Virgin Killing Sweater was under that long sleeves. So Marianne 
already had her weapons prepared. 

She had the beauty of a Goddess. Unlike the others who had a mortal appearance, Marianne was 
one of a kind. With her long pointy ears, golden hair, blue ocean eyes, ample breast, and pale white 
skin, she exudes this elegant, perfect, and noble aura. 

"Hehe."

She giggled, even girls would turn lesbians because of her simple smile. 

However, Marianne didn't know that despite her goddess-like appearance, she was being cucked 
right now! 

Marianne reached the door and she gently opened it. She took a step into the room, however, the 
first thing she heard was the sloppy sounds of blowjob!!

"Huh?"

She was dumbfounded when she found Calix standing stiffly while a woman who had pink hair tied 
in twin tails was sucking his monster cock vigorously. Yuna didn't stop at all even though Marianne 
was stunned staring hard at her, Yuna prioritized Calix's long thick cock as expected.

Her spits covered his shaft down to the base, her saliva drizzled rolling on her neck down to her 
cleavage. She was gagging as she throat-fuck him, Calix grunted. He grabbed her twin tails and 
pulled them closer, causing Yuna to choke hard. Yet she didn't stop at all, she kept bobbing her head 
up and down. She glanced for a second at Marianne but she immediately returned her focus on the 
tasty cock inside her mouth. 



"… What is happening here?"

Marianne asked, confused and aggravated. The sparkling soda started levitating and divided into 
small drops, they were bullets that would penetrate two bodies perhaps.  

"Oh, hi Marianne."

Calix looked at her, waving his hand as if everything was normal. Yuna continued sucking his rod 
while fingering herself. She admitted that she just cummed because her ass trembled up. 

"Calix…"

Marianne glared at him, waiting for his answer. She didn't know what to say. Yes, she was mad, but 
behind that anger, she felt hot. She knew that her crotch was so wet right now watching Yuna 
sucking his cock. 

"Ah, about this-- kuh."

Calix's face contorted because Yuna sucked him so hard. He looked down and shrugged, it seemed 
that Yuna wanted his attention all for herself. Yuna didn't care about Marianne, she just want Calix 
to watch her, watch her shove his huge hard cock appear, and disappear in her mouth. Calix tapped 
her head, but he immediately crumpled her hair which caused Yuna to cum so hard that her eyes 
turned white. Calix was so rough and she loves him so much.

She didn't feel any pain, she felt pleasure instead. She didn't care if Calix pulled all her hair, as long 
as Calix loves her, she didn't care about anything. 

When Yuna finished cumming, she released his cock and panted, her saliva rolled down together 
with the pre-cum. That was the best orgasm she ever experienced. Though of course Calix was 
always the best person who could make her cum. Her eyes were teary, looking up at him. 

She was panting as her saliva run down her neck, her cheeks had spits making it so hot. Calix felt 
proud that Yuna became a mess like this because of him. 



Calix turned to Marianne and she flinched. This gaze, this was the gaze that Calix had when he took 
her first time. The abyss-like eyes, as if his eyes were endless darkness. Marianne gulped, she felt 
like there was something running down her legs, she was so wet.

She remembered, this is the person who tossed her all around, ravaging her body to his satisfaction, 
leaving her breathless, covered with sweat, and her skin reddened because of the arduous actions. 
Marianne could never forget it. The drops of soda fell on the floor, she lost control over them. 

She tried to step back but her legs couldn't move, she was afraid and excited at the same time. She 
averted her gaze, she didn't know what would happen if she looked into his eyes. 

"Look at me."

Yet Calix commanded her and he approached her. Marianne tried to escape but a strong hand caught 
her. 

"I said look at me."

He said with a heavy voice.

Left with no choice, Marianne looked at him, just as she expected, she lost her strength. Calix 
pulled her towards him and Marianne lost her chance to escape. 

"We both know that you're never going to leave this place without tasting my cock."

Calix grinned and Marianne nodded, hypnotized by his powerful presence. Her hormones were 
telling her to submit to him, to give her body to Calix. To get fucked till she screamed so crazy. 

She forgot her so-called mission: to seduce Calix. It was the other way around. All she wanted right 
now was to have sex with him. 

The curse(blessing) of female Elves was resurfacing. Just like her predecessors, Marianne could 
never escape this predicament and she would succumb to Calix's big girthy rooster. She would 
become a slave, a fucktoy, and happy to be used by a manly Ogre. 



Calix grinned and kissed her sweet lips. Marianne shuddered and closed her eyes, drowning in 
Calix's influence.

Chapter 164

Elves were known for being the protectors of the forest, the noble people who were loved by nature. 
Naturally, they were proud of their lineage and they have the tendency to act high and mighty, 
especially the Dark Elves. Elves always have this idea in their brains that they were the best species, 
which was kind of right, in a way. Because Elves were close to perfection, but of course it didn't 
mean that they were Gods. 

They were loved by nature, having the aspects of every concept such as Nature Elements, Light, 
Darkness, Fate, and others. They strongly believed that no one was above them. 

However, that's where Ogres come up with their monstrous cocks!! These gentle and good species 
had this huge and deadly weapon that could make them scream(in pleasure). Ogres were simple-
minded, they would follow their instincts. If a female Elf pissed an Ogre, it usually ended in a fuck-
fuck-fuck. 

Anyway, let's return to Calix and Marianne's. 

"Kneel."

Calix whispered, heavy, and commanding. Marianne swallowed hard and her knees lost their 
strength. She kneeled in front of him. When she gazed up, she found that Calix's hard standing shaft 
was over her head. 

She looked up and she smelled the strong scent of his cock. If Marianne was a hentai character, her 
pupils would definitely be heart-shaped right now. 

"Suck it."

Calix smirked, slapping his cock on her cheek. 

She gulped and opened her mouth. Her tongue came out and she started licking its head. She didn't 
know why she was doing this. Her mind was so fuzzy and she just wanted to go crazy, using this big 
cock. 



Marianne started jerking him using her two hands yet she couldn't wrap his cock at all. The head 
was still visible, Marianne didn't know what to do, so she started sucking his cock. She thought it 
would taste funny, but it was actually sweet. Not that it matters, his manly scent, his cock's flavor, 
Marianne would not hesitate to savor all of them. 

However, one person was not satisfied. Yuna glared at Marianne. 

"That's not how you suck a cock!"

She raised her voice and Calix looked at her. Calix chuckled. 

"Yuna, come here and teach Marianne how to suck a real cock."

"Yes, Calix!!"

Yuna smiled and teleported before them and pushed Marianne away. It didn't take long before 
Yuna's spits covered his cock up to the head down to the base. Yuna was doing the throat-fuck as if 
it was a walk in the park. Calix grunted but he didn't want to cum for now. 

Calix glanced at Marianne, she was staring at his spits-covered cock hungrily. Her mouth was 
watering. 

"Marianne."

With just one word, Marianne was astonished and she looked at Calix. 

"Come here."

Calix extended his hand, asking her to take it. Marianne's eyes trembles. She was relieved that Calix 
wanted her. 

So she grabbed his hand and Calix pulled her into him. She yelped but lips covered her mouth and 
she was dumbfounded. 



While Yuna was sucking his mighty rod, Marianne was kissing him. This was the best scenario. 

Marianne started taking her clothes, she took off Calix's long sleeves. 

"Don't take the sweater, I want to fuck you while wearing that."

"Y- yes."

She stuttered, her face blushing. 

"You know, you're cute when you're like that."

"S- shut up…"

Calix smiled and Marianne averted her gaze. Despite being teased, her heart was beating faster and 
she didn't hate it at all. 

"So… Who I'm gonna fuck first?"

Calix asked them. 

"Me! Me, fuck me first! Calix, I love you!"

Of course Yuna would fight for the first, she was the type who would speak her true feelings. 

As for Marianne, she wanted to raise her hand but she was too shy and proud to say that. She is an 
Elf, a High-Elf at that. She had to maintain her dignity, she won't beg for a cock!! Unless Calix said 
so…

"I see… How about you Mariane?"

"Me?"



She flinched, surprised that her name was called. 

"Yeah, you want Yuna to go first?"

"… You can do what you want. It's not that I care."

She was being a tsundere. 

"Hoh."

Marianne acted that she was not hungry for his cock, Calix raised his brow. As expected, it was fun 
seeing Marianne like this. No matter how much Marianne tried to hide it, Calix could see her 
scraping her legs. Her crotch was probably wet right now. He chuckled and turned to Yuna. 

"So be it, Yuna come wiggle your ass!"

"Yay!!"

Yuna started twerking her ass and Calix whistled, he definitely loved it. He smacked her ass just 
like how Will Smith slapped Chris Rock!

"No one will slap that ass, but I WILL!"

Marianne bit her lip. She watched as Calix started fucking Yuna gently until his hips began pacing 
up, Yuna cried in satisfaction as Calix grabbed both her hands and fucked her behind. Her twerking 
disappeared in the scene, instead, she met his cock in the middle, changed by Calix's powerful 
piston. 

Marianne didn't know what to do aside from grinding her legs. She wanted to touch herself but she 
couldn't show that behavior in front of Calix, she didn't want to be seen as a dirty woman. 

She hated that Yuna appeared and destroyed her plan. She wanted this night to be memorable, she 
wanted to steal Calix using her elegant beauty. But she didn't expect that a crazy pink-haired wench 
would show up and steal Calix's attention.



She glared at Yuna who kept moaning as if there was no other person in the room aside from her 
and Calix. 

"Yes, Yes, Calix ohhhh fuck me!!! Oohhhh aaahhh!!! Mmmm, I love this. More more. Fucke me 
more!! Aahhh!! Ah! Ah! Oh!"

Yuna screamed, her eyes lost their focus as her pupils rolled up. Nothing could be seen except for 
pleasure. She came as her body shuddered. She lost her strength and gently fell on the bed, her ass 
was twitching and red. She was undergoing the state of a tag called 'mind break'. She was chuckling 
"hehe".

"Now, you're next."

Calix approached Marianne, he was sweating and breathing deeply but it seemed that he was still 
not finished. After all, he still didn't cum. 

"C- Calix… what are you going to do…?"

Marianne looked up, her heart was palpitating. Calix was staring at her with a grin on his face, he 
was determined to own her. Marianne gulped and nodded her head. Perhaps wearing the Virgin 
Killing Sweater was the right decision. 

Chapter 165

Calix gently pushed Marianne to the bed. He slowly caressed her back and kissed her nape, the 
woman shuddered and held her breath. However, as Calix kept kissing her nape down to her chest 
and nipple, a sweet moan escaped from her mouth. She bit her lip, hoping that she could stop the 
embarrassment but--

"Yah!"

She moaned when Calix lightly bit her nipple, she wanted him to stop but not at the same time. 

"Calix… Aah!"



She tried to speak but Calix fondled her other breast instead. She didn't have a choice but to get 
eaten by the wolf. 

She was panting, laying on the bed where an adult guy was sucking and fondling her breasts. She 
didn't move at all but she felt so tired. 

Suddenly.

"Let's see what you got there."

Calix's hand reached her legs and it slowly moved into, her skin felt hot as his hand scraped by. She 
wanted to move but Calix's other hand embraced her, now she didn't have a way to escape, she 
didn't want to anyway. 

"Calix, n- no, it's dirty, don't touch-- Nhhggghh!"

"I see, so I'm right."

Calix chuckled, his hand touched her slit over her panties and he confirmed that she was wet. He 
inserted his two fingers in her pussy and there was no resistance at all because Marianne was 
already drenching wet. Perhaps her pussy was already aching and hungry for his cock. 

"See this?"

He raised his soggy fingers and Marianne's face blushed as she saw the liquid that came from her 
vagina. 

He looked at her but Marianne averted her gaze. She was embarrassed, she covered her face but 
Calix prevented her. Instead, he put his wet fingers in her mouth. 

"What do you think of your own taste? Does it taste good, hm?"

Calix teased her as his fingers invaded her mouth and attacked her tongue. 



Marianne wanted to deny it. However, she was struck by the taste. It was sweet and sour with a 
little hint of salt, like citrus. She didn't know if it was connected to her being an Elf but her juice 
tasted like fruit. Like, what the fuck?

"Answer me."

Calix commanded, staring at her intently. 

"… Ish tashte swiisshhh…"

She answered, but two fingers kept playing with her tongue so she didn't say it well. 

Calix laughed and kissed her forehead. 

"Good girl. Now show me your pussy."

"B- but--"

"Uh-uh, no buts."

She pursed her lips. Yes, she recalled the reason why she brought Calix into the mansion. She 
wanted to defeat Scarlett, but most of all, she wanted to steal Calix. To seduce him and make him 
crazy over her. Of course so that she became stronger. 

Now that Calix gave her a chance, she decided to use this situation to her advantage. 

"Okay~~"

She tried her best to act coy and sexy, it was sloppy to be honest. Calix was holding himself not to 
laugh. 

She slowly took off her panties, she thought she looked sexy but her trembling shoulders betrayed 
her. She didn't look sexy, she looked cute and innocent. As if taking off her panties was a proud 
thing to do. 



She stared at Calix, waiting for his reaction. It took a second for Calix to realize that Marianne was 
waiting for his praise. 

"Ah, oh?… You're so sexy. I want to kiss you and bend you over, fuck you till you cum, and say my 
name while screaming."

"S- stop. That's too much! You beast!"

She cried and pouted. However, deep inside, she was happy that Calix praised her. 

By the way, everything that Calix said was a foreshadow. Because a few hours from now on, that 
scenario indeed happened. 

"Sorry, sorry. Now let's go with the main course."

"Kyah!"

Calix pushed her onto the bed, he started kissing her till she was breathless and panting for air. 

"Let's not forget that I'm horny too, so touch my dick."

Calix caught her hand and put it over his hard cock. Marianne already knew what to do, she started 
jacking him while Calix was fingering her pussy. 

"Ca- Calix! Nooo. S- stop!!! Mmmm!!"

Calix was brutally fingering her. Every time he shoved his fingers, splashes of juices came out, 
wetting the bed. Calix continued fingering her for five minutes straight that Marianne lost her 
strength to fight back, she even forgot to jack him. Her legs were twitching when Calix was over, 
she still didn't experience his huge monstrosity but she had already came a lot. 

Fluid oozed out of her used pussy, yet it was still not over. 



She was left broken and messed up, but it was just the beginning. Calix carried her up, holding her 
legs and butt where her pussy was wide open and grinding against his cock. 

"W- what are you doing? Drop me down!"

She protested. She was scared because Calix was holding her butt and she couldn't do anything 
except put her arms around his neck and trust him that he'll never let her go. Well, Calix is strong 
and he could carry her for hours without getting tired. 

"Well, if you say so."

Calix's strong pointing cock slowly entered her pussy until Marianne's vision got blurry, tears 
gathered around her eyes. She felt full and her inside felt hot, squeezing his cock. 

Her teary eyes glared at him, this guy just carried her then shoved his dick without any notice. 
However, instead of getting angry, she decided to kiss him. It's no use to get angry. 

"Mmmm…"

Calix started moving his hips and Marianne softly moaned. She didn't have anything to do but to 
accept him, his wide hands were gripping her ass and guiding her. Calix was standing straight while 
Marianne was tightly embracing him.

Marianne was scared and excited at the same time, she was clutching his neck, afraid that she would 
fall. Yet, Calix, the warmonger didn't care about that because he started humping his hips strongly. 

"Aahhhh hhhhaaahhh!!! Aaahhnnn!!! Nnggghhh!!"

Because Marianne didn't have a way to fight, all she could do was grab on him and let her pussy get 
plowed.

Her body was rocking on his hands while her crotch smacked against his balls. She looked down 
and found that Calix's big cock was covered by white stuff, her face reddened when she realized 
that she was the reason.



Her love juices coated his cock so well that their legs became slippery. 

Chapter 166

"Aannghhh--!! Naahhaahhh!! Guuuhhh!

A growl-like moaning could be heard together with the sound of flesh colliding. The clapping and 
the moaning were like a melody combined. 

Marianne's clutched the bed sheet as her ass cheeks were getting clapped. Calix was squeezing her 
left ass while hugging a girl beside him. That's right, Yuna came back from the brink of tiredness 
and joined the fun. 

They were kissing while Marianne was having a good dicking. She gasped as Calix's huge rod 
poked deep into her womb and she felt like her mind lost its purpose. She became blank and her 
body shuddered in the sweetness of sex. 

"Ah!"

Yuna grinned and slapped Marianne's other ass cheek, Marianne moaned and further cummed. She 
squeezed Calix's shaft and he grunted. 

It was a cycle, every action they did would be connected to one another. 

"Hhhaaahhh… Hhhaaahhh…"

Marianne was panting, she couldn't speak well anymore. All she did was scream guttural noises 
while getting ravaged by his manly cock. She was covered in sweat and other fluids. Her white pale 
skin had bruises all around and she was extremely exhausted. Her blonde hair was wet and lost its 
vibrant, or perhaps gained another kind of vibrant, vibrant of sex. 

As for her Virgin Killing Sweater, Calix tore the dress because he wanted to leave kiss marks on her 
body. Marianne didn't protest, she didn't have the strength to. So Calix easily tore the sweater and 
put a lot of marks on her breasts and neck. She had to wear clothes that could cover her up to her 
neck to hide these marks.



Despite being smashed for hours, Marianne felt like she would meet the God ol' Lord of Heaven 
after this, but there was happiness in her cries.

"Ugh-- Gahhaa…"

Calix kept plunging his cock deep into her gushy used pipe. Perhaps she would have a hard time 
walking after this session. But it didn't matter, because it felt so good. 

She bit her lip, her eyes lost their focus and her instincts were the only thing remaining, the instinct 
of a horny female Elf. 

"More… More!! Aahhh!"

"Shut up, don't tell me what to do! I'm the boss here!"

"Aaahhh!!"

Calix said and jabbed her womb strongly that Marianne screamed with her eyes wide open. 

"Bark!"

"Mmmm-- Ahhh!"

Calix smashed her again and her body shuddered.

"I said bark!"

"… Arf, arf!"

Our noble Elf was turned into a dog-speaking sex slave, sasuga hentai protagonist. Marianne 
understood that it was humiliating but she was betrayed by her body. Her mouth came with these 
words and started barking like a dog while Calix was fucking her. 



"Arf arf!!"

Marianne was on her arms and knees, keeping her ass raised, and rest her head and arms on the bed. 
She was getting smashed in this position. 

"Not fair! Me too! I want to bark too!"

Yuna, on the side, pouted at Calix, she wanted to have sex too. Calix nodded and squeezed her 
booba, Yuna moaned and closed her eyes. 

"Okay, let's fuck."

"Yay!"

Yuna was happy, just like an innocent child. Calix pulled his cock out of Mariann's sloppy pussy, 
Marianne even cummed when Calix took it out. This meant that her pussy was so sensitive right 
now. Her gaping hole was spurting white stuff, some rolled on her legs while most landed on the 
bed. 

"Why did you put it out?"

Marianne still wanted to continue. So she looked at Calix who was kissing Yuna and guiding her 
body, Yuna bent over and raised her ass. 

"Shut up, don't annoy us!"

Marianne gritted her teeth, she wanted to have sex but this pink-haired girl disturbed her again. She 
glanced at Calix who inserted his cock inside Yuna. Yuna gasped and turned her head to him, they 
started kissing again. 

"… I'm sorry."

Marianne averted her gaze. She didn't know why but she felt like this was the moment to say this. 
Because she understood that Calix would be greatly affected once she said it.



"I'm sorry for hurting you back in the past…"

She said it, she threw the bomb. There were tears in her eyes. She didn't know if they were real or 
fake, but it didn't matter. Because Calix turned to her, with heat blazing gaze. It seemed that she 
caught his attention. 

"What did you say?"

Marianne averted her gaze, wiping the tears in her eyes. 

"I said I'm sorry. I know that I'm the reason why you have that scar on your chest. I hurt you. I feel 
guilty about that, that I can't sleep at night. I'm truly sorry."

She was not lying, she couldn't sleep these days. Sometimes she remembered the moments when 
she hurt him, it ached her heart. She wanted to slap her past self. She started sobbing, her body 
trembled. Her mind was in turmoil. 

"I'm sorry for hurting you-- kyah!"

"Don't ever say that again."

Calix approached her and kissed her hungrily. He sucked her tongue, attacked her mouth until 
Marianne felt fuzzy, and stopped crying. 

"You think you can easily say that? Nope, you have to pay for it."

"How?"

"Of course, using your body."

Calix was staring at her greedily and angry at the same time. Marianne triggered his madness. She 
was lying on the bed, panting, her chest heaved up and down. 

"I'm sorry Yuna, I have to teach this bad girl some lessons."



"Tch, fine. But I will join too."

Yuna scoffed but she helped Calix to torture Marianne using pleasure. 

That night, Marianne had an orgasm many times. Yuna and Calix kept pleasuring her body till her 
eyes lost their vitality and she moved based on what they wanted. 

She got fucked in different ways, even her butthole didn't escape the torture. Unlike Scarlett who 
used lube, Calix only used his saliva to lube her asshole then he immediately inserted it. Marianne 
cried at first but she started liking it later on. 

After all, no matter what Calix does, Marianne would like it.

From that very moment, Marianne decided that she would have Calix. She didn't care about Scarlett 
anymore, she didn't want revenge or competition. All she wanted was Calix. She genuinely loved 
Calix. 

Tears rolled on her face as she whispered these words. 

"Calix, I love you."

She cried and swallowed her groan when Calix started fucking her vigorously. In the end, Marianne 
closed her eyes and had an orgasm for the last time. She didn't care about his reply, she planned to 
steal him after all. 

Chapter 167

The bright rays of the sun flash across the room as the window was wide open, probably because 
Calix had sex with Marianne on the window where they watched the surrounding area while her red 
ass cheeks got clapped thoroughly. 

"Nnn…"



Marianne groaned as she stretched her body, she sat up and rubbed her eyes. Her body was aching 
all over but the sense of satisfaction radiated in her. The kiss marks, bite marks, and bruises could 
be seen, which was kind of hot. It showed how her pale white body was conquered. 

Marianne yawned and looked around, but when she found Calix and Yuna sleeping beside her, her 
eyes widened and she almost screamed. She covered her mouth and glanced at Calix who was 
hugging her waist. He was topless and probably under the bedsheet he was not wearing anything 
too. 

She bit her lip and her face blushed in embarrassment. She recalled what happened last night, she 
couldn't believe that she did that. She screamed that she loves him, god she wanted to die!!

She hid her face and squirmed like a worm, which was cute and embarrassing. Her legs ached. On 
top of that, she recalled that Calix was fucking her the whole time. She remembered how her body 
went from different positions, she didn't know that she could bend her body like that. She learned 
that there were hundreds of positions she could do while having sex. 

'Why, why why why!!'

She was asking herself, but she already knew the answer. She had sex with Calix, to be precise, she 
had a threesome with Calix and the pink-haired girl named Yuna. 

She didn't know how she crossed that line. She planned to steal Calix, she didn't have any intention 
of having an intimate relationship with Yuna at all. Yet… They kissed!!

Yes, Calix commanded both girls to kiss each other because it was hot. 

The girls who were horny and under the influence of pleasure started making out and kissing. Calix 
was invigorated and he started fucking them crazily. 

Indeed, she didn't know why she did that. She wanted to die. 

She is a High-Elf, she is a noblewoman chosen by nature. She shouldn't have done that. Yet because 
of Calix, and because of her hazy mind, she started doing things that she didn't use to do. 



Did she regret it? Slightly. But if Calix asked for it again, Marianne understood that she would 
follow his command. Because she loves Calix no matter what. 

"Ugh…"

Next to her, Calix weakly opened his eyes and looked around. He confirmed that he was indeed in 
another room and the things he did last night were real. It means that he fucked Marianne and put 
his semen in her baby-making tank. 

He glanced at Marianne who was flinching because she found that Calix was awake. Her face was 
bright red and even her long pointy ears stiffened. 

"G- Good morning."

She greeted him, but she couldn't look at his face so she just looked in another direction. 

"Hm, good morning."

Calix chuckled and moved his hand that was on her waist. 

"Calix what are you doing-- ah!"

She yelped because Calix squeezed her aching leg. She received a lot of smashing last night that she 
couldn't move well. 

However, Calix just casually stretched his body and stood up. It appeared that he was not tired at 
all, as if this kind of stuff was normal. Well, Calix has a strong body because of his Ogre lineage.

"Looks like the bite marks I did are still visible."

"!!!"



He smirked when he looked at her breasts, there were some lovely bite marks that could invoke 
animalistic lust. Marianne immediately covered her body with the bedsheet. Now that she regained 
her rationality, she realized that showing her naked body was a sin. 

She glared at Calix, pouting cutely.

"What? You want me to put another set of bite marks."

"C- Calix you stupid pervert!!"

She screamed at him and threw a pillow but Calix caught it easily. 

"…Nm, shut up, I'm still sleeping."

Yuna mumbled and returned to sleep. 

Marianne and Calix decided to be quiet because they didn't want to wake her. Disturbing a person 
when they are sleeping is a great crime. 

Anyway, the two of them stood up to eat some breakfast. It was good that Marianne prepared 
everything so they didn't have to go outside. Microwave and Mini-refrigerator were there too. 

While Marianne was looking around, she found the remnants of the sweater that Calix tore. She 
blushed as she remembered how Calix growled and started battering her vigorously while tearing 
her dress. 

'Oh my God, I feel like I'm going crazy. I don't know why my heart is beating like this whenever I 
remember those scenes… Calix is indeed a man. No, he's a man among men. Particularly down 
there.'

She was mesmerized by how a big thing like that entered her small fragile body. Yet it didn't hurt, it 
felt good instead. Like her brain would melt and she would forget about everything. 

That was the best sensation of all. 



She coughed when she realized that she started to become crazy over this guy. 

'… Marianne, don't be fooled. You have to remember that you only want to steal him because of his 
power. Nothing else.'

Ah, this woman is still using that excuse. Perhaps she needed another good fucking so that she 
could be honest with herself. Let's not forget that she confessed her love last chapter while getting 
pounded. 

"Do I have a chance?"

"Hm? What are you talking about?"

Calix tilted his head, confused by what she asked. 

"Nothing… Hmmph!"

She scoffed and turned her head away. She couldn't say that she wanted to know if she had a chance 
to win his heart. She was afraid to know. 

"This woman… Maybe you need another session."

Calix clicked his tongue and approached her. He understood that Marianne would only be honest 
whenever there was a cock in her. 

"W- wait, Calix, I'm still eating-- Mmmm."

"Then why don't you eat this cock, it's still piping hot."

He smirked and pinched her nipples, Marianne cried and glared at him although she didn't stop him. 

In the end, they had sex where Marianne was sitting on his lap, bouncing her ass like there was no 
other day while they were eating borgir. 

Chapter 168



"Um… Sir?"

The male cashier glanced at the guy who was buying things in the grocery store. Their store was 
wide and had varieties of products but the cashier didn't expect that he would witness something 
like this. 

"Yes?"

The guy tilted his head, he didn't know why the cashier was looking at him with confusion. 

"Are you sure you want to buy these things?"

The cashier asked, just to be sure. 

"Yeah, let me do this. I'm a millionaire."

The guy grinned and placed the dozens of tissues and a bottle of high-class lotion. 

The cashier gulped while looking at the tissues and lotion. As a male, the cashier understood these 
two combinations. 

Even the people who were waiting in line looked at the guy with a questionable gaze. 

Yet the guy was not affected by their gaze. Instead, the guy smirked and put other items on the 
counter. The guy added four eggplants and a box of  0.1 magnum condoms. 

"Crazy…"

The people gasped and even the cashier admitted that this guy was above all. He is a sigma. 

"No, I'm not crazy, I'm a millionaire."



The guy didn't stop with that, he decided to use his trump card!!

[Trump Card Activate!!!]

Calix placed an onahole on the counter!!!

"Waaahhh!! My eyes!!!"

"He's crazy!!"

"How can he do that!!??"

"It's over 9000!!]

"Lezgoooo!!! That's what I've been waiting for, that's what's all about!! Wooooo!!"

People started screaming when Calix put the eye dirtier! This guy was not afraid and directly 
bought an onahole in broad daylight. He's a master! 

"S- sir, this is your receipt."

The cashier's hands were trembling while giving the receipt. He couldn't believe that he would meet 
a sage in this place. 

Calix just shrugged, grabbed his items, and walked away as if everything was normal. After all,

"I'm a millionaire."

Women who glanced at him turned red, they couldn't believe that there is a guy like him. A guy who 
is not afraid of what the people might say. 



Calix was just wearing flip-flops and shorts that reached only his legs, where his knees and leg hair 
could be seen. Furthermore, he only had an undershirt(sando) and a baseball cap. He looked like a 
jobless person but he radiates hotness. He is a hunk no matter what he wears. 

"Oh my god, is that the newest version, iPhone 10!? It's so big!!"

"That's what she said."

When Calix left the grocery store, he looked around and found that there were cars parked in the 
parking lot. Not that it matters. 

After all, 

"I'm a millionaire."

He said and took out his phone. He dialed a number and a sweet voice talked to him. 

Calix smiled and said his location. He sent a picture just to make it easy. Yuna needed an image to 
create a portal to the said place. 

In just a second, a round portal manifested in front of the grocery store, and people who witnessed it 
were aghast and shocked. Some started taking some pictures, Calix waved his hand at them and 
entered the portal. Then, the portal disappeared as if nothing happened. 

"Calix!!"

Yuna jumped on him and hugged him strongly. Of course Calix gave her a breathless kiss till Yuna 
panted when their lips parted. 

"Calix can we--"

"Sorry Yuna, I promised Scarlett that I'll reserve my time for her."

"Tch."



Yuna clicked her tongue. As expected, Scarlett was the last boss. Once she spoke something, Calix 
would obey it no matter what or how. 

"What about these?"

Yuna asked about the items that Calix bought. 

"Oh this, Scarlett said that she wanted to do some kinky stuff."

"No fair! I want it too! You can use my ass or mouth, I want to join!"

Yuna had a tantrum like a spoiled girl and Calix found it cute. However, Calix won't be fooled. 
Yuna tried this technique a lot of times, she succeeded most of the time but she failed right now. 
Because Calix is tough to crack especially if Scarlett is related. 

"Scarlett wants to have some alone time with me."

"Mou!"

Yuna pouted and left angrily. She knew that Calix would never grant her wish whenever he was like 
this. Scarlett is indeed the hardest one. 

"Please be careful!"

Calix said to her. He shrugged and started walking to meet Scarlett. However, on his way, he met 
Kimberly who was reading some documents. 

"Hi, Calix!"

Kimberly walked faster and greeted him. Calix kissed her forehead and Kimberly shyly smiled. She 
fixed her glasses and glanced at the items that Calix bought. 

"What is this for...?"



Kimberly wanted to ask if the items were for her but she already knew the answer. Kimberly sighed 
and admitted that Scarlett was stepping up. She wanted to try some of these toys but Scarlett took 
the lead. Anyway, Kimberly had her share last week so she was not jealous. 

Just like she planned, Kimberly and Calix had a one-week vacation on a private island that 
Kimberly acquired. They were naked all the time while strolling on the beach, they played and 
fucked around. When they returned, both of them became tan and they laughed at each other. 

'I know when to attack and when to retreat. I have my time, so let's give Scarlett hers. Although I'll 
retaliate stronger.'

Ah, our calculative girl is indeed frightening. 

"Ah, before I forgot."

Calix took out something from his pocket. It was a ticket. 

"This is a lotto ticket?"

"Yup."

Calix nodded. 

"But I thought you already won?"

Calix won the lottery last two days ago. He won 69, 696, 969 million dollars and it was tax-free. 

"Yeah, so I'm thinking of giving it to you."

"Why me? I'm already rich."

"Well about that."



Calix scratched his head. 

"I found that the C- Series Battle Suit is worth 20- 25 million and I feel guilty so I decided to give 
you that as a gift-- hey, why are you looking at me like that? Hey!"

"I don't need this."

Kimberly returned the ticket to Calix and started walking away with a grumpy expression. She 
scoffed and left Calix alone in the hallway. 

"... What did I do wrong?"

Well, Calix is a millionaire.

Chapter 169

"Calix you stupid… Do I look like I gave the battle suit because I want something in return? No, I 
gave it to you because I want to."

Kimberly murmured and her face looked sad. She fixed her glasses and sighed in defeat. She started 
reading the documents on her table. They were about the Vindicators who wanted to apply for the 
new special team under General Andreas Romoel. 

Kimberly blushed thinking of an idea. 

"B- but of course, I will not deny if Calix gives me a kiss instead or a hot piping cock…"

Let's be real here, these girls were addicted to Calix's big girthy cock that their minds would easily 
affect. Even Kimberly who had a good brain couldn't resist kneeling to give Calix a blowjob. 

"Fufu, I can use this situation to negotiate with Calix to have some steamy sex with me."



She giggled and started reading the documents. As expected, everything that Kimberly did was 
calculated. She was acting grumpy so that Calix would be sweet to her. Girls, they are frightening 
creatures. 

………  

……  

…

"Let's see… Ah."

Calix recalled where they would meet. 

Calix earned over 100 million dollars within a week. Calix was happy about it but not enough to 
make him jump in joy. After all, Calix already had a billion dollars in his bank account. 

Kimberly kept her promise and sent him the money. Sometimes cash, but most of the time through 
bank transfer. When Calix checked his bank account, his face became pog because he realized that 
his account had a lot of zeros. 

His net worth was so big that Calix didn't know where to spend it. He was thinking of giving his 
girls some money but they were already rich, even Yuna became wealthy because of the money she 
received from the military. It seemed like she was treated with great importance. 

So Calix decided to give some money to Lou who was studying at Horvart University in Junian. Of 
course he only gave her a couple of thousand, any person might have a heart attack if someone 
casually gave them a million dollars. 

"I'm thinking of bribing the officers who facilitate the Vindicator Exam but I found that I actually 
passed the exam without a problem."

It was definitely related to his Luck.



Being a Vindicator means that the government approved the TA users to use their Term Attributes in 
public, but it had to be a proper reason such as their TA were related to construction or healing. 

Scarlett and Marianne took a Vindicator examination before they were allowed to use their powers 
in the military. They were Vindicators since their high school. 

As for Yuna, she easily got the license because of her achievements. 

"I thought I'll have a hard time but it was actually pretty easy."

Calix heard that the exam was difficult but he didn't feel any hardship at all. He just used different 
weapons and easily passed the exams. That's why Calix thought of bribing the facilitators. Bribing 
was not a proud thing to do but Calix didn't care. He fought a lot of thugs in the past and pride 
didn't help him, so he used dirty tactics instead. He would only keep his pride if it's related to his 
loved ones. 

Calix was qualified to enter the military and he was immediately put on his father's special team. 
But to be honest, the special team was nothing but a lie. 

'It's more like my team… Because all of my girls are members of the special unit.'

Yes. Scarlett, Kimberly, Yuna, and Marianne. These girls voluntarily joined the unit just for him. In 
the first place, the only reason why the team was created was because of Yuna and Calix. Kimberly 
thought of a plan so that Yuna and Calix won't be affected by the politics. 

"Although Kimberly is not a full-fledged member… Maybe I have to talk to her later. I know I 
made a mistake."

He grimly smiled. He realized that he hurt her feelings, so he planned to make up for it. 

The special unit was just getting started and Kimberly didn't have a choice but to pick some 
members. It would be suspicious if they didn't choose some soldiers in the other divisions. 

While walking, Calix found two people talking in the distance and Calix immediately hid in the 
corner. His senses became much sharper after months of deciphering his Term Attribute. 



'Scarlett and Marianne are talking.'

While Calix was hiding, Scarlett and Marianne were confronting each other. 

"What's your intention?"

Scarlett crossed her arms while staring at Marianne. As the woman who strongly loves Calix, 
Scarlett wanted to protect him from bad guys. 

And Scarlett wanted to confirm if Marianne is a bad guy. She knew how dangerous Calix's power 
is, it could make anyone stronger and luckier once they experienced his sexual gland. 

Yuna just recently became a 2nd Advanced. 

Kimberly could read and create Runes. 

And Scarlett herself became the youngest person who became a 2nd Advanced. 

So she knew the danger if people found out about Calix's Term Attribute. They would go crazy just 
to get him. That's why Scarlett wanted to know if Marianne would betray Calix. Because she would 
end her life in this place if that's her plan. 

However,

"W- what are you thinking. I- it's not that I like him or anything! He's too lowly to be my 
boyfriend... B- but, if he begged me, maybe I can accept his proposal. Maybe I will accept him as 
my husband."

Marianne said while averting her gaze and her face blushing. Only stupid people would believe that 
she had hidden intentions. Marianne was just acting like a tsundere. 

"Tch."



Scarlett clicked her tongue. She was waiting for a bad thing but it seemed like Marianne was in love 
with Calix. 

'What a waste, I'm planning on burning her face at least once. Well, maybe I will have some chance 
later on.'

Girls, they are frightening creatures. 

Chapter 170

Calix held his breath while listening to their conversation. He knew that these two girls had high 
egos and even Calix had a hard time pacifying them, especially Scarlett. Calix understood that he 
could never say no if Scarlett asked for a favor. That's why he decided to wait. 

"Hmmph! Don't think that you win. I still have a chance. No, we still have a chance."

Marianne raised her lips, crossing her arms. She used the tactic of scaring her. However, Scarlett's 
expression didn't change. 

Why? Because she was not afraid. She gained rivals but one thing didn't change. Calix still loves 
her. As long as that aspect didn't change, Scarlett had the upper hand. 

"You can say what you want. It will not affect me."

Marianne bit her lip and glared. She started walking away. Talking to Scarlett was making her mad. 
She brushed her hair up and looked at her for the last time but Scarlett prevented her from leaving. 

"Wait, are you not going to say something? You can't leave this place without apologizing."

The atmosphere heated up and even breathing became hard. The air was hot that it could burn the 
throat. 

"Whom? To you? Hah!"

Yet Marianne was not affected. She casually scoffed. 



"Why would I apologize to you?"

She narrowed her eyes, pointing her finger at Scarlett. Scarlett should be the one to apologize 
because of slapping her but Marianne was not petty to ask for that. She would defeat her and crush 
her heart instead. Something that Scarlett would never recover from.

"Not me. You have to apologize to Calix. I know what you did to him. The fact that you hurt him 
irked me so bad… I'm giving you a chance, apologize now."

"This woman…"

Marianne gritted her teeth, glaring dangerously. Her heart was pounding so fast, she was offended 
because she knew what she did to Calix. She was actually relieved that Calix forgave her, she knew 
her sin. Perhaps Calix is the good guy all along. 

"Say it--"

"I already did it."

"What?"

"I said I already did it. Okay, I apologized to him last week ago …"

She blurted out but her cheeks were bright red. Marianne recalled that moment. She apologized 
while kneeling in front of him, Calix slapped her face using his huge angry bird. Marianne was 
intoxicated and begged for forgiveness, of course while licking his cock. 

Calix easily forgave her but he pumped his seeds into her mouth. It was one of the best forgiveness 
that she ever received. 

"I see."

"Can I go now?"



"… Don't hurt him again. Or else--"

"I will never hurt him. Fufu, but I will hurt you."

Marianne started walking away. The painting in the hallway was melting and even the floor was 
scorching hot. But Marianne was not afraid, with every step she took the floor turned to ice. 

As expected, they were both dangerous. No one wanted to back down. Harmony was the last thing 
that could happen if love was related. After all, love is a desire, and desire is greed. So these girls 
were greedy to have Calix. Some said that women love competition, perhaps that was right. 

Scarlett sighed and the atmosphere turned to normal. 

'That woman, she is still stubborn. I swear, I hate her. Maybe I should have slapped her more and 
stronger.'

To be fair, Scarlett slapped her enough, she put her strength in those slaps too. So asking for more 
was already too much.

"Anyway, I don't want to think about her anymore."

She turned around and glanced at the corner, where a person was hiding his presence. 

"Calix come out."

"Hehe, so you found me."

Calix came out, he wiped the sweat on his forehead and greeted Scarlett. 

"Hi, Scarlett."

"Did you miss me?"



"Of course!!"

He nodded and Scarlett approached him. She checked his body and confirmed that he was fine, she 
gave him a peck.

"Are you okay?"

"Yeah, I'm Lucky remember?"

"Good, now let's go."

"To where?"

"To my room, I'm already horny."

Her pussy was so wet.

Scarlett pulled him to her room and she started taking her clothes. She looked at the stuff that Calix 
bought and she decided to use them.

This time, Scarlett was the one in control. She tied Calix's arms. She was stroking his cock using the 
onahole that he bought while they were kissing. Then, Scarlett used her mouth to put the condom 
on. 

They were fucking like rabbits. 

………  

……  

…



Marianne use her connections and easily transferred to the special unit. She talked to her uncle, the 
Clan Leader of the Francine Clan. She said that there was a strong chance that her cultivation would 
further increase if she was transferred into the special unit. 

She showed her strength and her uncle was convinced. Her uncle was happy that Marianne became 
a bonafide 2nd Advanced. After all, her uncle didn't have much hope for his children. So he 
immediately talked to General Andreas to put Marianne on the special team. 

Andreas didn't have a choice. He was still new in his position. Besides, transferring one soldier was 
not that hard nor illegal, Marianne is a strong Vindicator too. 

Although Andreas was worried that the special unit would become nothing but a harem and a fuck-
fest. So Andreas gave them a mission. 

He sent them to the Port of Aoneon to help the soldiers to fight the Aberrants. 

.........

......

...

A few days later. 

"Hm? Are you Nikki Stringendo?"

"Y- yes."

The woman squealed.

Kimberly raised her head, looking up at the giant woman before her. Kimberly had examined every 
soldier who applied to the special unit. Kimberly found that Nikki Stringendo was the best 
candidate. She is not a TA user but she has a strong physique. Furthermore, because of her height of 
7'2 feet. Kimberly believed that Calix won't be attracted to her. 



That's why Kimberly chose her as the new member of the special unit. 

"Can you repeat it? I can't hear your voice."

Kimberly asked, she was not used to look up like this. Calix is tall but Nikki is a freaking giant. 

'7-footer woman is definitely a no-no.'

Kimberly convinced herself that Calix won't be attracted to a big woman like Nikki. 

Nikki fidgeted when Kimberly looked at her and she opened her mouth again.

"I'm Nikki Stringendo, from the fifth battalion."

She said weakly. 

"Huh? Can you repeat it again?"

Kimberly fixed her glasses, narrowing her eyes. 

"I- I'm Nikki Stringendo from..."

She said but her voice was so weak. 


	Only Fuel 161

