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Chapter 25

After some minutes of choking Scarlett with his big dick, they started making out again. Calix 
didn't hesitate to kiss her, in fact, he was thirsty for her lips. At this moment, Scarlett confirmed that 
Calix did love her. 

'They say heartless men don't like kissing girls after girls give a head…'

If you don't kiss her after a bj, then you're a dickhead. And Calix was not that kind of man, he's a 
real chad. A tequila for you my friend.

Calix didn't hesitate to kiss her. Actually, he didn't even think about it. All he wanted was to taste 
her lips. They shared a long passionate kiss until they broke apart and looked at each other's eyes. 
They both reflected their faces. They were looking intently and they forgot about the outside world. 
Right now, they were living in their world.

Scarlett was feeling hot, she licked her lips and realized that there was pubic hair close to her 
mouth. Her eyes immediately widened and wiped it out, she was embarrassed. It seemed like she 
caught some of Calix's pubic hair when the man lost his control and started pushing his cock deep 
in her throat. She was blushing as she wiped her red lips.

'Gosh, this is embarrassing.'

Now, she couldn't look straight to Calix. However, Calix raised her chin and made her look at him. 
She realized that Calix didn't care about it, he just wanted everything about her. She smiled and they 
started making out again.

They both sat on the bed and tasted each other. Their salivas mixed as their tongue intertwined. 
They didn't want to stop this moment. Calix's hands started caressing her back, he was touching her 
and moved his hands downwards. Scarlett felt his hands on her ass, they were cupping them. 
Scarlett moaned and Calix attacked her with more deep kisses.

"Mmm, Calix… Aahhh… I want it."



Scarlett said the magic word that could make any man crazy. And as of now, Calix was going down 
the void and perhaps lose himself. 

Calix grabbed her waist and firmly place her on his lap. Scarlett felt the giant pole poking and she 
was excited about it. 

'I want this, I want this dick inside me... I want this to fill me up, just like last time... I wanna lose 
myself in his arms.'

Scarlett was feverish that she even moved by herself. Calix saw her expression and helped her. He 
positioned her on his cock, and looked into her eyes. He was waiting for her approval. 

Scarlett saw that Calix was losing himself too, she smiled seductively and nodded. 

"Y- You can. I want it, I'll be fine."

She said like a thirsty woman that she is.

Calix slid his huge rod into her tight slit. It was wet, Scarlett gasped as she closed her eyes feeling 
his thing inside her. She didn't have the effect of aphrodisiac but it was surprisingly smooth, she 
thought it would going to be a little bit painful but no, it was so good. Perhaps her pussy easily 
accepted Calix because of what happened last time. Her hole was now molded to accept him. 

She weakly cried and grabbed Calix's hair. His dick was still not completely inside her and she was 
eager to have it. When Calix saw that Scarlett looked fine(in bliss), he then dropped her onto his 
massive cock. Her pussy slapped against his balls and Scarlett passionately screamed on top of her 
lungs. She moaned happily as she fully had him inside her.

With that, the job was now easy. Calix started to smash his big shaft in and out of her drenching wet 
pussy, he did it as hard as he could. He wanted to start slow but Scarlett's cries and begging 
expression were so good to see. He decided to go with smashes. He was gritting his teeth as he was 
feeling good too.

In just a few minutes, Scarlett kept coming multiple times. The Luck was affecting their sex which 
caused them to be in bliss. She curled and trembled as she violently came. Scarlett was screaming 
each orgasm and Calix loved to hear it forever.



They were both moving their hips to feel more of each other. Perhaps the whole dorm heard 
Scarlett's cries but they were too high in pleasure to think about it. 

"Ooohh, please please Calix!! Pleeaaase don't stop!! Aahhh!!"

The sounds of Calix's balls slapping her tiny pussy echoed in the room. 

……….

……

…

Yeah, Calix still has pubic hair. He didn't shave since he didn't have any reason. But after this, he 
will start to.

……….

……

…

After four sessions with breaks between here and there, the couple was now lying on the bed 
exhausted but satisfied. They were breathing hard as they had just recently finished another round. 

"I… I have to clean you. Let me take a towel."

Calix said as he tried to stand but Scarlett grabbed his arm and stopped him. She wanted Calix to 
stay close to him and feel his warmth.

"No, it's okay. Just stay here with me, I'm fine with that."

She shyly said as her ears were blushing. She couldn't believe that she was acting like this.

'Gosh we just have sex but I'm still shy… You dumb girl, why can't you act fierce whenever it's 
him?'



She asked herself. She always lost her facade whenever she saw him. Just like the time where Calix 
stumbled and landed in front of her. She was embarrassed at that moment. 

She would always show her true feelings whenever it was him. Her hatred, her lust, her sadness, she 
showed him a lot. She bit her lower lips, she was tired and just wanted to lay down.

Gulped

Calix saw her sexy reaction and swallowed hard. He couldn't believe that he had sex with a woman 
like her. He nodded and started touching her cheek. He leaned and kissed her sweet lips, Scarlett 
closed her eyes and let herself let loose. 

"Then do you want pizza? I have Hawaiian Pizza in the fridge."

Calix offered since he knew that they were both hungry. They spent almost all of their strength 
playing with fire. 

Scarlett's eyes brightened and immediately nodded as she loved Hawaiian Pizza.

"Let me heat it."

Calix chuckled and began walking towards the fridge. His back was wide and he was packed with 
hard muscle. 

Scarlett sat up and recalled how his body owned her. She was starting to heat up again.

'No… My body couldn't keep up if we do it again.'

Scarlett was actually shocked that she was the first to get tired. Calix had huge stamina and she lost 
to him. She was a Vindicator and she should have a strong physique but she was surprised that 
Calix beat her in terms of lasting in bed. 

'Still… It was so good.'



She smiled. Then, she remembered something in the past.

"Calix, I thought you hate pineapple on pizza?"

She raised her brow as she waited for his answer.

"Oh that. You see, it's actually good."

He replied, scratching his cheek and embarrassed. 

Scarlett's eyes widened and her complexion brightened. She realized that Calix started eating 
pineapple on pizza these three whole years that they didn't speak to each other. She realized that 
Calix didn't forget about her. 

Butterflies fluttered in her stomach as she smiled. She recalled that Calix didn't like Hawaiian pizza 
but here they are, going to eat one.

[This is how I pictured Scarlett]

[Red hair, red eyes, looked fierce but warm on the inside, especially for Calix.]
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