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"Grrr."

The men around him snarled like dogs after seeing what happened. Even though it was an accident, 
they could not accept that Calix had grazed Shoujo Ramune's breasts!

"I'm sorry for what I did."

He stretched out his hand and offered it to the Nine-Tailed Woman, but all he got was a glare. 

"Don't touch me, you filthy ape. I don't like Slap Soil guy."

"..."

She muttered weakly and only Calix could hear what she said. Shoujo Ramune stood up and 
straightened her dress, then smiled at him kindly. 

"It's okay, everyone makes mistakes."

She said it friendly, but her eyes burned with anger.

" For the record, I have no intention of doing that. It's just that you're running towards me."

Calix might have other things on his mind, but he was still aware of his surroundings. He was just 
walking when the woman bumped into him. He was innocent. 

"It's okay, everyone makes mistakes."

The woman repeated but with veins in her forehead. 



"I'm sorry."

Since Calix was the man, he finally had to apologize and bow his head. Shoujo accepted his gesture 
after he bowed and walked away without hesitation. Of course, she smiled at the people around her. 
Everything went back to normal, except for the glaring looks at Calix. 

"Tch! I can't believe he's acting like this after touching a goddess!"

"Damn it! It should have been me, not him!" Someone said, pounding their fists on the ground in 
frustration.

Calix listened to their grumbling, but his mind was on something else. 

'Strange, I feel like I didn't touch them at all.'

His elbow felt nothing as it brushed against the so-called breasts. He shook his head and ignored it. 
Calix and Shoujo were worlds apart. He was just a simple guy while the woman was an award-
winning actress. 

'Except for the fact that Lou and Shoujo are close, I have no connection with her. She will probably 
forget this incident easily.'

He thought and closed his locker. Then he went to his class and met his friends. 

However, when he entered the room, he noticed that they were staring at him as well. Even his 
friends and even Quandale Dingle were staring at him coldly. 

"Let me get this straight, I'm not an asshole."

He waved his hand. 

"Yes, you are! Your name is indeed Lucky!"



One of his buddies growled. 

"I'll only forgive you if you let me lick your elbow!" This sentence came from Quandale Dingle. 
Shoujo Ramune was his idol. 

"Hell no! That's disgusting!"

"At least let me touch it!"

"Back off! Stand the fuck up!"

Calix prepared for battle. 

But since they were buddies, they easily forgave Calix after they received a beating. They could not 
touch him anyway, he mastered martial arts and defended himself against them. 

After a few minutes of 'brawling', they stopped their stupidity and returned to their seats. Calix 
looked around and found Lou sitting with her friends. She looked at him for a second and smiled. 
His lips curled up and he greeted her with a smile as well. 

"Hey Calix, since we're talking about Shoujo Ramune. I heard that she actually had a relationship 
with First Prince Diane!"

"Really? I thought that was a rumor?"

"No, I heard that they were dating a year ago!"

"If you're talking about the time when they were found talking in a cafe, I think it's nothing more 
than a simple meeting. No romance at all."

The guys around him gossiped and Calix just shook his head. He didn't care about the beautiful 
woman. Speaking of beautiful women, Calix had a handful of them and he could fuck them every 
day if he wanted to. 



'I bet they would even quit their jobs just to be with me.'

He was immune to women's beauty because he had already taken many into his bed. 

.........

......

...

"This is strange... What is this feeling?"

Shoujo touched her chest and frowned. The guy who bumped into her earlier made her heart skip a 
beat. 

"Disgusting! Probably because I hate him. That's right!"

She retouched her makeup and convinced herself that Calix's touch was just a simple one. 

"I want to take my best friend Lou up north next time. Man, I already told her she can rest for at 
least a week, but she won't listen. I don't know what to do with this child."

Lou and Shoujo were classmates in archaeology just two years ago. The first time they talked to 
each other was when their seating arrangement was changed and they were seated next to each 
other. Lou was a timid and shy woman, and Shoujo didn't have a strong impression of her, until that 
important meeting... Since then, Shoujo and Lou have become friends. 

.........

......

...



"Okay class, I am going to give you a group project and this will be your final exam for the 
semester. Each group will have three or four members." 

Professor Fannie from the history class announced. Some students were happy to know that their 
final exam would not be a written exam. 

"Pick a number when I call your name. This is a random lottery that will determine who will be 
your members."

"Nice!"

"I hope I'll be with Lou or Oni, they're smart and can finish the project quickly."

"It's all about destiny, my friend."

"Exactly, I will pray to the goddess Amore to give me luck!"

"I thought the goddess Amore was the goddess of love? Why are you praying to her?"

"Better to be sure than to regret it later."

"All right, I will pray too!"

A few minutes later, the grouping was announced and everyone was staring at Lucky T. Tiko. 

They were jealous! The man really was Lucky!

"What a coincidence."

Calix greeted Lou Viola and Oni Chichi. That's right, the three of them became a group. The two 
smart students became Calix's group mates. The others were jealous of the result! Calix will 
definitely get a high grade on the final exam! 



"It should've been me! Not him!"

Some students pounded their fists on the ground.

Chapter 352

"The project is about the history of the Forest of Death and how it affects our land." The professor 
added after the grouping was complete. 

"Which means..."

"Just as you suspected, you will take a field trip to the border. But of course you will not enter the 
Forest of Death, that place is dangerous. What you'll do is interview soldiers and historians and 
come up with your own hypothesis... Although I think one of us has already made one."

As Professor Fannie said this, the students looked at Lou Viola, who was taking notes. Her studies 
were well respected by the faculty because her ideas were noble. 

However, few knew the exact information. The students only knew that Lou Viola was accepted 
into Horvart University because of the article she sent to the university. 

"This is the beginning of the semester, and I will not be giving any lectures or assignments. You can 
go now and plan your trip."

"Nice!"

The students happily left the classroom. Early dismissal of the class means more time to play 
around. 

"Um... Do you have free time after school?"

Oni Chichi mumbled and looked at them. She felt uncomfortable standing next to them after 
remembering what happened last time. She knew that Calix and Lou were close, at least from what 
she saw. 



"I don't have any work today." Lou acted normal. Maybe she was too focused on the project to see 
Oni's expression. 

"Cool, what about you Calix?"

"I have nothing to do today. My place is big and we can use it."

Calix remembered that Oni had a nasty roommate and Lou's place was quite small. So he decided to 
offer his place. 

"It's better than finding a place in the cafeteria or the restaurant."

Lou easily agreed. 

"Okay. Since everyone already knows Calix's place, let's meet at 5 pm."

The three quickly made a decision and planned their project. 

'I thought it was a practical project, but I can't believe it's still a written one.'

At least it was better than a written exam. 

As they parted ways, Lou paused when she noticed her phone vibrating. She realized that Calix had 
sent her a message. 

-- Meet me at my house at 4:00. I will prepare dinner for us.

It was an hour before the meeting time. Lou's face immediately turned red as she understood Calix's 
intention. Preparing dinner at 4 pm was too early, but Lou would not judge. Her body trembled 
slightly as she typed her reply. 

-- I will visit you at 3:30 and bring some dishes. I want to help you prepare dinner. 



She was nervous as she hit the send button. She was being shameless and she knew it. Still, she 
wanted to spend more time with Calix. She had missed him for a whole week. 

-- This is going to be great. Thank you.

She squealed as she read his approval. 

'I wonder what nice dish to cook? Oh, and I need to wear something nice. Luckily, I bought some 
lingerie last time... I can wear it for Calix.'

Her face was red as she walked, almost as if she had a fever - a love fever/lovesickness.

Still, the smile on her face was nice to see. 

.........

......

...

Calix bought ingredients to make sure they would have a nice meal. On his way out of the market, 
he noticed something amusing. 

'Is that Quandale?'

He saw his friend Quandale Dingle with some shady characters. They seemed to be talking about 
something and acting suspiciously. 

They are men and women who have a lot of tattoos and are smoking cigarettes.

Quandale was sweating as he talked to them. Calix could tell that he was really nervous.

His eyebrows furrowed as he saw Quandale follow the suspicious group into the dark alley. 



'Should I follow him?'

Quandale was a good person, and he was Calix's first friend when he set foot in this country. 

In the end, Calix decided to follow them. He placed the groceries in his spatial ring and entered the 
alley. 

"Let's see what they do."

But before he could even see what they were doing, a deafening scream shook the place. 

Calix was stunned, but he immediately regained his senses and rushed into the alley. His hand 
clutched his necklace in case something happened. 

His feet stopped in front of the dumpster and he was shocked to see a horrible scene. 

A naked woman was lying on top of a man. However, they were not having sex. The naked woman 
was devouring the man by eating his throat. Blood was gushing from his throat and he was 
struggling to breathe, but he was drowning in his own blood. 

"H- Help me..."

Unfortunately, the woman broke his neck and he died miserably. 

"Hiii--!!"

The others quickly ran away from them and fled the scene. 

'What is happening here? Is she a descendant of vampires? But I thought they only needed blood, 
not flesh.'

Scarlett loved to drink his blood, but the woman before him was like a hungry beast ready to kill 
anyone. She looked like a monster. 



Calix had no time to understand the situation. He found Quandale staring a few meters away. 

The woman was still busy devouring the man. 

"Quandale, we have to go!"

"Huh? Lucky?"

Quandale was still in shock and could not think clearly. Calix grabbed his shirt and pulled him away 
from the spot. They started running out of the alley. 

He didn't kill the woman because he didn't want to blow his cover. No one knows he was a spy. 
Besides, he didn't know those people, and he didn't feel bad about it. 

When they were far away from the place, Quandale gasped for breath and sat on the ground. 

As for Calix, he was only sweating, and he could still run another mile. 

"What happened there?"

"I-I don't know, the woman started acting crazy after she got undressed."

"What are you doing with them?"

"T-that's..."

Quandale didn't know what to say. It would be humiliating if he told the truth.
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Calix looked at him seriously and Quandale started to sweat. The pressure Calix was putting on him 
was too much for him.



Finally, he decided to say it, knowing that Calix wasn't the type to talk about someone's privacy. 

"... I was walking when they offered me something."

It was actually embarrassing. The shady people easily convinced him. 

He paused only to see that Calix was still staring at him. Quandale sighed and began to speak. 

"They asked me for money in exchange for sex. I'm a virgin, so when they talked to me, I was 
nervous and easily agreed. Now I don't know what to say."

He dropped his head, ashamed to look at Calix. He could not believe that he was telling his deepest 
secret, that he was a virgin. 

But instead of blaming Quandale, Calix patted him on the shoulder. 

"Don't worry, I won't tell anyone. Besides, it is not a sin to be a virgin. I respect you for it."

Calix was also a late bloomer, he lost his virginity when he was 18. He could even say that he was 
rap-ed. He never expected that his first time would be in an abandoned warehouse. He would never 
forget that experience. 

"So you don't have to be afraid."

He encouraged his friend.

"Really?"

"Come on man, I thought it would be worse. I thought you were going to buy drugs from them." 

"No, I will never try drugs or my dad will beat the shit out of me."



"But seriously. They are doing prostitution in the daylight and in an alley?"

This was the most bizarre. Prostitution was usually done in motels and bars. But these people were 
doing it in a public place. 

'I can say they are crazy or brave.'

Calix never had a bad opinion of prostitution. After all, he was thinking of using prostitution to 
solve his problem back then. He could not judge people based on their profession, because he knew 
that most of them hated their jobs as well. It's just that life forced them to do dirty work.

As they rested under the shade of the tree, they heard the sirens of police cars. They realized that the 
police were starting to do their job.  

"Quandale, promise me you will never do this again. Man, you got to respect yourself. You're a nice 
guy, I think someone will like you. Just take it slow."

"... Lucky, do you have a way to increase my rizz game?"

Calix chuckled when he saw Quandale's expression. Quandale was an innocent guy. 

"Well, if we're talking about attractiveness, I can give you some advice."

"Let me hear it."

"Go to the gym and wear something nice. Build up your confidence and people will start looking at 
you."

Calix wanted to add "luck," but he knew it was something he alone possessed. Unless Quandale had 
the same power he did. 

'We've known each other for almost half a year and I know he doesn't have Term Attribute.'

The Term Attribute was both a curse and a blessing. Calix knew how difficult it was to live with it.



'I need coitus every three days... If you think about it, my fuel is not that bad, it actually feels good, 
ahem.'

"I understand, but where can I find a clean gym? You know there are gyms that have dirty 
equipment and stinky place." He listened to Calix. 

"I know a nice place, I will send you the location later.

"Nice."

"Now you don't have to think about what happened earlier. The alley is dark and there is no camera, 
we can be sure that the police will not bother you."

Calix had strong senses. He realized that the reason those shady people used the alley as a sex 
dungeon was because there were no cameras in the place. 

"Thank God, I'm afraid my parents will scold me when they find out. My father used his connection 
to enroll me in Horvart, and I feel bad if I waste this chance."

"I know, you're too stupid to enter this place, so you probably used money just like me."

"Hey! I'm not stupid!"

"Yeah right."

The two laughed after a nice chat. When they confirmed that the police had cleaned up the crime 
scene, Calix and Quandale parted ways. 

Calix went back to his apartment. Of course, he never forgot the encounter. 

'Good thing I still have time to prepare.'

He glanced at his watch and noticed that it was 3:12. 



"Still, I wonder what kind of creature that woman was. I have never met a humanoid species that 
eats meat."

His experience in this country was getting serious. 

"Lou will be here any minute. I have to change into something nice."

Suddenly he had an idea and grinned. 

"Let's see how strong my rizz game is."

..........

......

...

A few minutes later, Lou was standing at his door, fidgeting and nervous. She made sure she was 
wearing something nice for Calix, she even put on some light makeup. Nothing much, just eyeliner 
and blush on.

'My face isn't that bad, is it?'

She checked her appearance with the front camera of her phone. She nodded when she saw her face, 
it was cute and lovely. 

Lou knocked on his door. 

When the door opened, Lou was surprised to see Calix wearing an apron. But under the apron, 
Calix was completely naked!

"Hi honey, do you want to take a shower, do you want to eat, or maybe... Do you want me?"



He said with a heavy, clear voice. 

Seduction! 

Lou was stunned and her face turned red. Right now, Calix was standing at the door with nothing 
but an apron covering his body. 

And Lou could see his ripped muscles! 

His body was a true creation of the gods!

Her heart was pounding like crazy! She was punched in the chest! 

"Y-yes!"

She didn't know what she was talking about, but she would say yes to anything Calix wanted. 
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Lou held back a squeal as her eyes scanned the man in front of her. Calix's toned side abs were not 
covered by the apron, and his thick arms and legs were like chiseled concrete. 

She swallowed her moan as she realized how sexy the man in front of her was. The dark hair that 
hung over half of his face was so sleek you wondered if he had oil on it. He also had broad 
shoulders and long arms. Lou couldn't believe he wasn't even wearing anything under that apron.

"M- May I enter?"

She stuttered. 

"Of course, but you have to answer my question first," he replied roughly but seductively. "What do 
you want?"



Lou Viola was stunned, her imagination quickly building perverse scenes in her mind. 

"T- Then I want to help you cook."

However, Lou felt that she was being a bad girl, so she decided to answer safely. Although it was 
obvious what was under that apron. 

Calix chuckled and let her in. 

Her eyes went to his body. 

She couldn't help but admire how much muscle she saw in his arms and thighs. She wondered what 
it would feel like to touch them with her own hands. 

She followed him into the kitchen. The walls were white and well lit, but there was something else 
that caught her attention.

The pots were already filled with ingredients and it seemed that Calix was cooking. Still, she could 
see that there were unfinished dishes. For there were chopped meat and vegetables on the table. 

"Let me help you."

"Thanks, I want to make Japanese curry."

"Hm, it's a delicious dish. By the way, I have kimchi rice and soup in my Tupperware. Can I put 
them in the refrigerator?"

"Sure, no problem."

She refocused and began to put the food in... 

'Maybe I can do it next time.'



Her mind wandered to different scenarios. 

Maybe she could get him to come over to her apartment tomorrow. What if she wore the same outfit 
he was wearing now - the apron. Would he notice? 

She shook her head when she realized she was acting crazy. 

"Lou, are you okay?"

"Yes, I'm fine."

She replied immediately. She felt guilty when Calix looked at her worriedly. 

'I'm sorry Calix, I can't concentrate when I'm with you.'

To be honest, it would be hard to focus when there's an almost naked guy next to you. 

A few minutes later, the two finished cooking and tasted the dishes. 

"Delicious."

"Thank you. Now we just have to wait for Oni Chichi..."

The two looked at the clock and found that it was 4:15. They still have time...

Realizing that the remaining time was quite long, the two stared at each other. Lou's face turned 
bright red. 

However, she braved her heart and approached him. 

"What you said earlier... Can I answer it?"



"Sure."

Calix smiled and kissed her brow. 

"I don't want food, I don't want a bath... I want you."

Her face turned even redder. 

"Oh. Lou, you're getting braver now."

Lou nodded shyly. 

"Yeah, um... Because you're hot..."

He laughed softly and cupped her chin. 

"Lou, you are too gorgeous. You are mine and mine alone."

She shivered as Calix bit her lips. The kiss was soft but sweet. Lou responded by grabbing Calix's 
buttocks. 

She wanted to squeeze his ass sooner. Calix chuckled and let her have it. 

"You can touch me as much as you want."

"En."

Lou nodded and her hands slipped free and went under the apron. She gasped when she realized that 
there was a hard rod between his legs! 

Lou was embarrassed and Calix laughed nonchalantly. 



"You're getting naughty."

"I-I..."

Lou tried to apologize, but Calix stopped her with a finger over her mouth.

"It's okay. I don't mind if you take charge."

Calix winked and stroked her lower lip with his thumb.

She was mesmerized as her hands gently squeezed his cock. It was so big and hard, she wanted 
more.

Lou moved her hands from Calix's crotch to his chest. Then she cupped his neck. She kissed him 
lightly and stroked his cheek with her thumbs. This action calmed her somewhat. She continued to 
touch his neck, jawline, ears, temples, and collarbones. 

Then she leaned down and bit Calix's left nipple. Calix moaned loudly. Lou bit harder, eliciting 
another sharp moan. The sound was very erotic and Lou wanted more. She tugged at Calix's earlobe 
and then pulled away.

She looked at him with pleading eyes. Calix stared at her with desire.

"Calix, can I eat you tonight?"

He was surprised at the request. But he nodded and kissed her.

As soon as she began to lick his tongue, Calix turned her around and pinned Lou's hands above her 
head.

"I'm sorry, Lou. I can't control my urges, I want to eat you. I want to taste your sweet juices."

"Mm~"



Lou moaned and closed her eyes. She was so turned on that she didn't care about anything else.

Calix licked her neck and sucked on her skin. Lou arched her back and moaned louder.

After putting hickeys around her neck, Calix understood that his junior was already hurting. So he 
bent her over the wall and pulled up her skirt. 

His cock was already up, eager and hungry for her.  Lou took a deep breath to calm herself and 
spread her legs.

Calix entered her slowly at first and then went faster.

"Ngggnnhh~ So good~"

Lou felt dizzy and couldn't hold it any longer. She came with a loud moan. Calix grunted as well 
and thrust deeper into her womb. 

Squelching sounds echoed as Lou's pussy became wet. Her ass shook as her vagina swallowed and 
released his cock.

"Ahhh! Ahhh! Ahhh!"

Calix kept pumping in and out. Lou whimpered each time she felt him enter her. The orgasmic 
sensations sent ripples through her entire body. She felt like she was being torn apart.

Calix kept going hard, making Lou's legs weak. 

"Anh~"

She lay limp on the floor, exhausted. Unfortunately, Calix was still standing and staring at her. 

"Haahh..."



Lou swallowed when she realized that they still had time to fuck... This was going to be the longest 
45 minutes of her life.
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"... Let's go to the bathroom."

Calix offered, knowing that they would smell when they were done. So to kill two birds with one 
stone, he decided to take a bath and have sex at the same time. They could accomplish two tasks at 
the same time, what a smartass. 

"En."

Lou nodded and stood up weakly. Her legs were shaking from her orgasm. Calix chuckled and 
carried her to the bathroom.

"Let's do it before Oni Chichi gets here."

"Yes."

Lou blushed the whole time. She knew that once they were in the bathroom, Calix would shower 
her with love and cum... Her body shivered as she imagined the scene. 

..........

.......

...

However, the two never thought that Oni Chichi was actually standing at the door. She heard 
everything they said!



Because they were too excited, they left the door open. Oni Chichi decided to visit Calix's 
apartment earlier than the meeting time. Because she wanted to spend some time with him.

However, it seemed that Lou had already beaten her to it. Lou Viola arrived earlier than her and 
monopolized Calix. Finally, the door was open and she heard their activities. 

Oni Chichi heard Lou's moaning and smiled bitterly. Finally, she lowered her head and walked 
away. She looked at her watch and realized that she had to wait another 45 minutes. 

She could not imagine what the two would do within that time. She felt defeated, even though the 
battle had never begun. 

.........

......

...

Inside the bathtub, the water was filled and swirling as Lou bounced on Calix's cock. 

"Annh~! Anng--! Mmm--!"

She moaned as the water hit her tits. The water in the tub dwindled as it escaped every time Lou 
dropped her ass and made waves. 

"Goooodd~~ So gooooddd!!"

She cried, looking at Calix with a blissful look. Her body was wet all over. 

"Haa~ aahh~!"

She looked absolutely stunning when she screamed like that, she looked beautiful. It seemed like 
she was an underworld goddess or something. Sucking out Calix's life. 



Even though Lou was crying, her eyes were still sparkling.

"Sooo~..."

Calix groaned as Lou grabbed his wet hair and pulled hard. She was moaning like crazy, she knew 
she could scream as much as she wanted in the bathroom. 

"Your cock feels so big in me, Calix. I love your cock. Please love me more. Ngggnnh~"

She grunted and the water continued to undulate around them. To be honest, having sex in the 
slippery bathtub was kind of dangerous, but they were too horny to think. They fucked like rabbits. 

"Yeah, I want to fuck you too."

Calix grabbed her tits and squeezed them while Lou rocked her ass.  Lou's breathing became 
uneven as her breasts got fondled.

"You're so hot when you're like this. Tease my breasts more!"

Lou whined as Calix continued to squeeze her nipples. The nipple hardened quickly from the 
intense pleasure.

"Mmmmmmm~!"

Lou couldn't stop screaming and squirming as Calix increased the pressure. 

"Calix~~ I'm going to cum again!!! Aarrgghhh--! Yeah! yeah! yeah! ugh ugh ugh ugh! Fuck Oh 
fuck~~ I feel stupid! I'm gonna go crazy~~ Cumming--!"

"Guh! Me too, Lou! I'm gonna--"

"Give it to me! I want it! Fill me with your cum!"



She convulsed on top of him, gasping for air. Her back arched and her hips jerked. 

"Gaahhaaa~~"

She looked wild and happy as she screamed incoherently while Calix watched her. He enjoyed 
every moment his woman gave him. Her lips were red from the kiss and her cheeks were flushed, 
making her look even hotter. 

He loved the way she tasted and looked. She tasted sweet yet sexy. 

"Fucckkkk!!"

Calix pumped his semen into her womb. Her pussy also squeezed him tightly. He exploded and 
grunted for a few seconds. 

"Ah!"

Lou exclaimed. She felt his cock throbbing deep inside her pussy. She hummed happily as she 
realized that another bank of semen had been deposited inside her. 

Then Lou stood up and turned around. She spread the entrance of her pussy to show the evidence. 
However, because Calix was filling her deep inside her womb, the white cum could not come out. 

So Calix helped her and started fucking her with his fingers. 

"Mmm~~ Guuhh~ Hmm~"

She bit her lip and moaned sweetly as Calix's fingers entered her pussy.  His other hand trailed 
along her beautiful ass. He pressed her against the wall of the tub and began rubbing her clit 
vigorously and finger fucking her pussy. 

"Ah~"



Lou threw her head back. She moaned as she realized that his white cum was leaving her pussy and 
running down her legs. Her body shook again as she grabbed the edge of the tub. 

Calix kissed her back up to her neck. 

"Let's get out of the tub."

"Okay."

Fucking in the tub while standing was dangerous because it was slippery. So they decided to 
continue their sex while taking a hot shower. 

"Ah!"

Lou's face was against the wall and she lifted her butt for Calix. Calix entered her again. The sperm 
that leaked out earlier was immediately stuffed back into her womb. 

"Hhuuu~"

An exhale escaped her mouth as Calix's long rod greeted her vagina. She turned her head and 
smiled seductively at him.  

"I'm ready for more~"

And she did. She lifted her ass, allowing Calix to reach deeper. His cock bobbed in perfect rhythm 
inside her cunt.

"Aanhh! Aahhh~"

He grabbed her neck and kissed her hard, making sure to leave his mark on her. He sucked on her 
skin until it turned red. His thrusts increased as the rhythm quickened. Lou moaned nonstop. Her 
tight pussy was stretched deeper and wider by his mighty shaft. 

"Guh guh guh guh guh!"



She moaned like a broken cassette tape. 

 Then he slammed into her hard and fast.

Lou clung to the wall like a gecko as her pussy was pounded by a thick, hot cock. 

"Uhhh... Ah..."

Her face was almost completely buried in the cold tiles. With each thrust, her hips slammed against 
the wall. Calix's cock went deeper and deeper.  Lou's moans grew louder with each thrust. She 
began to throw her head back and forth.

"Aaaah! Hnnngnnnnnngggggggggh---!! Gg--!"

Lou finally lost control and came. The feeling of the white cum filling her vagina and dripping 
down her thighs was like nothing else.
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As the water grazed her skin, Lou breathed heavily as she looked up at her master. Calix waved his 
big thing in front of her face and Lou unconsciously opened her mouth. She licked the tip of his 
cock and Calix shivered. 

"Hmm."

She cleaned his cock and sucked up the sperm with her tongue and mouth. She made sure his shaft 
was perfectly clean. 

As she worked on the man she felt him move against her lips and she knew what she had to do. She 
licked the cum from her lips before smiling. She pulled his cock into her face. She swirled her 
tongue around it.

"Fufu, tastes good."



Lou giggled after giving him fellatio. 

After the "shower," the two left the bathroom and got dressed. Calix had already prepared some 
clothes for Lou. 

"Thank you... Although the bra size is too big for me."

"I'm sorry about that. I have one here that is smaller."

He apologized and scratched the back of his head. Of course, these bras were part of his collection. 
He never needed them, but the girls kept giving him souvenirs. So much so that 1/4 of his spatial 
ring was taken up by their clothes. 

Since the girls visited him almost every day, his room had makeup, hairdryers, and so on. 

Lou didn't ask about it because she knew Calix was on a mission. She just dried her hair. 

"Let's wait for Oni Chichi."

"Okay."

A few minutes later someone rang the doorbell and Calix opened it. As expected, Oni Chichi 
greeted him. 

"Oni, come in."

The young woman smiled and entered the room. Her eyes traveled around and found nothing 
strange. But Oni Chichi was no fool. What she had heard before was clear and obvious. Her smile 
looked forced, but she immediately controlled her emotions. 

"You have a nice place."

"Thank you."



Then Lou came out after her hair was dry. 

"Oni! I'm glad to see you!"

"Me too! Looks like you got here earlier than me... Hm, could it be that...?"

Oni Chichi smiled teasingly as she looked at them. 

"Well..."

Lou just blushed and looked away while Calix just chuckled. They never confirmed it. 

"Don't worry, if you want to keep your relationship a secret, I will keep my mouth shut. I'm a tight-
lipped woman."

"Thanks, but nothing happened," Lou justified. 

"Right, I will believe you."

Oni nodded. 

.........

......

...

The three of them made a preliminary plan. Once field trip started and they reached the border 
between the Forest of Death and Junian. 

Oni Chichi had already researched the people they could interview. This project was very important 
to her. 



Like her, Lucky (Calix) also realized the value of this project. 

'Maybe this project can help me make a breakthrough in my mission. Understanding the history of 
the Forest of Death might lead me to a realization.'

This feeling was not a simple deduction. His intuition told him that this project was important. 
That's why he listened to Oni Chichi's idea. 

"There is a historian in the military. He is a descendant of the turtle tribe, and his tribe is known for 
its long life span. The historian is currently 213 years old."

'Nice! That's what I'm talking about!'

Calix found another person to ask. In fact, this project could help him.

"The military site on the border is heavily guarded. It's impossible to enter unless you have a very 
good reason. But because we're students of the most famous university, we can go on a field trip to 
the military site. This field trip is important to remind us of what happened in the past and how we 
fought the Aberrants," Lou added.

This trip had a deeper meaning. Lou had written some articles about the Forest of Death, and she 
had an idea about the grim place.

The Forest of Death was home to millions of Aberrants. It was a place where powerful creatures 
lived and killed each other. It's like a constant battlefield where the strong get stronger while the 
loser gets eaten. 

It was also the most dangerous place in the world. There were thousands of different kinds of 
Aberrants. If you want to enter the Forest of Death, you have to be able to fight or survive against 
all those beasts. But it was a sick idea. For no one has ever returned alive.

Even strong Vindicators, such as Demi- Gods, would have a hard time infiltrating the forest.

'I fought a bird that could teleport, it's not even at the top of the food chain, yet it almost killed me.'



Calix could not tell how strong the creatures living in the legendary forest were. 

"I prepared dinner earlier, Oni, how about eating with us?"

Since the two women would be the brains of this project and he didn't have enough understanding 
of Junian, Calix decided to help in another way. 

"O- Okay."

Oni Chichi was shocked, but she decided to accept his goodwill. Besides, she was interested in his 
cooking. 

"I'm too busy today, so I didn't have a proper lunch."

"Don't worry, I can assure you that Calix is a good cook. I helped him too, so I'm confident."

"Is that so..."

Lou smiled and nodded. However, she did not see the change in Oni's expression. Oni clenched his 
fists under the table. 

She wasn't happy about Lou spending time with Calix. She already knew that Lou and Calix were 
in a relationship, and it bothered her. 

 But she couldn't say anything.

She couldn't reveal her feelings, so she kept a low profile.

"Let's go to my kitchen."

"Oh... okay. Thanks for helping, Oni."



Lou thanked her and left the dining table to follow Calix.

The three of them had a hearty dinner and both Oni and Lou were impressed with Calix's cooking. 
Calix scored points in the hearts of both women. Although Calix was unaware of their feelings. 

As soon as they finished eating, they said goodbye. Lou wanted to study before bed, but Oni wanted 
to rest. Oni's roommate was difficult to deal with, so she wanted to rest her mind as long as 
possible. 

Chapter 357

At a social banquet where the wealthy and nobility were gathered. A strange sight could be seen in 
the corner. A woman with nine tails was standing there, and her presence seemed to attract the 
attention of all the guests. The woman had a mysterious air about her, and it was clear that she was 
not one of the usual attendees at such an event.

The guests were both intrigued and intimidated by her presence, and no one dared to approach her. 
Despite the curiosity of the guests, the woman remained in the corner. She quietly observed the 
festivities.

She even seemed to be enjoying herself, as if the party itself was nothing special to her. Even her 
tails seemed to twirl slowly.

She sipped her champagne while her eyes wandered around. To be honest, she had simply been 
invited to the banquet. She didn't dare to refuse, because the one who invited her was royalty. So 
she decided to keep a low profile.

'Even though the media shows that this country is free of racial discrimination, I disagree.'

The nine-tailed fox, Shoujo Ramune, could see that she was one of the few Beastkins at the 
banquet. Most of the attendees were humans and half-elves.

'Our race was only liberated a few centuries ago. Perhaps that's one of the reasons why there are 
only a few prominent Beastkins at this banquet. Our race doesn't have enough power to compete 
with these old nobles...'



Although she was thinking of something dark, the sweet smile on her face was always there. After 
all, she was a great actress.

Besides, the eyes of the participants were on her. Most of them were men, and these men couldn't 
hide their lust for her. Shoujo Ramune was beautiful in her blue nude dress, her orange hair tied in a 
bun and her neck bare. 

Her tails swayed gently behind her as she continued to sip her champagne. With a gentle look on 
her face.

The fox demoness felt that her charm and beauty would soon attract a man or two. She smiled and 
looked around. As far as she could tell, most of the men in the room were interested in her. She was 
a famous actress with many awards under her belt.

"Good evening, Miss Ramune."

Suddenly, someone who was brave enough greeted her. The man was tall and handsome, radiating 
confidence and power.

"Hm, it's nice to meet you, Young Master Methecula Rosanic."

Shoujo nodded. The man in front of her was one of the strongest Vindicators of her generation. 
Perhaps second only to the Crown Prince.

Methecula Rosanic was already a 3rd Advanced TA User at the age of 31. He was known as the 
Master of the Sky because of his ability to command the wind.

The Rosanic Clan is a clan of wind mages. Their roots began in the southern part of the continent. 
They moved their headquarters when the Aberrants were rampant.

But even now, their clan was still strong and became one of the pillars of Junian.

'Unlike the recently blooming clans, the Rosanic are true nobles with hundreds of years of history... 
He is useful.'



"I have seen your latest movie and all I can say is that you deserve another Hoescar statue. 
Unfortunately, the Academy will never give this statue to an actor twice."

"It's an honor."

Shoujo replied, looking up at him. She was already used to this kind of praise. She was already tired 
of this typical flattery, to be honest.

'Is that the best pick-up line you can come up with? I'm disappointed.'

"Are you having fun?"

He asked.

She nodded.

"I am, thank you."

Methecula then asked something else, but another person arrived and joined their conversation.

"What a wonderful night to see the young master of the Rosanic Clan and the greatest actress in the 
world talking."

"Your Highness."

When his voice resounded, both Methecula and Shoujo bowed their heads in respect.

Not only them, but everyone at the banquet bowed to the Crown Prince.  He was like the sun that 
brought warmth to all of Junian. His radiance lit up every room he passed through. Everyone sees 
him as the next king and savior of the kingdom, for he deserves it. He is strong, talented, handsome, 
and noble. He is perfect.

Methecula was glad to see the prince. Especially since the prince did not usually grace anyone with 
his presence. However, Shoujo Ramune knew the Crown Prince's intention.



It was the Crown Prince who had invited her to this noble gathering where she felt out of place.

'I am from the Fox Tribe. My lineage can be described as aristocratic, but our status is nothing 
compared to these people.'

Unfortunately, the media had spread the idea that noble Beastkins were accepted at this social 
gathering, which was false.

"Young Master Methecula, may I have a moment with Lady Shoujo Ramune?"

"As long as you wish, Crown Prince."

Methecula realized that the rumors were true and immediately backed away. He knew that he was 
nothing compared to the Crown Prince. Besides, their clan might be affected if he faced him.

"Then, Milady, may I?"

The crown prince held out his hand to her.  Shoujo took his hand and was pulled away from the 
crowd.

When they were out of sight, Methecula looked at the other guest. Some of them mocked him, but 
his expression never changed. He knew, however, that he had lost face tonight, and he had to find a 
way to vent his frustration.

His gaze was cold.

Then he found his target. A shy woman was standing next to an old, lanky man. Judging by the 
woman's expression and appearance, she was a companion of a noble.

'She looks like a woman who wants to get rich by marrying an old man. A typical plot. I have found 
my prey.'



With a devilish grin, he approached the duo. The next day, the woman disappeared, and no one 
dared to find her.  No one knew what happened to her either, so the story became nothing more than 
unfounded gossip.

Chapter 358

The Crown Prince and Shoujo Ramune left the noisy banquet and went to the garden. The nobles 
glanced at them, but no one dared to follow them, it was disrespectful to the heir of the kingdom.

"Looks like Methecula is interested in you."

"Your Highness, you know that my beauty attracts men."

Unlike before, Shoujo Ramune's attitude was carefree and genuine.

"So you're saying it's not your fault? It's the men's fault that they like you."

"Hm." She nodded. 

"As expected of you. You're too arrogant.

The Crown Prince, Prince Diane, just chuckled.

He could be cold, arrogant sometimes, or sarcastic, but he never really cared about his image, he 
liked it that way. It gave him the feeling of being in control of everything. But when Shoujo 
Ramune was at his side, he felt like a normal person, not the crown prince, not the heir of the 
kingdom.

"How's work?"

"Meh, it's fine. Same as always."

Their conversation was easy, as if they were friends, which was true.



"By the way, if you are interested in Methecula Rosanic, you need to be careful. I heard that the 
Rosanic Clan has a connection with the Tempest Clan of Dellia."

Hearing this rumor, Shoujo's fox ears twitched.

"I didn't know that. I guess our great Crown Prince knows so much."

"It is my duty to understand my kingdom. The two clans were close. Especially Darrio Robinson 
and the current Patriarch of Rosanic. I even heard that they tried to engage Methecula and Scarlett 
Robinson."

Dario Robinson... The man who died after Scarlett blew him to pieces.

"Are you talking about the most talented young Vindicator, Scarlett Robinson?"

"Yes," Prince Diane could not help but sigh. "Scarlett Robinson recently broke through the 3rd 
Advance. She became the youngest person to become a 3rd Advance TA user."

He lamented the fact that someone like her was on the other side. Scarlett's talent was frightening 
even to someone like Prince Diane.

'We are both 3rd Advance, but she is far more talented than me.'

The Crown Prince was only 28 years old, and he was confident in himself. However, he realized 
that someone would always be better than him.

"I can't believe that Methecula Rosanic and Scarlett Robinson almost got engaged."

"If they became a couple, our situation might not happen."

Both Tempest and Rosanic have a strong influence in their countries. There was a possibility that 
they could prevent the friction between the two countries if Scarlett and Methecula became 
engaged.



The reality, however, was often disappointing.

There's no such thing as happy ever after, only truth.

"So I advised you to think seriously about becoming his girlfriend.

The prince was like an older brother giving a lesson to his sibling.

"What about you?"

"Me?"

"What do you think of me?"

"I think of you as my friend. Maybe my best friend."

He answered without a problem. Even though he was happy to be with Shoujo Ramune, their 
relationship was nothing more than friendship.

He knew that there was gossip about him and Shoujo, but he didn't care. He didn't even bother to 
correct the rumors.

"Nice."

As for Shoujo Ramune, she just smiled, hiding her emotions well.

"Speaking of rumors, I heard the news that there is a crazy group attacking innocent people."

Shoujo Ramune always keeps up with celebrity gossip and other news. Yesterday, she saw a clip of 
a person attacking innocent people in the park. He looked crazy, like a rabid dog.

"Are you talking about the rabid people who attack and eat people's flesh?"



"Eating flesh? That's the first I've heard of it?"

"It's not a secret, so there's no problem telling you."

Actually, the kingdom tried to keep this news under wraps because it could lead to mass hysteria. 
But no matter how hard they tried, these incidents kept coming out of nowhere. So now a lot of 
people were hearing about it.

"We believe that these people are infected with a virus. They are all dead."

The autopsy was quite interesting when Prince Diane read it.

"Huh?"

"You heard right, these people are already dead, yet they are moving and hungry for human flesh."

"... Do you think this is related to Dellia?"

"Like a secret act of terrorism? Maybe, but first we need to understand how these people got 
infected. Anyway, you don't have to think about it, we'll find a solution."

"I believe in you."

"Thank you, now let's talk about our business."

Her expression became serious.

The real purpose of this meeting was important to both of them. It was about the coup. The plan to 
overthrow the current king.

King Baboy...



The King, Diane's father. He was nothing but a stupid, arrogant jerk who thinks that royal blood 
rules the world.

"We have new information about the dungeon the King was hiding..."

"I'm all ears."

.........

......

...

While the banquet was going on, a couple was procreating on the balcony of the apartment.

"Mmm~ Master, this slave's pussy is all yours, ah!"

A woman with dark skin turned her ass around greedily. She looked at Calix with a pleading look. 
She moaned like a bitch as his thick cock stretched her pussy so well.

Her cheeks were red and she was breathing heavily through her nose. A small bead of sweat slid 
down her neck, but Calix didn't care.

"Huu~~"

He was having a very hot sex scene right in front of him, and it was going to be perfect.

Calix had a huge dick. It wasn't a lie to say that her pussy hole was stuffed and full.

"Anng! Anng-- Annhh~"

Her guttural moans were deep. Esmeralda, the dark-skinned woman, bounced on his cock. Riding 
him from behind.



The two sat on the balcony, watching the stars in the sky. Of course, it would be lonely if they 
weren't fucking.

"Oh God~ Fuucckkk~"

She squealed as her waist jerked. Her hips bucked again. Her breasts bounced back. Her pussy felt 
so sweet and sticky. She was enjoying the whole situation so much that she was even wetter than 
before. The only thing that could make this moment better was to be spanked.

"Come on... Master... Please~"

She wanted his master to spank her.

Calix grunted and slapped her ass hard.  It sent vibrations through her body. Her face started to 
blush. Her legs trembled and her heart started to beat faster.

Then she realized what she had done. She started to cry.

"I'm sorry-- Master-- Master!!! I'm sorry!! Aaahhh~~"

She bowed in shame as she came on his cock. She squirted and made her master wet...

Chapter 359

Esmeralda's hips withered and she nearly fell. Unfortunately for her, Calix was still not satisfied. He 
caught her weak body. He let the woman rest for a few minutes before gently thrusting his penis in.

"Hmm~~"

The woman shuddered as his cock entered her for the second time. This time her hands were on the 
railing and she lifted her ass for better balance.

The balcony was exciting to use. Almost as if they were in the public.



"Calix," she gasped, trying to hold her breath. She could feel herself getting wetter with each stroke 
of his shaft against her pussy. The heat from him began to warm her, but it wasn't enough. Her need 
to come soon had begun to become a desire.

She knew she had just come and she was greedy. But her body spoke the truth. She was so wet that 
Calix's cock turned creamy white from her fluids.

"Mmm! Nnnm! Nnnn!"

Even in this position, she could already see his thick cock whenever she lowered her head. It was so 
hot she couldn't help it. She needed more. More of him. More than he was giving her.

She felt his shaft enter her cunt, spreading the wetness over her clit.

"Ahhh~~~" She moaned softly like a mewing cat. But her ass was shaking all over his cock, 
matching his rhythm. The two were moving like one, just wanting to reach nirvana.

He stroked her pussy so well that his cock could hit every weak spot and it drove her crazy.

"Huuuu-- Guuhh Uuhgghh! Ngggnnhh! Guuh!"

He was going faster now and she moaned louder. She wanted to explode again. Right now. She had 
to come. But her body wouldn't obey her commands because Calix was slapping her ass again!

Pah! Pah!

"Ahh~"

Her ample breasts shook like two balls grinding against each other!

Every time she tried to move, she was stuck in place. She was a statue waiting to be dominated, 
only able to watch as her legs tensed and Calix drove into her harder!



"Nnngghh~~"

She whimpered loudly as she felt the tip of his penis hitting her cervix. His movements became 
even more violent and she lost control!

"Annhh~"

Her back arched slightly from the railing. She gripped the railing tightly to keep herself steady. She 
felt like dying when she suddenly heard someone grunting.

Calix was reaching his limit as he pumped his baby batter. Each stroke was so strong that Esmeralda 
moaned each time.

"Hm~ Ngghh~ Mmm~"

The intensity of their lovemaking reached its peak. She cried out as her vagina snuggled the cock. 
Her orgasm washed over her like an ocean wave.

"Haaaa..."

Calix collapsed against her, both of them panting heavily. Esmeralda lay there. Breathing heavily 
while Calix tried to regain his composure after the release of his cum.

Then they both giggled after the sweet sex. A nice laugh after exhausting sex made them feel closer.

.........

......

...

"What are you thinking?"



After leaving the bathroom, Esmeralda noticed that Calix was thinking deeply about something. His 
expression was serious and Esmeralda liked his face when he was serious.

Calix looked at her with a deep stare and Esmeralda instinctively shivered. He always looked at her 
like that when he wanted to punish her.

"Master, you can tell your slave anything."

Perhaps because she was under his influence, Esmeralda's speech became submissive.

"Esmeralda, am I really going to meet your daughter?"

He didn't know why Esmeralda was so confident that he would meet her daughter. Was it because of 
his luck? He was not sure.

Hearing his question, Esmeralda returned to her usual self. She might be in love, but she knew her 
priorities.

"I just have a feeling you will meet her. I'm a Demigod and I have stronger senses than you, so..."

"Fair enough."

Calix could see that Esmeralda was hiding something, but he didn't bother to force her. As he had 
expected, Esmeralda was still hiding her true feelings.

Knowing that asking more questions about Esmeralda's life could lead to negative results, he 
decided to change the subject instead.

"While I was interviewing the families related to the ancient dark elves, I heard something 
interesting."

His eyes were on her, the woman was only wrapped in a bath towel and her beautiful figure radiated 
sexiness.



"What did you hear, maybe I can help you."

"You are the only dark elves I know, so I can only ask you. Do you know what World Tree is?"

"I knew you would ask me about it."

She chuckled and started to dry her hair. Calix's apartment had everything a woman needed. 
However, because Esmeralda was disgusted with using the other hairdryer. She had her own, which 
was always in her spatial ring.

The President of Dellia has her own spatial ring, of course.

"I want to know more about the World Tree."

"Before I can answer that, do you believe in ghosts?"

"No, I do not. I can only believe what I can see. The Aberrants I killed are real, and Term Attributes 
are real, so I believe them. But I never see a ghost in my life."

"Then what about Hell or Backrooms?"

She asked casually, but Calix's reaction was too strong. His pupils trembled. For he had not 
expected Esmeralda to ask him about these mythical places.

If she had asked him two weeks ago, Calix would probably have scoffed. But because of what he 
experienced when he fought his uncle, Berto Alb, Calix learned that there were things he didn't 
know.

"Tell me more about it."

"Looks like you are interested," she giggled and began to tell what she knew.

"Like Hell, Backrooms, and other mythical places, the World Tree is a mythical place."



"But it's a tree, not a ground or a space."

"Yes, but the World Tree is a huge tree that covers the sky. So in a way it's classified as a place 
because it's too big," she continued.

"There are many myths about the World Tree. But the most famous is that the World Tree is the land 
the elves came from. It is their Eden, no, our Eden. It is said that when an elf dies, he/she returns to 
the World Tree and becomes part of it."

Calix was shocked. He was no illiterate bum, but he realized that there were things he didn't know, 
like the mythical places.

Suddenly, he remembered his uncle's ability - the power to summon those mythical places.

Chapter 360

'That man has the ability to summon and use the powers of these mythical places.'

Calix had learned how terrifying they were. Now he learned that the unknown World Tree was also 
a mythical place.

"Just like the World Tree, Hell and the Backrooms are places where spirits reside."

Esmeralda finished drying her hair and looked at her face in the mirror. As a career woman, her 
appearance was very important for people to respect her. She needed to look fierce yet beautiful so 
that no one would take her lightly.

"Hell is a place where bad people suffer in endless flames. While in the Backrooms, the spirits 
mutated, that's why most of the creatures there are unrecognizable."

Calix nodded. He had been teleported to Backrooms once, and the monsters there were ugly.

"If you think the World Tree is a place you can just go to, I'm sorry to tell you that it's impossible. 
I'm not even sure if a human like you can go there, only elves are allowed. Besides, I can assure you 
that my daughter is not in that place, she is here in Junian."



"Thank you for telling me about these places. I learned a lot."

For a person who only knew what school and the Internet taught him, Calix was still ignorant. He 
never knew that such places existed. He felt that he was just learning about the real world, which 
was interesting and surprising.

"Now that you have explained it to me, would you mind telling me when I can meet this female spy 
of yours?"

"Hm? So she never contacted you?" Esmeralda chuckled. "I guess she thought you were unworthy. 
Perhaps your appearance is not to her liking."

"I'm no longer an emo."

"Fufu."

After checking her appearance, Esmeralda dropped her towel. She started to put on her uniform.

However, Calix, who was watching her change, started to get a hard-on. Esmeralda was so 
attractive that his PP reacted quickly.

Since Calix was naked just like her, his junior was clearly hard and Esmeralda saw it.

She giggled and stopped changing.

"Master, do you...?"

She pointed at his cock.

"Yes, make it docile."

"Fufu."



Esmeralda approached him naked. First she teased him with a slow dance. Her hips and torso 
swayed gently, seducing his young penis, which was rock hard.

Her movements were so beautiful that Calix clenched his fists in frustration. He wanted to pounce 
on her and devour her.

Then she turned and bent over. Her pussy lips were glistening. Her ass was bruised but still so hot to 
look at.

Calix's chest was on fire.

She slowly walked towards him, then stopped moving altogether.

"Master~~"

He didn't know what she was planning. He only knew that if she stopped, it meant he should too. So 
he waited for her to move again, but instead of dropping her ass, she slowly turned to face him.

She kneeled down and gently touched his raging cock.  His erection grew stronger as she stroked it. 
Esmeralda's touch was soft but firm, sending shivers through his body. Her fingers moved like 
electricity, playing with every nerve in his body until he was ready to burst. Then she began to 
move slowly between his legs, teasing his balls.

Finally, both of her hands wrapped around his cock and stroked his insane shaft. Calix convulsed 
and held his breath as Esmeralda jacked his cock.

The sight was amazing. She looked so beautiful. Her long black hair fell behind her shoulders, 
revealing her smooth back. And the sound of her moaning, her soft breathing and the way she 
moved her hands drove him crazy. He could feel himself coming closer to release.

Then suddenly she stopped.

She lowered her breasts between his cock and gave him a titjob. She squeezed her breasts and used 
her arms to put pressure on his cock. Calix's moan told her she was doing the right thing.



Her breasts made his cock throb as she moved them up and down. Her breasts felt so good and he 
was so close to coming. He reached out and grabbed her nipple, squeezing it hard.

"Mmm~"

She moaned too loudly. The moans made him even hotter. She had a sexy voice and mouth.

She moved quickly between his legs. She rubbed her breasts and nipples against his cock.

Calix felt his heart about to jump out of his chest, so much so that he couldn't help but grunt. 
Unfortunately, Esmeralda was just getting started.

She opened her mouth and sucked on the tip of his cock as she moved her breasts. Calix's cock was 
thoroughly sandwiched between her two large melons. While the tip was lewdly licked by her 
tongue. Damn sexy!

Then she lifted her head from sucking and looked him in the eyes. Her smile told him everything 
and he couldn't help but moan. It was a sexy smile, full of wanton lust and desire.

"Esmeralda!"

Calix could not hold it in any longer and exploded. Esmeralda realized quickly and opened her 
mouth. The cum poured into her mouth as she swallowed his cock, sucking every drop.

Calix jerked as he pumped his seed into her mouth. Of course, Esmeralda blew him as well.

"Shit!"

"Mm~"

The sperm built up in her mouth and a small portion escaped through the crack of her lips. Still, she 
continued to suck him.



Calix released his load for a few seconds.

-- slurp slurp slurp.

This time she didn't stop after swallowing his cum. Instead, she continued to suck his cock.

She did this for five or six minutes. Until the last drop was gone.

When she finally let go of his cock, Calix collapsed onto the chair with a thud. His cock was limp 
and covered in thick drool from her.

"I have to swallow it since I already showered."

"Okay...  Phew."

He was the one who was sitting, yet he was breathing raggedly, as if he had encountered a 
cocksucker...
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