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Jim was afraid that it was indeed a hallucination, that Bonnie did not actually move. He 
was afraid that it was, once again, a false hope, so he quietly repeated what he said. 

This time, no matter what Jim said or did, Bonnie’s fingers did not even quiver. ‘Maybe it 
was a trick of the mind after all.’ He smiled bitterly and helped tuck Bonnie into the 
blanket nicely before he left. 

What he did not see, however, was that a lone tear fell from the corner of Bonnie’s eye 
when he turned around. 

Jim was awake the entire night, organizing all the things Butler Fred did for his family. It 
turned out the butler had done so many things for him and his family. 

Previously , Fred had thought Heather was the real Ms. Landry, so he cared for her 
deeply and even associated Heather to attack Jim business-wise. However, when Luna 
was back in the Landry family, he knew that Heather never had the chance to hold any 
power in the family. His attitude toward Heather changed drastically. Hence… 

Jim rubbed his glabella. Honestly speaking, Fred and Mickey were not against him or 
Heather. They knew very 

well that their future was based on the real person in charge of the Landry family. 

Fred and Mickey had always wanted to be on the good side of the person holding the 
power to the family, regardless of whom it was. They first served him, then Heather, 
and, currently, Luna. 

Jim squinted and organized all the information. He sent a message to Joshua and then 
sent all of the information he 

gathered to him. 

It was already morning by the time Joshua received the information. Before, Joshua had 
the habit of working through the night, but after he got back together with Luna, he 
changed his habit. Since all of his children were living with him, if he worked late… Nigel 
would hack into the company’s system and close down all of the company’s servers to 
stop Joshua from working. Neil would constantly nag Joshua to go to sleep, while Nellie 
would just start to cry in his arms. 

“You can’t stay up late, Daddy, or I’ll have to call other men ‘daddy’ if you die! I don’t 
want that to happen!” 

Luna would smilingly stand at the door every time Nellie cried. “Maybe your new daddy 
will be even more handsome, Nellie.” 



“But he won’t look the same as daddy. I only like this daddy who looks the same as me!” 

There was nothing that could stop Joshua from working in the past. No matter how 
many times Lucas reminded him, he would just continue to work. 

However… When he saw how Luna and his kids stayed up late with him and urged him 
to sleep, he could not allow himself to let them be worried. Thus, gradually, he stopped 
the habit of working late. 

Since he no longer stayed up late, he would wake up earlier in the morning. This 
morning, the first thing he read was the information Jim sent over. The information was 
a conclusion to all of the things Butler Fred and Mickey did over the years. 

The information was detailed up to the point Jim was able to pinpoint exactly how long 
Mickey left Merchant City every time. From there , Joshua could see Jim had been wary 
of every person working in the family. There was no other explanation for how he could 
organize such detailed information within a night. Joshua felt astonished as he read the 
information . Amid the information, the first time when Mickey left Merchant City…was 
exactly 10 hours before Granny Lynch was poisoned for the first time. 

It only took six hours to travel from Merchant City to Banyan City. 

Joshua squinted. He was right; Mickey was related to Granny Lynch being poisoned 
after all.” 
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After breakfast… 

“You’re saying that my mom had no idea at all when Granny Lynch was poisoned?” 

Luna was so shocked that she could not close her mouth as Joshua told her about all 
the information Jim sent him. She looked at Joshua astonishingly, her voice faltering as 
she added, “So… When mom said she didn’t know Granny Lynch was poisoned, she 
didn’t say it because she was afraid to sabotage our relationship?” 

Looking at how shocked Luna was, Joshua could not help but smile. “I thought she 
purposely didn’t mention it because she didn’t want to affect our relationship.” Joshua 
looked up. “Looking back at it now, however, I don’t think she’s that kind of person. 
Since she could honestly tell Jim about his birth mother when he asked, I don’t think 
she’s a person who likes to lie.” Luna bit her lip and nodded silently. “You’re right. Mom 
never likes to tell lies, especially to the kids.” 

At first, Jim had always thought he was Rosalyn’s son. When he found out that his birth 
mother was someone else, Rosalyn immediately came clean when he asked, despite 



him being heartbroken and furious at the time. Even when she told Jim the truth, Jim did 
not throw tantrums or cut off ties with her. 

That day, Rosalyn held Jim in her arms and told him with the softest tone that she never 
treated him differently, even when Jim was not her flesh and blood. Although it did not 
create a serious reciprocal, she took a huge risk by telling Jim the truth. If it was not 
dealt with diligently, Rosalyn could lose Jim forever. Nevertheless, she did not choose 
to lie. 

A woman who faced the risk of losing her son refused to tell her son a lie, so why 
should that woman lie just because she feared it would affect their relationship? After 
all, Joshua and Luna’s relationship was stable already. Luna bit her lip and kept quiet. 

Joshua curled up his lip and continued, “Plus, the Landry family and the Lynch family 
were enemies and were at odds. No one knew that the Quinn family was behind all of it, 
though, and no one knew everything was just a misunderstanding. 

“Back in the past, Granny used to attack the Landry Group to harm them, and if your 
mother truly had poisoned Granny, well… It’s a despicable tactic, but I can accept it, 
and vengeance isn’t the only option to go about things.” 

He looked at Luna. “You should understand what I mean.” 

Luna bit her lip and kept quiet for a long time. Eventually, she nodded. 

Joshua was right. When Granny Lynch was poisoned, it was the peak period when the 
Landry family and the Lynch family were fighting against each other. In addition, 
Charles Landry was innocent and had nothing to do with Lucy’s death, but Granny 
Lynch insisted that he was the one who killed her. In the end, Luna’s uncle was the 
reciprocal of the feud between both families. 

Although all the misunderstandings were finally cleared, the hatred that Luna’s parents 
had for Granny Lynch was no lesser than how much Granny Lynch hated Rosalyn and 
Charles when she was alive. 

Moreover, to both Rosalyn and Charles, Granny Lynch was the perpetrator who killed 
Colin Landry. 
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Under those circumstances, it made sense if Luna’s parents wanted to poison Granny 
Lynch to exact vengeance for murdering Colin Landry. She believed if her parents truly 
had done so, Joshua would understandit. 

Nevertheless, it would be much better if Rosalyn and Charles had nothing to do with 
Granny Lynch’s demise. 



This thought had crossed Luna’s mind before. However, it had only been almost a year 
since she returned to the Landy family. She did not have the same hatred the Landry 
family had against the Lynch family, and she also did not have the right to comment on 
it. 

Hence, if she could avoid discussing Granny Lynch being poisoned, she would avoid it 
at all costs. Since there were some things that one could not solve, the only way out 
was to avoid facing them. 

To her amazement, she chose to escape facing reality, but that was not what Joshua 
wanted. Joshua was a person who was very clear about his love and hate for people. 
He loved Luna, and he also loved Granny Lynch. 

Although he said nothing about what happened before, he never gave up seeking the 
truth. Otherwise, he would not be able to compare the time between Mickey leaving 
Merchant City with the time Granny Lynch got sick after Jim sent him the details on 
Butler Fred and Mickey. 

The thought had been in his mind for quite some time, and he took this opportunity to 
investigate it. 

Luna looked up to gaze into Joshua’s eyes. Suddenly, she felt like she did not know the 
man standing in front of her. 

She had thought that there were no secrets between them after all the hardship they 
had been through all these years, but at this moment, she clearly felt the distance 
between them. She had put her heart out by telling him all of her plans and thoughts, 
but Joshua had his own plans in his mind. For example, this incident. 

Before today, she thought that Joshua wanted to help her and Jim to look out for the 
Landry family by investigating Butler Fred and Mickey. Even before breakfast today, she 
did not know that the reason Joshua wanted to look into Fred and Mickey was so he 
could find out the truth behind Granny Lynch’s poisoning. 

Joshua was the same as before: never sharing anything with Luna and disliked being 
honest with her. 

More specifically, Luna felt like Joshua was using her. He could have made time to tell 
Luna yesterday that he wanted to study the incident when Granny Lynch was poisoned 
when he said he harbored suspicions toward Butler Fred and Mickey. 

There was no reason for Joshua not to say it. Luna would not stop him from 
investigating and also did not think investigating it would cause any harm to her or the 
Landry family. Furthermore, Luna would help him had he wanted it. 



They were married too, for goodness’ sake! They had been through so many difficulties, 
and theoretically speaking, they should face every consequence together. However, 
Joshua did not tell Luna his plan, only saying that Fred and Mickey were very 
suspicious. 

Having those thoughts in her mind caused Luna to lose her appetite. She put down her 
cutlery and looked straight into Joshua’s eyes. “If you have any more thoughts, 
especially when it’s involving me and the Landry family, can you please tell me in 
advance? I’m your wife. I won’t betray you or sell you out. “Joshua, do you still have 
doubts about me? Can you trust me with your whole heart?” 

Joshua furrowed his eyebrow, staring at Luna as questions surfaced in his mind. “What 
are you talking about?” 

 


