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Pursuing My Ex-Wife Is not Easy chapter 3019-“The man who kidnapped your 
father is Tyson,” Stefan interrupted Gwen before she could even finish. “Kurt 
and I have decided on a plan. We’ll intercept him this afternoon, and after 
gaining his trust, we’ll be able to find out where he’s keeping your father 
hostage.” 

As he said this, he lifted his head to stare intently at Gwen. “Don’t worry. With 
me around, your father will be fine. I’ll do everything in my power to fulfill your 
wish, even if it means helping you protect the people you love…” 

Stefan paused for a moment, then added, “Your wish is my command.” 

With that, he turned to leave. 

“Thank you.” Gwen bit her lip as she stared at his retreating figure. “After we 
settle all this, I will hand over all the money under my name as a reward for all 
that you’ve done. I…I don’t know what else I can offer you besides this.” 

A bitter smile crept onto Stefan’s face when he heard this. He turned to meet 
her gaze and replied, “There’s no need for that. Kurt and I didn’t decide to 
help you just to get some reward. What matters the most to us is seeing you 
happy.” 

With that, he turned and strode away. 

Gwen bit her lip as she stared at his retreating figure, and a sinking feeling 
appeared in her heart. A split second later, she closed her eyes, took out her 
phone, and sent Luna a text message to tell her everything. 

[Are you falling for this man?] At this moment, Luna was cradling Shelly in her 
arms, trying to put her to sleep, while watching over Nellie at the same time. 

[How can you fall for him when you don’t even know what he looks like? Why 
don’t you find a chance to remove his mask and see for yourself what he 
looks like before deciding to entrust your heart to him?] This was the only way 
Luna could think of to help Gwen and Luke reunite. 

The truth was, she could not help feeling exasperated every time she thought 
of this. 



Just a couple of days ago, after a series of cajoling and pleading, she finally 
convinced Joshua to tell her the truth—that Stefan Joneson was in fact, Luke 
Jones in disguise. 

However, since Joshua had not told Gwen of Stefan’s true identity in the first 
place and instead chose to lie to her about Stefan being a bodyguard who had 
suffered disfigurement in an accident…this unfortunately led to Gwen and 
Luke’s delayed reunion. 

If Joshua told her the truth earlier, Gwen would not be in so much anguish, 
and Luna would not need to find a way to persuade Gwen into removing 
Stefan’s mask and revealing his identity. 

At the thought of this, Luna could not help cursing Joshua and his ‘great idea’. 

He did this to protect Gwen from the pain of having to decide between Luke 
and Steven, but the truth was, if Luke really wanted to protect her, he would 
not have chosen to return to Gwen’s side in this manner. 

After all, Gwen would eventually find out the truth, and what was to say she 
would not be even more upset after discovering this? 

Had either of them attempted to think of this from Gwen’s point of view? 

At the thought of this, Luna sighed and tried to convince Gwen again. [Listen 
to me. You have to find a chance to take off his mask. If he turns out to be 
your type, you can feel free to listen to your heart and go after him, but if not, 
you can stay away from him!] 

Gwen did not know whether to laugh at this or not. A split second later, she 
sighed and replied, [Luna, I…I think I might have developed feelings for him, 
but it’s strange; I can’t help feeling that he reminds me a lot of Luke.] 

 


