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Pursuing My Ex-Wife Is not Easy chapter 3048-Gwen told Stefan her address 
with a puzzled look on her face. “What’s wrong?” 

“Wait for me. I’ll be there soon.” With that, Stefan hung up and sprinted back 
to the car. 

Kurt paused then followed suit, still carrying the woman in his arms. He flung 
the car door open before Stefan could even start the engine. “Boss, you were 
drinking just now. I think it’d be better if I drove.” 

Stefan furrowed his brow, suddenly remembering that he had drunk a few 
cans of beer with search Diablo when he tried to find out where they kept 
‘Gwen’. 

He was so anxious about finding Gwen as soon as possible that he forgot 
about this. 

At the thought of this, Stefan sighed and got out of the car, then slid into the 
front passenger seat. 

Kurt opened the door and placed the woman into the backseat. “Hold on tight. 
I’ll be driving very fast.” 

With that, he plopped into the driver’s seat and started the car, stepping on 
the gas so abruptly that the woman in the backseat slid right out of the seat! 

She finally understood that Kurt was not joking. 

She wrapped the blanket around herself again, then tucked herself in the 
space between the front and back seats. 

Although this was not a big car with ample space, the woman was so petite 
that she could easily fit in such a cramped space. 

She cowered in a corner as she stared blankly out the window at the passing 
streetlights. 

The car soon arrived at the hotel Gwen was at. 



Kurt, knowing that Stefan was anxious to find Gwen, had driven exceptionally 
fast and managed to reach there in only half an hour, despite it being a 40-
minutes drive away. 

As soon as the car screeched to a halt, Stefan flung the door open and 
stormed toward the hotel entrance. He was gone by the time the woman 
popped her head out from between the front and back seats. 

She froze and thought out loud, “That was quick…” 

“You cant stop him from finding the love of his life.” Kurt let out a chuckle, then 
glanced at the woman. “Wait here. I’ll get you a set of fresh clothes. What size 
do you wear?” 

The woman paused, then told him her size and added, “It’s okay. You can just 
get any size. I dont mind wearing men’s clothes either…” 

She had no specific requests; all she wanted was something to cover herself 
with. 

“Alright.” With that, Kurt got out of the car and made his way toward the 
nearest supermarket. 

The woman watched him leave in silence, her gaze filled with gratitude and 
awe. 

Although this man was not as strong or brave as Luke…she still felt that he 
respected her very much despite how she had been treated. 

Others would think she was impure after what she went through. Kurt, on the 
other hand, not only respected her but even behaved gentlemanly toward her. 

A tall, handsome, courteous man like this… 

It was hard for any woman not to fall for him. 

However… 

The woman lowered her head to glance at her battered, bruised body. 

Someone like her did not deserve to be with a man like him. 

 


