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I am a quadrillionarire chapter 2278-Thor and the others were relieved when 
they saw that David was safe. 

“Master David, you’re still alive!” 

“Master, are you alright?” 

Evie and Beanie asked excitedly at the same time. 

“What? Do you really think I’m that weak?” David smiled. 

“No! No! Master David, it’s great that you’re alive.” Evie said incoherently. 

She was very excited. 

She thought something would happen to David when he met his mother, the 
Elven Queen. 

Unexpectedly, he was fine. 

Plus, both David and her mother were both fine, which was great. 

Beanie did not speak, but she could not hide the heartfelt smile on her face. 

When Queen Isa saw that Evie was concerned about David’s safety the 
moment she saw him, she knew that David was not lying. 

After slowly calming down, Evie looked at her mother, Elven Queen Isa. 

“Mother!” Evie lowered her head and called out obediently. 

It was all her fault. 

It was she who sneaked into The Spirit Cage that caused what happened. 

Not only did she harm the maids who had followed her for many years, she 
almost could not go back. 

“Hmm!” Queen Isa responded lightly. 

“Sorry,” Evie whispered. 



“You shouldn’t apologize to me, but to all of the Elves. Evie, you are usually 
very obedient, but I never thought that you would be so courageous to come 
to The Spirit Cage. You know that if something unexpected happens here, you 
will also die in the real world, right? You are the Elven Princess and if you are 
gone, who will I hand the clan to?” Eventually, Queen Isa could not stop 
herself from reprimanding her. 

“I know I made a mistake, Mother. I will never dare to do this again in the 
future. Please forgive me!” 

Evie knelt in front of Queen Isa as she spoke. 

‘Tell me about what you have experienced since you entered The Spirit Cage. 
Don’t miss anything. I want to know everything,” Queen Isa took a deep 
breath and asked. 

Now, she was eager to know what happened to Evie after she came to The 
Spirit Cage. 

Most importantly, did a man assault her, and if she could still accept the 
inheritance? 

‘Yes, Mother!” 

Evie started telling her story, starting from when she first entered The Spirit 
Cage. 

First, she met Soleil, a direct descendant of the Alten family, who broke up the 
nine-member team, leaving only five of them. 

Then, a man rescued them. 

She thought she had met a good person, but unexpectedly, she fell into 
another trap. 

In the end, David bought them at an underground fair. 

This time, she did meet a good person. 

After listening to her daughter, Queen Isa did not speak, and nobody knew 
what she was thinking. 

After a while, she asked, “So you haven’t been violated?” 



“No!” Evie shook her head repeatedly. 

“Who was the man who took you?” 

“I only know his name is Black Fox, but I don’t know his real name.” 

“What about his appearance? Do you remember? Can you draw him?” 

“Mother, Black Fox was very cautious. Every time he appears in front of us, he 
will look different. He would be wearing a special mask for fear of being 
recognized by others.” 

At this moment, Thor suddenly interjected. 

‘Your Majesty, Princess Evie, I have had contact with Black Fox. May I say a 
few words?” 

Queen Isa looked at Thor and nodded expressionlessly, indicating that he 
could speak. 

‘Your Majesty, I have been in Sole for many years and I have participated in 
many underground trade fairs held by Black Fox. He is very mysterious. Every 
time he appears, many people will dress up exactly like him to maintain his 
anonymity. Until now, no one knows his true identity and appearance.” 

“When is that underground trade fair usually held?” Queen Isa asked again. 

This person dared to target the Elven Princess, so as the Elven Queen, how 
could Queen Isa spare him? 

“There is no set time, but according to what Princess Evie said, Black Fox 
discovered Princess Evie’s identity, so he was desperate to sell her in Sole. 
Otherwise, he could get a much higher price if he sold her in any first-tier city. 
From this, I infer that Black Fox is no longer in Sole,” Thor expressed his 
judgment. 

He had been in contact with Black Fox. 

So, he knew he was very cautious and would never put himself in danger. 

Not even a little. 

 


