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When Collin came back to the table, Roxanne and Mike were drinking 

and using sign language. Collin couldn't understand, but he stood in the 

distance and watched them for a while. 

He knew that Roxanne had a tough life when she was pregnant. Collin 

was shocked when the incident happened. At that time, her baby wasn't 
born. 

The skin of his cheeks tautened and his eyes turned red. Roxanne stood 
up and walked to Collin, "What's wrong?" 

"I'm sorry." Collin hugged her. 

Everyone at the table looked at them. 

Local people were not very open, and no one would hug others in public. 

Roxanne tried to refuse him, but she couldn't make it. Collin hugged her 

tightly, "I'm sorry." 

"Are you drunk?" Roxanne asked. 

Collin let go of her and touched her chin. Suddenly, Collin gave her a big 
kiss. 

The village women felt bashful, but they couldn't help but peep. Some 
people mumbled and cursed in low voices, but more of them were 

jealous. 

Collin was not gentle that night and Roxanne shouted herself hoarsely. 
They cuddled up and stayed closer. 

It seemed that only in this way could Collin allay his regret. 

The group packed their luggage and planned to go back to City Y. Collin 
had a long conversation with Mike, but Mike was unwilling to go to City 

Y with them. Mike waved his hand and wanted to refuse. 



Collin had no choice but let Roxanne and Livia say goodbye to Mike. 

Livia kissed Mike before leaving. 

Mike cried and waved his hand. He made sounds as if saying goodbye. 

"I will come back to see you. I will look after you when you are old." 
Livia said. 

Mike shook his head and waved his hand as if saying something. 

Livia cried, "He told me not to come back. It's not a comfortable place 

and the locals are not friendly. Just leave and never come back." 

Collin rubbed her head. 

Roxanne walked to and hugged Mike, "I gave the principal money every 
month. You can come to his place to have meals." Roxanne said it in sign 

language. 

Mike wanted to refuse, but Roxanne held his hand. After a long time, he 

nodded and made sounds. It meant agreement. 

After the conversation, Roxanne stood by Livia and stared at the house 
she had lived in for nearly ten years. Then she turned around and left 

with Collin. 

The principal brought a group of children to send them off at the 

intersection. Livia kept waving her hand and drawing in her head until 
the car drove them out of the mountain and no one was in her sight. 

Livia kept mom's words in mind, "When someone stays in a place for a 
long time, he or she has been accustomed to it and tends to rely on it. So, 
when you leave your comfort zone and enter an unfamiliar area, you will 

reject and fear. But after a while, you can adapt to it, because pursuing 
comfort is out of human instinct." 

"I have many friends in City Y. Their children are almost the same age as 

you. You will be good friends. Don't worry." Collin smiled and touched 

her head. 



Livia nodded. 

She did not want any friends. 

During these years, Livia lived in the village, but she didn't have any 

sincere friends. Therefore, Livia thought that it was not easy to make 
friends. 

Mom was right. All relationships needed to be cautious, no matter 

romantic love or friendship. 

At eleven o'clock in the evening, the car stopped. 

It was Livia's first time traveling long distances. Although she felt 
uncomfortable after sitting for a long time, she was still in high spirits 

when she got out of the car. As a kid, she was not naughty and 
overcautious at all. 

When they arrived in City Y, Livia looked at the strange city and behaved 
herself. 

Collin took them back to their residence first. It was the house Roxy lived 
in before. 

Roxanne stopped for a moment at the door. 

"What's wrong?" Collin asked. 

Roxanne shook his head. When she entered the house, she realized that 
Collin seemed to live in this place. 

"I used to rely on it to fall asleep." Collin adjusted the electronic clock to 
the point and listened to the hoarse voice inside, "When I am with you, 
insomnia has never bothered me." 

He put the clock on the bedside table and hugged Roxanne, "So, you can't 
leave me in the future, or I will have insomnia." 

"Are you tired?" Roxanne wiped her hair. 



Collin shook his head. "I'm not tired. What's the matter?" 

Roxanne put the towel in his hand and pulled him into the bathroom. 

As soon as the door closed, she tiptoed to kiss Collin. 

Collin gained the initiative instantly. 

They enjoyed warm water under the shower. 

"Do you remember?" Roxanne whispered. 

Of course, Collin remembered. They made a promise that only after 
Collin married could Roxanne leave. 

And then, he was not married. 

But she left. 

He bit her neck gently and held her hands. "Roxanne..." 

"What?" Roxanne asked. 

"When did you fall in love with me?" Collin's face was full of warm 

water, similar to tears. 

Warm water flew down from the showerhead. 

The room was filled with mist. Roxanne muttered, 

"It was longer than you..." 
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Before Collin took Roxanne and Livia to Cora's house, he told her, 

"Prepare the fast-acting heart-saving pill." 

Cora scolded him. 



When Collin introduced Livia to Cora that she was her granddaughter, 
Cora collapsed on the sofa, and Mike hurriedly went to the room to look 

for the fast-acting heart-saving pill. 

Cora was just shocked. She did not need to take the medicine, but her 

hands and feet were so feeble that they couldn't support her. She looked 
at Livia in disbelief, but her son did not look like he was joking. She 
began to look at Livia seriously and could vaguely see that Collin and she 
bore a little resemblance. 

"Granddaughter?" Cora didn't believe him. "How could she be my 
granddaughter? Collin, are you lying to me?" 

Collin took Roxanne to Cora's front and said, "You don't believe me, but 
you should at least believe her." 

It was only now that Cora saw Roxanne whom she felt slightly familiar. 

The name sounded familiar at first, and Collin reminded her, "You asked 
me to rent the wedding room. At that time, a girl came to rent the 
room..." 

Cora finally remembered. It seemed that Roxanne was the little girl that 
rented the house back then. Indeed, her voice matched as well. Cora 
looked at Livia and found that she was at least eight or nine years old. 

In other words, since Collin had ruined the girl, he left her to bring up 
the child alone. 

Cora was the same age as the girl when she gave birth to Collin, and she 
felt tired though she had a nanny at that time. Moreover, based on how 

Roxanne was dressed, she was obviously a simple girl. 

Cora slapped Collin on the shoulder. "Good! You did a good job at that 
time! The child is already at such an age. You brought her back now! Do 

you have any conscience?" 

Collin did not expect the plot to go this way. 



Roxanne was stunned as well, and she hurriedly stretched out her hand 
to stop Cora. "Madam, no, it's not his fault..." 

"Don't stop me! I'll help you get back at the injustice you've suffered!" 

Cora was worthy of being a model example of being swift and decisive in 

taking action. As soon as she finished speaking, she didn't stop slapping 
Collin more than ten times until her palm became red. Only then did she 
pull Roxanne over to apologize. "Roxanne, I'm sorry. I am a bad mother. 
You've suffered so much outside for so many years, right?" 

"Girl, you must have suffered a lot too, right?" Cora asked while looking 
at Livia seriously. 

Livia shook her head. 

"But you didn't tell me that you had a child!" Cora was trying to recall 
something. "Are you sure that she's your child? No, you didn't lie to me, 
right?" 

"Collin, this matter concerns the two families. Tell me, is that child 
yours?" Mike also asked in a low voice. 

"Yes." Collin took out a certificate from his pocket and said, "I was afraid 
you won't believe me. So I went to the hospital to do a DNA report the 
next day after I came back. Take a look." 

He showed the report before them. 

Cora was overjoyed when she saw it, but after that, she asked nervously, 
"Roxanne doesn't know it, right?" 

"No." Collin said frankly, "She suggested I do it." 

Mike raised his eyebrows and nodded thoughtfully. He exchanged a look 

with Cora. 

Cora nodded as well, and she had a slightly better impression of 
Roxanne. "This child..." Suddenly she thought of something serious and 

asked Collin immediately, "What exactly happened between the two of 

you? How could you hide it from me for so long? Your child is already at 



such an age, but mom still arranges blind dates for you every day. If you 
brought her here earlier, there wouldn't be so many unnecessary things 

to do." 
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"To tell you the truth, I do not know either." Collin sighed, "At that time, 

I was afraid that you would not agree with me being with her, so I went 
on blind dates. I was going to marry Jade at that time. But Roxanne knew 
it and left me for so many years. She was pregnant when she left. If I 

hadn't met her, I might have..." Collin spread his hands. "That's the 
story." 

"God bless you. Fortunately, you met..." Cora quickly put her hands 

together and prayed. After she finished praying, she told Collin, 
"Roxanne looks very quiet, but she couldn't accept any disloyalty. You 
must treat her well, understand?" 

"Yes." Collin smiled and agreed. "I will treat her well." 

Cora thought of something and quickly reached out her hand to Mike, 

"Give me some money." 

"Money? I don't know if I have enough money..." Mike took out his wallet 
and was about to take out his cash when he was mercilessly interrupted 
by Cora. "I don't need any cash. That card, I need your card." 

Mike was stunned. "Isn't the money left to cover the expenses we need 
after our retirement?" 

"We don't need it. Give me the card." Cora snatched his wallet, found the 
card, and took it out. 

Mike was speechless. 

Collin held back his laughter. When he washed the fruit and carried it 

out, Roxanne already had the card in her hand. Cora was asking Livia 
what she liked to eat. 



Collin sat beside Roxanne and said, "The money is all my parents have 
now." 

"Really?" Roxanne was surprised. 

Cora immediately said, "He lied to you. We still have some money left. 
Take it, it's just a greeting gift. I don't know what to buy. Do take it." 

Roxanne nodded. 

Cora finished chatting with Livia. She liked this well-behaved and 
obedient child very much. Moreover, she didn't have any strange accent 

like the people in the mountains. She was very good at speaking standard 
English. 

The child was already at such an age, but the two adults were not 
married yet. 

Cora thought before saying, "Look at the wedding room first. Tell me 
which one you like. I'll buy it." 

"I like the one we live in now," Collin replied. 

"Isn't that the one you..." Cora hadn't finished speaking when she 
thought of something. 'Maybe the house witnesses Collin and Roxanne's 

love,' wondered she. Then she immediately said, "Alright, tell me if you 
need to renovate it. What about the wedding? Have you decided the date 
of the wedding?" 

Collin tilted his head to look at Roxanne who said, "Anytime." 

Roxanne shook her head. 

Mike came out of the kitchen and said, "The private room has been 

booked. Let's go out to eat." 

"Let's go." After Cora left, she held Roxanne with one hand and Livia 
with the other. 

Collin walked behind and looked at them, feeling funny. 



Mike walked over and gently patted Collin on the shoulder. "When you 
build up a career and have a family, you have to bear the responsibility." 

There was something in his words that Collin could understand. "I have 

already reported to the dean. I will be going back to my job next month." 

Mike nodded. "You've always been reliable. It's just that your marriage 
has been dragged on for too long. Your mother urged you earlier because 
she didn't want to see you being too lonely by yourself. Now that you 

have a wife and a child, the two of you should get along well. Although 
dad and mom are old, we can still take care of your child. You must treat 
Roxanne well. When dad saw her, I knew that she must have suffered a 

lot. Since you chose her, you have to treat her well." 

"Yes." 

Collin raised his head to look ahead, and Roxanne just happened to turn 
around. 
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Eight years passed... 

Collin finally understood her gaze. There was fear, loneliness, hesitation, 
and despair in the pupils. 

Roxanne gave him a very shallow smile. Behind the smile, her sensitive 
and timid love was hidden. 

Collin took a few steps forward and firmly held her hand. 

"What are you talking about? You don't look good," she asked softly. 

"Do I look unattractive?" Collin bantered. "Didn't you say that I am the 
most handsome among the group of doctors?" 

Roxanne pursed her lips and didn't say anything because Cora was by her 
side, but Cora butted in, "What's the use of being good-looking? Will it 

bring a man fortune and luck? Am I right? Roxanne?" 



The corners of Roxanne's mouth slowly curved up. "... Yes." 

Cora took her hand and continued walking forward, "Why don't we go 
shopping after dinner. I haven't bought clothes for a long time. What type 

of clothes do you like? I will buy you a few..." 

Roxanne replied with a smile. 

"Livia is a good name. Grandma will buy you... clothes for spring, 

summer, autumn, and winter. I must buy you a hundred pieces..." 

"That's too many..." Livia raised her head to look at Roxanne, and she 

didn't know if she should refuse. 

Roxanne just smiled and let her decide for herself. 

"How about this? Whatever you like, grandma will buy for you." Cora 
gave in. "Girls should wear clothes in bright colors. Your black dress 

looks good too. Grandma just wants to buy some beautiful dresses of 
other colors for you..." 

"I only like black." Livia shook her head. 

"Why? Young girls at your age all like red and pink dresses. Why do you 
like black only?" Cora continued. 

"Because this is my mother's favorite color. I want to be like my mother," 
Livia said. 

"It's good to be like your mom. Black looks good too. It looks steady and 
magnanimous," Cora said. 

Cora was a good talker who was good at people. In short, Livia had only 
stayed with her for less than a day before she had a good impression of 

her. 

At first, Livia was too embarrassed to call her grandma. When she 
returned home at night, she picked up her phone and called Cora. 

"Grandma, we're home..." 



Collin whispered to Roxanne, "Look at our daughter, then look at you. 
You have never called me affectionately..." 

"Darling," Roxanne called expressionlessly. 

Collin was speechless. 

Although she had no expression on her face, Collin was still shocked by 
her hoarse voice which seemed to carry an electric current. 

Roxanne saw that his expression was not right and smiled, "Darling?" 

Everyone looked at Roxanne once more. 

She looked ordinary. They couldn't understand why Collin was attracted. 

"You guys don't understand. I made them a couple," the bespectacled 
doctor said merrily. 

"What?" One nurse asked. 

"This is a long story." The doctor adjusted his glasses with his fingers. 

"This story started eleven years ago... One day, we had coffee in the 
coffee shop. Our Doctor Collin fell in love with her at one sight back then. 
Under my encouragement, he bravely took the first step and asked her 

the telephone number..." 

"Impossible! It must be you who took a fancy to her and wanted to 

contact her. Collin stopped you and then she took a fancy to our 
gentlemanly Doctor Collin..." 

The bespectacled doctor defended, "... No, how can you change the 
script? That's how the story went." 

"What script? I think you are the one who made it up!" 

The bespectacled doctor was speechless. "Fuck. I become the scapegoat. I 

don't even have a name in the whole story. But I did have any complaints. 
Shit!" 



There was no one else in the corridor except him. 

They were still affectionate with each other in the office as if no one was 
there. 

The doctor took out his phone and examined himself in the camera and 
signed, "Good-looking people are enviable!" 
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On May 20th, it was sunny and warm, and there were no clouds in the 

sky. 

Roxanne sat in the bride's break room, and the makeup artist went out 
after finishing her makeup. 

"Mom, are you nervous?" Livia asked when she saw that everyone in the 

room had left. 

Roxanne shook her head. 

Glancing at Livia's teasing gaze in the mirror, Roxanne smiled and said 
softly, "A little bit." 

"Mom, you're very beautiful today. Really," Livia said with a smile. 

She gave her a thumbs up. 

Both of them thought of Mike at that moment. 

Livia took out her phone and took a picture of Roxanne. "It doesn't 
matter. I'll send it to Mike. He can see how beautiful you are today." 

Roxanne chuckled. 

There was a knock on the door, and Livia replied, "Please come in." 

Roxanne raised her head to look and was slightly surprised, but there 
was obvious happiness in her eyes. "Vivian?" 



Vivian came in unexpectedly. "Rag! You broke my heart! You didn't even 
tell me your wedding date! If it weren't for Doctor Collin informing me in 

advance, I wouldn't have been able to make it here at all! I took a plane 
and took a bus and jolted for more than ten hours here for you! Who is 

this?" He turned his gaze to Livia. "Flower girl?" 

Roxanne stood up. The pure white wedding dress was as simple as a long 
dress. She did not wear any jewelry, except for a pair of elk-shaped ear 
studs on her ears. When she was close, he could smell the perfume on her 

body. The smell was indescribably confusing and sexy. 

"She's my daughter, Livia Copley." Roxanne looked at Livia and said, 

"This is Vivian Brown. Mom mentioned him to you. Call him Vivian." 

"Hello, Vivian." Livia greeted politely. 

"Oh, your daughter..." Vivian was about to sit down when he suddenly 
shivered, "What? Your, your daughter?" 

Since Roxanne left and did not keep in touch with anyone, Vivian 
naturally did not know where she lived these years and how her life was. 

To be honest, if not for Collin still remembering to send him the message, 

he would have thought that Roxanne must have married another man. 

Who knew that the two were suddenly married, and now they had such a 

big daughter! 

"Oh my god!" Vivian opened his eyes wide, "You shocked me. We have 

been apart for a long time, so you prepare such a big surprise for me!" 

"How about you? How are you recently?" Roxanne asked with a smile. 

It had to be said that Collin understood Roxanne the most. Perhaps if it 
was someone else, Roxanne might not necessarily be able to chat frankly 
with others to eliminate her nervousness before marriage. But Vivian 

was different. During the most difficult period of Roxanne's life, Vivian 
accompanied her. He was a companion, a superior, and a friend. Only he 
witnessed how she worked hard to live and desperately integrate into 

this world... 



"Doctor Collin guessed it right," Vivian said angrily. 

Roxanne smiled faintly but did not ask. 

"I asked him why you didn't contact me. He said that you might find it 

troublesome for me, so you probably wouldn't contact me." Vivian said 
though he tried not to tell her. 

Collin said, "I don't understand." 

Vivian was speechless. 

Collin walked in and helped Roxanne comb her hair before saying, "I'll 
introduce a few friends to you later." 

"OK." 

Just as he finished speaking, a group of people rushed in from the door. 

Roxanne saw Janessa, Emma, and Christy standing in the front with 
Armando, Jaquan, and Trevor behind them. 

Jaquan exposed his head and smiled awkwardly, "They... can't wait to see 
the bride..." 

Janessa gazed at Roxanne attentively as soon as she entered, and then 
she grabbed Roxanne's hand. "Heroine, I never expected that it would be 
you who subdued this rich bachelor in the end. I thought that Doctor 

Collin would be lonely for the rest of his life. I must propose a toast to 
you later!" As soon as she finished speaking, she stuffed a red envelope 
into Roxanne's hand in a very unrestrained manner. "The few of us don't 

have anything else except money. It's a bit vulgar. But please take it." 

Roxanne said, "... I like money." 

Janessa laughed out loud and said to Collin, "Doctor Collin! You have 
good taste. I like your wife." 

Words failed Collin. 



Emma took out a gift box from behind and passed it to Roxanne, "A 
greeting gift. We might have to come and disturb you frequently in the 

future." 
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Roxanne thanked her for her gift and then said, "I am a very boring 
person. If you don't mind, you can come and have fun with me at any 
time." 

"No problem." Christy smiled and said, "I knew you are an interesting 
person the moment I saw you." She took out a red envelope and a gift 
from behind. The money was given to Roxanne, and the gift was given to 

Livia. "Your daughter is so beautiful. I don't know what to buy, but I 
picked this. Do you like it?" 

Livia thanked her. After opening it, she found that it was a pair of night 
running glasses. It was a high-tech gift. After wearing it, one could see 
anything in the dark. 

"Thank you." Livia thanked her again. 

"The wedding is about to begin. The groom, get ready!" Someone outside 
shouted. 

Collin responded and said to Roxanne, "I'll go first." 

Roxanne nodded. 

As soon as Collin left, Janessa and the others surrounded Roxanne. 
Vivian, as the only male present, stood before Roxanne extremely 
bravely. "You, what are you going to do?" 

"What did you say?" Janessa laughed sinisterly and winked at Christy 
who immediately subdued him. He shouted, "Help!" 

Christy thought he was too noisy and stuffed a towel into his mouth. 



Jaquan, Armando, and Trevor stood at the door, keeping a guard. 

Janessa took out her phone and said to Roxanne, "Come, scan the code 
and join our group chat." 

Roxanne was speechless. 

So was Vivian. 

Was there a need to mobilize so many people just to make her join a 
group chat? 

Roxanne took out her old-fashioned phone from her bag. 

Everyone was silent. 

Janessa looked at the old machine in confusion and asked Roxanne, "May 
I ask, when were you born?" 

"I don't play WeChat," Roxanne smiled. 

"The bride, get ready!" Shouts came from the outside. 

Roxanne stood up and smiled at the few of them, then looked at Janessa 

and said, "I'll go back and change my phone. When the time comes, you 
can invite me to join the group." 

Janessa waved her hand, "Hurry up and go. We're expecting the exciting 

part tonight." 

Roxanne nodded and stood up slightly, then walked out with a firm smile 

on her face. 

Roxanne had been staring at the man for a long time, and Collin asked 

from the side, "Don't you recognize him?" 

Only now did Roxanne turn around and ask uncertainly, "My father?" 

Collin nodded. 



Before they got married, Cora discussed with Roxanne about finding a 
friend of Mike as her godfather. On the day of the wedding, he was 

expected to hold Roxanne's hand and gave it to Collin. 

But Roxanne refused. 

She wanted to walk to Collin alone. 

Meeting Collin until getting to know him and then falling in love with 

him, she was alone. 

On the road to the future, she also hoped that she could put aside all her 

past and only have Collin in her eyes. 

And at this moment, Collin invited her parents and sat below the stage, 

looking at her. 

Roxanne understood what he was thinking. 

He wanted her parents to see that from now on, she, Roxanne, would be 
his girl, and he would marry her. But it had nothing to do with Ann and 

Eden Copper. 
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"I heard that the bride lives a hard life. Her parents passed away very 

early, so she has always been alone. She is very independent and 
powerful. It is said that it took our groom one year to win her heart." The 
host teased. 

Collin tilted his head. 

The host handed the microphone to him. "Our groom seems to have 

something to say, right?" 

Collin chuckled and said, "To correct your statement: it is not a year." 

The host asked him with a smile, "How long is that? It seems that the 
groom cares a lot about the time he has spent on the girl." 



"Nine years," Collin said. There was an uproar below the stage. 

Roxanne only smiled lightly. 

She had an aloof and refined temperament. The guests did not feel it at 

first. When they saw her and Collin standing together, they realized that 
the bride had an indescribable beauty. 

This beauty had nothing to do with appearance. Just by standing there, 

others would feel her beauty. 

Emily and Kaden arrived late. They didn't join Janessa and other partners 

until the wedding ceremony between Roxanne and Collin ended. 

Kaden immediately ran away on hearing that Emily would join Janessa 

soon. 

Therefore, Emily went to Janessa and the others alone. 

"Doctor Mueller's daughter is very good-looking. Did you see her?" 
Janessa asked Emily. 

Emily took out a red packet and a gift. "Not yet. I haven't had the time to 
see her yet. Which one is?" 

"That one, the one in the black dress," Janessa said, pointing at Livia. 

Emily nodded. "She is indeed beautiful." 

"What's inside the small gift box? It can't be a ring, right? Are you 
looking for a wife for your son?" Janessa raised her brow. 

Emily refused to tell her frankly. "It's just a small gift." 

Emily first went to Collin and greeted Roxanne. After sending out the red 
packet, Emily walked to Livia and handed the gift to Livia. 

"What's inside the box? She is so mysterious." Since Livia didn't show 
the gift to Janessa, Janessa grew very curious. Emily refused to tell her 

either, so Janessa wanted to ask Livia. 



"Just a piece of jade." Emily said, "Doctor Mueller sent it to me and asked 
me to paint on it. In the end, he asked a craftsman to carve it before 

sending it to me." 

"Ah? Why?" Janessa asked, "Aren't those which have already been curved 

in grocery stores better?" 

Emily explained, "Doctor Mueller said that his daughter only likes 
presents that are carefully selected. She doesn't like presents from 

common stores." 

"No wonder she liked the gift I gave her." Christy agreed. 

"Then I screwed it. She probably doesn't like me the most." Janessa 
shrugged. "Well, when I first saw her, I was thinking of establishing a 

marriage tie with Doctor Mueller." 

"In-laws?" Christy chuckled. "Your son is still young. Why are you in a 

hurry to find a wife for him?" 

Kaden dragged Emily away. 

"Chase." Chase turned to Livia. 

Livia was slightly stunned. "Why does your voice sound like a boy's?" 

Chase said, fiddling his hair. "Because I am a man." 

Livia froze in shock. 

"Mom, I don't want to make friends anymore," Livia said to Roxanne 

when she returned to Roxanne. 

Roxanne asked, "What's wrong?" 

Livia thought for a moment and said, "There is a boy wearing a girl's 
clothes. I thought he was a girl." 



Chen Xi understood. "Some people in women's clothes are boys, and 
some are girls in men's clothes. You'll be able to distinguish them when 

you're older." 

"Mom, which girls are wearing men's clothing?" Livia asked. 

Roxanne pointed to the editor who was checking the phone. "Here it is." 

The dumbfounded editor looked up in confusion. 

What was it? 

Was he missing something? 
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Happisland University was built later. 

Because of the money donated by many rich people in Happisland City, 
this university looked more imposing than the other universities. The 

teachers hired at Happisland University were well-known professors at 

home and abroad as well as some famous figures on TV. In recent years, 
many young promising people had graduated from Happisland 

University, increasing the reputation of this university. 

And the most outstanding of the promising youths was Jacky. 

"Jacky!" Christy called. As soon as Christy got out of the car, she saw 
Jacky surrounded by many students and teachers at the school gate. 

Jacky was very good-looking. He was slightly different from his father, 
who looked clean and delicate. Jacky took more after Christy. With this 
kind of beauty, even if Jacky just stood there without saying anything, he 

could still attract the attention of many people. 

Not to mention the other titles Jacky had, including a genius, a prodigy, 

and an inventor. 

Jacky handed the flowers in his hand to Christy. 



"Why did you buy me flowers?" Christy asked excitedly. 

Jacky pointed at the students behind him, and said, "The flowers are 
from those classmates." 

Christy went speechless. 

Ferne burst into laughter, and then Noah pulled him into the school by 
the collar. 

Levin was still sitting in the corner of the campus. When Noah passed by, 
Levin was staring at a flower in the garden. 

"What's so special about this flower?" Noah sat beside Levin and asked. 

"Congratulations on your graduation." Ferne took out a gift from his 
chest and handed it to Levin. 

Levin took the gift with a smile and said, "Thank you, Mom." 

"No! Call me Dad!" Ferne slapped Levin. 

Levin ignored what Ferne said and opened the gift instead. It was a very 
delicate pocket flashlight the size of a pinky. It was very textured and 
heavy. "Do you like it?" asked Noah. 

"Yes, I like it," Levin said. Levin turned on the flashlight. Although the 
flashlight was very small, the beam could reach far away. Levin tested it 

in his palms for a moment, then put the flashlight into his pocket and 
asked Noah, "Dad, you picked it, right?" 

Noah raised his eyebrows. 

"I was the one who picked the gift," said Ferne. 

Noah pointed to the flower in the garden and asked, "What's wrong with 
the flower you were just looking at?" 

Levin looked over and asked, "Can you see any difference in that flower?" 



"No," Ferne moved closer. 

Noah carefully compared that flower with the other flowers for a while, 
and then said, "It has fewer leaves than other flowers." 

Levin was stunned for a moment. "You can see that?" 

Because otherwise, Levin wouldn't have been isolated from the moment 
he became mature. 

"People are all visual animals. They will naturally like beautiful things 
and people. But Levin, you have to know," Noah said, holding Levin's 

shoulder, "Those who love you and care about you, don't care what you 
look like. And even if you become old and ugly in the future, they will 
still love you." 

"Are you touched? Noah never said anything so sentimental to me in his 
life, and I'm about to cry," said Ferne as he handed a tissue to Levin. 

Levin went speechless. 

The graduation ceremony began in the auditorium. 

Noah met up with Christy and the others and sat together in the hall. The 
principal was giving his speech on the stage, while Jacky, the most 

outstanding student in the whole school, was about to speak on the stage. 

"Jacky shouldn't be nervous, right?" Christy asked from below the stage. 

Trevor nodded. 

"Jacky needs to just read it after he has memorized the manuscript. 
What's there to be nervous about?" Ferne said. 

Christy took a deep breath and said, "I don't know why, but I'm a little 
nervous," 

"Maybe when your son expresses his thanks to his parents later, the 
lights will come to us..." Ferne coughed a little and straightened his 



collar, "Smile for the camera, Noah. We're gonna be the best-looking 
parents." 

"Alright," Christy said with a poker face. 
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The principal finished his speech and invited Jacky to speak on behalf of 

all the students. 

There was continuous applause below the stage. 

Christy clapped until her palms were red. Finally, she took out her phone 

and started recording. 

Jacky stood on the platform, holding a speech script in his hands. A 
moment later, Jacky put the speech script on the table, looked at the 

crowd below the stage with a slight frown, and said, "Before going on 
stage, the principal asked me to share my experience in getting these 
patents as well as the difficulties and obstacles in the process of 

inventing with you." 

Below the stage, tens of thousands of eyes were focused on Jacky. 

However, Jacky then said, "It's too simple. There are no difficulties or 
obstacles." 

The crowd below the stage was speechless. 

"As for things I've learned from that," Jacky thought about it, "It takes 
brains to invent. It's a waste of time for those with low intelligence to try 
it." 

Christy almost smashed her phone onto the stage. 

The principal got both speechless and furious. 

Jacky glanced at the speech draft, looked up, and said, "As for the 
suggestion for future juniors," he thought about it and said, "Since 

college is quite boring, and the courses are too simple, I think it's better 



for you to take time to play games." Speaking of games, Jacky paused for 
a second and went on, "Games are also too simple. Forget it." 

Everyone below the stage was shocked. 

The graduation ceremony came to an end. 

Christy drank an entire bottle of water before she managed to suppress 
the anger in her heart. 

As for Trevor, he ran away as soon as the graduation ceremony ended. It 
was said that Trevor went to City Y to look for Kaden. 

Ferne laughed as he watched the video, "How could Jacky be so arrogant? 
He must be like his uncle." 

Noah looked at Ferne with a blank expression. 

Ferne shut his mouth but burst into laughter after a moment. 

Christy rested her arm on Ferne's shoulder and said, "Mr. Ferne, let's go 

and have a drink." 

Ferne replied fearfully, "OK! I'm not afraid of you!" 

"Hey, Janessa, did you hear that? Mr. Ferne just challenged you," Christy 
said into her phone. 

Janessa's voice came from the other end of the phone, "How arrogant, 
Ferne! I'll be there soon." 

Ferne was startled. 

Jacky was in a good relationship with Kaden, and Kaden got on well with 

Levin and Chase. As a result, when Jacky went to Kaden, it would result 
in a large group of people gathering together. 

However, Kaden was busy chasing after Livia and had no time to play 
with Jacky at all. 



"Dame it!" The girl hung up the phone with a snap, and then stared at 
Jacky incredulously, "Is there anything wrong with you?" 

Jacky took out the IQ detector from his backpack and scanned the girl's 

forehead. 

Jacky got the result immediately. 

Jacky found the girl's IQ was only eighty-five. 

Jacky showed the girl the result and said, "Your IQ is too low. Don't talk 
to me. 

"Fuck! Where the hell are you from? Why are you so arrogant?" the girl 
asked as she ruffled her hair and exhaled, "Where are you going?" 

Jacky closed his eyes and ignored the girl. 

The girl was so angry that she grabbed Jacky's collar. Jacky was wearing 
a white shirt today and his collar was deformed after that. Jacky opened 
his eyes and only saw a face with heavy makeup. The fake eyelashes 

almost poked into his nostrils. 

"My IQ is too low?" the girl sneered, "How about yours? Let me see." 

Jacky took the detector and scanned his forehead. 

The result showed his IQ was 145. 

The girl went speechless. 
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The girl picked up the detector and looked at it, asking, "What is this?" 

"As you can see, an IQ detector," Jacky said as he revealed his wrist and 

there was a transparent watch on it. Jacky then grabbed the girl's index 
finger and placed it on the watch. A fingerprint detection was carried 
out. After the fingerprint was magnified, a projection screen popped up 

above the watch with all the girl's information. 



All the girl's information, including her name, height, weight, BWH, as 
well as her educational background, and grades in all subjects, was 

shown. 

"Fuck!" The girl reached out to cover the watch in shock, but she could 

not turn it off. 

"Got kicked out of high school for fighting?" Jacky read the girl's 
information expressionlessly, "Got 200 marks for SAT? For you, it is 

quite a high score." 

The girl glared at Jacky, "Are you out of your mind? Lock it up!" 

Jacky turned off his watch. 

Jacky looked out the window and suddenly looked back at the girl's chest. 

Zoey slapped Jacky on the face and said, "Shame on you! What are you 

looking at?" 

Jacky covered his face in disbelief, "How dare you hit me?" 

"Then how dare you peek at me" Zoey pointed at her chest, "Just now, 
you were staring straight here." 

Jacky pointed at Zoey and said, "That's because I suspect the data is 
wrong." 

"What do you mean?" Zoey asked. 

"The data shows that you are of C cup. But I don't think so." 

Zoey got too furious to say anything. 

Before Jacky arrived at Happisland City, he was dragged out by Zoey. 

"Hey! I haven't arrived yet!" Jacky shouted as he was pulled out of the 

bus by Zoey. 



"Shut up!" Zoey glared at Jacky fiercely, "Be obedient, and I'll let you go. 
If you don't follow my words, you'll..." She threatened, "You will be 

doomed, got it?" 

Jacky did not say anything. 

When Jacky got off the bus, he noticed that it was City Y. 

Jacky had never been to City Y before. The streets were different from 

those in Happisland City. The area of greenery here was larger than that 
of Happisland City, so it looked more spacious. There were fewer cars 
and not many pedestrians on the road. 

The lights were on and the night was just falling. The street lamps were 
lit up one by one, and there were many light bulbs wrapped around the 

trees, which seemed to flash when people looked far away. 

The environment in City Y was very good. 

Jacky looked around and then noticed a few men walking over not far 
away. 

The man in the lead was about the same as the girl beside Jacky. They 
both seemed to be from an alternative world. The man's hair was dyed in 
various colors. Then the man looked at Jacky with disdain and asked, 

"New boyfriend?" 

Zoey took Jacky and said, "Yes, my new boyfriend. He adores me so 

much." 

"Damn it! A bunch of idiots." Zoey cursed, and then she helped Jacky up 

and ran out with him. 

Jacky asked as he ran, "Why did the man hit me?" 

"Because you are an idiot!" Zoey cursed. 

Jacky seemed to have heard something ridiculous. He said in disbelief, 

"It's Impossible! My IQ is 145." 



"I really want to ask your parents how they managed to raise a fool like 
you!" Zoey kicked Jacky into a narrow alley while panting, and then 

followed him into hiding. 

The man and the others followed closely. 

Zoey quickly reached out her hand and covered Jacky's mouth, with her 
whole body almost sticking to him. 

After the man and the others ran far away, Zoey let out a sigh of relief 
and withdrew her hand. 

Jacky suddenly said, "The data is correct." 

Zoey said, "What?" 

"You are really of C cup," Jacky said with his eyes full of excitement 
because of his new discovery. 

"What the fuck! Shut up!" Zoey slapped Jacky on the head. 
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"Is he dead?" Someone in the dark asked. 

"Not yet. He's still breathing." A man came over and kicked the boy on 

the ground. 

The boy's body was kicked over and the face exposed was full of blood. 

"What did you do to his face?" The man in the dark came over and looked 
down, "Those two guests wanted him. How am I going to explain it to 
them?" 

"It won't matter after the boy takes a bath," the other man said. 

"But..." The man who had spoken before hooked his hand around the 
boy's face, and the corner of his mouth curved up, revealing a 
bloodthirsty smile, "Some people just like this style." 



The man walked out. 

The remaining man raised his hand and grabbed the boy's hair. The boy 
opened his eyes painfully. His eyes were bloodshot and filled with dense 

hatred and the intent to kill. 

"How dare you glare at me?" The man snorted disdainfully, "I'll let you 
know what the saying 'to live is no better than to die' means." 

The boy was taken to have a bath, and there were boys and girls of the 
same age everywhere. 

A girl came to ask the boy if he knew what would happen next. 

The boy only glanced at the girl before lowering his head. 

'What will happen? 

What else could happen?' the boy thought. 

The boy was taken to a room. 

The two beasts showed up again. 

The boy pounced on one of the men angrily, biting at the neck of the man 
with his teeth, and refusing to let go until the man stopped breathing and 
struggling. 

The boy wiped the blood from the corner of his mouth and turned to look 
at the other man. 

"Help! Help!" The other man shouted and ran to the door, "Help!" 

"Noah!" said Ferne, patting Noah on his face. "What happened to you? 

Why are you sweating so much?" 

Noah was stiff all over with his teeth tightly clenched. He opened his 

eyes, which were suffused with a bloody red color. 



"This is the first time you are drunk," said Ferne, looking at Noah in 
surprise, "Are you dreaming?" 

Noah pressed his temples and stood up. He staggered with his mind full 

of bright red blood. His hands and feet were still stiff, but his body was 

hot, and his heart was beating violently. 

"Aren't you going to take a shower?" Ferne asked while supporting Noah. 

Noah entered the room without a word. 

"I'm going to get you a glass of water," Ferne said and was about to 

leave, but Noah pulled him over. 

Trevor gently hugged Christy's shoulder. 

Christy turned around and smiled at Trevor. Then, Christy looked at 
everyone and said, "It's all over. Forget about it. Cheers." 

Janessa and Stephanie also stood up, saying, "Cheers!" 

"Levin has been out shopping for a long time." Janessa looked at her 

phone and said, "Did he go to City Y to shop?" 

"Levin is not like Jacky, who goes to City Y every day. If I had known 

that, I would have signed Jacky up for a university in City Y," Christy 
mocked herself. 

"No. Levin will be lonelier if you do that." Janessa picked up her glass 
and clinked it against Christy's. "Of course, even if Jacky is here, Levin is 
still lonely and helpless. Damn it, Levin deserves it." 

"Where is our daughter?" Stephanie suddenly looked at Harold. 

Harold was making tea for Stephanie. When he heard what Stephanie 
said, he looked at his watch and said, "She has been out for fifteen 
minutes." 

"I see." Stephanie continued drinking with relief. 



"Are you sure it's OK for your daughter to be out alone?" Janessa asked. 

"Of course." Stephanie thought of something, and put on a strange look, 
"I think no one dares to provoke my daughter. The students of the school 

call her the Lord of Poison." 

Janessa went speechless. 

Billionaire's Reborn Baby novel Chapter 1092 

"Look at what you did. She was a little princess." Janessa clicked her 

tongue. 

"Don't say that to me. Your son is going to leave you," Stephanie 
retorted. 

Christy laughed. 

Janessa and Stephanie turned to look at her at the same time. "What are 
you laughing at? Your son is mediocre other than being a little smart." 

Christy was speechless. 

"Do you want to fight?" Christy lifted her gown and was about to fight. 

"Darling! She wants to hit me!" Janessa shouted. 

Armando stood up from his seat. 

Trevor also stood in front of Christy. 

Stephanie didn't need to shout and Harold was already standing next to 

her. 

The six stared at each other. 

After staring for a few seconds, Ferne's shouts came from the room. 

Everyone turned around and looked at the room with strange 

expressions. 



Then the voice became higher. All the men present lower their heads 
silently. 

On the other hand, Stephanie and Janessa simultaneously took out their 

phones and recorded a video. 

The other side. 

Levin had just come out of the bar. His arm was a little injured, so he was 

about to go to the pharmacy to buy something to bandage it. Then, he 
saw a girl standing in front of him. 

She was dressed in a white shirt with a small bag on her shoulder. 

"Levin, you are injured," she said with a sleepy smile. 

Zaid didn't look like Stephanie. She was more beautiful than Stephanie, 
but she was too young to show her dazzling charm. 

Zaid was three years younger than Levin but was smarter. 

Perhaps because she had stayed by Spencer's side since she was a child, 

she was more mature than her peers. Zaid had a liberal attitude to life 
and death. 

"It doesn't matter. Why are you here?" Levin walked over. 

"Waiting for you." Zaid smiled and raised Levin's arm to look at it. "Let 

me bandage your wound." 

Levin seldom had contact with girls, including Livia and Zaid. 

However, Noah and Ferne stayed at the Delton Hotel all year round. 
Janessa, Armando, Stephanie, Harold, and the others would come to 

drink sometimes. Thus, Levin had met Zaid many times, but they did not 
talk much. 

Levin did not know why Zaid suddenly followed him out today. 



She was still smiling when she spoke, but Levin knew that they had the 
same nature. She was not a busybody. 

Levin thought it was strange. 

Stephanie was simple, while her daughter was cunning. 

"Hey, I bandaged your wound. It's fine if you don't say thanks, but you 
can't criticize me in your heart." Zaid blinked at him. 

Levin put on his shirt again. "Thank you." 

"Your shirt is stained with blood. I've already asked the owner to get you 
some clothes." Zaid packed her things and put them in her bag. She stood 
up and waved at him. "Then I'll go first." 

Levin nodded. 

He sat there with his upper body bare. He had a muscular and strong 
body. 

Zaid opened the door, and then she suddenly turned her head and said, 

"Levin, I really didn't like you in the past." 

Levin tilted his head slightly, revealing only half of his face. 

He had a plain face. But after he took off his clothes, Zaid found that his 
silent body was filled with power and secrets. 

Zaid gave him a thumbs up. "Now, I find that you are so handsome!" 

Levin fell silent again. 

 


