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"What do you want to play?" a short boy asked Lucy. 

Lucy shook her head. 

Tatiana stared at the crowd in front of her and exclaimed, "There are 

many handsome guys and beauties." 

Lucy looked up, and all the boys in Class F also looked up. 

Emily was just about to pull Vincent back. When she noticed that they 
were looking over, Emily stopped. 

Janessa was talking to Emma. When she saw Emily cuddled up in 
Vincent's arms, she thought that they were showing off their love again. 
"What are you doing?" 

Trevor and Armando had just come over and were now talking to Christy. 
Christy took a look at Emily. Before she could tease Emily, she heard a 

surprised cheer from afar. "Miss Sachs!" 

Christy turned around and saw twenty students rushing over. 

Emily jumped into Vincent's arms before the group of people rushed over 
and buried her face into Vincent's neck. 

Vincent was dumbfounded. 

"Miss Sachs, are you and your friends playing in the playground?" 
Tatiana rushed forward. She liked Christy. She liked beautiful women 
and was happy to make friends with them. 

Christy nodded. 

The other students also greeted Christy. 



The students didn't want to disturb Christy and her friends, so they were 
about to leave. Before leaving, Tatiana noticed a man standing with his 

back to them and found the figure familiar. 

"Does he look like Mr. Vincent?" 

"Yes!" Someone nodded in agreement. "I found it familiar when I came." 

Vincent lowered his head and said to Emily, "It will be strange if I don't 

turn around and greet them." 

Before Emily could say "It's more strange for you to turn around with a 

woman in your arms", Vincent turned around with her in his arms and 
greeted the students. 

Emily was surprised. 

The students found it strange to see Vincent holding a person in his arms, 

and they were pretty intimate. 

Everyone guessed that she must be Vincent's girlfriend who gave Vincent 

the rabbit gloves. 

"How do you do, lady!" Tatiana took the lead and shouted. 

The others also shouted, "How do you do!." 

Emily dared not answer. 

"They are greeting you," Vincent said with a smile. 

Emily, still lying on Vincent's neck, said in a low voice, "How do you do." 

"Is she feeling unwell?" Tatiana asked. 

Vincent touched Emily's head and said, "You're right. She's not feeling 
well." 

"Then we won't disturb you." Tatiana said before looking at Christy, 

"Miss Sachs, have fun," 



Christy smiled. 

Ferne struggled and came out of the water. He spat a mouthful of water 
on Noah's face and said, "Damn it. Do you want to kill me?" 

"Mr. Noah!" Just as Noah was about to press Ferne into the water, Noah 
heard shouts from outside. He looked up and saw that many students 
stood outside the water slide. 

"Mr. Noah, you are here to play as well!" a few male students greeted. 

Noah nodded. 

"Mr. Noah, you have a good figure!" Tatiana took a few pictures of Noah. 
Noah's clothes were soaked and stuck to Noah's body, revealing his well-

defined muscles. 

Noah didn't care about being photographed, but Ferne was angry. "Hey! 

You! Delete the pictures! Hurry up." 

Tatiana was sad. 

Tatiana was at a loss for a moment, but she deleted the photo. "Sorry. I 
have deleted it." 

"How could you be so frivolous with your teacher? What did you learn in 
school? Don't you know how to respect your teacher?" 

Ferne pinched his waist as he spoke, "After greeting your teacher, 
shouldn't you leave quickly so as not to disturb him? What are you doing 
now?" 

The students felt embarrassed. 

Hearing the scold, the students quickly left. 

As soon as they left, Ferne took out his waterproof mobile phone and 

took a few pictures of Noah. After that, he complained to Noah, "Your 
students are so naughty." 



Noah was speechless.� 
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In the Haunted House, other than the creepy music, there were also 

skulls and dummies around. Janessa and Emma weren't scared. They 
even protected Stephanie and comforted her. "Don't be afraid, they are 

all fake." 

Emily saw a man covered in blood dragging his legs and crying as he 

crawled in their direction, "Where are my legs? Where are my legs?" 

Stephanie screamed in fear and kept retreating. She almost bumped 

Emma and was lifted by the guard with one hand. 

"Thank you." Stephanie turned around and wanted to thank him, but the 
Haunted House was dark. She could not see the person who had picked 

her up. She only vaguely felt that there were people around her, but they 
were in the darkness, so she could not see their faces clearly. 

"Emily! Help!" Stephanie shouted. 

Emily was studying the red color on the man's body. She dipped a little 

on her finger and smelled it. It was not chicken blood, but red paint, 
which had a scent. 

"Miss, have you seen my legs?" the man on the ground said as he dragged 
his broken legs. 

Emily asked him, "What is the brand of this red paint?" 

Everyone was lost for words. 

After coming out of the Haunted House, everyone was fine. Only 
Stephanie was frightened. When she was about to come out, there was a 
headless man standing at the entrance of the cave, holding a skull in his 

hand. His voice came from his abdomen. "Where is my head? Did any of 
you see my head?" 



Stephanie was not afraid at first, but the two eyeballs in the skull 
suddenly looked at her, and then the skull opened its mouth. Stephanie 

screamed and ran out. 

This was the end of the Haunted House trip. 

"Stephanie, I advise you to bring your boyfriend over next time. 
Otherwise, he wouldn't have the chance to hear your beautiful crying," 
Janessa teased Stephanie. 

Everyone laughed out. 

"I won't come again. I won't come again!" Stephanie said as she waved 
her hand. Her face was pale. 

"Where else do you want to go? Let's go with you," Emily asked. 

"Slow down! Let me take a break." Stephanie found a chair and sat down. 

"Let's split up and have fun." Janessa leaned on Armando's shoulder and 
said, "Everyone, have fun with your couple first, and then meet under the 

Ferris wheel." 

"Sure." 

"I'm alone," Stephanie said, raising her hand. 

"Then you can come with us," Christy said, raising her hand to hug her. 

"You can come with me. I am also alone," Emma said to Stephanie. 

As expected, when Tatiana arrived at Emily's side, she pointed at her and 
Vincent and widened her eyes. 

Emily was just about to admit it. Yes, they were a couple. But Tatiana 
shouted, "You also met Mr. Vincent!" 

Emily was stunned. 



"We just met Mr. Vincent!" Tatiana said as he shook Lucy's arm. "Isn't 
that right? What a coincidence! We just met Mr. Vincent." 

Lucy glanced at Emily's clothes, then at Vincent. She slowly widened her 

eyes and mouth. It was obvious that she had confirmed a fact that 

shocked her greatly. 

"Right. Mr. Vincent, where's your wife?" Tatiana asked and looked at 
Vincent. 

Vincent glanced at Emily. "She is..." 

"Well, Mr. Vincent, didn't you say you were going to have ice cream? 
Why are you still here?" Emily interrupted him, "Hurry up and go." 

Vincent glanced at her and turned to leave. 

Emily looked at Tatiana and Lucy, "What are you doing here?" 

Lucy had yet to understand what had just happened, and her eyes were 
filled with shock as she looked at Emily. 
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"We're here to tutor those guys," Tatiana explained simply. Then, she 

asked curiously, "Are you familiar with Mr. Vincent?" she looked at 
Vincent's back and said, "I feel that the way Mr. Vincent looked at you 
was weird. I mean the expression in his eyes." 



"What kind of eyes? Did he seem to have a crush on me or did he fall in 
love with me at first sight?" Emily sounded out. 

Tatiana shook her head. "No. On the contrary, he seemed to hate you." 

Emily was speechless. 

"Where are the others?" Emily changed the topic. 

"They're doing the test papers. And we're looking for the washroom." 
After Tatiana finished speaking, she looked at Emily and asked, "Did you 
come alone?" 

Emily thought for a while and said, "I came with my friend." 

Tatiana looked around carefully immediately and asked surprisingly, 
"You mean Stephanie?" 

"No, she didn't come." Emily had just finished when she saw Stephanie 
and Emma walking over, side by side. They smiled at her from a distance. 
"Hey, why are you here? Where's Mr. Vincent?" 

Emily was in shock. 

Tatiana's eyes lit up. "Stephanie!" 

Stephanie greeted Tatiana with a smile, "Hello." Then, Stephanie noticed 
something was wrong with Emily's appearance. So she stopped right 

there and asked with hesitation, "Emily, are you OK?" 

"Yeah, I'm fine," Emily said, holding her forehead. 

Lucy was so surprised that she could hardly believe it."You... Do you..." 
She looked at Stephanie and Emily. Then, she looked at Tatiana in shock. 

After looking at them one by one, Lucy fixed her eyes on Emily. "You 
know each other?!" 

Tatiana whispered to Lucy, "Be quiet. Yes, Emily and Stephanie are good 
friends." 



"Good f..." Before Lucy finished shouting, her mouth had been covered by 
Tatiana. "What are you doing? Be quiet!" Tatiana said. 

Lucy covered her mouth on her own, with her eyes wide open, looking 

towards Emily. "Good ... Good friends?" 

Stephanie quickly put on her mask, pretended not to know Emily, and 
supported Emma to walk back. 

"Where are you going?" Emily asked. 

"To the washroom," Stephanie said, pointing at the signboard. 

Emily looked up and confirmed that the washroom was indeed on this 
road. 

"Let's go together. They also go to the washroom." Emily said. 

"Alright," Stephanie said as she supported Emma and turned around. 

The girls were stunned there. 

It was silent for a few seconds. 

Tatiana and Lucy were so frightened that they quickly hid behind Emily. 
And Emily merely widened her eyes in surprise because she had not 
figured out the situation, but her first reaction was that this man was 
abnormal. 

Janessa frowned, took a glance at the naked man, and said in a mocking 
tone, "Just like this?" 

The perverted man said nothing. 

Christy looked all over the naked man and asked, "What's there to see?" 

The perverted man was wordless. 

Seeing that the girls were not frightened, the perverted man closed his 

coat and was going to leave. Just then, the bodyguards of the Alberton 



family, who hid somewhere around, all moved out and pressed that man 
to the ground. 

"Help! Let me go!" The perverted man's face was pressed against the 

ground, and his body was twisted in reverse. He called out in alarm, 

"Who are you? Let me go!" 

Emily took her phone and captured a few photos of the man's face. Then 
she called the police, "Hello, I'm calling from Starlight Amusement Park. 

We caught a pervert at the washroom door..." 

The perverted man struggled even harder when he heard that.��������������� 
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"He will be released after detention for at most fifteen days," Christy 
said. 

Emily frowned. "That's it?" 

Emma gestured to the bodyguards of the Alberton family, and the 

bodyguards immediately dragged the perverted man into the men's 
washroom. 

As soon as the door of the bathroom was closed, a howl came from 
inside. Then a few men ran out of the bathroom in a panic. Seeing a 

group of women standing at the door, they ran out in panic, shouting 
something as they ran. 

"They won't beat him to death, will they?" Emily asked. 

"No." Emma looked at the bathroom and said, "I'm just teaching him how 
to be a human." 

Janessa was laughing, "How dare he show off when his penis is so 
small?" 

Stephanie was speechless. 

"Let's go to the bathroom," Christy said as she dragged Janessa in. 



Emily, on the other hand, led Tatiana and the others out. Tatiana asked 
Emily in a low voice, "Could those men in black be bodyguards?" 

Emily nodded. 

"But I don't think they're Stephanie's bodyguards, but the lady next to 
her." Tatiana didn't know how to describe it. "I thought that lady was 
approachable! But now I am shocked when she is with eight bodyguards." 

Emily smiled, "She is indeed very approachable." After a pause, she 
added, "But if you offend her, you'll regret it." 

Tatiana exclaimed, "Emily, how did you get to know these powerful 
friends? Stephanie is a famous star. The lady who looks approachable has 
eight bodyguards. And..." 

Tatiana suddenly realized something. 

"You know Miss Sachs too!" Tatiana cried out. 

Emily was speechless by Tatiana. When Lucy saw Christy, Lucy 

subconsciously glanced at Emily. Emily was too lazy to lie or find an 
excuse, so she blinked at Lucy as a response. 

"You know Miss Sachs, which means you know Mr. Noah too!" Tatiana 

was shocked. "You don't know our principal, do you?" 

Emily led the group around the corner and saw a man standing in front 

of the ice cream vendor's cart. "No," she said with a smile. 

Tatiana was speechless. 

"What's wrong?" As soon as Emily walked over, Vincent stared at 
Tatiana, who was howling behind. 

"It's fine." Emily held his arm. "Let's go to play." 

"Aren't you afraid of being seen by your classmates?" Vincent handed the 
ice cream over. 



Emily took it, took off the mask, and tried it. Then, she pulled Vincent 
down, took off his mask, and kissed him on the lips. "No. I don't care." 

Vincent chuckled and walked forward with his arms around her. 

"Lucy, tell me. Is this true? Am I dreaming?" Tatiana was still pinching 
her face. 

"To be honest, I also feel like I'm dreaming," Lucy said as she looked at 

Emily and Vincent's intimate back as they left. 

Tatiana was speechless.
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By the time they returned, it was already evening. 

Everyone had a good time in the afternoon. Apart from Janessa and 
Emma who could only sit in their chairs and watch Stephanie scream in 
the pirate ship, the trip was quite pleasant. 

After driving back, Armando got out of the car and went to the dessert 
shop to buy tiramisu for Janessa. In the car, Stephanie and Christy also 

called out, "Please bring me some." 

"Okay," Armando answered. 

"Wait for me!" Ferne's voice came from the back of the car. 

Noah lit a cigarette and was smoking. When he heard this, he glanced at 

Ferne. "Do you want to eat what girls like?" 

Ferne rolled his eyes, unfastened his seat belt, and rushed over. 

Armando stood at the entrance of the shop and said, "What do you want 
to eat? I'll bring it for you." 

"No need, I can do it myself." Ferne swaggered in. 

"Give me a bigger cake and a candle," said Ferne. 

The clerk nodded and asked, "What size would you like? And the model?" 

"Whatever, just a little bigger is enough." Ferne pointed to the sample 
placed in the cupboard and said, "This one is okay." With that, he glanced 
at Armando who was picking cream biscuits, then lowered his voice, and 

said to the clerk, "I'll come to get it in an hour. How much is it? I'll pay 
you." 

"Okay," the clerk replied softly. 



"What did you buy?" Armando came over to pay after choosing the 
things, and when he saw that Ferne was empty-handed, he could not help 

asking. 

Ferne picked a few bottles of freshly squeezed fruit juice and a few 

desserts decorated with strawberries, and then said, "Just these." 

"When did you like to eat these?" Armando took out his wallet, but it was 
paid by Ferne first, "I'll do it. It's my treat. You can buy more." 

Armando had not used a single cent from his family since he started 
working. His friends all knew it, so when they went out, they were all 

rushing to pay the bill. After all, Armando had to raise his family. The 
expenses were not small. 

"There's nothing else. Let's go," Armando said as he put away his wallet. 

They went back. Christy and the others had parked their cars and were 

waiting downstairs. When they saw them return, they rushed over. 
"What did you buy?" 

Girls always liked sweets, so Janessa, Emily and the other girls gathered 

together to share the sweets, chattering happily. 

"Who will eat Tiramisu?" 

"Me!" Janessa raised her hand. 

"Puff! Who wants to eat it?" 

Christy raised her hand. 

"Chestnut cake?" 

Stephanie raised her hand. 

"Mango..." Before the words were finished, Vincent raised his hand. 

"Here." 

Emily was speechless. 



Lord Top was about to get something to eat downstairs and met them. 
"What do you want to eat?" Christy pulled her over before she could 

understand the situation. 

Lord Top pointed at something casually. 

"William cake! You have a good taste!" Christy handed the cake over, 
then used a spoon to dig a spoonful and had a taste. Then, she turned to 
taste the others'. 

This was the first time that Lord Top ate like this with others, and she 
couldn't help but feel that it was fresh and funny. She smiled. 

The others also held their own desserts and walked around to taste other 
people's. 

Unfortunately, Christy had taken a fancy to the sweets that Ferne was 
carrying, so she took it all. 

"..." 

When Ferne went upstairs, he looked at the empty bag in his hand and 
sighed. "Fortunately, I have expected this..." 

Janessa and the others went to Emily's place to chat. Noah and Ferne 

went home first to take a shower and change clothes. When they were in 
the amusement park, their clothes were completely soaked. They bought 
a clean set of clothes to change into, but they always felt uncomfortable. 

Noah had mysophobia. The first thing he did when he went home was to 
take a shower. Even Ferne was affected by him. 

The two of them took a shower before going to Emily's place. Janessa and 
the others were there as well. Emma, Jaquan and Armando were playing 
cards and chatting with each other. Stony was watching beside them. 
Christy and Trevor were in the kitchen. They later had dinner and left 

when it was almost nine in the evening. 

Jaquan, Emma, Janessa, Armando and Stephanie went back to the hotel. 



After Ferne sent them downstairs and watched them leave in the car, he 
told Noah that he was going out to buy something. Noah frowned and 

asked, "Have you brought the key?" 

"I brought it with me," Ferne nodded. 

It was not bad to run to the amusement park. However, Ferne was frozen 
by the water slide and almost got beaten to death by Noah. 

Of course, Ferne didn't dare to say these words. He only said, "It's quite 
fun to go out and play together." 

Noah stared at the cake, as well as the exaggerated heart-shaped candle 
on the cake, and then looked at Ferne's embarrassed expression. He 
suddenly smiled. 

"Idiot." 

"What did you say?" Ferne jumped up. 

"Shut up." Without even looking at him, Noah suddenly lowered his head 

and blew out the candle. 

The entire room was plunged into darkness. 

Just as Ferne was about to say something, he heard Noah's low and soft 
voice from the darkness. 

"Thank you." 

"No need to thank me..." Ferne turned around in embarrassment. Later, 

he found that the room was completely dark and that Noah could not see 
him at all. He could not help but muster up his courage. "Just thank you?" 

Ferne was a little bit proud. 

Noah was still standing in the same position as before. Ferne could not 

see Noah clearly. He only heard Noah asking, "What do you want?" 



Ferne was especially grateful for the darkness around him. Otherwise, he 
wouldn't have the courage to say this, "Will you give whatever I want?" 

Noah was silent. 

Ferne coughed lightly. "I..." 

Ferne wanted to joke around, but then he heard Noah's gentle voice. 

"Yes." 

"..." 

'Are you kidding me? 

How rare!'���� 
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Chapter 936 Silent Mode (1) 

  

As soon as Stephanie got out of the car, she met John at the entrance of 
the hotel. She was a little surprised, "You are not waiting for me, are 
you?" 

  

Armando gave Stephanie a ride. Janessa looked at John through the 
window. Janessa did not disturb Stephanie. She drove her car directly to 
the side and parked it. 

  

Jaquan and Emma got out of the car. Stony was sleepy and could barely 

wake up. When Stony saw Stephanie standing with a strange man, he 
looked up and seemed to be waiting for Stephanie to introduce them to 
each other. 



  

"Well, this is my ... meal companion.” Stephanie thought for a moment 
and said to Jaquan and Emma, "Nobody special. You guys go up first. I'll 

have a conversation with him- 

  

John nodded and greeted all the people there. With a smile on his face, 

John inadvertently sized up Jaquan and Armando. 

The female companions of these two men should be switched. Armando 

was too ordinary, and Emma was plain, too. On the other hand, Jaquan 
and Janessa, both attractive, were a perfect match. One was handsome 
and the other was pretty. 

  

But... 

  

Now that these two women were both pregnant, they were not just 
lovers, were they? 

  

John's gaze fell on their fingers and he saw the wedding rings. 

  

Armando didn't speak much. He only nodded at John and walked in, 
escorting Janessa all the way. Janessa, on the other hand, glanced a few 
more times when she passed by John. Then Janessa winked at Stephanie. 

As for Emma, she only glanced at John. When she passed by Stephanie, 
she said, "It's not safe at night. Come back early. 

  



Call me if you need anything.” 

  

It seemed to be deliberately said for John to hear. 

  

But Stephanie was touched since probably they were all worried that 
John was a bad person and worried that Stephanie might be fooled. 

  

Jaquan walked directly to John and chatted with him for a while. After 
asking for a business card from John, Jaquan pulled Stony to the hotel. 

  

“This is the meal companion Stephanie mentioned.” When Janessa almost 
reached the elevator, she whispered, “He's hot.’ 

  

"Too plain’ Jaquan said disdainfully. 

  

"Speak for yourself.” Janessa then poked Armando in the face. "Look at 

him, then look back at that man. Don't you suddenly feel that the man is 
really hot?" 

  

Armando was speechless. 

  

So was Jaquan. 

  



So was Emma. 

  

Stephanie stood in the wind and felt a little cold. She rubbed her hands 

and felt delighted, but she maintained a calm expression on her face. 
“Are you waiting for me?" 

  

John said, "You didn't say that you hung out with your friends today. I 
thought something happened to you. I didn't see you when I went to your 

shop. I was wondering if I would meet you here, so I waited for a while.” 

  

Stephanie briefly talked about the trip to the amusement park. When she 
talked about the ghost house, she looked painful. 

“I can't go there anymore. I won't go again next time. I was almost 
scared to death.” 

  

"Next time, I'll take you there.” John smiled. "You'll be safe to be with 

me.” 

  

John was suggesting something. Stephanie forced a smile but she did not 
reply. 

  

"You look so happy today." John said, “You had a smile on your face when 
you got out of the car. We've known each other for some time. I've never 
seen you happier.” 

  



John was right. Stephanie was indeed very happy that day. This was the 
first time she had hung out with her friends in an amusement park 

without being spotted. Not only was she not discovered, but she was also 
very happy. Christy and Emily had taken her to try the attractions that 

Stephanie did not dare to try. In the end, the group bought all kinds of 
flavored marshmallows and hid in the merry-go-round to taste them. 

When Stephanie closed her eyes, she could recall the scene where she 
was screaming on the pirate ship like a crazy woman. 

  

Stephanie also thought of Emily who took silly photos of Stephanie. 

Stephanie could not help but smile. "Yes, I am very happy.’ 

  

When the waiter came over to serve the dishes, John occasionally looked 
up to say something to Stephanie. Stephanie sipped the glass of milk. 

When she finished drinking, John also finished eating. After the meal, 
John said goodbye to Stephanie. It seemed that John only needed 
Stephanie as a meal companion. 

  

The two parted at the door. John suddenly said, "There are many fun 

places. If you are interested, I will wait for you at the door at eight 
o'clock tomorrow morning." 

  

Stephanie thought for a moment and said, "I don't think I can get up at 

eight.” 

  

"Then I'll wait for you.” John laughed. 

  

“Alright.” 
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Chapter 937 Silent Mode (2) 

  

Tomorrow was an official date. Stephanie thought to herself. 

  

After returning to her room, she called Harold, but she did not expect 
that Spencer would pick up the phone. 

  

"Grandpa, haven't you slept yet?" Stephanie looked at the time. It was 

almost ten o'clock. 

  

"He just came back. He is full of injuries. I am cleaning his wounds.” 

Spencer said. 

  

“What? Is he injured? Where is he? Has he fainted?" Stephanie asked 

with a frown. 

  

"No. What's wrong?” Harold asked. 

  

“I'm calling to ask how you are doing. How did you get hurt? Did you get 
beaten up by those people?” When Stephanie thought of this possibility, 

she couldn't help but say, “Hurry up and quit. You don't have to earn 
money to support the family. I'm here” 

  



"I was hit by a piece of wood. It wasn't a big deal? Harold said and made 
light of it. 

  

“It's not a big deal. Only a large piece of skin on the back of his shoulder 
is gone.” Spencer deliberately said exaggeratedly and sighed, "So much 
blood." 

  

"What! Why are you so seriously injured?" Stephanie felt goosebumps all 

over her body. 

  

"I'm fine. I'm fine. What about you? Is there anything wrong?” Harold 
took his phone, turned off the speaker, and said to Stephanie. 

  

"No." Stephanie wanted to share her good mood of going on a date with 

someone tomorrow, but when she heard that Harold was injured, she 
immediately did not want to say anything else. After giving a few words 
of advice and hanging up the phone, she took a shower and went to sleep. 

When she got on the bed, she remembered that she had forgotten to 
apply the mask. 

  

Stephanie did not go to have fun the next day. She received a call from 

the Relax Room early in the morning and rushed over. There was a 
patient, who had been suffering from depression, missing after 
returning. The patient's family searched for a day but could not find him. 

They found the Relax Room and were making a scene at the reception. 
Stephanie should not show up to deal with this matter, but she still came 
out to appease the family members and called the police, asking the 
police to look for the patient. 

  



Due to the police and patient's family members showing up in the Relax 
Room that day, many people with depression didn't dare to come over. 

The Relax Room was empty and quiet. 

  

Stephanie sat in the office in a daze, waiting for the phone call from the 
patient's family and the police. 

  

Later, John came. 

  

When John walked into the office, Stephanie was still in a daze. She knew 
that someone had come in, but she did not realize that it was John. She 
just looked at him and asked, "What is it?” 

  

John knocked on the office door, “Are you hungry? Let's go. I'll take you 

out to eat.” 

  

He heard about what happened here, but he did not ask anything. He just 
took Stephanie out and found a quiet place to sit down and have a simple 

meal. 

  

Stephanie had no appetite. She only ate a few things. Then she said that 
she was going back to the hotel. 

Stephanie also stayed in a business suit, but she had never opened her 
curtains before. Even in the middle of the night, she did not have the 

habit of looking at the night sky. She had been used to avoiding paparazzi 
all year round, so wherever she went, she would subconsciously check if 

the windows and curtains were closed. 



John took half a step. When he turned around, he saw Stephanie still 
standing by the sofa without moving. He could not help but think of 

something and suddenly smiled. "I almost forgot." 

  

He closed the curtains, leaving only a crack in the middle. Then he turned 
back to look at Stephanie and said, “Is this OK?" 

  

Stephanie walked over and looked out from the crack. The floor was not 

high, but the view was good. Neon lights were shining on the distant 
street, and a building facing them was still lit with an LED display 
screen. 

  

"Have a seat.” John cleaned up the coffee table and moved it over. There 
was a chessboard on it. When he saw Stephanie staring at the 
chessboard, he explained, "Usually, I play alone.” 

  

Stephanie sometimes felt that he was very lonely. He ate, played chess, 

and drank alone. When she thought of herself, she could not help but 
laugh bitterly. 

  

"What are you laughing at? You're not laughing at me, are you?” asked 

John, noticing her smile. 

  

"No, Stephanie shook her head with a smile, “I just feel that a person 
playing chess alone is quite special." 

  



John sat down, "Do you know how to play? Play a game with me." 

  

Stephanie knew how to play. She sat down and her mood was a little 

more relaxed than before she came in. 

  

The two chatted as they played chess. John was not local. His boss came 
over and opened a branch company. John's boss asked John to come over. 
John's boss had arranged an apartment for John, but one of the neighbors 

was renovating the apartment. It was so noisy that John could not sleep 
at night, so John simply stayed in the hotel. 
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Chapter 938 Silent Mode (3) 

  

“Will you go back in the future?” Stephanie asked after taking a sip of the 
red wine. 

  

“After the work here is over, I should go back. Why do you ask me this?” 

John looked at Stephanie and chuckled. 

  

"Nothing." Stephanie felt it was really strange. She had been on guard 
against John before. However, when Stephanie heard what he said, she 
was inexplicably reluctant to part with him. 

  



"You can't bear to part with me, right?" John looked into Stephanie's eyes 
and asked. He looked very charming. Stephanie tried to shake her head, 

but she unconsciously nodded. "Yes." 

  

John looked Stephanie in the eye. 

  

Across the chessboard, John leaned over to Stephanie. Stephanie froze at 
once. However, John stopped and asked, “Will you kick me if I kiss you?" 

  

A few seconds ago, Stephanie was nervous. But now, she was amused, 
"You..." 

  

Before Stephanie could finish speaking, John kissed her. 

  

Stephanie's mind went blank. Apart from filming, she had not kissed 
anyone for a long time. However, Stephanie was not repulsed. When John 
tried to stick his tongue down her throat, Stephanie pushed him away. 

  

"Sorry..." Stephanie stood up and walked out. 

  

John quickly took a few steps forward and stopped Stephanie. "I should 
apologize. Did I scare you?" 

  

"No." Stephanie lowered her head and thought of her ex-boyfriend. They 

had been extremely close to each other. However, later, Stephanie 



discovered that her ex-boyfriend was just pretending to be nice, so she 
was deceived. Thinking of this, Stephanie was not sure if John was 

deceiving her. Although Christy told Stephanie not to worry about too 
many things, Stephanie was worried and afraid. 

  

Stephanie had poor psychological endurance. Otherwise, she would not 
have been depressed for so long or tried to commit suicide. 

  

“What's up?” John thought for a moment and asked, "Do I have a bad 
breath?" 

  

Stephanie was amused with a smile playing in her eyes. "No..." She bit 

her lower lip, saying in a soft and shy voice. “It smells like wine. I like it. 

  

"Then why did you push me away?" John asked. 

  

Stephanie lowered her head and did not reply. 

  

“Well.” John picked up the handbag on the sofa. “It doesn't matter if you 

don't want to tell me. I will give you a ride home’ 

  

They walked out side by side. When they arrived at the door of 
Stephanie's room, John handed the handbag to Stephanie. 

When Stephanie reached out to take it, John did not let go of it. 

  



"Good night; John said. 

  

"Good night-” 

  

  

“It's nothing. I can't sleep, so I want to chat with you.” Stephanie 
yawned. "Well, I'm sleepy now. I'm going to sleep.” 

  

Harold said at the other end of the phone, “You can call me at any time. I 
am always here for you." 

  

For some reason, Stephanie was touched by Harold's words with tears 

trickling down her cheeks. Stephanie spent nearly half her life acting and 

performing to make money for her adoptive parents, so she always 
wanted to escape from this place. Harold was the first one who told her 
that she could call him at any time.’ 

  

Stephanie burst into tears and felt very sad. She told Harold everything 
that had happened today in a broken tone. “They spoke in a hurry and 
were very cruel. I wanted to throw a fit, but after thinking about it, I 

calmed down. After all, I'm responsible for it. I didn't expect it when I 
decided to run Relax Room, so I..." 

  

Stephanie stopped. 

  



Stephanie was badly treated. 

  

However, Stephanie couldn't say it to anyone else. Although the problem 

was solved, she remained worried. Stephanie knew she would encounter 
all sorts of difficulties, but she wouldn't be able to handle them. She 
would even meet more mean customers. 

  

Hence, Stephanie wanted to talk with someone who would do nothing but 

quietly listen to her. Stephanie didn't need comfort. 

  

Harold was a rather good listener. He listened quietly until Stephanie 
said that she was tired. Then Harold said, "Go wash 

your face and put a warm towel on your eyes, or you will look very ugly 
tomorrow." 

  

Stephanie nodded and fell asleep as soon as she lay down on the bed with 

a warm towel on her eyes. She even forgot to hang up the phone. 

  

Harold didn’t hang up the phone until he heard her gentle breath. 
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Chapter 939 Show Me (1) 

  

Emily was dragged to the toilet by Tatiana the next day in school. Making 
sure that there was nobody around, Tatiana lowered her voice and said, 

"You... You and Mr. Vincent...” 



  

"Yes, what's wrong?” Emily asked as she washed her hands. 

  

"I couldn't believe it! You must be relatives, right?" Tatiana analyzed, 
“Because you study in this school and he is a teacher, he came to take 
care of you. Am I right?" 

  

Emily was dumbfounded. 

  

After a moment of silence, Emily asked, "What did Lucy say?" 

  

"She said you're married.” Tatiana chuckled, “If you're married, I'll eat 

the mirror, the mirror you're looking at right now.” 

  

"I'll just devour it; said Tatiana. 

  

Emily didn't know what to say. 

  

She sighed, “You are right. Mr. Vincent is my uncle.’ 

  

"I told you!" Tatiana slapped Emily on the shoulder, "That's more like it! 
You're so young and Mr. Vincent is so old. How could you be a couple?” 

  



"Is Mr. Vincent old?" Emily looked at her with surprise. 

  

Before the guards outside the door laughed, they heard a notification 

sound from WeChat. Everyone looked at each other in dismay and saw a 
voice message that had been sent on Guard D's mobile phone. 

  

The guards were stunned. 

  

Guard B clicked on the voice message. Then, he heard Tatiana's loud 

voice, “That's more like it! You're so young and Mr. 

Vincent is so old. How could you be a couple?” 

  

The guards were speechless. 

  

They all fell silent. After a while, the guards immediately jumped on 
Guard D and beat him up. “Bastard! Don't drag us down if you are in 
trouble.” 

  

“He even sent it to Mr. Vincent! Shit!" 

  

When Vincent, who was at home, heard this voice message, he walked up 
to the mirror and looked at himself carefully. 

  



"What is happening outside?” Tatiana listened carefully. "It seems like 
someone is fighting.” 

  

“Let's go back to the classroom; Emily said, patting her. 

  

"Oh." They returned to the classroom. 

Emily had drawn a lot recently, but she didn't release her paintings. She 

drew a portrait of Trevor, which had been given to Christy, and the 
portrait of Christy had been given to Trevor. The portrait of Harold was 
not in his tombstone. Emily also drew Vincent's mother and even drew 

pictures of Vincent naked. 

  

Finally, Emily took another picture to participate in the competition. 

  

It was a painting of Easton, Class S's class monitor. But Emily learned 
from Ferne that before others could see the picture clearly, it was bought 

at a high price. Therefore, very few people knew that "E" had produced a 
new piece of work. 

  

"This person is particularly mysterious. No one knows whether it's a man 

or a woman and no one knows how old it is. The painting is special..." 
Tatiana was at a loss on how to phrase her words. 

  

"Especially beautiful?” Tatiana interjected. 

  



"No, it has a kind of conception; Tatiana said. "When people see it, they 
will resonate with the drawing.” 

  

"Did you read too many porn comics so that you would feel refreshed 
when you see the beautiful pictures?” Tatiana asked. 

  

Tatiana glared at Tatiana. "I didn't!" 

  

"Don't deny it. You hide so many pornographic works under your desk,’ 

Tatiana snorted coldly. 

  

Seeing that they were about to quarrel again, Emily immediately stopped 
them. "Class is about to begin. Stop arguing.” 

  

Then they fell silent. 
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Not long after, Tatiana used his pen to press against Emily's back. 

Emily leaned back and tilted her head slightly. 

Tatiana took out the album that Marley had read and said to Emily, "Your 
painting is much better than hers. Hurry up and draw one. It will sell 

higher than hers." 

Emily was lost for words. 



"I have faith in you. Although your painting isn't worth ten million, it 
should be worth at least one hundred. I believe you!" Tatiana patted 

Emily's shoulder. 

Emily didn't know what to say. 

Lucy got some water from the water dispenser to make tea. She even 
asked Emily if she wanted some. Emily smelled the tea and felt that it 
was familiar. "Where did you buy it?" she asked. 

Why did it smell so similar to the tea planted by the Tea Manor? 

"Miss Sachs is selling it. I bought some from her," Lucy whispered. 

Emily understood. 

She had almost forgotten that Christy had told her that Christy was 
selling tea. However, Emily had never expected that Lucy would also buy 

it. 

"I smelled it when I went to the office. I asked around and bought some. 

It's quite delicious and refreshing. Many people in our class have bought 
it." 

Emily was stunned. "Our class?" 

"Yes," Lucy pointed at Jenny beside her. "She was the one who tried it 
first. She said that after drinking the tea, we wouldn't be sleepy. So, the 

others also bought some." 

Lucy meant the people who always followed Jenny. 

Emily was surprised that Lucy had been accepted by Class F. When she 
mentioned Class F, she used the words "our class". 

Jenny was looking down at the questions when Lucy suddenly mentioned 
her name. Jenny couldn't help but look up. First, she met Emily's eyes. 
Then she looked at Lucy and said, "Option C." 

Emily was lost for words. 



Lucy was also speechless. 

Jenny was doing her homework. When she saw Emily and Lucy's shocked 
expressions, she could not help but ask, "Isn't that right? Isn't the answer 

C?" 

They didn't know what to say. 

The first thing Emily did when she returned home after school was to 

turn on the computer. Recently, she had been watching Rex's computer 
every day. She was watching what websites he had browsed, what he had 
bought online, and whether he had watched porn. 

Vincent looked at her and approached her quietly. He glanced at the 
notebook on the table and asked, "What were you doing just now?" 

"I just went to the bathroom." Emily walked over and hugged his neck. 
"What's wrong?" 

Emily held Vincent's neck and let him sit in front of the desk. 

Emily turned her back to the laptop and she was stunned. 

Vincent had turned on the laptop and the screen lit up. 

Emily hugged Vincent's waist and listened to the sound of the laptop. 
Emily dared not to look back. Her eyes were spinning. 

"Why is the laptop on?" Vincent asked as he lowered his eyes to look at 
her. 

Emily quickly said, "It must be Rex. He must have forgotten to turn it off 
after using it." 

"Really? Rex went out an hour ago and hasn't come back yet." Vincent 
looked at her. 

Emily was speechless. 

 


