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The Ex Husbands Revenge Chapter 2531-“Jensen, are you going to make me 
your enemy for this guy’s sake?” Felton’s expression darkened and he glared 
sharply at Jensen. 

“Mister Fermer, I’ll repeat this: I have no intention of opposing you! Mister Wolf 
hasn’t done anything to you, yet you undermined him. You are out of line 
here. 

Mister Wolf offered me a pill and if you intend to harm him, I won’t stand idly 
by!” 

Jensen said calmly. 

“Why you! Very well! Jensen, Renee, you asked for this. 

Since you two insist on protecting him, don’t blame me for not showing 
mercy!” 

Felton was utterly enraged by the fact that Renee and Jensen kept protecting 
Leon. 

Not wanting to waste more of his time, he waved his arm and commanded his 
guards, “You two will deal with Hugh. Destroy him and feed him to the 
hounds! I will handle Jensen and Renee!” 

Renee and Jensen’s statuses rivaled that of his and on top of that, Renee was 
the woman he was interested in. 

If he had any other option, he would not choose to hurt her. 

However, Renee and Jensen both insisted on protecting Leon so he could 
only keep them under control while his bodyguards took care of Leon. 

This was his best option. So long as he stalled Renee and Jensen, his two 
guards could take care of Leon and resolve everything. 

“Yes, sir!” the guards responded. 

Without hesitation, they fired up their true energy and charged at Leon. 



“How arrogant!” Leon lost his patience and was about to attack when Renee 
beat him to it. 

“Don’t you dare!” Renee scoffed and extended her arms to launch two waves 
of true energy at the guards to stop them from harming Leon. 

“Renee, it’s me you need to deal with!” Felton was prepared for this and sent 
his powerful true energy at Renee. 

“Oh no!” Renee paled. 

Though she reached the Initial Emperor State, she was still weaker than 
Felton in the Intermediate Emperor State. 

She dared not to take his attack directly, nor could she dodge because Leon 
was right behind her because she did not want to give them a chance to hurt 
Loen. 

Just as she hesitated, Felton’s attack reached her. 

“Miss Morrison, allow me to help!” Jensen reacted swiftly and darted toward 
Renee. 

He extended his arm and launched a powerful attack to fend off Felton’s 
attack. 
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Following a deafening sound, the combined attack launched by Renee and 
Jensen clashed with Felton’s true energy. 

Though both of them reached the Initial Emperor State, they just reached this 
level while Felton long reached the Intermediate Emperor State. 

As their attacks clashed, Felton remained completely still while the other two 
backed away under the pressure of his energy. 

“He’s good!” Their expression darkened once they steadied themselves. 

Initially, they thought they could stand a chance against Felton now that they 
both reached the Initial Emperor State. However, a casual blow from Felton 
could easily overwhelm them and his strength surpassed what they imagined. 



Even if they fought together, there was no way they could defeat him. 

“Mister Wolf, Felton is too strong and we can’t beat him! Miss Morrison and I 
will stall him, so run while you can!” Jensen snapped out of it and shouted at 
Leon. 

Leon was Felton’s ultimate target. Though they could not beat Felton, they 
should be able to stall him. 

All they needed to do was keep Felton occupied for some time so that Leon 
could get away. 

“Yeah, Mister Daglesh is right! Hugh, run!” Renee urged. 

She agreed with Jensen and realized that they could not defeat Felton. 

At the moment, they could only stall to buy Leon time to escape. 

So long as he succeeded in escaping, Felton would not dare to do anything to 
the two of them out of fear for their families. 

That way, all issues would be resolved. 

“Trying to run? Not happening!” Felton scoffed and saw right through what 
they were thinking. 

Launching another attack at Jensen and Renee, he shouted at the guards, 
“What are the two of you doing? Destroy Hugh! IV “Yes!” The guards snapped 
out of it. 

They paused earlier and refrained from attacking Leon because Renee and 
Jensen were in the way. Now that Felton was blocking them, the guards no 
longer had any concern. 

Not daring to hesitate, they immediately circled around Renee and Jensen 
and each launched a powerful attack at Leon. 

“Oh no!” Both Jensen and Renee paled. 

They wanted to hurry to Leon’s rescue but were both hindered by Felton. It 
took them all their might to withstand Felton’s intensive attack, so they could 
not possibly save Leon. 



“Guards! Go fend off those two people and help Mister Wolf escape!” At the 
very last moment, Jensen shouted at his bodyguards while fighting Felton 
alongside Renee. 

The Ex Husbands Revenge Chapter 2533-“Yes, sir!” The guards did not delay 
and both launched their attacks at Felton’s bodyguards, attempting to force 
them into giving up. 

“Get out of the way!” Felton’s expression darkened. 

The guards were about to finish Leon off, so Felton would not allow anyone to 
interfere. He waved his arm and sent off a wave of powerful true energy that 
overwhelmed Jensen’s guards instantly. 

“Oh no!” Jensen’s guards were both shaken. 

They were just ordinary guards who ran errands for Jensen. Hence, they were 
Intermediate Emperor State Felton was in. 

Hence, there was no way they could withstand Felton’s attack. 

Baam! Baam!” 

Following two deafening sounds, the two were sent flying by Felton’s true 
energy and slammed hard onto the ground. 

As soon as they landed, a sharp pain pierced through their chests and they 
each spat blood before lying sprawled on the ground. 

“Die!” The two guards were right in front of Leon and started their attacks. 

“Oh no!” Renee and Jensen’s hearts sank at the sight. 

They were both busy fighting Felton and could not hurry to Leon’s rescue. 

The guards that worked for Jensen were already defeated by Felton and Leon 
was left vulnerable to Felton’s guards. 

If they were not mistaken, there was no escape for Leon unless there was a 
miracle. 

The two could only watch as the attacks darted toward Leon in despair. 



Ariella felt exactly the same. Leon gave her a pill that helped her through the 
bottleneck of her training, and she remained grateful for that. 

Seeing that Leon was in danger, she desperately wanted to help. However, 
she Overlord State. 

They were far stronger than her and she could not help Leon even if she 
wanted to. 

“It’s time to die. No one can save you now!” Contrary to Renee, Jensen and 
Arie I la’s reaction, Felton sneered and looked at Leon as though he was 
already dead. 

He did not know how strong Leon was, but he knew that Leon was merely the 
vice president of Cynthion Group and not someone from a powerful family. 

Judging from Leon’s age, Felton assumed he was weak and no match for the 
guards. 

If he was not mistaken, Leon would be severely injured or die from the attacks 
and there was no other possibility. 

However, reality was cruel and what happened next shook them all. 

The Ex Husbands Revenge Chapter 2534-Know your place!” Leon scoffed. 

Just as he was about to fight back, he recalled something. 

After defeating the Southern Boss, he and his confidantes all trained and 
made progress in their training. 

reaching the Peak Overlord State. 

Overlord State and slightly weaker than him. 

Despite all the tricks he had up his sleeves, he only needed to use his true 
energy to take care of the guards and there was not even a need to use 
spiritual energy. 

On top of that, he mainly focused on training his spiritual energy so far and 
neglected his growth in true energy. 



Since he was now facing enemies of a similar level, he decided this was the 
perfect opportunity for him to gain more experience and reach the Peak 
Overlord State as soon as possible. 

With that thought in mind, he did not use his spiritual energy and launched two 
waves of true energy at the two guards. 

Baam! Baam! 

Following two loud noises, their attacks clashed. 

Though Leon’s true energy was on the same level as the guards, his physique 
was incredibly strong after all that he went through. 

Along with the treasures he possessed, he was practically invincible so the 
guards could not possibly beat him. 

As their attacks clashed, Leon remained still while the two guards were forced 
to back away under the pressure of Leon’s true energy. 

Leon took the opportunity to attack and charged at the guard that was closest 
to him. 

“Oh no!” The guard paled. 

He just steadied himself and was in no position to dodge Leon’s attack. 

In a rush, he launched a desperate counterattack in an attempt to stop Leon. 

Baam! 

As they clashed, Leon’s true energy tore through the guard’s defense and 
slammed against his chest, sending him flying. 

As soon as the guard landed, he spat blood and slumped on the ground. 

“Know your place, brat!” The other guard snapped out of it and launched an 
attack from behind Leon. 

Based on the earlier exchange, he could tell that Leon was on the same 
power level as him. Now that Leon was attacking the other guard, his back 
was left in the open and this was the perfect chance for the guard to attack. 



Not missing the opportunity, the guard charged forward without hesitation, 
knowing that he would be able to avenge his comrade. 

Unfortunately, he underestimated Leon. 

From Springfield City to the southern region, Leon experienced different 
battles and near-death experiences. In terms of strength and skills, he rivaled 
the likes of the Southern Boss so there was no way that this guard could harm 
him. 

The Ex Husbands Revenge Chapter 2535-“You are the one who should know 
your place!” Leon scoffed and leaped into the air to dodge the attack. 

Then, he turned to land a powerful kick that aimed for the guard’s neck. 

“How swift!” The guard was shocked by the powerful true energy Leon 
wielded. 

He initially thought that he could apply great damage with the element of 
surprise. To his bewilderment, Leon was swift enough to dodge his attack and 
launch a counterattack. 

Leon’s movements were smooth with no excessive moves, which surprised 
him. 

The guard was still on the momentum of his initial attack and had no time to 
dodge. At the very last moment, he rolled off the ground to distance himself 
from Leon. 

However, Leon’s attack had a wide range and the guard was one step too 
late. 

Though he managed to avoid taking the blow on his neck, Leon’s true energy 
struck in in the chest and he was instantly sent flying. 

Baam! 

Paling, the guard spat blood and sustained internal injuries like the other 
guard. 

“What? How is that possible?” Felton was shocked and could not believe what 
he was seeing. 



To his knowledge, Leon was just a vice president of the Cynthion Group who 
was not from any influential family. 

State, making them fairly formidable amongst the younger generation. 

Apart from some of the direct descendants of powerful families, these guards’ 
strength was unrivaled. 

Considering Leon’s age, Felton assumed that the guards could easily take 
care of him. To his bewilderment, the guards ended up getting defeated 
instead. 

This was so surreal that he was shaken to the core. 

Naturally, he was not the only one who was shocked. Renee, Jensen, and 
Ariella all felt the same way. 

Due to Leon’s humble background and young age, they all assumed that Leon 
was weak or not even a martial artist. 

At the very least, there was no way that he could survive the guards’ attack. 

To their surprise, Leon turned out to be a rather formidable martial artist who 
defeated the guards with ease. 

This caught them by surprise and they instantly realized why Leon remained 
composed the entire time. Leon was never one to be bullied without fighting 
back and they all underestimated him. 

 


