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“Don’t worry, the sect Master of the Heavenly Cloud sect isn’t here at all. Naturally, no 
one will be able to accept this gift.”Sima bei continued. 

Even though that was the case, Yong Ji still didn’t have the intention to extend his hand 
to accept the gift. 

He said somewhat awkwardly, “Lord Sima Bei, you should change someone else. I… 
Haven’t been feeling too well recently.” 

Sima bei sneered, “What? A Heavenly Cloud Sect’s sect master scared you to this 
extent? I said, he’s not here at all!” 

“I know he’s not here. I just haven’t been feeling well recently.”Yong Ji braced himself 
and said. 

Sima bei frowned slightly. It was very obvious that he had underestimated Yong Ji’s fear 
of the Heavenly Cloud Sect’s sect master and overestimated Yong Ji’s courage. 

“I’ve already said that he’s not here! Moreover, so what if he is? You’re only going to 
deliver a gift. As a great sect, the Heavenly Cloud sect will definitely not act rashly 
against you.”Sima bei said earnestly. 

“If you don’t go, I’ll kill you right now. Of course, if you complete this matter, after the 
master recovers, I can help you step into the reversion void stage.” 

The combination of kindness and power instantly made Yongji’s eyes light up. 

Before Yongji could speak, Feng Hai at the side volunteered, “Lord Sima Bei, he doesn’t 
dare to go, I will go! Since his Tianyun sect’s sect master isn’t here, there’s nothing to 
be afraid of!” 

“Alright.”Sima bei made a gesture and was about to pass this gift to Feng Hai. 

But before Feng Hai could receive the gift, Yongji took the gift box in his hand. 



“I’ll go.”Yong Ji said with a smile. 

Sima bei snorted coldly, “Aren’t you feeling unwell?” 

“It’s fine all of a sudden. Don’t you think it’s Strange?”Yong Ji said shamelessly. 

He took the gift and repeatedly confirmed, “You’re sure that he’s in thunder roar 
courtyard and not in Heavenly Cloud Sect, right?” 

Sima bei said with a dark face, “Since you’re so worried, I think you’d better not go!” 

“I’ll go. I’m just asking.”Yong Ji said with an embarrassed smile. 

Sima bei snorted lightly and said, “Then let’s set off now. Don’t waste time.” 

“Okay, I’ll leave right away.”Yong Ji agreed. 

With that, he stood up and shot toward the direction of the Heavenly Cloud sect. 

Although he was a bit worried, Sima Bei didn’t seem to be lying. Moreover, the condition 
of helping him to step into the reversion void stage was too tempting. 

After Yong Ji left, Sima bei looked at Feng Hai. 

“You cooperated well. The position of the godly monarch is currently lacking one. I will 
apply to the Lord as soon as possible,”Sima Bei said indifferently. 

Feng Hai hurriedly cupped his hands and said, “Thank you, Lord Sima Bei!” 

“By the way… is the sect master of the Heavenly Cloud sect around?”Feng Hai 
changed the topic and asked suspiciously. 

“Most likely not, but I’m not sure either.”Sima bei did not lie. 

“Then is the news that he’s in the Thunder Academy Fake?”Feng Hai continued to ask. 

Sima bei sneered, “Of course it’s fake. How would I know where he is?” 

Feng Hai suddenly came to a realization and could not help but break out in cold sweat 
for Yong Ji. 

“Yong Ji, I can only say that I’m helping you with your good luck.”Feng Hai muttered in 
his heart. 

… 



In the Heavenly Cloud Sect, the sect leader of many sects had gathered. 

They had been discussing how to deal with the current situation all day long. 

Qin Yu’s whereabouts were unknown. Qu Zhu was living in seclusion on wind bamboo 
mountain, while the sect leader of the Heavenly Cloud sect was missing. 

Under such circumstances, they could only rely on themselves. 

“In my opinion, it’s better to find an opportunity to negotiate,”an elder stood up and said. 

This old man was called Kong you. He had never been willing to fight with others, and it 
was the same for his sect. 

If it weren’t for the northern land attacking them this time, Kong you would never have 
participated in this matter. 

“Negotiate? How?” 

“The negotiation needs to be done on an equal footing before we have the ability to 
negotiate. The northern land clearly wants to exterminate us.” 

Kong you smiled and said, “Nothing is absolute. It all depends on how we negotiate.” 

“Oh? Does that mean that old Mister Kong has an idea?”Someone asked coldly. 

Kong you waved his hand and said, “We can only say that we’ll try. If we don’t try, no 
one knows if we’ll have a chance.” 

“I don’t agree to negotiate. The northern lands also said that they wanted to negotiate 
the last time. What was the result?” 

“Hehe, if Xiao Hai didn’t agree that time, it might not have been impossible to negotiate.” 

“Didn’t they always want the northern border? We’ll just give it to them.” 

For a time, everyone was divided into two factions. Some people agreed while others 
disagreed. 

As they were speaking, someone suddenly walked in from outside. 

A disciple of the Tianyun sect walked quickly to the side of the deputy sect leader and 
said in a low voice, “Yongji is here.” 

As soon as he said this, the vice sect master’s expression changed drastically! 



Although the Disciple’s voice was very soft, the people in the meeting hall were all very 
powerful and could not escape their ears at all! 

“What? Yong Ji is here?” 

“What does he want to do? is he going to attack us?” 

“Where is the sect master? Yong Ji is here and the sect master still doesn’t intend to 
show himself?” 

Everyone was panicking, and the deputy sect master’s expression was extremely ugly. 

Di Zun, who was at the side, said in a deep voice, “Everyone, don’t panic. I’ll go ask the 
sect master to show himself now.” 

When he heard this, a trace of surprise flashed across the deputy sect master’s face. 

Di Zun nodded at him, telling him to be at ease. 

When the deputy sect master saw this, he could only brace himself and agree. 

Then, the deputy sect master stood up and walked out of the meeting hall. 

In the hall, Yong Ji was holding a gift box and sitting there with a smile on his face. 

He was also uncertain because he didn’t know whether the sect master of the Heavenly 
Cloud sect was there or not. 

Even though his divine sense couldn’t catch the sect master’s figure, Yong Ji still didn’t 
dare to be too presumptuous. 

The deputy sect master walked quickly into the hall. He looked at Yong Ji in front of him 
and couldn’t help but say coldly, “Yong Ji, you still dare to come to my heavenly cloud 
sect? !” 

Yong Ji glanced at the deputy sect master and said indifferently, “Deputy sect master, 
Why Are You So Angry? It’s better to resolve the enmity than to form a knot.” 

The deputy sect master glared at Yong Ji and said through gritted teeth, “You are just a 
treacherous villain. What is there to talk about with a person like you? Get out 
immediately!” 

Yong Ji’s eyes narrowed slightly. He slowly stood up and said, “I heard that the sect 
master of the Heavenly Cloud sect has returned. I don’t know if it’s true or not.” 



The deputy sect master was startled. He said with some lack of confidence, “Of course 
our sect master has returned. What does this have to do with you!” 

“Are you serious?”Yong Ji raised his eyebrows and said tentatively, “Since he has 
returned, why hasn’t he made a move yet? You should know that I almost caused the 
fall of the Heavenly Cloud sect back then. Doesn’t he want to kill me?” 

The deputy sect master opened his mouth and was speechless. He couldn’t say a word. 

Seeing the deputy sect master’s expression, Yong Ji instantly had an idea. 

“It seems that Sima Bei didn’t lie to me. The sect master of the Heavenly Cloud sect 
didn’t come back at all!”Yong Ji said coldly in his heart. 
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Even though that was the case, Yong Ji was still a little worried. He still did not dare to 
be too arrogant. 

To be on the safe side, Yong Ji stood up and said, “Regarding the incident last time, I 
am filled with guilt. And our northern land also does not want to be enemies with the 
Tianyun sect.” 

Speaking up to this point, Yong Ji took out a gift box and said, “In order to express our 
apology, the northern land specially prepared a gift to apologize to the sect leader.” 

The deputy sect master secretly felt that things were not good. He was silent for a 
moment before saying, “I don’t think there’s a need for that. Our Heavenly Cloud sect 
doesn’t want to have an affair with you.” 

Yong ji chuckled and said, “This is a token of our northern land’s goodwill. Moreover, it 
was personally given to me by our Northern Land’s master. No matter what, I have to 
give it to you.” 

The deputy sect master frowned slightly and braced himself to say, “Then hand it over 
to me. I will hand it over to the sect master.” 

Seeing the deputy sect master’s behavior, Yong Ji increasingly believed in his own 
thoughts. 

The Heavenly Cloud Sect’s sect master had not returned at all! Otherwise, the deputy 
sect master would not have such an attitude! 



Hence, Yong Ji said with a smile, “The Divine King has said that this thing has to be 
handed over to the sect master personally. It’s better for Lord sect master to come 
forward.” 

The deputy sect master’s expression turned even uglier. 

The sect master had not returned at all. How could he come forward to receive this gift? 

“Hand the thing over to me. Our sect master doesn’t want to see you.”At this point, the 
deputy sect master could only brace himself and continue acting. 

With that said, the deputy sect master stretched out his hand to receive the thing. 

However, Yong Ji reached out his hand to the side and said with a faint smile, “I said 
that this thing can only be handed over to the sect master personally.” 

The Deputy Sect Master was silent and did not know what to do for a moment. 

When Yong Ji saw this, his face was gradually exposed. 

He sneered and said, “What’s wrong? Why hasn’t your sect master appeared yet? It 
Can’t be that he hasn’t returned at all, right?” 

The deputy sect master opened his mouth and braced himself to say, “Nonsense, our 
sect master just doesn’t want to see you.” 

“Oh? Is That So?”Yong Ji no see sneered and his actions became more and more 
impudent. 

Yong Ji sat down and crossed his legs intentionally, then he said indifferently, “Then 
please ask your sect master to come out. If he doesn’t come out, it only means that he 
didn’t come back at all. All of you are just using tiger skin as a banner!” 

“Who says our sect master hasn’t come back?” 

At this moment, Di Zun’s voice came from the dark. 

Then, he looked over and saw him walking straight to Yongji from outside the door. 

“Who says our sect master hasn’t come back?”Di Zun said with a faint smile. 

Yongji glanced at Di zun and said sarcastically, “If he has come back, why doesn’t he 
dare to come out to see me?” 

“He doesn’t dare to come out to see you? Yong Ji, do you dare to repeat it again?”Di 
Zun said coldly. 



Yong Ji opened his mouth and felt as though a fishbone was stuck in his throat. He was 
actually a little worried. 

He knew that Di Zun was very likely putting on an act, but he still did not dare to take 
this risk. 

Yong Ji swallowed his saliva and then braced himself to say, “I… I just want to see your 
sect master. This is also what our godly monarch wants.” 

Di Zun, however, did not spare him. He said with a black face, “I’ll let you repeat it 
again.” 

Yong Ji’s expression changed. This extreme pressure made Yong Ji even more 
terrified. 

“Forget it. I believe Mr. Yong Ji did not do it on purpose,”the deputy sect master stepped 
forward to mediate the situation. 

Di Zun snorted coldly and said, “I thought Mr. Yong Ji was really so bold to dare to 
speak rudely in front of our sect master.” 

Yong Ji’s expression immediately changed! 

Could it be that the sect master of the Heavenly Cloud sect really came back? Was 
Sima Bei lying to him? 

As he was speaking, a tall figure walked in from outside. 

His face was covered by the dense mist and it was impossible to see his face clearly. 
No one could tell whether he was the sect master of the Heavenly Cloud sect or not. 

However, his figure was extremely similar to the sect master of the Heavenly Cloud 
Sect! 

Therefore, when Yong Ji saw this figure, he couldn’t help but shiver. 

He tried to use his divine sense to try to find out the identity of the person in front of him, 
but unfortunately, this “Sect master of the Tianyun sect”in front of him had no internal Qi 
at all. 

“What… What’s going on…”Yong Ji was extremely terrified, and cold sweat kept flowing 
down his face. 

“Greetings… Greetings to the sect master of the Tianyun sect,”Yong Ji cupped his 
hands and said. 



However, the sect master of the Tianyun sect did not say a word. 

This behavior immediately made Yong Ji suspicious. 

He held the gift box with both hands and said, “This is a gift from our godly monarch. I 
hope you can accept it.” 

The sect master of the Tianyun sect remained silent and did not reach out to receive the 
gift. 

Di Zun quickly reached out his hand and put the gift into his bag. 

“Our sect master is sick and doesn’t want to talk, so I took it for him,”said Di Zun. 

Yong Ji couldn’t help but frown. He asked suspiciously, “What happened to the sect 
master? Is he injured?” 

“It has nothing to do with you. Anyway, you have delivered the gift. You can leave 
now,”said Di Zun. 

The suspicion in Yong Ji’s heart grew stronger. He tried to say, “Are you really the sect 
master of the Tianyun Sect?” 

“How dare you!”Di Zun suddenly shouted from the side. 

“Yong Ji, what do you mean? Are you doubting the identity of our sect master? !”Di Zun 
berated him angrily. 

Yong Ji remained silent. He could basically determine that the person in front of him 
was a fake sect master. However, the fear in his heart still made him not dare to say 
anything. 

“Sect master, you should go back and rest first. Leave this place to me.”Di Zun cupped 
his hands towards the sect master. 

The sect master didn’t say anything else and turned around to leave. 

Yong Ji narrowed his eyes and remained silent. 

He increasingly believed in his own judgment. 

Because if the person in front of him was really the sect master of the Heavenly Cloud 
Sect, he would definitely die here and wouldn’t be able to leave the Heavenly Cloud 
sect at all! 



However, the “Sect master”in front of him didn’t say a word. Instead, he asked him to 
leave. This was too illogical and didn’t conform to the character of the sect master of the 
Tianyun sect. 

Even though that was the case, Yong Ji didn’t dare to gamble. He was afraid that if he 
lost the bet, he would lose his life. 

Di Zun was also gambling. He was gambling that Yong Ji didn’t dare to gamble! 

“Why aren’t you leaving yet? Do you still want to wait for us to treat you to a meal?”Di 
Zun said with a dark face. 

Yong Ji sneered in his heart. After thinking for a while, he came up with a perfect plan. 

“Vice sect master, the north and south regions are currently in a constant conflict. 
Countless people have died and many sects have been implicated,”Yong Ji said faintly. 

“To tell you the truth, this is not what we want to see. Therefore, I plan to invite 
everyone to discuss this matter and find a way for both of us to survive.” 

“Three days later, I will set up a banquet in the eternal limit city and invite all the major 
sects and sects in the world to participate. Of course, the sect leader of the Heavenly 
Cloud sect must be present.” 
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Hearing Yongji’s words, the deputy sect master frowned and said, “Are you planning to 
negotiate?” 

“That’s right, I am.”Yongji said with a smile. 

The deputy sect master hurriedly said, “Our sect master can’t go. When the time comes, 
I will go on behalf of the sect master.” 

Yongji laughed loudly and said, “If the sect master can’t go, then it means that the 
heavenly cloud sect treats all living things in the world as nothing. At that time, our 
northern land can only comply with one of the Heavenly Cloud Sect.” 

These words were very sneaky, and in an instant, the pressure was transferred to the 
Heavenly Cloud sect. 

“I agree!” 

At this time, Kong you stood out and said. 



Yong Ji nodded slightly, and then said, “Okay, then we’ll meet in Yong Ji City in three 
days.” 

After saying this, Yong Ji walked out quickly. 

After he left, Di Zun finally let out a sigh of relief, and his forehead was covered with 
layers of secret sweat. 

It was obvious that he was under a lot of pressure to pretend to be the sect master of 
the Heavenly Cloud Sect. 

“Damn, Yao Qing’s mental strength is awesome.”Di Zun couldn’t help but think to 
himself. 

“Hehe, it seems that Yongji also wants to talk about this matter.”Kong you said 
recklessly. 

Di Zun took a look and didn’t say a word. 

The deputy sect master pulled Di Zun to the side and said, “Who was that sect master 
just now?” 

“Who else could it be? The eighteen gods,”Di Zun said with a bitter smile. 

The deputy sect master could not help but have a horrified expression. He said in 
horror, “Don’t you know that the eighteen gods have no feelings at all? Aren’t you afraid 
of being exposed?” 

Di zun sneered and said, “Yongji is very afraid of our sect master. Even if he suspects, 
he doesn’t dare to take that risk! That’s why he said that he would invite the sect master 
for a peace talk in three days. The purpose of doing so is to safely find out the truth.” 

“Then what should we do in three days?”The deputy sect master asked with a frown. 

Di Zun laughed bitterly and said, “We can only let the eighteen gods continue to 
pretend. As for whether we can fool them or not, we can only leave it to fate.” 

… 

After Yongji left the Tianyun sect, the black-robed man who was waiting outside the 
door quickly walked up. 

“How is it? is the sect master of the Tianyun sect here?”The black-robed man asked 
impatiently. 

Yong ji sneered, “Ninety-nine percent is not here.” 



“In that case, Lord Sima Bei didn’t lie to you.”The black-robed man said. 

“Since that’s the case, there’s no need for us to be polite with them anymore!” 

Yong Ji glared at him and berated, “Are you deaf? I said it, it’s only ninety-nine percent. 
Isn’t there still a one percent chance?” 

The black-robed man opened his mouth and was immediately speechless. 

Yong Ji narrowed his eyes and sneered, “If the sect master of the Heavenly Cloud sect 
doesn’t show up in three days, it means that he’s definitely not here. At that time, we 
can also be unrestrained.” 

After saying that, he looked at the black-robed man and said coldly, “Bring people to 
Yong Ji City. Three days later, I want to prepare a big show.” 

“Yes!” 

… 

In a desert, there was a sudden mausoleum. 

Dark Energy was everywhere in this place, and no one was around. 

However, in this kind of environment, there was a young man sitting cross-legged, 
absorbing the dark energy from the mausoleum. 

His forehead would sweat from time to time, and it seemed to be extremely difficult. 

“Swoosh!” 

At this moment, Qin Yu suddenly opened his eyes. 

His gaze imagined the mausoleum, as if he was afraid of something. 

“Strange, what exactly is in this mausoleum?”Qin Yu frowned. 

For some reason, his heart could not calm down, as if there was a pair of eyes staring 
at him in the dark. 

This feeling was extremely strange, and it was exactly the same as the gaze of the 
green creature back then. 

Qin Yu stood up from the ground. He looked into the dark and said in a low voice, “The 
last time, man with the mustache said that there was definitely something hidden inside. 
Now, it seems that this kid’s judgment is correct.” 



Under such a state of mind, Qin Yu had no way to calm down and cultivate. 

What gave Qin Yu a headache was that after cultivating in seclusion for so long, he 
didn’t feel any signs of breaking through to the middle stage of the Almighty Realm. 

“It seems that cultivation isn’t that simple,”Qin Yu thought to himself. 

He closed his eyes slightly and tried to absorb the dark energy of the mausoleum again. 
However, the moment he closed his eyes, that feeling came back again. 

“Who is this sneaky person? If you have the ability, come out!”Qin Yu shouted at the 
tomb! 

Terrifying spiritual power shot out from the entrance of the cave, and huge rocks rolled 
down one after another! 

However, other than Qin Yu’s echo, there was no other sound in the cave. 

“If you still don’t come out, I will go in!”Qin Yu shouted. 

With that, Qin Yu pretended to step into the cave. 

At this moment, the ground suddenly shook. Then, a huge hand surged out and 
slammed fiercely at Qin Yu! 

Qin Yu’s face changed greatly. He hurriedly activated the line word formula and shot 
backward! 

The huge hand slammed fiercely on the ground, giving off a loud bang. A terrifying 
internal Qi surged over, stirring up waves of smoke and dust! 

Qin Yu’s expression changed slightly. Just as he was about to stand up, the huge hand 
in front of him disappeared without a trace. 

“What’s going on?”Qin Yu rubbed his eyes. He was surprised to find that there was no 
palm print on the ground! 

“Could it be an illusion?”Qin Yu frowned. 

Something was wrong. The feeling just now was extremely clear. If not for the support 
of the line word formula, the huge hand would definitely have slammed him into the 
ground! 

Qin Yu mustered up his courage and walked towards the cave entrance once again. 

He was extremely nervous and was extremely careful along the way. 



However, when he reached the cave entrance, he stopped in his tracks. 

“Forget it.”Qin Yu shook his head. 

The last time in the sacred mausoleum, Qin Yu’s cultivation had disappeared. who 
could guarantee that there was no aura of death in the mausoleum this time. 

If he lost his cultivation at such a critical moment, then he would be in big trouble. 

After thinking about it, Qin Yu finally decided to leave this place temporarily to avoid 
attracting trouble. 

Thus, Qin Yu summoned the Divine Eagle and rushed towards the great Yue mountain. 

This place wasn’t considered close to the great Yue Mountain, and it would take at least 
two days to get close to the Divine Eagle. 

Along the way, Qin Yu found that the battle situation seemed to have calmed down 
quite a bit, and the number of cultivators in the northern lands had also decreased by a 
lot. 

“HM? Could it be that someone has made a move?”Qin Yu couldn’t help but be a bit 
surprised. 

With suspicion, Qin Yu headed straight for the great Yue mountain. 

Two days later, Qin Yu arrived at the great Yue mountain. 

Far Away, Qin Yu heard the voice of Wen Da Wen Er. 

As usual, the two of them drank wine as if nothing had happened. 

“HM? Wen Da Wen er has actually returned?”Qin Yu was a bit surprised. 

Listening carefully, Qin Yu heard a familiar voice again. 

“Damn it, I’m not afraid of him. If he dares to come, I’ll shove his head into his butt!” 

“Grandpa is awesome! Let’s not talk about other things. If you drink another two Jin, I 
reckon you can shove the head of the sect leader of the Heavenly Cloud sect into his 
butt too!” 
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“F * ck your grandpa. If you dare to be rude to me again, I’ll stuff your head into Your 
Butt First!” 



Qin Yu rubbed his ears. wasn’t that the voice of Wen Wanyun? ! 

He hurriedly put away the divine eagle and followed the voice. 

Soon, he saw the three drunk people in the great hall. 

The one sitting in the middle was Wen Wanyi. 

His face was red. Obviously, he had drunk too much. 

Qin Yu quickly walked to Wen Wanyi’s side and said with surprise and joy, “Master, 
you’re Not Dead?” 

“You’re the F * cking dead!”Wen wanyi cursed subconsciously. 

When he saw Qin Yu’s face clearly, he hurriedly stood up and said, “Qin Yu? Where did 
you go? F * ck, I thought you were really a coward!” 

“Coward?”Qin Yu was stunned and asked in confusion, “What do you mean?” 

“What else can I mean? That Yongji had been clamoring with you for several days and 
almost went on a killing spree. If grandfather hadn’t arrived in time, who knows how 
many people would have died,”Wen da muttered. 

“That’s right, that’s right,”Wen er echoed. 

Then, Wen Wanji pulled Qin Yu to sit down. He told Qin Yu the whole story. 

After Qin Yu heard it, he couldn’t help but feel angry. 

“Qu Zhu and monk Hongxi are both injured?”Qin Yu asked in a deep voice. 

“Yes, Qu Zhu is injured, but monk Hongxi’s life and death are unknown,”Wen Wanji 
said. 

Qin Yu took a deep breath. He didn’t expect so many things to happen after he left. 

“If someone didn’t claim that the sect master of the Tianyun sect is back, the situation 
would be even worse,”Wen Wanji said in a deep voice. 

“He’s Back?”Qin Yu was slightly surprised. 

Wen wanyun sneered and said, “With my understanding of him, he definitely hasn’t 
returned, and he definitely won’t come back at this time.” 

“He has never been interested in being a hero. He’s very different from Xiao Hai.” 



Qin Yu didn’t say anything. Although the two of them were blood-related brothers, their 
personalities were indeed completely different. 

“Tomorrow, the eternal limit meeting will hold a grand meeting in eternal limit city. It’s 
said to be for negotiations, but in reality, it’s just to find out the truth,”Wen Wanyi said 
with a dark expression. 

Qin Yu nodded slightly, then said coldly, “That’s fine. Tomorrow, I’ll Go and end things 
with eternal limit!” 

Although Qin Yu hadn’t reached the middle stage of the Almighty Realm, he wasn’t 
afraid of dealing with eternal limit. 

“Alright, let’s not talk about that. Let’s drink first,”said Big Wen as he pulled Qin Yu 
along. 

Qin Yu stood up and said, “You guys drink. I’ll go to wind bamboo mountain to see Qu 
Zhu.” 

Wen wanyun grunted in gratitude and said, “There have been quite a number of people 
who have gone to visit during this period of time, but they all returned in defeat. You…” 

“He will see me,”said Qin Yu. 

Seeing this, Wen Wanyun did not try to persuade Qin Yu. He only told Qin Yu to be 
careful. 

Therefore, Qin Yu summoned the Divine Eagle and rushed towards the wind bamboo 
mountain. 

Wind Bamboo Mountain. 

Qu Zhu activated the formation and sealed the entire wind bamboo mountain. 

This formation was quite superb. Rumor has it that in order to prevent anyone from 
disturbing him, qu Zhu had specially paid a huge price to set up this formation. 

After rushing all the way to wind bamboo mountain, Qin Yu stood at the door and 
shouted into the wind bamboo mountain, “Big Brother Qu Zhu, Qin Yu requests to see 
you!” 

After a loud shout, Qin Yu stood at the door and waited quietly. 

Very soon, a light flashed in front of him and a tree-lined path appeared in front of Qin 
Yu. 



Qin Yu did not waste any time and quickly stepped into the wind bamboo mountain. 

There was a bamboo bed in the bamboo forest of the wind bamboo mountain. 

At this moment, Qu Zhu was lying on this bed to recuperate. 

His internal Qi was not calm, and there were spots of scars on his body. 

“Big Brother Qu Zhu!” 

Qin Yu quickly walked over and crouched in front of the bamboo bed. 

Qu Zhu slowly stood up and said, “You’re back.” 

Qin Yu acknowledged and then asked, “How are your injuries?” 

Qu Zhu waved his hand and said, “It’s just a small injury. I really didn’t expect that a 
mere baro would have such ability…” 

“Baro? The one who attacked was the Baro of the three madmen?”Qin Yu said in 
surprise. 

Qu zhu grunted and said, “I don’t know what kind of cultivation method this baro has 
cultivated. His strength has soared, far surpassing the past. Otherwise, I wouldn’t have 
fallen to such a state.” 

“Since they have joined the northern lands, the northern lands will naturally teach them 
the cultivation technique.”Qin Yu nodded slightly. 

Qu Zhu sighed and said with a sigh, “Speaking of which, it’s really embarrassing…” 

“There’s nothing to be embarrassed about. What they cultivate are all techniques of the 
immortal slaying sect. It’s already not bad that you can defeat him.”Qin Yu said 
sincerely. 

The immortal slaying sect was once a top-tier great sect in its glory days. It was an 
existence that suppressed the nine great families of the Holy Region. The cultivation 
technique they cultivated was naturally incomparable. 

“You should be careful too. Yongji has been clamoring for many days,”qu Zhu said in a 
deep voice. 

Qin Yu sneered, “Even if he doesn’t look for me, I will look for him. This bastard should 
pay the price for his actions.” 



Following that, Qin Yu took out the herbs from his spatial magic artifact and planned to 
refine the herbs for Qu Zhu. 

The injuries on Qu Zhu’s body were not serious. With Qin Yu’s ability, he was able to 
recover to his peak in the shortest amount of time. 

He took out the medicinal cauldron and began to refine medicine for Qu Zhu. 

In the blink of an eye, three days had passed. The world’s sect had also received 
eternal pole’s invitation. 

Eternal Pole City was dead silent. It no longer had the glory of the past. 

And on the back mountain of Eternal Pole Manor, this place was still filled with dense 
air. 

This back mountain was like a paradise. There were fine wine and delicacies. A faint 
fragrance assailed one’s face, forming a sharp contrast with the dead silence outside. 

“I’ve finally waited for this day,”Yong Ji said indifferently with his hands behind his back. 

All the major sects in the world had received Yong Ji’s invitation, and Yong Ji had 
already set up an inescapable net here. Who knew how many northern land cultivators 
and paintings were hidden in the dark. 

As long as the sect leader of the Tianyun sect didn’t come, those who came today 
would die without a doubt. 

At noon, one sect leader after another arrived. 

They gathered together and discussed something in a low voice. No one greeted Yong 
Ji. 

Yong Ji couldn’t help but sigh, “When I held the banquet last time, I was still one of the 
most respected people in the South Province. I didn’t expect that no one would take me 
seriously in such a short time.” 

At this point, Yong Ji paused and then smiled, “That’s true. They are just a bunch of 
dead people. Why should I care about the respect of dead people?” 

Soon, more and more people came to the back of the mountain. Almost all the people 
from the major sects and sects had arrived. 

At this moment, Kong you and a few sect masters appeared at the door. 



“This banquet concerns the life and death of the South Province. Everyone, please stay 
calm,”Kong you urged. 

The person next to him snorted and said, “If you can really make the northern region 
leave the southern region, we will submit to you.” 

Kong you smiled and said, “Don’t worry. I will do my best to convince Yongji.” 

Chapter 1615: Chapter 1615, Yongji, we finally meet! 1 

 

Kong you regarded himself as a lobbyist and was extremely confident. 

He stepped into the back of the mountain and walked towards Yongji. 

“Mr. Yongji.”Kong you cupped his hands slightly towards Yongji. 

Yongji was slightly surprised. This was the only person who greeted him so far today. 

“Why?”Yong Ji raised his eyebrows. 

Kong you smiled and said, “Mr. Yong Ji, since you have the intention to negotiate peace 
with our South region, this is enough to show that you don’t want the two sides to 
continue fighting. Or rather, you still miss the South Region.” 

Hearing this, Yong Ji almost laughed out loud. 

Miss the South Region? Is there something wrong with this guy’s brain? 

Yong Ji smiled and didn’t say anything, indicating for him to continue. 

“Firstly, I want to express my gratitude to you. Secondly, I hope that you can convince 
the northern lands to end this cruel struggle. I believe that anything can be resolved 
through negotiations,”Kong you said with a faint smile. 

Yong Ji rolled his eyes, then said, “Who do you think will win between the northern 
lands and the Southern Region?” 

“En… it’s hard to say. After all, the strength of the sect master of the Heavenly Cloud 
sect is obvious to everyone,”Kong you said. 

Yong Ji’s expression became a little unnatural when the sect master was mentioned. 

He continued to ask, “Oh right, have you seen the sect master in the Tianyun sect these 
past few days?” 



Kong you shook his head and said, “I’ve really never seen him before.” 

Yong Ji was delighted in his heart and immediately believed in his own thoughts. 

The sect master of the Tianyun sect had never returned! 

“I hope that Mister Yong Ji can become a bridge between the southern region and the 
northern lands and end this war,”Kong you continued to say to himself. 

However, Yong Ji laughed coldly in his heart. 

He looked at Kong you in front of him and said faintly, “Okay, I will give you an 
explanation.” 

“Thank you, Mr. Yong Ji!”Kong you hurriedly cupped his hands, and a trace of pride 
appeared on his face. 

He had mistakenly thought that he had convinced Yong Ji with his negotiation ability. 

Little did he know that Yong Ji had long had the desire to kill in his heart. 

When he returned to the crowd, the people around him quickly surrounded him. 

“How is it? What did Yong Ji say?”The people beside him couldn’t wait to ask. 

Kong you said faintly, “Of course there’s no problem. Mr. Yong Ji has promised that he 
will become a bridge of friendship between our southern region and the northern lands.” 

“Is that true?”The people around him were slightly surprised. 

“It’s absolutely true. He personally agreed!”Kong you said proudly. 

“Yongji is not a reliable person. It’s better to be careful,”someone said worriedly. 

Hearing this, Kong you immediately said with some displeasure, “What do you mean? 
You Don’t believe me? I, Kong You, am a famous lobbyist in the South Province!” 

“It’s not that I don’t believe you, but I just don’t believe Yongji. I hope he can keep his 
word,”the person next to him sighed. 

Kong you sneered and said, “Do you know why Yongji chose Yongji City as the 
location? This is enough to show that he still cares about our South Province. So, 
everyone, you don’t have to worry!” 

With Kong You’s words, everyone felt a little more at ease. 



More and more people came to the venue one after another. Many mighty figures who 
had been reclusive for many years also came to the venue. 

These people were very rare. Some rumors had even said that they had passed away 
long ago. Now that they had appeared again, it was enough to show the importance of 
this banquet. 

Yong Ji sat on the throne with his eyes slightly closed, as if he was waiting for 
something. 

As time passed, the people of the Heavenly Cloud sect also arrived at the scene. 

Under Di Zun’s signal, the eighteen gods once again pretended to be the sect master of 
the Heavenly Cloud sect. 

Upon seeing this “Sect master”, many people at the scene walked over. 

“Greetings, Sect Master!”Someone cupped his hands and said. 

“Sect master, your battle was truly unprecedented. You killed a godly king of the 
northern lands with just a divine stone. It really makes us admire you!” 

However, this sect master did not say a word. He was extremely silent. 

Di Zun was afraid that the matter would be exposed, so he quickly pulled the eighteen 
gods to find a place to sit down. 

On the throne, Yong Ji frowned. 

Although he knew that this sect master in front of him was fake, he still felt uneasy. 

“It’s just a fake. What’s there to be afraid of!”Yong Ji tried his best to cheer himself up. 

He closed his eyes slightly and simply did not look at the fake sect master anymore. 

In the blink of an eye, it was already noon. Almost everyone who was supposed to be 
there had arrived. 

“Please come and chat with the sect master of the Heavenly Cloud Sect.” 

Yong Ji suppressed the fear in his heart and shouted in the direction of the eighteen 
gods. 

However, the eighteen gods sat there motionlessly and kept silent as if they didn’t hear 
anything. 



“Please take a step forward, sect master of the Heavenly Cloud Sect, to discuss the 
important matters of the southern region and the northern lands,”Yong Ji shouted again. 

The eighteen gods were still sitting there motionlessly. 

Di Zun, who was beside him, saw that things were not looking good. He hurriedly stood 
up and said, “Yong Ji, I’ve already said that our sect master is unwell and can not speak 
or negotiate. If there’s anything, I can represent the sect master.” 

When Yong Ji saw this, he could not help but sneer in his heart. 

“You lied to me once and you want to lie to me a second time?”Yong Ji said coldly in his 
heart. 

Therefore, he ignored di zun and shouted in the direction of the eighteen gods for the 
third time, “Sect Master of the Heavenly Cloud Sect, please take a step forward and 
have a chat!” 

At this moment, the eighteen gods suddenly stood up! 

The sudden action scared Yong Ji so much that he trembled. 

He subconsciously took two steps back, and sweat broke out on his face. 

The eighteen gods stood up, buttoned their butts, and sat down again. 

When Yong Ji saw this, he couldn’t help but tremble with anger. 

Thinking of his loss of self-control just now, he wished he could slap himself twice! 

Yong Ji suppressed the anger in his heart and said coldly, “Sect master, please take a 
step forward.” 

“Don’t you understand human language? Keep calling out, call out my A * S.” 

At this moment, a voice came from afar. 

Before everyone could regain their senses, they saw a huge divine hawk hovering in the 
sky! 

The Divine Hawk’s arms shook, creating gusts of wind. 

Qin Yu and Wen Wanye jumped down from their backs and landed in the center. 

His eyes looked straight in the direction of Yongji and sneered, “What, Yongji, are you 
representing the northern lands? What right do you have to shout here?” 



“Qin Yu!” 

Looking at Qin Yu in front of him, Yong Ji instantly lost his composure. 

He suddenly stood up from his throne and glared angrily at Qin Yu, wishing he could 
swallow Qin Yu whole. 

“What, are you surprised to see me?”Qin Yu sneered. 

Yong Ji narrowed his eyes and said, “Kid, you finally dare to show your face. What, 
aren’t you a coward anymore?” 

“Shut your dog mouth. Look at your behavior. You are born to be a dog. Do you think 
you can replace the Heavenly Cloud Sect? Why don’t you see if you have that 
fate?”Wen Wan ridiculed from the side. 

These words undoubtedly hit Yong Ji’s soft spot. Being able to replace the Heavenly 
Cloud sect and become the overlord of a region had always been his long-cherished 
wish! Unfortunately, from the South region to the north region, he had always been 
under people! 

Chapter 1616: Chapter 1616 was indeed fake! 1 

 

Now that he was exposed in front of Wen Wanji, his anger reached its peak. 

He was emitting a strong killing intent. He glared at Wen Wanji and said, “Old man, 
don’t worry. I’ll kill you soon!” 

“I think you’d better think about how to escape,”Qin Yu said coldly. 

Both sides were at daggers drawn, as if they were ready to attack at any time. 

At this moment, Kong you stepped out to smooth things over, “Don’t worry, everyone. 
It’s just a misunderstanding!” 

After saying that, Kong you looked at Qin Yu and said in a low voice, “Qin Yu, come 
with me.” 

Qin Yu didn’t know this guy, but he still followed him to the side. 

Because of Qin Yu’s arrival, the situation at the scene changed again, and the crisis of 
the “Fake sect master”was temporarily alleviated. 



Kong you pulled Qin Yu to the side and said, “Qin Yu, Yongji has just agreed to 
negotiate peace. What do you mean by suddenly standing out? Isn’t this destroying our 
hard-won peace?” 

Qin Yu glanced at Kong you and sneered, “What nonsense are you talking about? 
Yongji will negotiate peace with you? Are you still asleep?” 

Upon hearing that, Kong you also said with extreme displeasure, “Qin Yu, how do you 
know that Yongji won’t negotiate peace? When Yongji declared war on you, you found a 
place to hide and didn’t even dare to show your face. Now, what kind of hero are you 
pretending to be?” 

Qin Yu narrowed his eyes and said with a cold face, “Where did you come from, you 
bastard? What nonsense are you talking about?” 

Kong you didn’t want to be outdone. He stared at him and said, “I’m the famous lobbyist 
of the South Province, Kong you!” 

“You’d better shut your dog mouth. Otherwise, I don’t mind giving you a head start,”Qin 
Yu said coldly. 

Kong you sneered and said, “What? You Don’t dare to attack Yongji and vent your 
anger on me?” 

“For the sake of peace in the South Province, I put down my face and begged Yongji. At 
the very least, I have contributed to the South Province. What about you? Now, other 
than ruining good things, what else can you do?”Kong you pointed at Qin Yu and 
shouted. 

Qin Yu knew that he couldn’t make sense of Kong you no matter what, so he simply 
retreated to the side and sneered, “Well, I want to see what use you, the so-called 
lobbyist, have.” 

After saying that, Qin Yu found a place to sit down. 

“Just wait and see.”Kong you snorted lightly. 

Then, he quickly walked in the direction of Yongji. 

A few minutes later, Kong you walked over proudly again. 

He pretended to sigh and said, “Sigh, fortunately, I went to Yongji in time to explain the 
situation. Otherwise, this war would be inevitable!” 

Looking at his behavior, Qin Yu sneered. 



The saddest thing about people was that they were stupid and didn’t know it. The 
saddest thing was that such people were everywhere. 

“Master.” 

At this time, Di Zun walked over quickly. 

He was beside Qin Yu and whispered, “Master, you came back at the right time.” 

Qin Yu couldn’t help but glance at the eighteen gods not far away, and then whispered, 
“That’s not the sect master of the Tianyun sect, right?” 

Di Zun smiled bitterly and nodded, “Sigh, I have no choice.” 

Qin Yu continued, “He is… The eighteen gods in disguise?” 

Di Zun immediately gave Qin Yu a thumbs up and said, “It still has to be Master! He saw 
through it with one look!” 

Qin Yu said helplessly, “Seeing this scene, I can’t help but think of someone.” 

“Yao Qing, right?”Di Zun said with a smile. “To be honest, I’m imitating him.” 

Qin Yu didn’t know whether to laugh or cry when he heard that. 

“Speaking of which, I really miss him…”Qin Yu sighed. 

Yao Qing was Qin Yu’s first true follower, and he had accompanied Qin Yu through 
countless battles, big and small. 

The two of them had not seen each other for a long time, and they wondered how their 
old friends were doing. 

“Forget it, let’s not talk about this anymore.”Qin Yu waved his hand. 

“Master, are you confident in dealing with Yongji?”Di Zun asked in a deep voice. 

Qin Yu thought for a moment and said, “It’s hard to say, but it’s probably not a problem.” 

Di Zun said in a deep voice, “I think Yongji would not dare to act rashly. He is very afraid 
of the sect master.” 

Qin Yu didn’t say anything. In the entire southern province, there seemed to be no one 
who wasn’t afraid of the sect master of the Heavenly Cloud sect. 

Of course, there were exceptions, such as Wen Wanyi and Jue Wu. 



“Alright, leave the rest to me.”Qin Yu patted Di Zun’s shoulder. 

Then, he looked at Yong Ji who was not far away. 

And coincidentally, Yong Ji also looked at Qin Yu. 

Their eyes met, and a killing intent came quietly. 

Yongji glared at Qin Yu, and his teeth clenched. 

If he was not afraid of the “Sect master of the Tianyun sect,”he would have attacked 
long ago. 

“You all saw it, right? Yongji’s original intention was to negotiate.”Not far away, Kong 
you was still bragging about his contributions. 

And in front of him, Yongji had already set his eyes on the eighteen gods. 

He was extremely conflicted, but he didn’t dare to casually make a move. 

At this moment, a voice entered Yong Ji’s mind. 

“That sect master of the Heavenly Cloud sect is fake. He’s one of the eighteen gods of 
the Heavenly Cloud sect. There’s no need to be afraid.” 

Yong Ji was stunned. This voice was actually Sima Bei’s! 

“Lord Sima Bei, where are you?”Yong Ji hurriedly asked. 

Sima bei said coldly, “I’m nearby. The moment things change, I’ll immediately act.” 

“Other than me, there are many cultivators waiting nearby in the north. You can go as 
boldly as you want.” 

With Sima Bei’s words, Yong Ji’s heart was instantly filled with courage. 

He looked in the direction of the eighteen gods and shouted once again, “Invite the sect 
master of the Heavenly Cloud sect to come and have a chat!” 

The eighteen celestials remained silent as usual. 

Yong ji sneered, “I think you are a fake sect master.” 

As soon as he said this, Di ZUN’s expression changed drastically! 

He hurriedly shouted, “Yong Ji, what do you mean! You Dare to insult our sect master!” 



Yong ji said coldly, “If he really is the sect master of the Heavenly Cloud Sect, then 
remove the mist on his face for me. What, he doesn’t dare to see anyone!” 

Di Zun’s expression turned extremely ugly. He knew very well that this scene could not 
be continued. 

“You are not the sect master of the Tianyun sect at all. You are deceiving us!”Yong Ji 
continued to shout loudly. 

His feet shook, and in an instant, he arrived in front of the eighteen gods. 

“You are just a pile of dog shit,”Yong Ji said coldly. 

However, the “Sect master”in front of him still did not react. 

Seeing this scene, Yong Ji laughed loudly and said, “It is indeed fake! You are indeed 
the eighteen gods in disguise! Why? You are a fool if you can’t get the Order!” 

Di ZUN’s expression changed greatly, and he hurriedly pulled the eighteen gods to the 
side. 

At this time, Kong you hurriedly stood out. 

He ran in front of Yong Ji and said with a smile, “Mr. Yong Ji, although he is not the sect 
master of the Heavenly Cloud sect, Di Zun can represent the sect master to negotiate 
with you. Moreover, there are so many people present, everyone can make the 
decision!” 
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Yongji looked at Kong you and said with a faint smile, “Talk? Who Wants to talk to me? 
who has the right to talk to me?” 

Kong you patted his chest and said, “If Mr. Yongji doesn’t mind, I’m willing to negotiate 
with you!” 

“Hahahahaha!”Yongji immediately burst into laughter. 

He suddenly slapped Kong You’s face, and with a “PA”sound, Kong you was sent flying. 

“Negotiate? You Think You’re Worthy? Since the sect master of the Heavenly Cloud 
sect isn’t here, do I need to negotiate with you losers?”Yongji sneered. 



Kong you got up from the ground and covered his face that was almost shattered, 
looking extremely aggrieved. 

Qin Yu couldn’t help but sneer and said with slight sarcasm, “Didn’t you say that Yongji 
promised you? Why did he slap you now?” 

Kong you braced himself and said, “If it wasn’t because you angered Yongji, why would 
he suddenly change his mind!” 

“What a pure retard.”Qin Yu could not help but curse. 

At this moment, he could not be bothered to lower himself to this Kong you’s level. The 
most important thing was still Yongji in front of him. 

One after another, black-clothed men appeared around them. They held the painting 
scrolls in their hands, and streams of black aura lingered around their internal Qi. 

“The painting scroll! It’s that painting scroll!” 

“As expected, Yongji didn’t plan to talk at all! They had already prepared the painting 
scrolls!” 

“This bastard, we were all fooled by him!” 

Yongji couldn’t help but laugh out loud when he saw this, “A bunch of idiots! Today is 
the Day You Die!” 

“What, do you think I don’t exist anymore?”At this moment, Qin Yu suddenly jumped 
and instantly appeared in front of Yongji. 

Yong Ji narrowed his eyes and coldly said, “Qin Yu, I’ve wanted to kill you for a long 
time. Since you want to die, then I’ll satisfy you!” 

After saying that, his internal Qi surged and he suddenly threw a punch towards Qin Yu! 

Qin Yu angrily shouted and a golden light instantly appeared. His right fist was like a 
golden dragon as it suddenly smashed over! 

“Boom!” 

At the instant of the collision, a terrifying airwave swept out in all directions! 

This mountain that was like a paradise was instantly reduced to dust, and the aftershock 
of the shockwave shook countless people until they vomited blood continuously! 



Yong Ji’s expression changed slightly. He only felt pain in his fist, and it was as if his 
bones were about to be shattered! 

However, Qin Yu in front of him was brimming with fighting spirit. He did not give Yong 
Ji the slightest chance to catch his breath, and once again clenched his fist and charged 
forward! 

This time, Yong Ji did not dare to face Qin Yu head-on. Instead, he hurriedly shot into 
the distance! 

“How could this be…”Yong Ji stood high in the sky and could not help but gasp for 
breath. 

During this period of time, his strength had greatly increased. Logically speaking, he 
should be able to easily crush Qin Yu. 

However, after the collision of this fist, he was shocked to discover that Qin Yu’s 
strength was much stronger than he had imagined! 

“Yong Ji, didn’t you come looking for me? Come, let us fight to our heart’s content 
today!” 

Qin Yu took a step forward, and the entire ground instantly collapsed! 

The clothes on his body were torn apart by the powerful internal Qi, revealing his dark 
golden skin! 

This skin was sparkling under the sunlight. At this moment, Qin Yu looked like an 
undefeatable war god! 

Yong Ji looked at Qin Yu coldly and said, “Don’t think that I’m afraid of You!” 

“You talk too much nonsense!” 

Qin Yu stepped on the line word formula and walked towards Yong Ji! 

Yong Ji knew very well that he could not fight with Qin Yu’s body. His body immediately 
disappeared into the void. Following that, a beam of light shattered the void. Energy that 
was like meteorites covered Qin Yu. 

This energy was like stones that covered Qin Yu’s body, as if it wanted to freeze Qin 
Yu. 

However, in less than half a second, Qin Yu’s aura directly shattered the energy! 



His long hair fluttered under the waves of internal QI, and the resolute expression on his 
face made people moved. 

“Yong Ji, what are you hiding for? Didn’t you want to fight with me? !”Qin Yu’s voice was 
like thunder, shaking the entire world! 

Yong ji shouted, “Qin Yu, do you dare to fight with me in another place? !” 

“Change your grandfather!”Qin Yu did not listen to Yong Ji’s nonsense at all. He 
stepped on the line word formula and charged straight at Yong Ji! 

Yong Ji’s hand kneading technique actually struck out hundreds of seals in the blink of 
an eye! 

The sky was covered with ice and snow. This seemed to be a secret technique that had 
been brought from the northern lands! 

This ice and snow contained the power of the Northern Lands’Daoist techniques. The 
purpose of this technique was to suppress the spiritual power in Qin Yu’s body! 

“Good method, but unfortunately, it’s useless against me!”Qin Yu sneered. Under this 
great ice and snow seal, Qin Yu’s movements were still unrestricted, pressing straight 
towards Yongji! 

“How could it be!”Yongji instantly turned pale with fright. He hurriedly raised both his 
hands, and that ice and snow transformed into a huge iceberg, pressing towards Qin 
Yu! 

This iceberg was extremely similar to the iceberg of the Northern Lands Lord, and the 
power contained within it was incomparably terrifying! 

Qin Yu raised his head and looked at this ice mountain. He raised his head and laughed 
loudly, “Dog, trying to suppress me with the Northern Lands’Arts? It’s useless!” 

As he spoke, Qin Yu’s body emitted a golden light, and an endless amount of light 
almost covered the entire world! 

After that, Qin Yu’s Golden Fist followed his heart, and with a crushing punch, he faced 
the Ice Mountain. 

“Boom!” 

The entire world shook as the void started to collapse. All the laws seemed to be unable 
to withstand it anymore as they continued to shatter and reassemble. 



The iceberg was pierced through at a speed visible to the naked eye and once again 
turned into an ice and snow seal. 

Yong Ji’s expression was ice-cold. It was obvious that Qin Yu’s strength had exceeded 
his imagination. 

“This person is really terrifying,”Yong Ji said coldly. 

“In time, he will very likely become the second sect master of the Heavenly Cloud sect 
in the Southern Region!” 

Qin Yu, who had shattered the ice mountain, was looking at Yong Ji coldly. 

“Why? Are you thinking about your own grave again?”Qin Yu said sarcastically. 

Yong Ji narrowed his eyes and said, “Qin Yu, I really want to have a good fight with you. 
Unfortunately, I want to put the big picture first.” 

“Big Picture? What big picture do you have?”Qin Yu sneered. 

As he said that, Yong Ji took a step back. 

Then, the space in front of him shook. 

In the next second, an old man with white hair walked out from the darkness. 

This old man was none other than Sima bei! 

The moment he appeared, the surrounding space was fluctuating. 

This was a display of power. Each and every move of his could cause a huge change in 
space! 

Furthermore, the internal Qi on his body was so powerful that it made people tremble in 
fear! 

“Qin Yu, we meet again.”Sima bei said indifferently. 

Qin Yu’s eyes narrowed slightly as he said, “Sima Bei? Is this your real body? You 
actually have such an awesome appearance. No wonder you didn’t dare to show your 
face.” 

Sima bei placed his hands behind his back and said indifferently, “Sharp-tongued brat, 
is it useful to show off your power of speech?” 

“It’s indeed useless.”Qin Yu’s internal Qi began to climb. 



“Speaking of which, I feel a little surprised that you dare to leave the northern lands.” 

Sima bei laughed loudly and said, “You have many unexpected things. I know that it’s 
impossible for you to join the northern lands, so I don’t want to talk nonsense with you. 
Today, I’ll let you die here.” 
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Sima bei’s entire body was exuding an ice-cold aura. His arrival had caused the 
situation to change once again. 

As one of the four great godly monarchs, Sima Bei’s strength was not inferior to anyone 
else. It was not an exaggeration to say that the current Sima Bei was the number one 
person below the Void Return Stage! 

“Sima Bei, are you bullying me because there’s no one else in the Southern 
Region!”Someone shouted loudly. 

Sima bei glanced at him. Then, he stretched out his palm and gently pinched with his 
fingers. Immediately, he crushed the person who spoke into a meat paste! 

He coldly glanced at everyone and said with a proud tone, “In the entire southern 
region, other than Xiao Hai and the sect leader of the Heavenly Cloud Sect, who else do 
i, Sima Bei, Fear?” 

Qin Yu’s expression was ice-cold. He took a step forward and coldly said, “Looks like 
the main character today is not Yongji, but you, Sima Bei.” 

Sima bei narrowed his eyes and said, “Qin Yu, I will not give you any chance to catch 
your breath. Today, you must die here! Including Qu Zhu and the others!” 

“That will depend on whether you have the ability or not.”Qin Yu’s internal Qi became 
stronger and stronger. Even the surrounding space became slightly distorted. 

Sima bei narrowed his eyes and sneered, “In just a few days, your strength has 
increased again. It’s really terrifying. However… it ends here!” 

“Wait!”At this moment, someone from the crowd stood out. 

He shouted at Sima bei, “We can give up the northern border and allow you to enter the 
Northern Territory, but the condition is that you can not enter the other regions of the 
South Province. How about it?” 

Hearing his words, Qin Yu felt a headache. 



The stupidity of these people had already exceeded their imagination. Even now, they 
still had this kind of fantasy. 

When Sima bei heard these words, he even laughed out loud. 

He swept his gaze over everyone and laughed coldly, “Back then, we were willing to 
negotiate because there was still Xiao Hai in the southern region. Now that Xiao Hai is 
dead, what right do you have to talk to me? Do you have the qualifications to do so?” 

Traces of despair appeared on everyone’s faces. 

At this moment, they finally understood that the northern lands wanted to exterminate 
everyone! He simply did not intend to let anyone go! 

“Then let’s fight. Stop talking nonsense!” 

Qin Yu took a step forward, and golden light flourished. Divine power that could destroy 
everything in its path lingered around the Golden Fist, and he instantly arrived in front of 
Sima bei! 

Sima bei’s expression turned cold. He did not dare to be negligent. He immediately 
extended his palm, and streams of black aura gathered, wrapping around his palm. His 
internal Qi surged out from his palm, and the black aura surged out. 

“Boom!” 

At the instant of the collision, this black radiance seemed to have exploded. A terrifying 
power swept out instantly! 

Qin Yu only felt his palm go numb. The powerful impact almost spread throughout his 
entire body! 

“Is this Sima Bei’s true body?”Qin Yu’s expression turned cold. He immediately felt a 
trace of unease in his heart. 

No wonder Sima Bei was so confident. His strength was indeed terrifying! 

Sima bei looked coldly at Qin Yu and said, “Your strength is indeed shocking. No 
wonder I wasn’t able to kill you last time.” 

Qin Yu didn’t want to waste any more words with him. In the face of such a person, 
other than fighting, everything else was just empty talk! 

He immediately took out the bracelet that Xiao Yu had given him and planned to 
activate this magical artifact to force Sima Bei back! 



But right at this moment, Qin Yu felt an intense murderous aura! 

This murderous aura enveloped the world, causing everyone to shudder. 

Even Sima Bei’s expression changed slightly, because this murderous aura even 
covered him! 

“Old Thing, why don’t I try it with you!” 

A loud shout spread throughout the world, shaking people’s ears until they felt pain! 

Following that, a figure shot over explosively. His move was extremely fierce and 
vicious, heading straight for Sima Bei’s glabella! 

Sima Bei’s expression changed. A black radiance appeared in front of him, and a large 
hand stretched out from the black radiance! 

“Chi la!” 

That figure’s palm grabbed directly at this large hand. Then, he suddenly exerted force 
and actually directly threw Sima bei out! 

“Iron Egg? !” 

Seeing the newcomer, Qin Yu could not help but be greatly shocked! 

Iron Egg glanced at Qin Yu, and he grinned and said, “How can such a thing not include 
me? The last time at the Death River, my hand was itchy. I didn’t expect that this god 
King would actually come to the South Province today…” 

Sima Bei’s expression was also a little ugly. He said with a cold face, “Who are you?” 

Iron egg sneered, “You can call me the number one Asura! Of course, you don’t need to 
know so much.” 

“Number one Asura? Why haven’t I heard of it?”Sima bei frowned slightly. 

“Don’t worry, this name will soon spread all over the country…”iron egg grinned. 

After saying that, he suddenly shot towards Sima bei! 

His attack method was also extremely simple, just like Qin Yu, it was all based on his 
body! 

Sima Bei’s expression turned cold as he shouted, “No matter who you are, if you 
obstruct the good things of the northern lands, you will die!” 



After saying that, Sima bei muttered to himself. The space in front of him trembled and 
tens of millions of rays of light formed from the interweaving of the laws of heaven and 
earth condensed into an arm, heading towards Iron Egg. 

“Boom!” 

The huge collision caused the entire back mountain to start collapsing. Countless 
people vomited blood because of it, and some people were even directly smashed into 
meat paste! 

The huge hand that was interwoven was easily pierced through by iron egg. His entire 
body emitted an intense killing intent, causing people to be terrified! 

Sima Bei’s expression changed greatly, and he hurriedly shot backwards, standing in a 
safe position. 

“TSK TSK, as expected of a divine body, as expected of a divine body of the reversion 
void stage!”A greedy expression appeared on Iron Egg’s face! 

However, Sima Bei’s expression was ice-cold. He had just sent away Xiao Hai, and now 
such a person had appeared. Just how many top-notch martial artist were hidden in the 
South Province? 

“Iron egg, kill him!”Qin Yu shouted at Iron Egg. 

Iron egg sneered, “Don’t worry, I Will Never Show Mercy.” 

After saying that, his feet shook, and the ground was instantly shattered. His body was 
like an arrow that had left the bowstring, and he once again shot towards Sima Bei! 

Sima bei cursed inwardly. He didn’t have absolute confidence. He had never wanted to 
step into the South Province, and now that such a person had appeared, it was too 
dangerous for Sima Bei. 

Therefore, he did not have any fighting spirit. He immediately rushed into the darkness 
and left quickly by relying on the teleportation formation! 

In just an instant, he disappeared without a trace. 

Iron Egg’s fist smashed the space into pieces, but he still could not touch a corner of 
Sima Bei’s clothes. 

“Damn it, he ran away just like that?”Iron Egg could not help but curse. 

“Won’t the fighting spirit in my entire body be wasted just like that?” 



Qin Yu frowned slightly. This was a place that was difficult to deal with in the northern 
lands. 

They could leave this place at any time. Even someone as powerful as Xiao Hai could 
not do anything to them. 

Not far away, Yong Ji’s expression could not help but turn cold. 

He looked at iron egg beside Qin Yu and sneered, “Qin Yu, you really have a lot of top-
notch martial artist by your side. You’re really lucky.” 

Qin Yu looked at Yong Ji coldly and said, “Yong Ji, why are you talking so much 
nonsense? Didn’t you want to fight with me? Don’t Leave!” 
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Yong Ji slowly stood up from his throne. He looked at Qin Yu and said coldly, “I also 
long to fight with you, but unfortunately, it’s not now.” 

“Don’t worry. Iron Egg will definitely not make a move,”Qin Yu said coldly. 

“No one here will make a move. Only you and me. Do You Dare?” 

Yong Ji said with a sneer, “I’ll let you grow for a period of time. When the time comes, I’ll 
fight you.” 

“Grow for a period of time?”Qin Yu nearly laughed out loud. 

“Yong Ji, you really think highly of yourself. Do you think I treat you as a target? “I know 
you don’t dare to fight me today. Then, please go back and deliver a message to the 
few godly monarchs in the northern lands. I’ll end them with my own hands.” 

Yong Ji’s expression was ice-cold. He did not say a word as he looked at Qin Yu. No 
one knew what he was thinking. 

And Qin Yu did not make a move. He knew that it was too difficult to stop Yong Ji now. 

Soon, Yong Ji’s body disappeared into the darkness. Under everyone’s watchful eyes, 
he left the place. 

“Why did you let him leave?”Someone seemed to be extremely puzzled. 

Qin Yu shook his head and said, “I can’t stop him.” 



“Doesn’t that mean that he can come and go as he pleases? Even if he really loses, he 
can still leave?”Someone asked. 

“Theoretically speaking, it’s like this.”Qin Yu took a deep breath. 

“Unless we wait for the Death River to disappear and for the two plates to completely 
merge, but we can’t wait that long anymore.” 

It was precisely because Xiao Hai had long since peered into this level that he had 
rashly stepped into the death river and headed to the northern lands. 

“Qin Yu, do you have any ideas?”The leaders of the surrounding large sects and sects 
all surrounded him. 

“If you need us to do anything, just say the word!” 

“That’s right. As long as we can kill these bastards, we’re willing to go through fire and 
water!” 

Unknowingly, these people had already treated Qin Yu as their sustenance. 

Qin Yu said in a deep voice, “I will think of a way. Everyone, go back for now. Please 
find me at the Great Yue Mountain in a few days.” 

Everyone did not say much and agreed one after another. 

After they left, Qin Yu looked at Iron Egg. He opened his mouth and was just about to 
thank him, iron Egg took a step forward and said, “There’s no need to thank me. I’m not 
here to save you. I just want to fight with those godly monarchs.” 

Qin Yu looked at iron egg and said, “Are you confident?” 

“Yes,”iron egg said concisely. 

Qin Yu grunted and said, “I’m afraid I’ll need your help in the future. You should get 
used to this body as soon as possible.” 

Iron egg sneered and said, “What do I need to get used to to dealing with them?” 

“Not them.”Qin Yu took a deep breath. 

“I have a very bad premonition that there will be a great battle between the Southern 
Prefecture and the northern lands.” 

It was likely that iron egg would not be facing the three godly monarchs, but the master 
of the northern lands. 



“Qin Yu, what should we do next?”The deputy sect master walked forward and asked. 

Qin Yu looked at the deputy sect master and said, “First, increase your strength as soon 
as possible. Second, deputy sect master, if you want to think of a way to find the sect 
master of the Tianyun sect, he must take action.” 

The deputy sect leader opened his mouth and smiled bitterly, “I’m afraid this will be very 
difficult. I…” 

“That’s why you have to think of a way.”Qin Yu interrupted the deputy sect leader. 

The deputy sect leader saw this and could only nod his head, “Alright, I’ll try my best.” 

After that, Qin Yu asked again, “How many days will it take to swallow the Huangji 
Buddha Flame?” 

The deputy sect leader replied in a deep voice, “The fastest will be a year, the slowest 
will be a few hundred years.” 

Qin Yu gasped when he heard this. 

Several hundred years? 

This number was a little too exaggerated. 

“In that case, I’m afraid I won’t be able to devour the Huangji Buddhas Flame for the 
time being.”Qin Yu sighed. 

It was definitely not an easy task to find a place with dense dark energy in a short period 
of time. 

After thinking about it, Qin Yu felt that there was only one way. 

That was to improve his physical body and increase the strength of his physical body as 
soon as possible. 

Just as Wen Wanyun had thought, his physical body had reached the void-level! 

Once his physical body reached the void-level, Qin Yu would definitely not be afraid 
when facing those few godly monarchs! 

“Master, I’m afraid that I still need your help to send me to that body tempering place 
that you brought me to previously.”Qin Yu looked at Wen Wanyun. 

However, Wen Wanyun shook his head and said, “The last time you did not succeed, it 
means that there is no way for your physical body to break through again.” 



Qin Yu frowned slightly and said, “Master, do you have a better idea?” 

A trace of coldness flashed across Wen Wanyun’s face. 

He narrowed his eyes and said, “As the saying goes, if you don’t break through, you 
won’t succeed. I do have another place, but there’s a certain risk.” 

“It’s okay. Just say it,”Qin Yu hurriedly said. 

Wen wanyun said coldly, “Purple-red volcano!” 

“Purple-red volcano? What is that place?”Qin Yu said with some surprise. 

The deputy sect master next to him scolded, “Wen Wanyun, don’t come up with such a 
bad idea. You are trying to send him to his death!” 

Wen wanyun coldly said, “Besides the purple-red volcano, do you have a better place?” 

“That won’t do!”The deputy sect master shouted, “If Qin Yu dies, the South Province will 
have one less war general!” 

Wen Wanyi opened his mouth and was about to refute, but Qin Yu quickly interrupted 
him and said, “What exactly is this purple-red volcano?” 

The deputy sect master said with a cold face, “That is the heaven fire, the quenching 
fire, not the body tempering fire!” 

“That’s right, the quenching fire.”Wen wanyi also nodded slightly. 

He sized up Qin Yu’s body and said, “But I feel that this body of yours is not inferior to a 
magical artifact or divine weapon. You can give it a try.” 

“Nonsense!”The deputy sect master said with his eyes wide open. 

Qin Yu was silent. Of course, he knew what the quenching fire meant. 

Top-tier divine weapons were almost invulnerable to all kinds of flames. It was very 
difficult to melt them, so they needed extremely powerful flames. 

This quenching fire was enough to melt all kinds of divine weapons. It was enough to 
show its terrifying power. 

The deputy sect master and Wen Wanzhu argued endlessly. The two of them held 
completely different views. 



At this time, Qin Yu said in a deep voice, “Alright, stop arguing. I have my own 
decision.” 

After saying that, Qin Yu looked at Wen wanyi and said, “Then where is the purple-red 
volcano?” 

Hearing Qin Yu’s words, Wen Wanyi was instantly delighted. He said with a smile, 
“That’s right. Only a man who dares to take risks is a man!” 

“You’re full of nonsense. Qin Yu is really unlucky to be in your hands!”The deputy sect 
master said somewhat exasperatedly at the side. 

Wen Wanyi couldn’t be bothered with him. He said with a smile, “I’ll take you to the 
purple-red volcano now.” 

“Not now. I still have things to do,”Qin Yu said in a deep voice. 

“Let’s return to the great Yue Mountain for now.” 

The deputy sect master pulled Qin Yu and said, “Qin Yu, don’t be rash. This old bastard 
doesn’t have any good intentions. He has disappeared for so long that I even suspect 
that he has gone to the northern lands!” 

“F * ck your Bullsh * T! If you dare to spout nonsense again, do you believe that I will 
tear your mouth apart?”Wen Wan was so angry that he blew his beard and glared. 
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Seeing that they were about to quarrel again, Qin Yu hurriedly stood between them. 

He looked at the deputy sect master and said, “Deputy sect master, don’t worry. If 
there’s really danger, I definitely won’t use the purple-red Heaven Fire.” 

Even though that was the case, with Qin Yu’s character, as long as there was a one in 
ten thousand chance, he would try. 

“Alright, now that everyone understands the situation in the northern lands, let’s do our 
own things,”Qin Yu said. 

The deputy sect master did not say anything more and could only nod in agreement. 

As for whether they could find the sect master of the Heavenly Cloud sect, that was 
probably an unknown. 



After parting ways, Qin Yu followed Wen Wanye and rushed towards the great Yue 
mountain. 

After arriving at the great Yue Mountain, Wen Wanye looked at Qin Yu and said, “What 
plans do you have?” 

Qin Yu glanced at Wen Wanyun and said in a deep voice, “To resist the northern lands, 
it’s definitely not something that one or two people can do. Moreover, with the current 
state of the world, everyone must have the ability to protect themselves.” 

“Therefore, I plan to refine a batch of pills and distribute them.” 

Wen wanyun cried out in alarm, “Pill? What Pill?” 

“Beast Spirit Pill.”Qin Yu took a deep breath. 

Originally, this Beast Spirit Pill was intended to be used by the cultivators at the northern 
border to resist the northern lands. But now, the situation had changed. The entire 
southern region was probably going to fall. Qin Yu could only try to refine as many beast 
spirit pills as possible. 

“Qin Yu, do you know how many people there are in the Southern Region? It’s 
impossible for you to give everyone a pill,”Wen Wanyi said in a deep voice. 

Qin Yu nodded and said, “I understand. That’s why we have to select from among them. 
In any war, there will always be the strong and the weak. We only need to distribute the 
pill to the strong and let the strong protect the weak.” 

Wen wanyun frowned and said, “That’s not a small number either.” 

“We can only try our best.”Qin Yu sighed. 

After experiencing this matter, presumably, the northern lands would not make any 
moves for a while. 

As long as the three godly monarchs did not come, the others would not be much of a 
threat. 

And the existence of iron egg would definitely make the three godly monarchs extremely 
fearful. As such, the Southern Region still had a certain amount of time to prepare. 

“Alright, I won’t waste any more time. Master, if there’s anything, please wake me up as 
soon as possible,”Qin Yu said in a deep voice. 

Wen wanyi sighed, “You really have the guts to think of refining a pill for everyone in the 
world.” 



Qin Yu didn’t say anything. He stood at the top of the Great Yue Mountain, took out ye 
Nan’s stock of herbs from the spatial magic artifact, and then began to refine the Beast 
Spirit Pill. 

This was definitely an extremely huge project. Even Qin Yu needed to waste a large 
amount of energy and physical strength, so he had to be fully focused and not be 
distracted. 

Along with the input of the herbs and the leap of the spiritual fire, pill after pill began to 
take shape. 

It had to be said that Qin Yu’s speed of comprehending pills was extremely fast. He was 
not familiar with this beast spirit pill, but he had refined more than ten beast spirit pills in 
one go! And these more than ten Beast Spirit Pill, Qin Yu only used three days! 

Such a speed, if the person from the central plains saw it, he would definitely be greatly 
shocked! 

But even so, Qin Yu was not the slightest bit satisfied. 

He looked at the pill in front of him and said in a low voice, “It’s too slow. At this speed, 
I’m simply unable to refine a large number of pills…” 

But the current Qin Yu did not have anyone to ask for help. He could only try to increase 
his speed. 

Day after day passed, and the number of pill in front of Qin Yu also began to increase. 

In half a month’s time, there were already nearly a hundred beast spirit pills in front of 
Qin Yu! 

And at this time, Qin Yu was almost exhausted. 

His face was pale, his lips were purple, and his forehead was sweating non-stop. This 
was clearly the result of excessive divine sense! 

When Wen Wanyi saw this scene, he couldn’t help but feel anxious and angry. 

“Damn it, for the sake of these B * stards, is this kid going to risk his life? !”Wen Wanyi 
couldn’t help but blow his beard and glare. 

He walked around Qin Yu, the more he thought about it, the angrier he got. 

“The most important thing is, these B * stards might not even appreciate my kindness. F 
* ck them!”Wen wanyi held back his anger, afraid of alerting Qin Yu. 



After thinking about it, Wen Wanyi turned around and left the great Yue mountain. He 
did not know where he went. 

On the other side. 

The deputy sect master was also looking for traces of the sect master. 

He knew that the sect master liked to go to a few places, but after searching for a while, 
he didn’t find any traces of the sect master. 

In the meeting hall. 

The vice sect master and the Elders’faces were as dark as water, and they all kept 
quiet. 

“With the sect master’s methods, if he wants to hide, no one in this world can find 
him,”an elder said. 

“That’s right, we’ve searched everywhere we can, but we still haven’t found him.” 

“If we really can’t find him, we can only give up.” 

“Perhaps the first elder knows where the sect master is, but unfortunately, the first elder 
is already dead.” 

At the mention of the first elder, the vice sect master’s eyes lit up, as if he had thought 
of something. 

He suddenly stood up and said with some excitement, “There’s still one place we 
haven’t been to!” 

“What Place?”Everyone’s gaze fell on the vice sect master. 

The vice sect master narrowed his eyes and said, “Laiqu Lake.” 

“Laiqu Lake?”Everyone looked at each other, as if they were extremely unfamiliar with 
this place. 

The vice sect master glanced at everyone, and then slowly said, “You shouldn’t know 
this place. Laiqu Lake is the sect master’s hometown, as well as the first elder’s 
hometown.” 

When these words were said, everyone was shocked! 

What? The first elder and the sect master actually came from the same place? 



No wonder the sect master trusted and valued the first elder so much. There must be an 
unclear relationship between the two! 

“I’ll leave now and head to the Laiqu Lake,”the deputy sect master said in a deep voice. 

“I’ll go with you!”Di Zun quickly stood up and said. 

The deputy sect master glanced at Di Zun and shook his head, “No, you can’t go. If 
anything happens on the way, I can’t explain it.” 

“But…” 

“There’s no buts,”the deputy sect master interrupted Di Zun. 

He glanced at the crowd and said in a deep voice, “Before I come back, no one is 
allowed to act recklessly.” 

That day, the deputy sect master left the Heavenly Cloud sect and went straight to the 
Laiqu Pond. 

Laiqu Pond. 

This was a rather remote village, and this place had long been deserted. Rumor has it 
that in a great war, the Laiqu Pond was destroyed, and only the sect master and first 
elder were left alive. 

In the center of the Laiqu Pond was a pond. This pond didn’t have any spiritual Qi, and 
was just an ordinary mountain spring. That was why the Laiqu Pond got its name. 

Beside the Laiqu Pond sat a slender man. He wore a long white robe and had a head of 
long hair like a waterfall. He looked like an immortal. 

This person was none other than the sect master of the Tianyun sect. 

At this moment, the sect master was sitting cross-legged with his eyes closed, as if he 
was cultivating. 

 


