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C1 She Was Picked up by President Bo 

The evening sun, little by little, sank into the boundless sea. 

The surface of the sea rolled with ruthless waves, devouring a thin and weak 
figure. 

It had been five hours... 

After the smuggling ship sunk, Gu Wuyan swam for a full five hours in order to 
survive. In order to wake herself up, she kept reminding herself that she still 
had revenge to take! 

From the moment she was born, she was treated as a donor. She provided 
blood, bone marrow, kidney, liver and even heart for her sick older sister. She 
suffered all kinds of injustice. 

In the end, her heart was useless and could not be operated on. 

Gu Industries had a big business, but they could not tolerate her. Her parents 
lied that she was mentally ill and would harm society. They had people tie her 
up in the middle of the night to the hell of Country J, Mad Man Desert. 

Before that, her sister proudly told her the truth. 

"Gu Wuyan, you are just a bastard that was picked up. God sent you to the 
Gu family to extend my life. This is what I call a proud son of heaven!" 

That year, she was only sixteen years old. 

She lived a life that was worse than a pig or dog in Mad Man Desert and 
suffered for four years. 

She barely escaped the desert and boarded the smuggling ship. However, the 
smuggling ship sank, and all the passengers in the container drowned. She 
was the only one who swam out. 

She was almost there, and she absolutely could not die in the sea! 



After she swam ashore, she reached the border of A Nation. 

Those people wanted her to live a life worse than death, but she couldn't do 
what they wanted! 

Suddenly, Gu Wuyan's sharp eyes discovered that not far away from her, 
there was a person in the sea, the sea water drowning his head. 

Someone was drowning?! 

But, she saw that he was about to reach the shore. 

On one side, they were going ashore, and on the other side, they were saving 
people! 

Gu Wuyan gritted her teeth and still swam towards that person. 

She swam very quickly. When she reached the approximate location of that 
person, she quickly dived into the water and touched a hand! 

The man in the water suddenly kicked over. 

Puff! 

Gu Wuyan was kicked away and there was a pain in her abdomen. 

She gritted her teeth and continued to swim towards that person's side, 
thinking that he had drowned and struggled accidentally. 

This time, she directly hugged him from behind. 

Her petite body used an unknown amount of strength and actually forcefully 
dragged him ashore. 

As if she had used up all of her strength, Gu Wuyan's entire body went limp 
on the beach as she gasped for breath. 

Suddenly, her neck was grabbed by a large hand! 

"Who sent you here?" 

The man's tall body completely suppressed her, and his aura was extremely 
dangerous. 



When he saw the woman's appearance, his cold eyes seemed to flash with 
surprise. 

Gu Wuyan's heart shook. 

If she was not mistaken, this man was Bao Jingfeng? 

In J Country, after she escaped from Mad Man Desert, she saw the news on 
the big screen by the roadside. 

This man was the number one tycoon in A Nation, and he had tremendous 
power and control over the economic lifeline of A Nation. 

His fame spread all over the world! 

She did not know if it was luck or misfortune, but the first person she met 
when she went ashore was him! 

"I thought you were drowning, so I saved you. I don't know you!" She 
explained. 

... "" 

When she thought of this woman dragging him to the shore as if she didn't 
care about his life, she probably wasn't here to kill him. Otherwise, it would 
have been an excellent opportunity! 

The big hand on her neck let go of her. 

Gu Wuyan struggled to get up from the ground and wanted to leave. 

"Who asked you to save her? Mind your own business!" The man's cold voice 
suddenly sounded behind her. 

Gu Wuyan's footsteps paused slightly. 

She remembered that when she saw this man just now, he did not seem to 
struggle at all in the water. She immediately understood something. 

She twitched the corner of her mouth, turned her head and said, "Sorry, then I 
will have to trouble you to die again. I will not save you this time." 



Her tone was very indifferent, as if this sort of thing was already common to 
her. 

In J Country, she was thrown to Mad Man Desert by her family, tortured for 
four years, she had seen too many people die... 

In that place, it was too painful, people could no longer live. 

Someone ate moldy food, had a serious illness, and died overnight! 

There were people who were pressed down into the water, drowning! 

Someone had died of thirst. 

Someone was shot to death. 

They died more and more casually. 

Later... 

Someone buried his head in the sand and suffocated himself to death. 

Someone slammed his head to death. 

If it wasn't for the fact that it was better to die than live, who would want to end 
their life? 

After all, hurting oneself was the most painful thing, and it required great 
courage. 

She could only watch helplessly, and she was powerless to do anything, 
risking her life to keep herself alive. 

Only by surviving could she come to A Nation to take revenge! 

A cold chill surged up Bao Jingfeng's brows. "What did you say?" 

What kind of nerve did this woman have? She actually thought that he was 
courting death? 

Was her calm tone mocking him for not appreciating his life? 

What did she know! 



Anger surged in his heart. Bao Jingfeng stepped forward and grabbed her 
slender wrist. "You know..." 

Before he could say the word "what," the woman's body went limp and she 
fainted. 

Bao Jingfeng reached out his hand and instinctively received it. 

Gu Wuyan steadily landed in his wide arms. 

When he hugged the cold woman in his arms, he realized that this woman 
was actually very thin, almost to the point of only having bones left. 

So thin to this extent, how did she drag him ashore just now? 

The anger in his chest seemed to have been extinguished by a basin of cold 
water at this moment, leaving nothing behind. 

In the dark night, a man's warm and angry voice could be heard. 

"If I find out who sent you to deliberately approach me, I will tear you into 
pieces!" 

After saying that, he carried Gu Wuyan and left the beach. 

... 

Yunxiu Garden. 

Dr. Mu carried the medicine box and hurried over. 

He was sleeping soundly at night when he received a call from his father. It 
seemed to be a very urgent matter. 

When he saw the patient in front of him, Dr. Mu was stunned. He thought that 
something had happened to Mr. Bao. 

However, he did not expect to see a thin and weak woman lying on the bed. 
Moreover, this woman was disfigured because there were many hideous 
scars on her face. She looked very scary. 

"She has been soaking in the sea." Bao Jingfeng briefly explained the 
situation. 



The woman Mr. Bao personally asked him to treat must not be simple. 

Dr. Mu hurriedly nodded and went forward to lift the blanket on Gu Wuyan's 
body. 

Gu Wuyan's drenched old clothes had already been changed into clean 
pajamas by the maid. 

Suddenly, Dr. Mu discovered a large patch of bruises on Gu Wuyan's 
stomach. One look and he could tell that it was a man's footprint, the kind that 
had just come out of the oven. 

He looked at Bao Jingfeng suspiciously. 

Bao Jingfeng hugged his chest, expressionless and surprisingly steady, "I 
thought she was a killer." 

He basically did not hit women. It was an accident tonight. After all, there were 
too many people he wanted to kill. 

Dr. Mu nodded to show his understanding. 

He used the stethoscope to listen to her heartbeat. He gently pressed her 
abdomen with his hand, opened her mouth, and checked her oral cavity. 

After a careful examination, Dr. Mu said, "It's a miracle that she's alive. Her 
body has been submerged in the sea water for at least a few hours. Her body 
temperature is very low, but there is no lack of oxygen. If it was a man, he 
might not even be able to survive. I really don't know how she managed to 
survive. " 

... 

Author: 

Male pet pet, no Mo, no white moonlight. 

Empty writing, no logic, please do not take it seriously, please do not 
investigate. 

 


