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The sweet pursuit Chapter 11-The foreign language teacher is an 
Englishman, who looks handsome, and Cheng Xiaoxiao often recounts that 
the 
foreign language teacher is the most perfect Prince Charming in her heart, her 
white moonlight. 

The two went to class and entered the classroom, and many people looked 
towards Su Xi, thinking that they had seen or heard what happened under the 
foreign language building just now, and everyone had different eyes, some 
admired Su Xi, and some mocked her for being too clean and tall and did not 
know how to lift. 

Su Xi’s face was as usual, and the little two found a seat and sat down, took 
out a pen and writing, and prepared to listen to the class. 

…… 

After a class, Cheng Xiaoxiao took the opportunity to ask questions to 
approach her “white moonlight”, and Su Xi sat on the seat and waited for her. 

After waiting for ten minutes, Cheng Xiaoxiao’s side was still endless, and Su 
Xi got up and went to the bathroom. 

Coming out of the bathroom, I was about to go back to the classroom, and 
Zhou Ting came over with a few girls. 

Zhou Ting stared at Su Xi’s face with a gloomy face, and when she 
approached, she turned around to block her way, and warned Su Xi in a 
commanding tone, “Stay away from Qiao Yu in the future!” 

Su Xi said lightly, “You go and talk to Qiao Yu.” 

Zhou Ting’s face suddenly changed, “You gave you a face, didn’t you?” 

She was arrogant, and remembered the hatred a few days ago, and just took 
the opportunity to play, raised her hand and hit Su Xi’s face, as if deliberately 
scolding Su Xi in front of everyone to find face for Qiao Yu. 

Su Xi didn’t wait for her hand to touch herself, and raised her foot to kick on 
Zhou Ting’s left leg. 



Zhou Ting’s leg was directly kicked and broken! 

Su Xi’s clean and delicate facial features always give people an illusion, 
making people think that she is soft and bullied. In fact, her approach to 
problem solving is just as clean and she never talks much. 

…… 

An hour later, Su Xi stood in the principal’s office, Zhou Ting had been sent to 
the hospital, and at this time it was Zhou Ting’s father Zhou Xiangkun who 
was arguing with the principal. 

The counselor protected Su Xi and Zhou Xiangkun’s theory, obviously it was 
Zhou Ting’s hand that moved first, and Su Xi’s return was also a legitimate 
defense. 

Zhou Xiangkun pointed at him in annoyance, “Why are you protecting this little 
slut so much? She seduced Tingting’s boyfriend, it’s not a good thing at first 
glance, is there some shady relationship between you! 

The counselor with this sentence turned pale, “You don’t want to spew blood!” 
The 

principal also sank his face, “Mr. Zhou, it’s not right for you to talk like this, 
slander, we can sue you!” 

Zhou Xiangkun became more and more annoyed, “I don’t care about the 
broken things between you, but I must give Tingting an explanation, if you 
don’t expel this dead girl, the 10 million I donated to the school will be 
returned to me now!” The 

Zhou family is rich, and last year Jiang built a new library, and Zhou Xiangkun 
donated 10 million. 

“I am a person who has contributed to Jiang Da, and now you treat me like 
this for a poor student, pay back now!” Zhou Xiangkun stuck his waist and 
was on his toes. 

“That labor week is always forgiven for a few days.” The school can’t take out 
10 million at once, but the principal is a man of letters and has his own 
backbone. 



“No negotiation, pay back now!” Zhou Xiangkun did not budge. 

“I’ll pay it back!” A cold magnetic voice sounded from behind the sofa, and 
then a tall figure stood up, and walked over with long legs. 

Zhou Xiangkun’s greasy and distorted face froze, and he looked at the man 
dumbfounded, “Ling, President Ling? 
Su Xi, 
who was standing behind, suddenly raised his head. 

When they quarreled, there was a person sitting on the other side of the sofa, 
but the person turned his back to everyone, and no one could see the face. 

Su Xi was calm before, but now he is a little weak-hearted, but he didn’t 
expect to meet Ling Jiuze here again, or in this situation. 

Especially what Zhou Xiangkun said just now, so loud, he must have heard 
them all. 

Zhou Xiangkun has lost the momentum of Fang Cai, his business has been 
smooth over the years, and he is worth more than a billion, but in front of the 
Ling family, he is not a fart. 

Principal Fang stepped forward and said quietly, “This is a matter between the 
school and the parents of the students, you don’t need to mix with Jiuzawa.” 

He had a personal relationship with Ling Jiuze’s father, and he invited Ling 
Jiuze because of the school celebration, so naturally it was not good to trouble 
him with these things. 

Zhou Xiangkun didn’t expect Principal Fang to have a relationship with Ling 
Jiuze, so he immediately changed his smiling face and said with a fawning 
smile, “I really didn’t know that President Ling was here, and the money didn’t 
have to be returned, I said it was funny.” 

Ling Jiuze said nothing, didn’t pay attention to him at all, took out the phone 
and instructed the company assistant to transfer 20 million to the school, hung 
up the phone and turned to the other principal, “Even pay him back the 
interest!” Zhou 

Xiangkun’s face turned pale, Ling Jiuze had just returned to China, and he 
had offended him before he could stammer. 



At this point, Principal Fang didn’t say much, and soon the money arrived and 
transferred it to Zhou Xiangkun. 

Zhou Xiangkun scolded and left, thinking about how to save face in Ling 
Jiuze. 

The principal and counselor went out to see off Zhou Xiangkun together, and 
only Su Xi and Ling Jiuze were left in the office. 

Su Xi’s face was embarrassed, no matter what, she was now the tutor of the 
Ling family, Ling Yinuo’s teacher, but now she was standing here because of 
the fight, or Ling Jiuze paid for this matter. 

She felt that she should say something, she looked up at the man, and just 
about to speak, Ling Jiuze suddenly said, “No thanks, I’m not for you either!” 

Su Xi held her breath in her throat, she couldn’t go up, she couldn’t get down, 
she had already seen this man’s mouth poisonous, and her chest was still 
blocked. 

She said lightly, “I didn’t want to thank you!” The 

man was a head taller than her, and looked down at her, “Look at your kicking 
Zhou Ting’s skills, have you practiced?” The 

monitoring of the corridor has been called, and Ling Jiuze also saw it, at that 
time, Zhou Ting was imposing, and the hand that hit people was fast and 
ruthless, Su Xi did not blink his eyes, and kicked on Zhou Ting’s leg. 

And how can an ordinary girl kick someone and break a bone? 

A dark color flashed in Su Xi’s eyes, and he said calmly, “I practiced self-
defense when I was a child.” 

Ling Jiuze nodded, “Don’t worry, I have always been clear about right and 
wrong, and I will not fire you because of this matter.” Su 

Xi was just about to speak, when he heard footsteps coming over, he closed 
his mouth and lowered his head. 

Ling Jiuze looked at her pretending to be well-behaved and wanted to laugh. 



Principal Fang walked in, looked at Su Xi, and said seriously, “Su Xi, I believe 
you are a good student, but you shouldn’t do it no matter what, don’t affect 
your future.” 

Su Xi lowered her long eyelashes and nodded meekly, “Yes, thank you 
Principal.” 

“Don’t thank me!” Principal Fang smiled and said, “You should thank 
President Ling, he helped you!” 

Su Xi took a deep breath without a trace, stepped forward two steps, raised 
his head, and opened his pink lips lightly, “Thank you President Ling!” ” 

Ling Jiuze didn’t move, only a hint of ridicule was hidden in his inky eyes, as if 
mocking her and saying that he would not thank him, “No need to thank him, 
but,” Ling Jiuze said slowly, “As a student, it is better to keep to yourself, 

don’t tarnish the reputation of Jiangda’s century-old famous school because of 
these messy things.” 

Su Xi’s face turned pale, and he bit his lip and did not speak. 

Principal Fang played the round and changed the topic, “I’m really sorry, I let 
you spend 20 million for no reason, and the school will pay back this money.” 

Ling Jiuze glanced at Su Xi, “Let her return her!” 

Su Xi gasped and looked at him stunned. 

Principal Fang thought that Ling Jiuze was joking, and smiled at Su Xiwen, 
“It’s almost dark, Su Xi, you can also go home, you don’t care about Zhou 
Ting’s affairs, the school will take care of the aftermath.” 

Su Xi thanked Principal Fang again, did not dare to look at Ling Jiuze, turned 
and left the office. 

When Su Xi went out, Principal Fang asked Ling Jiuze to sit down again and 
said with a smile, “Don’t scare her, she’s still a child!” Ling 

Jiuze smiled lightly, “I see that she is not afraid at all. ” 

 


