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Chapter 241 - 249 

 

: Real or Fake Confidantes 

 

The two of them had known each other for quite a long time, so Mo Yan did not beat 
around the bush with her. She directly said, “Guoguo, do you have any designs on Luo 
Tao when you have such high regard for him?” 

Faced with Mo Yan’s sudden outburst, Li Guoguo was speechless. After a long while, 
she laughed dryly and said, “Sister Mo Yan, what are you talking about? He is your 
husband, my brother-in-law. What designs can I have?” 

“It’s good that you don’t have any. I don’t want my friend to be eyeing my husband.” 

Mo Yan’s voice was cold and indifferent. Her eyes were locked tightly on Li Guoguo. 

Li Guoguo stuttered, “Sister Mo Yan, why would you think that! Am I that kind of 
person?” 

“Guoguo, I’ve always hoped that you’re not, but your actions and words make me 
suspicious.” 

“Sister Mo Yan, what do you mean by that? You can’t accuse me like this!” 

Li Guoguo had an aggrieved look on her face, and her eyes were filled with tears. It 
really seemed like Mo Yan had wronged her. 

Mo Yan’s expression suddenly changed, and the corners of her mouth rose, she 
laughed lightly. “Why are you crying? I’m just suspicious. Firstly, I don’t want our 
relationship to be ruined because of my husband. Secondly, I don’t want any 
misunderstandings between us to cause any changes in my relationship with my 
husband. Today, I’m just saying it out loud so that there won’t be any suspicions 
between us.” 



Li Guoguo was nervous because of Mo Yan’s every move. She was indeed interested in 
Luo Tao, but she didn’t expect Mo Yan to notice and directly expose it. However, at this 
time, she wouldn’t admit it no matter what. 

“Sister Mo Yan, believe me. I don’t have any other intentions towards brother-in-law. I 
just think that brother-in-law and sister are very compatible.” 

Mo Yan smiled as she picked up the name tag on the office desk and fiddled with it. 
“Yes, I believe you. Our Guoguo isn’t stupid. You know yourself what you should or 
should not do.” 

Li Guoguo watched as Mo Yan’s movements became faster and faster. Was Mo Yan 
warning her that she was her superior and not to have any designs on Luo Tao? 

Li Guoguo held back her fear and tried her best to pretend to be her usual self, she said 
coquettishly, “Of course I’m not stupid! Sister Mo Yan, you are really thinking too much. 
Brother-in-law is already married to you. How can I be interested in brother-in-law! 
Moreover, there are so many single men. I wouldn’t go to the extent of being someone’s 
mistress, right?” 

Mo Yan smiled and did not answer. 

Seeing that the situation was still not right, Li Guoguo did not dare to stay with Mo Yan 
any longer. She simply found an excuse and left Mo Yan’s office. 

Mo Yan leaned back on the chair and sighed. Xu Wan was right. Li Guoguo was 
interested in Luo Tao. 

This man was really more attractive than her. Back when she was in school, she 
thought that she had received a lot of love letters. But now, looking at these women who 
knew that Luo Tao was already married and still jumped on him, she could not help but 
be convinced. 

However, Li Guoguo was different from other women. She wanted to save her from 
embarrassment and not let her meet Luo Tao in the future. 

At this time, Mo Yan’s phone rang. It was Xu Wan. 

“How is it? I was correct, right?” 

“Yeah, I think so.” 

On the other side of the phone, Xu Wan clicked her tongue, which made Mo Yan want 
to laugh. 



“I just asked Li Guoguo what she thought of Luo Tao. She praised him to the skies. 
What about you? What do you think of Luo Tao?” Mo Yan took a bite of the sandwich 
she had brought from home that morning. 

That day, Xu Wan went to get insurance for the employees while Xu Tian went to run 
some business. The two of them had happily gone out, leaving her to have lunch alone. 

“What do you think? Just like that! When he was like a gangster, he definitely wasn’t 
good enough for you. Now, it looks okay. At least he can earn some money and not 
starve you.” 

Listening to Xu Wan’s evaluation, Mo Yan laughed out loud. 

This was a true confidante. When you asked her to evaluate the people around you, 
they would always be the first to judge your boyfriend from your point of view, from the 
point of view of a friend, and not from the point of view of the opposite sex admiring your 
boyfriend. 

“Hey! What are you laughing at! You sound so silly!” 

Listening to the laughter that suddenly came from the phone, the corners of Xu Wan’s 
mouth twitched. 

“I’m laughing at how I have such a good friend.” 

Mo Yan’s voice still carried a hint of a smile, which gave Xu Wan goosebumps. 

“Ew! It’s so mushy! Mo Yan, did you take the wrong medicine today? Hurry up and get 
your husband to bring you to check whether there’s anything wrong with your brain.” 

Seeing that the lunch break had ended, Mo Yan did not continue nattering with her. 
After asking a few more questions about insurance, she hung up. 

Thank you for reading on  

Chapter 242: Leisure Time 

 

From the moment Mo Yan became a supervisor, she realized that there was so much a 
supervisor had to do. 

As the middle management in the company, the supervisor not only had to report to the 
higher-ups, but also had to convey the sales tasks and strategies to the subordinates. 



Sometimes, Mo Yan would wonder how Chen Ya had the time to pay close attention to 
her every day when she had been a supervisor, causing trouble for her? 

In the afternoon, Mo Yan finished the work on hand and started the fieldwork. Even 
though she became a supervisor, she could not sit in the office all day. 

Market development and payment supervision were all tasks that she had to do. 

However, she did not expect to see Luo Tao as soon as she went downstairs. Mo Yan 
was a little surprised and ran quickly to Luo Tao’s side. 

“Why are you here?” Mo Yan looked up at Luo Tao in astonishment. 

Luo Tao gently rubbed Mo Yan’s bun. “You said yesterday that you needed to do 
fieldwork this afternoon, so I came to wait for you.” 

“Huh? I’m at work! It’s not good to meet during working hours!” 

Although she was very happy to see Luo Tao, she had to draw clear boundaries 
between work and personal matters. Mo Yan felt that it was not good no matter how she 
looked at it. 

Luo Tao’s smile became even more gentle. “Your boss allowed it.” 

“Huh?” Mo Yan replied in a daze. 

“I sent a translation to your director on the way today. Your director said that you can 
have someone accompany you when you do your fieldwork with an injured arm this 
afternoon.” 

Because he knew Mo Yan’s personality, Luo Tao’s expression was very serious when 
he spoke, as if to prove that he was not lying. 

Mo Yan giggled and grabbed Luo Tao’s arm. 

Previously, the director had asked her for Luo Tao’s phone number. She didn’t expect 
Luo Tao to complete the translation so quickly. 

“Why are you so serious! It’s fieldwork! There will always be times when you slack off.” 
Mo Yan mischievously stuck her tongue out at Luo Tao. 

Today, Mo Yan was going to the site of the project that the Mo family had discussed 
with them a few days ago. The distance wasn’t too far; by bus, it was six stops away. 
She had chosen a time when there were fewer people, so there would be no traffic 
jams. 



After spending a lot of time with Mo Yan, Luo Tao had slowly gotten used to taking the 
bus. For this reason, the two of them had specially gone to get bus passes. 

Like the previous time, if the two of them had time at night, they could take the bus 
home slowly. Enjoying the night scenery of the city along the way was a kind of 
enjoyment. 

Without Mo Lian stopping them, Mo Yan’s work progressed very quickly. It was not that 
the project had fallen into Mo Yan’s hands, but they had held meetings over a few days 
and so had to see it for themselves and get some results. In the future, if she 
encountered a similar project, she would be able to come up with a plan as quickly as 
possible. 

If they had rejected it, then the few mornings spent would have been wasted. 

After work at night, the two of them weren’t in a hurry to go home. They were ready to 
take a walk and take a taxi once they felt tired. 

Mo Yan held onto Luo Tao’s arm and strolled under the brightly lit high-rise buildings. 

“Mo Cheng called me this afternoon.” 

Just as Mo Yan was talking about her childhood with Mo Cheng, Luo Tao suddenly 
spoke up. 

“Is anything the matter?” Mo Yan looked at Luo Tao. 

“He said that the results are out regarding his school’s punishment for the students who 
had fought.” 

Mo Yan had almost forgotten about this matter. The day after the fight, she went to work 
and met Mo Lian. She was promoted to supervisor and took over the supervisor’s job. 
She was busy as a top all day long. 

She didn’t have the time to bother about this issue. Luo Tao was the one who dealt with 
the follow-up matters. 

Besides, apart from her injury, Luo Tao and Mo Cheng were both fine, so she didn’t 
really care about it. 

“What do you mean?” Mo Yan asked. 

“I heard from Mo Cheng that after the school teacher confirmed from the students that 
those people were the ones who started the fight, they gave them demerits.” 

“What about their injuries? How much did you pay back then?” 



Mo Yan remembered that Luo Tao had beaten up those gangster students quite badly 
back then. 

“I didn’t pay. They were the ones who started the fight. We considered it as self-
defense. Moreover, you were injured. They were the ones who paid for your medical 
expenses.” 

Mo Yan looked at Luo Tao in surprise. Was this considered self-defense? How did Luo 
Tao beat up those people in order to make such a judgment? 

Seeing Mo Yan’s strange expression, Luo Tao didn’t explain much, he continued to 
laugh, “I heard from Mo Cheng that he gave the teacher evidence of these people 
bullying the other students. Other than the demerits, they are also facing the risk of 
being expelled.” 

Mo Yan’s jaw dropped. Her family’s Cheng was not bad! Things were done well. With 
the experience of these people, there should be fewer bullying incidences in the school. 

Thank you for reading on  

Chapter 243: A Storm Was Coming 

 

Thinking of Mo Cheng, the conversation between Luo Tao and Mo Cheng also came to 
Mo Yan’s mind. What exactly did they say that made Mo Cheng change so much? 

Mo Yan had asked about it a few times, but Luo Tao never said anything. 

In fact, Luo Tao did not know what to say. Mo Cheng was very smart, but he had been 
blindfolded. When someone was willing to listen and give him confidence, he could walk 
out on his own. 

The two of them strolled along the street. Mo Yan leaned her head against Luo Tao’s 
arm. 

“I really hope that I can continue walking like this with you.” Mo Yan sighed. 

From that night onwards, Mo Yan had an inexplicable sense of uneasiness. It was as if 
Luo Tao would leave her at any moment. 

Luo Tao looked at Mo Yan and smiled lightly. “You will.” 

From the beginning of their life together, it was like a vacation. There was no distrust or 
scheming. There was only the daily grind to grapple with. 



The night light elongated their shadows, and as they moved, they got closer and closer. 

… 

In the Mo family’s villa. 

Mo Lian rushed back from country M. As soon as she entered the door, she saw Mo 
Dong sitting on the sofa. Her heart skipped a beat, and she wanted to turn around and 
leave, but Mo Dong stopped her. 

“For what are you leaving?” Mo Dong said icily. 

Mo Lian reluctantly walked to Mo Dong’s side. “Dad.” 

Seeing Mo Dong glaring at her, Mo Lian hurriedly apologized, “Dad! I was wrong about 
what had happened before. Dad, don’t be angry.” 

“What was wrong?” Mo Dong continued to ask. 

“I shouldn’t have targeted Mo Yan in Mo Yan’s company and embarrassed Dad,” Mo 
Lian lowered her head. 

“What else!” 

Mo Lian didn’t know what else she had done wrong, so she lowered her head and kept 
quiet. 

“Also, you can do a lot of things to mess with her, but you have to choose the stupidest 
one. Not only Hong Jing, even the employees of our own company don’t like you,” Mo 
Dong said with a snort. 

Actually, what made him most dissatisfied with Mo Lian was that Mo Lian had started 
thinking about his company at such a young age. He hadn’t even retired yet, but she 
had already spread the word that she would inherit the company in the future. 

In the end, Mo Dong was a person who did not love anyone. He only loved his company 
and his money. Once someone coveted his things, he could not bear it, let alone a 
daughter like this who did not have a brain, and had embarrassed him in front of other 
companies. 

“Dad! I’m sorry, I won’t do it again in the future. I know my mistake.” 

Mo Lian dared to be arrogant towards others, but she did not dare to say anything to her 
father. 



Firstly, it was because she and her mother had to rely on her father for a living. 
Secondly, her father would really throw punches. If her father wanted to hit her, even 
her mother would not be able to stop him. Hence, she did not dare to go head-to-head 
with her father. 

Mo Dong glanced at her coldly and said, “Enough! Let’s forget about this matter. In the 
future, think before you act.” 

Mo Lian nodded obediently. 

“In a few days, Mo Real Estate will hold a charity banquet. Clean yourself up and attend 
it.” 

“Okay! I got it, Dad!” 

Hearing Mo Dong mention the banquet, Mo Lian’s expression remain unchanged, but 
her heart was filled with joy. 

When she received the call asking her to return, she heard her mother wanted her to 
hurry home, saying that they were going to hold a charity banquet. 

Mo Lian liked this kind of occasion the most. Once the Mo family held a banquet, she 
would be the center of attention. Regardless of whether it was someone more powerful 
than the Mo family, they would all have to show respect to her. 

Mo Dong looked at Mo Lian and said frostily, “For this banquet, invite Mo Yan as well.” 

“What?” 

Mo Lian shrieked a little, but when she saw Mo Dong’s gloomy expression, she had no 
choice but to shut her mouth, not daring to speak further 

“Mo Lian, look at you now. You still want to inherit the company? I might as well give it 
to Mo Yan.” 

Mo Lian looked at Mo Dong in disbelief. Her father had actually said that he wanted to 
give the company to Mo Yan? 

“Father! Mo Yan and her mother have done so many things in the past! How can you 
say that!” 

Seeing Mo Lian’s agitation, Mo Dong’s expression became even more frigid. 

“Mo Lian, let me tell you, with your current state, not only will you not inherit the 
company, you won’t even be qualified to be a junior supervisor.” 



Mo Dong suddenly thought of Mo Yan in the video. If he had not broken off with mother 
and daughter, Mo Yan would probably be much better than Mo Lian. At least there 
would be someone to keep Mo Lian in check, so Mo Lian would not develop into such a 
brainless character, with a habit of doing things solely based on her preferences. 

“Go and invite Mo Yan. If you can’t, you don’t have to attend the banquet as well.” 

“Dad!” 

Mo Lian growled at Mo Dong’s back, but Mo Dong ignored her and went straight 
upstairs to his room. 

Thank you for reading on  

Chapter 244: A Storm Was Brewing 

 

In the living room, only Mo Lian was left crying bitterly. 

After about half an hour, Chang Lu rushed downstairs and saw her daughter still sitting 
on the sofa. She quickly helped her daughter up the stairs. 

“Little Lian, why are you quarreling with your father again? Didn’t I tell you on the phone 
that you just have to listen to him!” 

Mo Lian said aggrievedly: “Mom, dad actually said that he would let that little sl*t attend 
the banquet! How can dad say that? Didn’t he already chase that little sl*t out of the 
house?” 

Chang Lu stroked her daughter’s head and comforted her: “Your dad was angered by 
you this time. Little Lian, you have to change your temper too. Even with our status, we 
can’t do anything domineering. Otherwise, the one who will lose face will be us the Mo 
family.” 

“I can change, but we can’t let that little sl*t come back again! Mom, we finally chased 
them away, how can we let them come back again!” 

Chang Lu sighed. Why would she want that mother and daughter to come back? 
However, she could not change Mo Dong’s decision. Moreover, Mo Dong only said that 
he wanted Mo Yan to attend the dinner party and did not say anything about bringing 
the mother and daughter back, so she could not say anything. 

“Little Lian, bear with it and behave better. When you take over your father’s company, 
the two of us will not be like this anymore.” 



Over the years, the Mo family was controlled by Mo Dong completely. If Chang Lu 
dared to refute what he said, she would definitely suffer. This also made Chang Lu want 
her daughter to quickly take over the company. 

“Mom, should we think of a way to punish Mo Yan and the others? It would be best if we 
can chase them out of C City. That way, we won’t have to worry anymore.” 

Every time Mo Lian thought of the humiliation Mo Yan had brought to her, she wanted to 
tear Mo Yan into pieces. Chasing her out of C City was already considered a light 
punishment. 

Chang Lu sighed. Her daughter still did not realize the crux of the problem. She only 
focused on the small details. 

Chang Lu thought for a moment and continued: “You don’t have to care too much about 
Mo Yan. Even if your father wants to recognize Mo Yan, she might not be able to come 
back. Moreover, Mo Yan’s mother and Mo Cheng are sandwiched in the middle. Even if 
your father doesn’t mind, do you think Mo Yan wouldn’t mind?” 

Thinking of the situation where Mo Yan and her father were at loggerheads, Mo Lian felt 
a little relieved. 

“Then mom, you will just let that little sl*t go? I can’t accept this. That little sl*t must have 
made her boss complain to dad about this. That’s why dad was so angry.” Mo Lian 
angrily blamed Mo Yan. 

Chang Lu said earnestly: “There’s no rush. You have plenty of opportunities to deal with 
Mo Yan. The most important thing now is for you to organize this charity banquet well. I 
heard that the Huo family’s daughter came to C City recently for her engagement. Your 
dad’s charity banquet is prepared for the Huo family’s daughter. If you want to climb the 
social ladders, you know what you have to do!” 

“Mom, are you talking about the Huo family of Jing City?” Mo Lian’s face turned from 
anger to surprise. 

“Yes, it’s the Huo family that is famous all over the country. The daughter of the Huo 
family came to C City to get engaged to the young master of the Qin family. If you can 
invite her to this charity banquet, our family will get countless benefits in the future.” 

Hearing Chang Lu’s words, Mo Lian felt that it was wonderful. 

The daughter of the Huo family! She was the little princess that Fourth Master Huo 
doted on the most! If she could become friends with the little princess, not only would 
her status be raised by a few levels, but she would also have the opportunity to get 
close to Fourth Master Huo. This was the goal that all girls pursued! 



Seeing her daughter’s eyes light up, Chang Lu smiled and said, “This time, you will 
personally write the invitation letter to the daughter of the Huo family. Your words must 
be sincere. Fourth Master Huo and his little sister have always liked to do charity. If you 
are sincere, I think she will not reject it.” 

Mo Lian nodded vigorously: “Okay, I will definitely write it well.” 

Then, Mo Lian thought of Mo Yan. She really did not want to invite that sl*t to such an 
occasion. 

“Mom! Do I really have to invite that sl*t? I don’t want to.” 

Chang Lu sighed: “Since your dad has said so, he must have his own plans. You better 
not go against his wishes. Your father has also said that as long as you perform well 
this time, you will still be his only daughter.” 

Mo Dong’s words were very contradictory, but the mother and daughter had no other 
choice. They could only go along with Mo Dong’s wishes and do whatever Mo Dong 
said. 

Thank you for reading on  

Chapter 245: Threaten 

 

Two days later, Mo Yan was working when her phone suddenly rang. It was a call from 
an unknown number. 

“Hello? How are you?” 

“Mo Yan! You blocked my number?” 

Mo Yan had just picked up the phone when she heard Mo Lian’s exasperated voice. Mo 
Yan subconsciously pressed the hang-up button. 

Before she could block it again, Mo Lian’s call came in again. 

“Mo Yan! I have something to talk to you about.” Mo Lian shouted directly. 

Mo Yan rolled her eyes. She had already blocked three of Mo Lian’s numbers before, 
and Mo Lian was actually able to get a fourth card to call her! How weird! 

“What is it? Talk!” 



“The Mo family has a charity banquet on Saturday night. The venue is the Peninsula 
Hotel. Come and attend it.” 

Mo Lian’s commanding tone made Mo Yan laugh. She rejected her directly: “I’m not 
going.” 

“You!” 

Mo Lian was choked by Mo Yan’s straightforward words. When she remembered that 
Luo Tao had rejected her the same way last time, she felt even more resentful. 

“It was dad who asked me to invite you.” Mo Lian said stiffly. 

“I’m not going. That’s your dad, not mine. Why should I listen to him?” 

Although Mo Yan’s words did not give her any face, Mo Lian was secretly delighted. 

Judging from the degree of separation between Mo Yan and Mo Dong, it was really like 
what her mother said. She did not have to worry too much about Mo Dong reconciling 
with Mo Yan. 

“Do you have anything else? If there’s nothing else, I’m hanging up.” Mo Yan said coldly 
on the other side of the phone. 

“Don’t hang up, Mo Yan. I advise you to attend this banquet. Otherwise, it’s hard to say 
what will happen to your family.” 

Even if she did not want Mo Yan to come, she did not dare to disobey Mo Dong’s 
orders. Of course, she would not reveal to Mo Yan that the Huo family’s daughter might 
attend the banquet, so she could only threaten her. 

“What do you mean?” 

Mo Yan’s voice became colder. Mo Lian had repeatedly threatened her with her family. 
Did she really think that Mo Yan had no temper? 

“Dad asked you to come. If you don’t come, dad will blame me. There’s nothing I can 
do! I can only use your family members to threaten you.” 

Seeing that Mo Yan was angry, Mo Lian was happy. Her words also became more and 
more infuriating. 

“Mo Lian, do you think that threatening me with the same method will work?” 

Mo Yan’s voice was cold and stern. If Mo Lian could see Mo Yan’s current expression, 
she would probably be scared half to death. However, Mo Lian could not see it. 



“Now that your mother is in the hospital and your brother is in school, it’s easy for me to 
make a move. Think about it yourself! The invitation will be mailed to your house. 
Whether you go or not, it’s up to you.” 

After saying that, Mo Lian hung up the phone first. 

Mo Yan heard the busy tone coming from the phone. The veins on her hand that were 
holding the phone popped up. Mo Lian! 

Taking two deep breaths, Mo Yan focused her attention back on work. It was probably 
because she had experienced a lot of things over time. The moment Mo Lian said that 
Mo Dong wanted her to attend the banquet, she knew that Mo Dong wanted to use her 
to discipline Mo Lian. 

Mo Dong had always been a person who cared about his face. After the incident with 
Mo Lian, how could he not be angry? But now, he only had Mo Lian by his side. He 
wanted to discipline her, but he did not have the time, so he used her to teach Mo Lian 
a lesson. 

Heh! Mo Dong’s idea was good. Even though he had already severed his relationship 
with this daughter. As long as he wanted to use her, he would still use her. 

However, Mo Lian was right. With her current situation, she could not completely protect 
her family. She could only work hard and climb to a higher position to earn more money 
and hire people to take care of them. 

Mo Yan sighed. When she had time, she really had to think of ways to deal with Mo 
Lian. She could not always let her use her weak spot to threaten her. 

During lunch, Mo Yan, Xu Wan, and the others sat at the same table. Halfway through 
lunch, they heard Qiao Li and Zhao Xin mention the Mo family’s charity banquet on 
Saturday. 

Zhao Xin had never been interested in banquets. She looked as if she had lost her 
parents. 

“I don’t want to go. My mom is urging me to find a boyfriend. If I go, she might drag me 
around to promote me.” 

Xu Wan looked at Zhao Xin’s pained expression and smiled happily: “I don’t understand 
the troubles of rich people!” 

“You’re still gloating over my misery! You’re too much! Qiao Li, your family isn’t urging 
you to get married?” 



Qiao Li elegantly swallowed a mouthful of food and said, “Fortunately, they haven’t 
rushed me recently.” 

Thank you for reading on  

Chapter 246: On the Eve of the Banquet 

 

As they were talking, the topic of conversation changed to Mo Yan. After all, it was a 
party organized by the Mo family. Whether Mo Yan would attend or not, they still had to 
ask. 

Mo Yan picked up a piece of shredded potatoes with her chopsticks and said helplessly: 
“I’ll go, but not in the name of the Mo family’s daughter, but in my own name.” 

Xu Wan was a little surprised. She thought Mo Yan would not go. 

“Didn’t you break off all ties with the Mo family? Why are you still going? Won’t Mo Lian 
make things difficult for you?” Xu Wan was puzzled. 

Mo Yan sighed: “She specifically called me and asked me to go.” 

“Specifically asked you to go? That’s strange! Could it be that she’s trying to trick you to 
go and make things difficult for you?” Xu Wan asked. 

“I’m not sure. She said that Mo Dong asked me to go. I think Mo Lian was humiliated in 
Hong Jing this time so Mo Dong deliberately made me go back to provoke Mo Lian.” 

When she said this, Mo Yan seemed to be saying something very normal, causing the 
other three people to look over. 

Was he not using Mo Yan as a tool? The person who wanted to use her was her father. 
How did she manage to be so calm? 

Other than Xu Wan who knew the situation, Xu Wan was still quite surprised at Mo 
Yan’s attitude. Could it be that Mo Yan really did not care at all? 

“You already know the reason, yet you still went! Isn’t this just being used as a target for 
others!” Xu Wan stood up for Mo Yan. 

Mo Yan chuckled: “I can’t help it. That family has no bottom line. Mo Lian threatened me 
that if I did not go, she would attack my family. Anyway, if I go alone, she can only 
humiliate me.” 



“Threaten you? Call the police! What kind of person is this? Her family is having a lousy 
banquet and she still wants you to go.” Xu Wan said angrily. 

“I don’t have any evidence. It’s useless to call the police. Anyway, she’s just saying it 
now. If something really happens, we’ll talk about it later!” 

Xu Wan could hear the helplessness in Mo Yan’s tone, but she could not do anything 
about it. 

On the other side, Qiao Li and Zhao Xin looked at each other and said: “Don’t worry. 
We’ll go tonight too. We won’t let Mo Lian bully Mo Yan.” 

Mo Yan could not help but burst into laughter when she saw their worried expressions. 

“Don’t worry, the most Mo Lian could do will be to humiliate me. She won’t do anything 
else.” 

Mo Yan could tell from these few incidents that Mo Lian wanted to humiliate her and see 
her make a fool of herself, but she did not have the guts to do something that would kill 
her. So as long as she was more vigilant, nothing big should happen. 

“Okay, then you should be more careful.” 

After Xu Wan said that, she started to talk about other topics. After all, no one was in a 
good mood when it came to Mo Lian. 

While Mo Yan was having a heated conversation, Li Guoguo was not having a good 
time. 

Ever since Mo Yan revealed her stakes to her that day, she did not dare to casually look 
for Mo Yan. However, everyone in the office knew that she had a good relationship with 
Mo Yan and often asked her about Mo Yan and the stocks. 

When it came to the stocks, Li Guoguo thought of what Luo Tao had said. 

“If you don’t understand something, don’t meddle in it.” 

She always felt that Luo Tao’s words did not only refer to the stocks but also to her 
unspeakable thoughts. 

No girl would not be moved by such a handsome, elegant, and capable man. Why 
would Mo Yan be so harsh to her? She only had a crush on her and did not confess. 
Why would Mo Yan expose her like that? 

Thinking of this, Li Guoguo could not help but feel a little resentful. 



Li Guoguo thought of Mo Yan’s husband and her boyfriend, and her eyes reddened 
slightly. 

In the past, she had always thought that Mo Yan’s husband was only good-looking but 
had no money and had to be supported by Mo Yan. If she found a rich man, she would 
always be like Mo Yan. 

But now, comparing Mo Yan’s husband who was only capable and did not show it, and 
her boyfriend, who relied on his family’s money but had no looks or figure and not only 
cheated on her but also dumped her, how could she tolerate that? 

“Eh? Guoguo, what’s wrong? Why aren’t you eating?” A colleague asked. 

Li Guoguo calmed herself down and said: “Nothing! I just thought of something.” 

“Thought of something? The stock issue? Guoguo, let me tell you, Manager Mo’s 
husband is really amazing! I saw that the stocks he recommended are rising these 
days! I’ve earned a few hundred in these few days!” 

The female colleague took out her phone and opened the stock market APP. She said 
while showing it to Li Guoguo. 

Thank you for reading on  

Chapter 247: Stories From Others 

 

Li Guoguo saw that no one noticed her abnormality and heaved a sigh of relief. 

“Yeah! I bought it too. I’ve been looking pretty happy these past few days.” 

Li Guoguo told the others about the stocks that she had mentioned at the dinner table 
that day. At first, she was a little nervous, but these few stocks had been increasing 
these past few days, and many people had been praising her. Hearing these words, Li 
Guoguo was relieved. 

“Guoguo, you’re really amazing! You got the god of stocks to recommend so many 
stocks to you. Sigh! Your relationship is really good. People like us, who are not familiar 
with Supervisor Mo, can’t even talk to them!” 

The one who spoke was a short-haired female colleague. Previously, she had privately 
said that Li Guoguo’s performance was so bad that she could not stay in Hong Jing. 
However, when she saw that Mo Yan had been promoted to director, she immediately 
changed her attitude. 



Li Guoguo was flattered by others. She did not care whether what she said was true or 
not, she just blurted it out. 

“Brother-in-law is pretty good. The day we had dinner, he asked me about my views on 
stocks. After I said that, he even praised me for coming. After that, he recommended 
stocks to me.” 

“Eh? The god of stocks is so approachable? He was so cold that day I saw him! When I 
was taking photos, he almost scared me to death.” This time, the one who spoke was 
the girl who had been caught by Luo Tao secretly taking photos after work that day. 

Li Guoguo smiled lightly: “He’s alright! Brother-in-law is quite gentle to me. Maybe Mo 
Yan is often jealous so brother-in-law won’t show his gentle side in front of others.” 

“No way! Supervisor Mo is so jealous? She doesn’t look like she would!” The girl 
continued to say. 

“Haha, after all, brother-in-law is so nice! Mo Yan should be jealous! If she wasn’t 
jealous, why would Mo Yan not be willing to let brother-in-law help you to trade stocks? 
This is also a way for Mo Yan to win people’s hearts!” 

“That’s true! It seems that Supervisor Mo is a little stingy! Guoguo, you’re good. You’re 
so close to the god of stocks. You’ll be rich in the future!” The short-haired woman 
continued to flatter. 

Li Guoguo said generously: “It’s okay. Mo Yan doesn’t buy stocks. I can always ask 
brother-in-law. I’ll tell you when brother-in-law teaches me.” 

“Aiya! Guoguo is too nice. We’ll treat you to a meal another time.” 

In the cafeteria, the sound of Li Guoguo’s table gradually grew louder. Xu Wan glanced 
at it a few times and asked Mo Yan: “What’s going on between you and Li Guoguo?” 

Mo Yan followed Xu Wan’s line of sight and chuckled: “Nothing much. It’s pretty good 
now. She won’t disturb me, and I don’t have to be afraid of her scheming anymore.” 

“I don’t think it’s possible. This girl! She probably doesn’t have any ulterior motives, but 
she’s just not too capable.” 

Xu Wan gave such an evaluation. 

Actually, Mo Yan did not really want to befriend Li Guoguo back then. Sister Xu had 
also reminded her several times, but every time Li Guoguo followed her, she was too 
embarrassed to refuse, so she could only accept it. 



Now that they were slowly distancing themselves, it was also a way for them to part on 
good terms. 

“Yes, I took her to a cocktail party to do a project, and I think it’s almost done.” Mo Yan 
replied. 

“I think you should be more careful of her.” 

Qiao Li suddenly spoke, causing Mo Yan and the other two to look at her. 

“There’s greed in her eyes, especially when she looks at you, Mo Yan.” 

After Mo Yan was promoted to supervisor, they had a few meals together. Qiao Li had 
discovered this at that time. 

Among the seven deadly sins, there was greed. 

However, under certain circumstances, if one did not become the greedy person that 
others described, it would be difficult to provide for one’s family. 

Living in a materialistic society, if everyone did not have the slightest bit of greed in their 
hearts, how could they work hard to make their lives better? 

However, this kind of greed treated life and work. In other words, it was a kind of desire 
for a better life. 

However, this kind of greed could not be placed on a person. If the opposite sex could 
be said to be someone you wanted to pursue, but if it was placed on a person of the 
same sex, what did you want? 

After Qiao Li finished speaking, Mo Yan fell silent. Li Guoguo had never cared about her 
job, so she probably did not covet her position. 

Then, all she had was the benefits that she could bring to Li Guoguo as a supervisor, as 
well as Luo Tao. 

Mo Yan rubbed her temples and thanked Qiao Li, indicating that she understood. 
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Before the end of work, Li Guoguo knocked on the door and came to the office. 



Seeing Li Guoguo put on a harmless smile, Mo Yan’s temples throbbed. 

“What’s wrong to come to my office to look for me?.” 

“Mo Yan, isn’t It Saturday tomorrow? I want to invite you to go shopping, okay?” 

Mo Yan disagreed a million times in her heart, but she still did not say it out loud. 

She pinched the space between her eyebrows and asked: “If you have something to 
say, just say it! Don’t beat around the bush.” 

“Hehe! Mo Yan, how do you know that I have something to ask you?” Li Guoguo’s smile 
was bright, and she was not polite at all. 

Mo Yan was completely convinced. She would not visit for no reason. Did she not know 
what kind of person she was? 

Just as Li Guoguo was about to speak, there was a knock on the office door. 

“Come in.” 

Mo Yan looked up. It was the company’s finance department. 

“Supervisor Mo, there’s a document that I need you to check and sign.” 

“Okay, I’ll take a look first.” 

After saying that, Mo Yan glanced at the time. There were only twenty minutes left until 
the end of the day. 

She said to the finance department: “Is this document urgent? If it’s not urgent, you can 
get off work first. I’ll check it and give it to you Monday morning.” 

The finance looked at the time and nodded: “Okay.” 

After the treasurer left, Mo Yan picked up the document and started to check it 
seriously. Other than wanting to work with her when she talked about business, Li 
Guoguo basically had nothing to talk to her about at work, so she put Li Guoguo aside 
first. 

This check lasted for an hour, which was already far beyond the time when she was 
supposed to get off work. However, she did not expect Li Guoguo to still be waiting for 
her when Mo Yan raised her head. This was a little unusual. 

Li Guoguo had always been free to enter and leave her office whenever she wanted. 
This was the first time she was still waiting for her when she was working. 



“What is it? Tell me!” Mo Yan said as she tidied up the table. 

“That’s right! Mo Yan, I heard that the Mo family is going to hold a charity banquet soon. 
Mo Yan, Can you give me an invitation?” Li Guoguo’s eyes were full of hope as she 
spoke. 

Mo Yan frowned. She did not understand what Li Guoguo was thinking. 

Since she had a way to find out about the Mo family’s party on Saturday, how could she 
not hear about her and Mo Lian’s incompatible relationship? 

Putting aside whether she could get what she wanted at the party, if Mo Lian knew that 
she had a good relationship with her, she might be humiliated at the party. 

“That’s not a good place to go. I suggest you don’t go.” 

Li Guoguo’s face fell: “Mo Yan, I just want to go and take a look! It shouldn’t be difficult 
for you to get an invitation letter from the Mo family, right?” 

“My relationship with the Mo family is very poor. If I didn’t have to go, I wouldn’t go.” 

Hearing Mo Yan’s words, Li Guoguo’s face turned even uglier. 

“Mo Yan, I just want to take a look. It’s just an invitation. Please help!” 

Li Guoguo’s tone was a little off, but when she thought of the need to get an invitation 
through Mo Yan, her tone softened. 

Mo Yan was a little impatient from her grinding. She rubbed her throbbing temples and 
said: “I can indeed get an invitation, but I have to make it clear that if anything bad 
happens at the banquet, don’t blame me for not reminding you.” 

Li Guoguo only heard the first sentence, but the rest of the sentence was selectively 
ignored by her. 

“Mo Yan, you’re so nice! I love you to death! I heard that the banquet is tomorrow night, 
so the invitation letter…” 

“Give me your address. When the invitation letter arrives at my place tomorrow, I’ll find 
someone to send it to you.” 

“Okay! Mo Yan, then I’ll wait for your good news tomorrow!” 

After saying this, Li Guoguo skipped out. 



Mo Yan looked at the tightly shut door and fell into deep thought. In the past, when she 
saw Li Guoguo like this, she would always laugh at her childish temper. But now, when 
she saw her, she only felt that she was pretentious. 

She did not understand why Li Guoguo was in the mood to call her Mo Yan. Behind her 
back, she was thinking about how to get some benefits from her. 

She and Li Guoguo did not have a deep relationship, to begin with, and it had been 
exhausted by the repeated schemes. She felt annoyed and nauseous at the thought of 
having designs on her friend’s husband. 

All of a sudden, Mo Yan felt that it was great to have a close friend like Xu Wan as a 
comparison. At the very least, it would let her know who was the scheming one. For 
example, Xu Wan would not do anything like Li Guoguo. 
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“You look really good today,” Xu Qing sized up Mo Yan and complimented her. 

Mo Yan had always denied her good looks and put little effort into makeup or styling, 
usually going to work bare-faced with a simple ponytail. However, she was pretty by 
nature. 

Putting on makeup made her dazzlingly gorgeous, especially her pair of big, sparkling 
eyes, which were especially cute. 

Mo Yan lowered her head and looked at her light blue dress. She mostly wore clothes 
for commuting and had few dresses suitable for such a grand occasion. In contrast, Mo 
Lian had a wardrobe full of limited edition dresses. 

“Since I’ve already decided to participate in the charity gala, I must treat it seriously.” Mo 
Yan’s eyes were fixed, and a quiet smile hung on her face. 

“You’d better be careful. After all…” Xu Qing sighed, thinking about the Mo family and 
their antics. Although it was a charity gala on the front, it was in fact a banquet set up to 
scheme against others. 

“I know.” Mo Yan nodded. As soon as she went downstairs, she met Li Guoguo, who 
had been waiting for her for a long time. 



Li Guoguo’s makeup was very exquisite. She had determinedly spent several months of 
her salary to buy a beautiful dress that made her appear radiant. The moment she saw 
Mo Yan, her entire face immediately fell. 

Mo Yan had only briefly modified her makeup, but standing next to her, Li Guoguo paled 
in comparison. 

Exasperated, Li Guoguo walked to Mo Yan’s side with a smile and begged her to bring 
her along. 

“I’ve already given you the invitation. You can go over yourself.” Mo Yan sighed with a 
headache. It was already very troublesome to deal with the Mo family, but she still had 
to deal with Li Guoguo. 

“No.” Li Guoguo was leaning against and practically blocking the door, looking at Mo 
Yan obediently. “I was hoping that you could introduce me.” 

Mo Yan rolled her eyes and stepped forward to pull Li Guoguo away. “You can walk 
there on your own. I have no obligation to send you there.” 

After saying that, she slammed the car door and left, leaving Li Guoguo screaming from 
behind without any intention of slowing down. 

Li Guoguo fell and got up again. The clothes she had spent a lot of money buying had 
become a big mess. She was anxious and angry, and she could not help but burst into 
tears. 

The charity gala was scheduled to be held on the first floor of a famous five-star hotel. 
Mo Yan arrived a little late. When she arrived, she saw that Mo Lian was already waiting 
for her outside, and her face showed some impatience. 

Mo Lian took a few quick steps forward. She was used to being arrogant, and in the Mo 
family, she was in charge. It was clearly the Mo family’s charity gala, and it was meant 
to humiliate Mo Yan, but Mo Yan was more beautiful than herself. 

Mo Lian was so angry that she immediately tried to slap Mo Yan’s face, but Mo Yan 
moved quickly enough to avoid it. 

She grabbed Mo Lian’s wrist first, and her strength was so strong that the latter cried 
out in pain. 

“Mo Yan, let go of me!” Mo Lian snorted angrily. After her sister married Luo Tao, she 
became bolder and more disobedient. 

Mo Lian looked Mo Yan up and down, and the corners of her lips curled up in disdain. “I 
thought you were enjoying life with Luo Tao, and that you had become a decent person. 



I didn’t expect you to still be wearing branded clothes from three or four years ago. It’s 
already outdated. This set of mine is that brand’s latest model. I just took it off a big 
celebrity, and it’s the only one in the country.” 

As if having completely forgotten how humble she was when she begged Mo Dong, Mo 
Lian demonstrated the common belief in clothes making the man. 

Mo Yan nodded slightly. She simply felt that her set of clothes was appropriate and 
comfortable. As for what brand they were and which year they were released for sale, 
she never paid attention to it, much less be affected by Mo Lian’s exposure. 

Mo Yan replied softly, “Yes, I didn’t dress as well as you did. With your set of clothes, 
those who don’t know that you are attending the charity gala would think that you are 
attending a peacock exhibition.” 

“You!” Mo Lian was so angry that she stomped her feet. 

“I’ll go in first. If you don’t feel embarrassed about remaining outside, you can continue 
standing there.” After saying that, Mo Yan walked in without looking back. The charity 
gala was about to start, so she had no time to argue with Mo Lian. 

Mo Lian’s face was flushed red. She had wanted to humiliate Mo Yan earlier, but she 
unexpectedly failed to do so. If she stayed in public any longer, she would only make a 
fool of herself. 

Mo Lian took a few quick steps and caught up to Mo Yan. She gritted her teeth and 
glared at her. “Mo Yan, just you wait. I won’t let you be so smug all the time.” 

Mo Yan only smiled, and the two of them entered the main hall one after the other. 
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