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Chapter 1221 

He got the gist of what had happened after he’d crashed out last night 

That guy, not only did he use Cory’s fame to promote his crappy, problem-riddled 

product, but he also threw shade at Mr. Raleigh and his dad online Upon digging a bit 

deeper, he found out that this dude named George had even made snide comments 

about his mom on social media a few years back 

After seeing this, Cory was ready to hit back. 

After having breakfast, he tweeted Raleigh. “Mr. Raleigh, no need to keep it hush-hush 

for me anymore.” 

Raleigh called back promptly. “Did your parents agree to this?” 

“I can make my own decisions.” 

“Alright then, I’ve been itching to do this. So many people have been scamming in your 

name, I can barely keep up with debunking them!” 

Raleigh left some things unsaid to Cory 

The most outrageous incident happened right when the product launched. 

One of his friends invited him for a meal, but he was caught on camera. Later, he 

discovered that this friend was seeking investment for a project. The friend told others 

he was the anonymous Tech Seven of the Bane Corporation Al team, along with the 

photograph of him dining with Raleigh The investment team fell for it hook, line, and 

sinker, and after receiving the investment, the friend vanished 



Raleigh hung up in a hurry. He was a bit uneasy, so he shot a message to Rosalynn on 

WhatsApp to confirm things. After getting Rosalynn’s green light, he immediately had 

the word “anonymous in the creative team replaced with ‘Cory’. 

Those keeping tabs on the situation immediately noticed the change. 

“Cory? Who’s Cory? Never heard of this big shot in our industry?” 

“He can’t possibly be that six-year-old kid-” 

“Bane Corporation is being so extra. Just a team member, and they’re making it out like 

some idol debut, so mysterious!” 

“The internet is a tough crowd to please. Anonymous isn’t good, revealing the name 

isn’t good. Do they want a live stream to see who it is?” 

A moment later, this netizen was continuously reminded. 

“This guy is a psychic!” 

“Holy crap, Cory is really gonna live stream. The official Twitter account announced it 

live at 7PM tonight!” 

It turned out to be the Al team’s official Twitter. 

The official Twitter just announced that there would be a Q&A live stream about Bane 

Corporation Al tonight, with the entire team of seven participating. 

What’s even more outrageous is that not long after the official announcement, Bane 

Corporation Al’s overseas account challenged George: Cory invites you to join tonight’s 

live stream. Do you dare to come? 

George didn’t expect things to escalate this way after just one night. Bane Corporation 

was still picking a fight. He had never heard of Cory, so there was nothing to fear. Worst 

case scenario, held use the live stream to plug his new product. 

He wasn’t sure about the quality of his product, but yesterday’s download count was 

through the roof, and he gained over two hundred thousand paying users overnight. He 



made a killing. If he could hold his own against Cory tonight, he could probably rack up 

even more downloads! 

So, George agreed on the spot. 

With the announcement of this upcoming event, internet users both domestic and 

overseas were eagerly anticipating tonight’s live stream. Meanwhile, some people were 

frantically searching for Cory’s identity. During the search, someone leaked a piece of 

info: “This might just be a coincidence, I can’t be sure. But the CEO of Bane Corporation 

has a son named Cory…” 

After a night of heated discussion, internet users didn’t pay this piece of information any 

mind. 

Chapter 1222 

“Dude, if you’re trying to stir up some buzz, I suggest you pick a different topic. That 
trend is dead and gone. Better off saying the CEO’s son from Bune Corporation is 
actually a girl. That’ll get you more attention” 

“Oh yeah Cory is that whiz kid who was brilliant at six, right?” 

“Please stop pushing this ignorant crap on me, thanks!” 

The whistleblower went on a rant with a string of speechless comments. 

The world is a tough place, no one believes the truth anymore! 

So everyone anxiously waited until seven in the evening, all gathered for the official live 
stream, 

Seven o’clock came, but the live stream hadn’t started 

People were getting antsy. “Did they cancel it?” 

“Bane Corporation, get your act together!!!” 

“If the live stream is cancelled, I declare your reputation untrustworthy!” 

The officials quickly responded, “Due to issues involving minors, we are in active 
communication. Please wait.” 

All people confused, 



“Who?” 

“Minors?” 

“Huh? The creative team are all big shots over 30, who’s the minor?” 

“Isn’t it obvious? It’s Cory!” 

“OMG, Cory’s a minor?” 

The comment section once again erupted with heated discussion. 

After a tense ten minutes, the officials finally sorted everything out and the live stream 
officially started. 

One by one, the creative team appeared. 

Before the live stream started, everyone’s gaze was fixed on the unlit screen in the 
middle of the fourth row 

After a few seconds, the screen finally lit up, revealing a beautifully delicate face 

All people “WTF? Secretary Tesdal?” 

“Holy cow! Secretary Tesdal is Cory? I swear, there’s no news more shocking than this 
in my life!” 

“I can’t believe it!!” 

As everyone was still puzzled, the person on the screen began to speak, Sorry 
everyone, because minors can’t stream alone, I had to show my face first. Censor, the 
kids mom is right here with him the whole time.” 

Her voice was pleasant, but everyone was too shocked to appreciate it. 

A flood of question marks appeared on the screen. 

“Hon, it’s ok now.” 

Rosalynn looked to her side, her voice gentle. 

Then, a child slowly appeared in front of the camera. 

The host excitedly announced, “All seven of our creative team members have arrived. 
Let’s officially start today’s live stream! Please introduce yourselves!” 

Starting from Raleigh, everyone introduced themselves one by one, and soon it was 
Cory’s turn. 



He looked at the camera, nodded slightly, ‘Hello everyone, I’m Cory, the Tech Seven of 
Bane Corporation’s Al team.” 

The comment section was flooded with question marks. 

“You got to be kidding me. Bane Corporation, have you lost your minds? You’re really 
pushing the CEO’s son as Tech Seven? 

“Oh my God! To be honest, he’s too cute. He’s such a good boy!!! 

Raleigh glanced at the comments, then laughed, “Seems like everyone is quite 
interested in our Tech Seven!” 

“Get a grip, Raleigh. What Tech Seven? Don’t trash your reputation on this, he’s just a 
kid!!! You got to make your stories more believable!” 

“These two are insane, wouldn’t a children’s coding competition be more appropriate? 
Just shoving him in with the pros and spinning tales, we’re not idiots” 
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As everyone was all over the place, Tech Seven started to speak: “I’ll answer some of 
your questions first.” 

The comment section was still buzzing like crazy 

Then, Tech Seven said slowly. I learned basic arithmetic a long time ago 

The comments paused for a second, then got flooded with question marki. 

“Is he joking?” 

“No, you guys got it wrong he’s answering some questions from the internet yesterday 

The next second Tech Seven picked up his phone, pointing to the math problem on the 
screen. The answer is 61, I also left a problem for you in the comments” 

After answering that, he paused again: “Playing with computers is my hobby, I’ve 
always been studying hard 

Up until now, everyone thought this kid was just joking, until Tech Seven started 
answering professional questions in the comments. 

He spoke slowly, but very clearly, answering the technical questions in a simple and 
understandable way. 

The question marks and mockery in the comments slowly disappeared, replaced by: “Is 
this for real?” 



“Umm… I’m starting to find this interesting.” 

“He really answered my question, it was a hard one I randomly picked from an exam 
paper, I don’t even know the answer but he does? 

After about ten minutes of Q&A, Tech Seven stopped: “My Q&A time is up.” 

Raleigh said happily: “I told you guys yesterday, don’t just blindly believe what others 
say, there are many things in this world you don’t know, Cory was able to join our core 
department not because of who his parents are. To be honest, his mom is right here, 
you can ask her, has she ever been in our team office with President Silverman?” 
Everyone else laughed, Rosalynn also gave a helpless smile, then answered: “No, I can 
only wait outside every time I pick him up 

Raleigh continued: “We originally kept Tech Seven’s identity secret to protect the child, 
but recently there have been too many people pretending to be Tech Sever, we had to 
give you an explanation.” 

Everyone in the comments was reminding George: “He’s talking about you? 

George himself was also watching the live stream, he thought of many outcomes before 
the live started. 

But he never expected that Tech Seven would be Wayne’s son, and such a young one 
at that 

He thought about himself at Cory’s age, he was still causing trouble at the neighbor’s 
house! 

He quickly denied the fact that Cory was Tech Seven in his mind 

He commented: “You guys are all great actors, you almost had me convinced, a six-
year-old kid is Tech Seven!” 

Cory took a glance at the ID. 

George felt like he was afraid people wouldn’t notice him. 

After George posted a comment, he posted another one: “Raleigh is hilarious, sucking 
up to the rich and admitting he’s not as good as a six-year-old kid!” 

He continued to probe: “Raleigh, do you admit that you’re not as good as a six-year-old 
kid? If you admit it in public, I’ll show you my highest respect.” 

George led the topic like this, and the comments section became chaotic. 

The creators were having a smooth conversation, but seeing this, they all furrowed their 
brows and stopped talking. 



Just as Raleigh was about to speak, Cory suddenly interjected “Sir, first of all, I’m not as 
amazing as you say. The Al of Bane Corporation is the result of Mr. Raleigh and team’s 
six years of research and development. All I did was find some flaws that they would 
eventually discover, allowing the product to hit the market ahead of schedule He paused 
for a moment. “As for how capable a six-year-old kid like me is, if you don’t mind, I’m 
willing to have a high-level showdown with you.” 
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Raleigh burst into laughter immediately, and so did everyone else. 

The bullet screen was full of questions. 

Raleigh explained, “Sorry, this is something only we insiders know. Simply put, our Tech 
Seven has almost challenged all the masters in our department. He participates in all 
the difficult competitions, and within three rounds, he always wins, including met 

George listened to Raleigh’s words in front of the computer. 

He snorted, still acting? 

He directly replied to Cory “Listening to Mr. Raleigh, I’m really interested in playing now. 
How do I play?” 

Cory responded with a poker face, ‘Are you satisfied with your Al work?” 

“Of course!” 

“Then play this.” Cory lowered his head and tapped a few keys. “I sent you a domain 
name, it’s encrypted. Within half an hour, I’ll crack your Al module, and you decademy 
domain password. Are you in?” 

“Cracking my product in half an hour, where did you get this confidence, kid?” 

“My ability gives me confidence, Cory answered. 

Seeing Cory’s confidence, George began to have doubts, “I just want to know, is it you 
competing with me, or did you find other experts to help you?” 

If it was Raleigh and his team, he might really lose. 

“Il livestream the whole process, Cory answered without hesitation. 

George was relieved, then Cory announced to everyone, “In order not to affect other 
people’s broadcasts, I’ll exit first.“ 

Raleigh and others quickly said, “Go ahead, we’re fine here, we’ll watch your livestream 
later and provide commentary for everyone.” 



“Thanks, Mr. Mason, Cory was very polite. 

Then he turned to the side, his tone became softer, “Mom, I’m ready 

“Good-” 

To be honest, Rosalynn was really angry watching George provoke Cory 

But her son’s emotion was as steady as a rock, which greatly calmed her down. Then 
he ended the livestream. Soon, Cory started a separate livestream 

On the other side, George didn’t want to be outdone, he also started a livestream 
Without any greetings, he directly requested to link up with Cory 

Cory calmly accepted. 

As soon as George connected, he started talking. “Kid, don’t cry if you lose later! 

“You too.” Cory replied. 

Netizens who were just angry burst into laughter when they heard Cory’s response 

“Holy shit, he’s really funny!” 

“What should I do, am I crazy, I actually think he can win!” 

“Snap out of it, he’s only six” 

“Wow, putting aside the tech stuff, he’s so handsome at such a young age, he’s just the 
perfect kid!” 

“It’s amazing! I just realized that he looks exactly like his sister, but completely different! 
Do you guys get what I’m saying?” 

As everyone was discussing, the challenge reached the 17th minute. 

George’s expression was serious, his small and chubby phone was moving quickly on 
the keyboard, and he was starting to sweat 

Now let’s look at the kid 

At seventeen minutes and three seconds, he withdrew his hand and stopped. 
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The comment section was instantly filled with question marks 



Some even started to mock, saying “This kid can’t handle it anymore, right? Been 
smashing the keyboard for over ten minutes, ready to throw in the towel?” 

“Hahah, I really don’t get why kids do this stuff?” 

Just as the comments were filled with mockery, the child’s immature voice was heard. 
He calmly said. ‘T’m ready 

Cold sweat started to bead on George’s forehead 

It was just unlocking a domain name. Even if he was technologically inferior to many 
people now, he thought this was a piece of cake 

However, the reality was 

Half the time had passed, and he was still unable to crack the domain name: 

At this moment, he heard the child say that he was ready 

George got a bit frantic, losing his temper. He scoffed, Kid, what are you ready for? 

Just as he finished speaking out of the corner of his eye, he caught sight of the 
comments 

Someone was saying, “Oh my God. I can’t log in to George’s Al module 

George was stunned, his phone rang 

He glanced at it, it was a call from the company 

In the comments, more and more people were talking about not being able to log in 

George was starting to panic 

Then he heard the child’s voice again, “Don’t panic, the module will be operational in 
half an hour” 

In the comments. “What does he mean, what does he mean? Did he do 

“Oh my god! Go check George’s Al module’s official website!” 

The crowd rushed there. 

The entire page, was filled with George’s previous misdeeds in his home country 

ryet. 



He hadn’t cracked the domain name yet, if he ran away now he wouldn’t be Cory 
planned to do his homework after completing the challenge, and son 

However 

George realized the severity of the situation, but the challenge wasn 

e to hold has head high for the rest of his life. 

cortments started to give Cory math problems they thought were difficult. 

Cory looked at them and didn’t even write anything down. Most of the problems, he 
gave the answer right away 

At first, the people in the comments didn’t realize the seriousness of the problem, they 
just thought it was a joke When the problems got harder and he still read them once and 
gave the answer. 

The comments gradually stopped laughing they were all surprised 

Soon, a well-known math blogger also rushed to the scene 

He gave a very difficult problem right off the bat 

Cory was always very calm in front of the camera. 

However, after seeing this problem, he sat up straight and finally grabbed a piece of 
scratch paper 

In the comments. “Oh my god, look, he’s finally starting to calculateli 

“This level of problem, I as a college student can’t solve. If he can’t solve it, I hope 
everyone won’t blame him: You have to know he’s not even 

As soon as this comment appeared, Cory’s pen stopped. 

Then he looked at the camera and said a number 

What? Thirty seconds? 

“Where’s the one who set the question? Come and confirm the answerl 

The question setter responded, “The answer is correct 

Then, he promptly posted another math question, harder than the previous one 

 


