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Chen Hao turned around and saw Su Tongxin. 
 
“Are you also here to practice driving?” 
 
Chen Hao smiled. 
 
Yes. my driving test is tomorrow.Oh right, isn’t your driving test tomorrow as well?” Su Tongxin did not 
manage to sit for her test previously. for she had left due to her family’s crisis. 
 
Naturally,she had to retake her test. 
 
Chen Hao nodded. 
 
“Alright! Let’s go together tomorrow.I hope that both of us pass the tests!” “No problem! Let’s head 
over to the driving site!” 
 
Chen Hao gradually loosened up over time in front of Su Tongxin. 
 
He was no longer as nervous and as awkward as before. 
 
The experience from attending big social events and meeting big shots definitely helped. 
 
The experiences were able to greatly expand Chen Hao’s knowledge and views. 
 
They practiced for the entire afternoon On the flowing day, both of them attended their tests 
respectively. 
 
Everything went smoothly for Chen Hao. He passed both his written and practical tests in one go. 
 
He would receive his driving license within the next two days. 
 
Chen Hao and Su Tongxin agreed to meet at the entrance of the examination site. Then, they would 
head for lunch together. 
 
Chen Hao had to be tested on two subjects, thus, he needed more time compared to Su Tongxin. 
 
As Chen Hao walked out of the examination site, he saw Su Tongxin already waiting there for him. 
 
However, there was a young couple standing beside Su Tongxin. They looked about the same age and 
they were talking to her. 
 
Chen Hao slowly walked over. The three of them were happily chatting and did not notice Chen Hao. 
 
“Tongxin, come to think of it, other than family gatherings, we barely meet each other. Did you come 
here alone?” 
 
Although the girl was smiling, it was obvious she was putting on a front. There was a hint of mockery in 
her tone. 



 
“Yes, Su Ying, we barely see each other, yet you still amaze me. Have you recently changed your 
boyfriend again? Is he the newest one?” 
 
Su Tongxin replied with an insolent tone as well. 
 
The two of them were like mortal enemies. Tension was always present between them and they got 
extremely jealous of each other whenever they met. 
 
They were constantly arguing and tying to score off each other! 
 
Upon hearing what Su Tongxin said, the expression of the handsome guy who was next to Su Ying 
changed. 
 
“Tongxin, no matter what, I am still a few months older than you. According to seniority within the 
family, you should address me as your cousin sister. How can you be so disrespectful toward me?” 
 
Su Ying got slightly mad. 
 
Both of them were born within the Su Family. Su Ying’s father was the uncle of Su Tongxin. 
 
Plus Su Qi, the three of them were cousins. Although there were benefits of having cousins of the same 
age, there were conflicts as well. 
 
Ever since they were young, Su Ying and Su Tongxin had always been thrown into comparison because 
they were the same age. 
 
All these happened ever since they were kids. 
 
Su Tongxin excelled in almost everything and had always performed better than Su Ying, be it in 
academics or in her conduct. 
 
During family gatherings, the most common phrase said to Su Ying by the elderly would be ‘You should 
learn from your younger cousin sister!’ 
 
Su Ying had lived with this trauma all through childhood. 
 
Therefore, Su Ying had always viewed Su Tongxin as a nemesis and she would treat everything as a 
competition. 
 
Although they have already grown up, the trauma persisted. 
 
As such, they still spoke to each other harshly. 
 
“Ha, ha, Tongxin, I know you have always been snobby and have always had high standards. But so what 
anyway? You still haven’t gotten a single boyfriend. Do you know how it feels to be pampered by a 
guy?” 
 
Su Ying crossed her arms and smiled. 
 
“You had to take your driving test alone. 



 
Unlike you, I have someone like Jiannan to always accompany me! He couldn’t bear the thought of 
leaving me for a second!” 
 
U Jiannan smiled happily and wrapped his arm around Su Ying’s waist. 
 
I’m helping my girl fend off her cousin sister. If Su Ying ends up happy, who knows if she might give me 
her body! 
 
Su Tongxin could not stand the insult. 
 
All these years, she had always been single. She had always been nonchalant to couples showing off 
their love in front of her. 
 
Yet, of all days, she bumped into Su Ying on the day of her driving test. 
 
Furthermore, Su Ying brought her boyfriend along to show off. 
 
Both of them were so used to competing that they could not control themselves from being jealous of 
each other whenever they met. 
 
Su Tongxin was furious. 
 
Yet, she was at a loss for words. 
 
“Tongxin!” 
 
Chen Hao had been listening and watching from the side. Upon seeing Su Tongxin being bullied, he 
stepped out. 
 
“Ah! Chen Hao!” 
 
Upon seeing Chen Hao, Su Tongxin was surprised. 
 
Why did Chen Hao appear at this moment? This is so embarrassing! 
 
“Oh? Tongxin, who is this?” 
 
Su Ying scrutinized Chen Hao from head to toe. She smiled after realizing Chen Hao was dressed in 
typical clothing. 
 
Her own friends were all famous and rich whereas Su Tongxin’s friends were of this calibre. 
 
How did this guy address Su Tongxin? 
 
Tongxin? 
 
Was there something going on between them? 
 
“This is my friend, Chen Hao. Why?” 
 



Su Tongxin introduced Chen Hao to Su Ying 
 
“Oh! Su Ying, I thought that was your brother-in-law!” Li Jiannan said while stretching out his arm to 
display the watch on his wrist. 
 
The watch was a golden Rolex and Li Jiannan wanted to show that he was superior compared to Chen 
Hao. 
 
However, since they were only friends, the plan fell through. 
 
“Jiannan, how is that possible? How could Tongxin have gotten a boyfriend? She is always so snobbish! 
Furthermore, take a look at this guy and his clothes! How could he be Tongxin’s boyfriend?” 
 
Su Ying sneered. 
 
She targeted her insults at Su Tongxin and did not care about how Chen Hao felt. 
 
In her eyes, Chen Hao was nothing. 
 
“Haha…” Instead of being angry after being ridiculed, Su Tongxin was happy, “Su Ying, you are wrong. 
Chen Hao is not only my classmate but also my boyfriend!” Su Tongxin then walked over to Chen Hao 
and held onto his arm. 
 
The soft touch from her body made Chen Hao tremble. 
 
I’m Tongxin’s boyfriend? 
 
Chen Hao had always wished for that to happen. Yet, he did not expect it to happen this way. 
 
Chen Hao had mixed feelings. 
 
Su Ying and Li Jiannan were stunned. 
 
“Haha, Su Tongxin, I know you are trying to make me mad. You want to get a boyfriend to contest with 
me especially during Grandma’s birthday celebration on the day after tomorrow. However, at least find 
someone of a higher status. Why would you get someone that looks like this?” 
 
“Oh right, I have yet to introduce Jiannan to you! He is the young master of Li’s Corporation. Do you 
know what car Jiannan owns? He drives a Ferrari! That alone is enough to show that you have lost to 
me!” 
 
Su Ying’s face turned red. 
 
I know Su Tongxin would never surrender in front of me! So let’s compete! I’m not afraid! 
 
Su Tongxin was not to be outdone. She replied, “Haha, so what? My boyfriend Chen Hao is also a rich 
heir of a wealthy family. He is just humble unlike a certain person’s boyfriend who only knows how to 
show off!” 
 
Su Tongxin’s arm wrapped tighter around Chen Hao. She went all out. 
 



“Haha, what? This guy is a rich heir? A humble wealthy descendant? Su Tongxin, I surrender. I really 
surrender to your thick skin!” 
 
Su Ying burst out laughing. 
 
On the other hand, Chen Hao’s mind was filled with questions. He was shocked at the extent of their 
childhood trauma. 
 
Even a goddess like Su Tongxin could not rise above it. 
 
The only reason Chen Hao became her boyfriend was to compete with Su Ying. 
 
Yet, what surprised Chen Hao the most was the last sentence Su Tongxin said! 
 
“Tongxin, you knew?” 
 
Chen Hao had always been troubled by the problem of revealing his identity to his friends. 
 
After what Su Tongxin said, Chen Hao’s burden lessened. 
 
Su Tongxin was stunned. “Know what?” “That I am a descendant of a wealthy family!” Chen Hao replied. 


